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Kasaragod Development Package

Annexure
SL . Implementin | Amount
No. Name of Project g Agency @) Present Status LAC
1 2 3 4 5 6
Investigation-
~ {Reconstruction of VCB cum |E.E, Minor
bridge at Kaje near Irrigation Work completed. Report .
! Janardhana temple across Division, 3.60 not submitted Manjeshwar
Swarnagiri thodu in Kasaragod
Paivalike GP
Construction of . E.E, LID & N ’
smart anganwadi at _ Civil and electrical .
2 . EW Division, | 8.65 Manjeshwar
Mannamkuzhy in Kasaragod works completed.
Mangalpady GP &
2023-24- Investigation- .
Construction of VCB cum ﬁf’ ;/i[:rllor Investigation work
3 |Bridge across Uppala river ed 6.40 |completed. Report to be |Manjeshwar
. . Division, .
in Madanthoor Bekur village K asaracod submitted
of Mangalpady GP- 6.4 L &
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD
Development for PHC Buildings :
4 Arikady in Kumbala GP- | Division, 126.00 | Work completed Manjeshwar
(2021-22)- 1.26 cr Kasaragod
Toilet block plastering
work completed, Rain
shelter, ticket counter-
plinth beam concreting,
2022-23- Development of  |D.D, District basement work etc
5 |Kanwatheertha beach at Tourism, 3.49 |completed, laterite Manjeshwar
Manjeshwar- 1.1537 cr Kasaragod masonry work
progressing. Container
has been placed. Agreed
to complete the work by
March 2025
Investigation- construction |{E.E, Minor
of overhead water tank for |Irrigation . Work completed and-
®  |the lift irrigation scheme at | Division, 0-90 1 paid Kasaragod

Athithamoola- Uyithadukka

Kasaragod




in Karadka G.P

GP (31 Nos)- 1.47 cr

- |Kasaragod

submitted

Construction of smart EE,LID &
7 |anganwadi at Kattathbayal in|EW Division, | 10.31 | Work completed Kasaragod
Karadka GP Kasaragod
Construction of smart EE,LID &
8 |anganwadi at Koyakudlu in |EW Division, | 10.31 |Work completed Kasaragod
Karadka GP Kasaragod
Investigation- Construction |E.E, Minor Investication work
of VCB at Vellarikkandam  |Irrigation gation work.
9 . . Lo 6.00 |completed, invesigation |Kasaragod
across Nekraje thodu in 4th | Division, renort under Droeress
ward of Chengala G.P Kasaragod P prog
Civil and electrical
Construction of smart EE, LID & works completed.
.10 |anganwadi at Kattathbayal |EW Division, | 10.31 |Drinking water- water ~ |Kasaragod
mini in Karadka GP Kasaragod will be collect from
nearby bore well.
Upgradation of E.E, Harbour
Perumbalakadavu Thuruthi |Engineering Work comp leted.(}C first _
11 road in Division 88.00 |and part bill pending for [Kasaragod
Kasaragod Municipality Kasaragod payment.
Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
12 |smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 12.92 works completed Kasaragod
Chenakkod in Madhur GP | Kasaragod P '
Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
13 {smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 12.92 works completed Kasaragod
Varkathotty in Madhur GP | Kasaragod p '
: Construction of E.E,LID & . Civil and electrical
14 |smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 7.31 works completed Kasaragod
Kuthirappady in Madhur GP |Kasaragod p '
GF-structure work
. completed. Risk and cost
2022-23- Construction of g g 11p & terminated, work
15 ?\Id 2;; a:g;pr : adk GP EW Division, | 2.24 [tendered, no bid, The Kasaragod
]Oa3 ]a \L ran baradka bt 1K asaragod meeting detected to
' invite the tender again
o o and follow up
2022-23- Construction of g;’:;gi:ggn 10 nos completed. Bill
16 |ring check dams in Bellur Officer 6.77 |forRs.11.68 Listobe {Kasaragod




2024-25- Ventilation and
Allied Electrical Works at

)

Director of

Preparation of TS
document in progress.

239 cr

Kasaragod

Ongoing

17 Academic Block of KMC- ggfclgglon 0.29 Agreed to complete the Kasaragod
78.57 L (2019-20) work within 6 months
Construction of smart E.E,LID &

18 {anganwadi at Balanadukkam {EW Division, | 11.92 [Work completed Uduma
in Bedaduka GP Kasaragod
o Comono |opupe | ot v

19 ganwadi & . |EW Division, | 1131 preec. Uduma

' Koppalamkochi in Muliyar K asaracod Borewell work (GP)-
GP-11.31L 5 agreement executed,
2022-23- Construction of civil and electrical work

" EE,LID &
smart anganwadi at Nusrath |- - completed. Borewell,

20 . . EW Division, | 16.92 . Uduma
Nagar in Muliayar GP- K asaraeod Electrical work to be
16.92 L & executed by GP.

2022-23- Construction of civil works and electrical
T EE,LID &

91 smart anganwadi at EW Division 8 65 works completed.GP Uduma
Annappadi in Kuttikol GP- K asaragod ’ ' FUND-Bore well
8.65L _ & dug,motor fixed.

2022-23- Recc}nstruction of |E.E, Minor
Meengoth VCB across Irrigation
22 Meengoth thodu at Pullur | Division, 82.76 | Work completed. Uduma
Periya GP- 83.6 L Kasaragod
GF-structure work
completed. Risk and cost
2022-23- Constr}lctlon of EE, LID & terminated, work

)3 |SMart anganwadi at EW Division 461 tendered, opened on Uduma
Alanadukkam in Muliyar K asaragod ’ ' 15.01.25. The meeting
GP- 16.42 L 8 detected to invite the

tender again and follow
up
. Storeshed foundation
2022-23- Construction VCB frf ;:ilé‘;‘” ‘S‘t";;’lfézt?gr Z’Iatg;i'}f
24 |cum Bridge at Kunduchi in r1ea 19.12 Pp Uduma
Bedaduka GP- 99 L Division, road DR work. Agreed to
' Kasaragod completed the work by
March 2025
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Finishing work ongoing
development for PHC Buildings (painting) 92%. 4
25 Kalanad in Chemnad G.P-  |Division, 104.39 Electrical works -CW- Uduma




E.E, PWD

Chamundikkunnu in Ajanoor
GP-29.98L

Kasaragod

meeting directed to
review the project in the
next meeting

2022-23- Infrastructure Buildin Revised AS obtained.
26 |development to GLPS Divisiox%s 23.14 | Work to be restarted. Uduma
Chemnad East- 1.3 cr ’ (90%)
Kasaragod
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Laterite work completed
development to GLPS Buildings (70%). Agreed to
27 Kalanad Old in Chemnad  |Division, 15.09 complete the work by Uduma
G.P-1lecr Kasaragod March 2025
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Laterite masonry,
development for GUPS Buildings plastering work
28 | Thekkil Paramba in Division, 2275 | ongoing(80%). Electrical | ©0UMa
Chemnad G.P- 2.11 er Kasaragod work- ongoing
2022-23- Infrastructure EE, LID & N .
development for GWLPS ~ e s civil and electrical work
29 . . EW Division, 14 Kanhangad
Naikayam in Kodom Belur K asaracod completed.
G.P-14 L £0
. civil and electrical work
20222 Lonstuction of g g, 11D & completed. GP FUND-
30 | ga! EW Division, | 12.92 |Bore well dug, ICDS Kanhangad
Peruthady in Panathady GP- . .
Kasaragod fund will be obtained
1292 L :
soon for fixing motor
"+ |Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
31 |smart anganwadi at Alayiin |EW Division, | 7.31 works completed Kanhangad
Madikkai GP Kasaragod P )
2022-23- Construction of E.E. Minor
VCB cum bridge across Ir.ri ,ation Work completed on
32 |Chullikkara Kottody thodu | : &o; 80.19 |30.11.2024. 2nd part bill |Kanhangad
. Division, .
at Payyacheri in Kallar GP- submitted.
Kasaragod
81L
202‘;25' C"“Sg.”":“’“ of |gE LID& Civil work completed.
33 [Jnartanganwadia EW Division, | 9.65 |Ele- agmt to be executed |Kanhangad
Balamthode in Panathady K asaragod by GP
GP-9.65 L g Y
Civil work completed,
2022-23- Construction of %f,helr(w‘?lr]kb‘s n p“ig:efis'
' rt anganwadi at DWCDO YOTK Wil be complete
34 308 ’ 4.81 |in February 2025. The |Kanhangad




Sorheny

[

N

2023-24- Infrastructure
development to GLPS South

t

DD,

Column raised up to linel

35 Chithari in Aianur G.P- Education, 4.58 |le. Laterite masonry up |Kanhangad
70.48 L Je ' Kasaragod to lintel level completed.
2023-24- Infrastructure .
development to GLPS D.D, . : Laterite mason.ry'for
36 Peruthady in Panathady G.P- Education, 14.73 |superstructure is in Kanhangad
3L y yu Kasaragod progress.
2023-24- Infrastructure DD Plinth beam work
37 deye}opment to .GUI?S Education, 20.50 |°MP leted, Cglqmn Kanhangad
Puthiyakandam in Ajanur Kasaracod raising up to lintel level
G.P-1025L , & is in progress.
2022-23- Strengthening of | D.M.O E tf';lizre ':)of‘if:mf;’r the
38 |infrastructure facilitiesat | (Health), 26.85 pﬁb‘]’ishe 3. Opening Date | K2nhangad
DH Kanhangad- 114.69 L |Kasaragod P  ~pening
' : 06/02/2025 at 10.30
Construction of smart E.E,LID &
39 |anganwadi at Karakkeruin |EW Division, | 14.92 |Work completed Trikaripur
Pilicode GP Kasaragod
. civil and electrical work
2022 7;”1 - fn"\zzgi”::‘m of |EE LID& completed.GP FUND-
40 Ma dakkzﬁ Mini in EW Division, | 10.15 |Bore well dug, ICDS Trikaripur
) ' Kasaragod fund will be obtained
Valiyaparamba GP- 10.15L :
soon for fixing motor
Constructlon of . EE, LID & N '
41 |Smart-anganwadi at EW Division 8.65 Civil and electrical Trikaripur
Kottappuram in Nileshwar Kasarasod ’ ’ works completed.
Municipality &
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD
42 develop ment for GHSS Bl.m.d.l nes 123.00 | Work completed Trikaripur
Cheemeni in Kayyur Division,
Cheemeni G.P- 1.23 cr Kasaragod
e ool ot
43 [ e EW Division, | 7.31 | Work completed. Trikaripur
uttama ‘ Kasaragod
Cheruvathur GP- 7.31L
" |2022-23- Gidshomeat  |D.D, . -
44 |Palathadam in Nileshwar-  |Education, | 39,93 |R0OfSlabconcreting oy oo

2.015Cr

Kasaragod

completed




Works of 7 ring check

2022-23- Construction of | Principal dams 90% completed, 1 .
. . . . , Manjeshwar
ring check dams in Agriculture ring check dam's earth
45 AR 21.28 . &
Kumbala- Kayyur Cheemeni | Officer, work completed. 2 ring Trikari
G.Ps (3&8 Nos)- 45.12L  |Kasaragod check dams work not yet ripur
started.
Strengthening of primary DM.O Bill for Rs. 6.78 lakh for
NP , the supply of battery for
46  |health institutions in (Health), 7.28 : General
eHealth submitted. The
Kasaragod Kasaragod .
same is under process
Computerisation for e-office |Dy. Collector Computers and
47 |implementation of revenue |(General), 129.32 pute General
offices Kasaragod accessories purchased.
Setting up of modern D.D,
48 - |classrooms for Govt Schools |Education, 117.00 | Work completed General
in Kasaragod district Kasaragod
Computerisation for e-office |Dy. Collector
49 |implementation of revenue |(General), 171.07 V\;(i);k completed and General
offices- Phase 11 Kasaragod P
e Hospital treatment st
202323 Repabi atton of 1pMo and 2nd part bill paid.
50 o (Health), 462.90 |3rd, 4th and 5th part bill |General
Kasaragod District- 462.9 K d sted. L
takh asarago submitted. Letter sent fo
- Govt. for further sanction
Posted 11 Nursing (GH
D.M.O 2, DH 9), 2 dialysis
51 2022-23- Health Facilities in (IJ.Iea.l th) 750.00 technicians & 3 cleaning General
Kasaragod- 7.5 crore Kasara ;) d ' staff in GH. Letter sent
' g to Gowt. for further
sanction
Chief
2022-23- Management of  [Conservator
Human- Animal Conflict of Forests, Watchers are deployed.
32 issues in Kasaragod District- | Northern 25.00 Drone & torch supplied. General
25 lakh Circle,
- |Kannur . «
53 [2022-23- MUNNOT- Project | District 15.25 |[Classes have been General
for the integrated training for | Employment conducted till August
competitive examinations- | Officer, 2024. The duration of the
32.52L Kasaragod project is extended to

August 2025 and the




* | detailed report and bills

can be submitted up to
September 2025

54

2022-23- Vazhikatti-
Vocational Training for
children residing in child
care institutions- 9.36 L

District Child
Protection
Officer,
Kasaragod

2.38

ASAP has created batch
of Graphic Designing
course with 14 children
from Chemnad
Panchayath. They have
requested us to include 5
children who are ready
for attending Graphic
Designing Course and
prepared the list of the
children.

General

Total

2738.06




Kasaragod Development Package

Annexure
SL . Implementin | Amount
No. Name of Project g Agency @) Present Status LAC
1 2 3 4 5 6
Investigation-
~ {Reconstruction of VCB cum |E.E, Minor
bridge at Kaje near Irrigation Work completed. Report .
! Janardhana temple across Division, 3.60 not submitted Manjeshwar
Swarnagiri thodu in Kasaragod
Paivalike GP
Construction of . E.E, LID & N ’
smart anganwadi at _ Civil and electrical .
2 . EW Division, | 8.65 Manjeshwar
Mannamkuzhy in Kasaragod works completed.
Mangalpady GP &
2023-24- Investigation- .
Construction of VCB cum ﬁf’ ;/i[:rllor Investigation work
3 |Bridge across Uppala river ed 6.40 |completed. Report to be |Manjeshwar
. . Division, .
in Madanthoor Bekur village K asaracod submitted
of Mangalpady GP- 6.4 L &
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD
Development for PHC Buildings :
4 Arikady in Kumbala GP- | Division, 126.00 | Work completed Manjeshwar
(2021-22)- 1.26 cr Kasaragod
Toilet block plastering
work completed, Rain
shelter, ticket counter-
plinth beam concreting,
2022-23- Development of  |D.D, District basement work etc
5 |Kanwatheertha beach at Tourism, 3.49 |completed, laterite Manjeshwar
Manjeshwar- 1.1537 cr Kasaragod masonry work
progressing. Container
has been placed. Agreed
to complete the work by
March 2025
Investigation- construction |{E.E, Minor
of overhead water tank for |Irrigation . Work completed and-
®  |the lift irrigation scheme at | Division, 0-90 1 paid Kasaragod

Athithamoola- Uyithadukka

Kasaragod




in Karadka G.P

GP (31 Nos)- 1.47 cr

- |Kasaragod

submitted

Construction of smart EE,LID &
7 |anganwadi at Kattathbayal in|EW Division, | 10.31 | Work completed Kasaragod
Karadka GP Kasaragod
Construction of smart EE,LID &
8 |anganwadi at Koyakudlu in |EW Division, | 10.31 |Work completed Kasaragod
Karadka GP Kasaragod
Investigation- Construction |E.E, Minor Investication work
of VCB at Vellarikkandam  |Irrigation gation work.
9 . . Lo 6.00 |completed, invesigation |Kasaragod
across Nekraje thodu in 4th | Division, renort under Droeress
ward of Chengala G.P Kasaragod P prog
Civil and electrical
Construction of smart EE, LID & works completed.
.10 |anganwadi at Kattathbayal |EW Division, | 10.31 |Drinking water- water ~ |Kasaragod
mini in Karadka GP Kasaragod will be collect from
nearby bore well.
Upgradation of E.E, Harbour
Perumbalakadavu Thuruthi |Engineering Work comp leted.(}C first _
11 road in Division 88.00 |and part bill pending for [Kasaragod
Kasaragod Municipality Kasaragod payment.
Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
12 |smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 12.92 works completed Kasaragod
Chenakkod in Madhur GP | Kasaragod P '
Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
13 {smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 12.92 works completed Kasaragod
Varkathotty in Madhur GP | Kasaragod p '
: Construction of E.E,LID & . Civil and electrical
14 |smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 7.31 works completed Kasaragod
Kuthirappady in Madhur GP |Kasaragod p '
GF-structure work
. completed. Risk and cost
2022-23- Construction of g g 11p & terminated, work
15 ?\Id 2;; a:g;pr : adk GP EW Division, | 2.24 [tendered, no bid, The Kasaragod
]Oa3 ]a \L ran baradka bt 1K asaragod meeting detected to
' invite the tender again
o o and follow up
2022-23- Construction of g;’:;gi:ggn 10 nos completed. Bill
16 |ring check dams in Bellur Officer 6.77 |forRs.11.68 Listobe {Kasaragod




2024-25- Ventilation and
Allied Electrical Works at

)

Director of

Preparation of TS
document in progress.

239 cr

Kasaragod

Ongoing

17 Academic Block of KMC- ggfclgglon 0.29 Agreed to complete the Kasaragod
78.57 L (2019-20) work within 6 months
Construction of smart E.E,LID &

18 {anganwadi at Balanadukkam {EW Division, | 11.92 [Work completed Uduma
in Bedaduka GP Kasaragod
o Comono |opupe | ot v

19 ganwadi & . |EW Division, | 1131 preec. Uduma

' Koppalamkochi in Muliyar K asaracod Borewell work (GP)-
GP-11.31L 5 agreement executed,
2022-23- Construction of civil and electrical work

" EE,LID &
smart anganwadi at Nusrath |- - completed. Borewell,

20 . . EW Division, | 16.92 . Uduma
Nagar in Muliayar GP- K asaraeod Electrical work to be
16.92 L & executed by GP.

2022-23- Construction of civil works and electrical
T EE,LID &

91 smart anganwadi at EW Division 8 65 works completed.GP Uduma
Annappadi in Kuttikol GP- K asaragod ’ ' FUND-Bore well
8.65L _ & dug,motor fixed.

2022-23- Recc}nstruction of |E.E, Minor
Meengoth VCB across Irrigation
22 Meengoth thodu at Pullur | Division, 82.76 | Work completed. Uduma
Periya GP- 83.6 L Kasaragod
GF-structure work
completed. Risk and cost
2022-23- Constr}lctlon of EE, LID & terminated, work

)3 |SMart anganwadi at EW Division 461 tendered, opened on Uduma
Alanadukkam in Muliyar K asaragod ’ ' 15.01.25. The meeting
GP- 16.42 L 8 detected to invite the

tender again and follow
up
. Storeshed foundation
2022-23- Construction VCB frf ;:ilé‘;‘” ‘S‘t";;’lfézt?gr Z’Iatg;i'}f
24 |cum Bridge at Kunduchi in r1ea 19.12 Pp Uduma
Bedaduka GP- 99 L Division, road DR work. Agreed to
' Kasaragod completed the work by
March 2025
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Finishing work ongoing
development for PHC Buildings (painting) 92%. 4
25 Kalanad in Chemnad G.P-  |Division, 104.39 Electrical works -CW- Uduma




E.E, PWD

Chamundikkunnu in Ajanoor
GP-29.98L

Kasaragod

meeting directed to
review the project in the
next meeting

2022-23- Infrastructure Buildin Revised AS obtained.
26 |development to GLPS Divisiox%s 23.14 | Work to be restarted. Uduma
Chemnad East- 1.3 cr ’ (90%)
Kasaragod
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Laterite work completed
development to GLPS Buildings (70%). Agreed to
27 Kalanad Old in Chemnad  |Division, 15.09 complete the work by Uduma
G.P-1lecr Kasaragod March 2025
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Laterite masonry,
development for GUPS Buildings plastering work
28 | Thekkil Paramba in Division, 2275 | ongoing(80%). Electrical | ©0UMa
Chemnad G.P- 2.11 er Kasaragod work- ongoing
2022-23- Infrastructure EE, LID & N .
development for GWLPS ~ e s civil and electrical work
29 . . EW Division, 14 Kanhangad
Naikayam in Kodom Belur K asaracod completed.
G.P-14 L £0
. civil and electrical work
20222 Lonstuction of g g, 11D & completed. GP FUND-
30 | ga! EW Division, | 12.92 |Bore well dug, ICDS Kanhangad
Peruthady in Panathady GP- . .
Kasaragod fund will be obtained
1292 L :
soon for fixing motor
"+ |Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
31 |smart anganwadi at Alayiin |EW Division, | 7.31 works completed Kanhangad
Madikkai GP Kasaragod P )
2022-23- Construction of E.E. Minor
VCB cum bridge across Ir.ri ,ation Work completed on
32 |Chullikkara Kottody thodu | : &o; 80.19 |30.11.2024. 2nd part bill |Kanhangad
. Division, .
at Payyacheri in Kallar GP- submitted.
Kasaragod
81L
202‘;25' C"“Sg.”":“’“ of |gE LID& Civil work completed.
33 [Jnartanganwadia EW Division, | 9.65 |Ele- agmt to be executed |Kanhangad
Balamthode in Panathady K asaragod by GP
GP-9.65 L g Y
Civil work completed,
2022-23- Construction of %f,helr(w‘?lr]kb‘s n p“ig:efis'
' rt anganwadi at DWCDO YOTK Wil be complete
34 308 ’ 4.81 |in February 2025. The |Kanhangad




Sorheny

[

N

2023-24- Infrastructure
development to GLPS South

t

DD,

Column raised up to linel

35 Chithari in Aianur G.P- Education, 4.58 |le. Laterite masonry up |Kanhangad
70.48 L Je ' Kasaragod to lintel level completed.
2023-24- Infrastructure .
development to GLPS D.D, . : Laterite mason.ry'for
36 Peruthady in Panathady G.P- Education, 14.73 |superstructure is in Kanhangad
3L y yu Kasaragod progress.
2023-24- Infrastructure DD Plinth beam work
37 deye}opment to .GUI?S Education, 20.50 |°MP leted, Cglqmn Kanhangad
Puthiyakandam in Ajanur Kasaracod raising up to lintel level
G.P-1025L , & is in progress.
2022-23- Strengthening of | D.M.O E tf';lizre ':)of‘if:mf;’r the
38 |infrastructure facilitiesat | (Health), 26.85 pﬁb‘]’ishe 3. Opening Date | K2nhangad
DH Kanhangad- 114.69 L |Kasaragod P  ~pening
' : 06/02/2025 at 10.30
Construction of smart E.E,LID &
39 |anganwadi at Karakkeruin |EW Division, | 14.92 |Work completed Trikaripur
Pilicode GP Kasaragod
. civil and electrical work
2022 7;”1 - fn"\zzgi”::‘m of |EE LID& completed.GP FUND-
40 Ma dakkzﬁ Mini in EW Division, | 10.15 |Bore well dug, ICDS Trikaripur
) ' Kasaragod fund will be obtained
Valiyaparamba GP- 10.15L :
soon for fixing motor
Constructlon of . EE, LID & N '
41 |Smart-anganwadi at EW Division 8.65 Civil and electrical Trikaripur
Kottappuram in Nileshwar Kasarasod ’ ’ works completed.
Municipality &
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD
42 develop ment for GHSS Bl.m.d.l nes 123.00 | Work completed Trikaripur
Cheemeni in Kayyur Division,
Cheemeni G.P- 1.23 cr Kasaragod
e ool ot
43 [ e EW Division, | 7.31 | Work completed. Trikaripur
uttama ‘ Kasaragod
Cheruvathur GP- 7.31L
" |2022-23- Gidshomeat  |D.D, . -
44 |Palathadam in Nileshwar-  |Education, | 39,93 |R0OfSlabconcreting oy oo

2.015Cr

Kasaragod

completed




Works of 7 ring check

2022-23- Construction of | Principal dams 90% completed, 1 .
. . . . , Manjeshwar
ring check dams in Agriculture ring check dam's earth
45 AR 21.28 . &
Kumbala- Kayyur Cheemeni | Officer, work completed. 2 ring Trikari
G.Ps (3&8 Nos)- 45.12L  |Kasaragod check dams work not yet ripur
started.
Strengthening of primary DM.O Bill for Rs. 6.78 lakh for
NP , the supply of battery for
46  |health institutions in (Health), 7.28 : General
eHealth submitted. The
Kasaragod Kasaragod .
same is under process
Computerisation for e-office |Dy. Collector Computers and
47 |implementation of revenue |(General), 129.32 pute General
offices Kasaragod accessories purchased.
Setting up of modern D.D,
48 - |classrooms for Govt Schools |Education, 117.00 | Work completed General
in Kasaragod district Kasaragod
Computerisation for e-office |Dy. Collector
49 |implementation of revenue |(General), 171.07 V\;(i);k completed and General
offices- Phase 11 Kasaragod P
e Hospital treatment st
202323 Repabi atton of 1pMo and 2nd part bill paid.
50 o (Health), 462.90 |3rd, 4th and 5th part bill |General
Kasaragod District- 462.9 K d sted. L
takh asarago submitted. Letter sent fo
- Govt. for further sanction
Posted 11 Nursing (GH
D.M.O 2, DH 9), 2 dialysis
51 2022-23- Health Facilities in (IJ.Iea.l th) 750.00 technicians & 3 cleaning General
Kasaragod- 7.5 crore Kasara ;) d ' staff in GH. Letter sent
' g to Gowt. for further
sanction
Chief
2022-23- Management of  [Conservator
Human- Animal Conflict of Forests, Watchers are deployed.
32 issues in Kasaragod District- | Northern 25.00 Drone & torch supplied. General
25 lakh Circle,
- |Kannur . «
53 [2022-23- MUNNOT- Project | District 15.25 |[Classes have been General
for the integrated training for | Employment conducted till August
competitive examinations- | Officer, 2024. The duration of the
32.52L Kasaragod project is extended to

August 2025 and the




* | detailed report and bills

can be submitted up to
September 2025

54

2022-23- Vazhikatti-
Vocational Training for
children residing in child
care institutions- 9.36 L

District Child
Protection
Officer,
Kasaragod

2.38

ASAP has created batch
of Graphic Designing
course with 14 children
from Chemnad
Panchayath. They have
requested us to include 5
children who are ready
for attending Graphic
Designing Course and
prepared the list of the
children.

General

Total

2738.06




Kasaragod Development Package

Annexure
SL . Implementin | Amount
No. Name of Project g Agency @) Present Status LAC
1 2 3 4 5 6
Investigation-
~ {Reconstruction of VCB cum |E.E, Minor
bridge at Kaje near Irrigation Work completed. Report .
! Janardhana temple across Division, 3.60 not submitted Manjeshwar
Swarnagiri thodu in Kasaragod
Paivalike GP
Construction of . E.E, LID & N ’
smart anganwadi at _ Civil and electrical .
2 . EW Division, | 8.65 Manjeshwar
Mannamkuzhy in Kasaragod works completed.
Mangalpady GP &
2023-24- Investigation- .
Construction of VCB cum ﬁf’ ;/i[:rllor Investigation work
3 |Bridge across Uppala river ed 6.40 |completed. Report to be |Manjeshwar
. . Division, .
in Madanthoor Bekur village K asaracod submitted
of Mangalpady GP- 6.4 L &
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD
Development for PHC Buildings :
4 Arikady in Kumbala GP- | Division, 126.00 | Work completed Manjeshwar
(2021-22)- 1.26 cr Kasaragod
Toilet block plastering
work completed, Rain
shelter, ticket counter-
plinth beam concreting,
2022-23- Development of  |D.D, District basement work etc
5 |Kanwatheertha beach at Tourism, 3.49 |completed, laterite Manjeshwar
Manjeshwar- 1.1537 cr Kasaragod masonry work
progressing. Container
has been placed. Agreed
to complete the work by
March 2025
Investigation- construction |{E.E, Minor
of overhead water tank for |Irrigation . Work completed and-
®  |the lift irrigation scheme at | Division, 0-90 1 paid Kasaragod

Athithamoola- Uyithadukka

Kasaragod




in Karadka G.P

GP (31 Nos)- 1.47 cr

- |Kasaragod

submitted

Construction of smart EE,LID &
7 |anganwadi at Kattathbayal in|EW Division, | 10.31 | Work completed Kasaragod
Karadka GP Kasaragod
Construction of smart EE,LID &
8 |anganwadi at Koyakudlu in |EW Division, | 10.31 |Work completed Kasaragod
Karadka GP Kasaragod
Investigation- Construction |E.E, Minor Investication work
of VCB at Vellarikkandam  |Irrigation gation work.
9 . . Lo 6.00 |completed, invesigation |Kasaragod
across Nekraje thodu in 4th | Division, renort under Droeress
ward of Chengala G.P Kasaragod P prog
Civil and electrical
Construction of smart EE, LID & works completed.
.10 |anganwadi at Kattathbayal |EW Division, | 10.31 |Drinking water- water ~ |Kasaragod
mini in Karadka GP Kasaragod will be collect from
nearby bore well.
Upgradation of E.E, Harbour
Perumbalakadavu Thuruthi |Engineering Work comp leted.(}C first _
11 road in Division 88.00 |and part bill pending for [Kasaragod
Kasaragod Municipality Kasaragod payment.
Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
12 |smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 12.92 works completed Kasaragod
Chenakkod in Madhur GP | Kasaragod P '
Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
13 {smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 12.92 works completed Kasaragod
Varkathotty in Madhur GP | Kasaragod p '
: Construction of E.E,LID & . Civil and electrical
14 |smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 7.31 works completed Kasaragod
Kuthirappady in Madhur GP |Kasaragod p '
GF-structure work
. completed. Risk and cost
2022-23- Construction of g g 11p & terminated, work
15 ?\Id 2;; a:g;pr : adk GP EW Division, | 2.24 [tendered, no bid, The Kasaragod
]Oa3 ]a \L ran baradka bt 1K asaragod meeting detected to
' invite the tender again
o o and follow up
2022-23- Construction of g;’:;gi:ggn 10 nos completed. Bill
16 |ring check dams in Bellur Officer 6.77 |forRs.11.68 Listobe {Kasaragod




2024-25- Ventilation and
Allied Electrical Works at

)

Director of

Preparation of TS
document in progress.

239 cr

Kasaragod

Ongoing

17 Academic Block of KMC- ggfclgglon 0.29 Agreed to complete the Kasaragod
78.57 L (2019-20) work within 6 months
Construction of smart E.E,LID &

18 {anganwadi at Balanadukkam {EW Division, | 11.92 [Work completed Uduma
in Bedaduka GP Kasaragod
o Comono |opupe | ot v

19 ganwadi & . |EW Division, | 1131 preec. Uduma

' Koppalamkochi in Muliyar K asaracod Borewell work (GP)-
GP-11.31L 5 agreement executed,
2022-23- Construction of civil and electrical work

" EE,LID &
smart anganwadi at Nusrath |- - completed. Borewell,

20 . . EW Division, | 16.92 . Uduma
Nagar in Muliayar GP- K asaraeod Electrical work to be
16.92 L & executed by GP.

2022-23- Construction of civil works and electrical
T EE,LID &

91 smart anganwadi at EW Division 8 65 works completed.GP Uduma
Annappadi in Kuttikol GP- K asaragod ’ ' FUND-Bore well
8.65L _ & dug,motor fixed.

2022-23- Recc}nstruction of |E.E, Minor
Meengoth VCB across Irrigation
22 Meengoth thodu at Pullur | Division, 82.76 | Work completed. Uduma
Periya GP- 83.6 L Kasaragod
GF-structure work
completed. Risk and cost
2022-23- Constr}lctlon of EE, LID & terminated, work

)3 |SMart anganwadi at EW Division 461 tendered, opened on Uduma
Alanadukkam in Muliyar K asaragod ’ ' 15.01.25. The meeting
GP- 16.42 L 8 detected to invite the

tender again and follow
up
. Storeshed foundation
2022-23- Construction VCB frf ;:ilé‘;‘” ‘S‘t";;’lfézt?gr Z’Iatg;i'}f
24 |cum Bridge at Kunduchi in r1ea 19.12 Pp Uduma
Bedaduka GP- 99 L Division, road DR work. Agreed to
' Kasaragod completed the work by
March 2025
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Finishing work ongoing
development for PHC Buildings (painting) 92%. 4
25 Kalanad in Chemnad G.P-  |Division, 104.39 Electrical works -CW- Uduma




E.E, PWD

Chamundikkunnu in Ajanoor
GP-29.98L

Kasaragod

meeting directed to
review the project in the
next meeting

2022-23- Infrastructure Buildin Revised AS obtained.
26 |development to GLPS Divisiox%s 23.14 | Work to be restarted. Uduma
Chemnad East- 1.3 cr ’ (90%)
Kasaragod
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Laterite work completed
development to GLPS Buildings (70%). Agreed to
27 Kalanad Old in Chemnad  |Division, 15.09 complete the work by Uduma
G.P-1lecr Kasaragod March 2025
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Laterite masonry,
development for GUPS Buildings plastering work
28 | Thekkil Paramba in Division, 2275 | ongoing(80%). Electrical | ©0UMa
Chemnad G.P- 2.11 er Kasaragod work- ongoing
2022-23- Infrastructure EE, LID & N .
development for GWLPS ~ e s civil and electrical work
29 . . EW Division, 14 Kanhangad
Naikayam in Kodom Belur K asaracod completed.
G.P-14 L £0
. civil and electrical work
20222 Lonstuction of g g, 11D & completed. GP FUND-
30 | ga! EW Division, | 12.92 |Bore well dug, ICDS Kanhangad
Peruthady in Panathady GP- . .
Kasaragod fund will be obtained
1292 L :
soon for fixing motor
"+ |Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
31 |smart anganwadi at Alayiin |EW Division, | 7.31 works completed Kanhangad
Madikkai GP Kasaragod P )
2022-23- Construction of E.E. Minor
VCB cum bridge across Ir.ri ,ation Work completed on
32 |Chullikkara Kottody thodu | : &o; 80.19 |30.11.2024. 2nd part bill |Kanhangad
. Division, .
at Payyacheri in Kallar GP- submitted.
Kasaragod
81L
202‘;25' C"“Sg.”":“’“ of |gE LID& Civil work completed.
33 [Jnartanganwadia EW Division, | 9.65 |Ele- agmt to be executed |Kanhangad
Balamthode in Panathady K asaragod by GP
GP-9.65 L g Y
Civil work completed,
2022-23- Construction of %f,helr(w‘?lr]kb‘s n p“ig:efis'
' rt anganwadi at DWCDO YOTK Wil be complete
34 308 ’ 4.81 |in February 2025. The |Kanhangad




Sorheny

[

N

2023-24- Infrastructure
development to GLPS South

t

DD,

Column raised up to linel

35 Chithari in Aianur G.P- Education, 4.58 |le. Laterite masonry up |Kanhangad
70.48 L Je ' Kasaragod to lintel level completed.
2023-24- Infrastructure .
development to GLPS D.D, . : Laterite mason.ry'for
36 Peruthady in Panathady G.P- Education, 14.73 |superstructure is in Kanhangad
3L y yu Kasaragod progress.
2023-24- Infrastructure DD Plinth beam work
37 deye}opment to .GUI?S Education, 20.50 |°MP leted, Cglqmn Kanhangad
Puthiyakandam in Ajanur Kasaracod raising up to lintel level
G.P-1025L , & is in progress.
2022-23- Strengthening of | D.M.O E tf';lizre ':)of‘if:mf;’r the
38 |infrastructure facilitiesat | (Health), 26.85 pﬁb‘]’ishe 3. Opening Date | K2nhangad
DH Kanhangad- 114.69 L |Kasaragod P  ~pening
' : 06/02/2025 at 10.30
Construction of smart E.E,LID &
39 |anganwadi at Karakkeruin |EW Division, | 14.92 |Work completed Trikaripur
Pilicode GP Kasaragod
. civil and electrical work
2022 7;”1 - fn"\zzgi”::‘m of |EE LID& completed.GP FUND-
40 Ma dakkzﬁ Mini in EW Division, | 10.15 |Bore well dug, ICDS Trikaripur
) ' Kasaragod fund will be obtained
Valiyaparamba GP- 10.15L :
soon for fixing motor
Constructlon of . EE, LID & N '
41 |Smart-anganwadi at EW Division 8.65 Civil and electrical Trikaripur
Kottappuram in Nileshwar Kasarasod ’ ’ works completed.
Municipality &
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD
42 develop ment for GHSS Bl.m.d.l nes 123.00 | Work completed Trikaripur
Cheemeni in Kayyur Division,
Cheemeni G.P- 1.23 cr Kasaragod
e ool ot
43 [ e EW Division, | 7.31 | Work completed. Trikaripur
uttama ‘ Kasaragod
Cheruvathur GP- 7.31L
" |2022-23- Gidshomeat  |D.D, . -
44 |Palathadam in Nileshwar-  |Education, | 39,93 |R0OfSlabconcreting oy oo

2.015Cr

Kasaragod

completed




Works of 7 ring check

2022-23- Construction of | Principal dams 90% completed, 1 .
. . . . , Manjeshwar
ring check dams in Agriculture ring check dam's earth
45 AR 21.28 . &
Kumbala- Kayyur Cheemeni | Officer, work completed. 2 ring Trikari
G.Ps (3&8 Nos)- 45.12L  |Kasaragod check dams work not yet ripur
started.
Strengthening of primary DM.O Bill for Rs. 6.78 lakh for
NP , the supply of battery for
46  |health institutions in (Health), 7.28 : General
eHealth submitted. The
Kasaragod Kasaragod .
same is under process
Computerisation for e-office |Dy. Collector Computers and
47 |implementation of revenue |(General), 129.32 pute General
offices Kasaragod accessories purchased.
Setting up of modern D.D,
48 - |classrooms for Govt Schools |Education, 117.00 | Work completed General
in Kasaragod district Kasaragod
Computerisation for e-office |Dy. Collector
49 |implementation of revenue |(General), 171.07 V\;(i);k completed and General
offices- Phase 11 Kasaragod P
e Hospital treatment st
202323 Repabi atton of 1pMo and 2nd part bill paid.
50 o (Health), 462.90 |3rd, 4th and 5th part bill |General
Kasaragod District- 462.9 K d sted. L
takh asarago submitted. Letter sent fo
- Govt. for further sanction
Posted 11 Nursing (GH
D.M.O 2, DH 9), 2 dialysis
51 2022-23- Health Facilities in (IJ.Iea.l th) 750.00 technicians & 3 cleaning General
Kasaragod- 7.5 crore Kasara ;) d ' staff in GH. Letter sent
' g to Gowt. for further
sanction
Chief
2022-23- Management of  [Conservator
Human- Animal Conflict of Forests, Watchers are deployed.
32 issues in Kasaragod District- | Northern 25.00 Drone & torch supplied. General
25 lakh Circle,
- |Kannur . «
53 [2022-23- MUNNOT- Project | District 15.25 |[Classes have been General
for the integrated training for | Employment conducted till August
competitive examinations- | Officer, 2024. The duration of the
32.52L Kasaragod project is extended to

August 2025 and the




* | detailed report and bills

can be submitted up to
September 2025

54

2022-23- Vazhikatti-
Vocational Training for
children residing in child
care institutions- 9.36 L

District Child
Protection
Officer,
Kasaragod

2.38

ASAP has created batch
of Graphic Designing
course with 14 children
from Chemnad
Panchayath. They have
requested us to include 5
children who are ready
for attending Graphic
Designing Course and
prepared the list of the
children.

General

Total

2738.06




Kasaragod Development Package

Annexure
SL . Implementin | Amount
No. Name of Project g Agency @) Present Status LAC
1 2 3 4 5 6
Investigation-
~ {Reconstruction of VCB cum |E.E, Minor
bridge at Kaje near Irrigation Work completed. Report .
! Janardhana temple across Division, 3.60 not submitted Manjeshwar
Swarnagiri thodu in Kasaragod
Paivalike GP
Construction of . E.E, LID & N ’
smart anganwadi at _ Civil and electrical .
2 . EW Division, | 8.65 Manjeshwar
Mannamkuzhy in Kasaragod works completed.
Mangalpady GP &
2023-24- Investigation- .
Construction of VCB cum ﬁf’ ;/i[:rllor Investigation work
3 |Bridge across Uppala river ed 6.40 |completed. Report to be |Manjeshwar
. . Division, .
in Madanthoor Bekur village K asaracod submitted
of Mangalpady GP- 6.4 L &
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD
Development for PHC Buildings :
4 Arikady in Kumbala GP- | Division, 126.00 | Work completed Manjeshwar
(2021-22)- 1.26 cr Kasaragod
Toilet block plastering
work completed, Rain
shelter, ticket counter-
plinth beam concreting,
2022-23- Development of  |D.D, District basement work etc
5 |Kanwatheertha beach at Tourism, 3.49 |completed, laterite Manjeshwar
Manjeshwar- 1.1537 cr Kasaragod masonry work
progressing. Container
has been placed. Agreed
to complete the work by
March 2025
Investigation- construction |{E.E, Minor
of overhead water tank for |Irrigation . Work completed and-
®  |the lift irrigation scheme at | Division, 0-90 1 paid Kasaragod

Athithamoola- Uyithadukka

Kasaragod




in Karadka G.P

GP (31 Nos)- 1.47 cr

- |Kasaragod

submitted

Construction of smart EE,LID &
7 |anganwadi at Kattathbayal in|EW Division, | 10.31 | Work completed Kasaragod
Karadka GP Kasaragod
Construction of smart EE,LID &
8 |anganwadi at Koyakudlu in |EW Division, | 10.31 |Work completed Kasaragod
Karadka GP Kasaragod
Investigation- Construction |E.E, Minor Investication work
of VCB at Vellarikkandam  |Irrigation gation work.
9 . . Lo 6.00 |completed, invesigation |Kasaragod
across Nekraje thodu in 4th | Division, renort under Droeress
ward of Chengala G.P Kasaragod P prog
Civil and electrical
Construction of smart EE, LID & works completed.
.10 |anganwadi at Kattathbayal |EW Division, | 10.31 |Drinking water- water ~ |Kasaragod
mini in Karadka GP Kasaragod will be collect from
nearby bore well.
Upgradation of E.E, Harbour
Perumbalakadavu Thuruthi |Engineering Work comp leted.(}C first _
11 road in Division 88.00 |and part bill pending for [Kasaragod
Kasaragod Municipality Kasaragod payment.
Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
12 |smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 12.92 works completed Kasaragod
Chenakkod in Madhur GP | Kasaragod P '
Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
13 {smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 12.92 works completed Kasaragod
Varkathotty in Madhur GP | Kasaragod p '
: Construction of E.E,LID & . Civil and electrical
14 |smart anganwadi at EW Division, | 7.31 works completed Kasaragod
Kuthirappady in Madhur GP |Kasaragod p '
GF-structure work
. completed. Risk and cost
2022-23- Construction of g g 11p & terminated, work
15 ?\Id 2;; a:g;pr : adk GP EW Division, | 2.24 [tendered, no bid, The Kasaragod
]Oa3 ]a \L ran baradka bt 1K asaragod meeting detected to
' invite the tender again
o o and follow up
2022-23- Construction of g;’:;gi:ggn 10 nos completed. Bill
16 |ring check dams in Bellur Officer 6.77 |forRs.11.68 Listobe {Kasaragod




2024-25- Ventilation and
Allied Electrical Works at

)

Director of

Preparation of TS
document in progress.

239 cr

Kasaragod

Ongoing

17 Academic Block of KMC- ggfclgglon 0.29 Agreed to complete the Kasaragod
78.57 L (2019-20) work within 6 months
Construction of smart E.E,LID &

18 {anganwadi at Balanadukkam {EW Division, | 11.92 [Work completed Uduma
in Bedaduka GP Kasaragod
o Comono |opupe | ot v

19 ganwadi & . |EW Division, | 1131 preec. Uduma

' Koppalamkochi in Muliyar K asaracod Borewell work (GP)-
GP-11.31L 5 agreement executed,
2022-23- Construction of civil and electrical work

" EE,LID &
smart anganwadi at Nusrath |- - completed. Borewell,

20 . . EW Division, | 16.92 . Uduma
Nagar in Muliayar GP- K asaraeod Electrical work to be
16.92 L & executed by GP.

2022-23- Construction of civil works and electrical
T EE,LID &

91 smart anganwadi at EW Division 8 65 works completed.GP Uduma
Annappadi in Kuttikol GP- K asaragod ’ ' FUND-Bore well
8.65L _ & dug,motor fixed.

2022-23- Recc}nstruction of |E.E, Minor
Meengoth VCB across Irrigation
22 Meengoth thodu at Pullur | Division, 82.76 | Work completed. Uduma
Periya GP- 83.6 L Kasaragod
GF-structure work
completed. Risk and cost
2022-23- Constr}lctlon of EE, LID & terminated, work

)3 |SMart anganwadi at EW Division 461 tendered, opened on Uduma
Alanadukkam in Muliyar K asaragod ’ ' 15.01.25. The meeting
GP- 16.42 L 8 detected to invite the

tender again and follow
up
. Storeshed foundation
2022-23- Construction VCB frf ;:ilé‘;‘” ‘S‘t";;’lfézt?gr Z’Iatg;i'}f
24 |cum Bridge at Kunduchi in r1ea 19.12 Pp Uduma
Bedaduka GP- 99 L Division, road DR work. Agreed to
' Kasaragod completed the work by
March 2025
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Finishing work ongoing
development for PHC Buildings (painting) 92%. 4
25 Kalanad in Chemnad G.P-  |Division, 104.39 Electrical works -CW- Uduma




E.E, PWD

Chamundikkunnu in Ajanoor
GP-29.98L

Kasaragod

meeting directed to
review the project in the
next meeting

2022-23- Infrastructure Buildin Revised AS obtained.
26 |development to GLPS Divisiox%s 23.14 | Work to be restarted. Uduma
Chemnad East- 1.3 cr ’ (90%)
Kasaragod
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Laterite work completed
development to GLPS Buildings (70%). Agreed to
27 Kalanad Old in Chemnad  |Division, 15.09 complete the work by Uduma
G.P-1lecr Kasaragod March 2025
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD Laterite masonry,
development for GUPS Buildings plastering work
28 | Thekkil Paramba in Division, 2275 | ongoing(80%). Electrical | ©0UMa
Chemnad G.P- 2.11 er Kasaragod work- ongoing
2022-23- Infrastructure EE, LID & N .
development for GWLPS ~ e s civil and electrical work
29 . . EW Division, 14 Kanhangad
Naikayam in Kodom Belur K asaracod completed.
G.P-14 L £0
. civil and electrical work
20222 Lonstuction of g g, 11D & completed. GP FUND-
30 | ga! EW Division, | 12.92 |Bore well dug, ICDS Kanhangad
Peruthady in Panathady GP- . .
Kasaragod fund will be obtained
1292 L :
soon for fixing motor
"+ |Construction of E.E,LID & Civil and electrical
31 |smart anganwadi at Alayiin |EW Division, | 7.31 works completed Kanhangad
Madikkai GP Kasaragod P )
2022-23- Construction of E.E. Minor
VCB cum bridge across Ir.ri ,ation Work completed on
32 |Chullikkara Kottody thodu | : &o; 80.19 |30.11.2024. 2nd part bill |Kanhangad
. Division, .
at Payyacheri in Kallar GP- submitted.
Kasaragod
81L
202‘;25' C"“Sg.”":“’“ of |gE LID& Civil work completed.
33 [Jnartanganwadia EW Division, | 9.65 |Ele- agmt to be executed |Kanhangad
Balamthode in Panathady K asaragod by GP
GP-9.65 L g Y
Civil work completed,
2022-23- Construction of %f,helr(w‘?lr]kb‘s n p“ig:efis'
' rt anganwadi at DWCDO YOTK Wil be complete
34 308 ’ 4.81 |in February 2025. The |Kanhangad




Sorheny

[

N

2023-24- Infrastructure
development to GLPS South

t

DD,

Column raised up to linel

35 Chithari in Aianur G.P- Education, 4.58 |le. Laterite masonry up |Kanhangad
70.48 L Je ' Kasaragod to lintel level completed.
2023-24- Infrastructure .
development to GLPS D.D, . : Laterite mason.ry'for
36 Peruthady in Panathady G.P- Education, 14.73 |superstructure is in Kanhangad
3L y yu Kasaragod progress.
2023-24- Infrastructure DD Plinth beam work
37 deye}opment to .GUI?S Education, 20.50 |°MP leted, Cglqmn Kanhangad
Puthiyakandam in Ajanur Kasaracod raising up to lintel level
G.P-1025L , & is in progress.
2022-23- Strengthening of | D.M.O E tf';lizre ':)of‘if:mf;’r the
38 |infrastructure facilitiesat | (Health), 26.85 pﬁb‘]’ishe 3. Opening Date | K2nhangad
DH Kanhangad- 114.69 L |Kasaragod P  ~pening
' : 06/02/2025 at 10.30
Construction of smart E.E,LID &
39 |anganwadi at Karakkeruin |EW Division, | 14.92 |Work completed Trikaripur
Pilicode GP Kasaragod
. civil and electrical work
2022 7;”1 - fn"\zzgi”::‘m of |EE LID& completed.GP FUND-
40 Ma dakkzﬁ Mini in EW Division, | 10.15 |Bore well dug, ICDS Trikaripur
) ' Kasaragod fund will be obtained
Valiyaparamba GP- 10.15L :
soon for fixing motor
Constructlon of . EE, LID & N '
41 |Smart-anganwadi at EW Division 8.65 Civil and electrical Trikaripur
Kottappuram in Nileshwar Kasarasod ’ ’ works completed.
Municipality &
2022-23- Infrastructure E.E, PWD
42 develop ment for GHSS Bl.m.d.l nes 123.00 | Work completed Trikaripur
Cheemeni in Kayyur Division,
Cheemeni G.P- 1.23 cr Kasaragod
e ool ot
43 [ e EW Division, | 7.31 | Work completed. Trikaripur
uttama ‘ Kasaragod
Cheruvathur GP- 7.31L
" |2022-23- Gidshomeat  |D.D, . -
44 |Palathadam in Nileshwar-  |Education, | 39,93 |R0OfSlabconcreting oy oo

2.015Cr

Kasaragod

completed




Works of 7 ring check

2022-23- Construction of | Principal dams 90% completed, 1 .
. . . . , Manjeshwar
ring check dams in Agriculture ring check dam's earth
45 AR 21.28 . &
Kumbala- Kayyur Cheemeni | Officer, work completed. 2 ring Trikari
G.Ps (3&8 Nos)- 45.12L  |Kasaragod check dams work not yet ripur
started.
Strengthening of primary DM.O Bill for Rs. 6.78 lakh for
NP , the supply of battery for
46  |health institutions in (Health), 7.28 : General
eHealth submitted. The
Kasaragod Kasaragod .
same is under process
Computerisation for e-office |Dy. Collector Computers and
47 |implementation of revenue |(General), 129.32 pute General
offices Kasaragod accessories purchased.
Setting up of modern D.D,
48 - |classrooms for Govt Schools |Education, 117.00 | Work completed General
in Kasaragod district Kasaragod
Computerisation for e-office |Dy. Collector
49 |implementation of revenue |(General), 171.07 V\;(i);k completed and General
offices- Phase 11 Kasaragod P
e Hospital treatment st
202323 Repabi atton of 1pMo and 2nd part bill paid.
50 o (Health), 462.90 |3rd, 4th and 5th part bill |General
Kasaragod District- 462.9 K d sted. L
takh asarago submitted. Letter sent fo
- Govt. for further sanction
Posted 11 Nursing (GH
D.M.O 2, DH 9), 2 dialysis
51 2022-23- Health Facilities in (IJ.Iea.l th) 750.00 technicians & 3 cleaning General
Kasaragod- 7.5 crore Kasara ;) d ' staff in GH. Letter sent
' g to Gowt. for further
sanction
Chief
2022-23- Management of  [Conservator
Human- Animal Conflict of Forests, Watchers are deployed.
32 issues in Kasaragod District- | Northern 25.00 Drone & torch supplied. General
25 lakh Circle,
- |Kannur . «
53 [2022-23- MUNNOT- Project | District 15.25 |[Classes have been General
for the integrated training for | Employment conducted till August
competitive examinations- | Officer, 2024. The duration of the
32.52L Kasaragod project is extended to

August 2025 and the




* | detailed report and bills

can be submitted up to
September 2025

54

2022-23- Vazhikatti-
Vocational Training for
children residing in child
care institutions- 9.36 L

District Child
Protection
Officer,
Kasaragod

2.38

ASAP has created batch
of Graphic Designing
course with 14 children
from Chemnad
Panchayath. They have
requested us to include 5
children who are ready
for attending Graphic
Designing Course and
prepared the list of the
children.

General

Total

2738.06




