Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
1

VII. aigomimgs ee3u®1agns aldlneamm

aflaf” Aflaf (GAWI. ag)M. RWIR): aVd, 2021-6L1 CHO8 aleIOVWOD

mil@dwlow)” @gleel ey’ 12, 13, 14 agamlaiowae|glwosm” @wimadwoe
al0@IMBB®. OMID (@JWIMSalS AllaH®Wo 2fAMINEMAN™ Qlaj0@3 B30IUI
@ lGHNUM  OHISOMW  HYlaomIas 15 claive aee  amendment
@REIBOMWINM” HBMZENSBM®. 30 B11vo 2@’ 15 @RYEs B:04).
aleau alengo Hoilles” 15 3laive VAo OGISEMIGBaN. GHoX1FIWeS

al@lwemMmQGUaro 1S deem to have been given  agamoem’

a 1060 1B1H80M@). alddH @R INCWaHo  QfleNZHNI@ el ImMel’
BlaIvo@S]  OHISOD). WLNANOIEE Mmoaud 9©63wly 30
Slairvom 1008363103 alem] @00 159N @RA0AQIIB0

HHIFANMHOMBBMIM” @Y BT BHITU DM AflNZAAOW o IDIMEI
310INV00QINO BREAIGHHM HIOHICIESHME] AUBONOHANIT (@JUYAIEM” 61T
oJElo90g10@ .  6Hoay” 14(2)-enem” O JRASS®.  2OQIWHI0 o,

oo®loel  aESlaNlHNg af)MMalOQM®”  @INIGLOODI3  HOTVIalgIem:



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
2
OO0V G100 ld:00 TVBSla01EN]” af)iMDo MAYOS GaNIN1M3 @RS a1B1L8M®
eMe  allal@l®mimoeam. @R® &0y  0alQleeisod 6)o<m°]ojggo
(TU(3§1QD1£®%O OO 1e|H8BIG3 Doy OENBIG:HAANDIMN  (@JWIMAIW]
al0@IMBB®.  @RFOM®IW],  SaHOIQAOW]  MINWe]S  AflaHWAd6M.
SaHOIQAIW] MINWOalS GMOOE® OlMVAAI" MINEHIHAZ BT AWLOBHUN
mlelne|Bs®oam. @RMIV®” 80 m@quoeasp’]mm MIdWHHNIBAN AW 13
@P@IWId o  MIOWIa)ai@o  K000101G:  MIEUIRSBBAUGBNIW  BRYBBHUIHS”
M@3H1DB1HBM  BOIMGLNAME.  @P@IG 06N HHI0|6EBSINOSIO).
@P®IoeaN”  olavdal”  MmIe1ea) B3 WQOHHUM  CMOHODDHAN
mlelnflelns] ;-89 j60glal” aioesaudaso All State and Central co-
operative eniogsdW3dso MM MIdWHAINIMHINIW ADWOHHUID BMODD
@6 308WONEJBPq ISOMIXIgEs®em.  mo@ael commercial  bank-
HWBHBo  M® MIWHAEM.  @RANISOHO®  B@GBLONAVAM M@ IMOIW]

aflgloeiom] alyemIQes @M Mo)aUM  af)SOMIG OM]. D HNIO o

SaHO1H9” M@0  MNIDWHALIODDIMIT  SaHOTHABZEST  MNIdWHAIBH]WIB3



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
3
@POQIWHIA88  (Je® Klaf 80 m@quoea@mm af)LDAIBHB0 M@
NI H NI BB HWINEME, 103 @RQIRHS &6)0D83S]

(@JEWIRM(@JBAIHOAMNDIM OV BRHANGHNNGINHM JWIMSalS DEZUo.

2OQOAM oem‘s](om&%jomﬂ NINWE A SDIEM, Jay® af) V. @RYA. 63.-
Wleel  (@UOAIMINEMINVNILOT  CROMQYBS  MIEMOZ A" 9]
@RoWNEBBBHS  agf)lNo A I®IMHAUM” o l0QHQo  DSBAM,  @INP ]ORN
@BROWEBBBOS  af)ANADSOMIBE BRAIGE 18 Cal®BUBNSHWo  6).21QMME!
215O1@3 15 ag)am” al0Qd®H@o BRomMVoaIYI@3 18 AIele:0 621QGMIUY
303 @RO1LING3 HOQUTMEL Jo M1eINm1@3As3aM@ 1MI3 @O
BY1I0IHNEIMHAMDIM (@JWIMAa g QllaHWo. mn%lgomﬂ MNINWealg N
aflvosdowsEBglerlQ)”  6mOd HSHBAMIEL. M GRBUNM1HHUY

@01 A1HHEMHAN” @E | BLO1HE30T.

(1) 2021 @3 28-20 @lomleel =. 8. (ag)o. af)av)
Mo. 120/2021/ag)@3. agyav’.2).all. (ag)av.@rd.6. Mo.482/2021) neaimn
0409q150M{Isgss 2021-901 6508 alsmIoem” mlaulow)” (@ROAMHANT)

Qudany”




Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
4

allaf” aflof (BWI. ag@. ROEXR): aud, 2021 @@em 28-%

oloololeel 2. & (afo. apaV) mo. 120/2021/ag)@3.agyand” . aw.
(e @RAd.6. mo. 482/2021) aeaim ajosqlgalaflgss 2021-ee1 coog
ale@om  milddawlew” (@eeaageonad) Quday’ 2021  aigEBgIcd

@INP2|OQAN GRBUVMIHHUY I BRAIM o [lHsa.

I.  In Principal Rule 2(1)(i) proposed to be amended by Rule 2(1)
(a) after the word “ acknowledgement” the word “ receipt”
shall be inserted.

2. In the Table under the principal Rule 5(4), against SI no.5 in
Column 3 proposed to be amended by Rule 2(4)(i1) for the

word “ Panchayat” the words “ Panchayat Committee
concerned” shall be substituted.

3. In Principal Rule 14(3) proposed to be amended by Rule 2(8)
(b) for the words “ forty five days” the words “ thirty days”
shall be substituted.

4. In Principal Rule 15(1) proposed to be amended by Rule 2(9)
(a) before the word “ acknowledgement” the words “ or an”
shall be inserted.

5. In Principal Rule 15(2) proposed to be amended by Rule 2(9)
(b) for the words “ acknowledgement certificate” the words

13

acknowledgement receipt” shall be substituted.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
5

6. In Principal Rule 15(4) proposed to be amended by Rule 2(9)
(c) for the words “ acknowledgement certificate” the words
“ acknowledgement receipt” shall be substituted.

7. In the Marginal Heading of Rule 19A proposed to be inserted

in the Principal Rule by Rule 2(10) for the words
“ acknowledgement certificate” the words
“ acknowledgement receipt” shall be substituted.
8. In Rule 19A(2) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Rule
by Rule 2(10) delete “ in Appendix-A1A” .
9. In Rule 19A(2) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Rule
by Rule 2(10) In Rule 2(10) for the words “ acknowledgement
certificate” the words “ acknowledgement receipt” shall be
substituted.

10. In Rule 99(7) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Rule by
Rule 2(16) delete “ Institution/” .

11.  In the second para occuring after Rule 99(7) proposed to be
inserted in the Principal Rule by Rule 2(16) shall be numbered
aS 13 (8)57 .

12. In the second para of Rule 99(7) proposed to be inserted in
the Principal Rule by Rule 2(16) for the words “ The fee” the
words “ The one time fee” shall be substituted.

13. In the second para of Rule 99(7) proposed to be inserted in
the Principal Rule by Rule 2(16) after the words “ shall be” the

word “ at” shall be inserted.

®GRUOIVIWORMEMAJo  af)dRRIYo  aldBeInndn]ld:0040jo moemd@ﬂ

(W) ago. mil. ©IERH): aVB, 2021-021 CHO8 ale®WOD® mNc3alowy”




Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
6
(@Ronadonad) QUMM MITWea]S af)aV. @RA. &. mo. 482/2021-m"
GAWI. af)M. RVOIE" @PAUMGIafla] 4, 13 agan1 ®MUB GERVLM1B:U3

V1B 1H630M0.

ol aleed:  MIaondMeals @)1 auilddla]  GCRBLMIHUW  aVE

%

@010 12 f101H6300. ile) GRBULM 1HHUY MVEWHS @R IGWINS

afladaiefl aflelesa.

(2) 2021 @em 28-00 @lomeel . &.. (af)o.af)av’) Mo.
121/2021/ ag)@3. agyarv’. 22). a. (af)aV”@d.63. Mmo. 483/2021) acaim

a00q50Maflsss 2021-0e1 cH08 amlavla pelgl snlawlew)” (GReOngHAIZ)

e

QUAN

aflan” ofla | (6awo. o). RWoR): 2021 @6 28-00 @lomwlsel 2. a.

(ag)o. afy)mo. 121/2021/ag)@B. agyand”.2l.al). (ag)aV”@Rad.63. Mo.483/2021)
QeaIM  aJooqlgoflaflsgss 2021-ee1 coog gmlavieelgl  emiladauslowy”
(@ronagonad) Quday” 2021 1156aB81a @09q0Qan GEELMIHU3 amId

@AM [lasano.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
7

I.  In Principal Rule 2(1)(1) proposed to be amended by Rule 2(1)

(a) after the word “ acknowledgment” the word “ receipt”

shall be inserted.

2. In the Table under the Principal Rule 5(4), against Sl. no. 5 in
Column 3 proposed to be amended by Rule 2(4)(i1) for the
word “ Municipality” the words “ municipality council

concerned”  shall be substituted.

3. In Principal Rule 14(3) proposed to be amended by Rule 2(8)

(b) for the words “ forty five days” the words “ Thirty days”

shall be substituted.

4.  In Principal Rule 15(1) proposed to be amended by Rule 2(9)

(a) before the word “ acknowledgment” the words “ or an”

shall be inserted.

5. In Principal Rule 15(2) proposed to be amended by Rule 2(9)

(b) for the words “ acknowledgment certificate” the words
“ acknowledgment receipt” shall be substituted.

6. In Principal Rule 15(4) proposed to be amended by Rule 2(9)

(c) for the words “ acknowledgment certificate” the words
“ acknowledgment receipt” shall be substituted.

7. In the Marginal Heading of Rule 19A proposed to be inserted

in the Principal Rule by Rule 2(10) for the words

“ acknowledgment certificate” the words “ acknowledgment

receipt” shall be  substituted.

8. In Rule 19A(2) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Rule

by Rule 2(10) delete “ in Appendix-A1A” .

9. In Rule 19A(2) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Rule

by Rule 2(10) for the words “ Acknowledgment Certificate”

the words “ Acknowledgment Receipt” shall be substituted.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
8

10. In Rule 19B(1) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Rule

by Rule 2(10) for the words “ as intimate to the authority” the
words “ shall intimate the authority concerned” shall be
substituted.

11.  In Rule 99(7) proposed to be inserted in the Principal Rule by
Rule 2(15) delete “ Institution/” .

12. The second paragraph occuring after Rule 99(7) proposed to
be inserted in the Principal Rule by Rule 2(15) shall be
numbered as sub-rule “ (8)” .

13. The second paragraph of Rule 99(7) proposed to be inserted
in the Principal Rule by Rule 2(15) for the words “ The

fee the words “ The one time fee” shall be substituted.

14. The second paragraph of Rule 99(7) proposed to be inserted

in  the Principal Rule by Rule 2(15) after the words “ shall
be” the word “ at” shall be inserted.

15. In Appendix AIA proposed to be inserted in the Principal

Rule by Rule 2(17), in the entry against serial no. 9 for the

letters  “ KPBR” the letters © KMBR” shall be substituted.

16. In Appendix AIA proposed to be inserted in the Principal

Rule by Rule 2(17), in the entry against serial no. 19 for the

words  and figures “ Kerala Panchayth Building Rules 2019

the words, symbol and figures “ Kerala Municipality Building

Rules, 2019” shall be substituted.

17. In Appendix AIA proposed to be inserted in the Principal
Rule by Rule 2(17), in the entry against serial no. 19 for the
words and figures “ Kerala Panchayath Raj Act, 1994” the
words, symbol and figures “ Kerala Municipality Act, 1994
(200f 1  994)” shall be substituted.

2



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
9

®GRUOIVIWORMEMAJo  af)dDRIYo  aldBeInndnld:0040o O.lc@u()d@fl

(W afo. mil. EIcRH): VB, 202]1-0.1 ¢HO8 alemdVO® naalow”

(@ReagHnad) QUMW MIMLAA]g ofaV. @BA. &. Mo. 483/2021-m"
GAI. af)M. ROl @AU®Glafla) 4, 10, 14, 15, 16, 17 agam1 maud

GRANVMIHHUI AV 1HHA1H630M.

ol.  aVleenad:  MIa0mIMeals @1 aVlHEla  GRROMIHUE Ve

el

@R 10 12,{101H60M0. o) GRBNM 1MUY QVEWHIS @RIV 1GWINS

afladalei afleleasao.

(3) 2020 @peel 01-00 ®omIwlsel av. 9. (@Rals]) mo. 89/2020/wmo.

(e’ @RA.68. Mo. 726/2020) eaIm 0 j0oq gofafisss 2020-0e1 ¢o08
SaH0] (BaNIM®” CRAROLMI) 21S6BBUY

alla0” aflo | (6. oM. RwooR): 2020 @ooel 01-00 ®l@Wlsel

a.9. (@oa)sl) mo. 89/2020/wmo.(agaV.@d.a8. mMo.726/2020) aeeIm
ajooqfzoilaflgss 2020-001 ¢H08 Sauol (BIMI® EE3V®])  156EBRSE1G3

@INP 0N GRBUM KU NI BRAIMO 1o {losmo.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
10

I.  In Rule 19, Note 2 of Appendix 3 of the Kerala Treasury

Rules, 1963-Volume II, proposed to be amended by Rule 2, after
the words "holder 1s", the words and symbol "above eighty years
of age, on his request or" shall be inserted.

2. InRule 19, Note 2 of Appendix 3 of the Kerala Treasury Rules,
1963-Volume II, proposed to be amended by Rule 2, after the
word "Parliament”, the words "or the thumb impression is

identified by a responsible treasury official as witness" shall be
inserted.
WMS00Y Qi [A] (1. Od. afM. MNINRIGNININD): aua,

MHEBROMHVWIG  GRRNWM1 GMISINV MM@IHIW  GAWI. o). RWEIRIOHM
@RYRIR0WT @BREIMMIARHWIGM. HAMO0 HIQLEEBRUT §)2IQIMBB WIVIBo
MIWIDHUWY MM @ERMVoMIWIGE  MYATLEd  AVINIZETHHBHSENE
@RE300M1H3 DD DBINAMIEIOS 0930%@51 NDDOAICTMINS )TV BYA. 63.
2005006003 naleMenagdlead @aimleayg’lal Wl jodgenad”
@EEBOAAD H0 0 DORIEM”. BREGaO0 A lOGONISBS E6NE” B006EREE3 80
QUM HY1eMAUBHS" SaHO1WI@MIM0 aleMo alladaILNesmM@IM” 641010
snjevlggens. Melnl@d @oWEBRAEMY aB® BDSaldgdI38830 02189103 ol

CORUOISO™IT MRS GMAIFMM  aldHo DH aldQVIGH] MTIHHIMSS



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
11

@AM afaV i @rd.8.  maud  726/2020 .15 ceru™]

20|50l Me)nS TVABHNIA LIGHUINIS®. af)ANIB3 GALI. af)0d. RWOIXR’

@RAIM@Ta{la] 8aNJo CRRLMT MIBERU0 BRoUTMHAIABIMald:Ho, BRYVD), 80

QI@To @M IMVAGHSBIC3 (JOVWABBAIBHBo  AN@DIW] sl alyoiaun
101 1M STV  AlYILOMIHENIAD  AVIW §OQYBB@IE. BRDE NS’

JIR® eI BRoW1HAIEHNMBDIL]. EMRIAMIW], M1elnfl@d EEIWIWo
JOQIAILIMNIMAIY MSalFHIABS SaUGT GIVANo IV’ §.aloN1B3 63a (1S0d
HPIWITD  TVI02I0JOWIM  @JIP®  BRHOVNS" DSARHUW  AlELISWIBo
2l al®lal B8 WALV’  %anlrud,  afleelx”  80a01Iua,
(DIDAIMIIVWOD 1HLIGWI GENIODS a eIV 1OLICWI =eld
a1V OD 1HLICWO QMaVla pelglolericw CHIBn]B0aUMIDRICWI
MYATVERWIHLIGWI GRIDHMVRWIHLIGYI @ 10N HNN IS
20O INIWHUT  TVIGHIDAISOD]T MDBH1VWI@  BRD  aldAVISFIN@IM
S0l B32a01TVH0  BRWIGHIV0QISOMIVISBB®ILMD.  (JIYD DAV’

302010038 MVIMIVAE IYEJiE” ADEIBS SaHO1 Ba0TTVAE 9UINAISISBBGOG:T.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
12

af)OMO@3  GAWI. af)M. RWOIX" af)o.af)@8.af).-QAS ©6NJo  GRBRNMI
M1BEROMIT SatO]l BallaH{@3 af)IM o IBADIM” AIYHDOWILIODH@IMIG3

@RYO® FBAILIAILINTHNNAISIAT TVIW YO YBBDE) HIENE” JIR® GR_RBULMIWo

@T@om%e;(o%esam1%.

2. aYlead: GaI. af)M. RWOIXR" GRAIMNOIq{la] GRARVLMIBHUY (@AY’

@mc%macsmo?

GADI. af)M. RVWAIR" AVAE, HNIMW GBBNM 1MUY @JAV” H.algaNg.

ol. aV1eNA@: GAWI. af)Md. RWOIR" BRAIMO o [la] CRROMIMHUT MVRWQYHS

@RMAMICWINS CRBRVMI1KHU3 alladalell aflolasao.

(4) 2024 865,013 2-00 ®lo®IWeel Q. ©. (@R2S1)

mo. 52/2024/maviral. (ag)aV’@ryd.a. mo. 1104/2024) neaim
0409q 1500 aIgsss 2024-001 GH08 aIeMOVON” 0" (JNIEBIV
UNJa INEBRUIGREAIMNEIQYSB8 MM oW Ho1Q1 215688U3)

aflan” aflaf (GaWI. of)@. RwIR): 2024 acgoeud  02-0

oloddInel  qu.o. (@ralsl]) mo. 52/2024/mavical(agf)av@rad. 8.

M0.1104/2020) geaim ajooqisoisfigas 2024-0e1 608 o100’ 00227



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
13

(WIGEIWY MO IMEBBUIEREAMEIQSs  nICMe]ow) @)19’]) 2156838103

@INPaOWIN BBRNMIHHUI MO BRAIMG1q {lasam.

. aigo 3(2) iX)-@3,-

1) “ aveaun moeeismes @MW’ agam@Im”
BLaHURBE @0L]0fl020 (;) MIBP0 621QHQo
@®G3NVNIMO® " af)aN1QIBIG MM ag)am? QIVEBEUB

GalRASB3H QYo 6.21Q).

1) "®ioaesamalaladmlane’ af)an@IMald:00
" ®2I1a8M@o" af)Mo "MIAMIBEZWD0 6aIQID”
af) M@ Mald:00 "MIAMIBEZW0 6 21QYIMDAIWY"
af)0o GalBHE3H:.

2. 2150 3(3)-@8 " @wom ©aQoImol GyaIavd” agyan@Im”
QM "gNICRIWNY MO INONINAR" ag)a’ G2IAHRD:.

3. aigo 3(4)-@3,-

) "@ad012/0306ME ale0@Om1O]" af)M@1Mald:00
'@ ln05jo0me”  20EMERTow)” He21GlQYS" ag)an’
GalQHB .

i) "eagolmol ErENITVAE BC OO
206 |SANEHNMED®O" af)M@1Mald:0o " HAIQEIMO]
@RYa1NVQHS U31aldBUD (@JdhI00 MGZUD MV IWoROEM
Q| 8@ 2OMOAL” A J0a|5aeB9M@o’" ag)am”
GalBHBH:.

4. 2150 3(5)-@3 " 5:0£1001W] GRO®” A IRV’ HoN1FIW6S
SL1DIW] @I@BIM QOY" @RAINLIMTABAMN@IEM
af) MMM ld:0o " 3HLI1QIW] @RI AIGHEHI @ROL18,103



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
14
BRO® aleRIIVOD Ho191QOS B3:0L100IW] @IGBAN YOVEHHI
AF®ICEMI @RAITVIMo MoRANLBIM® ERMIWIBLBIN@IEM'™
af)aN’ G2lBHGB3 .

5. 150 3(6)-@3 " @Ro@IT ®I@BANDo WLNITLNIMo
AUa0188MDA6M”" )N IMaldh0o ' @RoWNAIW]T O IWBINDo
GUOaH]HEBAN GHILIVEBOIERIY” WLNIMVNIMo AUaO1HBANDNM

af)aN’ GalBHG3d.

6.

2150 3(8)-@3 "9Uleals B@ HQOMIM” " af)M@ M0 ld:00

ALl

"9U0360|0S aGO@EIEJ BT HQOMIM™"  af)aM” G2IBH63D:.

7. 2150 3(9)-@3 “ (7)-920 (8)-90" agan@MaldHoo ¢ (6)-90 (7)-
(8)-90" af)aM” C2IBHB3 .

8. a150 4(1) (1)-@B "(@Je® B ®OONLIB8 @IRYYD @ 1EHH"
af) M@ ]1Maldh0o " (@JEM B MATMILIBS JWIUDA D ICHHI"
af)aM’ GalRHE3H:.

9. 2150 4(1) (1v)-@8 "@Ra100im0®@" af)M@1MaldH0o ' HWIGRIWNY
MVNYa M ANGAVM anNME’ ag)IM Gald1@ @' ag)am”
GalQPE3ds.

10. =150 4(2)(1)-@3 "W d80 Hald@RMEBBS"
af) MM ldh0o ' Halo@RMEBBUR" af)IMm” GalBHB .

1I. 2150 6(4)-@3 " ®:086mIeM aldBcaloS”" ag)M@IMDald:00
"a1d3B6a0S”" ag)aM’ GalBBRH:.

12. 2150 9(4)-@3 " AIBUODHLINGTIHND" ag)aMN@ M ld:00

"@O®® TVIMIOM]E: QAlGaHo @BRAITVIM ] 2|GUdaH GO
MOIVO N0 af)IM” GalBHs3H.



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
15

®GRUOIVIWORMEMAJo  af)dDRIYo  aldBeInndnld:0040o O.lc@u()d@fl

(W)l ago. enil. ©i6maH): VB,  MUAOMIMOals  WMBO0Y

moe;%;!@ho@oaso%o GAWI. af)M. RWEIXIHM @REIMNAHNHIND  a»IMo
@R)(NaO1HE3HHWIEM. @006Mo  QAIBOO  MRYAHUANIW]  2ISEROBLIO
al016uoWls]” MOV GRRVM ;U3 MIBGRUIABIMMDIMIW] BRG3a06
MS@DAN  PadaldOo oMW  GBROBBUIGH  AIV)GHWIAHINANDIEM.
@ODOBINS” EMAHOD BREZOHOM @PEINMBHHIM  BRAITLERMBIWIZMNE,
OMIQYo DMBIB:0, HIVEMo @BRGZa00 MMIWo GRBULMIGHUY TVAB{loso.
@RGE3A0HO  BO1AN@3 &Sl BREIMMWIHBIMN. GAWI.  af)MB. RWEOIXR’
@RAMGIafla] of)aV. @RA. & ™. 1104/2020-0e1 a8@ eI

V101 oes?.cmi%.

2. aY1H9A@: GAWI. af)M. RWEIE" GRAMOIq{la] GRERODMIHUB JAV’

s)_u@ﬁmoczsngo?

BAWI. a)MB. RVEIR TVA, ANIM BGBENMIBUS @JTV alQaNIE].




Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
16

ol. aV1End@:  GAWI. af)Md. RWEIX" @PAIMGla{lay] GBRLM 1KUY

MVERWAS BRMAMICWINS alladalell aflalesamn.

2. aY1e9a@: aflandt.. aflavi... aflndl.. M1aMIEEME®IE3 NSHEIM
$H00L63BU3 QISHO HHAM <égocnﬂ NIaOMIMBE S GOI. af)Md.
2WOIXR" ERAIMO]a [lE8EMINUE BRoWEEBUY alEVOo TVOAVIBIBNIOD® @R

O’)(T(}g]&li)@@(ﬂ)@u m%@oam”.

M@a0, AAINVOWo, HVE Qldig Aa] (W) all. ©o=Nal): ava,

CHO8 MIVATVELY Hald@EA  @REINIMIENINHAMIT  HIOJAIMIB).
$006Mo MU aldBLINAMFIBE  (@JOIBOM1B3EMIIU3 cggo%gm GMIaHM
HHIMNZAUMDDDOAM N0 HILIOMINEUaHo 21GHD@OOMILINBIAIWISIeM.
@AM 1OHM BOTBMAIWIAT NI Wl. O af)dd. NINLIGNIAIILjo
@A @M IOM  HNEIGBING). aledd, CHO8 MlwarvewlerIQ”
QAUMEGaoud  MONSHOD® BIGOI  2ISEEBRHBWV0 @301%@2 GBIV IHUY
HDHIMNZAUCHOVIM® 8@  ubloe  AI®IWIHEIMAD”  AMAYILINW.

alodeloaaglm” ami® @ean ageo mel AI®IYIC eHo8 MIVaavVE



Uncorrected/Not for publication
19.03.2025
17

@JAUIBOD1EBMMHAUMBB®IT MAYDBHEINNIBHB0 BREINIMTHHIM HY1QAN

00 \A061M.

2l. aVle9d: DD MVBRHOD MW @RoVEBUE OO IS

q,gogégo’l GQIaHM  OGIMIAUIM  MIYWAMIB2NEMO®IG3  DSHAISAM
@RoWEBRSBIAM. BRDEHIME’ GHO8 MTWATVE BRAHIO <gcoTzsﬂe;)elo(cB Q0@ D>

@M.



