al@iimamnioe g alandus

alGfiganoe qusangma

qusTiiadg” omlgl Glgqlods” Nalgp @)S00GEE 2025-001 GHOB UXDEG:INY

sileilmnss eaewm] emoglay”

Aldrermldatia.o

Dr. M. K. Muneer :
103.  In the long title the word “certain” shall be deleted,
Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

104.  Inthe long title the word “certain” shall be deleted.

Shri P, K. Basheer ;

105.  Inthe long title the word “certain” shall be deleted.
Shri N, A. Nellikkunnu ;

106.  Inthe long t:tle the word “certain” shall be deleted.
Shri N. Samsudheen ‘:

107. In the long title the word “certain” shall be deleted,

aldla
Shri P. Ubaidulla :
108.  In the preamble the word “certain” shall be deleted,
Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal ;

108.  Inthe preamble the word “certain” shall be deleted.

50072025,




I3

Shri P. Ahdul Hameed :
110.  Inthe preamble the word “gertain” shall be deleted.
Shri T. V. Ibrahim :

111.  Inthe preamble the word “certain” shall be deleted.

.

SN0 Ofedeent
Shri Mons Joseph :

112. . In the proviso to clause 1(2) for the word “construed” the word
“interpreted” shall be substituted.

Shri. U. A. Lathif:

113. Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:-
“(2) It shall come into force at once”.

Shri, Kurukkoli Moideern :

114, Clause 1(2) shall be recast as foliows:-
“(2) It shall come into force at once”.

Shri. Najeeb Kanthapuram :

115.  Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:-
“(2) It shall come into force at once™.

Shri. A. K. M. Ashraf :

116,  Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:-
“(2) It shall come into force at once”.

Shri. K. P. A, Majeed :

117. Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:-
“2) It shall come into force on the day of notification in the
Gazette”,




Dr. M. K. Muneer :

118.  Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:-
“(2) It shall come into force on the
Gazette”.

Shri. P. K. Basheer :

119.  Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:-
“(2) It shall come into force on the
Gazette”,

Shri. N. A. Nellikkunnu :

120.  Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:-
“(2) Tt shall come into force on the
Gazette”,

Shri. N. Samsudheen :

121, Clause ‘1(2) shall be recast as follows:-

“(2) It shal’ come into force on the
Gazette”,

N0 Qldherl’
Shri P, Ubaiduila:

122, Clause 2 shell be deleted.
Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

123.  Clause 2 shail be deleted.
Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

124.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri T. V. Ibrahim :

125. Clause 2 shall be deleted.

day of notification in the

day aof notification in the

day of notification in the

day of notification in the




Shri U. A. Lathif:

126.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Si]ri Kurukkoli Moideen :

127,  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
>Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

128. Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :

128. Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Dr. M. K. Muneer :

130. | Clause 2 shall be deleted,
Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

131, Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri P. K. Basheer :

132, Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri N, A, Nellikkunmu :

133, Clause 2 shall be deleted,
Shri N, Samsudheen :

134, Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri A. P. Anil Kumar :

135, Clause 2 shatl be deleted.
Shri K. Babu (Thripoonithura) :

136. Clause 2 shall be deleted.




Shri Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan :
137.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri Sunny Joseph :

138.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri Anwar Sadath:

139. . Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri P. C. Vishnunadh :

140.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shei 1. C. Balakrishnan :

141.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri M. Vincent :

142, Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri Roji M. John ‘

143.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri Eldose P. Kunnappillil :

144.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri Rahul Mamkootathil :

145. Clause 2 shall be dejeted.
Shri T. J. Vinod :

146.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shi T. Siddique :

147, Clause 2 shall be deleted.




Dr. Mathew Kuzhalnadan :

148.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri C. R. Mahesh :

149.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri Saneeshkumar Joseph :

150.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri Sajeev Joseph

151.  Clause 2 shall be deleted.
Shri Mons Joseph :

152.  In clause 2(2) for the word “wherever” the word “wheresoever”
shall be substituted.

Smt. K. K. Reira :

153. In clause 2() for the worc “five” the word “two” shall be
substituted.

Shri Mons Joseph :

154. In clause 2(4)(i) for the word “five” the word “one” shall be
substituted.

Smt. X, K. Rema ;

155, In clause 2(4)(i} for the word “five” the word “three” and for the
word “rten” the word “two” shall be substituted.

Shri Mons Joseph :

156. In clause 2{4)i) for the word “ten” the word “five” shall be
substituted.




Smt. K. K. Rema ;

157. In clause 2(5) for the words “one third” the word “quarter” shall be
substituted,

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Al

158.  In clause 2(6) for the word “twenty” the word “five” shall be
substituted.

Shri Chandy Oommen :

158.  In clause 2(6) for the word “twenty” the word “five” shall be
substituted,

Shii Mons Joseph :

160. In clause 2(6) for the word “twenty” the word “ten” shall be
substituted,

Shri Mons Joseph :

161.  In clause 2(8) for the word “five” the word “two” shall be
substituted.

Shri Mons Joseph :

162.  In clause 2(9)(i) for the words “five hundred” the words “two
thousand” shall be substituted,

Shri Chandy Oommen :
163.  In clause 2{9)(ii) the word “two” shall be deleted.
Shzi Mons Joseph :

164.  In clause 2(9)(ii) for the ward “two” the word “one” shall be
substituted.

Shiri Mons Joseph :
165.  In section 40(1a) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala Court Fees

.and Suits Valuation Act, 1959 by clause 2(10) for the ‘word
“computed” the ward “programmed” shall be substituted,




Smt. K. K. Rema :

166.  In section 40(1a) proposed te be inserted in the Kerala Court Fees
and Suits Valuation Act, 1959 by clause 2(10} for the word
“market” the word “fair” shall be substituted.

Shri Mons Joseph. :

167.  In clause 2(11)(ii), for the word “five” the word “two” shall be
substituted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :

. 168..  Insection 74A proposed to be inserted in the Kerala Court Fees and
Suits Valuation Act, 1959 by clause 2(18) the word “twenty” shall
be deleted.

Smi. K. K. Rema :
169.  Inthe entry 1A in the 2* column of the first schedule after artcle 1.
proposed to be inserted in the Kerala Court Fees and Suits

Valuation Act, 1959 by clause 2(20)(2) for the word “percentun”
the word “percent” shal} be substituted,

230 Gl
Shri P. Abdul Hameed :
170.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :
171. Clause 3 shai, be deleted.
Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :
172,  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Dr. M. K. Muneer :

173. Clause 3 shall he deleted. N




2025.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

174.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri P. K. Basheer :

175.  Clause 3 shal] be deleted.
Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu :

176.  Clause 3'shall be deleted.
Shri P, Ubaidulla :

177.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri T. V. Tbrahim :

178.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri U, A. Lathif :

179.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri Kurukkoli Moideen ;

180.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

181.  Clause 3 shall be deleted,
Shri N. Samnsudheen:

182.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri A. P, Anil Kamar :

183.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri K. Babu (Thripunithura) :

184. Clause 3 shall be deleted.




10

Shri Thiravanchoor Radhakrishnan :
185;  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri Sunny Joseph :

186.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri Anwar Sadath :

187.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri P. C. Vishnunadh :

188. Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri 1. C. Balakrishnan :

189. Clause 3 shall be deleted.

Shri M. Vincent :

190.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri Roji M. John :

181.  Clause 3 shall be deleted
Shri Eldese P. Kunnappillil :

182,  Clauase 3 shall be deleted.
Shri Rahul Mamkoottathil :

193.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri T. J. Vinod :

194. Clause 3 shall be deleted.




1
Shri T. Siddique :
195.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
DR. Mathew Kuzhalnadan :
196.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri Saneeshlumar Joseph
197.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri C. R. Mahesh :
198.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.
Shri Sajeev Joseph :
199.  Clause 3 shall be deleted.

matido Olchal’

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

200. In section 23B(1) proposed to be substiuted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the figures, word and
symbo! “31%¥ March, 2021” the figures, word and symbol “31*
March, 2024 shall be substituted.

Shri P. Ubaidulla :

201.  In section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the figures, word and
symbel “31* March, 2021” the figures, word and symbol “31*
March, 2024” shall be substituted,

Shrt P. Abdul Hameed :

202. +  In section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the figures, word and
symbol “31% March, 2021" the figures, word and symbol “31%
March, 2024” shall be substituted.




12
Shri T, V. Ibrahim :

203. Insection 23B(1) proposed to he substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the figures, word and
symbol “31% March, 2021” the figures, word and symbol “31*
March, 2024” shall be substituted.

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram : .

204,  In section 23B(1) proposed to be substtuted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word “fifty * coming
after the words “cess along with” shall be substituted with the
words “twenty five ”.

Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :

205,  In section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word “fifty ” coming '
afier the words “cess along with” shall be substituted with the
words “twenty five”.

Shri Kurukkoli Moideen :

206.  In section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word “fifty ” coming
after the words “cess along with” shall be substituted with the
words “twenty five *.

Shri U. A. Latheef :

207.  In secton 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word “fifty ” coming
after the words “cess along with” shall be substituted with the
words “twenty five »,

Shri N. A. Nelitkkunnu :
208.  Insection 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General

Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) the words “fifty percentage”
coming after the word “balance” shall be deleted.




13
Shri P. K. Basheer :

209.  In section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) the words “fifty percentage”
. coming after the word “balance” shall be deleted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer :

210.  In section 23B(15 proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) the words “fifty percentage”
coming after the word “balance” shall be deleted. -

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

211.  In section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) the words “fifty percentage”
coming after the word “balance” shall be deleted.

Shri N. Samsudheen :

212, . In section 23B(1) proposed to be substitited in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) the words “fifty percentage”
coming after the word “balance” shall be deleted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

213.  In the first proviso to section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in
the Kerala General Sales Tax-Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word
“levied” the word “collected” shall be substituted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal : .

214.  In the first proviso to section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in
the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word
“levied” thg word “collected shall be substinuted.

Shri T. V. Tbrahim :,

215.  In the first proviso to section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in
the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Glause 4(4) for the word
“levied” the word “collected” shall be substituted.




14
Shri P. Ubaidulla :

716, I the first proviso to section 23B(1) proposed to be substitited in
the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word
«“lavied” the word “collected” shall be substituted.

Shri U. A. Lathif :

217.  In the second proviso to section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted
in the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) after the
- words “any of the” the word “former” shall be inserted.

Shri Kurukkoli Moideen

218.  In the second proviso section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in
the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) after the
‘words “any of the” the word “former” shall be inserted.

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

219.  In the second proviso section 23B(1) proposed to be substitited in
the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) after the
words “any of the” the word “former” shall be inserted.

Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :

220.  In the second proviso section 23B(1) proposed to be substituted in
the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4{4) after the
words “any of the” the word “former” shall be inserted.

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu :

971, In section 23B(2) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the figures, words and
symbol “30% June, 2025” the figures, words and symbol “30"
December, 2025 shall be substituted.

Shri N. Samsndheen

222,  In section 23B(2) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the figures, words and
symbol “30" June, 2025” the figures, words and symbol “36%
December, 2025 shall be substituted.



15

Shri P. K. Basheer :

273.  In section 23B(Z} proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Gales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the figures, words and
symbol “30" June, 20257 the figures, words and symbol “30°
December, 20257 shall be substituted.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

924, In section 23B(2) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the figures, words and
symbol “30% June, 20257 the figures, words and symbol “30"
December, 2025” shall be substituted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer :

975,  In section 23B(2) proposed to be substitated in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the figures, words and
symbol “30" June, 2025”7 the figures, words and symbol “30"
December, 2025” shall be substituted.

Smi. K. K. Rema :

726.  In section 23B(2) proposed 0 be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4} for the words “payment of the
amount made” the words “amount paid” shail be substituted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

227.  Tn section 23B(3) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the word “each” the word
“respective” shall be substituted.

Shri T. V. Ibrahim :
228. In section 23B(3) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General

Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the word “each” the word
“respective” shall be substituted.




16

Shri P. Ubaidulfla :

229.  In section 23B(3} proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the word “each” the word
“respective” shall be substituted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

230.  In section 23B(3) proposed to be substitated in the Kerala General

Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the word “each” the word
“respective” shall be substituted,

Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :

231, In section 23B(3) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word “each” the word
“particular” shall be substituted,

Shri U. A, Lathif :
232, In section 23B(3) proposed to be substitted in the Kerala General

Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word “each” the word
“particular” shall be substifited.

Shri Kurukkoli Moideen :
233, In section 23B(3) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General

Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word “each” the word
“particular” shall be substituted,

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

234.  In section 23B(3) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause A(4} for the word “each” the word
“particular” shall be substituted, '

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

235.  In the proviso to section 23B(4) proposed to be substituted in the

Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4¢4) for the word
“forthwith” the words “at once” shali be substituted.




17
Shri P. K. Basheer :

236.  In the proviso to section 23B(4) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word
“forthwith” the wards “at once” shall be substituted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer :

237.  In the proviso to section 23B(4) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word
“forthwith” the words “at once” shall be substituted.

Shri N, A. Nellikkunnu ;

238.  In the proviso to section 23B(4) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word
“forthwith” the words “at once” shall be substituted,

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

239. Im tﬁe proviso to section 23B(4) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word
“forthwith” the word “immediately” shall be substituted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

240.  In the proviso to section 23B(4) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the word
“forthwith” the word “immediately” shall be substituted.

Shri N. Samsudheen :

241, In the proviso to section 23B(4) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the ward
“forthwith” the word “immediately” shall be substituted.

Shri P. Ubaidulla :

242, In the proviso to section 23B(4) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the word
“forthwith” the word “immediately” shall be substituted.

50012025,



18
Shri T. V. Ibrahim :

243.  In the proviso to section 23B(4) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the word
“forthwith” the word “immediately” shall be substituted.

Smt. K. K. Rema :

244.  insection 23(B)(5) proposed to be substimted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) before the words “the payment”
the words “genuinity of” shall be substituted.

Shri Kurukkoli Moideen :

245.  Insection 23(B)(5) proposed to be substitiuted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
word “fifty days” shall be substituted.

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

246.  In section 23(BY(5) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
word “fifty days” shall be substituted.

Shri U. A. Lathif :

247.  In section 23(B)(5) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales ‘Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the words “one monthi” the
word “fifty days” shall be substifited.

Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :

248, In section 23(B}(5) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
word “fifty days” shall be substituted.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

249.  Insection 23(B)(6) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
word “forty five days™ shall be substituted.




19

Dr. M. K. Muneer :

250.  In section 23(B)(5) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
word “forty five days” shall be substituted.

Shri N, Samsudheen :

251.  In section 23B(6) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
words “forty five days” shall be substituted.

Shri P. K. Basheer :

252.  In section 23B(6) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
words “forty five days” shall be substifuted.

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu :

253.  In section 23B(6) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
words “forty five days” shall be substituted.

Shri P. Ubaidulla :

254.  The proviso to section 23B(6) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) shall be deleted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

255, The proviso to section 23B(6) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) shall be deleted,

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

256.  The proviso to section 23B(6) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) shall be deleted.

Shri T. V. Tbrahim :

257.  The proviso to section 23B(6) proposed to be substitutéd i the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clanse 4(4) shall be deleted.



20

Shﬁ Kurukkoli Moideen :

258. In section 23B(7) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
words “fifteen days” shall be substituted.

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

258.  In section 23B(7) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by. Clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
words “fifteen days” shall be substituted.

Shri A, K. M. Ashraf :

260,  In section 23B(7) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Genaral
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
words “fifteen days” shall be substinited.

Shri U. A. Latheef ;
261.  In section 23B(7) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General

Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the words “one month” the
words “fifteen days” shall be substitured.

Shri Manjalarmkuzhi Ali :

262,  Insection 23B(10) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(4) for the words “the service of”
the word “serving” shall be substituted.

Shri P. K. Basheer :

263.  In section 23BC(1) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(5) for the word “remove” the word
“solve” shall be substituted,

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu ;

264.  In section 23BC(1) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala General

Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(5} for the word “remove” the word
“solve” shall be substituted.




21
Shri N. Samsudheen :

265.  Inm section 23BC(1) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(5) for the word “remove” the word
“solve™ shall be substituted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer :

266.  In section 23BC(1) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(5) for the word “remove” the word
“solve” shall be substituted.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed ;

267.  In section 23BC(1) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(5) for the word “remove” the word
“solve” shall be substituted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :

268.  In section 30E(2) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(8) after the word “conveyance” the
words “or both” shall be inserted,

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :

269.  In section 30E(4) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(8) for the word “bonafide” the
word “genuinity” shall be substituted.

Shri Mons Joseph :

270.  In section 30E(4) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by clause 4(8) for the word “confiscation” the
word “appropriation” shall be substituted.

TRSRI0 Wb

Shri N. Samsudheen :

271, Clause 5(1)(c)(i)(ia) proposed to be substituted in the schedule of
Kerala Motor Vehicles taxation Act, 1976 shall be recast as
follows:-



22

(ia) for sub item (d) and the entries against it in column (2) and (3),
the following sub-items and entries shall respectively be
substituted, namely:- E
“(d) Vehicles permitted to operate within the state”.

(iv) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and|350
permitted to carry more than 6 passengers but not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.

(v) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and|600
permitted to carry more than 12 passengers but not more '
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.

|passenger.

(vi) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and|800
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every

(vi) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and| 900
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

(viii) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper herths and|1000
permitied to carry more than 12 passengers - but not more
than 20 passengers for every passenger.

(ix) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and|1200
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every

passenger.

1

Dr. M. K. Muneer :

272,

Clause 5(1)(c)(i)(ia) proposed to be substituted in the schedule of
Kerala Motor Vehicles taxation Act, 1976 shall be recast as
follows:- )

(ia) for sub item (d) and the entries against it in column (2) and (3),
the following sub-items and entries shall respectively be -
substituted, namely:-

“(d) Vehicles permitted to operate within the state”.

’('Tv) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and 350
permitted to carry more than 6 passengers but not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.

) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and|600
permitted to carry more than 12 passengers but not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.




* |permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every

23

permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

(vi) Contract Camriage fitted with push back seats and{800

permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

(vi) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and|900

(viii) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and
permitted to carry more than 12 passengers - but not more
than 20 passengers for every passenger.

1000

(ix) Conwract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and

passenger.

1200

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu :

273.

-'than 20 passengers for every passenger.

Clause 5(1)(c)(i)(ia) proposed to be substituted in the schedule of
Kerala Motor Vehicles taxation Act, 1976 shall be recast as

foliows:-

(ia) for sib item (d) and the entries'agamst it in columm (2) and (3),
the following sub-items and entries shall respectively be

substituted, namely:-
“(d) Vehicles permitted to operate within the state”.

(iv) Contract Carnage fited with push back seats arid
permitted to carry more than 6 passengers but not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenget.

350

{v) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permitted to carry more than 12 passengers but not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.

600

(vi) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger,

800

(vi) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permitted to cary more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

900

{viii) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and
permitted to carry more than 12 passengers - but not more

1000




24

(ix) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and|1200
pemnitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

Shri P. K. Bashéer :

274.

Clause 5(1)(c)(i)(ia) proposed to be substituted in the schedule of
Kerala Motor Vehicles taxation Act, 1976 shall be recast as
follows:- .

(ia) for sub item (d) and the entries against it in column (2) and (3),
the following sub-items and entries shall respectively be
substituted, namely:-

“(d) Vehicles permitted to operate within the state”.

(iv) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and;350
permitted to carry more than 6 passengers but not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.

(v) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and|600
permitted to carry more than 12 passengers but not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.

{vi) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and|800
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

(vi) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and|900
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger. .

(viii) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and|1000
permitted to cairy more than 12 passengers - but not more
than 20 passengers for every passenger.

(ix) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and 1200
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

275.

Clanse 5(1)(c)(i)(ia) proposed to be substituted in the schedule of
Kerala Motor Vehicles taxation Act, 1976 shall be recast as
follows:-

. (ia) for sub item (d) and the entries against it in column (2) and (3),

the following sub-items and entries shall respectively be
substituted, namely:-




25

#{d) Vehicles permitted to opergte within the state”,

Ev) Contract_Carri_a-tge fitted with push back seats and|
permitted to carry more than 6 passengers but not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenger,

350

{v) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permitted to carry more than 12 passengers but not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.

600

1

(vi) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

800

(vi) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permiited to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

500

(viii) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and
permitted to carry more than 12 passengers - but not more
than 20 passengers for every passenger.

1000

(ix) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every

passenger.

1200

Shri Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan :

276,

500/2023.

Clause 5(1)(c)(i)(ia) proposed to be substituted in the schedule of
Kerala Motor Vehicles taxation Act, 1976 shall be recast as

foHows:-

(ia) for sub item (d) and the entries against it in column (2) and (3),
the following sub-items and eniries shall respectively be

substituted, namely:-
“(d) Vehicles permitted to operate within the state”.

Riv) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permitted to carry more than 6 passengers but not more
‘En 20 passengers - for every passenger.

350

(v) Coniract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permitted to carry more than 12 passengers but not maore
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.

600

(vi) Confract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

800




26

I..(.\E) “Conttact Carriage fitted with push back seats and
|permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
| passenger.

1900

;(vijj) Contract Carriage fitted with sl:-e-eb_ef berths and

permitted to carry more than 12 passengers - but not more|

than 20 passengers for every passenger.

(ix) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and

1000

1200

permitted tc carry more than 20 passengers - for every
| passenger.

Shri A. P Anil Kinmar :

277.

Clause 5{1){c}(i)(ia) proposed to be substituted in the schedule of
Kerala Motor Vehicles taxation Act, 1976 shall be recast as

follows:-

{ia) for sub item (d) and the entries against it in column (2) and (3),
the following sub-items and enmies shall respectively be

substfuted, namely:-
“(d) Vehicles permitted to operate within the state”.

L(iv) Contract Carriage fitted with posh back seats and
‘permitted to carry more than 6 passengers bui not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.

350

(v) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permitied to carry more than 12 passengers but not more
than 20 passengers - for every passenger.

600

{vi) Contract Carriage fitted with push back seats and
permitted to cairy more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

800

(vi) Confract Camriage fitted with. push back seats and
permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every
passenger.

900

(viii) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and
permitted to carry more than 12 passengers - but not more
than 20 passengers for every passenger.

1000

permitted to carry more than 20 passengers - for every,

(ix) Contract Carriage fitted with sleeper berths and;

1200

passenger.




27
Shri P. C. Vishnunadh :
278.  Clause 5{2){a) shall be deleted.
Shri Anwar Sadath :
279.  Clause 5{2){a} shall be deleted.
Shri P. Ubaidulla :
280.  Clause 5(2)(a) shall be deleted.
Shri T. V. Ibrahim :
281. Clause 5(2)(a) shall be deleted.
Shri P. Abdul Hameed :
282.  Clause 5(2)(a) shall be deleted.
Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :
283. Clause 5{2)(a) shall be deleted.
Shri M. Vincent :
284. Clause 5(2)(b) shall be deleted.
Shri I. C. Balakrishnan:
285.  Clause 5(2)(b) shall be deleted.
Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :
286.  Clause 5(2)(b) shal! be deleted.
Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :
287. Clause 5(2)(b) shall be deleted.
Shri Kurukkeli Moideen :

288, Clause 5(2)(b) shall be deleted.



28

Shri U, A. Lathif :
289.  Clause 5(2)(b) shall be deleted.

ER000 kol
Shri Mons Joseph :

290.  [In section 122B proposed to be inserted in the Kerala State Goods
and Services Tax Act, 2017 by clause 6(12) for the word
“contravention” the word “viclatdon” shall be substituted.

T %0 Oldher

Shri P, Ubaidulla :

291.  In the second proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act,
2024 proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof
of” the word “such” shall be inserted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

202, I the second proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act,
2024 proposed 1o be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof
of” the word “such” shall be inserted.

Shri T. V. Ibrahim :

293. In the second proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act,
2024 proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof
of” the word “such” shall be inserted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed ;

294.  In the second proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act,
2024 proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof
of” the word “suclt” shall be inserted.

Shri U. A. Lathif :

295,  In the third proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act, 2024

proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof of”
the word “such” shall be inserted.




29
Shri A. K, M. Ashraf :

296, In the third proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act, 2024
proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proot of”
the word “such” shall be inserted.

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

297.  Inthe third proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act, 2024
proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof of”

the word “such” shall.be inserted.
Shri Kurukkoli Moideen :

288.  In the third provise to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act, 2024
proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof of”
the word “such” shall be inserted.

Shri N, Samsudheen :

293.  In the fourth proviso to section 13(2) of the Kerala Finance Act,
- 2024 proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof
of” the word “such” shall be inserted.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

300.  In the fourth proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act,
2024 proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof
of” the word “such” shall be inserted.

Dr. M. K., Muneer :

301.  In the fowrth proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act,
2024 proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof
of” the word “such” shall be inserted,

Shri N, A. Nellikkunmu :

302.  In the fourth proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act,
2024 proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1} after the words “proof
of” the word “such” shall be inserted,

500/2025.



30

Shri P. K. Basheer :
303. In the fourth proviso to section 11(2) of the Kerala Finance Act,

2024 proposed to be inserted by clause 7(1) after the words “proof
of” the word “such” shall be inserted.

AlGAHmMIMIo e

Smt. K. K. Rema :

304. In clause 11(3) for the words “A separate” the words “for each
settlements separate” shall be substituted.

AlOAmonialmio Ol
Shri Reji M. John :

305. In clause 19(1) for the words “information received” the words
“receiving credible information” shall be substituted.

Shri Eldose P. Kunnappillil :

306. In clause 19(1) for the words “information received” the words
“receiving credible information” shall be substituted.

Shri Rahul Mamkootathil :

307. In clause 19(1) for the word “two” the word “three” shall be
substituted.

- Shri T. J. Vinod :

308. In clause 15(1) for the word “two” the word “three” shall be
substituted. '

Shri C. R. Mahesh :

309, In clause 19(2) after the word “representation” the words“in person
or an advocate on his behalf” shall be added.




31
Shri Saneeshkumar Joseph :

310.  Inclause 19(2) after the word “representation” the words “in person
or an advocate on his behalf” shall be added.

Dr. Mathew Kuzhalnadan :

311. In clause 19(2) after the word “representation” the words “in
person” shall be added.

Shri T. Siddique :

312.  In clause 19(2) after the- word “representation” the words “in
person” shall be added.

P@ai®Io Aol

Shri Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan :

313. in clause 20 after the words “such revenue authorities,” the words
“and alt the proceedings initiated shall be stopped forthwith” shall
be added.

Shri A. P. Anil Kumar :

314,  In clause 20 after the words “such revenue authorities,” the words

“and all the proceedings initiated shall be stopped forthwith” shall
be added.

PMaIolRmEde el

Shri Sunny Joseph :

315.  In clause 22(1) after the words “false information or particulars”

the words “or by means of fraud or misrepresentation” shall be
inserted.

Shri Anwar Sadath :

316.  Inclause 22(1) after the words“false information or particulars” the

words “or by means of fraud or misrepresentation” shall be
inserted.



32
Shri Roji M. John :

317. In clause 22(1) fo word “two” the word “three” shall be
substituted.

Shri M. Vincent :

318,  In clause 22(1) for of the word “two” the word “three” shall be
substituted.

Shri I. C. Balakrishnan :

319.  In clause 22(1) after the words “showing cause” the words “in
person or by a legal representative” shall be inserted.

Shri P. C. Vishnunadh :

320.  In clause 22(1) after the words “showing cause” the words “in
person or by a legal representative” shall bie inserted.

mn_itmﬂ@stmau bl

Shri Eldose P, Kunopappillil :

321.  In clause 25(1) after the words “shall not be disclosed” the words
“unless on any order by a competent court or legal authority” shall
be inserted.

Shri Rahul Mamkootathil :

322, In clause 25(1) after the words “shall not be disclosed” the words
“unless on any order by a competent court or legal authority” shall
be inserted.

Shri T. J. Vinod :

323. In clause 25(2)(b) for the words “to any person enforcing the

provisions” the words “to any authority or officer enforcing the
provisions” shall be substituted.



33
Shri K. Babu (Thripoonithura) :

324.  In clause 25(2)(b) for the words “to any person enforcing the
provisions” the words “to any authority or pfficer enforcing the
provisions™ shall be substituted.

Dr. Mathew Kuzhalnadan :

325.  In clause 25(2)(f) for the words “to an officer of” the words “to an
officer related to taxation” shall be substituted.

Shri T. Siddique :

326.  In clause 25(2)(f) for the words “to an officer of” the words “to an
officer related to taxation” shall be substituted. :

DWAIBTEHIDIOTI0 Oidha]
Shri C. R. Mahesh :

Y

327.  In clause 26(1) for the words “of the Government” “of the state
Government” shall be substituted.

Shri Saneeshkumar Joseph :

328.  In clause 26(1) for the words “of the Government” “of the state
Government” shall be substituted.

SHBA LRGP0 Oehaer]
Dr. M. K. Muneer :

329, In clause 27(1) for the word “remove” the word “solve” shall be
substituted.

D@ ITANDINTa im0 gl

Shri Sajeev Joseph :

330.  In clause 29(1) for the words “Any taxpayer who is in arrears of
any amount payable as Kerala Flood Cess” the words “Any



34

taxpayer who has incurred arrears of any amount payable as Kerala
Flood Cess” shall be substituted.

Shri T. J. Vinod :
331.  In clause 29(1) for the words “Any taxpayer who is in arrears of
any amount payable as Kerala Flood Cess” the words “Any

taxpayer who has incurred arrears of any amount payable as Kerala
Flood Cess” shall be substituted.

Shii P. Abdul Hameed :

332. In clause 29(2) for the figures, word, symbol “30% June, 2025” the
figures, words and symbol «31% December, 2025” shall be
substituted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal :

333,  In clause 29(2) for the figures, word, symbo! “30% June, 2025” the
fipures, words and symbol “31" December, 2025”7 shall be
substituted.

Shri P. Ubaidulla :

334, In clause 29(2) for the figures, word, symbol “30® June, 2025” the
figures, words and symbol «31% December, 2025” shall be
substituted.

Shri T. V. brahim :

335.  In clause 29(2) for the figures, word, symbel “30™ June, 2025” the
figures, words and symbol “31% December, 2025” shall be
substituted.

QIEWIaWONI0 Ol

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :

336. In clause 31 for the word “remove” the word «“golve” shall be
substituted.



Shri P. K. Basheer :

337. In clause 31 for the word “remove” the word “solve” shall be

substituted.

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu :

338. In clause 31 for the word “remove” the word “solve” shall be

substituted.

Shri U. A. Lathif :

339. In clause 31 for the word “remove” the word “solve” shall be

substituted.

Shri Kurukkoli Moideen :

.

340. In clause 31 for the word “remove” the word “solve” shall be

substituted.

Shri Najeeb Kanthapuram :

341. In clause 31 for the word “remove” the word “solve” shali be

substituted.

1

Shri A, K. M. Ashraf;

342, In clause 31 for the word “remove” the word “solve” shall be

substituted.

g MIDATVED HGESIIog,

MIBQIMIT 0o,
2025 modaf 24.

anwd. a@ad. @y Hmod,
AT 501.




