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zwd: FW: CMO Portal Application from Mr.Paul Manjooran -reg

' message

Nithesh B <nithesh@ksidcmail.org> Fri, Jun 24, 2022 at 12:26 PM
To: Rithu KS <rithuks@ksidcmail.org>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Nithesh B <pithesh@ksidcmail.org>

Date: Sat, Jun 4, 2022 at 2:14 PM

Subject: Fwd: FW: CMO Portal Application from Mr.Paul Manjooran -reg
To: <dicthrissur@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,
Greetings from KSIDC,

: One of the conditions for eligibility for working capital loan under Covid Samashvasa Padhathi scheme is

"New MSMEs shall submit NoC from existing bankers and the loan shall be Standard as on
31/3/2021."

The promoter Shri. Paul Manjoooran during the discussion stage had informed us that he or his firm currently do not
have any loan obligation to any financial institutions. During the processing of the loan application, it came to our
notice that there are presently overdue in 6 accounts in his name amounting to Rs.170.44 lakhs and the promoter
has a total loan outstanding of Rs.574.15 lakhs which was in contravention to his application received stating that he

~ does not have any loans. The matter was communicated to him via mail expressing our inability to process his loan
request.

It may be noted that it was for this reason we could not proceed with his loan application and the loan request was not
. turned down based on the CIBIL score as claimed by the promoter.

Regards.

Nithesh B

Manager

KERALA STATE INDUSTRIAL
DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION LTD.

On Sat, May 28, 2022 at 6:26 PM Nithesh B <nithesh@ksidcmail.org> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <prasanth@ksidcmail.org>

Date: Fri, 27 May, 2022, 5:06 pm

Subject: FW: CMO Portal Application from Mr.Paul Manjooran -reg
To: Nithesh B <nithesh@ksidcmail.org>

From: KSIDC . <enquiry@ksidcmail.org>
Sent: 26 May 2022 15:33

To: Prasanth R <prasanth@ksidcmail.org> 1
Subject: Fwd: CMO Portal Application from Mr.Paul Manjooran -reg

Setln Ocer



