Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
1

MM2amI3206M HI0 Yo

VNI Ho1g] 018 983" 9219 (@JHIAABS BINYa |0 6T)_ﬂ%gc6303
alQ1VEMMWHHHFBNEMOAIM (@JEGAWQJo BRMANALISEBBSo:

1) 2021-ee1 c5H08 MVa0HHE6M Vol (N0 GRAVMI)MINGI

Ma0BEEM-OZEARAHM  Qldio |2QAD)] (). all. aga. aVAIN):

a3, 2021-0e1 GHO8 aLAOHEM auvocel (Ee2do GRARVMI) MG

IRl MW HANFHNMHAD (@JECAWo aNING BRAIMGa{lasamn.

AL jerMb Mo, (TUC)O(TQO((ﬂcG)o, QAIZM ECHHUN (').IoSzgd@']

(W) W] §210100M): VA, AMIM (JECAWHDED o llaMIEIZAND.

Ma0S6M-02ZICMRAHM  Qldin |AAD)] (W) afl. ag)ad. QAVOIM):

@, m» Mo @YCJe  @RAIMGla{la|eajordEmOIM  ERMINAZ
DCRUDYLIAHUIEBBAB  TVoMITWla] MVRWIGE QAYSMAIANTVW@IMIC B33
3132100V (@JMVoEDIM” 63 A@I@BANIL].  O@IB3 (@JWIMNIQo ONE"
3»O0J6EBBIMBSI®;  BaAN, AlG3NQAIW] MNINWe.|S cHHlocaalrI]eel

@M M) HUIOAVAOHOAN MVLIBBUIGH 3@ M1BQ 2IMNAMBIHB D,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
2

@PO®IM @MW 8@ afldEoUdo MQYINIBRH  af)M®Iem. 40

QUGHOD 1GLIHOWINHWE; 180 MO Q6N MO ]G3 OO0
muoallwomaemzol@aniel 29QOM, @RQRATYEOIBo AHIOMVAOB:O6M
MVoLIEBRUIHS Qmi” @an1elGaHad M @33 alel

$HIEMEBBUINEINZo  BIG101 2 [I@aM. LOIADL  AHIODHB@aHUHM DD
Mo2LIERS1M3 @RoW@Io RIBYNIMRHIMVo @REEBHMWBSB MoIERS1T3M1AN”
GORILID QeMIMI@3 @RaN1~1GWaud LIS1HHIMONLI00
MVa0IW1HBAN®IEM” MV CREVMIWIEINS DE3UWIHBIM Q" @JWIMea g
®0QJo.  @BREMINSIalo, GAO. m@mujlm)” S04 GROAL@I, 3 term
@103 I5 adao cOMIVAI®  @RoWEEBUWHN”  HOLIAIW]
m1uquﬂad6)oeaom§§§ B8@  GEROMIYAME.  GBRDEaIeLl  BRYAWIY
M a0)GHN U @RAVMVO]aj’ 'ag) @OL18;103 '’
HIMN1ablEHHUNBB0IBSHIEM”  MIW® 0T coaleld  Qemlwad
M@B:MM  aljoinunaldl - Mo OHHMZAIMMIRISBAN@. HSeIaV’

MVoCLIERABHVWELII0 BY1NI0HHIM HYIQIM BalOMILI88 RRLMIYAMS'.

2MOQIAM, MV  GAILIVITE GOMI®  V@AIMEOMIBo  AUMIDHBIEM’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
3
oem%oe)@oﬂdoea(oocc»’ggg@". ale)dH @RAIBHS  BOsMIVAIMIWIsnAINleSW)o
@O@InIwinlel. GCRXO®:IME 50 vo@aomeomogensslele ®ImIw o
@RAIAHS H1SOMES ANWEMIBE BMVB1BE (@JNTAWG” BRELIH1ITE HOQITY
@VIAad” af)MM BaloD1@  LIE1EHOMED O1DIVILI88  GBRLGIWIM
MIBE3UWIABN®. CaalLld QeMTWH 6.210A@NIMBAIBHS” EMNE" GSo ag)am
@B lO®»1@  HoeRaIW]  MIMIWILSBMDIEM” 00QI@W  GR3VMI. MM
00 O1@3 9al8GaN0dO0MaV” @RAWIY  GAlEMEOOAN 000
MlayBatilaflgens. o@loel  MIOMORIW]  MITWeQ]s  TYDIQL®
QOHO.I((B(Z)TZS)OG% MVa0W1HB8IM@IM” = elnle ololwle|ss B3
cenIoBW2mMm@aVA®) (@B ld:01H9H003 (6)"]«530(7)134. MO0 U01aldBUd
mmﬂggg«»‘“ eflawd eREDMI” Holaued 016a odSIcLeIaM. D@ BT
o) Ballg” H01g1WeM. M@®IMaJOND S8@B Oda0 SRINIGY NG
DOMVoNITWaf Wlalddrd MSOMIVIg88®10ad  @RSITLNIM T TEI06M”
DD 6E3OM] HHRHIMZAUMIIBB®. WIMYld, MDEB:®HBHS LIVMORIW]

MNINWOQS @JRODI@ af)o. af)MV. 1000 HNTaHM YD1 IdBUOV ANV af

14 Zeld  MNB:RHeaQo  CWIRlaflal’ GHOZ  TVOTVOIM  AMVaOB:OEM



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
4
MDBIOG @JABOMo &ZFO®  AflaJel1e01H90Mo  BREMINSIao
aleNu1@d  @&oal’ elRlendme a@ I Tier System  avaosoem
coaIRIG3 AG1GHWIEMN. BHASOMIM” MVITNAIW] BT MI0H/BHOBMNING,
a)Om Brand name egymoo®loag @oeslruOImOILNem” DG
@oe;omgmmﬂ%@g;@”. HOMOOMICS D  ilelloel e’ cg@em(zsﬂoeago

UM, H0A1GT 218a] ©21Q)” GEBRODMIEWIFEST CMOOOD MVAGq flafl@Gan.

OO 2 DAVISH]TMOIMOHA” @RE BT HE3M0.

. ol mamgasa 2013 avad, 2021-021 6HO8 MVadHHEeM Muocel
(@200 GRBVW™I) MilG3 MLoMITWIa) ONEWIRa | EMIM CORINA |STVAD.
Del]oo 18l TVaOHOMMEMNNE:IOM  CHOZ  MIVBAIW]
MoCWIRla[lasaM@Ie Al@AQYHS  JAN~  GAILID  TVaOHOEM
SH1CIM3In|I3M QeMmlwmH.gleel BEIMMLAI®HHglerIQY”
N@3MVAIEBMDIM” B@B  HUIO  HBHUMHM  alOMAIW] oM™ @Aalem
@OLIBI@ 15 aldarenmm &oe1sai” MR SEDM@IM” a1’
0D M@ @aI®dlaflesame. 2020-eel mi0elow)” HOYERIUND @Ry,

01-04-2021 go@ samyleel ageld aLoauoIm, £21L10 MVaO0G:O6M



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
5
MIEBEDHUHB0  NIOWDHRIHH1WGeNE', Yo arploel 44 (ag)
Qe |IVEle] 8@ Zeld MmO  HaHYAE  Ba0IUWWAAIBOS
coIwomloa ganl@d oM (BOlalHHUB8  OTBAIM(QJB00NIEM
NI0ERMDHBOS LIWMo TLIWIAIBHAND). Deln]0o 21210 MaOHH0MEMINE1OM
CHO8 MBI  RIWIa[lEN0MME88  QAIJAITVN  CADMIA|06MD (@3
mloae»Im”  ofl@3eLAdeM. 80  S0AWImmavle)ens M@ i0o
MoMLNIM@® MIWAMIB2MIEMo MSADAM AlaHYE® T3 MIaONIMH S
CHOB OO2OCHNIS®] GTY 0o |30ll2fIS88®MIEM. GHOS NI,
@allHoem SV VIOQ@AIWT  MIWAEBM@IMM88  @RYQIUd o
DI I LY Deln]0o 1Ll M CHOB HHa0CHNISMINW VAT (1H63H Qo
NIaONIMAAS HNaOCANISM]T BRMGRINIW AWl M@ Qo 921Q.
@SAAM”  aMONaMSa{le)ps ol geemaval®]l  Mlelall@daian.
M(aJHi0o MIVANNCWWNIW] TVIDHQADAIW] (@ JOIBODH30M Delo]0o
1Ll MVaOHH06M MINELTOHM COD3a 06D (@JHI00 GH@3 MWAGEBUIH

QN@RLAOW Q1w @3 CH0S 6N108%, 13 210 a {lesaM@1EMIS’

CWI1H0HIM MoOwWlesHwlel. @O 2MIWla I QN@RLOJo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
6
BEMLISMINMELOINIW MSaISIVWIEM.  CHESOMIG3 MIelnlle|8s Ham”
GO6IRID VO HO6M SHH1G0I03a [0BM Qemlwmnagleel
eIV I®IW]eLIQY” ACMVGIEBIMMIM” 8@ HHIO HBaHHM” aloAQIW]
Qan” ®alem GReLIBIGS 15 aidauenmm &ieiwsal” 8@ 6e3OLMIWIAHS
MROSTDAN®  BAMMLISMHQOS  @RASIenWB  14-m”  alevolo
2MIWlal®my alGELOJNIW MSaISIWIeM.  AlGIWHS YAN GAGILID
ann’lc(goe)go MVOMNIM  HaNALEOHMI@ M@0 BT HBaUMHM M’
¢S1m ZGMT DSBa|WIV] §21ARNIM al3all Alab1enIM &¥lvlealan
GeRL®] aljaInNQo RMIWlal®y A@BRLAIVW@TMIGI @R TM:A1HHINT
aoowleslel. DAMIVHLl M@  MVoVLNIMEBBSIGRI)  BHOBOM @3

(@JaIBo1H630M 2Q  MVAOM06M MocelEBglceld RMIWlal®y BO6Mo

MeIm1o3as3am @loel 160 O 5 U3 DR |HSQYSBAUWICRIO

HOMOOMIT ST aljairuowlel. m»  ilefloal  AlyITUOGHEBIS
@B N0W] allewolaf GOARINA|SOMINSS B 006MEBBUI
GAT3a 0TI Q8OO DaOMNIW] enil@3

@RAIMOMGCASWITAMHAN MVoVIBT2|@IEM, NIaONIMa ]S moea%cl@w



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
7
HONIW] NINWES 0Qals] A 10610 N6 . (@JWIMSaS
Ma0BIR1HOBIOSH MDD AllaHWORIV]  MINWOAIS" TVoMVIG]2fIgeMS.
oMM 0flUoB0UIEREIGRIY”  GalddhaMlel, Q8O0 (@@JWIMeqls alflel
$»H00)683U3, MV 6T)_ﬂ%|80®)'] NINWOAIS (@JWIM aflcIRMERBOla |, @RM®’
MIQHI  MVoIWIMOMI@ aldeflendQo  alo®3 Q(ZS?S(HCTT)%%GS@QO
QflaleMMo  MSEOMENE DOm0 GRRILD  QYeMIVMHBSES®IEM.
IO HBHUSMHBTIGIMIMMMo  ald@ VoAl GARILID  QEMIYWNBUIHE
MDSHOHQIND@EM (@JILOA]S MVoCLIBBBHS 2JA@EL.  &HHI0 TV LIBBRUD
MVoRE1a] M@ aldellead Moo, ald®d 9M3ald3Mo, M1BAMIEMo,
QflademMo  @S6a31WAl csmelooggam’l%ce;ge)s 2JOLIVIGNM'. @QMa3”
MO@HI  MVoAIWIMOMIMo D@UBBUROBOHODIIW  MVAECRBNM],
@RoEBBBIW  &HHI0  TLoEIEBBo  GRAILINQIMIVM®HSo @213
@RMIGOIWIHONIW  AG3TVOOWIM™  alflaiWo. ®1@BAUMAN 0o,
af)06MIGRBo, ALININA adIMT  JaM” GR6ILID QYeNTVMHE6eM” AlC3n”

&H19NIR  (@JUBOEBOM DY, ¥leom 40 aBavoom  0lodnQes

(DI DAIWV ()_J(S(OO(D(Oﬂ QN SODIH63aM 6N MVolWIMo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
8
@JOGWIUTIHOJo  HIDYAHHUAQIAIEM . af)OMO@ MM  GRBULM (a)»I00o
mlelnlleigg caaleldQeMIVMEHEeS @JAUC@DM aldlw] ome” R1ele:g0w]
QAUGBAN® GBIaHo BalPo. TLNIAIMEBBHS aflMIMaUI@3 G WlmileNg]
ODIEOS Mol |SHWQo  DalplN)dh U3 (GAIDT®AW]  QIGRU1H8HQo
9.21Qjo. LOWINEM  BM VAOBHHOEM LRI TG  BRoWAIGHINSS
CRINI® al0dABUTlHBIM® Mo LIEBREeS M1WAdAILIWILNM.  Af)aNIT®I
MaflOs  0OQIM®O0  TVAOBHOMTVoCLIOMIMe  MLIOD Ol 1W1©3
@RoMJo BMNSINBB GYWIVI® BFaHLIIEHNINS TVaOHO6M MIVACH1HY
BN D1 H63H @AM @RYMA" AIQWHI  AVaOHOEM  MVOCLIEBUIHE)
@QYQoBo  H0la] DIWOIOM  DUINAPSWBS  af)LId  MoMNIMEEBEL)o
@oW®lo LIRlAS@IM 90 Blaive a@leaNIGIeE) MANOS NI@)o
@® Mo51wian] (180 @laveamm) MEUVNEBAN® HBaUDHEGIa0
MSalslwiem. @RDCa DRl HILNomIQWESWo ?Qo ailelaidcrvmal
$HO06Mo  AQAIM  aldbjo AHIOMVoCLIEBEIM3  &:0a0m  aflel” M@

O®IYID  LIDERHOMIW] MSEMING TVIW]BBGHWIHLIMBB®IOM” AV Jo.

af)MI@  @Ro®Io  eIRlesmm@Imeaeje 500 eNgd 10w



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
9
M@3H1W1R1HHMHAM AIOINVO  BR(EJICWIWHAIVW@TMIM®I 2106
HBaUDHBAB0  MANIVMOAMITI BRI M1CAUWI LN |SIMW  BRBUD]
AUYIOVWIWHB30.  MI@AL] MV GBROLMIYLIo af)Lld HHIO MVocLlEBREIjo
GQISBRIMOS af)Mo WM NIV HOWHQo RMIWlal®) (@)@

@PS1001E06 0 |GH Qo alQo.

Wol. aeoms8los:¢]l @rell: aud, 500 eNgd @3 BG &BaUMH

M@ 1W1560mMees103 20@E6n HAMIGaH]qf maﬁoeaoeaomggs)mcm” aloQmMN @’
@dajo  MIdRNUMOEM. MLOWORAM MAYAS MISIMWa OB  af)@
HHBatdHmoem” 500 g8 al0@ H@3FHHIM HY1QH? GRM H:0WWldo
@RYBHU MSTAN  aNIAIMAI@o HYIYOAMENOD ATVIWIVEMBHIVIW
5HBaudHB09” 500 2198 a10@3 B MIMVo HBHIFARHHWMBB® BA1HNEJo
HEIVIOD HOOYMIEM; GR® BREBYOS UBHRLWI@BHQSIGEMEI?

@1  all. @RMI@ w0137 U8, ®132|WOWIgo. af)L10

aHlorvocci@Bglelo  GAINSGAIWOS  af)siNo WMV HOQYHWo
200Wlal®y &1  EPSIA0IENSHWo  ©2IQaN. Melnled

U100 2L1EBRE1G3 @RoUNEERBIW B ALl ailedo AVIWIVAM GHIO



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
10
HOHUMBHH MDD GRAVMIYPLIo  BAIIFAUMNHIWo Mala |FH Qo MIdHla
@I |OJBNIWBOS  OODHHSIT  TVoCLIOMINA BOEMo o) AN 1B|BH Qo
6.21Qo. MHOMOOMITBE  DIWBAUMADaJ0o  GAILID  AVaOBO6M
SHHIC0I032 [0BM  QIMIVWEMQo  AVoMUNIM  HaNALEOHENBWo  BOMo
al1S192)|SABHOWAN  DCRUDYEOMINS  HHINZAUIN MY CRBUDIHUBHN
WamN0W  ACWIR]al  COAINA|SOOT. MVaNGHOMGARILIHQ
@E®yHNW]  @®laldBlesnmz  @alvialel. 8@ 0yQIMElHnd
alo0MIOLANE" MAROS MVaOBHOMEANILIY.  MHAN” MAQNS TVaOBH06M
GORILIPNEI®  af)Lld  alEGRIV®IHBo  HOVEMo  MIAYOS  HFOW
@JAUCODMEBBBIEM.  MaYIABHEM]HBIW  BIMAUWT  TVa0HICHB6S
SHOIMIRLIOMo  BRM1OM aflaMlens’.  DO@MW] MITNWO|S8S Mmoo
MSalSla@lerlQ)” QIMEMINd  GR@INA3  MIMINIWEBOHG  TVoMITW]af”
MM BRYGCLINHBNMo, @RDAIWT MINMWE]S" 21Ba]hid MSTmEMo.
MAflOS MSABAN  af)Ld  al@lad0em  (@JAUBODMEBBUBERB0..., MAAOS

MVaOHOIMECANILIYOS 2lBl@o al@lEUIWI2J0d3 1.  YQINZHBIW]

MeINI@ABOHMMI@@  ALoAIWIMo  MAAS3ME. af)Rld  al@lay@em



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
11
MSalSldh8o MAYOS 30V 2lB2|QYOS BINMOWIFIEM™ MSa (LS.
@RI’ QNS aJGOIND 1B’ »I06Mo. QIS
MaOGHOMGAAILIHVAN alOammI@3 GRIDGHOMIM NOQHWIEM.
@RO@2I@0 MU S@WAa] MIMBB &S0V (@JAUBCOMOMIHG BINAIW]
DHSla ]SO, MAN” aFhG3U0o VME" RldhHo CHIS] (@Hal MICHHUINBS B3T3
Q1el AoalwIMAIWT MI0]. MABHO1WIo HFlam GMIS MIBGOIWMo,
M3 MM MVANBPHOD  BS@BALaf” MIAN™ HOMVEJAHM  aldNOSH].
SM2la] M3 OHDIOMD®IOH0 VAo 921Q. @P®IHG  BRMAMOaOLlo
MAOHNLIIGaIBBBo  BROTWIo. eMog  mMIeeIWmMOmIHnd  a0alldd
MVaOGHOMGALILINW DHABBIN®IMEAIME] alellw  UIHMEBBU3 MSAND.
@RYRIVMIG:®] Qldal, af)BEa0IYHNNG Aldhal, af)M1HH MANIVIFO1WIo,
MNI0NIMAalS AWAADT WY, HSdHhoaldxsl TYEOE@EM MDD TVEWILME,
@RAN HBBa oMo HANSFABMMD M calene] DElo]0o Zelwloel ==l
NI08: @ DM HWOIWIOEBBITM BT MVaOBHOEM MO IMEBBBAIE].

B8@ MWINOAINVQRS  &HBBaq [MoGaldLlo  GHAMBOMIA  MLIWIaflel.

@1RYRIWM 1] Qldhalo  GROGalOLI ag)m“scsoﬂog@ogo QINHIS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
12
MIDBEHSI03 HWOIW06sR3]1. @R MeIIdd Omleom  OHAHNIND
@AM a0 MIBNEBE8Yoe MW S@lo)MIAM”  af)@1BOTD
al00MIOIMIEM” MVa0GHOIMEAILIYBB®. D GRAIMUNEAHM MI1WNo
HONIQ] MITWOaIS aDLIJBAIW alBa] MsAMISIEl.  GR® ®@13@Do
af)M1ED” al0oWIM MVIWIHRBo, EMIMW  UY10Jo HIQIQYeS 2B @3
cgq}))c(g@og" OHISO  @IRYs06Mm. aMIad  @PAM°  VodVNIM
MaO0HOMMPDB IO BeeMAVAI®]  @RoWAIeM. WA WY
HSHhoalsds] MGO@M MAles  MHAlHBAVMNE., epam” 14 e
NI0B:HS1@3 13 1210 mideso BOlHSIM® Q. (Wl.af)al. @Y. aldLIBNIS
Zeld  Mmde;’ M@AOM” BRAN af)@3.AWl.af)al. BAOISBAN®.  GMIT
A l0oQa0, VO (U (@)@ 1B 06Mo Qmo@l%m". 668136
LU (JDHOMo  DENBIB:GMIIUT 2 AMIEM” HAICQYMED® !  HDNOW]
MNINWeAlS MU &S1IVIMBAN 3HI0L6EBU3 2l@s] ©alQeMo, af)aMIg’
@P®I3 MM 8@ OIBAIMOAGHNEMo.  HaldS1G1HH @3 el"]cw@osﬂ%docnﬂ

MVoMVIA1EHEMo. MAIHS MVWAMVER O GRIMHDD (@)D aldHBM@IO

Wl G HaIMIOMLIQME, @DlaldH DalCM®INI" GAWI. af)o. Ods.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
13
AMIQo  EPDEADOLIMOM  AF  BHDILHBANE. @RAIGOINSLI00
&S1006Lalla] 8@ @IGBRAIMOMIGE AUMIBHINE 103 DD Ca 10HLIYBSR
8@ MamIBIMOMINd  @YAIN o  DMBIG:AIVTGBANIHLIANIEM’
af)oM BREIJOWo.  (@JEDYDa] Deln]0o Z1eld mIdes1oad MIU3NIL]dEud
M16BBU3  alG1EUIWIGBE:. WAINOEAAT OBHINZAUIN  afLId  al@lad@em
MSalSHBOSWQo amie3omeam Dela]0o Zeld Mo 9MROWI@IN. @R
@OONEIBS (@JAUBADMo AMEBBUB B3I KAU[IFMNE". NAIMNBOAT OBENFAUAN
WIOHMIMW MSalSIQo aMEBBUY @1EMVA1afISIEl.  a)IMI@ DONeSs @R
®OOMIRIBS S@ al@2|QAMWILL.  CHOB MIH af)IM  (@JerlydalMo
QAUMDIMVEUAHAEM”  21B2JdHB8R0W]  BRANOHOD  MIaONIMOa|S QD]
QoW@MAIM®. MABHO1WI0 'EHOG MINE:  (BalldEeMeamMmM®” &H$lamm
@AIMDOHAN MSDaldhd RMIWlaI®Y JAMeMIQOS (@ JhSMal@1HW1@3
alOaO®OaM.  EPM1OLIMWe  aMEBBUWIHS allegoowalel,  (@JHSm
I@1HWI@  aloaom  H0LEBU3  MIEBUWIBN  MSaflelncanmelaldo.
@@ dlaf GG MINH B0al’ SI0IMBZHO1NM  GIRY™ MINE: 630a0

AN\ W1L|83 LIOMOR 1003 A lUDIO O IO @3 BHOBO M’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
14
MERQESOIVIBAN  GIRY” M0 Blal  SIAUMEB Mayealg, ald0o
MAOENIW MUK GAleMo. BRX@AIW] MITWHA]S @RYGRIIAINQo ™Qo
MSM.  @JEMID]af Va0 GRRILIVIG GROMOOMILIBS  BO3
MSalsionow] QQCBGUO%(SQJOO&CSCTUOU?S O® 1O *LISMIa I0NIW B>0068BS103
el AI®YIRI8s 2l8a] ERYAIUDIMIWIGBAN. MEJOUd GHOSB MINEL1H]

U’) (9}
@O(OTG)(OTZDFIEJQQ TU1EIAI0 af)dMIGIM £ 6)D)VE)6I0MF (T)S(TT)(S%I)O.....

@) HSdhoa 183631 MYGOQ300: ava, GH0S N1 16003

@afldhoama)a0@]  MITWeels WDEAUMONIW  2I@s] MSOMIMIW]
0AIIMOOE3, WAINHANGIMN” ENPDI0OBHIFABIN BHIW ENYD@IGRI
®QOOIWIDLIAMIEM”  MNIa0MIMalS  @RoWo  alOad®. @O
QIMOINIGEIMIOHWIN” @R~ BRYORIBMONIW] BRYELIIANHENHMo. MIHS
MoMNIMOD B@ RMadl®Mo®EaN JaR® Ao NINWeaS
OMBOWIgENE.  GHAIRlo 1V HAHl  EMDIGHMIBAIQYSS  21@2)
2@ I@ANIel MSM®.  HYleOD MIVATVEI  HDOOTMSa {ladQMI
@RMMHAD MSDaldhH RMIWlal®Y MmN 2MeEBUIASAMINGE VAda{la)

@QDHSNaI@IHWIGE MVa0H:EEM GRAILIHW  MVoNITWlaf  al06



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
15
MJWIMN® B@ OflaHWo GHOB MIBL1OM  (BalldHoeMAIW@aN.
MoMNIMAMSMIBo  AUSHO  NDOAUCAMINS  RMEBBUIBH 1S TOMHAM
2l@a] QAIMDIM. ERMINMFES] @RoW1HIMIM” H@OONIMGa| AllRWo
af) MV GHGBDAN QIO 610)6313U3. @) @0 1HI0OM1603
@RSINLNIM@MILINEM. GdhHE8 6MIIEH  (@Balldh06Mo  alolasMmM@ImMIW]
@l  @amlglees (M.S. Sreeram)emo@iomlos 2elnjoo 221610
6N108% 103 n@ael, N1 16003 19108383 U2 IGHS1LISHo
MO0 HBRIVSS GINO @3 1O HHI6NE” 21@a)
MSO W@, EIQ;!O(Z)TZS)U DO@0el, cHsomlanl 14 Rleimglejo @oald
auoooeaomoe)ggocogo 09" alel GRRILINHSLISBOIGNIQ0 DOAMOOHID3 21@.a)
MSOM1WIEM™  @RAITVIMo 01608 VAR {la@. 016a]0ds"
MG {1896 |SHWo BR® EROW1HTIBNOQIGHWo O alQYEUDaHQjo BHOSB
M (BalldHoemOmInd 60600 °LISOMILjo  MIa0MIMeals ©IaHIW
GN®IBHMIGBAIW] afleuoaHl )’ Q. W af)an-oel @31

CNOIGHWOIGBNOW],  EPDI@WAMOHAN  MVaOGHOM  GANILIY”  HFOD3

MVoRIAIM M@IHMM AMVlo eflWlead eM@®ININIWT MIEAIW] @Jolud o



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
16
2182)5HU3 MSOMIVIGBN. MM NIDAL], EHOSOWING BRYBOMIVWMIW
QU@IQo MY @O  al@a] MSOB], @REZa00 CHOBOMIOLI
aBQQjo alellw MVaO0HICIVINEMAN” BREEBRY’ — MIMIVWOIWIo,
@REZa0COMINSIalo  @JAUBOMIa] MLl  aldOMIOjo  GBREEBYAMS.
@REZa00®MOMM CMAIS" al@a] MSOWMI], AMIT GBREZ2OOMING FOMIWo
Calo1@aN.  MIaOMIMAalS all. . B:a0MIRINEsS] @01’]6)5@)1@100;161@”.
NIaONOM MO NI 1QOS 3OMIV1Go P EmEOaN QO

DHNIOYBRUT  WII8AIW] cmocmom%ﬂggg;@oem“. @D HIME’

MVoMIA T 2fIHLIMM” a I0VBB®).

Wl.  all @Toaugm 2013 oA, GHO8  MNINEHENIW]
GYLI(T\D@(H%@@:OGTQU, @P®1OM  Baflh06mMo, @P@IHAZ  LISMIA NIV
500468300 @SEEIVWAINW TVoMITW]a| @1BAIMEEBOBLII0 HODHOHNIENS
GUOaUAIEM 21B2] MSOMIV®, BRGA|ICYHBo MVAWo dhF¥lamI@man, alns]
Qfl56Uato O GHISIVDOBMNE B0 Y2ENRI? @JBD® Do) Delo]0o
Zeld  Mmo® o) OfllaH®o  MEBBUD  HOAUBHIBTHAOWT & d6eNDo.

0eIBRs0W]  @.aWl.af)al’ BAIHABAN BM@ AVAOGHO6M  TLNIAIMAIEM.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
17
NIaOMIMa ]S HShoa 183631 MEOQ30d VAN HO6M
m@;%@1@0@1®1o@@@mocﬁmam af)L10 al@lay@em
(@JAUCODMEBBSRIWV0 Dela]0o 2ZL10 AVa0B:E6M MINB: MVa0HEafIgleel?
calm  MIAmmiem  alrL®], AA@IQes  Fel®ovolav  MIwl
@seElealwloeieldo Deln]0o Z1eld MVa0H06M  MIdEs0 BRXEGA LI
@M KRILIVIOLl A9 MVa0®OEM MLNIAIMEBBBo TVa0d:01afISMs. @R
mleiiem” waeaadload MSalSlégadwl VadH:0la] MISIDASO
QAEMINFEAIV®. @PEHIVJe MAYOS (@flVWeHq]g TVaOB06M mday?d@”l
@1. all. af)d@. QLAIM. GROTWIAGEID, aMINY Delo]0o 2121010816903
@VIAWBVI@BN AVAVOD @RG3a00  BHISWo  221L10mIdEs 1603
@JaVlawado1@am. MONOBINBD  S@WAaf  @JAUGOD]2|®IMELI.
af)@3.AWl.af)a0’ BAIHEBIM MVAVOD @.AWlafal: OMR HYILIBB B
NI, Delo]0o Z1ePMmNg0em. aleHH @R Mleiel Menwd @D
cC0alRIVNTE  (@JoIBOM 2 l0lE8M@. MNWd S@alaj, 5001 aleaVo

AU IMNEOMIHSVWIVTIBAMN  MENIVIEBBOBIODD O AIYIBIN®, @R

OMIQo  DSOAMHAAMNIEM A lOQMND). MNIaONIMAalS QDT WHS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
18
@M@ BRAMNYBENAIW  2I@2] MSAMIOAAN”  alOcOBIGMNE.
AOEBBG0  AODMHINWIM” alOAUM®.  DLlg0o 2416l0 NI 4200
63051 (Bal MEHHAIME, M@Wo MU R8s, 3500 65951 @Gl QDY
MARBH1WO1E8BM, oFdhC3uoo 130 @row MVoCLIERBSs, MM HYlem
mIMIOM]S  QlBaHo  af)dGBWo 4 CHIS]  (@Bal LNEASBS BT
MUNJA IMAIEMD.  MEBBOM af)Lld Melwlejo MeBINIM @RAA (1SS0 BT
eNI08»00JCGMIIUB MEBRAMEOWIT MVoNIWIMo AUMEMIIUZ, MVIIRININBNIWQYo
@P®1OG @JAUBOMEEBOB MIWIB8IM 8@ Alla®o QIQ1HWINME 3
OEBBUY  NSEalSo, @R 1G3 MEBBOB  3:Qoaloaumlg” 30 alel.
@RE®MVAWo  GINY" erlnlelldd 8@  Ofla®o  AIBEMIIWE  GRDAOW
MITWOQ]S"  MVa0BAOIEH0)IN  AINIVIT  TVaOBHA1EBHWo  H.a1Q)o.
@ODIEM’  MEBBOS  H1YAUBHo,  @OED®  ENEBBUI @gjq(gl%og@%;.
MVa0BHOMECAILIYNS Moudalsl al01GUIW1 2 0@ M16BBUBHHD®
GNIOWIAIH0. BRDHHIMBIEM 6MIM  DHNIOVYEBBU alOQIN@®. D

AUNeHOONI@ af)M1HH MG ]Igo alOWIMBB® HYlamm MG GRAIMOEM

CAI8WIM MIa0MIMOa|S A @RE320OMINMG AQalS] (@JIVoWOH M3



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
19
aloaomI@an,....... DS aMEBUE DANWIa| @BRYQIUd 633U, 6BBBOS
alEd®1HU  af)aMIAl  ald16WIWla] al@a] ©alQ" S O1WAINHOHIGI
2f)OMEMHAMIM  aMeEBU3HH ANV  @PEIBMOILHHITMSI®).
MEBOM  B90a|SCANGREMIIES8  Miellage  @JWITVOJo  EMEBBUILS
MAMIWOIWIo. BRDHHIME MHNIOYOMIA BRI  21@.2]5HhUd
MSEHNEMo,  MIBRIMEBBBENZIH6Mo.  MDATOA  CLISMIA ORI  AIQo
@BRSHNAYBS 300 \6BBOS MoMITW1 2 {ISEGOMI30 af)QD6) 210}
MLIW1HEBHAOaM 0040 NIaOMIMAa g O_Ic93<'g:!@']
al01UIWIHHOMHAAMIM  af)MN1He MM TVMBABOMIGE A lOWINSBBD).

QORI gg(ﬁ;o(ocgsm@csel@”@oe@omm SGOLNV] Gald&HaMIel. CNOOOD

HO®NIW] MITWHS MLl GRAIMEIMEAUSWIM ...

@l. . Sl &esavemd  MOaVA: @, momes  enilelload
WLNIBMNONLIBSB L) SHIODBoHD:BHS @0@30|0)633U3

MVoOBHU]HBINDIHHEMo af)MNDIEM. BEONI AGM3I A1QB 2103 BRBHBD,
@POIG  @P®IHM  REMIVATI®IVI®  AITld, GP@MIW]  MINWOalS

3IQLEBBUS OHHIMZCA D @SEEIW MVoalWIMo ERAITVIM]a {lenema?



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
20

@l af). @JBIHOM: VA, MO MINB1NA AWWOBROM . Mafles

13 =eisgloel 218106108 ®HBo @AGMING MIVERDHBONEI00 LIV 4] CHOS
aNINE: )N MLoANWIMo WILNIB®MN MW, Delo]0o 1eld mide;” MI@o
2001 MI@HBIN@ MAADS CHABAMIM (GaHANAIGEMI, MDES] LI laf
G308  NIOBLIOM  QYEANIZOBHIMNZEAIIHIM  TVa0B:Q1BHNEMEM]Mald:00
O®IG3MINe  MOIMIAN”  HDAIOO  MANIOIAMIT  621QYOH®ELI00
@RalEdWRIHMAN  AIMIYI@  AILaIIMIEBMMN® VEIWICEMI? MRBS”
S00MI@Aal GaldHIMMEGE]  MEI®, GRX@ONIMS”  MIEBUWY ST

aJNOIGLIIAIM MSTMEMo af)aNIEM NI @REIAMO]HBING).

Wl. afl @Toar;léms a0n13T VB,  af)IDODIENBIEM AINEBBBHS
ANEWIK]a] af)dM@IOHM TLoMNIMWI1aJoem” MO MAMNAOS MVoMVIB] 2B
@R®  al@leIWIHENIMo  aloldndMo MIEBU3  ®QI0IGHAMHAANIEM’
af)M1He” M QVeEIIE OO o)) NIaOMIMa ]S D@ 1GWIS’
Myallo{la000as8 o). ((goe;o%m@@elg‘ Caldd:aleelam”  amOad
CMACOM®HAN Myaflafla). QIBHO aNLINIOHIVDO (& WICAHAIVDNIW

alBal®0d @®  milefloa  ERAIMOMEAUSWIT  MSOMIVW®INM'.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
21
@RD@ODHINBEM MW af)OMW @)oo  MISIOBHINZEaI0HHID
@)D 1HHIODO) . eOM coaILIW1G3 MSAHEAM af)Llo mel
(@JOIBO MEBBUIAB0 SMEBBBOSHWEII0 ad@6NM0W
MVaOGHO6MAENBIG:HAAN” B01H9)@3LBS| a 10610106 I6NS"

@RAINVIM o (106336

. avlal’ eRoavan® avd, 2021-021 GHO8 MVaOGHEEM MLocel

(@200 6B3LWMI) M@ MVonITWla) ANeWIR]a| aMNIM COINAISODAD.

MEAUWIWI® MIYWAMIGINIEMEBBUI MSO®]  GLIIGHOM1@HAN
DOQHWIVW  BHOB MIVWATVEBWIB MG U MSEHAN MIEAUWIWIW
(O [\0) 6T).ﬂ%lgc6>%6)‘5 @RAIMO6Mo, @JEDMIKHla]  TVAOBHAINGCANILIHW
MOWIABAN a@@IMWo  QAUBOO  (@JAVSMAIW  aflel AflaHWEBBUI
&5lGajdssmmaImeamsl  msgoman oM Mol @RAI®OMo
VNOAMOOMI@ QIgHO AflKILINNW MAROS AVa0BHEM  AGIMOOM 1Y
DGRULUDRLINW B2lB0 aIQYMM@®IM. MANeS @RAIMAIR{l06alg alel
M1BG3UEBBBo  &51G2|BHBAM oD m@(gdoe)uﬁ alfl®o  AVaNGO6M

mlwaomload alolglom@loiem. @R®IG a@Qolo AMN®3 MITEBIN®’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
22
a1 PlHHU|CODINSYBS MIOAMIBMN6MAI6M .
MaOHOMEAAILIQYOS HaldDAOW MY’ aldhOo MVaOHOMEIAILIHW
@EBBBOS UGB GAUGBAD M@ 1MEAIMNE] OIESEAL @01
PIHHICOMINSYBB O GRRNM] CHOBAMINLI TVaOHON GRILIW]G3
B0QIPAIHNIW  @JDYOLD®o  YaYlHEBOAMIBB  H00Jo  MAllOS
Tgalla(leseH@oem. @oalem  coaleiQes  Allad:rumemIn”  a@Qojo
M1BMNIVHNIW alh QlaOla] CGOAILIVWION  GHOBSOMINA TVaOBHO6M
GOAILL. BT GHILION GHOBOOD  6HhIBBalLIUdHHIGIGIMIAMo  AVMIAN
AUBPO O3 af)elo aJoHeM O 1@IM M0 @RS
$H0I8aOMEBBSITIMIMMo EHOZ BN@OW @Mdallaflaj” MVIPaO M1V
@RAINVE VA I0Jo Qo%;lm@(mﬂc@ Da0OMIVW BT (@JIVOIMAIEM’
CHOBOMINAMW  TVaAOBHOEM (@JANVNIMo. MM @Y MVaOHOM (@JITVOIMo
mdel  caaleldhgleelQo A8 alimellal edHogomleel  (Woalem
200"  20gINIAOMIM  MVIWIEHIO® BT GRANRIZILISH00W]

mo0lwligens. IR O EEROIOT) MVaOBQ6MM Mo LIBRSSS

MUoMLNIMEBBBOMBELIE0  a3Q0jo  Aldha] TVAOGHOM LN IMEBB8S8S



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
23
MoMNIMMIEN”  BHOBo. MM \WoEl MVa0BH:O6M  NINB:GH 8310l
MedHalo al@dlcuowlasscningd 60 vmnImeomIso M1GHHa16BBB0
BHOSOMINL]I  TVaOBHOM  GOAILIVILINHAMAN  QAUMEMIIUE, @O
oJeNE1HH6MTHBAN @ CHOBOM 1603 MVaOHH06M GOAILIGS
Al I®IM.  @JAUBODM  aldh0jo  AVITYOVo GO AHHUANIW
2MIWlal®) (HAQAM  CHASOMINLI MVaOHO6M CANILIQNS YOS ]
CAYIOM. MVMAIY BOEIMGHANe RMH1W MSHaISLJo MVIWIAIBAN
MUoCLIERU3  MAN” GHOSOAMILINEM  ZSMELJo.  @RMIGM  MONHS
ANWDIVI®. (HVWICDH 0IaYIW TVIPadY MSHAISLIM CHOSOW oA
MVaOHOEM  @JTVOIMOOD VAN GODTIO®. EIGIM B@  0aY1V
ald@5199" DO@2L] BHOBOMIOL! af)Lld BMONRIVEBUGse QLW ol
Qla0la] GR®1OMG QIBAB2 W@ aleh: QlaGla] BT MVOAMVOIMAIGM  MARQOS
CHOSBo. of)IMIC3 @D  AGIMNMQYOOD  BBIAHBHOMIW]T  MIdWIBBIM
6BV IHBo MIWRIMEBBBo  HOBHOHANIBBAN® A JBAIWAM  TVOMVLOIM

MBHNIAIM”™  (aHEMAIGAMIHWANBBMIAM aMIMIAIHS G21031H5H00d

@R)(NaO1BBIND). BH OSSO 6L MVaOGHO6IM (@JONVNIMEBRHS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
24
MOEH1EHIMo @PAUNY MEBBSNS AUBG VT AUBOMOMNSS  (UHAREBBUY
@RY@OS RINMOA MINMEMZIWILJo MALHD®  BRoW1GHE@IHNING TVIW ML
DANYWIHEI af)LI0 TVoTLNIM-LZILID MVaOHO6M MIE::Wlos0 2020-0el
nIoeslow)” oweelavad ¢e3O®] Mmoe 01-4-2021 @@3 nidwen26m”.
oo meaoieel 44 (ag) Qldhq @000 B@ 21510M0E1NG HaHVA
Ga0IUBWANIBHS COOINO1H03 AON1@3 6Nna” BOlaloH
@IBOOM@JHOOREM”  MNIBHNHBOS LIVMo  MVIWIAID.  MVaOGHOEM
UNJAIMEBBUT BRoWEEBBIM MTVEHIAIWBS MNIAIMAIEM. MO 1HOY
MNOE@»HEMIW]H:000 Mo6NIMW 1 2] 1@BRIMo DO HEHHNIVSBID
@RWI1HHI00BSB® o ldDEWINDODIMIG. @Ry NIOWI D HBOS
TMVoBWIRMo, AfleERMo WSEBIYW MYJWIM @IWBWRIMEIBUS BROWVEBBROS
AOMI@3 EME" (BOlalMHUCANIFES] M@ ED MVIW RIS HQBS af) MM’
M@Mo.  af)MI@  BRGNEAIUd GHAIL!I  (BOlalaHOAMIGH].  af)anlgo
Deln]0o 2e mowla 32 emaleo 97 BAGHUWBIH D M1BHOOD

al00RWOGOD].  MI@ORE] MNIVBREDHBOS LIOMOBIM  PANI@ NS

B0laldHo GAIEMOAAN” MINELToU)” HODERICHMD BRYH  MlaUBaH1Ss30MMS".



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
25
MM MIYAGHIHM@IQIGM TVoLNIM MIWNo. BRDEEGHIMZIMHAN D
MeINI@EBM®LL.  MaYODI®  Gald:IN CHOB  MINB1ERIYIM”
AUSOHOCWHO  Aldha MIEIVI@  LREOMIM  (JAUBON] 5] E:0nE1@aM
Deln 0o 18lomes1om elWle Ie3M@. GRANSS HGOOMIDFHNS 18
@RoEBOM  auAIMIHW oﬁczﬂ%m’lsomoam" MM MIWNo. MO
2MIWa @O0 HUWIq]  OaIQAD@IEM.  TVMLOIMHO®  KI1LID
MOB:RHOB CHOB NI0B103 LIWq{l9)6a]oud DElg0o 21610 MIdE” TLIAmo
M1l MIDBEBHQo M@ AVoNITW]a] GHISMIN®W TVATa1H83HQo

0 2lQ@I6M. EI%;!OO %% .........

@1.  HSdHoal8s] TYEO@M:  aLE, AN AGBELAIWVISES

B@HI0J0 alONDDORINE HI01ONaD §alQIMBEAUMNET A IOQIMN DI
CHOB M (@BolldH@lajeUdato @R MaHOMILIOIMAN” aloQAN®’
ANY@HWRBHs”  Mlospoommosm.  2020-21 cvomiomle:  Adaue o
@Jadomm engo 61.99 ¢3Sl @BalwiIan. Gall:HeMEUYBS O
MLIMIOMH> AIBaHEBBE]L)o M (JAIBODM B0 emslwlgme. 2020-

21 avomiomd  QlBaHo R10IMBNIBOS  VAUSO®IMo  0Y”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
26
@RYME:LIE@RUBEBNIW]  MBAUBUNOD BRGAIGH o] 428 ¢S] (BalQes
(243 vommomo) aidrumanem” 9m2oe®. =laimsanimes 2017 gomeiss
MI8 aldlal0emo MSaflenasle®o 2019 gomegs al.ag). #S1@Qe
MG 1@N6eM” alell  AIdRLMANM” &HIBMAIVO). 2ela 0o =eld
MVaOBHOM NI OUNa|OSQ88  Z1LDAMVaOHOEM  MINEEHUE DD
@RYAINYERUHNIVT OODLIINIY  HBO@DH:  TySHlaflaanlel
MB1OG  @JAUBODM L1080 AMAUBHOOD  @RCaldH]af HOQAMNGIM’
HI0EMAIVD MMINEMAN” BREE" AMALINENEMo.  MaHODILIL] SHNDo
e1neOmILINM” M, @R HBM®. 428 @ISl Hales @GRWls

®alelal’ Al 1ejo LI ILINAT (@)U 1HBAND).

@l. avlai” @RIMVa0? VB eMIMW  AMMIILINGHV@® MEa U3

@BallHMOVIRHBON  CGHO8  MI0H: BRYWIBo0  BHIS]  (BalCWIBo
MayOm1L1em” (@JAIBOD1ABBANH@ANIEM . a3’ GOAIWNS
@RSILNIM@M]LINM”  MIa0MIMAalS AWBAAD] A lOIDODAN” af)M1He”
QemA0WIgIelL VIO ERWIHI0A88 S@ ‘OeMIVAI®]  ER®1HN]

(@JAUCODMEBBSROW] QEAMIFEAIIB:EMUIUY mlwacvewlsel



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
27
@OlalorO®1OMW  mielomI@  MIWaMIB0N6eMe  MSEM]  RMIWlal®
AN@BELAOW MIeIaldS” TVFGHAIABIMD®  af)Caldgo  RMIWlaIDON@AEL
MeladgMV]  PBAMIFEANG:AD CH@  TVASHIR1HAZ  MSalSleex
308 1a{las30M  MSaISIWINMIMIEM™ MM  AVMBABOMIA  af) ML
yallo 8000830 . Deln]0o Zepmios  MIa0NdMeals  CHOS
06)aNBHNISOOHW aulaila) @RO0E:AI aflwlemsl. @SAAM”
2NIWla I nloN0®  adMRaMSa(lejps @rallos 8@ ceemaval®»]
Melnll@d alan. @y M ALAIM ] TVID@@DHAIW] (@ JABGD 1HE3EMIIIEM”
GH(@3 MwnEBUlLs all@BrLAIW] JIR® MINELIOM BHOB  6NIIE 13
IOl lon0m88 MIHHo.  MVa0HEEM MWaCMIORl  DEZUd OO
MoITWlaj” @RRINE!I BRHACMIG ~loQan autonomous democratic
®®IEBBUS, OHAVTIaN" WEAIBMToW CHI-630q |00l (@ fladavla fluday”
@@IM” afl@ELAIVIZBB®IM. @R GBRVMI BYIAUIGHEMHAMIEM” DD
MVBAROMIA  @RYAUNINA|SINBS®.  BIGWIMmMIVIom@ooQss 0lg”

@a flel@d oF»HG3Udo af)S (soeacrqxgoe@”lm NIaONIMAA]S HOaOCHNISD]

awlalauad  eniemlead s® status quo MeIMIGISBHWIM.  DOY



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
28

mlenejgseqajord m» Ml  6e3V®]  §a1QIM® MIVWATLEYES
alN@®Y” HBBHo  2l080Wo.  AI@QYAL]  BHIS®]  MIBERUJHI00
OMOOEMGa] MSO®] ‘M MLAIG] ABAMMIFEAIIB:EMINUE @G IOM
@RZ1A01HHIMIE” DD MA@, MAMIM BOMLISMHQOS 213-00 @GRMEI3
@000 @R (@JWIMAJo BRSIVWAMOQIAIW LIS LI S TMAMY’
MOHBMND®. MAIOS EROMONAITW TVMBABOWILILI, WIHMIT BRSIVWINO
MV0a0AIOJALIOD  CLISOMILINEM”  MIa0AIMlS  WVAIBEMOODEHIMNE”
$30BUIMMAV” MOSHWISBB®. BR@IM” MIaONIM]S (JTlAwadlnal

M1dG3w0Jo  GAIMHAMITINGHWIN 2RMIWlal®y al@BELAIW] D
$08AWIMMIV”" aJ0oq|gllaflS88. ZIEl0  MVa0®HO6M  NINEENHBOS
MO NOIDIOWEB0La] MI2ONIMAa|S @RoWo al. (mamé@“s Yelny (e
20093 alles ayalle {lEs3HQENERIW]. 21010 MIDB:HOB OHHIHHIMo
MVaOGHOEM  MNIBTBH:GHOB VSN |SOMINHAAD  QAIYICRM  GCHOS  NIOH;
(@B t15H01HB8EMIIUI MIEAIWIWIW MOWAOIB633UY analles

DVAADHQENBIW].  alCHU @) MNJOWOIIBEBROSBLII0 %@1@%06)@)017

OOV 1HBIN® M’ HFleom moggoe@%)el GH 0SB eNI08» 193



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
29
@JIBOMEBSIENS MU AMAILISBINO. cea%(ﬁ =eld  mnioey”
Ma0BHOM  MVoLIEBREIG IR  AVa0GEEM  MVOCLIBRUIABS
CNOOOD  al®IMEVJR@AIMOMIDa]0o  L~IEANOImo  MTIH 1V I@aD.
CHOB MINE: (Ballhlasemidoud MAIMOHN] al0D® o lTHUOGAIMo
LI0BONa01mo MTIHHAANIM:. alGHH MISIDAUNO @Y QIS aldellaflel.
@OLOR]d  MNDBBERHUWBHH  al@DUO@AIMo  L1BAMaOIMo  MBIBHAMMBS
QOB aldelleneq|somd TVAENIBIM” qmuowlaflslel. @P®Eaeel 221210
Qplel:c N [TaY @DOWEMNIERDHBOS oUW O EY(plan et [TR
MLIWIRMNANVI@ H@ NIV @@]2M@IB:AN AVI0 210 YAV BBAT.
MOfOS GHO8 M (BafldhOlaCD®INS @RoUMIIE:GHUINS @RAIMNS
HoUVA BNV MTIHIAT M0 210 AMNBIW]BIABINV. MV LIGEBUIHE
aleflto M1EES™ H0YWOAIN™ al0ey). MDA  aleloMIOEs” @06
QAUOQYHUY  LIBYAIGHIM MSalSl TUflhelafllel. mdho SO Olegend
21QOOD®  ALIWIVEMANIOM GELIIM  &ISOOD  @RAITLOWIMOBBD) .

@RS1WaM0°LIS6BE38103 el NI 83103M a0 @RADYLIAHO]o

A IQDLISHUOJ0 D@Bal® LlHHOJo GRIIAMD af)IHNIM TLIWIHBAIWVT@AT.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
30
alGH AN MIaHIMOHLITVW” MIE:EHSIT  BROLINH 13 @o%ﬂ»é(f&qp”
MU0 H63103 @RYQINDSIN DG lIRE DB Do Sogy”  Olegend
U300 |HSWBS MRAUIWIWIW @YU §63BUY Qmmﬂgd@oe)om”
MLIWIVEMBNIOM GRINAM  MICHWIBBHIM .  @JIDN]H  HIBaH]B:
NIOEBEMHUBSOHLINOD®  AG  VoLIEBRUINHNIMMO  AYGHUE  rIglasanIel.
MOMLI0 al®I® EHOB  MINH  (BalfldhOlayDIMVEUaH  QIOM
MVoBAIEBBIM. MIVWAMEBUE MSABINIL], oMW MINH AUMEDIFE:S]
all.a)U.aUl.-98" 8910Jeud 016aJods” H21QaMIel. MEAUW] @AY1E:@:u3
S0 1SHBD. @RONOSOWEII0 ®I@3HNL(ds M1AMEBRUI
GRMWIH®NIW]  MSTDHWIEM. MMIGIMI o DY CGHOG NI 103
MM’ MM NVBAROMIG C210318H003 aMIM @RYWa1HBHHWIeM”. S0
elgHo  @al 6eeemsaseminud 25000 @al  audoflay”  alodoes”
QEBRMHWIAN. MIUIMHHRITVW”  MINB1C|0RJo  DDSIHHICI)
DHWIM. BB HHIBBWIMN M®IOM  allaN1@3 MSHBSIMN®.  OG”

MO HHOM VO LIEBRUIDE) @a@u%“ GMIDAW]  OMBIABOHAAN A lO6).

ol MISI®0IHEWIW] ER® (Ba1dH@1e9008 MVIWIafIS1el. GRD@EA 6L



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
31
MYaMeRs103 @OMI® OAIMo VAN HO6M QpTfeL:cii N [oTa)
210N HNIBHHIWT  TVoAIBEMo  H2IYHAAT” alO0R.  GRAIVoNITWIajo
WIHDI@ MSalSlQo MUfl&HE1aflSIAl.  MINEs1HM  BRYWM]BHAUD BHOEMo
MoenITWlaf MleaIW]  (@JaIf0aIMEBRMBOW].  al@HH  af)M8.@RYAE.HaY).
@RHNHDENE, af).Sl. ag)o. ML QWIMEBRUY DU |HSYBS
@YUM B>QUID HHOEM Y1 @3 8330 QEANMIZEAIIBID HYleomisiel.
M1elnfelmzoI@an  EHI¥IeHnIS =eld  mIdesla  af)l. GRya.oag).
@BRADVENZCalILjo  (@JAUBODMo MSOMIND HFIVWIOD®  @RAIMNWIG3
GP@®INE8  §HLITVWBAIV"  MICaHW]a[lG1BBHWIEM.  af).Sl.af)o.-0Y
MG alloallomasolal Dalles aled®]B8WAEIMIC1EBHWIEM.
MEAIW] GalBHH  EIGHSHMSH]IM  (@Gal Mayealg. MOMENC a1
GHOB NI, mm@Wmcgcroomgmgomfl%@g_z MVoRAIGEIRBIGM . BRDEHIME’
CHOBOMINAMW  ATVIYPaOy  AVMUBAILINVOWI@  (YWIXTeD  GANILIYHS
QWANOMELEMMN @Il MIBT  H0la), GROIWAMAIW  AVoRIAIMEUI

MDH1W TVAOHOEM CAQILIYHS TYNANIW MSAWIaflM” alfleeln®now]

MIDBSBAM Q0 IVEIGH o Qlafdd0Mz8s8  MIQ6EBUY,  GBRVM1HUI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
32

839101089H6MOAMN” BNVa0aJBQo @REYBMNTBBHHWIeM.
21@3NOW  MVoMITWaf” EIMIONMW  (JAUBTDHMOO®  EBIHUBHOAIW]
MIWIAsam MIEAIWIWIW MIBG3UIBBREBIM oMW GRALMIWILIBs®).
'@HOBo M HNZEM@AN MMMWION~  Al@IA  af)aMIEM” Mo
alewoatlo lE830N@.  @R®IGE HAI8Bo G2IBOD MUdlo{lEa@O@ANIEM”
af) Moo’ @PE Y AMOHHINSI ). BB OB (@3 »HIQaH1 b
@RMMITWERRAILIGEIO3 ORICMAIY  AIQPHWIM AVaOHOM  HH10
Al&BIVM GARILL.  TVaOBH06M CORILIVIT DLBM VRO VOV
Al®oem  caaleldhud MWADBNNISIN  AVANGCUHAIY  AVIa0.2IA o
U0 GOAILIQYNMI@®)o @RAIRHIUONA|SDIE. MOMNIM DI H>

363

al@®QI8ATMMN  aBHGBUW0  af)SEISHo  HFomIEBSlMd  (BO18INo
HQoNIBBB0  MVA0HEM  SHH10ERAILIQAIVT  MITWeQ]S DalRlaIMo
COSAN.  CHOSOMIM3  G@REERIBAICEBIZe  OXRITVAE  0a1Q  HH]O

00
MVoCLIBRUB aldRJe]IBMo, MVoBOEMO, @JOGRUTIM: OflaleMmMo, »HIellom1g

allmoemo, QNHIVM(EJAIROMMEBRS1LI8S a 1808100 O ed[)

GOAILINHS1 @3 cmcrgelooo) MoRINIMNWIEM” MIBQa0THBMD.  5HIBaH]D:



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
33
COAIRIVIG ONalDals @RSINLNIMAVVHOIABSIDo MUOIEN0W  aflelgo
AllalemlQo 900 0EHIM  HFIQYINDAIW  CARILIWIGN  HHloGA6IEl.
C3U1V@LIOMITOMOM  oBQ0jo  2VWABAM  al0@d aflel MW ,)
MoMNIMo BHOSBNIEM . 9L[BM  GOAILIVIME  GRUWIEHILIIBMO
emalesenglaI@man AR  GRalIeIQo U1 Alldk:aumadem. a@eo
a 101 1®n0W (MNa0.210)63331@3 aBQQjo OO e1EOM1®3
(@JAUIBOABBAN Do af)aMO @3 oBQ0jo DIEY I GVLAIMEBRUI
M@IGHBINDAIQ  AUNIAIMAEM AVaO0HOEM  GHUIO  CVoCLIGBBUI.
BHOBOMIOLI AHHUIO HBaHUHDHOO (@JILOAN]H: TVaOGHOEM MLVoALIGN1@IM 1o
@R®Q],  QAUWBHIS  aNdo  DSOHUBABo  BRG®1HY (806)0(3(3:'(80809303&630
A®englnddase AN o flS1QHNIMNE88  YOOMINA  BIVAIEM
al®IMI0%0 Aldaflond eesw®].  MIelnlldd B86aMI OGMBI AlWINSSI
LNodmD  &:fldGAausM” 500 eNgd  @RQRINVEIMSSIGE  BRBHHIMD
HYIVOOD TMVIA02IYMIEM” alfiGalogo Melnlle)ss®”. momoomias S00

eNgd oa10@  quocelomlcely” maia:anleelslad, 180 clairve alowd

@RBABMM1DLIERT03  HHUIO  MVaO0HHOMAMVLIOMIT  qVRIAI EROWAIW]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
34
@SEIM  BRCYINID®  H@Ba[lHNOFHWIEM. M@ ALIWIVEM
HHIOHBHBHO0 Mo LIOMIBIMIMDo  @RHGT  MIBEMIMB  AI@EA
Ma00W1e8. 13 Balld@laj®, U0 dVocelEBUd  (Balld0]a|®”
af)aMIMIGEMI  BRM1OHA WINIBMD  DERUDJLIGH 0 o)A IMINMINSS
@»00Jo  AOMDANHIMNBIEM  MCa0ud MIBGZUBNNA]S C_BUM 1 UI.
MVa0BHO6M @D IEBBUINHBHT0IW GRBRVM1 03089H6eMo. M1elnll@d Aladn
WORA @MIdBATGLIYAINM®” (GO18IWAJ0 aNdo DSAMVNOIEM .  BRGY
Y GRAILIHVQo  BHIB|COQUUD HHOHBMNDIMSBS  (UYARIHEMAN’
Mo DWI1EHHMENWD1HBND. AHUIOMVaOH06MM Mo LI 16)E]
@Ro@ IO IM” HOM OO L8363 QILOINUNGUB MSa [1RI0E830M D
SHHIOHCHDHOQ  GBIAUNIW]T  MIOWIBRB0.  @PAIGHES allSlajM1@3HHID
MOWIENIO®  QIBo. ANDIAY” ald@ M@HAN  TVoCLIBRUIGH  AIDEN
@Raflelea® M@ af)MBB®IM” Mlelafleigs aljolcun.  ale3ngy”
a l0@3 M @33 IO MVoLIEBRE)S3 GO0l {las3aM @ 830

DEIMHONIH1LL. DD ATINOW DHBHNIMBB M1HHOD IO RINAIW]

DO@GA  HEMANIANIN TVIWILS. DDPLlo  AVIHIVY  HMIMDHUBHS”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
35

AHHIODHBHDHOO  aJoHEMo  alQOM  MVIWIHs0.  HBaUHLBHN  aldd3
2181892000 Qflatem] M1eIm13omIMs3s3 01@30QHS aley’
$H0MIMO1B9M0  aLoWlasHlel  28-00 Aidefload  6_REOL®]
2f)SODaINCWMZMIM. MY GR3VMIWILNS NTAYHS FJaN~ GAILID
MVaO0BHOM AHIGILJBH: QPeMTVWMMGHGEI@ Md@o ‘M Mual®IWlerIQ”
DONVAIEBM®IGE B@ SHUIOHGaUMHMD @RLOAID HHIO  dVoCLIo
@IWwaglond $:0eaIW] aleadQlw] ARl @ROLISTTE al®Imeni”
QAUBRHOAIN” GRBULMIWILRS MU flElE8BM@° BOEMCLISMI
al@eELMIE, KRMIWlad®y  AGBRLAM. M@ @0 1HO1H9HI03
MOWJRLL. BT HBaHDHM 06MNZ GSAIM &HGMT @SB ]IV @Javlavad”
alzall 0la01e9HI8 HY1VIeim EREV®IQL RMIWlaIl®y afl@GRLAIEM.
BRDEGHINZOHAN HD BRAVMIGHUY BFIAIAH] TVaDGHOM GARILIHWNQo
U0 GOAILIHVYO  MVoRAHUIHNIMo  MIo OWAGMT  aflSla)
2MIWal®IQLINEBBU  HIADAYSHHIHNIMWo MVBHNIB DQINIHHEMHAAN”

MM AVBAROMIG @BREYAMOIABHWIM. Mallos M milad eV

921QM@IM” 0f)ea3 016WIR], | B01EHBILBS] GO IAMAT. MAs].



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
36

GAI. MO\ HPOIMISA]: @, emoad @M milellemnigss

Aol GOEUOHAGODHWIEM.  MIEB:HBOS  LIOMOJo  BHOB
MNEH1OMW  @BalldOeMalo  MLoMINWIaoem”  GRYBIAOMERINOB M3
alOQAN®. MBA|IPHT M égamcsmﬁmﬁ NI0ERBHBNOW] G000 19" 62123
0103002100 @111 @3 303 NINEK1OHM Y1 H83HOH@M
RISHHICOINSWIEM CHOB M (Balldh@laj@® af)aMITM” TVaOBHOM
MOB:SHBOS  LIOMOOD MOV HA12OE:0Ms" TVBHHIC 2 l0ODES
alOQMM®. MIM8I@Wo  ANGWIRTHNIGAMI@W  HIVJo  MIMW  alOWIo,
CHOBOMIOHA TVMIBELISNQYHSWQo BIHIW-TVIPaO1d: alJERINHIVYOSWYo
HIlODHl  2lCI@ODIE3 MIGMIVSH  alts0lalla]  CORILIWIOM’
MaOHOMGARILL. BRMIM3 @RYAH30 m1@@091%m30@3@>@1%. Slally
MBENIBHBOS HILIADo HILDGHILIBRSI03 AUBBo| EMFHWQo BMZEBBUY
POHNUVIBHQo  Hal)  B@W  GAAILIVWIEM  MVaOHOEM  GAAILI
®IHYOMSIAIBB  MVaOH06M  HAVINOTVYTIHUY BRSHNABB  TVAOHOEM
MIBMHBo  KIBID  MVa0B:O6M  MDB:®Bo  M1BQa0laJAIMIAM 6003

a)ADIOEMAN”  alB1GUIWIJdT  MAES"  AMAVILNSHI3  TVIWlEso.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
37
Mainstream Banking @RELIBIG  NIE:Tow1@d  Hnlmaylo s
MI@BHSBAN  NIIBHUIHD 62100 SHYIQIOD  GBRELISITE  G@POIAQ
921QIOM, GBROIMGOS (JEWIRIGIVLNOD caaleldhgloel Widaf anldd
9alQIem”  MOYOS MVaOGHO6M NJa INEBRUZ QEAMISAUM D).
M1eHH1HOH Y BOM@MIMMIAM ;180 SHIVOQOS
BOWAMIMIEMEsIEje BRAIB  MIBQa0l2jAIMIGBAN  GOIU3 @RI
m‘éam@o(ﬂmﬁ 61108 BN W] G 0oa g 62100003 S
NINEHEENBIBHEMAAMN” MIE@BUE  alOQMD. MYV  EIVWIHAOD  MNIIEHlow)
CORILIY” GM@DIo MDHEN  @RYA.NI.Oag). @RSENABROIG  MI0Bslow)”
OTVRHA  Bq 6N 6219} Qo M1EAWIVIV  §9EJAIY"  GaNIEBIGAIY
QRIHQo M 3 LMEOAUM MINB:DHU3 AIBIHQo BRANOS AONVOAMBIB:HHQo
@y OONVEOMINM  B0WAIW]T VA INYHUB &HS®@  AIGRUIa {1880
9BIOAUDM HAHBHWQo ©21QYIN (JG1V BT BINMAD MSABANENE. aBQ0jo
®MIOHCOMSIHEN MVOWIVEM RMEBBUWISH  GMAIT  GILAIMEBBRUY

M @3 HH 1 1@aM, mé LM BOAUND NI HBOSEWI amﬂoﬁmg%

NI0ERDHBOSCWI  alod16Qglejo  00@GQ101VWeje  @RSIGIAILINGC



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
38
SHIReaglom cater 9a1Qan MRS MISIHL! MINE:B®BIM TVa0BO6M
CoRIRIVIRIBs  B»0-60q]G0QTal"  MNINB:EHU  af)Daloan el
MVAOHHOEM MINEsHUY. BRAIOM LIWa (laf méam(eoosmﬁ 6108 BN W]
DONVOO M Galdd:EMINUY MAlles @@ cater 9.21Q)o, alles @y idal
@O MGHAMo; @RMIOMAD” MVoANWIMAIMBB® ! NI @R® 16003
aNdRHMUIGRIQY”  QIRlH@IeM.  AI®Mo  OGIMZMNRIVISSI® o1
BMZEBBBAS algld: af)aINIMEEI al0QIN®. af)ddd HYEIBS 2JGBENo
aflel aDOoGgU(TUU eI alOW®o. mm@o%%;l@mseﬂ@a, 6)(?5)(%6)6TT§89:1(63
a1060MIB3 aMIM MI@WOMIND ®Y20dem”.  31-03-2019 aleo aveaunom
MVaO0BHOM NIdEEo SZ1LI0 TVa0BHOM MINE:HEI3 allei®o LIDEOT LI
@JUBOD) 9O BHOMEIBAND®. ag)@MI@s 29-11-2019-@3 13 22go qvaoHH06m
NIEEDHOB  TVoLNIM  MVa0H:EEM  NINEK1T3 ~IWa(laf GHO8 MINE,
@Ballh0la|@IMEWaHo @YD Moo 1,150 8051 @Galw@o] mool.
DM @JWIM0emo 60081 @al  MaUO®]LQ]GAD

@ 1BAUMADa JOO &1%0 TMVaOSHO6M 6NIIEE0 TVAIM MaHoGaIQaM Q” %%o

MNIB:NHOBQY0 CHOB MINEHI03 MVoCWIR]q [la|®I6M. DD Gald1agdl®s



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
39
@oee3" 0lciedlaf aloQOAMM” af)MIB EMIMANILL  CHOBOMIOLI
MEAUWIWI® 1Ll TVa0GHEM MU LIBOMILje Melnlelwlelo
(@JQIBON] 2 B0NEIBAN GG @13 Rl 0n0W MaYO1©3
@oIBO®I2fIBaN  @ReLIZITE oLl MIWI®  AGBOD]0L[IGBaM
MNB:DHNS TVoCWIRla(la], GMWo  @JAUBOMMo  MSOMIVWAUBHS
(@JAIBOD MO CHIMINBEIVY" ©21QI08 MAMIW]  (@JOIBOD] 20IN®
M&EBU8 GRHW” ©21Q” HRCMOMI@ 1,150 6551 @Baies maycmlerigy’
CGHOB  MNIOBKIOM LMW §21Qla]OINDIAN”  @RYBIHOM  (@J&1W.
Dela]0o Zeld  MLa0HOM  MIdE:  aBQale Mel  Mlelwlod
@JQIBOMIHBHANI@  6NIIBH6M. M @R 1HMESS] emﬂq:ﬂazﬂ%cs(mmo
AR O @3 @RDBS]  MaYOILIIB:IM. 31-03-2020-sel
HEMNAHMIVDT 2] BHOB MIVEH1HAF MaHo 776 5051 (@Balwow] 3061010,
MVOMVOIM TuBe9IA3 400 G»0S] @al ReIwmnIW]
M@ 1D HINZNI@AEMN HDAMVoBA12|@. AVaOHHO6M  CAAILIW]G3

2I@2e. AMIM M®  alOWIAW  HIB6Mo, eIOMm ()&l

MSOM WD EHINS ATVIWI6IM 2MEBBROS 2100 DD af)6BBOM



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
40
snloWlasmaalan” MeaBud alanlasemo. 1,150 €508l (@ales &So
so@omdealngl  aummoafl@dmlane 400 650581 @at  MEBRGS
@nﬁmémﬁ’ oaleenslaiamieel; GO 2f)ADHHIMBIM™? BHOSB MNINEIM”
OOLITVMTYo  ERMAMIYo  GHIgIM@IMEAME], EPMINAZ  aflMIMDaH {@3
9a0@30m  AdeUlalesmm@Imow]  aimoalladmlaoe 400 @501 @al
GaloW]l. ) aléMo @R)YRBHS” & 1G5, af)Qfles
0 21210191 CHHMB® IV @BAD; GO0l @Jolovawlalan”
MLIMIAMHAIMYo  GalQaM TVAVO®, M@ NS loU)” @030&219%0946)0@
unhealthy stage mogomss avawm@I@eans; The timing was so bad.
MoMNIM  AVABHHIB  aflMIMBauyell  dIWIWIXVT  MI@BB3EMIgo
WIMIBo HhIUD  HYIRIBBGB2|Igo MEBBRUT MDEaINOHRIIE3 proactive step-
m’ Ga DV 1@6HAN ;13 AMAVLIE9I00V @M. Mo U3 33
LMIBRILAINOH® NTYE@HTSBEMIIUE, BI6I HANO|FABEMIIgo QUSHO
@ERU12J06M" §alGQMB®. af)MI@ aBQ0Jo J@IMVAWIVIG3 M1@IHEM

MOVOD  @J@TTVIWIQHS @Yo aflengo &FAMN  MSalSldud  aflengo

af)SAVOVMDIE” af)O@  @YGHHalo.  31-03-2020-0e1 @100



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
41
Dlad@le  arayl 6,120 ¢35l @eltwoem. 2021 20@sf @000
@RYBHEMIIEYWo 5738 @251 (@Gal@o] H0amHAUAN” HhIeMlo. Q)M
awl.avl.eni.-ssgloel N.P.A. (Non Performing Assets) @l @saan
(B8@180W0 AP HBo  AUIQY BNV M1Q12JSAI" GUdaH] AIMTHBHIND NIOHH]
M| @&  QAPAMIV]  aJ@BH] MOH1VD@YPLINje  QAUIYHNIVHNF
@RMAGIWILIO® QIO E:UI oﬂ—aosacu)éua 9 21Q@ALINAIEM DO
H00JHU3 AUMISSB®. MODINBD  HEMINOL! HS1HBOeM.  alflBq]ogo
HMHBalOQAND® MBROHMWIGM. GdhHO8 ML Balld0la|®1M0EUaH
af)M.all.af). OE@WIWV]T GO, af)BRAMWIM  GOOMD® af)aNIEM’
GO  @RGBIS  alOOD®. BROMIQ® oﬂ@omaué@ouﬂee;@s
®I@IENICNBHAOVT  HSPINAVIT  AUGBOMIY  AQAIEM. DO QO0Y @3
@] MWBHIQW  AIQWHUW aB@IMET  QEAIMo MDA IMBHoDOAM
af)M.all.af). @YW M010FI600). 2021-2022  avomiom&al@ato
@RAITVIM]HBEMIOEYYo MmIBlom @ ol VIMIC) b,

@olnvawlwleal)” MEseamm’ MIUAVAM.  DBIaOQMEHIM’ 30-

09-2021-@3 e18§00® &aM@9” 2 1@1EUIWI2J0®3 MIdes1e3 Male @MY



Uncorrected/Not for Publication

02.11.2021
42
QM QIBHOM]HAF HOFIWIW], fdhEEU0 11,700 e¢aos]
@Bl af)MVBB®” BF0  GRYUIAVYHORIW  BSANE]. ®1@1ajsal’
GMIHNIOD a§)Md. all. ag). QU3 A AN TM@IBHANDo

aJNAGATHOIHBMNDAOW  HIOJ6BEBUB  MIdE:  GRAINVIMq flafleele 13
30000 WIR1H30  anetlo. GHOS  6NIIH; méamcgomcﬁ NI0EEM0 W]
€000 flg” ©aIQIM calME]l QAI8OO H@JIaNaeM@ ATVATalIMo AV @]
(@ J2aNaHM @3 e louflerlQ” Galdd:a0eHIAM M163B86OS
@AIHIUNIBOD MBS DQaISTWIeM’ MOM1Ga 0Ud A I060® .
af)M. afl. af).-»HeOs oﬂ—aosu(wécr& 921" HSeIMI03  00QTVDeOHIME
M;oeyalel.  saneelslad moeg, you will have to come out with the
real figures, then the whole bank will be in trouble, smoomoniw]
@m@(mﬂ%@@;om”lmm) MNDB:HOB AB10HHLI008  calnsl M@V
O LIWMo MIQo. MOMOo (@JTITVAW]T EMEIFAM BHOG NI 1GRIY”
QLIDOMYo  MEJAIDIM  JAUBOWIHBAD  ARlgjoo  ZIGID  TVaOB:OEM
M0 16M G2lBH9I00 MSHBAM U2eBRE1E3M 1Mo MVABHHIA

al103QI06BBIMOAMIEM” 6M6EBR6S  @PEl(EJoWo. ST  aldlaUamenam



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
43
Mely” aelqj0o MINE1HA3 HI0Jo GRONOS MIWHHOZ; MIVBHT al®1AT
NI0EEM0 W] M16BRUY QAEIMIZEA ] BTG ACNLOOAMDSS MelQ” GRAIGe
QEIMISEalodes; Let us see which will work, mlemswd @Wo exegame
s;mooymleleerd;  We can look for five years. ¢og enios’ manow]
QBB @gj@}dmamasﬂmfs Deln]0o NI 1OMEBS] o llaN1S Gal@B5J0.
M1EBBBOS @RG@EJI2] GaldaVIGINeME1G3, MMOW HGB@]1WIOEME:1I
@M  021Qonceld;  30-03-2020-@8  eH08  msslead  gelwm
al}dal® EIMIV® MUL.GRA.aH.ERYA. af)IN® SMBal® VMAIMOHIGS
H0WIM alNSILNeAN” @RA.Mil.oag). MaUBatlaflamo. One of the
criteria - @emIHEManIEm” amId AMAYILNEBM@. @Raflal’ §.21cQMe
$0322G1@3 BAN” @RMIHEMANIM” NI AMAYILISBM @Y. af)aNI@d 2020
m0Ba MOV GHAILlo 0.25 ®RIMo  PEIWMalR Oal®  AI@RIE
anI0es 1M’ NSO AVIWa|®.  MVeLNIM MVABBNIB M@3HIW 400 8081
@alQo 92BN aleflvo AwIMe 621 PACS (Primary Agricultural

Credit Society)-@3 olawo Perpetual Debt Instruments-@dmlamo

MBMITWI® MIBBHalo MSOMIW aleMOjo Dalc@IWlajoem” 6.25 agan



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
44
muolleeisslele M agolcajdana. 31-03-2021-ee1 cucion
af)OMMMOIWIMW  MMIAWIHAd  @RARIA  al@leIWm 016 Jods
QUGTBANDAINHO HIOD T EHNNBMIW]GENE. O afléengo
@RYAIBOM]HBAND®, GHOZ  MIBH1OMW  alflMIBaHI@  HaOTIOH 1603
MO 1O@AMIMaN”  @ROTWIAD caleNZ1WoaM. GH 08 ple}:cN
@BaflBOaJMEaHo @SB @] gan” aldauensslejo PACS-@:0dses”
9WAM Aloflaag” QRwIMo 2 IYD® MDA MSaflenwislel
aloflawag” elflendem®IMIce HaHVWA &30 Qe MledHalla] @b
aNBele9omd  aVIWIENICm®IMILje MIa0@@laldto aiman PACS-
HBo  HFOO MVIMIOM 1 HEDDWBAHOOMI@  (@JAUBGDM  nJeU1Ng’
@RMEANLBMME. AVIMIOD]D: @ JDINVATWIGHUIENISWlejo YAOMIMo
WSO OWIMo ST 001l olavdal” mIve19a  eerITLABIY”
PIG1HBM@INVAMI@OAN  LIOM  AVEIASM@, HMWToGMIAWW” MIQ®3,
@RMAMIVILNO®  30a01TV @DOGHT D@3 (JAUBOMEIBUIHNIW]

LIOHANEM BN M’ (@B lWoem’ pTiel:sN 02121019 2| HSN3A@

MBI WIGM’ O OO L6363 (@JQIBOMMEBBUI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
45
ms«mmooﬂggg@@cm@gs’l O®IOd WAl  AlBRUIq {18836
OO0 @JYANIHU  MIBLIOM  HFIM@ YUl [ldnomd  M@EH
cmoooogmo%;oemg@%. LIGUEBBUE  &alelalgla] 79Il IaIGSIejo
BS0anlyds3lelo ™Qo @MW dMWlo M@)o Qla] MUNIalla] GENIDBARYSBUI,
olavdal” m®slend MIAG3WeEm @SN 291 EHOE  MVoMNIM
MVa0BHO6M MINE; af)ANIGH T AVNIa (la|@IM LIGHUBBRUI 6 alelNIP]EHME]
AMIgms. DOMOo  RAODHUW  BREMIaHla  HQENIBOBOD]O0
MSalS1HWSHNINSBB MIHHAN2IG:ENIT BRDEa LI CIVAIMEBBROBHBO] )’
GMIBBHWINEME 1M, GHOS ML (BalldHEemomIm”  AMIOHAN
MUOMUNIM Va0  idEso IR MVaOHOEN  MI0Eko  VIANo
Mlellcd avlemil.ag). aTVOHOL0Je  ORalOals  2Y  BILAIMEEBBO
M@B16aJoan1gens" méaqa NIELEMHU  M@HAN  GILAINE3BUT
M@HHOVAN  QANGBIMBOMISo  af)aV-NnIl.Sl.,  af)aV.enil.eag).- 13
PI012J6a 0920 allsal’ MGHODH af)an LIGHHLCOMIFoS1WIEM CHOS

MnINe; @Bal13018000 51388 af)amIem” aloQaN®. 2]))

0 ld88WINMAN Melnfloel VoAl oﬂoa;om)ge‘rsggo D IBMISHo alD6I0N0)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
46
$0046BBEI@MIMMo  GMIDW D SIGMEIH0.  Odh.af)MU ULl  (cH0g
MY’ C®I-30q]c0Qlal" mioms) gad  awl.avlenfl.  (wlayle” G-
LN clolod o] aNI0E,)- M3 elwla)f GH 08 NIDEHLIHWAN”
@RAUSHINOAIFEMUIgo M@WNVEREMHBo  AUIGIARAIWIMN” DG g0
(JAUBON ] 9JUTBAN@. TVoEWIRMo MSTVHQIAN WM A IAAHIMEAUMNE]
DEBHOVIVONO  BPREEBISAIEEBISo TUORIAIo MSADI.  aflel Al
@I |OBBUS  DalGIWOITM]  ERYBHOB  EREEBISAIEGEBIS0
2001OD@OBHINZAI@o  LIVMo  af)MM  (@JGlVwIallel.  VWINIAMOO ]G3
@P® el @JOIBOM]IBEHIMONMRMNEE; 103, BRD1OH} @BRAIBIUEAHD
OIal OeMl Aol BRYWIZIM” MSEHNMZ®. GRMLIO® MDEGA LSS
GaNIYaRUd  @RAIMWEAHWHAVIMVO  DEMHONIGH:HAAN (@) THH
a)Mleolel. 850 MVAlabld:’ @RGEJIIE] AfAMIM ERDIHMEBO]a]
aloGME®.  RIAUMSNIHS  VMUBo  aBdh1H@RIWT  M@3HIT
MLIWIHNINH@ BRI MIIBEHUBDNANWIEM” MCa 090 MDHTAUTBAND).

MUOLIAOYNAIS  DEBLOMAIVNABHS  AUIDo  BRADVENETDLI  MIOLITBIY

Caldejn01@oad  MIBQJa0alel.  MSaldGHIBHD AN Odh.af)U-aVl.enil.-



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
47
leel aBO®B;18jo 101 1@3e 2 JaN” awl.avl.enil.- s81eel
WIAUDHSICLIV BHNI M1B1G2J0 aleMo MIBHHANBHNICMI alladaIelHnIemMI
qowjRel.  HOMOOMIAIBE  GRSITLOIMAlENIW  HI0YEBBUBGA IR0
M1BQa01ENIOD® 'CHOBNIOD: BHOS auoaeﬂcselg)); af)OM o lOAV{QIdaldho
M@)o a 10610 D O HIME” 8aMo MSHN1el. GHOS ple}:c)e
(@Bl1H01H000|SDO HIME” DS 1053H0BOBNANEN, plel:sN [oT=)
210INe9IBas0  Wemalel. (@alldHEeMOmIMEaHo  RTAINENIBHS”
BRAO®MOS (@JOGRIaUM ®SEI0YQ2{101H63H QI BHALA
MoGWIRMOMINMBQYo  MIMICWININIYASWo  DBHHEBBUB  HDAINO
010100018969 |S1S1EL EHO8 MIE: (Ba 0] NZgaIGato @1BHQEMIOGo
MVABHNIWo  NIB0 HAMA0  HIVYEEBHBIMV0  aldla0dHNIO® MEBS@3
Mo |SH@IEN. DD MSalslgelo 29-11-2019-mcwao 013WAE @2IQDo
921QMODN0W Z21AUMSHIBHH MBSV INOD]EJo OalMBaHM DMOD]EJ0
B1000® MaYo MVAOIEHHMEIAUBMVMNE. @MYLl ML 1AM SHIA

@RAVITVOOIM. MDD  ol0la00]1ENNA|CSMBDMIM.  CHOB  6NI0H:

mlelafledalan” M3V Mo (@Ja1oaul MIGHHa lo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
48

MV O1HE8MO 08 OOLITVAIY’ NINB 1M’ SNt olnlep plela s

A 106 1@AN Y.

UY1. HSHhoalss] MEO@M: VA, WLNIAMNOMIG3 M1 CHH0s

nIoBs16el 210N ENIBH HISABAND BN HHIUY Mo
HISHANEMHAANIGEMI @REBRWHS IR O PN (it l0) @E1 (@ Jowo?
DG PWIOMHIN MRS  IRYDDBS  GBUOAVIBIG®  MNIEsGHS]OA
R10MHNIBH  HISINDILJaWldo VUSRI  GHOB  NIE1OEI
210N HNIBHS” LIS1ABIM®. DI BT HEMNHH BREEBEWIS alOMELI.
af)R100IdBRB0 ERWIH VOMIBo HBHIFABHWIM. QAIBOO Al VMIBAIEM’
@RAIBHAN"  ADHISHEBAND.  @REEE @RAIBASONAN aOlMINIaU | ©3
OaldIV]laHd GRLOOID MIRINBAV" aHIQIOLI HI0INIEM o l0AUIN® . @R63E"
al0QMM®’ @ad\AceIW” eeloalon @»ooymoem” 29-11-2019-@3 1151
65051 @Bl I@mMm® 31-03-2020 @rwealoud 776.26 65051 @Galo
31-03-2021 epweapd 714.27 e5951 @Gal@mo@). 61.99 oSl @Hal
asosom). CRAR  (Capital to Risk Weighted Assets Ratio) 2019-@3

6.26-90 2020-@3 7.30-90 2021-@3 10.18-90 @gem”. @) MeIQIGd CH08



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
49
MINe; B oS1018060a S TVEUAHO @R QEMISMOMNWIEM’
mmﬂg@g@". @JQIBOM  LIDEOHAAT I al0® @AIQUGH

(@JAIBGDM £I0BAI6M.

GAI. MIM) HYBIMISM: VA, MIM HIV1ONaN HalQlo. UVOMIBo

ABRUIa [la636 af) M 1@3 YL FeN O wmIs Q1]
MSq{1eNe1gEMB  af)MBSB®EM” OM6EBUY  alEINBUT]a @, @61
alOeO® B@ »H00Jo aMIND HAVNTafldnIW] al0Wes, CHOS 6MINE,
Melnllod Qlam’ 6eNe’ DOV 1N dho (@10l MIGHHa lo
MUSHAO1EBM@IMNS8S  HHLINVWAV”  MINBKIM™  LIBIAIS:HAAN @631
al0aOMEEID. O™ @R M1CHWIBBEN? o) aNIGE 06ne” QUGHROIWIg0
OO LIBYNIWISIE] af)ANSBB 3OO o @R 1HHB1HBMEM=207 ..... af)N1He

@WIldh VAo @Mo.

@) HSdhoa I8s] MYGO@3D: aa, NIaONIMN S

@J®]alaHEM®IN)e MANSHOD A lNGLIOAMGonEB8e MmO  dlavadal
NI08s1oM TVAlaflaf DD HHLINVAAI” OHBHIFEIBD® af) NI YD |S®103

al@1BUIWMWANS BIVMAIWISIEM” D HHNIB:16)EHIMNENABEBANO) .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
50

GAI. MDY HPOIMISM: VA, BHOB NINEL1OHM (HBal1H0eMOJA0W]

MNINLOQ S MMM (@AM M1EBHalo MBS0 HHLINVMBIV” 1Y’
21010 MNINEEHUBBS TVIWINIWIWAT af)aIMIEM™ AMIM AMANLISBN D).
@RA@.NM.ag).-QOS  H1YILIM” D@D  HI0YEBOBLI00  AUBAND.
@REIBOM QAUGBEMIIE Moes ALloIm GIVIY" Bdal’ MMeAUTYH3/
GIVIY  &Jaf” anNME RMGCOUM  HFOW] Galdd:HhQIEM. MV  MINH
BaflHCla|@OHHIMNE" BREBOMOVIM (@JUyBo MABS QAUMMIEL! af)MIem”
MM  @2l0B1EBM®. MM MM  OMNANDD  HIVJOMIGLIY™ Qlddo.
MM AMIILINSBIM®  (VO1WINMELTIM3, MD AOLITVMIV" &H1FIOD
QAWEMIUW @R Mlely” 22180 AVa0GHEEM  MIEsGHUd  MDOIO
M101241588 (@JIoaVl M1BH1683U3 Y1) MOIBHNS
cmo’]@’l@gmooe;lcs%g? OOLINVMWBNVILINO® BR® GaOIUW” 6alQ)” QIYIAD
oJC(gG?O? B8@  alGlEUIWm  QIMIM3,  af)PODEI0  H:QEBBSBIEM’
HMZalISIGHNMBD®  af)MOTWIMIWVT  Wl. @AD" HIOWEH|ILISS
«;@goeaua CMIBH1WR1HBHWIAN. @Y VAV M@ OfleNgo MGG

GG MQo. MOJIBY” AGINMIT GaldWHANIMEIGaM LRI MNINE:EHOS
D) WY



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
51
aele  oolovawloieely)” a:Iomom1esan  ruOI®IWIGo  af)an
BOAEM  OMIM alBHAIPIND. BT HI0JokS] aMIM 2 l0WeS. B3OV
maflos M@ 0l  HIMB®. MOfes £21el0  MNI0E:hUd
MaYOD1CLIY”  GaldO® af)BBOMWINMAN”  ld1eUIW]HNEMo. OV
MUOMLOIMOD HBHIFODIRNBBAD a@Q0jo QLW AINY BOGMNOIQERI?
aMIM  AMAN1LNGHTO®” OMQINMEIT  BREEBY IWOMI0.  af)H0d
B030: VE1WINEME;1@3, ﬁam‘ém’]%\g’ alo@gl @saBlw Mmallsoom 8
MVaOGHOEM MVLINOW  OMNIBHIPIEM” MDD MVoLNIMo aBQ0je QLW
QI0Q) OGHIFOMD. MVEMVOIM TVAOHOM MIVH: HHISOMIBTHBOD oaBQ0jo
ael® aEIIMI®. @ 124 66951 @Gel@igemo 216 @@0s]
(@al@IGEMI af)aM” 3080WI1LL. alHH 8@ @Bal Galdejo M1@a)SaflSIEl.
M16BB8NOS O®SISo DS, af)MVlaf)al:0af).-Qo WI.09Al.af)al.0af).-
o allamdYo 86)%% QOSHY” M@H]. M@ MSAN  HOOYAEM . D
@IRYOO 2MEBBBAS A lfNAINEMFOD®. ER®INA GaldlGd BBaUBM”

YU CLOMUOIM  AMVAO®EEM  MNIIETNA  BHSENIOWI®

m@@ohd(auoo@@@oe;omg” moel” Mmoo alelluvog” oea’lgoom’l@cm



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
52
5IBatld QYY" MONSOHOD MINB:EHUB BRGOOLI®IW] ndclwleel.
M168BU3 A 10BSIWENBIHHNIMT BaldWDIEM. @) Al af)iflosmlaniem”
®1012)Sa|@. DD EIRYOODM ERYBHUBEN  OBHIFEHNMEIW]IBAN  aléMo
MIBBUE  HBHIMZEaIIW]  WBOMSIa]  AVAOHEEM  TVNIAIMAMBIHH]
MEBBGOS @JTVOIMo MSOD] BRAIOO 2 1B]Ea1daHla 1oJBIM” 356 EHS]

(@Bl aI2MINN@mMIeaMSOD aoe)ogmm%?

UYl.  HSHoalsssl  aYEOQ300: a3, (@flweqls GAWo. DO

SHPOIMISA, MAYAS MVoMNIMOD  AUBHO MLINILIY]TE  @JaIG@DMo
MSOMEMAAMMo  06MB  HBaHDHOO  MVaOIW]HHEMHANTHNIN BN QYSBS
MeIR1od  @RYOoEla®IEM” 0MIBH:I of)AN  VNIalMo. G@RGIM™ QY
OHIGOD  afMValOQIM@ ANAYAINIM. @)Y  QNQWBHANLIo®HAM
@RAIMDL 0 GAUME allJDEM HBHIFOMIFMNS. AN OMIGHIWQYOS PLIYNIOD:
a101GUOOW1LJ0@ GHOB MIE: HHIFOM QIDQYQHS MILNEgSIYME. @GP
DOMVOHHINE  TVoMVIVHNTBD). @) MO INODIM”  MaHo

QAMIZeMBIM@ QIARQIAIEM .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
53

VIR O) &HPYOIMISAY: V@, @REX QM AHADTWIVDEHHIMNE 63T
000  OMYMNadleno0] 62106816063, 0mieHd 356 GBSl (@Gal
AYOWZOMIS” af)@ @l ®101afSa] af)aM’ al0@oend? el emlnadQoe
@RMI1QOHSWVo 0040 a l0aOMGEID. @6’ QM Va0 HH06M
moear%;l@’l@omﬂman @RYSIEM. MDD  AVoMVNIMOOD  oBQ0je  aleflw
AQWIG )@ Bt @1G12fSaf ag)an’ a10WOM HYIQend? ®1@lafSaflel
@M MM IZRMIANGIMIAN @RSW EHHMBIAIN. GRANOSWIEM M
3GOLIWo. M1BBRU3 D MIIB;1HM DalECWIWaf 103351 AUSBOMIM GaldW,
0 10851990068° 62R0L(] HHIFOD. HPa el

WL af). af)@. aHoV1I@: V@, MEBBHMHWIAMO MVoMVIBTHHID

aloslel. ........... (00008 B2an)..........

2. 9210@RIMW: @REZa00 AIYeERIWILI GREE" MOlHnemo.

GAI. MO\ HPO3IMISAY: avd, 0mie»HI  aV).all.eag).(ag)o.)-

cB®Eeel? CHO8 MND:;  (BallGHoanOINag DC3UIUDELINW  MEEBRUI
G2l0BJo  ©2IQEMIUWY  GRMIM™ 9B0a00M2IWV] B@  GHAU  aMIT

2JNE1HHM 2. DHDGalIHL! GAUNO af)@ GBIV ald®emo? @3



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
54

GHAV N@GA  6IIND al060IR)SS. 8350108 D®OMWOWEIo  MIOW D

AIZLMIIQN@ QIO GAI@aM VAT 1IN,

0l. 2100003 TVOQAIW].

GAI. MIMY HPO3MISA: V@, EeNg AIMIS. @JWIME]S 00 oLsS]

aloeom’  @RAINVIM o {lando. @30 QN0W] MNINWealS 2lB@a)
0 21QOOMDHGHIMBI6M .  COIWIG3 QIOMo  af)ANIWaOIHBINDHHIME’
MOMHS MVaOHO6M m&(gﬂ@’l@@s ©rRLYIERIY” AIEdMEAIME] M3
al0QHWIEM. aMIM BCOHWIM  HIQjo AI@ECN al0QMNSS. M16813U3
21@32N1@3 MEa]IU8 MSEDIND®  WlaNOMWaHY @ ST1PON0GI6M”.

. af). afM. aHoVIB: VA, ........... (000d8” 82a0) .............

2. ©21Q3MM: o flaVL.... oflVL.... DEILS. ERGZa00 AIPERIVIAL.

GAI. NMOMY HPYOIMISAD: M@, 01ONOWHS30]s alOQEMIIUY
MIBBU  MGaoUd MAalles MSOMINENIMEIFIABIMN@ AWlaNOBaH| @3
S19OAGIEM . MVa0HE6M CORILIVNTE MEEBUBES” MWARNRISHI0. af)Lld
Va0 H06M N0 IMEBRHBQYo BM0GaIAA] M@ 1H8aM

M1YAYNRBIBSHIMIM”  M1EBBUBHS GBRAIGHINABBD®. GROLOD® BT



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
55
MaOHOEM GAAILIY” 8@ MIWNo, AOQITW TMVaOHOEM CORILIY” AOQIT3
MR, @ |0IABBAUBLH  CGAUNO  MIVAe  af)IMEIINRIHWINTO
DMRIHHIMW YW1l @R GMNOHDOD nJ%ooQﬂ«B(m. MGa0ud @M’
HYl1el $o0sMo, 97-20 @EeMALISMI GRARVLM] AUMIMECUWaHo Gdh0-
830aleoqQlol HMIDHVYIaNY” (GLEIENG BT T af) MBB®
2DLNHI0IHINA06M . BR@IG3MIIM” M16BBU3 WlaN0MBaHuy@ S1gen0gIm”
Gal0dEMINUY, 0MNG103 M MVMNIMODOD af)Llo Gd»O-
630a]60g7Tal"  AUNJaIMEBBUBAse  0ME"  6SAI@ ZIO@ @ADL
BEMOM1LNR1E9IM alglel af) M’ QleMo. aBOMEH1eje B@ HEINVOHW
GAISWISIMEAIME], aBODMBILIONIT HBAVO allS1e)a|SHNnIMdcaIme]l S8
MIamI3MM6Mo MS@DAND 2MIWal® o1 @3 @REEEBWQ0
al@1a00aV M06em. RMIWlal®IOMIG3  CaldIS1WIeM” ANRWICHHMED).
@RLIO®  aBOMILPAOMW  HEIVO  GMSIMBEAIMNE]  MTWaMIBondeMo
MSO®] @BRAINO BRCWINOIHH]T BRANOS HWOTWIDHHIMS8S HAOIM”

g§m1cmo<68, @RS M Mmoo BHISO B amilod

Meim@iaesenan” amoad  aflapdlesaniel agan” M MYATLEWIG3



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
56
al0WIad 61003 @)D 1HBaN. 006Mo,
DML GHINGHIV6BBUINHH 10X MWno MIBMTHEHIMBB BRAIGHIUd0 DD
quelel. ole3nealmnE]l A0@A0WT @RER™ B8 MIWAo HBGINFAIIMIOS
@RO) M1eIm1G3HEn2008s3 MLIW @ 0QIN6M’ af)am’ B33
3000060 |SOM@S]T MSOMOONIMNE" BRD@IINVAWo  HSMDLISOD D3

UMD Mo MSOM1HBHNIME” amIM M3, MA3].

W odl. all. WIMIRIM 2Ja®EINASONTVD(@JdhI00 YTl GaVAINA

aNglela I88]: aud, quemid;” Ho1g1 A1eajods” 21 elnoonss 2021-eel

CHOB MVaOHOEM Mvocel (EM2do GRAVMI) MM Hald®2MIR)(EJoWo
eMSIM@IMIVT AVBHBELIY” §aIQeMaaD 1 (ag)) MMIG GEBELMI I
@AM @ a [lasm0.

MM GHOB  TVaOMHOM  ALocel (EM2do  GBBVMT)  mileflom
alg@@emYaN. MAOS MVaOHOEM PO (@JEVWIRMOQISOM]DHNIMNE”
@aH1®  al0BSlHEBWo  AIYI®  aldBS]  AVOANWIMEBBEBWOAINHS
cmcauzﬂ(ﬁs;magcsoe;%. BHOSBO 1©3 aflédemo  3lMa|@o  aflengo

@SR 100EAIME] @AM E O MVaOHO6IM moe;cg;l@%m)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
57
DaICWINASOMINANINE  MVaOHON  oN@DMIAM” AVAOG] o)
Mo liQo  @UBOIB @@  @RYOoE1|PMIW]  MINWalS  2101@o
M08 ®IME" Malles afltR1d:01esaMIel. TVa0GHEM MINE:HOS
GHO0QUAIGYAIBBHOQAN LldhHio AlRWa{lasd agim@]mcalmeloam”
DEI OO0 Ao 2001MIBOD]OHHIMNE"  af)IDOHBHHIMNS DD MW
m’]cabdgsoa@)m)” @al031Ha83aM M. Delp]0o Z1eld MVaO0HO6M NI
CHOB MINBH1M LIV1EHMOAAN” @Y MINEL1OL! RTAMBNIB o JBmMIYo
@YU ISH @G ARlg |00 110 MVaO0HOEM MK GHOB 6NI0E;1M3
PIQNHBMMEMIFEST DG @@BBUIAN  MMIDABW™ DUl |HSWSS
VIMIOY 1 TMLOJAIMEBBBOS G060 alelloeImomle|ss QYB3
el(g%e&oeamg@%s)mm“ @RAMNSOO®  af)Lld  MSaldGHIBHse  MElaleMo
@RATWI0. MVIRININHAIWe AN @ELIONIDTI (@ JAUBAM]HBAN MVAOBHO6M
(@JaundM @ 1@3m 1Moo Zlelooelom]elss MVoOlWIMo
og)g@ogmcs@oggs”l SaN M@ JAN  O@MIMo QOO alellvowigal”

DM GRIGMIAIM” RIS1EBHWI. @1 S@A@ MonllwImMoe MIQ1 g SVWA

MUoQNTWIMOMIERIY” AUBEMIIWE  YEMERIGMINMENBIGHIN  DEMEBBRUI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
58
LIOMIGHEMHAAN ERYWaOISBM® BO1HHLo DEMBBIBMINIL.
MNEING o lCOMO al@IMEEND QAUBAN AWWOHAB GNIVAW" HAMIBNIAB
DI@DIEM” BR® BRYWaOlHBIND®. ERAIBHHIOM”  &H0AI AUGIWILINZIHAM
@J©@IMo  @ERMERAIGAIBINIGIND®.  MAOBHLIINIAHE30 MU0 low”
HOYERIHUM  MIYAA01WIe. @RMIMEAIME] MGa|dgo  QIIB1ABHWIM.
AANI@3 M  (BOlalSHUAOMEB0lsf  mallaswlmEBam  AIG@MAIMo
alOQdhQo  CGH@3 MWD DWAOMIBNINM]B63HQ)o @ajoggcgcmocra
MaOBHOEMo B GINQ"  TVMIGRIOIMAN”  MIEBUWE  AlM®aJdajo
@0 1B 1HHEMo. @RI elox V6N K06
2f) MDA HHINZDMHANWIEM” o 10@eIon0d1od RAAN1@3 6Ns”
(BOlAIAHUAMNBIWIGE M@0 MVoLOIM MIVWANVEHEIM3 ald:@W]elwldo
MOAMVEHSBOS  GRoW1HHI0RMBIVWIGE M@0 DD GBRVM] 621QOd
SFQSHQYBBOQAN”  al0deion0Flo 2012-@8  @.afl.ag). walEMead”
@RAIMOIa(la] Bslow” eV Mlacmle 97-00  BEEMALISMO

¢e3w®] Mnomlme 2021 @66e1n1@d  aocalla® GROMOCTIEISS

MYS10GHISHIWHS ST OI@BOMLIDWI@AN. TVoVNIM  OflaHWeBRE 103



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
59
@ IBROMOHAGHASBEMIIUY OO AW WIBIHNIMHRAN QUBHA G NI
MIAG3UWMIVITBMD MYaSfloGHISMIYHS @R AlWIVILHSWMEIVD).
@Omoo &@ allwl MG HMzeM=06em” 2020-0e1  esHoaNwlna]
200l@3 mil.o!.all. 1aIMONd” B®W oDV am%lgmgooe@omgg al0lUymo
MSOMIVO@. @R 6T)_ﬂ%lgo DD AINIWIM@ 0 I0IRWEQ|FHWINVMNBIBsdh.
@RCQ 0PN @RI  AADILIVOMINMW  H1YIG3 cNEOO®  Malles
Mallafla] @1 GRAI® aHIOWEAOHLIQBS GRYSHUY BT TVaOBOEM
2@oLIWo  BalldH0laf @RA.MI.oag).-Q" @LIYNI® B@  TVoallWwImMo
@palleelmd@®elomlcd  AYayla] D@IOM HYSHHOMW  CAMNEIQSS
al@lYyno MSODAN®. WD lBIYYANOD GWIEE] MM BMAIFEMIIUY
GR@IM” @) l00® B@W dLoAlWIMo B@W MIBHLIM ATV MAYBS”
(B0 |SOmID G F1GWMB®HMNANIGM’ @RD@MVoMNITW] o
MYallo {80088,  CHASOMINLI  @JILOATH:  MVaOHON  MVoCLIEEBRUY
MoMOIMOMING  ag)£ld  296BBEleje  MIBMIVE:  alth:Qln0]afIgens.

GHAILlo B@  TVINMIOMIS  TVNIa MDA (Tﬂ&l%f)@% AA0aU §

Ralloomlend  ageld coaleldlejo  @SOAISOD  21aImMIWIWIW]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
60
@JAIBOM ] 2JOWIMMIM”. BHOBOW LI (Galdladi@emM0ojo Q30BN mﬂ%o
2MH1VITRY@EMOjo AWMUDIL! MVIGHAD (@JTVUOIMEBBSBo  BFoMIUY -
9 I0®RMICRIW | NWEBBGo Galoeel MaOHOM (@JaNNIMOJo
DANEMINSIq]o MIBEMNIVE: alekz0la0laflSHMsan” Mo AMAVILNEHEMo.
RMSHTQ  AVOEEBBo RMGHIVW  MSHAISEIBHBNIM CHOSOD LI
MVa0GHOGM  (@JAVNIMH@D  AUSAOMTWOHDAN Mo @101 j0TWeMo.
@B H0LIEBSIT $H0BaHls CoalrIvleel @JUIEEBU3 aldla0d1enIOHmMAN
Meldled Mo (Balldh@la] ag)dhiMIMWY TVoLIERBIW WA af)8:1@3
enam’ @@)O@(H@O%@)@@OSU AENATSNIOIAM  ®EOWICRIY”  OWAM
MVAOO6IM MVNIA IMNEBBSBIEM BHOSOMILIBSB®. O IM HBIaO0MAIGM’
QOWBSIMMBM  afledaiMo  §alY Qfomogae;ma GLINI@  GHIMBSIE,
G0-a300]c0g1al” amvieeaugl. 1904-63 oanyoI@d GRYBY MVAOBO6M
@@ Melnllad aimm. 1914-@8 @l@aI®0@:0108 cHasam1nel @rRY3LHoIn
MVaOMHOEM  MUNdalMo  @RYOoEla). MENBI0 GG DaNIWRLANBISH W

HIN0, HIBaH]D: GRILIYINLI @BBa), HBaHD: RBINQEBBBHS DSHHo,

G3UD1Y (@JIVOIMOMIHAF SO IS MOMLI0 TVAOHO6M Mo LIEBBOS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
61
QA8G2|QY"  HEIMAW].  BWT-&SIWIB  ASVINDWHEDDI00W 3@
@®1BaHWo  &S1IVWIV]IWATD MVaOBHOEM (@JAMVNIMo. (BaldlaHOeMOHH0Y
QoMo £I1HNIM  MVA0HEM  (@JTVNIMo  QALN®  algk0laOlaflges.
Ma0IMIW AVAIAT M.af)o.af)aV -0 EMNP@IOHIG3 MSAM (Baldla@em
mlaOo»1ejns MLIWIEM £ aH1H000603 HOsEBRScIQ”
3210QOMIWEQ[0Ud @RAINME HYIT  PeImAMIVIBaNILL  gelwmo,
QI8o, B1SMIWINT DOMELIo LIBIAISBIM® Mo @RAIB 92[031q {lesam
»0BaU1CHIL|MEBBUBHN  QllaleM] HOMBOMIMe MVaOHOM  (@JAVNIMo
QaOla] al® ©aIQOEL  (BaldladEeMOO® @RSIN01HHIMW  BHY1VWIOHD®
Gald@D®EaIEjo BGHOBODIONL! MVaOB:OM (@JIVOIMEEBSAS GHEBOMIENM.
MVoCLIaIB10N01NM  CHOBSOMIGLIPSBB  HSAVAIEANOM  2IQHBaM
HIOJOMIT  AVa0HONM  (@JTVOINONIOMW  HGBO®  FleMuo”  nilawl
MVaOHOEM TVoCLIOMIEINS Mo HENBMIEM. af).odh.22]. afledaIMo §.a1Q)
DANYMW  GHIab]l  GMIAW 6®IYILNgldh80S 9SAMOMWVIEIS8  B8@

21l (@JAVOIMAIEM” a)aM” M0 GHIGMENBDEME. MAIlHS GOS8 MNIH;

QIBEMUIU3 V1RO HAIWe MANHS MISIHEI aleMo MANHS MISIGI®HAM



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
62
9a1L10IF1HHIM  HYIQAN, @EROLIITE DaleIU]HHIMB HY1WIQIM BT
M2a02l0lo  @BaldalGo. HoOMEld: aUlolwad  MINB:UIN.|HSYSS
CHOBSOMINLI HHICALIMT MNINBH:HU QYO (@Bal MICHHalo QII6BRZEMIIUT
®1@laf 37 @al 2I@DEM GHOBSOHIGE  AUIQWIW] HBHIFABAND .
o)V nMN.0afh).-@1c3 @@ 47 @GalQo HanWOm mIdeslod @rd” 40
@olQo MVDAD MANYAG MIBsIE8 @@ 50 (@GalQadem.  GHOSOM1H]
MledHalo  0flERLEOHYo (309)0(6(5(80%08308@630@)’] D HINZCa 0D
af)M@IEM” DD TVoAWIMEEBUY M1BQYa012]OE:0MEIRABMM®. WEBBOHM
HIMZCaldB:aM (MV2a0.210 O @3 MLS MVoMNOIME O
2NIEl8000nGalelo  aJOOWENGHIOEIAN” 204 AIBINMN@®’  CHOY
NINEHIEM.  BHOBOMIONMW @IMal0fo MVOABHHISHIT AQ" HHIGAY ®3
MNINBHEHEBIS  H1SallSlesam MOV @R@IOM NICQMEDNS.  @REBBOHM
MIQEMENE,1@3 Mo 6300895001 M1@3HHEMo. MI0Es oW’
Mo ONWIMEOOM VYo MVaOHO6M (@JONVNIMEBREBWY0 @ HBHHID

& 2]0 35101068310 101H630M GH(B BOEMIW]HI01HB6S QaN1@3

8300895001 @J®1BaUHWI]ABAM @M 1d>00 @050 6 HHHBIW]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
63

MWBHOB® af)NIM (@D alHUCOMIS  aM6EBUWIBH  AlNMWadB0jo
al0OWIMBB®.  GHOB MIH: QAUFl BCSOO G@RYMGZLINEIBUT  MTIHIND
H¥1Wo. @2 @IW0 @BRODM OO 12|88 B33 (@I MO IM”
MaNIWHONIW BT MILIaldsS MoUd aVI1SHOICHENME®NS.  MH0lles
O®IYILNBH BB MSAATIL], MSalNGHIBHS LMo §.21Q)aM0, @YUM 1>
MBI MVDHOYEBUS D0 0Hs300, 2lLl6900d° aJOODEaIdG:aN1El,
MMIBAW”  Galde|8s MO IMEBBBOS @RYAVG:LINEIBUY DS 10FHIBHN”
eIGlHEBM,  af)LINOMIMo  Dal@lWIVT  AVotLIalelad  malellmniood
@RRMNBHOB (JONCOIWIHBHWIEN GHOB 6NI0EH ©aIQAN®. DD 33
DOSDa IdhH NIBEINeM. W N el WIBN1HMIWo
2REMIaINHIV@J3DNIWQo af@® HIQYHAGOMILJo CHOB NIIEH ANldha DI
afloan  O®Om o) DBBAND® 2 aDIMIeM™? @@ aflel Mg
@0@3a10}63BUT  Qla)Od:06MBI6M. (@D alHHUADIM GROMOORIT MBI
@Il QNI 1L af)aIM” am6BBU3 QlluoIN1BsM.

A0 QAUAINVIVOONOD  BROEIBIGE MVaO0@GHEEM Vo LIERSA0W]

MINWOSOBHNE"  BHILILISOMIGII@O® 8@ 2090 @D mildd
0 0



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
64
QAGMIZAUPSHWIEM. ERYRIAUMITNo  alBald:g8103 80003 DSEMORIN’
MBBUY o lOQMOEHRI?  @REBHMOHWEIG (@D aldHEM®INNHA]
MIQEBRUY DUBINQPSQYBB  HIOQYEBRUE MEINUWE  alGlEUIW]BHEMS.
@AXR1AMITMo ol B02U3 DSMWH:  af)MNBB® o JOIW
MdoelepisomIm”  aflaeLAdIeM . @QYBHUY  MI01R0T  QAUESS. B02U3
MmOV 8@ al30lled dM@AMIG3 NI H00QIHOS
cmomem%Jo rgoﬂd’l%loeae)g cmoamcrw’l%poace@ MAH
630GRIBOMAHBAOTWI0.  BHOBSOMIGE BERAMA@ 221210 WI@IMIBRIWMo
M1eIM@EBIMN HILIODEaldLjo A3 & 21WABRHAZ AIaOMo (@JB1MITVo
5000 &leenalgoleiwlao  @I@ 021Q ol alOQM®. @D
AaOMOMIOM 16 SWQHBIeM” MQIVEY.  @REAJIW MM 6003
668136 M1e1m1G3asam P15 13 aVI0RINNHMIW)0
MODINBANHQYENBIF0. BRWIHI00 DSD 2|WIW] QAIAMIGI BVAOEHIDAENZIB:0
af)MaloO®@  M1BRUHANWIEM. ®SABa|WoW] @6BBROM

@WIB00EMLNR1SBIM@ MAME!  af)AM” @1@lajo A0lgjo  alOQRMMD®

WOIVEL CHASOMINL! HHIO TVoALIGBBROS MIECMBROAF H1G1V13



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
65
630003 RNaillor»oelo DSOID Q1 B63, @ailes c@"]oeauaceagé
al80S1OMAMBISBE:  af)ANTAUWIEM” LISGHLAUPMMD®. HH10 62611103
@JAUIBOMIABANAIRIGE  BSDEJo (Tg%e@oam”. @ROIAHS  ERP®1O0Z
BOMOMIME  aldHIBlOMo  HHISABAN® M, OeAIN”  (@Jaulawag’
MUOIMRUBOAOS M@HAN  ETdIW]enam” o» Mlwaemlcd c_3LM®]
OHMHIMZAUMIZBB®.  @JIVIWAZ AVOIMOJo  HHHIFHN0.  RIAUMHHION
MBS AMYDIQYDQMBIHEMo.  @6BRUIHH @Bl ASB0IRHS
2IBH HNHIFOM @BRAIDO DEBIIVOMIGLIY” HHIMNZNUVIM GAUMNEIQSS
al0lUNEBBUd MSCWMR®ME. @R IM  VaNIWE:ORIM” (ﬂ@g”@(@”
SHGL.  ERDEaIOL] HHIO MVoLlEBS1M @Ro®Ie BMFAMNAIB B0
HBoUH@  @MOMWIWIDIHNEMo. @RI 0  HDILADo  aly)jo
2106MH0JONINGHWIW]  cITWYMBIWGIBHGIE? S@d M908  calms]
M@0 ©210ABMNMR  IB0NWILNBANIT BaldOGLI). ald@® GHOBBHV0
DDHIFABH Qo  BRDANIW]  MITWe]S (JAUADMONID  aBBRa|GHQo

@mgtmm@ @RoEERBIW]  QITld:  af)MVBB®IEM.  alfl  HSLITY

MUoPLIEBBo @R  EoWED MIEIMIMEBAM  OMPIV  (JAUMDBHBo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
66
@RAINVIMTa [IENIMB MVa0IWHONIR0. @)Y MIRIYIG HIGCRI2RIW]
QEANIZI) M GRBUVM1HHOS oﬁ@esmada)oe)om“ 61)000

@RAITVIMN o (1863aM0.

@Wl. . af. elela0l V@, TVMI HIgl 01@a |03 ©alQ)

@J300088 2021-021 6HO8 MVa0d:oem ol (ee2do cRRVMI) Milmd
aflengo @RE® TVMIE HMIQIQYSS alBlWEMMY” BGRWPEMOHAIM 2 eni
MMIAB 63V M3 BRAIMM o (losaM.

UM, HNG] al0MIEHTW O1Ea]0d506M” MEReS AINILIBB®. B3T3
921010 020QoGaldejo GI®ILIMIWISIEL. BRD@OH:IME" amMIN3 MM ileflod
S@631MMN06 NS M1WNa IO QAUTR®IIQOAIQ 0 163303 DO(@GH
mm@m?ﬂ’loe&mag%. QMal” MoMIB]2|DEOB:6ME @RYAUIBGHMANOIV®
DENBIH:HAH 1A HHUAHHEMHRAN” BREJAMOIHBHWIAN.  BANIAMIW]
al0QMM®°  @RAITIWNEAAHUN  MVoMITWla]  @OAMNWIE. Banking
Regulation (Amendment) Act, 2020 cayg” 6Ho-80qjc0gl0l
MOB:MHRBABo e MmgdHWaso 01-04-2021 go@d  mi10wan006]

waleNdenagd’ 6830a0" DA | @MIS1a018HHaHND 2ler e (Wi



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
67
23-12-2020-moam”. @@ S-u00e00m Hmlauad, 'The scheme of
amalgamation shall be presented to the shareholders of the StCB/
DCCBs. A resolution shall be passed by 2/39 of the majority of the
shareholders, both in number and value, present and voting at a
General Body Meeting of StCB and each DCCB as required under
section 44(A) read with section 56 of the Banking Regulation Act,
1949 af)aMmoem” 210601018830 @Y. @R6EBOM QIBEMIOUD
07-03-2019-a00 18-07-2019-m0 0221000@ ailg]sj@ald0m Delnj0o &216J0
MO8 RMO@3 GNIAW] CRINEMI@ 129 ¢alodem” alomsom®. @R
129 Ga10l@d 97 auocelsBud ™M eI0M (@JERWHOTD af)®dom, 32
@RoWEEBU3 MI@DIEM” BRMELIN D). MIa0NIMHAIS HOAOCHNISHIWYNS
M1BE3WEJ»HI00 =1Ll HBHQOS MIVTHHUIMOMILIM” DD EGWIWo
msan@. 29-09-2021-00° @aldam =Moo gmioawl c¢wIwoe aflengo
DafDHHEIPIM DD LIQMOCO ) @IOD. BRDHBHIMNS I

MRallaflesan®” oVWBS@  EREHIM  Al@eELAI® 8@ Moo

al0mMHn0Mss  legislative competence maasea=d? aOMLNIM



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
68
MIOAME oIS 8@ Milelom®100W] gomeslele 8@ =leld
aleIOVO BT NM1WAe aldTVIGH WIS af)EBBHMQENBIB:07 BRDE HIMNS
OIVMSO @ERYRIM™ AN@rLEV] 8@ M3 MANOS AlPAISBMM®
MR 100001 MeIN1@Hs3H1el.

2000, @P®leel 4 b aldal @oo00 Gross NPA below
7%-90 Net NPA below-5%-90 @maiemenmoe’. @@’ oago 1elo
NINERINEMELTLJo  MVOMVNIM  MVa0HO6M  NINERINMEsTLJo aldellafislel.
olaudal” mies1eadQo MMINBAWTNM®o MVE@HIMANIM@ TVIDADHAIW]
MN@3H9HIB Delp]0o Zeld iy RMOT  eMIdA]T @T@BAIM] o |1OM
MIEaMIBAMMIMODIEDS  afDIBOD  CMIDa[lABMM@”  TVaOHOEM
2MIW]aI®IOHOD  DENDGISHLIEM  af)ANIEM  6M6EBBOS  @RE1(JIWo.
EM=2006Om®;, The basic regulatory criteria- @3 4 a-@1@3 alo@mMaoy,
"The State Government shall verify that there are no Court Orders
prohibiting or staying the proposal for amalgamation' agyanosm. Now,

at present there are 8 or 9 writ appeals pending before the honourable

High Court of Kerala” , i.e. W.A.Nos.708/2021 to 713/2021,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
69
715/2021 to 717/2021. eooad 28-04-2021-moem” ©6a0CH0IS®]
Nlo@d emieal” af)®10001 AlWla®. @y 20mEallea 8dqjeoglal
GaldBaHad NEEROHMWIWITAN. @RI (sq}o)g;” (sceno-@ocacsogﬂm" 6NN,
aflaf’ OOV S0], olav@ali® mIEm ag)MIAEIeM” BallaH|@3
sosmyoeeaday.  'However, I direct the respondents to take steps to
table the bill to replace the ordinance.! @P®IMEEI DEa U3
MSMOBGIMEIRlESM®. DD 9 eraflellejo @&51630MMIE @6
oomoanemle. 04-05-2021-m" o somoallom eay 6).21QO 06"
0a0CANISOIQOS  Awlailavad  enlemi” Q(Z)TZS)(OO_H%. @RM®  aflan’
OIV@S01EB0  @EROINIBB®OIEM.  @RE3000 B@  HAHHIWIEM. BN
CHI-6300 G070l nIdEso  OTAVAOIT  MIdEko  HAUIHBIEM.  BPRGAIU3
@O B>06Me” @R »I6MIOD) Q11 @3 M eni1@3
GRAIMOla {lEBM®°  MTVAIEAIW]  dDQIEM™  afMIM™ NI
@El oW lgan®. gamonsom@, Article 213 of Indian Constitution,

Power of Governor to promulgate Ordinances during recess of

Legislature, em»omModleoLIi®’ W ®i6em”. af)aniLlo B01HHTI:S]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
70
anvlesswoem;, (1) If at any time, except when the Legislative
Assembly of a State is in session, or where there is a Legislative
Council in a State, except when both Houses of the Legislature are in
session, the Governor is satisfied that circumstances exist which
render it necessary for him to take immediate action, he may
promulgate such Ordinance...'" ag)anoem” al0QMN@®. af) DM’ GRE)
@RSIVOMO  MVIa02I0f0;  @RSOM® alo@mm@, 'Provided that the
Governor shall not, without instructions from the President,
promulgate any such Ordinance if-, @ofles @R@OI@o
@RSIVMmojwimiass Extraordinary Circumstance of)amoem &
seeMMVAI®]  mafles  @JadEmlasanieal; BB (@QJECDIHNIW
MO0l O1e]. @R AHIVEM DI MNIa0MIMAalS T SloCHIS®]
Writ Petition (Civil) No.502/2021-@es oaNulol@d alo@an, 'The
Ordinance was declared null and void'. &206mo  @JaVlawadimowoejo

VAIBEIMBEHIVIL)e  @RAIGBES  amaV’  Satisfy  ealgan  @:00468303

B 1aU Y @3 crggmg»&” aflew@niem. @R® WOTWHLIST103 MDA INELI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
71

null and void' @y 'ultra wires to the Constitution' @ry@o aNwlenoad
MY@f1oCHIS®T BMHQYINIVD®.  @RDAHIMNE D Bodawlmaday” Article
213(2)(a) agam Qidaf 80leoeje alefsflglel. 'Every such Ordinance
shall be laid before the Legislative Assembly of the State, or where
there is a Legislative Council in the State, before both the House, and
shall cease to operate at the expiration of six weeks from the
reassembly of the Legislature,..." Cease to exist @GreBOMWINEME,1GI
MOMHS aBGPIBo 630BAWIMABIYHHBI6M” MHOSH WD . 6300 MTDWAVRWHS
M@ alaflel. 0D Milod ERAIMO] {lEsIM MVAVOD B8@ CINYHA0G
MO@o  Qlajo@d  A®ICWI; goemagismes  213(2)(a)  aidaf
atoeflespanzmeel; It is mandatory. @R@oem” MYEf1oGHISG] alOHG.
@P®o MAfeS aldellaflsiel.

soemeeismes Article 14 -Equality before law, eaomyoleel
af)RI0  MoMNIMEBBZEIORI MIdB:UBAs0 1L MIdB:HUdHB0 BRMISAI

@JCAWo  @RoWTRHATIHNINT  JAMTHALIAM” BClaldHo GAlEMo. o lGHH,

EIQ‘:!O(OTOﬂCT)U mwaeel, against Article 14 of the Constitution. Then,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
72

against Article 19 (1)(c) -Protection of right "to form associations and
unions or co-operative societies". Delnjoo  edlglo  enio@lm” @R
avellé:iamonaleel;  Article 43 B - Protection of Co-Operative
Societies - 'The states shall endeavour to promote voluntary
formation, autonomous functioning, democratic control and
professional management of co-operative societies.. e®o eallos
aOMNENOQSHWIEM . BOMLISMIA I0NIW ADLINBINIBGINEBBUBH0 AQ
@@@g%esﬂgoeauaoe@o all@eLAdV156eM” 20100) enil@d e 0iles
@AM {lEBIND 2f)NIEM” aNEBBUS MY alla {lH8ANOY.

0eQoam, 3 tier-@3 mlano &@ tier B910161Y88  *LISMIAIANIW
ilslelnlo]a) 8 @RDOBHIENFNBIBAN  NJEUIRSHB06M  ARaila {lesmMa@.
MNIOAWIE3 Moo 010 LIE12J0T MMIdBA™ GANY™ GhI-830q]c0gTal
MNIEBIMVM@HEMN  alelW]C  @relo 21210 MIIOH:SODOHIFHE30.
@R@OHIM2eM” moevass PAC(Primary Agricultural Co-operative

Societies (PACSs)-a:0d68” enyaulagenzoaid: af)ammoem” 0103e0®;163 e’

EMEBBUY H21QIN®, MMNAWIE Mo e1&la) 200 €H0S1 Galt @ROIB



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
73
aloQaM @RCE® alefld MIEGHILINEM @INYOMSILIBB  MIdB:BHUIBR
OHIGABM®. @Y B MIBC3UWo MMILINBIWIE ODIVWEGLI.  Q6ME]
DCB (District Co-operative Bank) senmowoad so@lem eoweelq”
92lQOMo  HEMBESIVB  ©21QI0  TVEANWIMAMRINYBHWILI  af)aMIEM.
Section 2 of the Kerala Co-Operative Societies Act is amended.
@REBOMWINMEIM  ameswlas  RBI-qeos  eseicrvadmymeeel.
aMeEROE8 Olavdal’ MIdE: 60a0" MDY HOYEAIY” 9.21Q)o, Me6ENIdAW”
HEMBSIVY alQo.  af)AMIM @RAINOS (@JWOAVo;  af)AMIM™ (@JUgo;
GO, MDY BHPBIMISM BGBaldS” BO0Y6EBUS Myailgfls). New generation
Bank-oeaggooo)’l QOJ%O.I’]Q]@QOO)O@GTDSM@, Deln]0o Zeld  moesIm”
G0 MINEsToWEME.  @RMIEM” (@JWIMSa|g @RAUWYe. ameEBUles” ATM,
RTGS (Real Time Gross Settlement), NEFT (National Electronic
Funds Transfer), POS (Point of Sale), Cheque Truncation System
ag) 1 qvonllwomesgMe.  momoinseweel New generation bank-m”

GQINE®.  @PO®LI00 6@6@3@1(8(5003 OB HI0J0 6)2IQMOME., @a@(ﬂouﬁ

@P@IMEAMEIWIN”  LlIWla {I880MemAN”  aloQM®IGE  GRAMOAIE].



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
74
afloan alo@mmo; 13 =ep mossgo ei@lafleel, afloan 'agamnoem”
MIEBBUBHH  (@JWITVo ag)aMIGM. MIa0AIMe]S AMAADIQo TVaOHO6M
m@;H@1®go 0NOSWENE.  af)sBBaM®IeM” MM 13 MmIdes®ud eI |oy
enailes 5 6NI08:H U Oam Y13 MIaHEM @3 G MWI1e03
MNOE@IMODILINWIBANEGELID; HITVAEWIAW, QAWMIS, BHISWo, MFHH],
@c@@ o)1 1Ll MVaO0HOEM  MIB:HUB  BHIVWN” BGE1HBM
MINEEHBIVWI@BAN.  af)BROMWINTN LIW L@,  HITVACWIW (@JEGAWo
HB3HIMNZAUM G IUD ni.o®.al.-Qo M.ail.eag).(af)o).-Do ®o1L|8s
a0V WIRMOMMVALa]  MILOR.all.  a0IROIGICME LI MO
A l0AVIHIOM®.  QIOMIS, MGHH], GHIFWo, @g@p@ a)aM1 221216 UBES”
PAAMI@EMNE"  (FOTalAHUALNOWAN”  AVAEHIBIMOTWIo. BRDODHINE”

OVHUM 14-0” oo Moarve 8@ GREAMHAG" Od:Imzgalm.  14-00

Qs |IVETe] JINI@d EMEIHMG  (BOIaIBHUAMBIVWIT NI@ED  Gelelo

aldS88  a)aMoaMm”  GR®OEM’ 1969-021 c5H08 G630 jc0qlal
OMVIOOHAVYIAY” @Ry@GleLl  Mlno. @R HN m@moem”  14(a)

Qldsq |od:06mgalan” Simple majority amlowan” Mlay@atlaf, M@enicula)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
75
MR 1000V DLPOD® MV  ERMVoMIWIT  aldaVIB]alaflg0em”
CHIMWAV’ BAIHBAN DD 221210 NINEEHHOB LIWTa 1900 OI@BAOM]2|oY.
GR@ENOD® MAIB aloQWINDEa L] 13 nnesas1od 5 nne:sud
TMUIGAWXI DTBAIM]DEL  MEBBBSHNO 6 MNB:H:806M”. RIAUMBHIA
@RMELINIWI@MOHAIAN”  MAIlOS  al06m). ZHeloleel 80 MmN
BAEMMVAIMT AN IMAMal @RADBLINIWITWAVHAUAMIAT alOQAND).
R10MB9IQ  AMEBBBOS  ZOSWIV WM.  af)MIT B@ AV BT
mmmﬁ@qgo R10IMH900  AflglaJa@BOm]  @RAIGEIS  TLoMVIOT4f
OMMQTM 500 |63BUIHE GMSEBBBo  BIYMOLLIJEBBBENEIB:0, @D M’
M168BUI OD@HM BRMBLINHHAMHAAD A lOMITI aB® RIQUMBHIOMIEM”
@RMBLINBHI D163 . 610)68136)63 3¢10100610WEa0go 610)6813U3
DMUBa IBTaHOEMo MSq 0],  MAIB H@JOGAIAHM MTIHIG BN G, |0U3
OM6EBBUI QYIIM XRIOMNBENIBHBo  H(@JICNIAHA M@IHIN] @ﬂ@om’lgd.
afloan eM6EBUIHS af) @100V BRAIG MITILBENI; BRDOBIMS” ilellod

A 10N @’ 0oV Ga02UdCEIOHM MoNITW 206,

210N HNINOBB012jLl.  BRD AOHHBBOAN” NI 630800114 [1883HWIeM.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
76
DM AURGIaIONOW  HIVYEEBUS  alOWo. af)OIMI6M”  610)63BUI
af)@1BBEBMO@AN” al0Wo.  21LI0 M af)AMVAlOQAMND®  allaNIBs
2 [STNOI\0) el(g;lo«m»” Q. W af)al-0A BN®ISHUI m%mmgj QIO 1Y
S@ alellw aIsSQoéHmdem.  maolles vl amam@@é} a0138” Myafla flajeeld;
DM@IM” 54 @UIHBME.  al®IQIMEHBIWT GR® LNEOTILIEM
@JUBOD) 9JoB0eE1B13M@. 4,500 @50S1 @Galwes mleaualofo
4,200 caosioleiwldme an@@nme. G loseemenlm” @YBHUBHNE”
MV ANYOWINGN  AMEBBU M@HBEMD®.  LIWIa[laJodd @RAIOO
MVa0IW]HNIAT  aM6BRUIHE TLIWIHEBERI;, MBIV, ma”lmgoqas
MABe3aMaVTla]” Mlenimwmawdasalewendwl OTS (One Time
Settlement) msosEMIOGD Delnjoo  &lgoloel  EROIEBHMESIM’
MVa0GHIVNH WA aleiltd @3 Hsai” M@IHIAd MVIWIAEs3MD.  HM] @R@
MEERUISS TVOWISBHWILL  MANSEOD GHINM LW’ anmEl@mian”
a00@g"  GalaH{aFUIMMo  HOMWAVA  GEIWGHUWER0  AflB§0810MVAIvN)o

@RYGCQIWN IR0  DANAMOANDIMGCAIME]  aM6EBUT af)@DCVI Db

amelmooeacm’lcg%? M1 GHIMeN?d DA’ aNENE’  6106BBUIHS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
77
$H6MIMBGaloLjo MIWIBRIEL  ERQYIVIEEM] S8@BMYO1d3aoo W]
GAURIVHIOO CHOB NI0E»103 MA2|OAUMD” MEDUY YMWal BHY. alGdHH
owell ga’ @SIAuNIMOEMIGEI) &HOIB  @RSITVNIMOD 1GLID
MENIMB  VIWIH536N0 7 el Mofles @GR 1Ll B@ aldvyo
M@HIMB  MVOW1H53620; M1EBBOBLINNIMo MINE: NSOV @@ggoe@@%?
Zeld  MNE:HU MSTDHAM @RYBBHB6MN” M16BBU3.  af)(®) @RYBBHB06MN’
glainvojo AVl lEB8M®, @RAIHO  MVA0IWIHHNIMB  TVIW]HBEAI;
@RAIMVIMAIW], 0 QI1S6) O alellyoo OB JoN1g” D HH Qo
QYOO QYo M1 W1H3M @1 @3 af)OaM s 1ejo A 1836306 GA0;
O®1OMEI0 Deln]0o ZHlelwleel LMEBBUY @Joei”  HoQ]
630a010VICRIMEHHI  GLIDEHM H1g]  830a01TVICLIVEHHI  @EROLIS 13

@ af). af)@B. aHoV1G0, oBOIWI Ho1g] 2anINIERIY” GaldGHeME]

(7
maﬂcg% !

@l af). of)M. oHoVIB: VB, GaldW1ad &Boal” BI38WA. DD

2 I0QIMSBIOY, NIaOMIMAa S @oWo [eI1 DI Myaflaflaf

aloaujomlmealme]l @Joanl” 83a011eRIY” Galddhemo, @Ry O1M1W1eIss



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
78
alEd0@Uoo COAIWILIMEIHINE aldSIEl &hI06Mo, TMVaOHOEM MINB:GHOS
V). af.0ag).(ag)o) al@muyo aflslesam @113 @E3a00
MBI 2|gHH0M8  A1HBIN® NOTVEL.  EMBIACOD®, OV
nlelneom” A@Bm® eflloa n@o  GRElEJOIVAIM.  &hIdeMo
CHIMWIVIOM B89 @Rowo MM Ganddleflel, ™ mileflom GHHIeMWAV

@RMZHLNHBMD. BRD@OGHIMBIEM” EHITBWINIH 36009 @RoWoGalIR)o

¥aklel [ [STOOIOR

0l. ®210BAN03; GAWI. 0(6)% HBOOIMISAVNS.,

W) af). af)@. oHoIB: LG, @PWIUT ]BIVWICTHDEBHIME

1AM @I,

GAI.  Q0MY HPOIMISM: VG, GaldW1ad  6%a0”  BIAAWWA.

GBIV B00WoBalde)o mvewleiloelam alQ00@Udo
av (e} [Q¥}
GO6UW1LINZIHINS aldS1el, &I06Mo MIT @@;omﬁ@n(pgoe;owmom“, QQRIeG)

MOOSYNE. @R CORIW1LMNEIHINS aldsll.

ol. ©21032003: AME” HIOJ0Jo aldlEUIWlaso".

+  NIpOMIMAOQ]g MVBIRLGHUOMW 2OmAANMEB00 (an@@3 Mo. 18071/m.6n./2021/m.oav. @l 03-11-2021)

aVERIGOMHS@3 M1eImBam].



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
79

@) ). af)- eiomlan? aVa, MNIaONIMAAlS  CHOS

DHO0CHNISOIWHS OO (@)oo HDMOENNFANN S
BEIMMVAIDIQHS  @JaVlawagoem” emid. e, GPMINR OOV’
@Javlaweagam aloQMN® Deln]0o =eld Q. W af)a0:-0)Y

0 210WANIMESIVWIW YY1, BRRW™ EGAIaOMMIEM.

2. ©210@RM: @6ER MY’ Da IGWIW1LS.

Wl Q. af). elomlan: avd, Mallos @.al.afan. BOIHABAN 633

Zeld  msoem.  aaVlo  erfly’ @gmﬂcwo%o BHIMMWAV”  HHAIAV’
@cmhim%om)“. MO @RAINVIMTa[ldB0M. 2l@a] GAlEMOHRIN” UYT. ol
mam%lm a013” aloaom.  MIM  @RANESYIIM” QAUBAND). DEBOS
HalOgan” M®Ealeel  &Sleajdom, @@ 8@  aUl.all.eag).(ag)o.)
GO IS eNIEHIEM. @@ @00 lHhAlaBAGRId? @P® 1603
@JV1aadowoeio BOMAVATDTWIWIL]o @REBROHMWIEM.
MBBOSWoS] @y  aVl.all.oag).(ago) miosslealy” elwlalonamosm”
99:41-003 @EOlIMMYS8 ®D ave OIGBAOMIEBM@. MDD M@

al0AVIGHAM DT aMEBUIES  @RE]EJOIVAII®OMVORIMMA]L].  alGHH,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
80
MEBBNW] 8@  al@a] MSOMEMo. @R 2lG2]VIT  ANEBULIIRSS
@BV al@la0olepemoe.  @R®IGE BN, MV  MIVACMIOAZ
®SMEBBU3 M1HHEMo.  EENE,, DB J0U MNIa0NIMOQ]S HOANCHNIS®] MHNIA
aloaN B  QNEEBZo  GHSOmIMEWaHadem”  day to  day
@RALIMICMNHMEAUMNE] 8@ BEIMMVAIDNW HDONEVSOD®. af)Lld
@Y GAHn 163380 cm’o@’]@om)mgo Qﬂ(ﬁcromémgo (8093%6)09306T]30m)u enM
BAMMVAIMIHW HDMOHMSOMD® . BRDCalINL] S BOMAVATIDICWI
@RELIH;1G 2HQOMMELEj Galdl@d 8@ WeaEMlow” candwlewd day to
day a@puimicapatmeaimsl @19  210JQEUnHo  MTHEMHAAN
@RE(@JOVWOQISHWIOM. BRI aMEBRUISH  WaleMenadleoad aam1od
QAUYOIMBB®. DDIMVEUaHo OMEBBOB  BRYA.NI1.Haf).-CLIVEHNI  CH@M
NAIIMOAFIGRIYBHHI 0aNCANISONWICRIY BHHI mYaflo
CHISOWIGLIVTEHHNI ERYY@®.  MEBBUS al@a] alQINB GQYINEM.
S6BIBBOS Q. Wl.af)aO-003 CNDISHIAQ D MVBWIGE @OINWNBELID,

@ROIRBNOW] 21@2] 9219 8T @1TBRIMHAFHNMORMN” MIBEIUT1 ]ed>06Ns"

MV aloam eflnejo aNdIdhalIBJA0W  &HI0L6BBUING6ME" af) DBLBHQo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
81

921QYOBH0NE” ANIM 2f)HAY AUIBEBHU3 BRAITVIM o {lHB0.

21, 9210A@RIM: MNIORNIMOQS albl @RoWEEBBo MITY” WAlafISIE].

20" MBMNINWAIW0 WAHNEMHAAN” O21VA@ QU3 @gj@»@’lgggmoam‘i

M0 BHEM-02FICIRAUM  Qldhq QD] (W. all. agMB. QIILAIM):

V@, MIaOMIMAA]S @ROWEEBUE MM 61).“%0@1 NIl MSOMIW
2182)5Hg103 2WABMAIIM  AYat{la 1MW ONNBUMEBOHBWo  (H1VWICVIH:
MIBERNEBBOSYo  TVNWDo  HaIYIN.  GREMINSIajo  MIaORIMOAS
Deln]0o Z1eld  TVa0HOEM NI @ycm’lam%gs’l@oq» Wl. . af.
IO 1an’ BRDEANOLIMOHAN @JAR! TVa0GHIGIWIW WYl. aofl. czmam@«sa
a013”  MayYORLI00  MANOS  2182|VNT  PVWAOWIOBHIMNZAUAD  (@JUQo
DOODTVoMITWa] &SI 2I@a|HhUd  GAMo, alBs|dhSle)Hs MAHS
¢WIH]a{lOLIOMI0 af)aIMIEM.  WAIMHAAZ" DOAN AMEIVINS 10V,
2182|&HUBOENCA]Igo VWAIMIHAAZ GQIVIEM; AMEBBRUE ERMIOM AMVIIN®o
921Q)M. YMI” 212568 MSOMIVISILIHWA GREBQOS QANBOMIM, QM
MSOMIQW  2l@2fhH0Ud  MUoMIMWlal  MIaOMIMS]S AWM  AVAOHH6M

AU |2AD] 0 10I0BUIHBHQMZIW].  GR@IT  GBRAIOYI0|DWOEEE 103



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
82
MBS afleNgo al@a] MSO®] D oW’ @@oa"lg;lmooe@’l GHOSB 6NN,
CHOBSOMICRB® af)AD  GRYUWo  WILNIBMOYAIHHNIo. @R 13
MIpOMIMIMIW  dLIgj0o &0 ME:  @JIUIAWAGIEMIS”  af)M1He”
al0@OMBI®, MANSLI Chd8a{loall FIMAWTI@IN. AN’ Haf)dh |CHOSBo
20On5OM1S” 65 A MG EMN20060™ F1AITVAIEM”. " BIO@HAMD
GH30M  BREINIMaJBIMANIMo  BRAMOoWO;  CHABHNAN  GCHSIGRID
@I8Y6eMo  Caldd MAHS AMOMYHS13 . ekg;!oacm‘“ GHUBBBEMIYL,
GHOBo  af)AMN  GHUIABEMUIUE  @HOANWIEM Galdd OIS CHHENID).
@EROM @613~ AflWILInd® AM:MAIMIWIG ODIOM af)SANHMOHAAN’
allm@aydqle  @REIAMOLBMM.  (....Nla0So....) Delg0o  2U3eqIgaM
BHOBo. BRDEHHINE BHOSOM1GIMIAN” GAIONS’ Deln |06nam (@Bl 13
CaloW1L8S).  af)Lloo  GalBIM  S@ AOMIOGaIHH  BIODo, BB
DA DHICEH0Bo, @Y CHOBOWINNG  Oaf)dhjo  MRINIBOD]GAI0BHI3

MVoGWIRMo  BRMIANAIMIEM. aB® alB@aj@o @QQIOINEMAN  HIOY0

ryaila [l983HQIEM”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
83

MafleOS  2l@ahS1EsS 2WAOMIOHHMNZAIA  @JUEBS1HL] &GO
300 683U3 enil@3 @AM Do [1.2]Ga]00dOmOM NIaOMIMNa g
@ . af). IOIa0 GRowo Myallafla]®I6M’. @RMM” BP@IOMEII0 AQaIS]
A l0AM®IM”.  BROMELIN0 BRYAIBOM]BNOQ |GSINBDILL 62101Q &0 63BUI
MRalla{lE9IO®  Gald®»dMo  HYlVILl.  ERP@OBDHIME  EI6EIAMNIW]
MAYOENFHNI0.  BRYBLo@MOAN  MIaONIMDals WYl all. (mméasis Yelnilcy
MV2a0leNl” AVAOH06M COAILIQNOW] NINWSAS (@JOWIM o
Qw3 1H:0la ™" Q8OO VATWIEM. af)@3.AWl.af)al.-Do. Q.. af)aD.-Oo
0 1VALI0EMAUBOHALI00 GalBam’ DaOOMIQ Mo RINIMNWIEM’
MVaOHOEM  GRAILIY" MMBHIV®. TVaOBHO6M  GARIL] AN HGBOD)
@foailaj €3001R @EIONI@ BGWIG" TVoelo aBQ0jo AMMIGMI@BEM@®
GHOSOMILINAM.  GRUOMIMmHAN dLoERIAIM MB3B10HHINS QYEAMIS’
QUGBEMIIU BRYEUNIB TVANHOEM CoNTDo CGBHOBo AIMIFMIVBBBHWIEN.
@) HOJOMITE MVoWVATLL  MVaOHOM  @JAMVNIMo DSeERIWIg" 8@

(T@((:))OGTBOCQﬂEDC@(TT) @rGE3a00 a_1061010). 63(03 (T@%)quﬁbo

@04 |020WTO@MIEM” afMles” emomman@. 1904-enem” @Rsioom



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
84
DHWIQ” HMVI0HTVYT MIWN0 AUGBIN@. GRGIAVAMI” DHDEMNBIHINVBS B3
al0O®LIDamM®” 1875-021 HAHHINM HLI0a 1N . ERMITI &aH1HHIAd
DWABOM 16 H>06MNZ30IaM @uoqmgmg”. 20MWls  all@ey, =kaml  oll@;ew
Cald0ISOMIONN3 RIMAIW] @RAIG DVWABAMINB:IMNZAUAM HLIDaIOM]IOMIT
al@la0d00  HIeMeMOAM @ISl VAMBOHAZIOMG  *HIKa0SIeM”
Ma0BHEM  Gaalellealy” »samam@oe 1904-a3 @rsyecm o@wlg’
mlone MMIWIG3 AANDo.  MEBBHMWIEM TVaOHON  (@JIVNIMo
@R0o&la|®. Meajoud 2021 ayem, a8 mQimElerlno @yIalesan.
@6BRWHS $0PaoSIEMIS IR HBOM. @6BROHM aflajelnjo
AWoORININIW  &HIPaoSI@d MENUWd  QAUSAOMHSNIMZAUAN  TVAOHOEM
coalel M’ 2m2lalledomlend qvaay caaleldglejo oIS alamellaf
aJONM 3I§a]oSHB8N0W] YBMMIFAUMMOB0NE1BTBBMM B@ AMLMBAGERIEM.
BRD@OGHIME TVaOBH06M GAILIY” &HHleMo MoRANSBIM 8@ Lm0
ONBI®IM  aldSIEL MI@RL!, TVoMOIMAD  af)GaldOYEldo (JUIeEBE8o
J@IVTWI8o MYEU1RSHSB0 dhatia]Igd80 FOMNEEBRSR0 FO1DEEBSOHRINHE

anaocoﬂ%cgsr@o @y  aumAsBglorIeldo aueﬂosgom) oea(oszmgocnﬂ



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
85
@ROD QO QoD cmoumcm%a’loe@ooﬁ QEIMIZAIaM VA
AVIMIOMIH: TUCH:®o  MVA0RM  CAAILIYINMAN MADHHEI00

@RERIAIMBOMINS  alOWIM  HYIWo. @BRDOGINE BROIM B33

®As0Alel.

neflom) 988SHOOMICLIY” HSAN™ @REG3a00 BRYBLe (@JUWIMAIW0
SHI0  GRILIQAIW]  MITWe]S @JUIEEBBIM 2NV a|®. GR®IOM
Mo Wlal” af)Mlee” @RRIMIT  ayallafleanmzo, @R®1©3
MayBatilaflolosan 500 eflgd  o10@  adIgasm@lem  mailes
®BHOJUNIV]  2MWg).  AVMIG oG] GalBINEROUd  BRMIOM
MoMITW2I88 6@ GRElEJOWo  MIa0MIMeqlg  dulal  GROTVan
ag)o.af)@3.af).-Qo AQoWEBBBo oJNElBHIEM ]2 |@MAVAL)” GR®IG3 M0Q6aBUY
a@om@Igms. @@ 120 slaive 90 eNgd a10@’  ag)aMods
2] BHS1VNgeNE. 20@0E), @ H00%e 500 N8 a0 af)IMaIOQEMIUD
a@ claime 2.78 elgd ald@no@en m@mgg@mcm‘“ ®1olajolsemo.
Q1ell  @EREAIT al0QMMDEHUIABEMIIU M@)o ald@ DENBIG:HAAN’

@BHU 0flalddlds0. 8@ Flairvoe 2.78 efgd al0@ 9mM20061WIGs B3T3



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
86

HoHlE900m” @alleos @Rov®™Ilo eIglasse. 120 Flairva@o 1003
@R8HBHQo  ¢alemo. 500 eNgd 2@ ag)MIem’  AENOIEHIMSS
CYIN VNS chlepntel] al0QONO). @REMIVAWo @RoU® Jo
eISloSM@IMEAUMEIWIM” MEaPwd  8MM@:sl  elrgdola 120
slaimomlmgglad 90 elgd o10@3 BRSASBAM  (HBaIGMIT AUIN@. @R
(Bl 1@3 COIEIJEI IS cp @RMIM @AM oJnElHnIemla)

00)63B80001 MNINLOA]S MYalla {lE90MSB®"
2OQIAM,  afIDHBHIMNBIM SN MIEWIV]BBIM®  af)MN@TOM
MUoMITNW1aJ06M . GR® EIVJOM Mlelaflejns’, coemMeaIsmI all@eLALL.
@13 (@JWIMMIWo aJeNE1HH6MTHHIMVBB® 0udg] GaNQ’
GH0-832a]e0q1al ©aVIee IV’ @R, 2002-@8 ald:af 44 (J&200 GSemM
QUMD H21QIgME.  921@ERIMo  HOAUTVH2IWBAIMo  @So  AIYAITVO
921Q/Igme. @@IMIGI EIRJOW” B@ MIVWANAIOEIN” BREEE" alOaHD®
WOIYEL MOAPMS, @D MSqfleNalgms. TVAHHI@ MEaIUd GSo

QIOINO HA&IMNZAIMD.  GAI. AUBWYIINT” &Ja3 AlBIAIMN §alQ) CAOALDI

OOMILINY” ERMAY®RAIWIM” aldelload @egal” Monud MV 4|



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
87
GRDOHRHIMNE"  GR@IOM  H®MQIW  (GalO®IB  QAIJIRIJOM]HOTBODAD
allmwaydale @REJBNIE8G:em . 120 dlacrvomlagsglad 90 slaiavoe

al0@3 @RSIMIM @R Io LIS1HBHAMM AIQ0Jo AUGBOMIWHMEAM HI0 Yo

allos myallaflasamn.

@RGRa00 (yallafla]l MOQI@W HIO0, aNdo DSAGHUD MDA’
DSDald  JOINIWIHOHSIMIOM. @REL,  MEAIEB8  MSDa ldH
2N INMIWHBI@o aNdo OSAMNBAVLINO AN 00 \o
MYallo{l883HWIaM. @RONI0 0 WYl aqulal’ G2RIMVaNIEM” Myallaflajoy.
MDHIOYOMIG @JWIMAIWo  alABAI  AVNIMo  allS1HnNdIEmMI
@RELIHIG3 BOeMo  allSlendemd of)am mleidlerl. aolsf gmi’ 35
QIBaHoNIHOWIW AN BR6M MVAT® ] @RoWEERUI N1GINWIGI ®SAANGAD.
QLNIBMNOMI@  @BRAIBHN  ald@ DL31a{lasaN  2f)BACWI  algHGAID
OBNIHVAN” G2l0B312J0®3 el ccggﬂel MORIOMIOMMo 2 l0@3 Q1063131
Gal@1@30la]” HEMEN &M a]” @REEBOHM AUMAN SO af)aNILNGa]0Ud
waleNdenad”  2E3UWISBMND®°  VLOIAMD  HaHlHHIOM  af) MBI

MO Qo ald®3 BRBHBINAUBHS BT Iy GRELIHITI BT of)BO DOMNAD



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
88
GeaNIOW O |gOeMo. M @QZ)(TU(O']%]U aldBfJo @RBHBH6Mo. @63BM

QUGN BOIVISSBAI@CA @R Jo LIC1HS3.

BREMINSIalo MDAIHD AHHICOITI2|IBE: MVaOHOEM MoLIERSE1M3
ANDHOE  ERAWEMIEHNNAISITBIN.  MADSHLI00  EROTVWIN)IMDEa 10eL!
MPaOO®I@  AMIOHOB  afLld  Qo@Do  DLIYTVOIMECODY’
QSO OHIMZOUGBAN  'aVRe’  al@laldsleel’  HSAMIGlO8M B
SHOLIPLISMIeMI®.  @RDCA DRI  EZUWERO6M  UNJIalMe@BUWes” S0
WO®AIMo O1INVABEAIAHTE NAITMOAG M@H]. HHIGDIBAJIBH TVAOHOM
Mo2elEBRS1M3  AIMIMRHUWBHH ST  OlTVBEAIHMME. @) KhI0OMIG3
M1alB2/1G1EBIM®° B  ©2IQAEN0M  GRELIHIT HOAIIV" §a1WARIMW,
@mlawad” @ReLIsd  §eaITy” @avlawad oD 8@  alsalloleelw”
QAN H03 QIEEMAOAMNIEM. @™ 1eelnfloswoism” MBHHIBIM’
FBERUABB®. af)QflOSWIM™ TVoLlo alflS1ENIMBS LldHio. BIVALI,

(MNURERUDGOIMINSWIEM @Y 500 @ TBAIMaflAlAs8IN®.

@M 1eel (e*@cw%(zoeaua 280011 £alBCaNIMBAV” @RYWIQIGHeMo.

@M 1sel @@w’l%oe)@m QAUSHO HILIMIATVo AUBAMAN. WINIBo HIElo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
89
deellqoflosan. el  (@BGalOMILI88 GROIRG:®Io  QU@AN.  G@RO)
@RQITVIM]a {lE0a AVIQ égcﬂ m@cuﬂgo al@CanInaday” m@mﬂgo GQleMo.

@NZgo  GAleMo  a)M®IEM” M1BG3WI[l01HBM®. @R HIVJOMIL)o

QUMD AUBODH1HHIMNZBS M1HHA6M” msmmcgﬂ%Qg@”.

2OQIaN” MWAMEBBBM0W] MITWOR]S (@JURBBSIM B@ TYDIOID®
Qon@@m@’lm@mam@om" aB®o)  MLAIMIOW  (JED® s
waledenad’  OAVGSO1D0®o WOHBRGBOALII0 DUIHHHIBBAM
®OO®MI® DG &HQAQ  BalO®IT S8@  GNIAW"  (BalldHdla]
M1BE3UD12{l01H80MND®. DD EoWOD WLOIBANAMIBE HETVE allSIendmel
@ROLIBI08  a@O®ILJo  TVocLlo  allSlevomel, adlal NN
HaH199006M®IW]  Al@da  M0eMo. @Y  HOJOMIB  ALlMIdAG
Mo LI 190 af)06MIB:80 cgoe-.»@"]oe)m%igg GORILIYHSW)o
OMOOEMGa] MSANGAUWd  af)Lld  dTLoCLIEBBo  (BOlaldH  (@JEGRWo
aldMIB®]. BRI  af)@.AWl.af)al, @.AWlLafal. afaM QUG IOV
&S0O®  aldMIBHT  9alo@ONl@d M 8@ OGOV @AM’

@RYBIHOD *LISON]T HDAENNF{IRJMNE0W D).



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
90

GALI. MOMY HYTIMISM: VA, @REE AlOG af)Lld BHI0Y6EBSBo

@RoNTHO1ABHWIGM.  af)MI@ NS GBS  af)88® AN1G3NW1G3
D@00 W] MR SEDMD@IM” allanleiss 00 )0 af) a6
@REBROMWINEMETIME  AVaNGHOM AUNIaIMEEBSI03 .. af)an.-Llo
af)@3. Wl. af)al’.-LIOHNIOHE) HILIIHHIL16BB8IW] @STBINAUGBNSECLID;

DAIRSB2I@AIW] MR ISOMIMBE HIVEMo ag)aNIGM”?

Wl. afl. agad. aPAVAING: VA, AVAOBO6M «;@oe%ocnﬂ NINWR S

01@306HWQo WI.aVLmil.-&HeH8Qo AI@AIGM MINUB af) SO . BRSO
MURIAVEIASMo  AUBMEMIIEYYo VAW  MIVAGREOD]  AUGBOAIND®’
Sl MVEWIGBOMeOM MO Myallaflaflgms.  auenid,’ &Ha1g1w1wd
2 S le]
OO al@a] ©alQ (@UWAEM. GREIMOo MIMW  DOTIOMEBO]af
miuors%ea(o’lad. MOYPS  LldHHJo MDD  OoWEOMY MOMANAIW  MIQo
HHINZAUVEMo. DD DROIOD ML, 6ad. AUBYIN" &Hoye0d
Mo2I@BSNLNOE)  MSa(lenas] AN &HIOYAM6M. 06N  GSeM
@RELIHIT JaN~ GSEM  af)aN  QIJAITVO  AIANIMT  alLl ALOLICIHMIMDo

QIO G IME1B1HBaN (DCHNGSHUIH B33 MmIQo DENBIHHIND



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
91
Ma0IWEHONIG0. @RDEGHIMNE VA MIVWACRBRNM] QAUIGEMIIUI @633

M0 oMWy  @BRYUWEBUW  DUBSAISOMTOHHIME” Aflajelnjo

QilvooeIn)ndW @mmme% HSHN0.

@) *Sdhoa 186] MYEOQ300: ava, P10 V_W1®3

@RMMMNBWIMAN  MNIaONIMHA|S @RoWEEBUY BIBMHSBHAAM” G®IATAD.
QM GSo af)M88 MIRIYIG @RAN HMINZAUAD. @RAN TLVBWHS
a)LDRIMADMIMMo  @R® BF¥1ANEHMOHAIM  MIBE3Wo  AUMIOAF
@RSITLNIMONI@ AN B §21QBHWINVMBIV®.  aflenNgo  ER@IOHM

MoMITW o @RYGRIAIGHNHME B MVAARe AIAMIG1HABD.

Wl. all. agad. aILVAIR: qVE, @P® LAY MIYn GR3LMI]

QABMEMIIU  afLINABESQo  TVa0IWo  BRYAINIANM. @R VAV
M1BBBOSOHWEI0 (UDRLHHNM]2[HB:06MNE” BRMIM” Afla LNV (BalOW1e)83
B33 Uo1e|wooRIo GOAILINSINLOIMOD 12|88 cmoooe;oaﬂoe;gs)s
TMVOUAIDAINGH GalBIM BRA@MVoMITWIa] @BREIEJIWo CMST HQAOQIT
Moo MO MWRWIM Tualaldoel 330113 GRAIMGq {lesenam” TVEY"

Qo%mm&@)o@omﬁ @603 HOS  @RYWIgHEMEM aflalnajo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
92
@RO1W1EBHWIEM . HM AVERI TVEANSBMOIY @I @%Oo@s’l alR1WeMIBNID

MO ATLIE@IMILINEM” af)SHNITD® .

OMIYBB®  CHOB  MBHAOW] MINWeals  (@JRsEREIcRIQ”
QAUWENIU (@JWIMAIQo MAAS JMElEN6MT2] @RYBIOCD B@ M1WN
@JRODIM” 6MIM GRAN” AQaIS] A lOMTMMIOMN. BHOS HOaOEHNISO VNS
AWl MIWEBOHRANIEM” MI20NIMA]S Q. af). LIOMla0" AVIasTni’
MRallafleS8N®. CHOB  00a0CHNIS®IYS  aVlowlud  miemilead
ANWlWes @RAINVIM @IWo maram@iem, 'However, 1 direct the
respondent to initiate steps to table the bill to replace the ordinance to
fulfil the constitutional mandate.! G&HE8 ©6a0cHHIS® AVlo1UB
snleafload v aflwl aIm@lem@Ioeoem” MUl aulallauad miemlead
AMNNOG GaldO®. WIANaHI MNIORIHOS DD HIOJOMIT GMY & alQlel,
status quo @®REM™ Al0®. M1EBBI6S ms 1o mlelnlleigs @no
@SEIOAMIN” dMyalla(lofldlosan@.  @RGIMIG3 MO QoD

CHISMIYHS GIY 9OMRIMMBZ MSTVOIIB6EBUY  MILINIBIEsIN]OHLIAN

0040 oJME1HNITMTHNIM BRYWaO1HBHWIGM .



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
93

2OQI@W  HI0Jo, MBI HODEGLIHMIT" @YK RV
meinNad aimo” 01-04-2021-@3 @ryem”. a)amIms MVa0:Hoem GREWMI
8303awlmadany” 15-01-2020-@3 mlelol@daimno. @O 1MI®3
@R@IMVEUAHAIEM MDD  ODHINZAMOGAD  QIDBOJ  VOOlVSLIAM’
MYallo{leBaH@iem. mallos oJnElandemlay) C%QJ']QI (@JUQ6813UI,
MIgOMIMA]S GAWI. DIMY HPTIMISMo D AflaHVONIT HGQIW aflel
CAOBHAM  MSOMIV@IOM  MI0NIMOalS  HSdhoaladd]  IYEOQ3MD
@IBODIN@BAN. BRDODHIME" MW BRYABOMBBINIeLIB:Llo allelm”
al0NMEIIEHMNED@ENE.  BAN,  MVoGVIVMoNIY] MEa|Igo  MaUOHI©3
630S0MEQIIM  BREBQYOS 0ld3o  VEIVEl, MV  AGUOOD GIVYHAY
a0V A SO aMEBBUY A l(@MVEABMo MSOMIWIMAN. GHOB NI, 1M’
61.99 @30Sl @alwoem” eEo.  @REIVNINOD AVU.ARYA.aj). BRA.
(Capital to Risk Assets Rati0)-6a3 30030 al0o@emMIOud @) £0030101G3
400 3951 @al 93SOMICLIHWAN” ¢al0Bla|@ VVGIWIET.  GRMIHM

MVoNINWla]” @R6EE" AMAVILIIEHNMBGY, MVIWIEIMUVD WIS WaleMBennd”

miwRgI@BMIaN” 8@ HJPallg@d  oadealquenadlerl)”  aleMo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
94
MEH1QJ0@ @@  01eg6M @1 Bso0. molaj  O®  gelwm
oaleloflealnEloel,  af)oalajdcd  MI@IMIBZIM  ealelaflaocalmnslvel
HHIFABMND®. @Y 01E3MBB B CHAVIMEAUME] aleMo M@, MISAY
BIaHWIM@3 A lOGIIMIMI alsMo af)O160D» aleMEOOD 6dHIBSH633HEWWANIEM,
olegend N3O 1. M. @Ry A. ag). BRYA.-BAJ®” MLAO 1863103
DHIGOMIOLIE1M  @RYA.MIl.Oag).  OOLINVMWBAV  MTIHHWLl. @R
HOLITLAIV” S MW 06331600 GIME] QW elcielel| Esntelw)le}
0IMOAZIM” H000” HHHIFEANME®IW]0IBo. @R6EBOHM 400 6H0S1 Gal
6 »HISO 1@ ND. @RDOHRHINE"  MEa0Ud  MUl.@RA.aj). BRYA.-GAF@IM”
@RA.6mnil.Hag). HOLITVMAV D@BAN  (BalOMIGRIY” af) TN ]afIgns. @6EE"
Myaflola)@Gateel 7-@ajoo vo@madmael, 10.18 ww@madmadem” agam
0030 Myalloflagmo. @M Mlelafloal AaRo.
(@RELYEHUCUFVIE al. M 16HA)

@RDCalRl  af)MB.all.ag). 40 doadmo»IceIno MIGEBAN@IW]

MIQOMOMO]g O©AMIB Myafllaflal. afMIG GROEL ®Eaowd 14.40

ROAIMAIEM. NI@OE] QIIQYHHUI o"l-e)osuauéua 921QO0IAM” Tyaflafly).



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
95

@RA@.mil.oag).- QS MYA@HMODY 12|83 NI0E:EH6316RIDaT00
GOIANAMNDCa DAL o"]—e)osncwécra 92100 HYlWlal. GRAE.mMIl.0aj).- QS
HQUOMAIW ochﬂ(scroowmoeago @RAUMOHS  M1BBRUIBBRUY oJoeﬂ%Jo
@0 1AMz MI@ED 92190 HYIY.  GROO®IMNS DO
o"l-e)osmuéua 6).21QO 06206 40 vo®20mo s 14.41 wdm@omo
@RYBHWOD@AN MIa0MIMH IS HAMIQHS Q1IB0 YOBTWEL. BPDAMQINEMAN

300 0&:S1 MYalla {80008 @RYWAS1HBIND.
210INENIWBOS (JREBBOBABON ] TR allafla]®IM” YY), HSdHoal8s]
MIGO@M  20QalSl  al06Dy; @P® MO  @RAIdOmIssaMILl.
all.oqU.aUL-08" o) IDOB0ME" 016 0ds"  ©21Qleslan”  Galddla).
all.ogauavl.-08"  0lealods @m%oeagﬂsmzsg. aulal  3laiavesrg1od
@PMVENHMNAF QITBo. BREOWo 20 6ERgIeRIY” MlERleoYIammealan
30080  GEROIV]HBHWIEN.  DLIgJ0o  MIDBBIM™ EHIBMBIoW, OMG
R pTleL:s 4 [T omdemg”  momlow;  RTGS, NEFT  osaslo

TUDBHOIEBRBONBAN  MU20MIMS @ Q. af)- eiomlan’

U |HSQB30I8 Myalla[lofil@Ba. 6MIMWB @@ AVEAD]HBA; o lGMHH



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
96
@@ MVIANDIEEMI? @RI GIS1 (@Gol @RIV’ MINEIGE BREEID; 1D
29Q0@  MIBIE3  MIGHUall2f0@ @RI  MYBBEAIMNE] M
TMUDBHOYEBOBEI00  BBEOIOM@o.  GREBOM  O2IQPAN  Alaylgy’
CHI-830a]60Qlal”  MNEEHUB  GHOBOMILIMIW]I@BMD. MDD alOQAN
DMBOMG msslow, oMY mBslow, af).Slago., RTGS, NEFT
@SERIVWAIOVEN0  BHOY MINBIM”  AUIADRIGEAN (@JAUBGDMo
@00E12JB 160, BR@INA nf).Ql. DAEWAUNHMY B1HH B0al BHE1EOm
Blalo  §IafloI@d MsSaeQIaN  @INIBMN oSl @BREEBOHW
AROIWIEBH@IGN.  AVdlaldhoel  @0aed M@  WILNIANYAIB:0.
BRDORHIMNE" @Y (JUYEERUT BRAIGUIAHIBBAMIEL.

(@JoLoo s UL DHBOS HMEWaHMB D0q OHSMNIMNB8 M1H96BBUI
@Q0oEla). EPMINA @PAITVIMALISTNIHLION]T MITILBATVHAUI  3IM Y0
&S] MGao0d MAlleS Myalla [lEBHWIEMN. BRDEOG:IME” DD AlaUWOD1G3
agaflafla]l  GRSITLOIMAIEDO®  AUTYDHUWE  @IBOWAD.  VATVIW

(Bl HLISH3EMUIUT £10_OM 19LIM1W1@ 166D, 20]0))

30.2]0HMZAUMIASBaM, MITVINAV” RoNOD o JERIN®] AIM1A1EBaM.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
97
BROOMENINBLIINa 0] BREBEWIS™ AIM®WaJdalo BGROTIVWIBHIMMESE BT
&0y, 7169  woausHRBH0 @RA.MI.Oag).-QOS  HeRITVMIY
21812 [l01H80M af) NI EROMIT al01W HI0JNL]. @Y OOOMIGLIY”
CHO8  MNIOBIOM  @JAUBODMEBU  ONaldals (B lOHICOMOHAN
AGMISAUMIASBAN.  GHOB  6NI0EEO  TVAOBOEM  GAILIQD QDY)
M@B1WIFBSI®” 0MIEHIY” MO@AINHEMAN” MNIa0AIMOa s HOMIAG Malles
Myaflofla). @REB" 8@ @000 A56aI0W], GREBYOS AMILISZ 06mM)Ad
20BHNFIoW”  HaDAWENAHMo  ANY  MBBHIWIGNE.  BRGNOMB0]0)
af)TDOBHIMBION” al0WITBAND®? @RWIME®IQY" M@ 1WIgms.
af)UHSOHQOM BRAIOWEIC? @REUIIMBEDI &SIV MVLINIW]Ge D).
03 2BHHF1oU) HANAEOAHM MEaJOUS aNoWaHM  62lQYATOMNSAN”
1210@189%. @RI B@ (BalGaldtjo @101alSafISIOLIM” aloQIN®’
woloel.  GP@IO  afludB0UIEBUd  MIa0NIMeqls AN TVAOBH06M
O.l(ﬁ?»(‘()d@q alODOHMNE MM 0" HI0)6EBS16RIY” &HSasanlol.

@PRGGa00  al0WIMIBOANI@W  &HI0J0 NN &51Ea|BADHAUCINQSS.

BRDO NS BRAIRHSBNI@AIW] M@HHT MANIO 633U CTﬂ@Q,]oIﬂ%QO_Im)U



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
98

al0QAN®” @INIBDOY AL

@RYA.MI.0ag).-QOS @JEM D MIBCZUJHIVMIM WLNIBMNO @3
GENIDAWo GRIDEUNIW0 cmooojgzﬂg’@@@”. afloam (@Jooalds MVoCLIBBSBOS
210N HIBHS” . ag) V. aV.mil.(CHOs8 GOV G»H0-830q]e0q’lal” NI, )-
@@ TLoQIEMo BPMAIBIA[IgME. MWAMo MSAMIM all.ag)V.aVl.-oW
2JO®LINQISOD]HDFIENR. O HOALAVL. BN af)ld  NINB:HUdH30
MNIDWeHMI6eM.  awl.avl.enil. (cwlnyoeg“ ChHaleogTal’ aNIIM; )-OHW
3910108910151el.  BR®EA L] O.af)aV.aVlemil. ems” aldauseBsle)o,
OV  S@ 0lGaHo M@OL] HYIOO®  Ql@aHOJo, LINEOMILINOMAN
@OV HBHWIEM. aJD]W 630010V @RYO0E12|OAUIM” aOMH]T@WATD; @G
@oclaflglel. aUl.nfl.a@u. 9SMW  MSeEBIN@IM.  ©af).Sl.
MHMWEWaUONABO1a] DI  aloeR. @RYA.NI.Oag). MIBCZUD ()00
HSOOY GeId6Nd @RMAIR1H9HIM HSO O oUW @Gﬁaﬂé(’l’\)u
9216QMNEINIMGo. Moo MTHODMNMD@IME], HaHWAE @Gﬁoﬂé(ﬂf 921QMO.

@RS @1012J01WEMHAAM HIAJo MYalla[lHs3HWIEM,

OMIOHWI@m  AVEAMIaH  QANAOMEES]T @ROIWIHEN%0. GRS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
99
CHUBABEMINPIM” MIE@BUEHH  AMAVILNG:0.  GHMMWIV  BO1H8aM
ale@IdeNT” MVoMNIME™” 221610 MIEEHBHS LIVMOMIM” ale@omi’ eaNg”
NI’ 1M” @RAVAIB0 M@HTWERIU @RYA.NIl.Oag). CHOB CARIHLHBFOD
8@ coal MoBP1YIolesan. =eld  MINE:HW  LlYlq lesmM@INas
)V B.@81A., @ QYA.MI.Oag). @0096)1@1%6113“. CHOBOMIOHAZ  COIALD3
@PAIB E@SIAUIM ANERHQo 2lQ. @G GHIMWYWIU" BE1HBI
ale@Iomim3 @ MNIWEHNIGHIMIW] DEHI0YEBSE1GLIY” GaldW 10166301
af) M@®Iam’ AUY®.  GHOS MIOBIOM D10 921Qo, GHABOOD 105
921Qo MUBABLIB  MOSBAND® MASH  @REINIMAGL!;  GREMI
@RAINIMMIEGEMI? BRD®EBGHINE EDBHIM YOOI DOQI@ DLIOM]DLISEDTBD.
@6NE" B3I OMIEJo MIaOMIMO]S BHOB HOa0CBHNISHIVI@ AUMISSS...
DEa0wd  2103aQeS (JROMIM MIEAUWIVWIBHW...  MIa0MIMOaS
OAMIB  alOAODIBIMEGLI  BHIS®IWOS @M TE  HWOIWIOS
GaldB:eHnam” oJomroﬂaBnm@%? M QNaHQ O 1@IOHHAN

Ma0BHIOISHBOS ~ WIVIBo  CHMYHUW  00a0CHNISMIVIGE  aiam.

HOMOOMIT3  $HOOYEBRUE MSOMIMIW]  MIaONAIMOA]S ONAOCHNIS®]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
100
@ean MIBE3UW1). EPMINA @RSITLOOMAMILINM” MWD Mla GEBV®I.
@RGa0Ud @Y 0130 MleiM@Hnlel. MOV, QaNI@d  ©ms”
BOla IO 103 00 oMVoMINW] Qwllen) SHE10m
MNOANVRWYITOMHAN A lOOMDION. MANDS @RI NI  @RBERHM
aI0IHH 1Y@, ER@ITEUaHO 21 e 96a0CHNISHIWIGE QIAM.
MIpOMIMA]3 GRS GRG GEIAURPHQo  §alQ. BRI
@pslunomom1enem” MloWlud 6aeRIGIQIVNGE  &»H00YEBRUE MSANOY.
9al0o@01W] MAfOS 2182|WT PVWBONIW (JUIEEBSEIDINM”. ERDHOBINE"
o)1 Myalla [lE9M88®), WAIMOHAZ Q@@@WQAW%@QQO aloellom mel
MeIYI@  HHMNZOIAD, @R®INAG ©B3adBMo, MVoRO6Mo, AllmMeMo,
aflalemMo MO®EI0 BoUIWIWT MSEMING CGAlMNEIWIEM . BRDIM” AHQITB
R@BERUOAIEL. BRDOBDIME  @R®IOM  FBEZROMIGE  BHIMB.
'GHUIONCBBIOZHISIB  2JAISIRJ0 G20 DOAN  HHIDHIAND  HODHo'
2f) MM I0ANNDCaIOL! BT FMCUCAMISES] allel MYalMBHUd alOaum@”

M1eINI@SHDLIM R0 0 &S aloem® MD MG  aldAVNISHMOAAN

@B AMO1H630M0.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
101

ol. aWleed: @l earvalyd aflglela{Iss], erases 1 (ag) maud

GR_RULMI (@JaV’ @mcgimocgmgo?

@l. caval@ »fglela I881: AVE, HMIM (JAV” OaIQADIEL.

2. W1HHAB: RV TVRWAS BPRMAMICWINS aflndalel] 2 [lalssam.

Wl Q. af). elomlan, @EBQes 2 (mil) mmnid 63V Jay

@gj@)ﬁmacsmo?

@1. Q. af). LIODTa07 TVE, NI (@JTV’ O21QANIE.

2l. 196 A@: R3] MVE MRIBA 12 ld1H8BaM.

aquaid” 016a0dg" ©a1Q @3»0988 202]1-0e1 EHO8 TVaOGHOEM
mvocel (een2do GRRVLMI) MM AlXlWEM MW HBNFHNMHAIM (@ JEGAWSDID)
@RMBLIHA6B0MAIA ......
(@J®&eNesamaIqd ......
@JG®@o VR BRoWTHA1aflA1BBaM. MIGE A lBINWEMNMW D HHFHBN.

©6N300 Qldsal

Minister for Co-operation and Registration (Shri V. N.

Vasavan): Sir, I move the following amendment:



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
102
147. In section 2(ac) and 2(pa) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 2(1) and 2(ii1) respectively shall be
recast as follows:

(1) "(ac) Anand Pattern Milk Co-operative Society" means a
Primary Dairy Co-operative Society, otherwise known as
'Ksheerolpadaka Sahakarana Sangham', registered on or after
the It day of January 1980, and functioning as per the model
bye-laws of Anand Pattern, with the principal objective of
procurement and marketing of milk and milk products and
pouring marketable surplus of milk to the Regional Co-
operative Milk Producers' Union and for providing inputs to
the dairy farmers, within the area of operation of the society;"

(1) "(pa) "Recruitment Committees" means the committees
constituted under section 80BB of this Act;"

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendments:

157. In section 2(ac) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
Clause 2(1) after the words "objective of' the words
"promoting production” shall be inserted.

182. In Section 2(ac)proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
Clause 2(1) after the word "farmers" the words "and to build up

viable dairy industry in the state" shall be inserted.

Smt. K. K. Rema: Sir, I move the following amendments:

164. In section 2(ac) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
Clause 2(1) after the word "chilling" the symbol and words
"and processing of milk, production of milk products and"



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
103

shall be inserted.

172. In section 2(ac), proposed to be inserted in the principal Act,
by Clause 2(i), after the word "operation" the symbol and
words "as specified in the bye-laws" shall be inserted.

226. The proviso to section 2 (ia) proposed to be substituted in the
principal Act by Clause 2(i1) shall be deleted.

248. In section 2(pb) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by Clause 2(ii1) after the word "processing" the symbol and

words "of milk, production of milk products" shall be inserted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed: Sir, I move the following amendments:

166. In section 2(ac) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
Clause 2(1) for the words "milk and milk products" the words
"milk and related products" shall be substituted.

183. In Section 2(ac)proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
Clause 2(1) the symbol ";"occuring after the word "Farmers"
shall be deleted.

201.  In section 2(ia) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by Clause 2 (i1) for the word "object" the word "aim" shall be
substituted.

221.  In Section 2(ia) proposed to be substituted in the principal
Act by Clause 2(i1), for the word "existed" the word

"survive'" shall be substituted.

222. In Section 2(ia) proposed to be substituted in the principal



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
104
Act by Clause 2(i1) before "74H" the symbol "," shall be

inserted.

223. In Section 2(ia) proposed to be substituted in the principal
Act by Clause 2(i1), for the word "ceased" the word "halt" shall
be substituted.

231. In the proviso to section 2 (ia) proposed to be substituted in
the principal Act by Clause 2(i1) the symbol ";" shall be
deleted.

237. In section 2(pa) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
Clause 2(i11) after the word "means" the symbol", " shall be
inserted.

238. In section 2(pa) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
Clause 2(ii1) before the word "80BB" the symbol ", " shall be

inserted.

258. In section 2(pb) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by Clause 2 (i11) the word "revenue" shall be deleted.

Smt. Daleema: Sir, I move the following amendment:

167. In section 2(ac), proposed to be inserted in the principal Act,
by Clause 2(i), before the words "milk products" the words
"procurement or production and marketing of" shall be
inserted.

Shri P. Ubaidulla: Sir, I move the following amendments:




194.

198.

2009.

219.

220.

227.

244,

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
105
In Section 2 (ia) proposed to be substituted in the principal
Act by Clause 2(i1) for the words "Primary Agricultural Credit
Societies Urban Co-op Banks" the words "any type of Primary
Societies and Federal and Central Societies" shall be
substituted.

In section 2(ia) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by Clause 2 (i1) after the words "Urban-Co-operative Banks"
the words "other commercial and marketing societies" shall be
inserted.

In section 2(ia) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by Clause 2(i1), for the word "raise" the word "collect" shall be
substituted.

In Section 2(ia) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by Clause 2(ii1) for the words "or associate members" the word
"and associate members" shall be substituted.

In Section 2(ia) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by Clause 2(i1), after the words "associate members" the words
"and institutions''shall be instered.

In the proviso to section 2 (ia) proposed to be substituted in
the principal Act by Clause 2(i1) the words "it shall continue as
such for a period of two years from the date of commencement
of the Kerala Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Act 2021."
shall be deleted.

In section 2(pa) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
Clause 2(ii1) after the word "Regional" the word "and rural"
shall be inserted.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
106

Shri U. A. Latheef: Sir, I move the following amendment:

199. In section 2(ia) proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by Clause 2 (i1) after the words "Urban-Co-operative Banks"
the words "except Malappuram District Co -operative Bank"
shall be inserted.

Shri K. U. Jenish Kumar: Sir, I move the following amendment:

257. In section 2(pb) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by Clause 2 (ii1) the words "comprising two or more revenue
districts" shall be deleted.

Shri A. N. Shamseer: Sir, I move the following amendment:

259. In section 2(pb) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by Clause 2 (iii), shall be recast as follows:

"(pb) "Regional Co-operative Milk Producers' Union" is a
central society having Anand Pattern Primary Dairy Co-
operative Societies as their members with the principal
objective of procurement, processing and marketing of milk or
production and marketing of milk products within its area of
operation”

DR. Mathew Kuzhalnadan: Sir, I move the following

amendment:

260. In section 2(pb) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by Clause 2 (i11), shall be recast as follows:



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
107

"Regional Cooperative Milk producers union is a central
society having Primary Dairy cooperative societies otherwise
known as ksherolpadaka sahakarana sangham as their
members with the principal objective of undertaking
procurement, processing and marketing of Milk and Milk
products and to provide technical financial and production
input assistance to their member societies and dairy farmers
with in their area of operation"

0.aend: 225-20 mud@ ee3uw™®] 226-20 M3 GR3LMIES”
DLINNIQ@]IMIB3 @RAI® T {Iesm®1l. NIaOMIMa ]S D@1
CRBULMIH U3 MV NBHO1AE3MMEMN=D?

M0 BHEEM-O2FICIYUM  Qldhq AV (W1 afl. agMB. QIAVOIM):

M@, 8MVEBJ WIS GREVMI @ROWIBHA1BNMHNIM” @REYAMC]BBMD. A
C_BVMIHU3 MLfld@1asaNIel.

0.aV1e0a@:  MIa0MIMeals 2@ @RAUMGIafla] 147-00  maud
BV630Wd GR3VWMT TVE @R 1A 1a[lB1Hs3M0.

W neoMmBld:91 @rell Gramlafls) 157, 182 agaml maud
GRBRVLMI1HU3 ME MTRIBHM2[l1B1H63aTM.

W@ Od. Od. 0n GRAIMGlafla) 164, 172, 226, 248 agam’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
108
MMIB CGRAVMIH:U MVE M1DIBGB12{101H630M0.

W afl «;rae;m@czsa 20n13” @aImdlafl 166, 183, 201, 221, 222,
223, 231, 237, 238, 258 agam1l ommid GR3LMIHU  auve
MNEIHA] 2[101H630M.

Wl oseflla GRAIMAlafla) 167-00 mMUd 6E3L®IT aqLVEWeS
@RMAMICWINS alladaleilaflelesan.

W all. 9eemIges @amdlafls) 194, 198, 209, 219, 220, 227,
244 agam1 mmIB eV IHU3 MVE MEIB:0]a{lv]esmo.

@) @. af). eIOmlad’ GRA®GIafla] 199-00 maud Ge3L®] ave
MNEIHA] 2[101H630M.

W o Q. 2MlaH 008 ERAUGGIa{la] 257-00 MIUR GREL®]
MVERWHS @GRV ICWINS alladalell aflelasam.

W af). af)@B. aHo1d @RA®Elafls 259-00 mMIB @RELMI
MVERWHS @RIV ICWINS alladalell aflelasam.

GAI. MY HEMIMISM @BRAIMG o 1) 260-00 mmud ee3L®I aqVE

MNEIHA1 2[101H630M.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
109

clelhlo] 921Q(JHI00BS Q6N320 Q]  mileflead
BOAIBHEMHAN (@JUIODD)

@RA0BLINHABMMAIA. .............
(@J®1gBelasamalad.............

CRBUILM] §2lQY@EJHIOABS N0 Aldsqa| MILOa3 BOVMIGHMHOAM
@JUgo VR @RV 1d@]2[lGBlBsaT.

CRRLMI 6.21Q((JHI0ABB VN0 Aldhal Miefload BoVMIW1TIBs3MD.

0MJo Qldsa |

Shri P. Abdul Hameed : Sir, I move the following amendment.

263. In section 8A(4) proposed to be added in the principal Act
by Clause 3, for the word “ contained” the word
“ included”  shall be substituted.

Shri P. Ubaidulla :Sir, I move the following amendments.

264. In section 8A(4) proposed to be added in the principal Act
by Clause 3, for the words “ in this Act” the words
“ in the provisions of this Act” shall be substituted.

263. In section 8A(4) proposed to be added in the principal Act
by Clause 3, for the word “ rules” the word

“ Rules” shall be substituted.

267. In section 8A(4) proposed to be added in the principal Act



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
110
by Clause 3, after the word “ Regional” the word
“ Rural” shall be inserted.

271. In Section 8A(4) proposed to be added in the principal
Act by Clause 3, for the words “ the area of operation”

the word “ jurisdiction shall be substituted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :Sir, I move the following amendment.

268. In section 8A(4) proposed to be added in the principal Act
by Clause 3, (i) for the word “ milk” the words
“ promoting production,” shall be substituted.
(i1) after the word “ sales” the words “ of milk” shall
be inserted.

Shri O. R. Kelu :Sir, I move the following amendment.

269. In section 8A(4) proposed to be added in the principal
Act by Clause 3, for the words “ milk procurement and
sales”  the words and symbols “ procurement,
processing and marketing of milk or production and
marketing of milk products” shall be substituted.

Smt K. K. Rema :Sir, I move the following amendment.

270. In Section 8A(4) proposed to be added in the principal
Act by Clause 3, after the word “ procurement”  the
symbol & words “ ,production of by products” shall be
inserted.

Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
111
272. In Section 8A(4) proposed to be added in the principal
Act by Clause 3, for the words “ area of operation” the
word “ jurisdiction” shall be substituted.

o). ae9d:273, 274 agyan1 moud 6e3L®ISHUd 272-30 maud

CRBUMIBS @LIYNIVD®IMIT BRAIMT]a {lessmz@Iel.

MIa0MIME g QD] GBEBVMIG:U3 MU B@1EBaTOEMN3I?

Ma0S6M-02Z1EMRAHMD  Qldsq 2OV (W) afl. ag)ad. aaVAIN):

@, 6eRVMIHNHU3 MV flealesanlel.

ol. a1698: @@ all. @RMIGE 003" EROIDGI 1, 263-00 MM

GRRVLMI] VB MTAIBA12{101H630.

W) all. 900388 @RAMGlafly] 264, 265, 267, 271 agam?

MMIB BGRAVMIH:Ud MVE M1DIBB12{101H6300.

©D). 2MBI0:¢1 @REIN ERAIMEa{la] 268-00 MMIA GRBL™I aLE

MNEIHA] 2{101H630M0.

W1 8. GG EHY GRAI®Olaflal 269-00 MG GEEL® Ve

M1 01 2[101660M0.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
112
WD O, Od. 00 @RAMAlafla) 270-00 MmaUB G_3L® aLE

MNRIHO] 2[101H63aM.

W af). . af)o. BRaHOAL EPAUGGafla] 272-00 MaUAB GBELM]
MR M1RIBO12[1@1H53M0.
BaMIo Qldsq| MINEflOad BIVAILHIMHAIM (@JUIODD)

@RMZELNHA63aMAIA. (... .......
@JO®1&Belasamala..........
PaMlo Qe  ileflload  BIWMIBSHIMOHAON  @JWRo VB

@010 12 [101H63aM0.

BaM0o Qldsa| milefloa owndwlalesan.

MILIo Qldza |

Minister for Co-operation and Registration (Shri V. N.

Vasavan): Sir, I move the following official amendment.

278. In the fifth proviso to Section 16(1) proposed to be
inserted in the principal Act by Clause 4, shall be recast
as follows:

“ Provided also that in the case of Anand Pattern Milk
Co- operative Societies, no dairy farmers other than



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
113

those who own one or more milch cows or buffaloes
and residing within the area of operation of the society
or running dairy farms in their own land or in
leased land within the area of operation of the society
and pouring milk not less than ninety days within a
period of one hundred  and twenty days in a year to the
society, shall be admitted as members”

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :Sir, I move the following amendments.

279. In the fifth proviso to Section 16(1) proposed to be
inserted in the principal Act by Clause 4, the

symbol “ ,” after the words “ Anand Pattern
Milk Co-operative Societies” shall be deleted.

280. In the fifth proviso to Section 16(1) proposed to be
inserted in the principal Act by Clause 4, the word “
milch ” shall be deleted.

Shr1 K. P. Kunhammed Kutti Master : Sir, I move the

following amendment.
283. In the fifth proviso to Section 16(1) proposed to be
inserted in the principal Act by Clause 4, for the word

“ poured” the word “ sells” shall be substituted.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :Sir, I move the following amendment.

285. In the fifth proviso to Section 16(1) proposed to be
inserted in the principal Act by Clause 4, for the words
“ five hundred ” the words “ four hundred” shall be



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
114
substituted.

Shri P. Mammikutty :Sir, I move the following amendment.

289. In the fifth proviso to section 16(1) proposed to be
inserted in the principal Act by Clause 4 for the words
“ for a period of” the words “ in not less than” shall
be substituted.
Shri P. Ubaidulla :Sir, I move the following amendment.

290.In the fifth proviso to section 16(1) proposed to be
inserted in the principal Act by Clause 4 for the words “ one
hundred and eighty days” the words “ six months” shall be
substituted.

Shri Sebastian Kulathunkal :Sir, I move the following

amendment.

296. In the Fifth proviso to section 16(1) proposed to be
inserted in the principal Act by Clause 4, for the words
“ One hundred and eighty” the words “ Two
hundred” shall be substituted.
Smt. K. K. Rema :Sir, I move the following amendment.

299. In the Fifth proviso to section 16(1) proposed to be

inserted in the principal Act by Clause 4, after the word
members” the words “ on their written request”
shall be inserted.

(13

ol. aVleed: 286, 287, 288 apam1l mmid ce3u™1dhud 285-00

GRRVMIY @LINNIVDIMITI BRAIMTa {leanmM@Iel.

MI20MIMOalg 2D GBI 1:US TVfBE1H80MEM30?



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
115

Ma0S6M-021EMRAHMD  Qldsq 2OV (W) ail. agad. aaVaIN):

ad, MM @PAIMAlafla)  278-20 MmMaUB &ME31Wd:  ERRUOMI

@RoUTHhO1HNMOAAN’ @RE Y AMO]H63aM0. il G_BLD1H U3

cmﬂoea@’]oesacm’l%.

o). aW1e0d: MIa0MIMeals D@D GRAIMOIa{la]  278-00 mMaUA

BV63L0UW1H BBV TVE BP0 1dhM1a[101H63aM0.

W il @Taméasa 013" @RAIMElafly] 279, 280 ~ganl maud

GRBLM 1 VB M1RIMO1a{la1Hs30M0.

@ o all. GaommE” &5l 20aRd ERAIMEa{la) 283-00 mMIA

GRAULMI MVRWAS BRMAMICGWINS alladalell aflolasan.

@), 9. all. ag). 22213" EPAMA)a{la] 285-00 MMUAB LI VB

M1 01 2[101660M0.

W all. 2o0lesg] ERAGGa{ly) 289-00 MMIB GERBVL®] TVEWHS

@RMAMICWINS alladaleilaflelesan.

W all. 990mI388 GPAMGIa(la] 290-00 MmaUB c_BVL®I1 aLE



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
116

MOIHO] 2f101H630M.

U3 HAVMNIOAVLM HBOWELG GRAUMANafla] 296-00 MMIB GREVM]

MR MRIBO]2[161H8600.

WD OB . 02 BPAMGIA(la] 299-00 maUB c_3L®T aVE

MRIHO] 2[l01H633aM.

CRRLMI 92l  (@HVAYB3  MILIdo

E3UNAIBHIMBAAT (U DI0)
m

@RMGZBLNABaMAIA. ...........
@®gelasanald..........
GR_BUNMI 9alQ (@JHO008S MoLIdo

BOAIBHEMOAND (@JUQo MV BRoW 101 2fl@18s3MN.

GRBL®] a1  (@HO0RSY  MILIO

INMIWID1H30M0.

@60 Qldsal

Qe  enilefload

Qs  enflefload

Qlda|  milelead

Minister for Co-operation and Registration (Shri V. N.

Vasavan): Sir, I move the following official amendment.



303.

Shri P.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
117
Section 16 B(I)(b) and section 16 B(2) proposed to be
inserted in the principal Act by Clause 5 is recast as

follows:

(1) “ (b) 1s not owning at least one milch cow or buffalo,
by rearing them in a cattle shed or in a farm set up either
in  his/her own land or in a leased land, within the area
of coperation of the society.

(i1) (2) Only an active member referred to in sub-section
(1) shall be eligible to become a member of the
committee of an Anand Pattern Milk Co-operative
Society and to continue as a member of such
committee.”

Ubaidulla :Sir, I move the following amendments.

305.

319.

321

Shri D.

In section 16 B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 5 the word “ active” shall be deleted.

In section 16B(1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 5 for the words “ one hundred
and eighty days” the words “ six months” shall be
substituted.

In section 16B(1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 5 for the words “ twelve

months” the words “ the year” shall be
substituted.
K. Murali :Sir, I move the following amendment.

307.

In section 16 B(1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 5 for the word “ pouring” the



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
118

word “ selling” shall be substituted.

Smt. K. K. Rema :Sir, I move the following amendments.

308. In section 16 B(1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 5 for the word “ five” the word
“ three” shall be substituted.

323. In section 16B(1)(b) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 5, the words “ in a cattle shed”
shall be deleted.

Shri Murali Perunelly :Sir, I move the following amendment.

314. In section 16B(1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 5 for the word “ for” the words
“ 1s not less than” shall be substituted.

Shri K. P. A. Majeed :Sir, I move the following amendment.

315. In section 16B(1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 5 for the words “ one hundred
and eighty” the words “ one hundred and twenty”
shall be substituted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer :Sir, I move the following amendment.

316. In section 16B(1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 5 for the words “ one hundred
and eighty” the words “ one hundred and twenty”
shall be substituted.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
119

Shri Sebastian Kulathunkal:Sir, I move the following

amendment.

320. In section 16B(1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 5 for the words “ one hundred
and eighty” the words “ two hundred” shall be
substituted.

Shri Saneeshkumar Joseph: Sir, I move the following

amendment.

322. Section 16B(1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 5 shall be recast as follows;
“ (a) 1s not pouring milk not less than 200 litres to the
society for ninety days during the preceding twelve
months”

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :Sir, I move the following amendments.

327. In section 16B(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 5, following proviso shall be inserted;
“ provided the death or loss of milch cow or buffalo
during the year is the reason for not satisfying the
conditions specified in the clause, it shall not be
considered for ceasing his/her eligibility as an active
member”

336. In Section 16B(2) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 5 for the words “ managing committee”
the word “ Managing Committee” shall be substituted



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
120

wherever it occurs.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :Sir, I move the following amendment.

335. In Section 16B(2) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 5 insert the symbol “ ,” before the word
“ managing committee” wherever it occurs.

Shri A. Prabhakaran :Sir, I move the following amendment.

337. In Section 16B(2) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 5 for the word “ and” the word “ or”
shall be substituted.

2. ae9d: 317-00 mmIB ee3w® 316-00 MMIB @RV 1830

@PI§N00®IMIG3 ERAIMTIa [lecanmz@Iel.

NI20MIMS g QD] GREOM U3 TVIBA1BBMEME0?

MVa0S6M-02Z1EMRAHMD  Qldsq QD] (W) afl. ag)ad. aaVAIN):

a3, ™M ERAI®Alafla)  303-2%0 ®mMId 8MeE31WE:  GRBRVMI

@RoNTHhHNMOAAN’ @PE Y AMO]H63aM0. il G_BULD 15 U3

cmﬂceamce@(m’l%.

o). aVleed: nIaom0mMeals a@1Qes 303-00 MMUB B8YE3LW1H:

GRBLMT VB BRoU1Mh014[1d1H63aTM.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
121
Wl all. 9eemies @ra®alafls) 305, 319, 321 agam1 maud

GRBLM 1% U3 MR MAIBA]2[1A1HEBaMD.

@ Wl od. s GRAIMGafly] 307-00 MMIB GBERLM] TVBWOS

@RMAMICWINS alladalellaflalaszamn.

WD O, oD, an GRAUMGIafla] 308, 323 agan1 maud

GRBRVMI1HU3 MVE MTRIBHM2[l1B1H63aT.

@ 008l ecimemell  erA®dlafla 314-20 MU GEEL®I

MVERWHS @RIV ICWINS alladalell aflelasam.

W Od. all. af). 22213" @GRAMOafls] 315-00 MmMUG ceRY®] aqVE

MNEIHA] 2[101H630M.

GAWI. af)o. Od. MIB @RAIME@lafla] 316-00 MmaUB GERL®] aLE

MOIHO] 2f101H630M.

U1, HAVMIAVYM HHBOWB:G3 BRAUDB)a{la) 320-00 MMIB GREZV®]

MR MRIBO]2[1G1H6600.

@) VMl @203 G2RIMVal” ERAMOlaflsl 322-00 MmMUAB ¢_REVL®I



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
122

MR M1OIBO]2[161H88300.

W MBIl @rell GrAImElafla) 327, 336 agam1 maud

GRBLM1H U3 MR MAIBA]2[1@1HBM0.

W ol @’omu@(aa a0018" @RAIM@1a{la] 335-00 MaUAB 6BV aqVE

MRIHO] 2[l01H633aM.

W af). @JBIBHOM @RAMOafla] 337-00 MMIA GRBVL®1 TLRWOS

@RMAMICWINS alladalellaflalasamn.

CRBLM]  ©alQ  (@HVABB  @REMId0  Aldsaf  nileflead

EIUAIHB6IM AT @UCP)O(Z)TZD

@M BLINH30MAIA. ...
@@ 1&Belasamala..........
lclelflo] 02l  (@JHOAB8  G@REMId0 Qe  nilefload

BIUNMIBNEMOAMM (@JUgo MVB BRoW @1 2f1@18830M.

CRRLMI  0alQ (@JHOVABB  @PEAId0  Aldkal  nilefload

CINMIWIR1HBM.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
123

@RY0Jo Qldha |

Minister for Co-operation and Registration (Shri V. N.

Vasavan): Sir, I move the following official amendment.

338. In Clause 6,
(1) In section 28(6) the words and symbols
“ Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or
rules made thereunder or bye-laws of a Regional Co-
operative Milk Producers' Union,” the words and
symbols “ Notwithstanding anything contained in this
Act or the rules made thereunder or the bye-laws of a
Regional Co-operative Milk Producers' Union or in any
other law, Judgement or Decree or Orders of any court or
Tribunal for the time being in force,” shall be
substituted.
(i1) Section 28(7) and 28(7)(a) shall be recast as follows:
“ (7) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or
the rules made thereunder or the bye-laws of a Regional
Co-operative Milk Producers' Union or in any other law,
judgement or Decree or Orders of any court or Tribunal,
for the time being in force, the President of an Anand
Pattern Milk Co-operative Society, which is a member of
the Regional Co-operative Milk Producers' Union shall
be eligible to contest the elections to the committee of
the Regional Co-operative Milk Producers' Union and
hold office as a member of the committee of the
Regional Co-operative Milk Producers' Union, only if the
Anand Pattern Milk co-operative Society to which he/she
belongs, satisfies the following conditions, namely:-

(a) the society i1s placed in audit classification A or B, as



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
124
prescribed, during the last audit conducted; and” .

(111) In section 28(8) the words and symbol “ Notwithstanding
anything contained in this Act or rules made
thereunder,” the words and symbols “ Notwithstanding
anything contained in this Act or the rules made
thereunder or the bye-laws of a Regional Co-operative
Milk Producers' Union or in any other law, Judgement or
Decree or Orders of any court or Tribunal, for the time
being in force,” shall be substituted.

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu:Sir, T move the following

amendment.

362. In section 28(6) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 6, for the words “ three terms or fifteen
years” the words “ four terms or twenty years” shall
be substituted.

Shri K. D. Prasenan :Sir, I move the following amendment.

368. In the first proviso to section 28(6), proposed to be
inserted in the principal Act by Clause 6, for the words
and symbols “ (Amendment)” the words and symbols
“ (Second Amendment)” shall be substituted.

Shri A. K. M. Ashraf :Sir, I move the following amendment.

369. The second proviso to section 28(6), proposed to be



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
125

inserted in the principal Act by Clause 6 shall be deleted.

Smt. U. Prathibha :Sir, I move the following amendments.

376. Section 28(7), proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 6, the word “ only” shall be deleted.

384. In section 28(7) (b), proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 6 the words “ committee of
the” , shall be deleted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :Sir, I move the following amendments.

379. In section 28(7) (a) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 6 for the word “ audit” , the
words “ Annual Performance Audit” shall be
substituted.

382. In section 28(7) (b) proposed to be inserted by the
principal Act by Clause 6 for the word “ Producers” ,
the word and symbol “ Producers’ ” shall be
substituted.

393. In section 28(8) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 6, the words “ managing committee” the
words “ Managing Committee” shall be substituted.

Shri M. Rajagopalan :Sir, I move the following amendment.

380. In section 28(7) (a) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 6, for the word “ and” , the word
“ or” shall be substituted.

Shri I. B. Satheesh :Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
126

389. In the proviso to section 28(7)(b) proposed to be inserted
in the principal Act by Clause 6, the words “ to Anand
Patternmodel bye-laws” shall be deleted.

Shri Sebastian Kulathunkal :Sir, I move the following amendment.

390. In the proviso to section 28(7)(b) proposed to be inserted
in the principal Act by Clause 6, after the words
“ Anand Pattern” the words “ Milk Co-operative
Societies” shall be inserted wherever it occurs.
Shri P. P. Sumod :Sir, I move the following amendment.

397. In section 28(8) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act, by Clause 6, for the word “ Societies” the word
“ Society” shall be substituted.

2. V1e9@: 363, 364 ag)am1 mmid eV Bud 362-20 MMIA

ce®laso 370, 371 agam1 mmud cew@eud 369-00 mmid
CRRVMIBc0 DLIYNIV@IMIB ERAIMOq [lesomsmIel.

MU20MIMS g DO GREODM U3 TVIB:A1BBMEME0?

MVa0S6M-021EMRAHMD  Qldsq 2OV (W) afl. ag)ad. QAVAIN):

a3, 6mIM  @PAUMGIafla]  338-00 mMUB 8DE31VE:  GRROMI

@0 THhO1HNMOAAN @RE Y AMO]HE3aM0. il G_BLD1H U3

cmﬂoea@’]oesacm’l%.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
127

o). 1e93: MIa0MIMeals d@IWes 338-%0 MAUB BDEBYIW1H:

GRBLM 1 VB BRoU 101 afldHs3aTM.

@ af)M. af). OMENHBID @RAIMGIa[la] 362-00 MMIA GRBOM]

MR M1RIBO12[1@1H53M0.

Wl od. Wl @erumad GRAIMOlafla] 368-00 mmUd @EELM]

MERWYANS RO ICGWINS M10IH012[101H86M0.

W ag). Od. af)o. ERAHOAD" ERAUGGa{la) 369-00 MMUAB GRELD]

MR M1RIBO12[1@1H53M0.

Wol @ @ole eea®dlafly) 376, 384 agpan1 maud

GRRVLMI1KHU3 MBWANS BRIV IGWIANS alldBalell aflolasao.

W neMEBIoB:¢] @re @RAIMOlafla) 379, 382, 393 agam1 maud

GRBLM 1R U3 MR MAIBA]2[1B1HEB3aM.

W af)o. MIREWIILID GRAUMGIa{la] 380-00 MmmUd GeEV®I

MERWAS BRIV ICWINS alladalel]l o[le1asa.

W &ag). mil. Ve GRAIMGa{la] 389-00 MIUB GERL®] ALE



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
128

MOIHO] 2f101H630M.

U1, HAVMIAVYMW HHBOWEHG GRAUGBa{la) 390-00 MMIB cREV®]

MR MRIBO]2[161H8600.

@ afl. afl. ME23" BRAGGIa{la] 397-00 MIUB BBV TVBWOS

@RMAMICWINS alladaleila[lelesan.

CRRLM] 92l  (@H0AB8  @RYOJdo Qe  mileflead
BOUMIBNEMHNAN (@ JUIO DI
@RMGZBLNABaMAIA. ...........
@®gelasanald..........
GRRULMI QEINY) (@J3H000)88 @QY0Jo Adsqf  nilefload

BOAIBHEMOAND (@JUQo MV BRoW 101 2fl@18s3MN.

CRBLM] 92l  (@HOOAB8  @RYOJo  Aldkal  milefload

INMIWID1H30M0.

3920 Qldsal

Minister for Co-operation and Registration (Shri V. N.

Vasavan): Sir, I move the following official amendment.



398.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
129

In Clause7

(1) In Section 28AB(3) for the words and symbol
“ Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or rules
made thereunder or the
bye-laws of a Regional Co-operative Milk Producers’
Union,” the words and symbols

“ Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or the rules
made thereunder or the bye-laws of a Regional Co-operative
milk Producers’ Union or in any other law, Judgement or
Decree or Orders of any court or Tribunal, for the time being
in force,”

(i1) the words “ and its apex society” shall be omitted.

(i11) Section 28AB(4) Shall be recast follows:

“ (4) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or the
rules made thereunder or the bye-laws of an Anand Pattern
Milk Co-operative Society or in any other law, Judgement or
Decree or Orders of any court or Tribunal, for the time being
in force, either the President or the Vice President of Anand
Pattern Milk Co-operative Societies shall be women
members”

Shri Saneeshkumar Joseph:Sir, I move the following

amendment.

399. Section 28AB(3) proposed to be added in the principal
Act by Clause 7 shall be deleted.

Shri K. V. Sumesh :Sir, I move the following amendments.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
130
404. In section 28AB(3) proposed to be added in the principal

Act by Clause 7 for the words “ President of an Anand

pattern Milk
Co-operative Society” the word “ one” shall be
substituted.

406. In section 28AB(3) proposed to be added in the principal
Act by Clause 7 for the word “ and” the word “ or”
shall be substituted.

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu :Sir, T move the following

amendment.
411. In section 28AB(3) proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by Clause 7 the words “ whether in full or
in part” shall be deleted.

ol. a1e9@:400, 401, 402, 403 agyam1 mnid ce3L®1H>u3

399-00 mmMIB ee3VG80 412, 413 agam1 mmid e 13 411-00
MMIB CGRAVDIAs0 DLIYNIVDIMIM BRAIMCq {lesoms®Iel.

MU20MIMS g DO GREODM U3 TVIB:A1BBMEME0?

MVa0S6M-021EMRAHMD  Qldsq 2OV (W) afl. ag)ad. QAVAIN):
T3, 6MIM  ERAUGE {1 398-%0 mmd 8Me3PWS  CBROMI

@0 THhO1HNMOAAN @RE Y AMO]HE3aM0. il G_BLD1H U3

cmﬂoea@’]oesacm’l%.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
131

o). aW1e9d: MIa0MIMeals d@IQes 398-00 MG 8DE31W1H:

GRBLM 1 VB BRoU 101 afldHs3aTM.

@ VMot &20Q GRIMVal” BRAIMAafla) 399-00 mMIAB GBI

MR M1RIBO12[1@1H53M0.

W . afl. MYEAH" @AU®Olafla] 404, 406 agaml maud

GRRVMI1KHU3 MBWYAS BRIV IGWIANS allddalell aflolasao.

@ o@. of). OMENSBMN GRAUMAIafla] 411-00 MU cEEL®I

MR MRIBO]2[161H86800.

RG]  §alQ (@GBS R0

EINAIHNEIMAAN (aJUR6)DD)

@M BLINH30MAIA. ...
@@ 1&Belasamala..........
GR_RRULMI 9 alQ) (@JBHI00)8S a3 $do

BIUNMIBNEMOAMM (@JUgo MVB BRoW @1 2f1@18830M.

CRBLM] 92l  (@HIOAYBB oGP0

CINMIWIR1HBM.

Q|  milellead

Qe  milellead

Qe  enilefload



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
132

af)S90 Qldra |

Minister for Co-operation and Registration (Shri V. N.

Vasavan): Sir, I move the following official amendment.

417. In section 64(13) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act,
by Clause 8 the following sub-section may be substituted,
namely:-

“ (13) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or the
rules made thereunder or the bye-laws of a Regional Co-
operative Milk Producers' Union and apex society, Annual
Performance audit in ~ Regional co-operative milk Producers'
Union and its apex society shall be conducted for every
financial year, in the prescribed manner, by engaging person/s
from among the panel of experienced person/s in dairy
industry, recommended by the apex society and approved by
the Functional registrar of Dairy Co-operatives.”

Shri P. Abdul Hameed :Sir, I move the following amendment.

418. In section 64(13) proposed to be added in the principal
Act by Clause 8, insert the symbol “ ,” after the word

“ producers”
Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali :Sir, I move the following amendments.

423. In section 64(13) proposed to be added in the principal
Act by clause 8 after the words “ experience in” , the
words “ the audit matters in connection with the” shall
be inserted.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
133
425. In section 64(13) proposed to be added in the principal

Act by clause 8 for the words and symbol “ Registrar of

Dairy Co-operatives” the words and symbols
“ Registrar of Dairy (Co-operatives)”  shall be
substituted.
ol. Mo a@: NIa0NIMea g @1 GRBUINM1HHUJ
V10188300 EN=20?

M0 E6M-02ZIEMRAUM  Qldsq AV (W) all. af)aB. QIIVLAIM):

T3, M  @ARAIMOIa{la] 417-00 ®mMId BWE3HPWB:  CRBOM]
@0 THO1HNMOAAN’ @PE Y AMO]H63a0. le CRBULD 1 U3

aufl&:m%e&mﬂea.

o). aV1e9d: MIa0n0Meals a@IWes 417-00 MmaUd 8DEBLN1S:

GRRVLMI] VB BRoW1B:@12{1A1HEB3D.

@ ofl. @MI@d 20013" BRI {lo) 418-20 mMIB @RAVL®] aVLE

MIOIHO12[10156300.

W 28Il @oell eRAmGlafly) 423, 425 agam1 maud

GRRVMI1HU3 ME MTRIBHM]2[l1B1H63aT.

GBI §21Q @MHIVABS af)§00 Qldsal MIlLllnad BIWVAIBHIMOAM



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
134

@JROOD
@RMBLINHB30MAIA. . .........
@®gelasamald..........
clelhlo]! 92lQ) (@JHONBS ag)S00 Qe  milellead
BIWMIBHMOAMM (@JUgo MVB BRoW @1 2{1@18630M.
CRBL™]  ©alQ  @HOOABB  af)500  Qldsa]  mileflload

RINMIWIR1HBM.

B0al®Io Qldsal

Shri T. P. Ramakrishnan: Sir, I move the following amendment.

445, In section 74 H (1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 9 (i) after “ Kerala State Co-operative Bank”
the words and symbol “ , renamed as Kerala Bank™ shall be
inserted.

Shri Xavier Chittilappilly: Sir, I move the following

amendment.
446. In section 74 H (1) (a) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 9 (i) for the word “ on” the word “ in” shall
be substituted.

Shri M. M. Mani : Sir, I move the following amendment.




452.

457.

459.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
135

Section 74H(1)(a)(i1) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 9(i) shall be recast as follows:

“ (1) the Registrar shall consider the objections/suggestions,
if any, received from the society or from any member of such
society within such period, being not less than fifteen days
from the date of publishing of the proposed order of merger in
the dailies as may be specified by the Registrar in this
behalf;”

Shri Sebastian Kulathunkal: Sir, I move the following

amendment.

In section 74H(1)(C) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 9(i), the word and symbol “ and/” shall be
deleted.

Shri P. Nandakumar : Sir, I move the following = amendment.

Section 74H(1)(C) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by Clause 9(1), shall be re-cast as follows;

“ (c) a member who has objected to the proposed order under
clause (a)(i1) shall have the option of withdrawing his share on
application, which shall be made to the society, in which the
member has share, within a period of thirty days from such
order;”

Shri U. A. Lathif: Sir, I move the following amendment.




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
136

464. After section 74H(1A) proposed to be inserted in the principal
Act by Clause 9(i1), the following subsection shall be inserted;
“ (IB) Since Section 44A of the Banking Regulation
(Amendment) Act 2020 is made applicable to all co-operative
banks in India by Govt. Of India notification dated 23-12-20
with effect from 1-4-21 this amendment of Section 74H is
void”

o). leod: el mad 426 @3 443 9o Alka  MIeoo

6 21QOMBBIHWIT (N (@]HI0ABSBOEL.
MI2OMIMA g OQD] BBV US TV BA1ABATOEM3I?

MO BEM-OZFIEAYAUM Qldin|AD] (W). al. af)ad.  QIPIVAIM):

MA@, RGOS MVI1HG1BsIMIEl.

oll. Y1993: @l S). alfl. 00U @RAIMEa{la) 445-00 maUA

GRBALM 1 MRWYAS BRMAMICWINS allaBalella[lalasao.

@l cavad aNgleia 1881 GRAIMGa[la] 446-00 MMIB 6RO
MVERWHS BRIV ICWINS alladalell aflelasam.

W ag)o. ag)o. @eM1 ERAUMAafla] 452-00 MMIB RO TVRWHS

@RMAM1GWINS afladalellaflolassano.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
137
U HAVMIOAYLM HBOWE:@ BRAUGA]afla) 457-00 MMIA EGREO
MVERWHS @RIV ICWINS alladalell afle1asam.
@) alfl. DBH003 ERAIMANa{la] 459-00 MMA BB  AVEBWS
@RMAMICWINS alladalells[lalasan.
Wl @. af). eOlad’ ERAU®Glafly 464-00 MU 3L aVE
MIEIHO12[101H6300.
8308a1®d0 Qldsq | MNiEfload BOVAIHHIMONI  (@JUIODOID
@RMZBLNHA63aMAIA. .. ...
@J®1gBellasamala........
88300al®lo  Qlda| MNENlod BIMAIGHIMONAIM (@JUo aLE
@RoU15@1 2[1G1H6800.

8308a1®d0 Qldsq | nilelload B0war1dlesam.

alO0 Qldza |

Minister for Co-operation and Registration (Shri V. N.

Vasavan): Sir, I move the following official amendment.

465. In Clause 10,
(1) In section 80BB(2) for the words and symbols “ as



466.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
138

follows,-” , the words and symbols “ as follows, namely:-”
shall be substituted.
(i1) Items (ii1) and (iv) under section 80BB shall be recast as
follows:
“ (1) Joint  Director(General), Dairy Development
Department or Joint Secretary to Government, Dairy
Development Department, Government of Kerala;
(iv) An expert from Diary Industry nominated by the
Government:”
(i11) In section 80BB(3), for the words “ the Southern
Regional Head of the National Dairy Development Board” ,
the words “ or an expert from Dairy Industry, nominated by
the Government.” shall be substituted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali : Sir, I move the following

amendments.

In the marginal heading of Clause 10, for the number and letters
“ 80 BB” the number and letters “ 80 BA' shall be substituted.

4677. In section 80BB proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
Clause 10, for the number and letters “ 80BB” the number and
letters “ 80 BA” shall be substituted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed: Sir, I move the following
amendments.

468. In section 80BB(1) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
Clause 10, before the word “ Gazette” the word “ Kerala”
shall be inserted.

489. In section 80BB(2)(ii1) proposed to be inserted in the principal



48]1.

494,

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
139

Act by Clause 10, after the word “ or” the words “ not below
the rank of” shall be inserted.

Dr. N. Jayaraj : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 80 BB (2) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by Clause 10, for the words *“ Recruitment Committee” the
words “ Recruitment Committees” shall be substituted.

Shri T. P. Ramakrishnan: Sir, I move the following

amendment.

Section 80BB(3) proposed to be inserted in the principal Act
by Clause 10, shall be re-cast as follows:

“ “ 80BB. Recruitment Committees for appointments in
Regional = Co-operative  Milk  Producers’ Union.-(1)
Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or rules made
thereunder Government shall, by notification in the Gazette,
constitute Recruitment Committee which shall conduct the
selection process for all permanent posts of the Regional Co-
operative Milk Producers’ Union.

(2) The Recruitment Committee shall consist of not more
than eight members. The Secretary to Government in charge
of Dairy Development Department shall be the Chairman of
the Committee, and the other members shall be as follows,-

(1) Registrar of Dairy (Co-operatives);
(i1) Chairman of the Apex Society;
(111) The managing Director of the apex body of Regional



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
140
Co-operative Milk Producers’ Union;
(iv) Joint Director (General) or Joint Secretary to
Government, Dairy Development Department;
(v) Southern Regional Head of the national Dairy
Development Board;
(vi) Chairman, Regional Co-operative Milk Producers’
Union;
(vii) Managing Director, Regional Co-operative Milk
Producers’ Union-Member Secretary.

(3) The Recruitment Committee for undertaking the
selection process of the Chief Executive or the managing
Director of the Regional Co-operative Milk producers’
Union shall consist of not more than four members. The
Secretary to Government in charge of Dairy Development
Department shall be the Chairman of the Committee. The
other members shall be the managing Director of the apex
society and the Southern Regional Head of the national Dairy
Development Board. The Chairman of Regional
Co-operative Milk Producers’ union shall be its Member

Secretary.”
ol. a1ea: NIaONIMA S @] RN U3
MO @1 BBMEENZ0?

Ma0G6M-02FIERAHM  Oldsq QD] (W) all. «fad. aQAVAIN):

a3, oM ERAI®Alafly) 465-00 mMIB BVeE3PWE: GBI

@0 THh 1M’ @PE Y AMO]H63a0. il G_BLD 1H U3

cmﬂceamce@(m’l%.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
141

o). 1e9d:  MIa0M0Meals a@DIWes 465-00 MMIB SDE33Ud

GRRVLMI] VB BRoW1B:@12{1A1HEB3ND.

W 2080l @oell eGPamGlafla) 466, 467 agan1 maud
GRBLM1H U3 MR MAIBA]2[1A1HEB3M0.

. afl. (mméasis 20013 @RAIMO)afla) 468, 489-20 agaml maud
GRBLM U3 VR MAIBO]2[1B1HE3aM.

GAI. af)M. RBVOIR" BPAUMGIa{la] 48]1-00 MAUAB GR3LM TLRWOS
@RMAM1GWINS afladalellaflolaszano.

@ Sl afl. GHHM @ROIMGIafla] 494-00 mMIE GEEVL®I
MERWAS BRIV ICWINS alladalel]l o[le1asa.

eclelhlo] QT (@JDHO0N8s3 alO®0 Qg  enileflead
BOUNDISNEMHDAN (@YY DI

@RABLINABEB3MMAIA. . ...

@J®1&Belasamala..........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
142
RO 92l  (@JHI0ABB  alOMI0 Qldq|  nilefload
BOAISHEIMOAND (@JURo MV BRoW 10 12fl@18s3M.
CRRLMI  9alQ  @NHVYBB  alO®o  Aldsaf  milellead

CINMIWIRHABM.

al®1OdMIOMI0 Qldha |

Shri P. Abdul Hameed: Sir, I move the following amendment.

495. In Clause 11(2), for the word “ deemed” the word
“ Considered” shall be substituted.

o). 189ad: NI0MIMeals @D GREV®1 MU fld@1EBaTOEM30?

MO B O6M- 1 EIYaH3 O_lcee‘gd@f] (Wl all. agMB. QIILAIM):

@, MM eV ILfle:dlasanlel.

ol. 1098: @1 afl. @EMI@ 20013 BRAIMEIa {14 495-20 mmud
GRRVLMI] VB MTAIHA12{101HE3D.
al®1OMIMI0 Qldsq | M908 BIVAILHEMOOAN  (@JUIOHDD
@RABZBLINAEBMMAIA. ... ...

@®gelasamald..........



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
143

aI®1OmMIMIo  Qldsa| MIENOMm BIVMMIBSNIMOHAIN @JUWo VR
[y e} m
@010 2[101H800.

al®1OMIMI0 Qldsq | milellead sowadwlalsasam.

800 Qldsalo all01dhWQo Gal@3o

Minister for Co-operation and Registration (Shri V. N.

Vasavan): Sir, I move the following official amendments.
111.  In the short title the word “ SECOND” shall be deleted.

133.  In Clause 1, the word “ Second” shall be deleted.

Shri P. Ubaidulla : Sir, I move the following amendments.

112.  In the long title the word “ further” shall be deleted.

116.  In the long title before the word “ Co-operative” the word
“ State” shall be inserted.

121.  In the preamble the word “ further” shall be deleted.

125. In the preamble before the word “ Co-operative” the word
“ State” shall be inserted.

126. In the preamble for the words “ purposes hereinafter
appearing” the words “ following purposes” shall be
substituted.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
144

135. In Clause 1(1) before the word “ Co-operative” the word
“ State” shall be inserted.

137. In Clause 1(2) the words “ deemed to have” shall be deleted.

Shri P. Abdul Hameed : Sir, I move the following

amendments.

118. In the preamble for the word “ expedient” the word
“ convenient” shall be substituted.

131.  In the preamble for the word “ hereinafter” the word
“ henceforth” shall be substituted.Shri P. Abdul Hameed :

132. In the enacting formula for the word “ enacted” the word
“ constituted” shall be substituted.

134. In Clause 1(1) for the word “ called” the word “ known”
shall be substituted.

138. In Clause 1(2) for the word “ deemed” the word
“ considered” shall be substituted.

. aVeed: 113, 114, 115 agyam1 mnid eeuw®1eud 112-20 mmid

cRBLMABo 117-20 mud ce3w®] 116-20 maud creV®1asse 119-2
mnid@ ee3®] 118-20 mmId ce3v@ese 120, 122, 123, 124 agyam

mmnId ceBLMHUd 121-00 mmIB Ge3v®ese 127, 128, 129 agam



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
145
mMIB e_AVMIBHUS 126-20 MmmIB c_3LM1B80 @elromImaejo 136-
mnId  eeeu®l  133-00  mMIB  GREULIWIGE  @RSERIM®IMIL)o
@AM Do {leanmemIal.
[QV]

NU20MIMS g QD] GRBVMT MVI1AB1ABMOEEN=I?

Ma0B6M-02FICARAHM  Qldsq QD] (W) all. «fad. aQAVAING):

ad, @ @RAmAlafla; 111, 133 agaml maud svesyowls
CRRVMIHU @RV 1BHTIENIMOAIM” BREYAMOIHBN.  AQ" GBARUVD 1KUY
Sl @1esamlel.

2. 1e9ad: MIa0MIMeals 2@ GRAGGIa(la) 111, 133 agam?

BVEBLIUND: CRBROLMIHUI MVE BRoU1KhO1alolasam.
W all. 990mI388 @AUGGIa{ls) 112, 116, 121, 125, 126, 135,
137 agyam1 mmiB ceO®I%HUd ME M@ a[1T1H6m0.
W, all. @’omu@asa 20013” @RAI®Gaflo) 118, 131, 132, 134, 138 agam
MMIG BRAVMIH:Ud MVE M1DIBB12{1B1H830D.
CRRLMI §alQ (@HIVABB  30MJI0 Qldhq o aflloldh@o  Gal@o

ni1elHald BoOWMIBHMHDAN (@ JURODOD
[Q¥) (0] @m



Uncorrected/Not for Publication

02.11.2021

146

@RMBLNHA6BMAIA. .. ...

@®1gelasamald..........
CRRLMI ©21Q @NHVYBB BN Qldhoo afoléh®o  Gal@Bo

nefload BG0MMIEHIMOHAIM @JUo MR @R B0 afl@lesam.

CRRLMI §al® (@HIVABB  30MI0 Qldhoo afloldhQo  Gal@Bo

6T)_ﬂ%l;]6)ﬂ§ CONMIWIB1H630aM0.

AaMIo QAI0WM

M0 BHEEM-02FICIYAUM  Qldhq QD] (W all. agMB. QIAVLAIM):

avd,  aueidy gl 016aods ©alR @do0gss 2021-ee1 cHos
MVaOBHO6M Mol (MeN2d0 BRAV®I) mi®3 adAVIBHEMHDIN (@JEAWo

I3 @RAM® 1o {losam.

alISIHRI®-aIS1HaIdW,  allMIeeallgdw  GHHUA - G3AITLIo
moeagd@W (). Od. ©IWIGHHM): aUdB, IV  (JECAVWHDD
aflamosaao.

ol. a1e9@: 2021-921 @GHO8 MVa0BH6M Muocelo (=220 CRARLMI)

enfl©d A 0VIGHEMAOIN (@JEAWHDD



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
147

@M BLIH630MAIA. ... ...
J®&elasamald..........
@JGO®o TVER BRoW 1A 2[1A1HBaM.

NN@3 Oaf)HdhGM M aldIW]B1H53a0.
O av

(i1) 2021-0e1 508 e3a1Io OldgHaag Genioda” (6e3W®I) Mo

alSIHRI®-alS1HaIdY,  allMIeallgdw  6&HHUA - G3AITVIo

Qo |2 D] (W) Od. EIWIHHM): aVAE, aVMI H1Gl 0lea]ods”

0alQ  @jsmoogss 2021-ee1 esH08 es3iVIe 0l@GSHRF @AW
(ee3L®]) MN@  alBIVINMUHANTHNMHAMN  @JCAWo I
@RAU®G1a [lasano.

MaDBHEEM-1ENRAHM Al D] (W all. agAB. QIIVAIM):

M@, MM (JEGLWHDD a (laMIEBZAM.

Wl Odh. IWID)HUM: aVA@, D NIlT3 @RAIMGTa[l2]Ga]0Ud MO

MVoMIA2fIBMN. ER@OHIME  MMIWVIEaOUd  TVoMVIBICHNMRDIEL.
2lBa] &SIO® ldAVIGHIOJAN  GRBVL®I]  mileemleo®an” m®  Mmilod
@RAMTa [12]G0BOMHAN  aMIW  alOGIDIGN.  MIaOAIME]S

@RoWEBRUT 21Ba|WIG3 A l1HELSOD MVoMVIN]HE3MMVENZEH; 1B BR@ 1ADEUdaHO



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
148

T3 MoV THN 0.

2. aY1e9@:  al@a] &SO®  aldAVISHIQIIM  MIlLleeMIMIeM”

MIaONIMOlg D@D  alOM@). 218s] 62ICYMBDEMI?  TVBWYHS
@E](JOWo @AM 100EUdaHO QGANIFEIdMHIo.
al@1WAMNMW D HNSHNIQIMDIM. (@JCAWo MVE @RoU 1014 lolHs30M.
MIl@3 2 IAIVIMMWHBHFBBMO. Qs ®IQ19)8B o IQIWEMM.  @6NBJ0

Qlsa .

@l. 06008091 @oell: avd, M3 «ldAVIGBEMIIUE  2lBa)

921QIO® GaldHI0ILL.  BRDODIME  2l@a] ©2IQIOD CaldB:IMNDIEMIS
aM6EBUHS 6WIla(lal.
Q)

2l. aV1e9d:  GRMIMELI  ©a2l038  GRYABAMaf 3210312

21820 1L106® A 10AVIBHINJAN®INEM AN 21@a) GQIIMONE; 13
®21QOOAMMo  MIaONIMDalS A@D]  alOa). @RONIVL0  §alVA
321031885 Qo 9alQ. al0QVIGHIOAAN” M1EBBUB IO AVAVO] 206
AGMISEaNO®. aflanls’ aflengail21002ms0W1g06em” BDEaoud  2l@a)

©21Q)0OAAM” alOQMM®).



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
149

@l 9dh.  QIWIGHHM: avd, MM M3 aquid SHo1glYes

al@lIMMPVPEMOAIN  (@JeaWo  BRAIMOIa{la]Ga 0wl  GaleMeNE;1®3
21Q2) @Y’ MO alOGO®I6M . 21Q2) &SI
a1V 1M GOENZ@INEM M0 Wl @QYQUUIOAS. EYIGEY
GAIIMAONMMHMEETIB  @BR@IMEUWaHo GO  MVoAVIBANIHANTV
§210016MIS” BREYAMOLa |6

2l. WH93:  ©al0AB aloem® TVRWINAI af)LIoaI®Bo CHSMGE.

OO 9alQOIM” @JEDIH @IL|OIONMMAILL  MIa0MIMeals QD]
A 10D @MAVO ] o)’ MERWHS @RE1(JoWo @RI @1V EUHO
QAGIMISEAIHIONMN ©2l0B alOOMD®IEN.  AQH] alODDEIIE!
2182]Q1LIO® aldAVISHICDI af)aN” GaldB1a]Ga 008 A ldAVIBHINAIMNIEM
@aflosmMIMoo 8@BaldS” Gald alOaTIMN®. BREEBHMWINN JEANISEIIV .
@R IMEUHRNIGM  AfleNZAil21000NR0WDGa 106)E] 21@a] ©alQIOAMN’
aloemm®.  al@2)Q”  afllcoowaleiam”  MIa0NIMeqls @@
aloaom]gens. M163B3UIHBEN2OW afengailanoeomim’ DEIWIG

DOMOAUIBIWINMIN al0QB®. 2IQ2] 6.alQ)do.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
150

@Wl. 06008091 @nell: aud, M3 aldAVIBBEMIIUE  alBa)

§21QIO® GaldhHI0lel. GR@IM” ArleNgallaldEOAIN” al0QIN® VATWEL.

2. W1e9A@: al@a] ©21QBO®MMVB8 BT MILlaldGo Hal@olmlel

GOIMONE1M 2182JQY"  @QPINIHEMAN” NIaOMNIMHQlS AEDTWo A l06O.
@RAUWIMDaJRIBAMIO® @RYBLo @RElEJIWo al0au). HalWA@  AISHO
MU VBWHS @RoU1HI00 BaldBla|®IEM.  AGIMIT  GalddhIOHAIM’
o100 @193 ERSINVOIMAMILINM” Ga DD MM 1@ ]I 0.

@l of)@M. of). OMLHB0DT AVE, al@a] &HSIO® aldAISH]LBOS

af)ON” 2L AADINIWo  GalIBlENIQPBB® o I®1QIEM @BRDCa 0L
MIQONIME]S  Oh.  EIWIGHM  2QADIWo  GaldBla).  MYLHDIEMIS’

@@0&1Hm30®)’1(63m’1%.

@l O, QIWIGHHM: VB, 2lB@a] &SIOD® aldTVIBNINYIN BT
nielnemlomae  NIa0NIMeq ]S @ERoMEEBSITE BRYEOEsILJo  21@2|W1®3
AlO:HSOD’ MoMVIA1ABNVEEN2E; 13 @R®1MVGUdaHO I

MNoMVIRHNINAMMO A 06T 1@AD.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
151

W). oM. af). OMENHsaT V@, oMM af)O@ aflewolaf

COAUNAISODAN.  MO® §al0lOWIB  MILINOMIMNSI® VAN ]HEBAD.
MAYOS  oJBQMYOBIHBIW  DaOIMIA WIMIBo  MVVERINYEBBUY
TMLOROM1afIgNE. @R TLVVEIVLEBUY  MIEIMIBAMIMIET” UHATBSHENED.
GP@ILI®IGHINMT  OABOBO@ANIEM”  MNIaONIMDQlS  AQADICWIS
af) MBS al0WIMBB®.  B@W MV1To MIRINIBOM] BaldhHIMIEM” MEROS
af)LNAIBOSWo  BIVADMIAN”  UYARYMBICHMZ®.  2MIWlal® §oAan’
aloQM®’ afeld alIMEBRO8Wo  aldleMlal Galdd:MMIM. Dely
al@1WeM®M  MSa{leRESaM®IEMELID  RMIWlal®yo. @Y 2|MIWlal®yo
@RISR  @LIfalAlweMm®m  2fleldes”  @ERAEAIGNIBIMIE:IMIE]
af)ON®1OR H®EINIM” 2O OLIMNII0TOLI BHHU@TVOIMIHMBAOWo  OG
R1AUMBNIGBo 2JAMORHMEIVIGBAN  FOIDMEBBBOS M0 )MV IOWIF
MM BRYYWaOlEBHWIM. @Y BCGlMo emIMIAeS  afemleowem]
alo@mlel.  HFEOD @JTVoWOMIT EDIMD® alOGID@IM.  IYeNiao]
NINELIEMINSIalo  CHU@EEBSINRI  WoRJMIBNJo  (@JBID®  BAMIWIMAJo

alsgloloel  2MlYSIQo  GHZIMTBAD MY ND1Qo o JR0O1Yo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication

02.11.2021

152
@D G IOLIMEAT a21@afleel aNIBANITHNIE) O BMCalleel
ENIaOMIM §QIET. @RAIGBOSOHWLINNIGBHSV0 GAIBMW)o Qﬂcroco;!o

SaMIHEMAN”  aMMILINGH]  AEINQEMINPION” MERSOS  2MIWlal® o
NIMNDQ|GH.  HITVACNIWINM  (YIO-WINIMOBBEIM  DUIMISAT
o IRIQODHSIG3  TVOIBHBEMIOUE  GHHU@o  TLNIMTHABAIOOWQo  AY
210N HNINOQ0 af)Ga]dgo HIMIM MVIWIHBMNVEMNE.  HaldDCHU@)EIBUI,
MUIHIQNCAHU@6EIBUY,  @OQNS  AUHOEIB8  CHU@BBUI  @S6a3]
@R IMHOD” @m%@mwoem“ MAHS” BRAUMOS (@JUIEBRUZ AMAVILINSHIS
HFIQaN . YOS HNID QNZAQAN QSO 0 J2R001DIBHSWVYo
210IMHNIWBOSWo  HeM1B0feM”  EAH@ODIMdo  SH@IBMNIO1HBSIN®”
MRS $H0eMINT MVIWIBs30. ERYBH:Qa oMU MSOMIN MVIWIBsaNIel.
alema 1L DOMD@OHMNE” 30600  BlAINV0jo  MSEOMENE  aJRBHUBEGa IR0
alelwlsenslejo ATV IHLIDAIBHLINGM MSOMIQBBHDANIEM af) MBS
@01 MVIWlaj®. @D enileflgles MM MIQAM (@JUIEEBRBIM” MONU3
al@lanOIGHNNB® . alddH, MOAU3 MM  mMICIHDINE af)aMIGM’

9C3U1ABM®? MO U3 N 1036 »26NZ3E3UD1HBAN DY,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
153

0 210BGAILIMICWI @RoWAIGWI Mol 300U3H"
aJNAMwamo»Im” BRABaODQYMBIAN 1O DNHISAE3BHWIGM . af)aMO @3
@P®EIeeld MUl @REINONHOISBMM  @JURo. GRIEMISIEM” NI
ANewitlo| (@JoSlaflafls8s®.

MINY HY1OMWIY MAMOS alOFR.  BHITVBEWIW” 21210 1®3
MIAMAUBAN  af)o.af)@.af) af)dN MILIYIG3 CHUOBROB, N06BBOS,
000Wla I8, GCHU@®o RIAUMBNINO BROMINlaHoGADLjo  AOHHID

af)Mee” HY1el. $0TVdeWIWIHnd nem1cs.....

2. 199@: @R6EE" HY1AMWIY o I0MMO®ELIN0 OIS

Wl. af)@. af) oOmellasant  aud, emIM GAIHOID3

@I®11eN6M” (@JMVoUWIEBMD.  GHINVBEWIWIHM3 06eM1®3 HOA@ 1o
MUVa0I@30Jo AMaUI®INIHALI0e MIRINIBEDN@IM” AMBalanllcdmlan
(@JAUBOMIHABINAIEIAM™ @RAIA.  @PRAIGEINSIaloMTAM” (@ JAIBO1HBAIID
MM BRYDAOIHBAN.  MIMW  af)SMI@ M0HOMERON] HFlaom
@Mo@®I@3  aloeO®ISIEL af)SMI@ B0OHEMEROa] MAHH  @ERO1WIo.

G3WIY (EJMELAIW @IBMOISM  BH@AIEM af)SMIB@ MO0o. @R’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
154
@REERYA0IWI0.  WU:RATOMIVW  BHUWAUIMMBRIO®], BREZOTHIHNY
Gald MYafloGHoS@IWIMEA[IRjo MSoBMSIWIFMNE.  B0TVAEUIWT®3
ald@aVIOMIW @B BHUDAUIMMBBIOM . AOIVVa0IBZOD1HY
@006NIdMI 1O 1@ @G3a0o. MAOHNLI0IBH30
@ROTWINIIMNDEAOL] WHHUNIMODINNG  BHLIaID]IWINM”  BREZa0o.

@RCE300MIO  allBWIAIWIIM”  AV2JlMIM®W  RIA®],  BREZaO0Jo

@REEBHMMNANWIEMN  MGEa|dUd  (@JAUBOMIABMMD@.  @RGJ0Wd  aflalw

nmallcowaBUianlswisel MUVaHBo 9M51Q0{lEBaMN@ 10
MVIOMVOT ...
GAI. af)M. RWOI2* aVad, (....... HONHR 30a0.....)

Wl. af)M. af) OME(HB8aMT qVE, GBRAIAHBBB ol DI

alo®@o. @R® MANOSWIOIABAN HITVBCUIARBS af)o.af)@d. af)-DIBHE)”
@010, ERM DOMOALIMIICIOL!  aBQ0jo (@JUAYAIW BT A0AIEM.
@R 00HOMHB0sl  af)IDHHHIMNBIAN alIABUW]ISBANHAN I
al0WOo. MUDVa02B30 DVSIWOQ [lEBM@IMMo MAYNS  TVICTVIV D

DINAMODIWONINHH @Y M0o0 M@LHAN  AVoRIAIMEHUI  BRAYLIYAIM.,



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
155

@RANAOS WINIBo aldlaldSldhud MSHABMME. M AIGBAM 18-00 @I
af)Bl0 af)o.af)@3.af)-0000Wo B aldlnldSIen GHeMlaflgans. GRAIB DD
MIMIOM: @IV WIHWRBAHISWIejo @RDEAIDHLIYB88  BMaldS
al0laldSlahud  @RANeS  avocrlSla[lasamnens. @RCa[0Ud  @RAIARHS
af)OIM1ejo MG OMAB012JGR] MODU3 2 lAD]ICHHMNRDY, @RLIOH®
AR 1ejo 830008  OMNZODHILIo MATEBIMNDD 1M B30 2J0GEMI
2NONCHNME®? BROM0o CAHHDEBBBOS HOOJEBRUT MINANIW] af)sBBOM
MSHBOAMBBD1OMHBO]2jGL] MODU3 2lODCHHMBD .

oML MNIaOMIMO]S AQDICWIS al0WIMBBD®), @63E"
BUIOLOMIGHEMHAON” aMIN o lOQINIEL alddHH, 988 WoOW @P6ER
M1eIn13omIad WA laneMo. @RI’ af)N1oe” @REBREWIS’
alOIMBB®. NI@2LL, CAHUDOBBUW  @REIYNHA1HB0N B@Balds
@JUIEBBA... aMIM  Balogan’ MIdomo. ami” 2009 @0daj" I-moem”
(OMIBA IBaYOEMo DM@, 10 IdaueEBUBscwaHnem” 2019 2av0I]

I-n” afengo NMIBaIQ1aUIMAPMNRIV@. MDD HILIVSOoLl TVBHHIAQ

1AIMNONIAHBo ARIMNIIA  G3AIMVJo  GMIdAAWIeel @To’lmm(rggf]m”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
156
2101I0H928880 BR®IV® ol Hindu Religious & Charitable
Endowments (HR&CE) Department -003 20UMIWI@AaM
OERLOVMNABABe MDD HILIVSAIG JaN” VMU  al@lad@emMo  MSAM.
2009 @ooel o, 2014 @ooel go@, 2019 go@3... alody, D
al0ladOEMOD IO VMo  ALIMNIIA  G3AITVIo  GMIBWIM™ &1¥1eiIes
CHU@o RN BNIBHBMNBOWV]HLIAM” NIa0MIMOQIS AEHTHS” BROTWINJAM
$HOQLMIGN.  BRDCAIOLIMOHAN  MVAHNIB Wl.ag). Domalleel @fl-
0leoaImnw” MIEHH1G3 LdMIBo leluy 210N HHIBHH BRAAONIW AW]. agj).
@YM CHHUE@Oo XRIAUMBNIBAH MTIBIAUBAND@ . QIBHO  HHQIG; 1QITAM
MIBa 1BlaUEIMOMIM0 (@fl-0190QINVTW’ W.af). GRAAISIEHIMOHAMMIEM’
af)MN1HH” A I0WIMBI®. VVMUBAIBTAHOEMANTHZ BIVRIV CHHU@DEBBIOS
CUWW  oJNAMIBMWo  H2IYPAN® QYWHILIBBSIOLIAo  al®IQIE].
CGOWIMIWB8  GAUDEBBBOS  ABRIMIOIW] 2VBOMIVGIMI3
CHHUOEBBUE  Aloo®o  Mlelnilgss  GWAWIGMIMDoe ®INYAIBo.

@REBOMWINMETIM  RIAUMSBHIOM™ al@ladEemMOMIHd  WemManLlo

eISlEnIn®  QIo. OMIBaIBlaHYEMOD IO BINMOWVT  BHHUDEBBBOS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
157
YW oJMAMIGMWo  SF1AIHHEMo.  BAHHU@EBBBOS  BWYW  @OLAN
MSalSl  DMBIG@WOHMANIEM  MIa0AIMA]S  AQYICWIS  af)M1He”
@PE MO HBAINBBD).

BRD@GANALIMOHAN  QAUMBAIMo KO  CAHUDRTAUMHNIBH
e¢mIdwlnngd m0eMBO0a” anml@mIan” AIGlesam vomige 6 MMVAIW]
MAYOS  TVOMLOIMAD  (JEM YK lal ARININAG  GBAIMNVIe  GMNIIAAIG3
S1QNHWIVT H1SEBHQIET. aflel CHU@o 21UMENIdHS” 2021-0el
Mo aJBeMIW]  LISlENIMMES.  ALININE  GBAINVIe  GeNIIBAWIM
ald@aNNZo aBdh V1o  MLINHVWIMSI® MANUY AIBHO NDOAIaJBQJo
al01WeMIBHNNBINMANIEM” af)N1ae’ al0WINS8BD).
GRDEAOLIMOMN  TVAHHNICINNG  H1Y1LRIVTGBAN a9  a0IRA®
WAMMAVNIaIM BAMAIG:a| Gald MIGT MLIMNINAG GBAIMNIo GMIIGALIW]
af)AN® NAIMHINWIOM . BRD MIVOBLINNIBo BRoW1HO1HNEMo. DD
Gal@GRIQDENOD® af)ad) MOQAIEN MABBMBIGHIM TVIWgJ®?  al9W

DBV MIWAAIM” MCa [0go aIADSGINO).

ol. V1E0A@: H@OWING CaldeD?




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
158

W). oM. of) OMENABAN: VA, EMID 63@3 ’lm’lc(g@oeaom‘“
MIB@™J0.  H0a HIVYEERUT NI@o alOOMIT A®].  VOMUBA IGlaYO6M
OOMOA  HaNERAIO] 12-0" osplo@man.  MIa0adMeals 2QD1Es”
HDAUNO BOD® MSallelNendm MIWlafIsloelan” @ROIWIo. @RAITVIMo
MUBHNIB A lO®, M@ MAlomId 1-m” goa (lonad @gj@}ﬁe)cmoam“.
af) Moo’ @@gugm»”lg’l@%aeﬂ«sa HAMHLIWITM”  Malonid 1,  @n
(OMIBIBHOEMo MABH MSa[1LINGHIM VIWIEa0? 2L GBAIMVIo
al@layoem  ml@d  AVAHHIBINME  alB1WeMMAILINHEMAN”  alOWI3
@s@R1IYNS 2 @UBUBBSIW]? @RDOMIMNE @R Mo 9©sm
M1YANISHIMHAAN” af) MBS @RERYAMOIHNIMMS.  YdMIBa IGlal@EMo
WILNIBDMOYAIHHEMo.  (Wl.ag). MLINDISBAN  M1HPo  DGaldHlHn6eMo.
DNUBB:S1WQPD aJBMNIW0 HHISODDTBHHEMo. af)LI0A0MVOJo ASEBRIOD)
OMIBo HHHISHNEMo. AlEA1a] CAHHE@RTIAUMBNIBHH TVABHIB@ M1OH ]G3
MABafIYo  ©alddaHmMo @ogoﬂgimgo M@IZH6Mo. MOWo WDOAINIW
3H00Y6BBUS  alRlNEMIBNIO® aBOMELIEjo BBINMI OGN BRYBHBOS

o FlE1OAW" af)R Q08" §21Q0ME88 MM MIIG3 aMIMW  ERAVOIMAMINNMAD



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
159
alo@amlel; oM mfl%o GAINEOMHANWINM. aldddhH, WDOAUCHOW
2O 00 463B3U3&:S] 20100) enileod

a101NM1EHNNEIWGBAHAUANIOM” af) N de’ A 10WIMDBSBO).

BRDORHIMNE" NI af)H0d AUISBHUY Da INVoaOO1H60T.

@l. VM TaHBAG  @ROVa0: U@, emI@  @m»  enilefleel
QYQINNGHEBIS’ aewoIRlal CARINA SO H QI @YU
QIONVAIYNEM”  MGa[0Ud  MEEBOHMHWIM  CRRNMIT  HMHIMZAUTAIIN]
MABBNITTIOM  BJBla{lao®MM” @EMYdho alocwemz®lel. @GO
af)®1B0NWILIO®  ale®ialaldSHs] MIM®IOG @)@lanelo TVIMIODY1H
J@lavawlgelo ol MIWAMEBBUEHH MIYWE@DHEMEEBUI  DeeNEH; 1 jo
aJNAMIYAMEMIM” ®SAVEBS]LI. AIMBERYIA®]HUd MSOMIM (o flHd]a)
MAISBIM®IGM GBAIMNVJo cﬂ@%g“@ag“ GNINAAW™ af)aM’ alO6D  63@3
GBQIMVIo Qldsal D@D MPYHBMNBOWI@AN. 2f)ANIG3 GRAIMVIo GeNIdBWIM”
DRSS o) DWW CHIEBBHSIOl MIVAMEBB8o  GRMISLI
@Y1 1Yo @R)@3o 21@a) 9 alQealsamiel. 0)60100)616813831@3

MIMBEMLEEBBIGHIN® HFIGAI CYIVIDHEBI @RLI. DEBIINIANCHeS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
160
allglaf aIBO®] Q010080 A (@JaOAVMo MSOM] @RAINIMTHBH Qo
allManomlellejos MO HBHH Qo 9.21Q)aM @11 M1@enIoWo
DSBWHQIM.  HP1OD  QlGaHo  DBWAUIYAB  WYlHaY GHIcaoCl
@PMVINNAE" @Joanmd@ MAMO®I®3 AId GRYIA®] MSIM®IW] o 193S]
@RoWo &HSIVWIW @@ DGAJIWIAMA] alEIVINIW]T aIEIDTOA|SD® aHIT
30BBBHWIM . TVAIMND®HSILIOD (@JDITVAW]BHSEIHSWIEM” EG3AITVIo
CNINBARMDHUT  HSMDGANGHIMN®. @RI  oBQ0jo  HFODI @m%m’lg}
GMAISIM®  @IBAUN®I0E@  G3QIMNVI0 GBI,  HOBMoBIM
(@JAIBOMEBBUIHE Galdejo aléMo HOENSOMIM HF1WIOD
@RAITLAWIEM.  ANlEA1.]AIRHBB8  BRYMBZHLINEEBUI  Galdjo  M@IHINT
HYleomISIel. TVAHHIG Va0V aflopienl®d Ao  MIMVEERS1®3
210MSHIBWHS VOMIBo GaldLjo ASEBRAMN @RAITLNWIGM . AIGWANDIoL@
e30Ivlo enudaleel 1250-@3 @owldoe com@emgeswo 4500- sogo
@M RAUMHNIMWESWo  MIM@al  ®ean  vomidlaciwleel

AUGBRIMOOD  BRYUYWIJoeM.  GBAUMVIe  GMNAW QMBS

a01®al@lEIWMWIBE MS® QeI oflRVsfloeislcd  VEHHIA



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
161
MOMIOD]H  MVa0dWo  M@&sElL, 30%  womigo  HAISIEBOW GHOME]
AUGBOROIMIOSH S QMM MDA (@JTVoWHBIND®  GHS.
af)OaMIWILJo RIAUMHHIBHY” VOMIBo HOWILIGLI af)aN” @RYUDITVIHHNIo.
QReIMNIIA GBQIMVl1o CHU@BBBESWo U@ XRTAUMN BNITHSWYo
$0LIER80Q88  AloWEBBIY  (@JUIERUIES o lB1a020QMBILSIN@IM’
DD MVABBNITIM ®ILIYAIL] af)M AVEMBUWAIEM  EGRAIMVIe AEDIWYOS
@®1»HoemeBaglad Mo Alkafload JadommeBglod  mlawo
DOALNGM@. HF1OD S5 AIGaUBHILI GRANHOI GBAINVI0 Qldsa]
D@1, BRSO MIYWAMVEI TVEIABMAMIBE MSa{lRNBEB0 AN’ AlOOD
H0elo H¥lal.  Mloaiw] QOquceo(ﬁ BEMIWIHIAHEIBd MIaN” @S
MWW  CAHHUORIVUMONHIGOIS @RLPAsIele MI] &Ml |®”
BWlari0lwoem. @D  AlaHOO®IG AVICGAWXI MSOalg  CHIS®]
DeImIdGleel G3AITVIEBRE1NAl BAMMVoAINWIMo, IWBAN®Iogrd@, Ol
G3QITNVIo  GNIARBHUBES” MVAIMNIW O1DIVIBE  aldlaylenemenamo

CAUORIAUMBINIBHD  DIWOMIafl ATLVAIMAI®  GAVAIM  CGAUM

QIQUNOBHUE MSlENEHIMONMMo  CHHU@DEBBBOS  AUYDITY  AY12B03



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
162
B 1HOIADMOAANDSHN0 o l®IPEAMIBo MIBG3UBBRU3  @RSERIW
MYJWIm ol aJosalgallafls’ o» aman @eser 21 o 27 aidauo
2B TWIB:HWIAM. ag)Llo U@ RN ANIBHS30 (@10
GoMISHAAM @RYAINLo GaldLjo MSa(lRINANIM HYIWICMH(@ FAMILINIW
MLOMIOD TS GUaHT DLINOM B@ G3AIMVIo GMIIBW™ alfiGqa|0go B3
GMIBB IO WIS MIQMO. mloaomIeel alolal®Io B3©3
$H00EMAIWIGIH0%0.  CHUDRIAUMBNIBOS  MIBo  aldlaydlaflg” 12
QABaHo allM1g. OMIB alBlatEMADIMIVT HI1G1OHW Alg). 2I@.2 U,
a lI0M6B3UT, @®MSBAM AVABAHNIO MHOHH 1 MIs al@lay@em
OMAAUNLINNMMETIB  BRYHaINS @RAIIGD. @RaldH® aldla0d]L60d
SHGl,  aloMo, TVAHHIBIERIBS 01@a|odS,  alG@lali®eMo M@)o
&150HHMIWIVWT  BRAIGUIAHIABIN.  GHHIANAo GRIDAH WMo  aflel
OMaUY@3 GWW  BPMIRIEBREIRISHN. (@JTTNVATW] (@BGHUNW]. of), endl,
YW’ CHU@BBSIO MIEMRBAMY V0MUBo LISIHNIAD CHHU@D)BBBSESWo

@nallseangloel  2R1aINOENIBIB  aBe0  Galddo GOMIBo  ASEBRECWI

AIS1IBBOY HEWI 0alqQ. ol CHHU@6IBgIrjo MMIQYONIHD  GaldLjo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
163
1eN© @@avawl emEIgmo. MM TVIa0210yemIas 1994 @eeer 21-av
MNIa0NIMAA]S  00a0CHNISD]  aJoaalgalls), MYSloGHIS®]  Galdrjo
01 (o1 Y| aflwWles @Javem] QIBRV1HBHQI6M . =113 plleled [57=Y
BAU(D)6BBUIHE30 CAHU@XRTAUNBNITESVYo @RYQIUdJo M 1OWITB
SHNGIEWI  HMNTCHEMI  alOMEAI  0lGa 03630 BMVALL.  GBREODIOHS
WIIBo MSAN” HY16IM). al@laNIOMIM GAIMNZD®. GRMIMBB @RY)B2RANI0
MVABHNIB HH6MTHHEMo. Dely GRILNHH DEely CGAIMHAN QIGaHEBREIW]
CHU@ORTAUNHNIB DWAOM]HHNIMENBTLBAN @RYQIVD 0 MSa [lLINEHIMNBS
S8@ @00Jo BEMIWIHIVIHUE MSEOMMISLIIN” nd@ael aflealalMo
MIUBBEBMIUT  QAIARL1SBIM @EOMIE88  MIEIaldgH8n0WT QeI
BGaldd3:aM. GRAIAVIo GMINAMW RTAIMBHNIBHEE MVABHNI@ MOSHM VdMISo,
CHUORIAUMHNINO HMaHJTI GWW  af), nil, avl, Al agamleBem
@@ QAT VOMIBo M@ T AU, M@ AV, AW W3 MB35
AB M@ D2100Q OMIBAEM. GO LIF1HSN® ®ean  31dealsnoel

&HS1YHIHWIM.  EAU@OBRUISH38  21BENIRLIVEM VWIS ASERIWIS

QAUBaHEBRBIW].  @RSIVWIMONIW]  DalGQYME  @RQYB:Qa |IM1:UBGa IR0



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
164
0SseER1W 2101w QUGOIMASS GAU@)6BRS 103 @Al SI0IN
M1eINI@EBM0. VMIB al0lad0MENI, M1VWA al0laHOEMENI MSOMINT)
CHU@ORTAUNANINOQo  CAH@BOIMIW]RHIATIHOBQo  dhenISla{lasam
@WIHHIQ1HE8as  MIelnlRSlIoM®Inn  CHH@ORIAUMSNI@  Ealdd3o,
'a151em1 20Q26MaMN' BIAUIHIQYNIW] (JEHHIBTNIEINET. GHOSONIGEN
29" GBAINVIo BMNIIBWRGHEIGRI® GaldeLl GHINMMIVIN0 BHINEM aNNZo
9U3ea]Om] 2eI1MIdd E3AMVINIVAC MVAWAIWT aldlal@12j03 AI@EH
2elnidd E3ATVIOMINL] @JUIEBBUBHS  YDOUDID® aldladdBo &I6MIMIN).
QflKoI0VEBRABWo @Y 2I0OERABWo  MHABBIN  MS® AVAHHIBIHNY
MOeEBGIEM  @IBAUI®IoE@  G3AINVIe  GMIDBWINE  HANOOD
MVOMIOD & DB 2| HI6Mo. @gf](()d@)()@mf)@) GOOMILeN3 M0 EHeead
GUOALINAMIOA! QIJIR  2IGMIIEI Galdejo  QlUDIMV]B:86S  Afld:000)@1)
YMOOmOd  oflei@  GMIDWadBQjo  2alGWIWla).  AVYPAOTNHI@I
GMIdWaJBqjo dMANB000 QYeMHQ|SOMINo TVAB DNBIBHING (YA 2|’

DO ABNIBH BN DO GH MV af)SBHNEN®IEM . G000

GEINBHWDEMo  AVIMITMIS:  @JDITVATWIQHS  BRBEHo  AIBEUIola).



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
165

QAUF1a10S MIOB3HUY m@(w%gd’]gdo CHUOBBSI03 HSOHOZ BN
og)(fm)ﬂ_r}!.jo @J®1VaW]l 201HSHNINBB  BRYGLIIAINWILINEM @MNIdABAW.
BAMOO  WMIAIALIVIM (@JEAUWIlESM@IM” agdeq|gem1V]gss
@MDY  MVADEMEBBBo @Touooc%ﬂ@)o@ Q1B 21103 M 40fo DIS{e0)
alladaielésnemo. woenIolnel @%@oosm@mosmarum1%§§ OSOMINIS
MR 2] WEBEOS MIB2NIEMo MIBTDOFODMEMo. MIaUEM @3 NNB3UWTow)”
HOMAPSAHUMD  BHIB|G0aHM”  MIB2NEM  2J0DLIYBS  210LIH63S]
MleVIRS  AmMLLIOMIDLl 2106830  MSOMIAUSOMIHAW  M1BoAdeMo
HODOOWo @RYOoElaflglel. MIBQJadem aBRMBMIWIV @IGBONMIo:Ad
GBQIMNVIo  GMIIAW~ MENIOIOMIAIB8  D3IAVIM®  HOHOAISIWeMo.
MLIMIOM 1 @JTTVaWIgelo @1 MIYWAMBBURHH MIWQADEMEBBUI
o330 ]SOMIYIRIHBIN  AVIa02IQNEOMITE  BOIWBH  aJNBMIWAMo
M@BHIMIVT OHRHMZAUMIZB8 DD nilgfloal QAYAUMNSHEBIS™ BO1HHM3
&S] llcWIRla | CONINA SO IOBHNIME” @PRAITVIM A [lasa.

W1 YRIMMB:AIQ]T O, 2JADRINAISONTVD(@)HI0o WYT. af)o.

@IREUIILIN: VG, TVMI” GHoilg]l 01Ga 08" 921 Jdoogss 2021




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
166
0Ll GHOZ  E30IMNIe  Ol@gHhHaag @@ (cesw®l) o3
0a10@2MI)IWo  EMGM@IMIWT  AVABHBELIY" §21QEMOAM  1(ag))
MMIB CBRNOMT aMIM @RAIM@1a [lasam.

@D alAHUOOD  MVoMITWIafISGOMIBo QAN ITVaOMNIW  63@3
afleozmmasolelel  malles malﬂggg@‘i 01@5“6)0@” G6NIDAAW’
@RoWEBRUIA  aJNABMIVWAMo MM@IBHIMD D1WBAIMIHBBEMIIUD, o’lgc%g”a)qg“
GMNINAW~ QGAIM MSHBAN MIVWAMEBBHS  *Olaj OWAIN QIGAM
@1 GA:Hn 163303 21016 W1HNNa|CSMEDo @ 1@BOD @3 MSals]
OB Q1BHHMEDAINEN AN’ @RAIBOS afleozmMHs301q {1003
OBBSHNo. BR® BB (@JAVIAUMWINM. BRYIA®] PaOI®Afo  (@JAIGOM
Cm(O(G)OJOQ)ﬂ%@g BT  AVAHANIVIOM  MCa oW CHOBo BOILHBAND.
BHOBOM10EI GAHU(D)6BRHS3 MoMNITW1 2 {1SGOMIs0 V1Yo
al)dq IO Erlss MW1HH0M8S af)L10fw MO WEBBGo
(@)D 12aMINIGL CWINS &m%e;)oe)omg%o%a@cm QIBOMHAIMN HILID”

@REBOMOVWIT  BRYIAMINWHB01a]  aJeNElonIeMICHNME  HOQYATEL.

2016 -@3 GenIBW” ERUIB:006AQ@IM” GUOUAEM” O] @)SORAG MSalS1HHud



Uncorrected/Not for Publication

02.11.2021

167
BHOBOMIG3 @BRYOoR]a|®. QAUSHD UYGRLAIW SHAISLIIEM AVAHNIB
6D HHIO Y O 13 msmzmcr»”lf%gg@". MIYAM  MSalS1ahud GaIODIejo
M@20320Q0 MSEIN@IM” C-DAC-608 q0a000eomins auiamadw]
8@ 0lGseng MEMERHNAF  GMVIaFHAUVAE  alld:0Va{lEn0ad6Ims]
MOWl). @RI E3AITNVI0 GNIAWRDEICRIPI], 69 ®@ayla:d.gleelss”
@RGAIGHBUY AU 2|0 BH06NE" Q2600 1Mo 2 J0a]50ie0003
qowlaflgene’ 47 oagisagleeigss 0w’ ey @ale1dela)
96BLNICMOIBHWBHH  MIOAM  W0laldBW M@BIVIgME. DDIO
@levladly]  00m  ellguaglened, 2518 961213 H:Ud
0UBoqsIgee. MRVl 008 eﬂq)\(goea@ma mlan” 1082
DCBLINIAMONRHUWBHH DDADHO  MIWAM  W0lalddUd mmoeﬂm)’l%m".
WIAN1HHIB DU [OSWBB  CAHHUORTAUMBHIBOS DN dhG1GLIYo
a)e1MNI1VAE, HOW1HH@ B3a01NVB BSERIY OVWABMM @M d:dglerIYo
mlam 101alo@uo M@ 10 1g6mE" DGCBLINIANNNHHOS

OMONNMSABMMDIMIW]  B.af)o.@BRYAB.  alXldH, af) O  ald]loH,

@qg(amé, @PEYIV]®  aldldY, aflNIEH@  af)ablanjad@adl  osqy’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
168
oserle  afloflw erveleHmd  E1m1ekud  @MIOBW” @RAIRIoMIfIgMS.
AUSHO NIV  B@  AVATaIMMIEN” MANIOYEMIT3  AVoVNIM
MBHHI@ DIBRIMISBIND.  GHOBOO  MVoNIMWaf  CHU@ODIM”
QISHOWWIdho (@JOWIM Q6N af)aMI@3 alRlGa|0go CHOS1W
MGPaoo®1Oad  afltojdTMo  TVoABHUIENIMo  BRDAIY]  CHHU@DEBBUI
MoOHHIHHOMABB  MSOISLIHUE  MSADEMIOUT  FOOBOIAIMEBBRBO
RaULINCHNISEZSIWYBR  (@J2106M  @JAUBODMEBS]LN6M”  alflGqa oo
@@lalaHojo QARIDaldH  MIWINEBBBo  aBB6|SOBHMEIBlHBIMND.
'20809” SIVNMM af)aD 2DHMB BENSHEE  alOMOBIGME, TVOYODIM
TUIODo  aldBOSYH  BREMIVWIMIGoRMI”  MEMYP”  GLINGO®  ald®]
TLEURHHIMIG:0.  BRDIM MO0 HIAYEBEIT alfIGalogo DAiles
MoR0{ 5o B0MENR1BM®.  19-00  mQoMElDd @Ry  @oelERglejo
@RI Mo DENBIWIMAMN CHHU@ NIaOITRIHANSBO] o) 21B1(@o0 @AM
GO SO IWIFMS. EHHU@Ra0ITRYHAIN alBo OBIMBEMONISBAN®

CRUIEHHUDEBBUB o leIBOMIVI@BIN MVEBH:MEBBOBWQY0  BHIQYHOSQYAIEM.

AN HIMAN  CAHU@DEBBBOS TLOIMOD  QUBOO QYN BHIOYBHBIEM



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
169
NIV ITBIN D). 00 UD DWYBODN 1 HBOW CBAUMDHBOS
@RYLIVEBSIVITBMN@IOMIale MOAM @GR GARWAOD TVoMITWla] afLlo
@YALND]HBo  TVEHSEBBo  BHY  al@laddo  GHIEMOAN  D2AN®  AVEI
TLEEM6EBBSB0 HS1WIG:HWIWT@N. @M0oa 16N QAW @AM
MOSSBSEBBUT  HIDHSIOL!I aBO@EHIL]HNIT  NIN02JAISIT3 Al o@D
&S1VIBAN®.  CAHUD@BBBIBIGEHQo  @Y2aRMABD  (@JIRIM 0o
(@JogaIy0jo a1V H633 Qo 6 21QBMIFESIVWIEM” 96 UIEBSo,
OOHAUNHAUBBSB0,  MIAMEBBBSNOWV  JDaYHU  MSMD@.  OORMENYRL
DNOEBBBOS Qﬂooomamgo n0flos MRIBNIYMBIW]. BUNAIMHHINHHS1eE]
®SHEBSEIT  MSANAUAN  2l9® ®OLBIEBBESWo  MYRLOEDRMAD
Qla00063813 mleimiani@sam TUBHBESWVo S03 al@1a4@1 4}
1@ POGlEn6Mo  allGHILIODMBIVISBE  BAHU@AVEEMEO6MoO.
MIEH M EROMIAOMIEB8S1OLl  LIVH1H0jo, OOABIHOIMIY  af)Lld
@PW1HH0068BS0 MSO® 1WI@BIN®” MVEH@IWTHHIQ1HBIW @M.

MIgAZEBBUIABAJOCD CAHHU@BOMo  MVoNITWlaf" @JEDIE GWIWEBBUY

@AM QN W@, U@ BRI LGS 6BBUIB638383113



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
170

CRINHNIBHH  TVBYIW]HO0EBGBo  BRAN”  DMNIW]@BD. CHHUO)

QAHUITVNIMo  @RLOAID  GHIANRIW]&HI0  aUNIMo M@OD @AM’

QIRABHMNIAHE) @Gngocmmcmgg. @) @RWI1Hho0o QSHO
al0101®nW1@amn. BAU@MVEEHHLDo af)f19SWIVI@BaNIEL)o
@@3MVOMIMLAIW qQorsiYal @RW1B0063380 CRINBNIMWES

M1URAVIMAVEEMo  EB30ME3  BRWIGIG1B:806m" MIBQJaslgjolm™. @
TUoMIMLAVW Qo @RANHSWYMNBIG:aN QAIIB6BBU3 BHg @ IMAIMONSOD”
WO 1H1 B3 A@®LNWAIHWLI00 GQINANIB®HAN §.21QAIND.
IRIBGHMIBEAILJo  BYINOMIT  W]B:HIINORISIGHMBAT”  MVoN®]
B0 HE3EMIDUB @RAIBNS (@Joenielyo AROOABHO OMa0ldn0.
MLEEH DI 1A OTN 1 B63836313 @Taw’loeaomoeag@s @RA0AINBoESIND  @R)YDA30
@AM’ (@Jeaivomaen=z001@manlel. BAHHU@ MVBH: DO
@OMILINIREAMMIEM”  GRAD”  AflAI0l4IS83®. RGN GGV G
HILIOD BAHU@O@MVEEH:®EBBUY BOMIWIHHI00 MSOMIWIGBMM®IWT @RAIA
OISO o OGEMIGIHMMIW  MLIPDIRT  HILJB:@DIT

OMIQIOMHD@IW  CAHHU@TVEHDIDON]HNHOD af)Sal38186001103



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
171

QgeN20®  QERLEDIT  AlEIRIOMIVW  OBIafl  EIRQI  BPEWo
(@J2allaloaIam” @JaRoQla)d:06man.  MHDENBIV®  HHHIL] QlBaHo 678-
2106 B8@ GRANVIOMI®E B@W ©IRINMNOM  BRGEHNIVYWIGWI,
0 JOCHNIYWICWDI, COD3GHNIYWIGWI @YHN | QIam1@sam B33
ILIPLISNIWI@AN BRD. GBRGHECHNIW  af)MMVaAlOQYMND® CHUO@ O IHEI
MI@IMIZOM  @RSIVWANOEBHB MSOMIHBH: AYMLINW CBAl HI0LERHS
@REMIaH]SBIMIMAI@ED  BRHEHHIQYW) @’ow%eaocoogmooc»’l@mo@%.
aJOCHNIW af)IMDOBNE" ANAISHHIABMN@” GBIV o AUNYSHOSB BO1H63
QALIOW @@3NVOMIMLAIW LIS 1 00 63BUIARBH
@RWI1HHI0MIWI@AN 2 JOBGHNIVWW OMBIWVIBAND®.  GCAMICHNIW af)LId

0 B6) 0L
HI0YEBBBOSYo  CRLIW]BHIGIWIeM.  6AUHO 2fleIel@d  @RWIE:006B80
OMWIBMO.  OHLI0IBaHe 993 B30g&:S1WIET” GHEM@ MEMBEOIQHS
G3QIMNVIo  al0laHIECOMIZZES] MDD TVEHMEBU  af)dINEMNYAOW]
@RAINVIMH633HWIWT@AN.

G OSBE) O MoNIATWaj MoMNIM naleNdenag aBQQjo

UPBGRLOWMNIW  MSHAISEINAN MSOIVD. @3Vl MIYWAMERs1G3



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
172
21515201 HHI@HB0 alaNIHs QNI INIBH0 MoNINEMo
o336 |gOMIMEB8  2IS6BRU3  MIABE3UWla] WaleMdenndlead  GRoW1:000
Q68BRl.  2101@OM1LNB M0V alSle:0IdY) ANBIWEBRUBES  CAHU@JE200]
MaMEEBS1G3 MoNI06Mo aBB6|SOMIW MVBENIVIEM” BHOSO ICGLIG).
MJo  BIBBHHEMNB® M0  ODMIOMABO]a] MU  @REIDIMEOMINS
2N H9H06M1H83EMIIUI OHMMBLISHS1eLl BH OB A0 2J061N.
HBalMIo MYQIMNEINAF @ERYVoROMIT EHOBOMIM Ma0IBEOlald:Ho QUGN
allmise B81m” 2MABINEEBEHSQo TVIPaNY-TVIMUADH B TVICAPITTH:
Rallomo Y@Ll W1@a0D. MIS1MBa joorem OVSAUS]HSI03  CO®3

RO®HNIWHS 'AIgl  mI0° o) @RAMNo QAN  'Ca0dW” Ga02W”
ofiglego’ '@rSIwEBUd  MoflosQms’  o)an” alo@IN 200’ 200W”
Qﬂ@%e)go' OMROWIWBIN  HOOJo MAYOS MIS  aoanislel. 0 1H6
9aD@AUYHBOSYo  GAUO® TVATal A OGHBOSVO  (JEIMEBBOS
@RAIHOLLIBAN@®” @OAM ST @JCD D  GNINAWILJHSWIW @M.

HVPOIBHB0 Q" @PRAIBIMABHB0 D AY] @JEAIMATHLIMIVI@BMN @R

GNIAAWI®HL!  QI0a1dH>683U0. allmoa® 381 5:S1dUdHs” ag@«ﬁ



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
173
@JealvomamzoIGaniel. aBOMB 1o MVAHHIA crggoeaglaﬁ af)L10
allwmeEBUIdnHo  ACWVEIW]T B@aldS @RAINIMo  aVal0la] al0laf
al0AVIVIM @O MVABBNIB DEBJWEBRUE ERAIBHS  MlaHIWAIWI@a.
MAOHNIW Hald® BIaHGA I @ERAMMBIWI@IMILL.  TVAIGMOHR GOIWo
BRWIMOIMM@OS algdhorlo af)aMIeM” AllUdaHlq {laIBM® .  @PAIGN6(]
O0BM0 MVAIBMOM aI8S1EBQa], MVAIGHN &S1WOS @alMo BERANWV
@QIB6M) oeag’loeage)s @AM H1SIOMAVo @AV & 1SN0, GADIRIM1WYOS
PDado MIYRIDIWOS HalaldS, ®MIEINAZ AMAY" GRSIVWHNZ alPOMM,
®MJ0ea3  aflaidao «msﬂ@mg@s GHEOD ODS af)MIEBBROM RIM]
@1 210068BU3 OHIMNE" RIBINNIGH]IYW RIAHWNS B (GO HILINIW] WD
MMES®. RG] MVABBBHS HIBHHUDYo TVPaOAMIOEL! Aa0IGOTald:Ho
QBN BRAIGEN AMaUI@BOS RI0No F:TVa0NIBH]I® TVBABOM LM
@WIMIEOWeM  V@AOMWBVo  BPRYRMHISIYOHSWo  (@JBAIYdMo. enN™M
Aflalal®hI@lhUd  QIMZHBIVW]T R0®T  AJOINLOWHS  DOHSBOW]

glallajaiam  @6EB8OS  ALIMMo  AVYBIWEBSIGE AWMU IOD]OY

MNO@JODIHG  ERAIGHIVEMIIWODIHAZ  AVIYPaOy QOIS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
174

DRI AOY12|0NgSHOOVIMMO.  UYIMIRIWEMD@Jo EPQYMHIS1Vo
OBHISOMIV  ERUTILRILIHUD MQQINZHBIVT  ERSINHHOBEq |06
DWBRlGHISAN AU  DEMNABAMQIINS QoJoe)(o”l%J. MVaO@YIMNJEBBGO
MQQINZHBo M1NE @RSIAGIONIHAG Mo Galdl AMVAHIINM” @AM
OOMHENIWo  AIIM MV ERUWIINLCI® RMOOPEN®  @YANaYd] o)
@QYUOVRYELILEBBUT B 2IMVAIB 2@ OSSN 21958103 GaldOLIVIVIGBN.
ROOIQOS MWMH@BU  Qlelloslolenm  amMaHi@Ilo  aflomegom @R
BMEHISIHU  EHOSOMIOL!  MVAIBHN  AUIYWHADIDIOO  alSaOWIM]
Q9BHIM QMISIoEBl. af)aINI@ BY2100EBROSWVe AU I0MVEBBHSWo
alooMIoy SlOM1HUd adhIME” MIMIQYHS DWAHEMELEIMNTaflom @ean
@®16EIWIEHIMIM™ @AM aVAIBMA YAl @RCa [09I6M”
ROAINNWIEINS Na0IHAI GNIOMIUYINMG NAPDRMERO] APERIV M.

oc(goﬂnis 2IS68BOB MVIWNLIE 13

O%Qc@)@q M163B3E8 I

MOLlo ae)moeﬂ(s%doooﬂ, GCHAILINI 2100~

MLJHOBLIN0 al9B:16q 0],



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
175
OHSINIQOMIM HY1WIOD 3B el
Dalg 210S103 M@ M1TIHNJ0.
GHAIRlo  @1Y2ldQMYLJHBIM3  MITWIMEIVWIGIN  AMaUI@ @OHAN  OD
MLIHUS  ©aldSIOBHHQo 215681303 2IQHQo  BalQ. @19 21000YLJHH U
®aldS1ABEMIgo  21S68BUY 20QHQo  HalYPEafogo Wle]TakeleaWaf () PN I
mommmémoe‘l&bgo anniles Blelle1NIM) OO1883HWIVI@BaNILl.
MeAUBMEBRIEOSVe 63 (@JWREBSIEHSYe  @H®]  BEINEBBBo
200 IWIhBo (@JAU21H8HIVI@BMO BRAM” GRAIG H2IQPD®.  21363BUI
2001WI@  HOBAICHHIIYNBIGB:HOMMo  MIS” QEAINd QS1IWOOMMo  @RAIA
Wallal. alodH OB GHiallaflel, MOS” RSIeDIEL  ald0o 2IS6BBRUI
MI01WEMINS BB MAUWYWo BHOABOMID o ll0BBHWIV @A, @RI’
MEAIMNIM  GHOBo.  DVRWILINIW  AIMAI  AMVIGaNIBOION O
VYO M1 YHSWVYo allomo agoals” 90a(la) MGEA®NIM
B2l enam” oeaéamkgg’ @JVNOMAOJo DSAAN” @RAELYIAID:  BHB@aUd:

OMIY1LNE]  (JTLOIMEBBIONEI0  ABOAIISIVD). MM  MEAIINIM

0150108 @OV RIGT-0® GAWINN®ION]HAG  WAMNI2 §6BRUI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
176
af)amn’ QYealg DLIMIIB-0HI afl- DB ®0gkd (@JGBUDEBERAS
e10la flajod0ee” 1956 200010) 1-0" 9ag)d:yEH080 aNOM®. DBali®do
MQINEIDM  AWYo QAUOO  GHOSOMIOL!  BRW:MLOI®  RMEISHUBBBO
N éam’lq)\g” (@JMNIMo MSOMIW )@ 1a0dTV1dh0jo @ LICUNIVRILINIAIW
@JCOHIBEBBo  @OAUG Mg MMsa] aJEEINAMIUOW  YEILEBBAIEM
@RYWRMIH  CHOSOMINAF VAWM IMNoREBRUS. MEADMOIM  BHOSOIHNY
NAMINBEEROSB DHBOHAOMOTNND  GHAILlo @Y aldVIYLIHBIT o lPH1W
ROMICHOBo o JNAVNIalHHIMIEM” VdMIRINLI TVAOMIEINS (JTICRIIN
WM1HU3 Malleos Eyalaj®. @PAId Al PIVODINM  (@JalMNEAIAHA]S
@RYIOMISHWIVT@IN. JINOCHNIS] ALIVWIS]HUIES MINOHDONCAIISEI
D@V DaNIBZEOMINSWo LAIWIMBOMINSWVYo an0iles
WMAIBRLIGHMONERIM3 MARSS  adBQflh3 MZFAUSBOMIV  MEAIGOIM
QYU af)0® QAULIOGRHISOMo MAHH TVoRHHUIGs] ADTWIL. MAHE
OOHNI0T H1S1W MEAIDNIM EHOBOMIOAT af)Glo GIL @RYHHT® Mo

MANOS HS1HUIDD  HAGHAIGOMBD . ADLRWQo MIoMVOIABS MEAUINIM

CHOBHOMWIAN QAUBWo  ALINORHUIANINIU 0. MT6BBUT (@ JO1HUCWINS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
177
IO 101H830M MGEA®NIM QYU 683U GQIGNINS
allga@mOIQONAN  @JAIL0aIMAEM  (VoLIAIR1NINA o JD®RINOCWIS
MSOM 1O HIMNSIOTHBBMN@ .  HBAIOMIUVIM o ldSIODEAINOLI,  GRMWEO
@PIWA MWIBEsaM MuOLIEBE1LI0M” a01RABRTVOQS AllaHINMBHUI
aJ8QON®. GRMIM  @.all. Qo VBVOIAMo Ma0IVIYWo QISEHH MAM Y03
MLOMNIMEBBBo  MRPHN MM@BAD  aldOo. MANOS (@JMNYRLOO  (@JenRLA
MY1HBAN  EHOBOMINMG  AUBODAIMHL!  HASB1L OO  HFOOI
2R1elo{leno@  MYLH  GBRYCHMEDMNE.  MVOHWIG  AUGCMHAIM L
M0l O]’  ROIGIEEROM1O] DO @IOHSOFHUD e Y
Wlesoaflelleelq)’ Hol QM VFHHOW MUY GRY@o A0aMISIEl
GOW1HHOOMOIWT 3TV Ol@SHRF GMINAW" MIWals] GRYBEIHOEIN
IS1HRIMHHNIOMIEMN”  @RGZa00. D@WANQYAB  CHUDOOD @103
QIBYHLINGHIOMIW, alSldhallBINENIOMIW TV laHlem MU BROTWo..
@@BAUN®I0:@ G3QITVIo GNIIBWITE alS1dh@o®] alleonom1Gieals 29

ald@599So  LIMMIENIOOWo  alSlHAIdY  ANRIVOTHIGMIMM” BIOBWo

MOA1EH0M@ MO  AVAHHIBIM”  AVIWafIgMs.  6302flad GBIV



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
178
GenI0BW1@3 14 151320 QB BHIIEM” DG 03
uooam”loes)omocxm%@g@". SO\ W1@3 aB® MVoMNIM DI
DEBOMOWIT Al lAI®HE00W1S88, TVIGady MSOHAISE)HUd MSTMID
@RYABHNITM” HY1QH? @RI’ allemoow] R  cHO8OMOAI
DSDoldhd  KRMIWlad®y  AMeMT AVBHNIAB. o JHIW  HILIHOD
@RE1ITVLGMNIOWM  ©2IQPHBHINE” QAGBo MIBHSEIT3 DBLRILINIW  TVIYaOY
NSO ISL]DHUD @on@m’laoeaom" CHUOBBBo  BRDECA VLIS
NJA IMEBROSWOHALI00 2MQEAIME] (@JCWIRM SOOI
@RYAIWINIY  MSHAISLIHSBIN  BHASOMIGI  MSMVHIMEIV]HB3M D).
3UMMMIWIVICRIPSB  2JAIS” QIY) af)TMINEMAN” Cald312J0@3 DOm0
MIAVIBo, ALV@IHNBINGERUT  @HANMHWAN. 2lAHHMIQ o, .
Ga00eM@IMY” BA1INM  (@Jalydallaflgns. MDD AVASHIB  ©2IQYINDo
@OD@MOHMDINM. AMaH MOV AHBMIBO®] aflvolPaVle:ges allvaldrvoe
MoOBAHUIHNIM  af)Lld  RME@BOSQYo  BRMILIEBBSIG G ldHIOMAIB®O

aISS1HGIC  CaldHIOMAITBo  ERAINOOWEIIe  BREMIMIECMOBI6Ns”

oﬂcmomﬂoeaggas aflyo10avo MVoQ MU BH)IM BB NSO ISL]HHBIM”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
179

BHOSOM 16l NS a IhH 2MIWlal®m) AaMeMm] MVABHNIA
MSOM10HMEIBIEBM@®. AUGBo MIBHGS1EJo DD MSHAIST DSGBHGOAM
9.21QOOMOSS @O0 OMI@  ®BHHATOLIAM”  alOaUm eI
@RAINVIMTa [I86aD.

Uyl all. af)anv. MY lo@®3 2JA®EING SO VWD (@ )hI0o

@l. . 21BEUAIEMM: VB, MVMI HG]l 016 [08S" §21Q) (@JGHI0)SS

2021-0e1 ea0g esaivlo 0l@sHnd emndw” (eesuml) miad aflengo
@RC® UM HMJIQOS aldlVemmMY” GrOEeMmeaa 2 (enfl) mmId
C_RUILM] aMI3 BRAIM@a [lasam.

24-12-2016-@3  af)@3.all.af)al. aVAHHI@ MIEWIWa] GmMIdB”
BRWIHHIVBAQEUIHAINM G3OIMNVIo  GENIDBAW” cﬂ@g"&c@“ MSalSladud
@1R)Y0oE1a|O). o’]@%g"@o%omﬂ MINWOIS HO0IEBRGo  BREOADSGIM’
M1HAls]  MSalSle:aniem”  Dafllos  MIaOMIMeals  GRoWIEBUY
N30,  23GIMIBTMeaS, GRAICN ANBIVON]B3NQ|SWIBEUY
@D D 1af, alSlHR0®] AlBIVOMIMNAISAIB DUIRA NS CHU@6EBS1@3

QI HNIVIHHQo BRAUODINMG aBQ0je QALY HBMNHBIW] NIQHHWV0



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
180
9alQ) (MN2a0.210AU3R |OS MBIV D) eNM VMAROM 12106 .
MNIQONIM]S @D MDD MM BRAUGTe{l]aE:06ME" af)EI0AIBHB0E:S]
aldaVIBNI0 o)A M1BE3Ud0 Ola|CGa]dUd Hald@ON® BT TVANIOWAMROW]
af)aMmIem” HBO Q. Wl af) M. af). omelasan’
MVoMIA] 2| DTOME@WSBIMIM” M908 2132|PBB  BRAINVOYMNBIV®) .
G3QIMIo o’l@%g‘@o@’ GMNIAWRROWT  MNINWeQlS  (@JAUBEMEBBGo
aJNAMIVWAMo  DUBNAOSWYBB  HI0QY6EBUIL” m@m’l@’lggg 0al0lW
GRARVMIWIEIM’ 20100 enfefod chae)cﬂgm"lcm%@@@‘i
@R 6B3LMINVAYSAIM” B6SO0 MSalSIHEMIWV]  YBAMMIZ EaldRHOd
TMUAHNIAIM”  MVIWaflgMs.  G3AUMVIo  GNDAWB:BOS  2101@OD @I
@CO D af,  @BAUN®IoB/ 932l melnIdd/ WmaIQYR/@&S03noeMId: jo
@SBRI @RI GAAIMVIo  GININAWRDSOS  HIOIPAgOMIas, 1949
B0g&S1wIam” @IBA®0:@ G3AITVIo  GINIIBW (@Balld:@]4]0®E1G3
1950-@3 odoaflo 1997-03 wma@@o @paITvomoe  2008-gmoem”

DeIMIN3 GBAITVIo GMIIBW (Ballg®NIV®. BRDEOMIME” Sl GRAIMVIo

GENUIBRHBOS (@JOIBODMEBBOBLIN0 al016UIWIHBEMINUT



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
181
V10EAMNHMIWo o”lt.%g“@a%omfl NINWeS flaHW63BUI
2182|921QRa|GEMI0UWE UYL af)o. QIREUNIaIRIMo Ul ofM. af).
OME[OBMMo  NLINIDA  GORILIYES  (@JEMYBHDHOBH301a] TRallofla).
@J1S1a"  BEEMOMIM  H1F1JIN0WI@BaN (BJGBUHnMM M1elWw1ed
MIY®IVIWOSWo  PIRISHMIBOSWo af)Lldo  BRWIMN@WI1EIM20W @M
@JE3ULOD]HMF EHU@EBSR0W] MIMWOR]S G@1RY210068BB0 BRAVAYIMEBBSo
@aflos  MaImIIMEA MBI 86300  (@JWIEBaMEM”  @afles
aJNE13H06M 2 |®. ERO@IMVo BRYAIBOMIEHNMS HIVYAILL. aleHU AOQLI0
GB3AIVIo  GMNIIAARGHNBGAIIOLI  TVIMIOMIEG:  GUHIGWI 01@56)038”
GENINAAW” QIMBEMINYS8 MWAMEBBUY MSOMIMSS BRAITLNCWI ALIMINQ
GRAIMNJo eeniodawlmlel af)Om WILNIAB@N Y0 M3
@R 1eEnME®mII0Imo. 2008-@3 gd a@] @l =] AYWIHHOM
G3QIMVIo GMIAW~  A@IIVI@GBAN  GHILICLISODILNaN  ARIMNIOA@
G3QIMVIo  GMIAW @afldh@laj®. &Yl ofllemMoow] aVAHHIGIMI,

G3QIMVIo GMNIIBWINAG aJa®El Qla01a[lBaM MIa0MIMNalg AM a@1 UY].

*Shoa 1883 MEO@30d GBAIVlo eenIoBAWlemM KGO



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
182
AN |SODAMBCAIMET  HHIMNZAUIM MIBG3UWl,] M@ DUdealeS
af)Ll0 MW IENIW MSalSldg8o 2RO @16 2 j810)0
(@JOIGWINTHRIGHIM  HFIWITM BOAUTVD DENZIWIFENE”.  af)BBOHMWIEM
@) @RODIM’  al0la0IRMNRISNIMW  HYIWH  af) MDD @13 .2]WIWQ0
NANBORMY" AUGBo MIBSHSIM3 BRYGLN2EBHOMBIG  AflaHVAIEM™ af)am’

D VBAROMIA3 My.allo (1063506,

aflaf” aflaf’ (GAWI. o). BWEIR):aVA, @PR" MM GIGBAIGo:d

GBQAUTVIo GNIAWIN af)Eld CAHHU@EBBBo AUSHOGWHO TLAUMMARINEMAT
(@BalO®IG3  MVoMVIBTABIMNIG3  Hal0l®  oallddme. VLIBT3
1,400- &980 GouM@EBWE @I@al®Iosd@  GBAITVIe  GMIIGWIHNT
D 191eJeNE. Ma0I801aldHo CAU@OBBBOSVo AUGBAIMo OO0 G006 .
(OMIAIRE!I GaldOLIQYSS (JWIMOQ]S CAHUDEEBBNS AUBAIMo HHIENBIEM”
LNIBONOD @3 2Q CAU@EBRE1OLI HOBMoB1M (JAUBMMEBBU GRAIANV o
GENIOBAW” QYBMIOG OBIMNZEAIIB:AN®. 16-20 @™ wosnidiael avlavend
@1R)Y0oR1HHIMBB  AOANIBHH6B3UI «;@@oeﬂ% S0,  MNIaONIMSl

DAYIQRS ENYDIOMIAZ MEJoalnio 25,000 -comoge cemRMEIBOS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
183
WoeNIO10LI1G3 @JCAUWIa[lEBMDUIN A |HSVSS @ﬂ@ommgomﬂ
WAIIMOAAY  QEMIIg  Caldd:HWINM.  VMICIRRIVIOAI  alOMIEIN®
HINMadDVIEHSWo  BHMRMEBBUY  ON200Jo. M1B2JWIQo MM

@JOQINYo  BAMERMEBBBHS  TLIMMTWLoHHHMNE" MIRYOS  CHHU@EBBUIHS”

S0  AMZAUGNHINILINIW]  2MBIVOHHINEIWBAN  NYEUIRSHU 3@

al0lwloen al01a0O1H6IM HY1Q)o. A 1GhU D 1@BAN®I08:0
CHHUO)BBOBHBONa] A lOQEMUIUY 8@ dTLVMUMNIV  CHUDBBBOS
D@D @3 WIREM  alflGalogo OMBIG:MNVME. @RO) oacﬁaaﬁgocqgo

NATYHLIAMIEM” AMINY @REBEWIS” MY alla 18900 BRYWOla D).

@) . 21BewaIem: avd, 1250-a8 @rwWleo coHU@EBsss

®IBON®I0gB@ E3AIMVIe  GMNIAWINM H1YIE Q8o  MLIPWIMASS

CHU@HAMN” a 1oM@Y’ wenioloel, 0 21515:863130, a0@1a 0S’
®S6eER1WAIWI6aM. DG 1DL|BSB &HO0  (@JWIMA]S CHHU@63BUI
HIMOAMMBBO®IF2J0®3, AQ"  af)Lld CHU@DEBBBo  BTBGAOE

cmcmcmoa)m)mw@uzﬂgd@ce)omg% MIM  alO® . af)MNIBI GdhAILlo

@GEMBY  QEIMI  CHH@EBO8IFIa 1250, 1300-a3080 cou@Bsss



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
184
ORINING  GORILIQAIW] @g’lgﬂ GMIBSBEMINUY  @RAINHS MINAI(B)NIW
mLPWIMAB8  BGANI,  OGMNRI  CAHUOMBOHB  HIEMIMW  HYI1.
@RDMIGMSNIWT  ONalHa|SDo  QAUBOHO  CMAOOD @A, 1949
SHIRILISODHIOLIND alOa0MIB BR@IOHM JEDYH® DAY OlalmedW]
(@Jedallosan@laogmi; G080 (@3alo O HIBSM®1MAYMI’
BaflH01890q|930@  63AINVIo  GMINAAW”™ af)am  Mlelwleje @13
(@JAUGDDONHIM” BR@1HBMIV (@JEDJHDHBo CAMB:Bo DBBDOIENZo
@ODHR0JHS]  AVMIANAINMAD  BRAANONTD  af)FOMIT AN 1WIBs0.
af)aMI@  BROAWT @S] 2JEMIBBEMIIUD 2Q8BOI @IODERYM  AUIBOO
RAMNILINIEM” af)M@IEM” BRD® 1O @JEDYHD®. MANUT HIGEMENE HI0 Yo
OO0 CAU@EBBBRWVW]  MITWOQ]S al*® IBI:8o GP®1e]
MSalSl@asEBgo  aloleuowlesemiord  ®I@all®mlegd  caalrlwlsel
Q3§80 IEMIW  QEINIBHNIAUVN, GHICBBRHUD,  AVBBHUD
OU3NaOSYBBO®LI00  GBAIMNVIe  GMIDBWINMW  H19¥1MB ®OMMVSS

MVIa02lQYAMES. EROMIMMo afleiGa|dUd 2OQANOSWo &HIEMIM KhHr¥lwilel.

DH0a[l01@3 2llRICaJ0Ud BBANI EGMEI CHICBRMHESBI TMVoNWIMEBBESI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
185
HIEMIMB  HYIQo.  af)MI®  BR®EI DRININAE  GRAITVIERS
MoMINWI4{ISEOMIBo BRANZHAD (JEDIBHD® S1 HOOJOMI@ OlSOANG
GNINBWRAMIWT NINWAlS AlaHWEBUE  @RYGERIJANABEMIIUD 01@56)038”
€eNINBAW1HN3 MVoWIMOBIGLIGS ERANFHOD MTVWAMo DUIN. |PSVBS
00463303 QIEMOAH; @3 MIamM13MM6Mo @6aM
BRMTANOIMIWITISBIM af)OIMI@ (@JEDYHOWAMNE.  aBQ0lo ald0Iea g
AYBHBOS BB  (@JE300H2MM  OIWIVWIGE S1  cReILIYIG  (@JUYesBUd
MeIMmI@WHBON  MVIa0al0yOAm  Mlelwlelo @ROMQ0  HID63BUI
a1lNMIBNNIBSMEDME”  a)ANDIN” o) M1HBH  BRAHIOLOMG3
oJNE1HIMHNIMBB®. QAUSHO 2] @@gce;uﬁ QO(@@I6M” @RS
GRAIMV IO 103 1918|880 @RallesYass CAU@6BBG1OLILI0
SAY1N0006M" 300 6BBU OOV H2IQIN®. ERAIGBOS OOBHS1GI
adlosan 1250, 1300 &80 a@an cHUE@EBSIG3 BGANI OGN0
CalpZOD) al0WIM HE1IQYIN CAHU@DBBUY 312003 AOQLI0@HAN AUSHO

BOMTVNIW @aIMuNWI1e1dem. @alles WIANHNIBHS @sedl

OHISHNIMBalILlo  HFIWIOD (MNV2a0.210AIMBB®). o’l@g"aqg”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
186
G6NIDAARYAIW] aumns)(ag’lggg 300463803 AIA1HWo ®SBRO6MoO
DUNASYBB  HIOLEEBUT @RYGRINANSBEMINWG @R  caelriwlsel
(@JUQ6eBBU3gsS] oJ(o%om(eoe@ma@ocrm%o DI CH @R HIME’
@R@IMININNI©  OTDIWILI8s @QYCLID2IMB®:Bo  BRDEAIOLIGOAT
Mwam1daI6Mo DU |OSVBS 00} 68BG0 MABHHIA1HN3
@RYGCLIN2INWILJMEBIHEMo af)AMIEM oJNE1HIAMIANIMBB®. ALIMIIGTGI
Mlanss3 @RYBIWDE)HIENS” @) (@Je3UOm1903 @JBDY DO
aJNE1H06M1H900®  MIBQIa0AEL.  aBQ0Jo  @JWIMSals @RI
0f)eRGO8o0 Q@AM GHOLIWIA]HGBo @19 210MVNIM TV @Bo
DU |ASWBBNIAB  CAHU@EBSIAME.  @RAAB  HQ)hsSlejo  @2l0lW
CAU@EBBBOSWVY0 @'omoeaocro’loea@o@nggz @RYBHB6IN . @RAIASH AN’
cdmalelo 1400, 1600 @Gal BN ©alBaUMB DHWIEN™  MTIS:AND).
29Q0MMo  ERAIBHS” MV  EHU@BBEICIMIMo  LISlasIM1el.  ERAIRBOS
@RORIVA®  ANUIPIVEDIOM  @RSINOIMODIT  af)Eld  GHI0LEBBo

M6EBBBIT3 M1BQaO1BHHMBMINEMAN  WIVEMEWINS HYHON1HAFDIW

a0 20MOAEBIGIEEBo AROQYITVOB®HIME  BRAIC  (JAUBCIHMo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
187
MSODHWIEM . WIANTHHIOMo  HPHOJo @’osbd@gloe@omogua@cas)s
QIGaM R10IMeH08 MM  GRILl  H21QMOeMEE;1Eje  GRAIGHS
@RIV  TVDHHOYEBRSILINOD  GROAINLOWENE.  GPMIMIG  BRAINO
MoMITNW1 2 fISEGO™MIs30, OEeININA  GRAIMVI0  GMIDABAIM™  MVABHHIAB
M@SAD  (YIAFIGIMIANIM” MIVA@NIW  ATDIWI@  HANLISHOMITD
MINY® AUBAIMABS CHU@BBRS1LIBBAIBHH VOMIBo MBIGHAND . MAIHS
MAHD MIURW] 2 |DCa I0LI8S aJ®1®  MIBaIGlaHEeMAjo  BRG@IOHM
@SB3 msmsW&g@%OO @mocm%@meeﬂe[;o sl coaueiwleel
210INANIOHO  MoMIMWa[ISGO™MIBo @R®  @GRAUABHY  eISlasam
MVIa0al0lo  eN2oNIglel HOMO0  AVIaN2IQJOMIT  ANVPaOODIREAI
(@JWOIMVEEBBMEAINAISAN  BMHILIWINV]HUI,  @RAIGIGAJIUWE g aDIM’
921QIMEODAMVALIM.....,  GHIAUIAW’ GalIHLIYSS Na0IBIAT MISIENNOH:
allSloqojs®mlom @SN’ HOBAUOH:S AGANIONAIEBUE MSHANIDWIW],
QAUOMISH:LI0  HOBAUOBS MEN®IV]. 2HQIEZH0  HOBAUTLNIMEBBST[@I

MSEHNENE  2ISEBRMHBo al@laldSldh@8o MEINMIV]. 8@Baldg PAOV]HS6S

CHU@@BUE  QAOM]HUY OHFIWISIHANDISIAD  MVIa0.21Q|R)NSIW].



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
188
GHIRILIN]H:BOVIF88  @RYBHUd  aflallw  (VYBIWEB1GINA]SISSS
@YBDHOS  MoMITWIa[ISEGEMIBo  BRAIG  BDEa]OUd DQalel  OODHOM:IG
aleM]&HOBFHNIM0 HalW1ads1Hndamoe MMM H@IFILN@ aBBHa|SI000
HEl aJOSHIMo 2SS af)SANIMONINAN  Galdd:aN (@R8I
DMOW §M6BBUNIYT MAYHBHIEMIM HY1QYAMN D). @RGEA|IU3 BROMWo BRYBHOS
MoNINWIa[ISEGOmIBo  OLININA E3AITVIo GMINBWINA3 BRWINM®©I©S
QAN (@JEBUIEBREINLI @JUIEBBUISH  @IMTA VVEAIMONIW ©1M]1W1©3
MBBHIBTOMG (JEDJHNIW alBIVEMM QIGOMEDME. ERMIMINIVDYNIW
m1@m1(80anamoe@o1gdgs"l 2D 1CHHMNZ®HENEM00 S1 TVMBABOM 13

MYallo {loBd: MO@MIEM” EMIMD 6)21QAND®.

Wl.  all. ML VB, ODIafl-DIBBAIMIo:B-0eImIdad

GBAINMVIBBROS &H1Y1IEIS8 GHUDEBBBOS EREHINEGBEIT  ABO®Es]Ejo
QARM  afl®  (@JTUOIMEBBNS  @YWWIBLOAVER A ldlU]lLIMEAd
MSHBAM®IW] @@@1@@(551%@61@0? CAUO@EBO8  AuoIoIVOm1H03
Cal0l@ 03yl  A®ELIGIMN  @OISHHNIV]  DalEWIWN]SBMND

YORLYI@O|SIgME. alel LRI o @R®  MVoLIBHOD 1M’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
189

DSWOWIgAME.  (@JEDMYlaf @cﬁcﬁ Zelwloel  afeld  (@JwIm
caH@6BBEEjo aflel a1 TVPLISME:EHS, QAIRMEJTVOIMEBBBOS
@IRYWWIBLOMVEBBBUINAINS MSAMAUGBIMN®IW] YORLW1Me SIS
@JCD® Do) @@;ogm%m’l@el W1EB@oMIHNINT, BT  OAVHASBRIA
MOSNVIMBAM,  CHOBSONMIOMWWo BWalGHH DAMIQWOSWo  BIaY1W
2101(@ @13 MMV MuIWIMo alejJO1I@aM,
COBNWHIFUINOS B3 (@JC a1 Mo LISMQYS
960N [1S1016RIYHHNIDERM@OVT  @REBYHS  UBRLOIMINA SISEMNEI;

OHMREID3 BRDMNOM aFO®Es]1Ljo MOOMIB3 MSWING MIWIHBENI?

Wl M. 2I@BEUWAINAY: VA, GCAU@EBBUI OLNIANODIDI

@RYOIWMPEAUMNEIWBB®IM.  BRYOIWMILIVEEBUY af)a» O1®IW]eIem”
CAUO)BROS 3HIBEMENBD®o @R®1OM )21 3HILI0Mo
D0lEWIN ] 5JOdMEIBINDo.  af)aMI@  MI2OAIMIMIVW  @RoWo  MAIeS
oJNEIHNIM o |DCaIOL]  CHHU@ITHIMEBBHS  Qlellw @@@gwﬁmoe@ooe@”l
MIQIMSS MSalSldhud MV HO1HBB3H Qo VoW al@1a10S18Ud

MVoceISla [las:hQo .21Q)aM (MNV2a0.210 463303 alRlGa 0o



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
190
Qmomfl%gg@o«»’l MASHOTWINJANDIGM . @ROMO0 M1 H6) O
@MSCWED®MES. @P@IMIV] |MNMH1W  MSHAIST3  @RYAUUD A6,
BRANHIOJOMI03 NVABHHIVTONM JEDYD UYRLAQENRIH:EMo.  BRMIMEAIMNS
MSalSldha8no]  MVAHHIB QPEAMISEAIG:ORMIT (O 1HH]IIBMD®.
@ROMO0  (@JEMIH MLORIYOMBAN MAIOS oJnElondemls] MeIW1@d
HOMoMITWa) BGRWIGH@@BOHS BOWADMIAN” MSaISIQMEBIB:AAN” 6IHID

HGBDHWIGTN. DDAV MITWRG SFMB3 $HI0YBBU alOWIA GHINT

©63ulasamlel

DEINDA@  GBAITVIo  GMINABWING  JAUBGDMo  B:0.9J&sS]
OD2JO]g@EMo.  0lG3Hnad  GENDAAW”  MVolWIMo  MSejId6]
QEIMISEANO®INM LRIV PMRIWISB8  MIQEBBUD 24-12-2016-@3
0AIIMOAE Bol1H019H008 MIUIWTa| @MINBAW, ER®INAZ @PRWIB:000
oBOQIOMEUHO  (@JWIMSaIS HIOYEBU alfi®o MSaldde]ae¥lan).
@103 BINAW] 2518 Gal@ulagisan 00&;” eﬂqj\%oe)ua ®QIIBBH QYo
1082  Galds®” mMomMeEBWd MaBSBHQoe 47 00wy eﬂq)\(goe;uﬁ

(@JV1RV 101886 Q0 69 @M 1HHU3  ANDEMIaiMo 021QHWo  HalQ.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
191
DHNIOYEBROBLI00 MV HOLIPLISOMITE 621003 cmow’l%ie;)mcm
0&seng" GBI JEDIBHMES] ofNE1BHIEM2JO06ME"  af)ed

QBB HUB @RAINVIM T [lasam.

alSIHRI®-alS1HAIdY,  allMIsHalledw Gsua - GBAIMVIo

Qo |2 (WD), O, IWIRHHM): VA, GBAUMVI0 OlGSHRF GenIoBW”

(eeBL®1) MM 2lB2|VOBHFOD  TVMBAROMIG  6MOM  Myaflafla)
$HOQYEBRUMHMM BRYAUAOMICHNMEIQAUBHWIGN. @l  of)M.  af).
omellasame @l AVMlaH&HN0B 62R0MVaRo  MIOIGHOM@JEAWo
@RAI®O1a [laf MVoMVI@] 2. (elol (M Ol&senag’ (JpIIGILVIN
@101 NSS so3awlmaday” MO QD@ 2014-ej0
@O®MIVE8s M@ aqISI®”  2015-g@osem’ oM@  oango
Q. Wl.af)a0:-003 HILIMIGIN QETOF @) enfelnauel )’
@QYOoUNEBRBIGM” o’l@g”s)(@“ eI Ie)MRIRI@BaN®@. 32 mavendelo
@AId @MIABWIONM BOeMo MSO®]. @l AVMIaHSHAE E2RITVal
0lGseng  GMIEW 6@ eQI8Ss0MWIVT  2019VWAN” Al

QY@ EROIWICMDHOHITNBIGEMIHWAN”  aMlseclwlel. 32



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
192
MOAVHNIEI0  G3AUMVIo  Ol@sonag” GmIdWlen ojamel  MI1BQJasla)
@QYO0oEBBRUS B@ QIYSMIOWEeIEJ0 013" H2IQIMITBAN@IGEMI BREGI
u§1oe;a0@1/u§1ce>m(8c{n)m1@8m1m° B0onQjo aAIMI® aflleovomlaimian’
800N0JAUINAIS JANoWEBBBIGH] 2JBHO], @PAAR Galdam” 1082 6alo®
M2 |®ICMI  HAISIM? M®IG HAUSBIM  @RYOINEMANVO  BRD
@BRYDMOS HILICLISOMILINHMIMBBDo 2a[lAM1HNEMo. BRDCaIIHE] MANHS
odBY1H@MMNRIBHT® Moo  MIRINIBOMEMOAIN” Ul af)@. af).
omellasan al06101), MEWI1©3 (@JVow QOO
MSOMIMECAUMEIMHHAMWIEM” @RG3a00 1B2IM ] 2[101H830N D).
0dBQ[lHM@MNRIHHI®  MEI  TLoVIVEEBOBLI0  MABY  MILINIGOmIo.
a)MI@ odBQldH@NBIGHI®  aflel MVoMVOEEBZME,  MANSE
eH08qa{loal 3l OMAOQYAE  AVMIPWa0  avaeolead  90-oo
QBaH1BH0jo MANUT @RYEENH]2). af)BIMIEN” DGBANYE TV@LOWa0o
@Yo 2! 2dBQ[lh@ENZ0H 1 aflel @19 2100019

@M 210AOMINMRQo  aneIMWIEM” 1931-68  wmAPQAE AVGIIW0o

MSCOMENEIQIM®. MAMIM 3LV VIO JODIHAG BIVAIW]T MSM



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
193
B33 @JBDO SHoelepigom1elnem’ O@AYA V@ YI(Pa0o
MSCOMMEIAUMD.  Aa0IMIW .  CHBo|XR]IQo  af). 0. 2].-Qo
all. @aHalI88Q AMMOD A lCDMICMASHNABBAAQ A lDEHFODORHINE”
MSoOm 1w @) VAo 0af) 10000V H0IW MVAEAIWI@BaN.
2B 1H@BMBIHHTW @19 21006836)BVYo @RMI210063B6)BWVYo
o) D1BADOHIMNB6M” @BRAN” MVAQ0  HAlYPD. algldso  afalPoGaldLo
MSHN00JAN  AIFIVIEINS  AMaHIM™ MSHHIAB 2 lQOO®  TVIa0aIO o
QAMEao9oem” 1924-@3  9oaIsHo  TVMIPWado MSOHIVD®. G@R®o
oJ3QlH@MN20HH1QW BT @RMI2NENIWIMAN.  G@RGIOHNQo  MAYHS
eloogileasnenglaino. @D HIMBI6M” Qlle) A 106 O),
adBQ[lH@MNRISHIVWO®EII0  MAYHH TVI1HA1EHIM  HYlwlel.  allei®”
TUflH01EH0. DMESBMRB® MBBHDOAN 621Q6IMo. GBAUMVIo o‘l@g“@qg"
GENIDAAW” enfeflod M clelflo]! OHHIMNZAUM 1O
DGRUDYLISHHATNINNAN’ DG 0ud af)L100I8H0

AMAV1LNW]EHINMOAAN” aNIMW HMBD@AN. MG  HAUSBIMGHSISNIMEN,

BBBDHILIOD CAHU@OMIGLID CAHU@ITHEMEBBRSICLID (@ JGAIVDMALID@ @AM
[QV)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
194
CHOBOMIOL! aldQeqls 01}  ABINONIMHRISAUNO  BAHUDEBBIOS
BRHEOM Yo CAUO) BeMOMIGLIYo dHI6NZNQUIMIM0
@19 21000MaYIMEBBUT  GRAIGIGAIY”  HBGIMZAUCIMAYBS  (YYARIMI®.
@@ B 44 aIgl®HRIM-algl:aldy)  ANBIVEMI@eA S0ID

CHU@@BSIORI aJR0C1HBOWT  mI0], @M1IHM 0 21Q@IW]

oe)oczmm@’l%. MY CRRLMT HHIMZAUMD  AVYOAHIREAI al00I®als,

21030010 BHA1HON ]S AYBHBOS @3@30 |0y 0ssS]
Mo AU HHIMBEAIMNE1WIeM” o)’ Myallo{laB3Hoem.
DY 63BOBHB0 o] MVoMLIRTHHING IO @RY@Waslasaniel.
GHOBOM1HEI CHH(@EBBSHSWVY0 GRAIMV]o csauo@algoe;gge)smgo

$IQYBROBLII0 MNIaOAIMOQ]S BROWEEBUD 2JeNETHHIOMTH63HVENBOW].

@) &H=QCHNIST HMOYIMW: VB, CHOBOMIHL!I @RYNIWIPOMIGLINO

ABAN  CAHORIAUNSNIOIBE o lGAMISHANRINEGBBUIH 316563
@RBaOMIW alghdB1Omo H1S1VISIOLIM ERYEHHUalo MILINTBISBMVMNE.
@R® MIHO®MIMo  BRDIM  HIVEMHNIVIWAUMNMRELIM3  BRAUMNS

Cal@1@d MSalsl MU dh01H9I000 DQYINIB:GAI?



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
195

W . QIWIRHM: VA, @R MM aflaHWo &Y

@JoQIdo  aJNElBNIeM1a)Gaoldameaam eI O@IM 2QalS]
alOaO@®IEM . G3AIMNVlo (ﬂ@g"&(@” e’ aI¥l  Mmlwamo
MSO@MEMINUY 630G ANBIVAMIMo &1BgME OlTVAGEAUHM MDIHINBS
R0 MSODMIVIZME. BRDEEIENBI6M’ af) V. ./ ag)av’s). aNcdwamIm”
12 vommomaje woeal alcowaIm” 17 wuoaomaje  ag"  aflleamoss
QOO @O 5AUBHS” 6 V®MIMOJo  TVOIMUBH]BHAIW]  alEGANIBHO
M@BBBAN PEMIGH ANBIVOM@RalgAUBH” 10 vom@IMAYo TVoQIGEMO
DD ISHNIM HE1M® . 2RI 1alondW] aNIG3 MI@AEBMAGSS K21al®o
QAUBHO  FOIMaBEIPRINEMAN” af)EId NIAOAIMOQ]S BRoWEBRBo MAfleS
al061010). @RAINOY0 MVa0IW1HHIMY @E’]@ombzﬂgm". B AlRINOHTIMWo

O8S1HHBWOME, o) [eaWlclefol feti 2Te ) MIMB6MUo SERENEY QDI )

QEAMIZEA BN D).

W), Q609981 HMIYIM: ....(00088 Bdan)......

(). Od.  0IWIGHHM: @™ DSERIVISEEIQSS. @R®1ea3

MIOHD GRIDY al@1BUIW]al” alldM1S” @R® al@ladB1HHIMBB S0 IS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
196
MSO®IMW  &HE1Qo.  G3AUIMVIo  0lGSHNAF  GMIOBWIE  BRoWEEBEIW]
QABMABRHD o JNAMIWAMo M@IHIMION OV MG HGHIMZAUNND).
@@  @RMIANOINIVWDOHRHIME6M MY MG  OHHHIMNFAUAIMSH
SO IS8 MSOMIV®.  EGRAUMVIONINA (@JAUIBODMEBBUB MVoMINWI af;
v 0VQje  @RYaldONo  MVOAMHILBAM  HIQJOMIT@  2f)GAMI  B:00T
MoRA(& aJaM” enailes Myalla [l68HQM20W], mlelnlle|ss
@1212QIMHOMEBBUIEHNI QiU 100VEBRUIBHNI BH050MZAM B33

fDSAaISEjo HD NAIIMIHAAFIHG BINODMIMMVAYMIBH1HLIAN” DI TVEY”

Qonmoeaoe;@oan”.

DRININA  GRAINVINIMIWT  MINWHA|SIeM  BGSH0  BRYGCHHUAIGBIBUY

OWAMDAIOM @Y. @alles MVAWRIHWITB mleaalelnom®1oad
S:00Jpn2aM”  ayalla [lEsHQENs0W]. melnioad delollMw©lera

MR RO QID3 Mmoo ODIMIAUBM®IM” 0D waleNdenagd’
J@I2EDIMIRLAIOEMAN” MDD  GBEWM] MM BRAIGE]q{la]ed:06ms"
MoMIVNABMBAUSWIGIOMHAN MIM  alDOHIM.  @ROAINSEHO

210100900 alalw ®™5HE1eNV] @10l2{1SHmems8®” af)£lo0Idas0



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
197
@RO1WINIAM @M. eISlE8aM  AIGBAIMOMINA3  @RSINNIM O3
@RMILIEBRAS  MOo®IGlaf,  XRIAUMBNIBHS  DMNUBo  HHISAGAM
O1®1WIMMBB® . oMMV VOMIBo H1FIM BHY1VWEMONEHT TVAWRIW
QAIMNINAG GRAIMVIo MR HHIMZAURIN HEIWaMo. BRDGAINAL! VdMIS
al0laHOEMOOME301a)”  MAOS  MVoMVIBBEBEBQYM2IW]. De1eMId@
G3QIMVJo GMIdAWIeERI R1AMEHIBH al@DNE” AUBaUCOMIBNIW] OMIS
al@lay@emo MSa{lenen1I@BIMIEl. ). HSHHoals8s] MEOE@E3 E3AITVIo
mcﬁ;%l@wcn)ocm@m HFOm  VOIBEAZIOR  HORIO), 2021
9anE)aIdl 12-20 ®@lo®@] 0e1nNd 63aITVIe  R1OINGNIGBOS  VOMIS
o I01aHOEM OB TMEAUMEIQYSS DOMOOI aJ0eq |FOH8HQMNRBIW]. ag)aNI®I
@1 DOMOAUMMVO] 2]’ 0046333 & HIMZBaIIHIN3 aflel
MSAVEBBRMNZOWIBAN.  BRMIMEUAHAIEM  BRAIGOS NAUS aB1@HaHd
MSEOMMEIAUMD. @Y aflGHaHNM TVoMITW]a| OO aJ0Oq |50l af
Yleom). M AWl.af). MVoMNITWIa] @REMINE MIEIMIBIABAVMNE. BRO®Y

a0IMOMIV” Wlajodse2ad" ald1@uooWla|aIdle:@iem”. 2llEHIdQo BRFOIN

@YYEWI MM  AAVOHIGOMOHINEYWI  @REMIRLl  aldla0dlaf, 12



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
198
QAURHAIWT MSa [IRINGEHIGI@WAN ALINIIAG GBAIMNVIe GMIdIAWInAI EaInd
210INHEHIBABo  VOVMUB  al0laHOMOWIHNG BRYMZLIfo  LIBIAIHHINDSS
MSals] V1 @10630. @RE®INSIa oMM &SP
DHIFOODBHHIMNBB  MSHaIST  MEICAIISLI ms«smﬂmﬂ%mg". eNM
waleNdenagd’ @RWI1HH IO 1GIAUM D TAVEUdAHO)o 20 DS a U
WAIMOAag” BOIABIM  VMBAROMILjo  G3AITNVIo  GMNIIBWRGHOBWV0
@pAllsoOm  RT0MENINOQe MEIGA ORI MVa0IW]HBaN  MLlaldSoem”
QU ENGI EY (O @BRDEHHINBIEM’ M nAIMOAag”
@RW1BHI0OM@AUMEUato Aol @3AITVI0  GMNINAWGHUBHHIN 217
G»IS1IGWIBo @Bal @RMAIBISBANIMBB MSalSl VNGOl ®. 0G0
G3AUMVIo GMNIDBWDHUIABo @RAVAIGL] DHWHS HhMNAH MAlOSWNS.
®I@BAUIMIogE@ GBIV  GMIABWIeEl R1AUMEHIBHS  VdMIBOJo
alBaMMIW] a@de3wo 131.06 pid:tHo (@G0 lWIem” M@HIV® .. SIO®
2eImiod ea3alvle GaIAWIM” 58.98 cloMo @GalQo O®HIaflad GRAITVIo

GenRBWIM” 25 63951 BalQo @&:s@3moemldio ¢3aITuIOMIM’ 15 eleto

@olQ26m M@HIQD. @RDGaIOL]  MIaONIMHalS @RoUo M.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
199

21((BGUIEIDAND @) al00 MNIMIWAH30 BHILIWINV] H B30
WMAVaNIVWHODa|]] ayaila flafl@amn. @1 210QMVNIMTWABHE30

CHILIWIDTHUBEBABE 3:S1WPlD HHIFOD®IBSBMDTIMIW] BEIMBHIG3
CHIS] @al M@BHHQENZIW]. ERDEADOLIMHIN ERAIMNVIo GMNIIAWIHA]
MNFleI88  quoelEBud MAflGEIASM@IMIVW]T 8@  G?IS]  (@BalWo
BHMBHN @RYBIWMI MVDHAYHNIWABIM@ MBS MVIMIAD 1 MVaOIWOJo
M@3B:M6NE”, @WIMea]s  GAHUDEBBBOS  BO®IH  TVI0aIRY0
H02]0o]|SODIN@INS8S MVIMIAM 1 TVa0IWo M@ILINVME.  VOMICIAA
2OqNA@a 008 MSePEsM@IME8 AW AlRL®1hBo MSa{lLINEBaMMS.
MNI0NIMAals  oomId  HFleom  Blalve MSaM  vomIdInel
®1B@MNISMOIMIW] NINWeS o’lmé 1gloSIOomMa 9]
MYallo{lE83HQMBIW].  MIe0MIMe]s  QRI@I®HIM @R o’]mé
2191o1@ 2 lOBHSOWODHIME  VMIBINLIYOS  BODTH:  TVIa0aIO 0
D02]0o]|SODIMN®IMo AIBMNISMBH0Llo  BoW1WIWT MSEVAN@TNYBS
DSHAIST NSO HQMBIW]. DD AUBAHHAOD AHAAIBHH AGOIBVAINJo

®1B®MNISMAle  aB3Q0jo  BoWIWIWT MSOYIM@IMBB  MSHAISLINEM'



Uncorrected/Not for Publication

02.11.2021

200
MSOM 10 BHIME1D1HBIN D). @ Imiswlenem’  ailel SOQD)6BBUI
B30{l8n0M@  HEIQERIHVINBB  @RYCRINAIM  alel  quoerlEBglelo
MSAMAUBIN@.  MI2OAIMA]g @RoWo oll. NINRILIQ3D CHU@EBBB0
@RYOIWMILIVEBBBo  BHM1d:Ola] MSHBMM  aflel  (JAUCCHMEBOHS
MoNIAWla]”  aRallo 168HQMBIW].  B@  HO0MAIIRJe  MIRAS
@YDIWMILIVEIBHSB (@T@@gwgdmoe;@omﬂ ilolelele aloslel
af) MDD ®HANWIEM” MY NAIIMOAFIH Melalds. @RAMNOS W20V
MSEM@IMEI BHMAHH  MIMIMWIaIan” 3ABUdMo Mmsom]
Calo:0MN@ 1SS VDB AN BTBCANNSO). walendenag’
@M1 EAUMEIY8s DSHAISLIHBIM” MSODAN D). BHMHO
O®Q1RLOla [lessaN@1ME8 0lelw  UYNEBUY MSEMANVMS.  BHINIYWIV”
@RoUEBRRBSHHABBNIAD @R ®1012J01@eMOHAMMIEM” af)Mae’
A l0QIMBBO). 610000 MO  alOWIM »J206Mo, @oeaogam%lgcﬁ
CAU@OD]OM Q] @RGE3a0n106S oJeNE1H026M1H63H QNSO W].

@@;ogm%@ CARH@OMIHG AHIVMODINIWV] aBHG3Ud0 5 ea0s1 21

Eldto @l QMR alrL@IQA0WT MINLE]S MT:HQo BRI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
201
(@JAIBOMEBBUI MSAMNAURTHQAIM. BT BHIS] af)iMalM1OHWS LldHo
@l alellgla] @RANOS BT EREENINEWAHM HIVAZOTHAZ DOLHL(STI
(@JAUCODMEBBBROW] HYBANMIFEIG:MM MVMBAROMIGE el dlmlwleiSs
QQBEEBBMBIGHIMIEM” 2Ll UYalaj. @@;ogm%é ag)o.af)@3. af).

@l afl. Eyd. MMIBB:A0IM” BR@1OMa|]] MEIDEalIeLe!l @BROIWIo.

QRN af)an@” QYo  AVABIWEBBBESMINEMANVo @R GROIGOS

06)H W16 LIOM 1860006363 B33 al101a10S1WI6HEMAOo BRYBHOS
O®Q12L A0 {1H683H Qo ®0HHENSOB @RANSH O af)®am
@MSQMM@MD8Bs3 Uymo MSOD) QYo 9alQ. @REEROMH VLI

6)(6)%)1@0(01(51%6)0@:061@1(01@63@3@)0@‘1 BHMHOWV)o Qv 0V HH800

®I@HNLlld: a1l  eMSOHIMIVT  e®JleLAlq {lesM®1MEx

UDHDOOT 101 2]0161010)0 HH06NE" (@JOIBO®1H9I0D Mo
@QI0IHEMOANTVES] rgallo {loBHH@o6m". Qklen) @RYBLGO
yallo{la|@Calonel (MR GRUD Y BOMIFESTWIEN” M clelflo]
aoe;oarr:gmcrm%@@@”. @O~ caroommgmgomﬂ@m) GenIdBWleel

%

@0V AAONOW] 2]BABHQINMNSIV D). @RYO



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
202
@RoEERRMBOVIGBINEOUd 33 aIS1BHR0®/ a151Hh0IBNHNIOMEWI
8@ ANIMOVWEWI DUBAQISOMIM  cIMIWILL  JINoWEBBRBIVWEGA [0Ud
B0 AMNIMOWQo B@3 oJ§1ce>Qo«5ﬂ/oJ§%e)m(8c8 ANRIVOMIWINA|S BRYHBWo
DU3R|SOMOENIMN6M” 20]00) GeNIoBW” o JNMVoCLISTa ooy,
@O MM ENIIBAW’ OHABBIMB:BOS  MISE, MO MIOS
VPO IDRI  aldQINa|SAIBHB0  DEBIINIAMTNIHUWIAB0  @RYUDIIMNo

M @3N GENIDABAI6eM. BRD®EHHINZDHAN M enflod

a0V 1OMOMHAMN” @BRE §AMCHSBaT.

ol. afleed: 2021-ee1 emog  esaivle  Ol@sHaag @@’

(eeBL®1) ml@3 MvonITWla) BT, ag)o. MIREUNIAILIM BRAUGGa(la) 1

(o)) MMIB BV @IV’ 2IQIPEMED?

U, af)o. MIREWIAILIN: VA, IMIND (@JIV’ O21QaMIe).

o). ae9d: @), ag)o. PIRENIANLIN ERAMAlaflal 1 (ag) maud

GRBALM 1 MVBWYHS BRMAMICWINS alladaleila[lelasa.
W M. 2lBcWRIM, @RERWYS 2 (nfl)) mmId LM Jav”

@mgm@mo?



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
203

©D1. . 2IBEUIIOM: VG, AMIM (JTV ©2IQANIE.

o). aVlend: Wl. . 2l@cUoem ERAUMGIaflal 2 (enfl) maud

GRRVMI] MVRWYANS BRMAMICWIANS alladalellafldles.

Ve’ H01G1 01600856 21Q)000a88 2021-0e1 es0g esaITvIo
Ol@sohaag” emoduw” (eesu®l) Mol  aldlVaMMWHHNFEHEMSRAN
(@JCOWBE O

@RMBLNH6BMMAIA. . ...........
@®1elasamald.............
(@JGOo VR BRoWTBA12[lA1BB3aM, MBS AlBINAMNMW D BNFHEMD.

Q620 Oldsal

W . all. af). 22137 aVE, OMIMW IO  GRANM]

@RAIM@a [lasm.

156. @wom @rygleel aldaf S(1)-@3 "gan™ agmM@IN” aldoo " @oemi”
af)aM’ GalBHE3Hs.

W@ Odh. Odh. O VG, aMIM @INP|OQIN  CRRNMDIHHUI

@AM 1o [lasano.

159. ausmwo 2-@d 5(1)-@3 "@rea;" ag)an” aimanlsecmelns” @rg: " agam’”



161.

162.

214.

215.

223.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
204

GalB@HB3D.

alembo 2-@3 " @alBCHnmMRmIeM” af)dM@IM” aldh0o ''CalBHB3H:"
af)aM’ GalQ@H63H.

aleMbo 2 (@000 (aJwIm @RYHIT @al@HHINVERUINHBAN Aldsa |

5(6)-@3 "62103Ca1LIMICWI" ag)M®IMAYMai "0 alwB0oMmIcWI,"
af)aM AARBo afllaMOJo BalRHBH:.

QlEMbo 2 (@000 @JWIM @RERIGE ¢alBHHIM0E3URNE8M Ak 3(6)-603
o DININLMVI@ " @IO®IIBe" af MM’ aldho " eBO®I0IS"
af)aMn’ GalBH63Hs.

Mo 2 (@00 @JWIM BRI GalBHHIMEZUSBMM Ak (6)-0ad
GloDININWMRI@ " ©IO®I0IBo" MM’ GUdato ' HalWEMIM,
@RoWo a1 @Ng MNIMEEBEILNV" a1 QIEBHSo aflaMOjo
GalQH63d.

alaMWo (2) @Jd0o (@JWIM @RYEIT Gal@HHINVEZUTIHBAN Qldsa |’
5(6)-008 @laJmlnInwm@I@ " @RAOMIVIBIERM@E"  afM@IM0

ald0o " @RGa0MQSS®IVTRNESM@E!" af)aN” GalBH63D:.

GA). MOMY HPLOIMISM: VA, MIM MINPa|OQIN GRRNMIHU3

@RAIM @ o [lasm0.

164.

QMo 2  (@J00o  (@JWom @YK GalBSHINVEZWIABAN  Qldsal

5(6)-x3 "92103BBAILIMICWI  @ROUVAICWI" MM aldho
T

"@o@VN" af)M’ CalBHBDH.

207. augmwo 2 (@J&000 @WIM @RI EalAHNHIMEZWIHBAD Qldaf 5(6)

®36)¢® al0W)o (aJdhI0o O(Q))cﬁai



Uncorrected/Not for Publication

02.11.2021

205
“(6) 92103GaISTVEMOIW] M21E96a S 300030
1AM W1898|SI0JaM QI QINOH W3 HS” aewnow]

aJMAMWAMOHIM” @G0 DRG] H8M®IEN”.”

@l GRIMAV" GRIMVaN AVE, aMIM @INYA|OQYAN GRANMDIHUY

@RAIM@a [lasm.

160.

163.

193.

211

217.

Mo (2)-@3 " ®969a 0" ag)m@IM” aldko "®Mlajoan” agam”
GalQAB .

QIgMWo 2 (@Jd»d00 (@JWIM @YdRI@ GalBHHNIMEIUTIHBAD Qldsa ]
5(6)-@3 "©21036aILeMOGWI" af) MM’ aldh0o " 210BRIMICW"
af)aM’ GalBHE3Hs.

MW 2 (@000 @JWIM @BRYERIM CaldSHIMEZUBBBM Aldal 3(6)-@3
" 2200 1RSI 0N ald0o ' 0mMWBIEBM®EL"
af)aM’ GalQH63H.

QMU0 2 (@Jdhd00 (JWIM GRYERI@E  EaldHHIMEZWIABAD Aldsaf 3(6)-6a3
GlaJMlnINLMOIGE " @REJGHIYSS" af) @M’ ald0o "6 210GRIEMI
@RoUNENI BV AN’ BalBH3D:.

oMo (2) (@000 @JWIM BRI G2IBHHINEZUINABAN Qlda |’
5(6)-6a3 GlaJMlmInwmI@ """ aaN@IM aldoo "B@" ag)amn’

GalBHO63Ds.

Wl all. @RMIG3 20137 VA, aMIMB MINP|OWAN GRBUNMDIHUY

@AM 1o [lasano.

170.

QoMo 2 (@000 (@JWom @RI Gal@HHINVERUINHBAN Qldsq |



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
206
" 2 " 29
5(6)-@3 "Maleneals’  af)M@IM ald0o " MAEN6 SN

af)aM” G2lBHBH:.

172, auemwo 2 @000 (JWIM @RI GaldHHIMEZUNERMM Qldal 3(6) -@3
"8000309° MM ald:0o "AIYEMIBS”  af)an” GalBSBH.

191, auemwo 2 @000 @JWIm BRYE:1@ Gal@HNIMEZWIHBAN Aldia 5(6)-@d
" 920 1B1ABM®ITM™ 2NN aldh0o " DMRIVIGIHBMDo"  ag)an”
GalQHBH.

212, auemuo 2 @200 @JWIM @RYZI@ G2l3HHIMEZWSBMM Ak 3(6)-0ad
o VNINWMVI@ " @REJHICYBS WIH®IVIBo" MM ald:0o

" @R(J$000 MOAIDMIGMM VWIO®ICIBo" af)In’ GBS .

ol. aleed: 157, 158 agam1 mmid eew®&ud 156-00 mmud

eRBLMIARo 192-00 mMIB 3L 193-20 MmMIB cREVLIH8o 198
a3 206 awowss 6e3u®:hud 207-00 mmId e oge 216-20

mnd 63wl 217-%0  maud  6eRLMIEse  @ENMIVGIMIGI

@RAIMOq {leanmzmIel. NIaOMIMa g @] GRBVWM 13U
QT ENO Pl T clol
aIS1H R0 T-aIS1H0IBY, N | [epplelsilol|[cheldp GAUA-GBQIMVJo

Qo |2 QD] (). . ©IWIGHHMB): aVB, IO Od. . O

@RAIMGa{la] 159-00 maud 6_EVL®T AVNGE1EBMD. VMG GBS



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
207

016qJ033" 921Q@IMEUaHo ©21010WIT allvod:” AlaMIgens, "@@@g‘” ag)am”
" [S]} o o o
QAUBINISOHODEI0 @RS af)IMIEM” BalBBHNMED®). AQ  CGRRNM1HOBITo

cmﬂoe)(o%e@mﬂ%.

0. W93 WA O Od:. 00 @RAUMOIafla) 159-00 mauad

GRBLM T VB BRoU1h014[1d1H63aTM.

W O all. af). 213" ERAU®Aa{la) 156-00 MmMUB ceB3V®] aqULE
MOIHO] 2[l01H630M.

WD O, Od. On ERAUMGa(la) 161, 162, 214, 215, 223 agam’
MMIB GBBLMIHHU3 MR MBI 0 12{1G1H60M0.

GWI. M0@Y HeOEMISW @ROIMNGIa{la) 164, 207 agam mauad
GRBLM 1K U3 MR MAIBA] 2[1@1HEB3M0.

@l 6aMaV" eRoMvad @RA®IGIA{ls] 160, 163, 193, 211,
217 agyom1 mmiIB cRARLMIHHUI VR MEIH®] 2{1G1H3M.

W, adl «mm%@a 20013 @RI @lafla) 170, 172, 191, 212 agyam?

MMIAB _RLMIHU3 MR MBI 012[101H630M



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
208
GR_RAUVMI 9alQ (@JHO0NSs3 N300 Qs  milelload
BOAIBHEMHAN (@JUIODD)
@RM0BLIHA60MAIA. .. .......
@J®1g&Belasamala.........
clelhlo] QI (@JHO0NSS Q6eN200 Qo | snflefload
BOUAIBNMOAND  (@JUgo MVB BRoW1d@12[1@1H630M.
clelhlo] 9alQ) (@JHO0N8383 Q6N200 Qldsa | enfleflead

CINMIW1DB1H30M0.

QOMO0 Qldsal

W] . . QD AUE, MIM MINP|OQYAN  GRANM]

@AM @ a [lasm0.
226. auemwo 3(2)-@8 "Gy af)m@IM aldho 'GRE; | af)an” GalBH6D:.

o). 189ad:  MIaOMIMSalg DAD] BREVDIB:03 MO BBMMEENZI?

aIS1H R0 T-aIS1H0IBY, N | [epplelsilol|[cheldp GAUA-GBAIMNV Jo

Qo |2 QD] (). . ©IWIGHHMB): aVB, IO Od. . O

@AU®Aafla] 226-00 MMIB RO AVNB:@1HB.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
209

o). 198 I O, O, 00 GRAMGIafla] 226-00 mauA@

GRBLM 1 VB BRoU 101 afldHs3aTM.
clelhlo] 0 2lQ) (@J3H00088 RAOMIo Qo] eniefleoad
BOUNAMIHHEMHAM (@ JUIOHDD
@RMOBLIHA60MAIA. .. . ...
@®ZBelasamald.........
GR_RAUVMI 9alQ (@JHO0N8S RAaM0 Q]  milellead
BOWAISHEIMOAND  (@JUQo VR BRoW1H 01 4[l01H830M.
clelhlo] 0 alQ) (@J3HI008s3 RAOMIo Qldsa enfefload

CINMIWIRHABM.

80MJ0 Qldsalo all01dhQo Gal@3o

W@ Odh. Odh. O VG, aMIM MINP|OQIN  CRRNMD MU

@RAIM @ o [lasm0.

" I

111. 313021001BaUHO @3 @Yt af) N1 aldh®o
"G af)aN’ GalBHB3D:.

120. aN015@1@8 "@Ryd," af)M@IMald0o '@ af)an” CalGo3d:.

141, auamwo 1(1)-@3 "@Ryd;" a)M@N0 ald0o "@Rg; o)’ Cal@HE3H:.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
210

Wl af). OH. af)o. BRaHOaO: AVAE, FMINT MINYQ|OQYMM GRENM]

@AM @ 1o [{lasm0.

117.

313021001 USHOMIB3 "B af) M@ B0 HB .

1. GRIMAV" GRIMVaN: VG, aMIMW @INYa|OQYAN GRANMIHU3

@AM @ a [lasm0.

121.

aNo1HN@  "OMWCEWaHs" NI aldh®o @I af)an”
GalQHE3Hs.

134, aN01®@1@8 "9aIQI®”  af)M@IMWaldh0o " HaICQEIR® ag)am’
G2lQHBD:.

142. etemwo 1(1)-@3 "@al@” al0@io" af)M@1Maldh0o " MING:OMo 6210
af)aM’ GalQH63H.

151. auemwo 1(2)-@3 " 9 BMO|GSNZ®6M af) MMV ldh0o
" H@B®IYAIM®IM”' ag)aIM” GaIBLB .
GAWI. af)o. &dh. QMIAB: AVAE, aMIM MINYa|OWAN  CRRNM U

@RAIM @ o [lasm0.

129. aN01@1@3 "0fengo” af)aMm@” 891010563 Hs.

148. aemwo 1(2)-@3 "@goenieyoml@d’ ) an@Im aldoo " Mleinl@d”

af)aM’ GalQH63H.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
211

Wl all. @RMIG3 20137 VA, aMIM MINP|OWAN GRBNMIHU3
@AM @ 1o [{lasm0.

135. aNO1&0N@ " Qamno1olasHhIad a)MDIM”  aldh0o
" BRMEWIL|M0WVIBIBRHWIT . af)an” GalBLBH:.

139.  ooUalPalmansiomIed " ®009a|0o” ad)M@]1Mald:oo
"M al0Wo 2N’ GalB@HB D,

143. auemwo  1(1)-@3  "a10@20"  ahan@IM” aldhoo  "all@lende”’  ag)am”
GalQHE3Hs.

152. susmwo  1(2)-@3 "@@®oaqlesamrrmIem” e D@IM  ald0o
" M BNIBNNASIQYM DI af)aN” G2lBGH63d.

Wl @. aof. elole0’ UG, aMIW MIDLa|OQIN  CRRVM®]

@AM @a [lasm0.

136. aNO1®H0N@ " Qom0 I0leE8HWIGY a) MM aldh0o
" @RI R0V BEBHWIBS  af) MM’ GalBSB3H:.

o). avleed: 118, 119 agyam1 mmid eew@laud 117-00  maud

ces™aso 130 po@d 133 awowss ceeu®:ud 129-00  mmud
cesu™laso 137, 138 agaml maud cesud:ud  136-00 maud

ces®laso 149, 150 agaml cmnid ee3u®l:hud  148-00  maud



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
212
CRBUILMIHB0  DRIINIV@IMIB  BRAIMOla[leanmMe@Iel.  MIa0MIMqls
D@ BRROLMIHU3 MV 1B:01a830M0EM=07

al1S1HR0I®]-aIS18:0138(, aflamaanallcow GHUN-GRAIMNV 10

Qo |2 D] (W) Od. ©IWIGHUM): aVEB, UHIOD] . . N

@A®GTa{la) 111, 120, 141 agam1 maud ceBw®1e:u8 aue:@lesam.

ol. aVlend: W@ ed. O, an eRAIGI0afly 111, 120, 141

ag)an’1 MMIAB RV IH:U3 MVE BRoWTd:@12{101H63aM.

W af). Od. af)o. BRaHOAC” ERAUMGafla) 117-00 maUB ceBL®I
ME M1RIBHA12[101H63aTM.

W oMV emoavad” @RAMGIa(ls) 121, 134, 142, 151 agam
MMIB GRARVMIHHUI MVE M1BIB:A12{1B1H3D.

GAO. af)o. O, MIB GPA®Glafla 129, 148 ogam1 maud
GRBVM U3 MR MAIBA]2[1B1H63aM.

. ol «mm%@a a00138” @raIm©lafla) 135, 139, 143, 152 agam

MMIAB GRBLMIHHU3 MR MBI 012{1G1H60M0.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
213
W) @. af). eO®lad @RAMGlafla) 136-00 MmaUB cel3V®I auve
MNRIHO] 2[101H63aM.
CRRLMI §alQ @HIVABB  0MI0 Qldhqo afNol®h®o  Gal@o
ni1elHad BOUNAIBHNEMHAAM (aJUDH DB
[QV] 0 m
@RMOBLIHA60MAIA. .. . ...
@®gelaesamald.........
CeBULM] ©alQ (@JHOOYBB  0NIo Qldhq o aflOldhQo  Gal@Bo
neflond BOVMIGHIMOAAM  (@JURo MVB @RoUY 101 afl@1esm.
CRRLMI ©21Q @NHVYBB BN Qldho o afoléh®o  Gal@Bo
nfefloag c0naW1alesm.

aIS1HRIM]-a1S15H0I0Y, aflamasanallcow GAUN-GBAIMV o

Qo QD] (). Od. EIWIGHHUMB): aud, 2021-e0e1 emH08 e€3aITvlo

01@5;@03; cenIoBw” (e_3L®1) mNmd A l0AVIGHEMHAAN (@JEOAWo NI
@AM @ o [lasm0.

901003108 10M-0®IFITE Qldin QD] (W, aN. wlaimda:sl): ava,

I (AJEGAWHDD a (laDI6BFAND.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
214

ol. aleed: 2021-ee1 edH0g  esaimule  Ol@soHnag eenodaw”
(6e3WMT) MA@ 2 IXAYISHEMHAM (@JEAWH O
@RMBBLINABOMAIA. ... ..veeeenen
@J®1&Belasamala.................
@62@o VB  @BRoV1H:012flAlesMD,  MIT  Haf)dHEPM
a 10O @18s30M.
@RO1Wlaf

ol.  aV1e9a: CHOBOMIT  TLVMYBMAIV]T  MSOHMIMWBEA IS

WIRQ@od  AVACQWAOWT  MINLEQlS  HI0YEBUE  MNIa0NIMSalS
@RoUEBBBHS @oolofleeiYowl  afltR1eE1e9dm@ MM HAAIG:EIMNOo
5.30-07" @yd. LE:EMIEIWEMM @M HRGMIY a0081T3 BT UB1M3a|UKdIEI
0QIMY Adso| S@BHNIWIFME.  MIa0NOIMee]s  RUIAAD]  OBPLIDSMo
9219 @MY@  al@laldSIVIE  MVINIRIHB  AlOE:GBNMHRAN
@O 1H8MM. 9BE0LI0SM 215633100GUdaHO NIaOMIMaS

@RoWEBRUIBHNIWT 0QIM 3 m@(g;l@%ogas @OMILAIBN’ 8@BHs1Igemns.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
02.11.2021
215

B03WA.... SIAWAE... VB MEaPUd ollAIYIMDo MINS MIAleAI
9.00 2emles” afenge MLEMAGEBANDNIE (2021 maloenid moavo

03-20 olo®l  mjwmog @afleer  9.00  aemles”  aflengo

MESEHBIN@CRIYIW] TVE HOAIG:EM00 3.21-m" o N6, )

* sk ok ockosk ok oskokosk



