al®mIoide e moame

GRAUIe VCEABMo

MBHE allamalsoomealdsie moaud - 3677

15.05.2017-@8 @QaJsly”

2QElaoemes saugema quoadlm’ md®Id @iodese ol

82106k
. O EBTD @RETIeY

(o)) DEDIDOWBOS  CaILEM®  WIaT oM (af)
mailad cvdenod ca:m(acgg,%@auﬁ i@l gud
TR @Jocacg%:ﬂ:(fa SFIQEMBDMICUUDY-
enlg pOmEA @om’!@']gcsmo; af)Enla@d
@R® pomAleR alddal eiEyRIERcR;

(enafl) QR® PO (@00 oR® W {enil}
QO B 10Be59 H0B 1€ a6y
adlosmeann) @RNIDISISEBO);

(ndl) 2016 el 21 OV GURAHe ofi® GalBes (MJl)
MuAEB ceamcacg%.ﬁ:cra cerocromra'l_qd; oIod
DQUIRI®MOS  CalREM@  (IClmdOISUB
@ ; udeed dlamensd ofo;
alluecnranen,

() (@p@ DODMYHBOS atd@af (o)
RIGYAISRICDO?

Do
Wl =l MYWwomeM

(Bald@OEIBEWe RHIEMY MU CUdrnf
o)

07.09.2016-021 au.o. (e&@®) M.
65/2016/60at0.0.c11 j0®@e (Rules for the
alotment and occupation of Government
Servants, 2006) HAEO ]
amgﬂg@g@omﬂ“. sl semeaieel Qud 2
(i), (i){a) IR DAVIBOWBOS GalFEM@B
qoad afim dlacied  qudeod
cauoracgﬁcaaua ramnamrﬂ_»g @lglacud,
@RAIR EaILEM@ (PIad  @RL@OITS
6303 DIV N dho - ARIGETG)
BPICWETRMIETT) . aldh@a]
@RMENIMULAID ¢aldaBm.

07.092016-0a0 qu.O©. (B0} Mo
85/2016/eu10.0.00 pomeallay 01.03.2006
QOB (JosruelygsnRoaii@lasmmamos’,

2016 ey 21 ai eUente (JED:
oMY @O @YD 484 Galdes

&0ABESE @R 5] aslollird]
OIPIROWmES GalPenad
MY0adl@Bealgud L’ @G 5)

MBI cB:JO(B(‘ag%cBJQG)S afsme 177
£o,  @Q mdHod  FHlaumanodas
@pmdly MIAENID ca;m(acgg%@agos

ase 307 9o @gyeny’

QTR DOMEYSHBOS aldh@a]
www.kerala.gov.in, eoffice kerala.gov.in
ag)yarml amem“e)smugae;g'lcca QIE\RIET.

\

Bimoden

HMASHUM B2anlrOd




GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
o Abstraet
Public Works Department — Amendment to Rules for Allotment and
Gccugation of Government Servant's Quarters in Kerala, 2006 - Orders .
issued. -

----------------------------------------------------- 2

. PUBLIC WORKS (E) DEPARTMENT .
G.0.(Ms)No0.65/2016/PWD " Dated, Thiruvananthapuram,07.09.2016

Read: - G.0.(Ms)No.11/2006/PWD dated 28.02.2006

_ As per Government Order read as 1% paper above Government
issued Rules for Allotment and Occupation of Government Servant's
Quarters with effect from 1* March,2006. '

2. Government are pleased to issue amendment to the Rules for
Allotment and Occupation of Government Servant's Quarters in Kerala,
2006, appended to this Order.

' : (By.Order of the Governor )
SHAREEFUDEEN A.
Additional Secretary to Government
To : '

All District Collectors

All Chief Engineers

'All Superintending Engineers and Executive Engineers of the

Buildings Wing '

All Heads of Department

The Finance Department ,

The Secretary, Kerala Public Service Commission (with C/L)

The Registrar, High Court of Kerala (with C/L) .

The Registrar, University of Kerala / Mahatma Gandhi University,

Kottayam / University of Calicut / University of Cochin/University of

 Kannur / Agriculture University, Mannuthy (with C/L) '

The Accountant General (A&E) / (Audit), Thiruvananthapuram

The Information Officer {Web & New Media]

Stock File / Office Copy - ‘ .
| Forwarded / By Order

: : Section Officer
~ Copy t0:PS to Minister [Works] -




TS IWLI YW DX 18/ LU 0P YWU

Mh’\ll)ML\Fl TO T HE RULES FORTHE ALLO'T MENT AND OCCUPATION Ol
GOVERNMENT SERVANTS' QUART ERS [N KERALA 2006

These Rules rmy be calied the Amendment Ruies for the allotmem and
occupation of Govemment Servant’s Quarters in Kerala, 2006

2. It shallcome into forre at once.

3. Amendment of the Rules 1ssued under GO(MS)NO 11/2006/’PWD ddted
28.02, 2006 '

Din mle 9, after clause (viii) the follo wing clauses shallbe inserted, namely:-

"(ix) 50% of the quarters shall be reserved rorallolment to womenstaff
(x) Govemment servants who are fromdistant plaL es”.

2) (1) in rule 10, for the flgure and words “75Nos.” the figure and words "200"
Nos.” shall be substituted;

(u) After the words * Deputv 5peaker‘ the words “Leader of Opposition”™ sImlI he
inserted;

(iii) for the existing clause (i), the following clauses shall be substituted namely-

(i) Me mbe rs of the personal staff including Governmem employees shall vacale
the quarters allotted to them within one month positively from the date on which
they ceases to be the member ofpemmmlsmtf

(11)(a) Not w1thstandmg anything contained in these Rules, the Govemment
employees who were ceased to be members of personal staff, but continued in
the Government Quarters allotted to themunder clause (i) of Rule 10 as it stood
before this amendment, shall vacate the quarters within one month positively
from the date of this amendment, if they have not been allotted the Government
quaners under rule 6 0r32."

3) (i) in rule 16 (i), for the words “not exceeding six months” the word. “not
exceeding three months” shall be substituted.

(i) In rule 16(i), for the words “not exceeding six months” the womds “not
- exceeding three months” shall be substituted. -

(i) In rule 16 (iv), for the words “six months” the words "three months” shall be
substtuted. .

{1\.) In rule 16 (iv) (a), forthe words “sxxmonths" the words“three months shall be -
subsntuted -




P

f'IIU_IW.I' WiWrEI LaVICY tYF ST W

(v)in rule 16(v) for the words “six months” the wonds “three months” shall be
substituted. :

(vi) In rule (vi), for the words “two years” the words “three months” shall be
substlmted

43In mle 27.

(D) The sentence “This period may be extended hp to six manths in exceptional
cases with the permission of the Executive Engineer in writing” shaill be omitted.

(i) For the words “ exceed six months” the wo rds “exceed three months” shall be_-

substituted.




