24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
1

MMamIGaIem &I Yo

WMHHIOVY0Jo HWQo O.l(ﬁ?'(;d@nl (@awa. Sl. af)o. BMINAV" OV ):
aud, 2020-9e1 6H08 WMDY 61).“%0 2020-0e1 08 Wm0y (2-20
mmiad) 6T)_ﬂ%lgo al@1WEMM W HEHHSHNEMHAAT (@JGOWo amMOd
@RAIM@a [lasa0.

@OQAINJo émﬂoo)oJo a @201y MVo@MHEMAQJo Qlceaq‘;l@f]

().0002IBMB HSANa |88]1): VB, MIM (JECAVWHDD o 1aNIEBZMD.

o). aleed: 2020-90e1 6508 wmdoey mia, 2020-ee1 caHoz

WMy  (2-00 maud) mN@  agaMal  aIBINMMY  af)SHNENHAAT
QEOBIOW)

@R BLIH630MAIA. . ... ........

@®elasamald............

@G0 MVR @BRoWTH>M1aflA1H63aM. 6110%09308 al@1EMM W D HHFHEMD.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
2
(1) 2020-0e1 6508 WM\ mNod

Qldia |[M1012]88 o 101WemMmM

Q620 Oldsal

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T.M. Thomas Isaac): sir, I move the

Official amendment:

19. In section 3 A proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Surcharge on
Taxes Act, 1957 by clause 2,

(a) in sub-section (5) the words and figures "31st July," shall be
substituted with the words and figures "30" November," wherever it

OCcurs.

(b) in sub-section (7) for the words and figures "3I* December,
2020" the words and figures "31t March, 2021" shall be substituted.

(c) in sub-section (12), for the word "their" the word "the" shall be
substituted.

@Yo NMNIIQYES Bdalat®@ IO, &SIyl ERSYWIM88 TV agyanlal
3132eiqa lendmaa®osm” 19-00 mmid 8Mesywle: ce3LMI.

Shri  Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan: Sir, I Move the following

amendments:

25. In section 3 A (1) (1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
3

Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by clause 2, for the word "fifty" the
words "thirty five" shall be substituted.

59. In the proviso to Section 3A(5) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by clause 2 for the figures,
letters and words "31st July, 2020", the figures, letters and word
"September 30", 2020" shall be substituted.

103.  In section 3A (13) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Surcharge
on Taxes Act, 1957 by Clause 2 for the word "four" the word "two"
shall be substituted.

Shri V.D. Satheesan: Sir, I Move the following amendments:

26. In section 3 A (1) (i) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by clause 2, for the word "fifty" the
word "thirty" shall be substituted.

88. In the proviso to section 3A(7) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Surcharge on taxes Act, 1957, by clause 2 for the words "four

installment" the words "five installments" shall be substituted.

Shri K.C. Joseph : Sir, I Move the following amendments:

217. In section 3 A (1) (i) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by clause 2, for the word "fifty" the
words "twenty five" shall be substituted.

64. In the proviso to the Section 3A(5) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by clause 2, the word "thirty"
shall be substituted with the words "seventy five".



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
4

104. In the section 3A (13) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by clause 2 for the word "four" the
word "three" shall be substituted.

Shri V. S. Sivakumar: Sir, I move the following amendments.

33. In section 3A(1)(i1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by Clause 2 for the word
"thirty", the words "seventy five" shall be substituted.

85. In the proviso to the section 3A(7) proposed to be substituted in
the Kerala surcharge on taxes Act, 1957 by Clause 2 for the word
"thirty" the word "sixty" shall be substituted.

Shri P. T. Thomas. : Sir, I move the following amendments.

36. In section 3A(I)(ii)) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by Clause 2 for the word "thirty", the
words "forty five" shall be substituted.

71. In the proviso to section 3A(5) proposed to be substituted in the

Kerala Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by clause 2 for the word
"March", the word "July" shall be substituted.

Shri K.M. Shaji : Sir, I move the following amendment.

45. In section 3A(3) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by Clause 2,the word
"declaration" shall be substituted with the word "statement".

o). Y199 @: MI20MIMalg O] GREOLMIMhU3 MVI1E:A1BBATOEME0?




24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
5

WMHHIOY0Jo HWQo moemd@”l (awa. Sl. af)o. BMINA Daf)TVD):
a8, @l af). afl. @MI@H0001903 90-00 MMIB BRI WY1, Ob:.
af)@. af). 212801608 92-00 MMUAB EBBVMIQo BVEBLPWIE: GERENMIWIW]
@RAIMOIa{le800.  amm@  @RAIMOIafla]  19-00  maud eV
@RoW1HA1HHMOAIM” BREIAMOISBM0. 1Y BBROM1HUE TVI1Bhalasamlel.
90. In the proviso to section 3A(’7) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Surcharge on taxes Act, 1957, by clause 2 for the words
"four installment" the words "four installments" shall be
substituted.

92. In section 3A(8) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala

Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 by clause 2 for the word "assesse"
the words "assessee" shall be substituted.

ol aVlenad:  MIa0MIMea]g WMo  HWQo O_lcezqu@’]
@RAIMAlafly) 19, 90, 92 agam1 maud e8mes3yPwle: GRBOLIGUE Ve
@0 1501 2[101H8800.

@1 @@aIeYd E0WIGHM 25, 59, 103 agyam1 maud EeELG&:U3
MR M10IBO12[1@1H63M0.

@l al. al aue1md epAamGlaflal 26, 88 aganl maud



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Noé for Publication
GRBLM KU MR MBIBO]2[1A1H63aM.
W 6. aVUl. @=MVal’ @RAMOlafla) 27, 64, 104 agam1 maud
GRRVMI1HU3 MR MIPIBHA]2[lB1H63aTM.
Wl al. afaV wWla:n0d GRAMOIafla) 33, 85 aganl maud
GRBLM KU MR MAIBA]2[1A1H63M.
@ afl. Sl. eIy’ GRAI®GIa{la] 36, 71 agan1 MMIB @BRL®1B:U3
MR M1OIBO]2[161H6600.
W Od. af)o. a0l GRA®Glafla] 45-0%0 mUB GV aULE
M1 012[1@1H660M0.
CRRLM] §alQY@JMHIVYBB M0 Aldsal iefload  BIVAIHHICNH]
a)IM JROOD
@RABZBLNHABOMAIA. .. . ......
@®Igelasanald..........

CRBULM] 21QE]HIVABR 06M=J0 Aldsq| MIElOd  BIVAILHIMORAM

@JUgo VR @RV 1d@12[l@1B8aT.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
7

GBI §21Q(JHI0ABB B0 Aldsa | milefload fo0nMIWIGlHsMMD.

a0 Qldza |

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac) : Sir, I

move the following official amendment.

107. (1) In section 28 C proposed to be substituted in the Kerala

Stamp Act, 1959 (17 of 1959) by Clause 3(3) after the words
"time to time" the words "in such manner as may be prescribed

by rules" shall be substituted.

(2) In Clause 3(4)(b), after the words, "for the entries", the
words, "against it" shall be inserted.

Smt. Shanimol Osman: Sir, I move the following amendment.

109.  Section 2(d)(ii1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Stamp
Act, 1959 by Clause 3(1) shall be recast as follows:-

"(i11) Every deed made as per the order by the Reserve Bank of
India under section 44A of the Banking Regulation Act, 1949
(Central Act 10 of 1949); and".

Shri K. M. Shaji : Sir, I move the following amendment.

110.  In sub section(1C) of Section 28A proposed to be inserted in the
Kerala Stamp Act, 1959 by Clause 3(2), for the words "of the
opinion" the word "found" shall be substituted.



115.

124.

132.

135.

138.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
8

Shri V. T. Balram : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In sub section (1C) of Section 28A proposed to be inserted in the

Kerala Stamp Act, 1959 by Clause 3(2), for the word "thirty" the
word "fifteen" shall be substituted.

Shri P. K. Basheer : Sir, I move the following amendments.

In Section 28(C) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala Stamp
Act, 1959 by clause 3(3), after the words "time to time" the
words "in that particular area" shall be added.

In the entry in column (3) against serial number 22A proposed to
be substituted in the SCHEDULE of the Kerala Stamp Act, 1959
by Clause 3(4)(b), for the word "Two" the word “ One" "all be
substituted.

Shri V. D. Satheesan : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In the entry in column (3) against serial number 22A proposed to
be substituted in the SCHEDULE of the Kerala Stamp Act 1959
by Clause 3(4)(b), for the words "Two percent of the market
value" the words "Five percent of the fair value" shall be
substituted.

Shri P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In the entry in column (3) against serial number 22A proposed to
be substituted in the SCHEDULE of the Kerala Stamp Act 1959



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
9

by Clause 3(4)(b), for the figures "0.6" the figures "0.5" shall be
substituted.

Shri V. S. Sivakumar : Sir, I move the following amendment.

140. In the entry in column (3) against serial number 22A proposed to

be substituted in the SCHEDULE of the Kerala Stamp Act 1959
by Clause 3(4)(b), for the words and figures "0.6 percent of the
aggregate of the market value" the words and figures "1.2 percent
of aggregate of the fair value" shall be substituted.

o). Y189@: MIa0MIMalg A GREOMIHhU3 MVI1E:@1BBATEME0?

WMI0Y0J0 SHWQo Aldsq AV (6. Sl. afo. BMINAV" HafMVS) :

aud, emImM  ePAMOlafla] 107-00 maud 8WesPRI®:  GBRLMI
@01 @189HMOHAM” @RERYAMATABMD. AQ” RO 1HU3 MVfld:@1esamlel.

ol V1@ MIa0MIMea]g WML  HWQo (').Io@e»qd@fl

@RI O1a {2 107-20 maud SDEBLIW s Eelellof QVC
@0 1501 2[101H8800.

U1 HIMIEMUS DAYIND BRAIMEa{la] 109-00 MMIA ceBL®] aVE
M1 2[10156300.

W) . afjo. audl @RAUMOlafla 110-00 mMd eV ave



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/N(;B for Publication

MEIBO1 2[101H63aM.

@l all. sl. ne3nde @RAMEIafla) 115-00 ®mmud ee3L®1 auve
M1 012[1@1H660M0.

Wl afl. o0& M3 @RAMGlally 124, 132 agaml maud
GRBLM KU MR MAIBA]2[1A1H63M.

Wl al. Wl 1@ ERAU®GIafly 135-00 mMUd ee3w®] aus
MEIBO] 2[101H63aM.

@1 afl. sl e®»nay’ GPA®Glafla] 138-%0 maud 3w qve
M1 012[1@1H660M0.

Wl ail. a)aV. w008 @RAIMGafla] 140-00 mMIB ceBV®I aVE
MNEIHA] 2[101H6830M.

CRBUILM] §21Q@JHI0ABB GANJo Aldal MILOd BINAIBHIGAI af)Mm
(U0

@RMZBLNA6aMAIA. .. ........

@J®1gBellasamala..........



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
11
R §a1QE@JHI0ABB PaMIo Aldsq| ilefload  BIVAILHIMEAAM
@JUgo VR @RV 1d@] 2 lGlBsaT.

CRRMI] 621QY(JHI0ABB YaMIo Alda | ilefload cIwmowlolssam.

Moo Qldsa |

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac) : Sir, I

move the following official amendment.

141. (1) In section 7 A proposed to be inserted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of 1963) by Clause 4 (1),

(a) in sub-clause (a), for the words and figures "31% July,
2020" the words and figures "30" November, 2020" shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub- clause (d),-

(1) for the words "paid in installments" the words "paid in
four installments" shall be substituted;

(11) for the words and figures "31% December, 2020" the
words and figures "31% March, 2021" shall be substituted;

(2) In section 23 B proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4 (2),



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
12
(a) to sub-section (1) the following Explanation shall be

inserted, namely:-
"Explanation,-Arrears for the purpose of this section shall
include the tax remaining unpaid as on the date of option, under
clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 47 pursuant to the
payment of compounding fee mentioned therein"

(b) in sub-section (5), for the words and figures “ "31st July,
2020" the words and figures " 30" November, 2020" shall be
substituted;

(c) in sub-section (7), for the word "dealer" the word
"assessee'" shall be substituted, and

(d) in sub-section (10), after the word "Appeals" the words
"and Revisions" shall be inserted.

0alo@ aflejn NG®IVIE  ERYEOMAIYSS  BJaia®@ O],

&S1UY1 @SOS (OIWIO] ag)amlal 31deellq {lenomass
GRBUNMIWIMID).

Dr. M. K. Muneer: Sir, I move the following amendment.

146. In section 7A (1)(1) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4 (1) for the word "Abkari' the
word "foreign liquor" shall be substituted.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
13

Shri K. C. Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendments.

155. In section 7A(1) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4 (1), for the word "complete" the
figures and symbol, "50%" shall be substituted.

215.  In the proviso to section 23B(7) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(2) for the word
"twenty", the word "thirty" shall be substituted.

Shri V. D. Satheesan: Sir, I move the following amendments.

158.  In section 7A(1) proposed to be inserted in the General Sales Tax
Act, 1963 by Clause 4 (1), for the words "and fifty per cent
waiver on interest" the words "with Seventy five percent waiver
on interest" shall be substituted.

Shri P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

162. In section 7A(1)(a) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala General

Sales Tax Act, 1963, by Clause 4 (1), for the word "July" the
word "March" shall be substituted.

Shri Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan: Sir, I move the following

amendment.

189. In section 23B(1)(1)(b) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(2) for the word"forty"



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
14

the word "fifty" shall be substituted.

Shri Anwar Sadath : Sir, I move the following amendment.

197. In section 23B(3), proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(2), for the words "shall

withdraw" the words and figures "shall within 60 days withdraw"
shall be substituted.

Shri Roji M. John : Sir, I move the following amendment.

202. In section 23B(5), proposed to be substituted in the Kerala

General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(2), after the word
"option" the words "in the prescribed form" shall be inserted.

Shri V. T. Balram : Sir, I move the following amendment.

208. In the proviso to section 23B(5) proposed to be substituted in the

Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(2), for the
words and figures "31t March 2021" the words and figures "3+
December 2020" shall be substituted.

Smt. Shanimol Osman: Sir, I move the following amendment.

214. In the proviso to section 23B(7) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 by Clause 4(2) for the word
"twenty", the words "twenty five" shall be substituted.

o). Y189@: MUI0MIMSalg 8] GREOMIHU3 MVI1E:G1BBATEME0?




24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
15

WMHHIOVY0Jo HWQo moeg(gﬂ@’l (@awa. Sl afo. BMINAV" afVBs) :
a3, M  @RAMAlafla)]  141-00 M8  8WE31WNe: RO
@RoW1HA1HHMOAMM” BREIAMAISBM. 0] GBROM1HUd TVI1dhalasamlel.

ol aVlend:  MIa0MIMea]g WMHIQY0Je  HWQo moe;(g;l@’l

@RAUMOa{la) 141-00 mMIB 86BN @EBLMI TVE BRoW1E:E2{lB1BED.

GAO. af)o. 0. AMIB ERAUGGlafly 146-00 MmMIB GeBL®] aUVE
MEIBO] 2[101H63aM.

Wl o&. ml. @ROTVal @RAMElafla) 155, 215 agaml maud
GRBRVMI1HU3 MR MIRIBHA2[lB1H63aTM.

@1 afl. awl. w1 GRAIMGIa{la] 158-00 mMIB 6_3VL®I aVE
MNEIHA] 2[101H6830M.

Wl afl. sl e®mnmy” GRAMGlafls) 162-00 maud Ge3L®] aVLE
MEIBO] 2[101H630M.

@) ®I@BAIYE EIWIGGH UM @RAIMGIafla] 189-00 mMIB ceBL®]

ME M1RIH A1 2[101H63aTM.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/N(itG for Publication
@) @RMAUR TVIBO @RAIMAlafla] 197-00 maud ee3L® ave
M1EIBO] 2[101H63aM.
@ 0o af)o. 6R0M ERAUIMAafla) 202-00 MmaUB G_B3L®I qVE
MEIBHA] 2[101H633aM.
Wl all. sl eu@dndo @RAIMAIafla] 208-2%0 M3 6e3L®] ave
M1RIBO12[101H6300.
U1 HIMIEMIUE DTVIND BRAUIMA)a{la) 214-00 MMUAG ceBL®] LB
M1EIBA1 2[101H63aM.
CRRM] §21QYE@JHIOABB MILIDo Aldsal Mmilefload  BIVAIHHICNH]
af)aM (@JUROHOD
@RMOBLIA60MAIA. (.. ...
@Q®g:elasamald..........
CRBUILM] §alQ@EJHIABB MILIo Aldsq| Milefload  BIVAIGHIMEAAM

@JUgo VR @RV 1d@12[l@lBsaT.

CRRMI] 621Q(JHIVABB MILIo Aldhal Milefload RIWVWaIWIalssam.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
17

@REMI00 Qldsal

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac) : Sir, 1

move the following official amendment.

222,

(1) Section 5 (7) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala Building
Tax Act, 1975 by Clause 5(1) (b) shall be omitted.

(2) In clause 5 (2) (b), for the word "substituted" the word
"inserted" shall be substituted.

(3) For "Schedule I" proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Building Tax Act, 1975 by Clause 35(3)(a) of the following
Schedule shall be substituted.

Schedule-I

(see section )
TABLE

Rate of Building Tax

Grama Municipal | Municipal

Plinth area Panchayath| Council |Corporation
(Rupees) (Rupees) (Rupees)
1 2 3

Residential Buildings

Not exceeding 100

Square Metres Nil Nil Nil




24-08-2020

Uncorrected/Not for Publication

18

Above 100 Square
Metres but not

exceeding 150 Square 1950 3500 >200
Metres
Above 150 Square
Metres but not
exceeding 200 Square 3900 7000 10500
Metres
Above 200 Square
Metres but not
exceeding 250 Square 7800 14000 21000
Metres
7800 plus | 14000 plus | 21000 plus
Rs. 1560 |Rs. 3100 for| Rs. 3900
: for every every for every
ﬁ‘;‘;:gmg 250 Square | ydiional  additional | additional
10 Square | 10 Square | 10 Square
Metres Metres Metres
Other Buildings
Not exceeding 50 Nil Nil Nil
Square Metres
Above 50 Square
Metres but not 1950 3900 7800
exceeding 75 Square
Metres
Above 75 Square 2925 5800 11700

Metres but not




24-08-2020

Uncorrected/Not for Publication

19

exceeding 100 Square
Metres
Above 100 Square
Metres but not
exceeding 150 Square 3850 11700 23400
Metres
Above 150 Square
Metres but not
exceeding 200 Square 1700 23400 46800
Metres
Above 200 Square
Metres but not
exceeding 250 Square 23400 46800 70200
Metres

23400 plus| 46800 plus | 70200 plus

Rs. 2340 = Rs. 4600 | Rs. 5800

Exceeding 250 Square | for every | forevery | for every
Metres additional | additional & additional

10 Square | 10 Square | 10 Square

Metres Metres Metres”

O>»Sls Me:®m ERRIAIBS 6ERVDIHBIMI®. DI OHAVAHUL O3
CGOW  aleOVODHBOS @osacw(éuﬁ amIndlapellgles” @elyndsnlo®”
MVABHNIB alladILNHB63HWIEM.

Shri V. S. Sivakumar : Sir, [ move the following amendment.




24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
20
225. In section 5(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Building
Tax Act, 1975 by clause 5(1)(a) for the words “ after the
appointed day” the words and figures “ after 1 April 20217
shall be substituted.

269. In the entry in column (2) under the heading other
Buildings” in the SCHEDULE -I proposed to be substituted in
the Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 by Clause 5(3)(a) for the
figure “ 39007 figure “ 35007 shall be substituted.

113

Shri K. M. Shaji : Sir, I move the following amendment.

230. In section 5(7) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Building
Tax Act, 1975 by clause 5(1)(b) the word “ twenty” shall be
substituted with the words “ twenty five” .

Shri Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan : Sir, I move the following

amendment.

241. In section 5A(3) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Building Tax Act, 1975 by Clause 35(2)(b), for the word
“ twenty” the word “ thirty” shall be substituted.

279. In the entry in Column 2 under the heading “ Other Buildings”
in the SCHEDULE-I proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Building Tax Act, 1975, for the figures “ 11700” , figures
“ 10000” shall be substituted.

Shri Anwar Sadath : Sir, I move the following amendments.




24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
21
2477. In section S5A(3) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Building Tax Act, 1975 by Clause 5 (2)(b), for the word

“ twenty” the words “ thirty five” shall be substituted.

280. In the entry in Column 3 under the heading “ Other Buildings”
in the SCHEDULE-I proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Building Tax Act, 1975, by Clause 5 (3)(a), for the figures
“ 234007 , the figures “ 20000” shall be substituted.

Shri P. C. George : Sir, I move the following amendment.

250. In Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975, Schedule 1, Rate of Building
Tax. In the entries
(1) Column against 2 the figures “ 1500” “ 3000” *“ 6000” ,

substitute the figures “ 1000” , *“ 2000 , “ 50007
respectively.

(ii)  Column against 3 the figures “ 2700”7 “ 54007
“ 10800” , substitute the figures “ 2000”7  “ 30007

“ 7500” respectively.

HDCaNOLIHVWIM HDHFIS MIG@IQYMBISBAN®  VDOTWICAMIHWAN’
WMDY moeg%l@’l @RYGLINAlHHaMo.  DDICMWMD@ o JMald1GUdIWM
GAIMOAMMIEN 0f)d13 @RETEJOWo. Al @Je3uoEnzl@ 100 gmad
150 a1@0Ws 2198 AeeQss aaVYe0EBRleRss Me:@1 1500 @aiwoay”

@@ 1000 @Ba1o0 &:0Q0m asleel? 150 a1@owy oo™’ gaglas 200



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Nth for Publication

2100wy 0198 awoss®Im” 3000 @eiwiem” mie:@l. @@’ 2000
(Bal@IHHEMHAMIN 0013 @PE1JoWo. @™ 2500 GalonWes1ejndos)
0@ ansleel? 200 a@owy a1Q01m” ad:glad 250 ai@owy 2193
AOOQE8 APIVYa0ERWBHn 6000 GBalwoam. MO®EBOM HBHISHNIND
& ¥1Qo. ODSISo  ANSHWHBHFOM @IAMISBaN®EL] Mmel®. ofls’
QIYEHNOMZAN” Ql2J003 ADTWELID. DD NIV 2108222 AI8RV1q {lesam®
A1VICEMINWIM” AQD] UHRUIEHHMNEDHMZANIEM” af)0dd BREl(@JIWo. M®’
ale@IOQ O™’ QAUBAIMAMBIGHNIMINEMAN A lOGIMIDI, 2MEBRHS
SOM o {IFlaomem” AIGAIMAMNBIAEAND. @ROMAD MIOWAIEM?
210199003 20BNALNOD AMaHiead M3 aflengoallmgo MB:@1RIMo
@RSIGaleflasan MSalsl S IhH 2MIWlal®) QAOMEM1HS”
DENHONIEIMINWAN MIaONIM]g AQDAD]IWYo 21Ba] &2IGQYMBDGIIE.
AMeMIQo  alBa] ©2IYPEMOAMMIM )03  GREIEJOIVo. BRDEaIALI

OMaUI@ YW  sWemM NNl @8  (@JEBUIEBElejlc  MDCalIEAl

QAIBRLMOYNRIGH 1VNRBBHWIM”. MO MIPWMIEM™? MIVATVRWVIG3



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
23
%] (9] (7
BOlalaeM2MM”  aflald@laf” af)IDo  aldAVIHHIOAIMIGEMI!  MONeS
af) @139 @RYSILL. lGHH Qmmgamm“ AMAY1LNGHMo. DD M@
aldebmal” velwel RMEBBERIS OaIYPIM  (GO@WIHEMANIEM”  af)o3
@RElEJOWo.  MANIOIOMIM @REEB RMEBBEBIS (@JEDM B BWIBRIMHIEM Jo

$6M1HHEMHAANIEM” af)HTY @BPREYBDOM.

Shri V. T. Balram : Sir, I move the following amendments.

260. In the entry in column (3) of TABLE in SCHEDULE - I to
section 5 of the Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 proposed to be
substituted by clause 5(3)(a), for the figures "10500" the figures

"9000" shall be substituted.

285. In the entry in Column 3 under the heading “ Other Buildings”
in the SCHEDULE-I proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Building Tax Act, 1975, by Clause 5 (3)(a) for the figures
“ 70200” , the figures “ 60000” shall be substituted.

Shri T. J. Vinod : Sir, I move the following amendments.

262. In the entry in column (2) of TABLE in SCHEDULE - I to
section 5 of the Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 proposed to be
substituted by clause 5(3)(a), for the figures "14000" the figures
"12000" shall be substituted.

286. In the entry in Column under the heading “ Other Buildings”



263.

265.

267.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
24

in the SCHEDULE-I proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Building Tax Act, 1975, by Clause 5 (3)(a) for the figures and
word “ 46800 plus 4600” , the figures and word “ 40000 plus
4000” shall be substituted.

Smt. Shanimol Osman : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In the entry in column (3) of TABLE in SCHEDULE - I to
section 5 of the Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 proposed to be
substituted by clause 5(3)(a), for the figures "21000" the figures
"19000" shall be substituted.

Shri K. C. Joseph : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In the entry in column (2) of TABLE in SCHEDULE - I to
section 5 of the Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 proposed to be
substituted by clause 5(3)(a), for the words and figures "14000
plus Rs.3100 for every additional 10 Square Metres " the words
and figures "12000 plus Rs.2500 for every additional 10 Square
Metres" shall be substituted.

Shri P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In the entry in column (3) of TABLE in SCHEDULE - I to
section 5 of the Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 proposed to be
substituted by clause 35(3)(a), for the words and figures "21000
plus Rs.5400 for every additional 10 Square Metres "the words
and figures "18000 plus Rs.4500 for every additional 10 Square
Metres" shall be substituted.



271.

275.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
25

Dr. M. K. Muneer: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In the entries in column (2) of TABLE under the heading "other
Buildings" in SCHEDULE- I, proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 by Clause 5(3)a
(1) against entry 2 for the figure "3900" substitute figure
"200"
(2) against entry 3 for the figure "5800" substitute figure
"4200"
(3) against entry 4 for the figure "11700" substitute figure
"10500"
(4) against entry 5 for the figure "23400" substitute figure
"23000"
(5) against entry 6 for the figure "46800" substitute figure
"42000"
(6) against entry 7 for the figure, word and letter "46800 Plus Rs.

4,600" substitute figure, word and letter "42,000 plus Rs.
2,000"

Shri P. K. Basheer: Sir, I move the following amendments.

In the entries in column (3) of TABLE under the heading "other
Buildings" in SCHEDULE- I, proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 by Clause 5(3)(a)
(1) against entry 2 for the figure "7800" substitute figure "6500"
(2) against entry 3 for the figure "11700" substitute figure
"11000"
(3) against entry 4 for the figure "23400" substitute figure



288.

277.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
26

"22000"
(4) against entry 5 for the figure "46800" substitute figure
"40000"
(5) against entry 6 for the figure "70200" substitute figure
"50000"
(6) against entry 7 for the figure, word and letter "72000 Plus Rs.
5,800"
substitute figure, word and letter "50,000 plus Rs. 5,000"

In the entries in column (3) of TABLE under the heading "other
Buildings" in SCHEDULE- II proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 by Clause 5(3)(b)
(1) against SL. No. 2 for the figure "5000" substitute figure
"4200"
(2) against SL. No. 3 for the figure "7500" substitute figure
"6200"
(3) against SL. No. 4 for the figure "10000" substitute figure
"8250"
(4) against SL. No. 5 for the figure "12500" substitute figure

"10250"

Shri C. Mammutty: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In the entries in column (3) of TABLE under the heading "other
Buildings" in SCHEDULE- I, proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 by Clause 5(3)(a)

(1) against entry 2 for the figure "7800" substitute figure

"7500"

(2) against entry 3 for the figure "11700" substitute figure



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
27

"11500"
(3) against entry 4 for the figure "23400" substitute figure
"23000"
(4) against entry 5 for the figure "46800" substitute figure
"42000"
(5) against entry 6 for the figure "70200” substitute figure
"52000"
(6) against entry 7 for the figure, word and letter "70200 Plus Rs.
5800"
substitute figure, word and letter "52000 plus Rs. 5000"

Shri Roji M. John: Sir, I move the following amendments.

283. In the entry in Column 3 under the heading “ Other Buildings”
in the SCHEDULE-I proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Building Tax Act, 1975, by Clause 5 (3)(a) for the figures
"46800", the figures "40000" shall be substituted.

290. In the entry in Column 3 against SI.No. 2 in the SCHEDULE-II
proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975,
by Clause 5 (3)(b) for the figures "5000", the figures "6000"
shall be substituted.

o). 189ad: NIOMIMea]s AAD] BRBVDIB03 MV BBAEENZ0?

WMHHIOVY0Jo HWQo moea%d@ﬁ (eawa. Sl af)o. BMINAV" af)MVB>) :

a3, I  @RAIMAIafla]  222-00 MM  B8MVEEPRIIH  GRBAOM]



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Ng:3 for Publication

@Ro1h1BnMeOAMN” @REIAMOEsaM.  222-%0 MMIB GRELM (@JdhI00

WIN(EJEBUBBEINE! HHRHSIS MG WME00) MIENTE Ala{IS88ENEMHNIUI

WEMIN0W H502fl01683HWIM”. YT, all. M. 6220d2” MAMOS aloaOO®1HAF

1@19” VBHHIA@ Quae)oes)omigmg". 29" GRARVMIHRHOBIMMo MVflB:@1asaNIel.

ol  aV1end:  MIe0MIMea]g WMHIQY0Je  HWQo moea%;l@ﬂ

@RAUMOa {12} 222-2 mmud 836330016 GRBIOM] V!
@010 2[101H868300.

W all. agaV. ;a3 @RAMGlafla) 225, 269 agan1 maud
GRBRVMI1HU3 MR MIRIBHA2[lB1H63aTM.

W Od. af)o. o]l @RAIMGlafly] 230-00 MMUB GRBVL®I1 aLE
MNEIHA] 2[101H6830M.

@) @BAUYE EIWIGHHMB GRAI®Na(la) 241, 279 agan1 maud
GRBLM 1K U3 MR MBIBA12[1A1H63aM.

@l epdAUd qIBem @RAMAlafly) 247, 280 agaml maud

GRBRVMI1HU3 MR MIPIBHA]2[lB1H63aTM.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Ng; for Publication
@1 afl. aVl. =032 @RAIMGlafla] 250-00 maud 6B3L®] qVE
M1EIBO] 2[101H63aM.
Wl afl. sl m@ode eRA®Glafla) 260, 285 agpan1 maud
GRRVLMI1HU3 MR M1PIBHA]2[lo1H63aTM.
Wl sl o= allemid’ @AUOGIafly 262, 286 agaml maud
GRBULM KU VR MOIBO]2[1A1H63aM.
12 aHIMIERIUWT DIYIM @RAIMATafla) 263-00 MaUAB RV aVE
M1EIBA1 2[101H63aM.
@) O MUl @2RITVal” ERAIMANa{la] 265-00 MmMIE GREVW®] aqVE
MEIHA] 2[101H63aM.
Wl afl. Sl e®oaaV” ERAU®Glafly] 267-00 maud 6E3L™] aVE
M1RIGO12[10156300.
GAWI. af)o. 0. OMIB BRA®EIafla] 271-00 moud ee3L® qVE

M1EIBO] 2[101H63aM0.

Wl afl. od. a3 @RAMOlafla) 275, 288 aganl maud



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/NgB for Publication
GRBLM KU MR MBIBO]2[1A1H63aM.
@l al. 25l @RAmGlafla] 277-00 ®maud ee3L®]  aVE
M1 012[1@1H660M0.
Wl 60021 agf)o. 6o @RAMAlaflal 283, 290 agaml maud
GRBLM KU MR MAIBA]2[1A1H63M.
R §2lQ@JHIABB @600 Aldsqaf MILlOaR  BIWAIHHIGCAD
a)IM @JROOD
@RAZBLNA6aMAIA. .. ........
@J®1gBelasamala..........
CRRNMI] §2lQYEJHIVABB BREMIJ0 Oldsal MILNOd BIVAIBHIMOAIM

@JUo VB BRoW @1 2fl@1H30M

CRBUILM] §21Q(JHI0ABB BREMIJ0 Aldsa | milelload fonMIWIGlesMMD.

@RY0%o Qldsa |

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac) : Sir, I

move the following official amendment.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
31

291. (1) In clause 6 of the Bill after the words "In the Kerala Motor Vehicles
Taxation Act," the figures "1976" shall be inserted.

(2) In sub-section (7A) of section 3 of the Kerala motor Vehicles
Taxation Act, 1976 (19 of 1976), proposed to be inserted by sub-clause
(2) of clause 6 of the Bill, for the words “shall be paid for each year” the
words “shall be paid for each year or part thereof” shall be substituted.

(3) In sub-clause (3), in item (b), in sub item (ii), after the words “item
(ii)” the words “and entries against it” shall be inserted.

(4) In sub-item (b), of item (iia) of serial number 7, in the Schedule of
the said Act, proposed to be inserted by sub-item (ii) of item (b) of sub-
clause (3), after the words and figures “Vehicles with more than 20
seats” the words “including driver” shall be inserted.

MHD 2D 1MDSS cm"]gda)ge)s af)eMo OIS OUBQIOS

DH@BaIDTWBEIOD )N’ RO §alQYIRYHAUM®IEM 291-00 ™A

BV630WH CRBULMI.

Shri Abdul Hameed P.: Sir, I move the following amendments.

292.  Clause 6 (1) (i) shall be deleted.

300. In clause 6 (2), for the words “for each year” add the words “once in
two years”.



307.

318.

322.

327.

331.

342.

295.

297.

298.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
32

In Clause 6 (3)(b) (i), for the word “solely” shall be deleted.

In the entry Clause 6 (3) (d) (ii) for the figure and sign “8%"”
substituted the figure and sign “7%”.

In Clause 6(3)(c)(i)(e)(ii), for the figure and symbol “9%” substitute
the figure and symbol “8%"”.

In Clause 6(3)(c)(i)(f)(ii), for the figure and symbol “11%” substitute
the figure and symbol “10%.

In Clause 6(3)(c)(i)(g)(ii) for the figure and symbol “13% substitute
the figure and symbol “12%”.

In clause 6(3)(c)(i)(k), for the figure and symbol “8%"” substitute the
figure and symbol “7%” shall be substituted.

Shri Parakkal Abdulla: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In clause 6 (2) after the word “dealer” insert the words “sub dealer”.

Shri Roji M. John: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In clause 6 (2) for the figures, symbol and letters “1/15"™” the figures,
symbol and letters “1/12"™” shall be substituted.

Shri V. T. Balram : Sir, I move the following amendment.

In clause 6 (2) for the figures, symbol and letters “1/15™” the figures,
symbol and letters “1/13"™ shall be substituted.

Smt. Shanimol Osman: Sir, I move the following amendment.




301.

304.

350.

305.

339.

319.

324.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
33

In clause 6 (2) for the figure and letters “15™” the figures and letters
“13™ shall be substituted.

Shri K. M. Shaji: Sir, I move the following amendments.

In clause 6 (3) (a), for the letters and figures “Rs. 190” substitute the
letters and figures “Rs. 185”.

In the entry in column(3) against Serial number CA in ANNEXURE-
I1 proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Motor Vehicles Taxation
Act, 1976 by clause 6(3)(d)(i), for the figure “2500.00” substitute
figure “2000.00”.

Shri C. Mammutty: Sir, I move the following amendments.

In clause 6 (3) (b) for the words “permitted to ply” substitute the
word “plying”.

In the entry in column(3) against item 7B in Serial number A in
ANNEXURE-I proposed to be inserted in the Kerala Motor Vehicles
Taxation Act, 1976 by clause 6(3)(c)(i)(j), for the figure and symbol
“5%"” the figure and symbol “4%” shall be substituted.

Shri P. C. George: Sir, I move the following amendment.

Clause 6(3)(c)(i)(d)(ii) , for the figure and symbol “6%”, the figure
and symbol “7%” shall be substituted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer: Sir, I move the following amendments.

Delete Clause 6(3)(c)(i)(f)(ii)



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
34

344. In the entry in column(3) against Serial number C in ANNEXURE I1
proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Motor Vehicles Taxation Act,
1976 by clause 6(3)(d)(i), for the figure “2000.00” substitute the
figure “1500.00”.

Shri Anwar Sadath: Sir, I move the following amendment.

330. In Clause 6(3)(c)(i)(g)(ii) for the figure and symbol“13%, the figure
and symbol “12%” shall be substituted.

Shri P. K. Basheer : Sir, I move the following amendment.

334. In the entry in column (3) against item 7B in serial no. A in
ANNEXURE-1 proposed to be inserted in the Kerala Motor Vehicle
Taxation Act, 1976 by clause 6(3)(c)(i)(j) for the figure and symbol
“5% the figure and symbol” 3%” shall be substituted.

o). 189ad: NIOMIMBea]s @D GRBVM1EU3 MVI1E:@1H63MEM=0?

WMHHIOVY0Jo HWQo moeg(gﬂ@’l (awa. Sl afo. BMINAV" afMVBs) :
a3, oMW  ERA®GIafly]  291-00  ®maud  B8WeE3PWS: RV
@RoW1HA1HHMOAIM” BREIAMAISBMN. 0] GBROM1HUd TVI1dhalasamlel.

ol aV1end:  MIe0MIMea]g  WMHIQY0Je  HWQo moe;(g;l@’l

@RAUMOa{la) 291-20 maud 3DE300 1 G_BLM] GV

@010 12 [101H63aM0.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
35

W ama%ua 203" afl. GRA®E1a{la) 292, 300, 307, 318, 322, 327, 331,
342 agam1 mmid eV 1HUd TVE M1EIB:0] 4 161H3a0.

@1 alo0sO@d  @oiel  @RAIMAla{la) 295-00 mmId 6_3L®IT qUVE
M1 012f101H630M0.

Wl 60R]. afo. 620 BRAUMOlafla 297-00 mMUB GRE3LM] aVE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

U@ a1OMIENIW8 2AYIM @RAIMGIafla] 301-00 MMIG GE3L®] aVE
M1 012f1@1H6300.

Wl Od. af)o. aHIE] @RA®EIA{la] 304, 350 aganT MMUB GREL® U3
Ve M1RIM0]2[161H80M0.

@l al. a5l ERAI®GIa{la] 305, 339 ag)aM1 MG ERBVLDIG:UW aLE
M1 012f1@1H6300.

Wl afl. M. 6RBR" @RA®AIa(la] 319-00 maud 6V aqUE



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
36

M1EIB0]afl@HBs30M.

GAWO. af)o. O. M3 ERAIMGIa{la) 324, 344 agam1 MIUB RV 1BU3
Ve M1RIM012[1a1H80M0.

Wl @MBad auisom GPAIMAlafla] 330-00 moud eV  aUVE
M1IB0]afl01Hs30M.

Wl afl. o MmaHld @RAMGlafly] 334-00 mUA GB3VL™]  aVE

M0 01 2f101H6300.
CRBULM] §2lQY@EJHI0ABS @Yo ldsa| MILNO3 BIVAIBHNIGAI af)aM
(@JUYOO
@RABBLINASBMAIA. . ............
Q@GS LNABIMAIA.....cc.eeeeeeee..

CRBULM] §4a1Q) @JHI0ABB @RYOJo Aldsqaf MILfload BIVAIBHIMOA
@JUgo VR @RV 1d@12[1E1B83aTD

CRRMI .21Q (@JHIVAYBS BRYOJo Aldsq | mileNlond cIWMIWIBlBsMD.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
37

3920 Qldsal

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac): Sir, I move the

following official amendment.

356.

359.

391.

360.

In section 37C of the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 (15
of 1991) proposed to be substituted by clause 7, of the Bill,-

(a) in sub-section (5), for the words and figures “31°* July, 2020 the
words and figures “30™ November, 2020” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (7), for the words and figures “31* December,
2020 the words and figures “31% March, 2021” and for the word
“dealer” wherever they occur the word “assessee” shall be
substituted;

(c) in sub-section (11), after the word “Appeals” the words “and
Revisions” shall be inserted.

Shri K. C. Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendmente::.

In section 37C(1)(i) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word “fifty”
the words “twenty five” shall be substituted.

In the proviso to Section 37(c)(5) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991, by Clause 7, for the word
“thirty” the word “seventy five” shall be substituted.

Shri P.T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 37C(1)(i) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala



392.

361.

394.

362.

393.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
38

Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word “fifty”
the word “thirty” shall be substituted.

In the proviso to Section 37(c)(5) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991, by Clause 7, for the word
“thirty” the word “ninety” shall be substituted.

Shri M. Vincent: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 37C(1)(i) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word “fifty”
the words “thirty five” shall be substituted.

In the proviso to Section 37(c)(5) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991, by Clause 7, for the word
figures, letters and symbol “on or before 31 March, 2021” the words,
figures, letters and symbol “on or before 30" September, 2021” shall
be substituted.

Shri V. S. Sivakumar: Sir, I move the following amendments.

In section 37C(1)(i) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word “fifty”
the word “forty” shall be substituted.

In the proviso to Section 37(c)(5) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991, by Clause 7, for the
words, figures, letters and symbol “on or before 31* March, 2021” the
words, figures, letters and symbol “on or before 31% July, 2021”
shall be substituted.

Shri Abdul Hameed P.: Sir, I move the following amendments.




363.

388.

411.

412.

366.

368.

409.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
39

In section 37C(1)(i) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word “fifty”
substitute the words “fifty five”.

In the proviso to Section 37(c)(5) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991, by Clause 7, for the word
'July' the word 'October’ shall be substituted.

In section 37C(9) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, the words “or in any
judgement, decree or order of any court, tribunal or appellate
authority” shall be deleted.

The following proviso shall be added to section 37C(9) proposed to
be substituted in the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by
clause 7:

“Provided that, the total amount paid by any assesse shall not be
greater than the sum of the principal amount, interest and other
penalties™.

Shri V. D. Satheesan: Sir, I move the following amendments.

In section 37C(1)(ii) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word “forty”
the word “twenty” shall be substituted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer: Sir, I move the following amendments.

In section 37C(1)(ii) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word “thirty”
the words “forty five” shall be substituted.

The proviso to section 37C(8) proposed to be substituted in the



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
40

Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, shall be
deleted.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendments.

372. In section 37C(2) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word
"reduction”, the words "exemption" shall be substituted.

384. In section 37C(5) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the figure, letter
and word "31% July, 2020" the figures, letters, word and symbol "30™"
September, 2020" shall be substituted wherever they occur.

Shri V. T. Balram: Sir, I move the following amendments.

378. In section 37C(3) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the words "to the

effect" the words and figures "within a span of 90 days" shall be
added.

405. In the proviso to section 37C(7) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word

“four” the word “five” shall be substituted.

Shri Roji M. John: Sir, I move the following amendment.

379. In section 37C(3) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the words "to the

effect" the words and figures "within a span of 120 days" shall be
added.



404.

380.

381.

407.

382.

386.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
41

In the proviso to section 37C(7) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word
“thirty” the word “sixty” shall be substituted.

Smt. Shanimol Osman: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 37C(5) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the words, letters
and figures "on or before 31% July 2020" the words, letters and figures
"on or before August 31 2020" shall be substituted.

Shri T. J. Vinod: Sir, I move the following amendmentex:.

In section 37C(5) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the words, letters
and figures "on or before 31% July 2020" the words, letters and figures
"on or before September 30™ 2020" shall be substituted.

In the proviso to section 37C(7) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the word
“four” the word “six” shall be substituted.

Shri Anil Akkara: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 37C(5) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 by clause 7, for the words, letters
and symbols "31% July 2020" the words, letters and symbols "31°*
August, 2020" shall be substituted.

Shri Manjalamkuzhi Ali: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In Section 37(c)(5) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
42

Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991, by Clause 7, for the figures,
letters, word and symbol “31st July, 2020” the figures, letters, word
and symbol “31* October, 2020” shall be substituted.

Shri_Anwar Sadath: Sir, I move the following amendment.

389. In the proviso to Section 37(c)(5) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991, by Clause 7, for the word
“thirty” the word “forty five” shall be substituted.

Shri _ Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan: Sir, I move the following

amendment.
390. In the proviso to Section 37(c)(5) proposed to be substituted in the

Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991, by Clause 7, for the word
“thirty” the word “sixty” shall be substituted.

o). Y199@: MU20MIM g O@D] RO U3 MVI1E:@1HBaTOEMR)?

WMI0Y0Jo BHVQo Qldhq QD] (awa. Sl. af)o. GMINAV" ANV ):

aud, emIM  EPAI®Glafla] 356-00 ®mMUd B8ME3YWIE:  GBROMI
@01 O189HMOAM” @RERYIAMAOTABMD. AQ” BV 1HU3 MVfld:@1asamlel.

ol aVlenad: MIa0MIMea]g WML  HWQo (').Io@e»gd@q

@RAIMO1a {12} 356-00 mmid 3633001 GRBIOM™] e



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
43

@010 2[101H88300.

Wl o, al. ¢ROMan @AU®GIafla] 359, 391 agaml maud
GRRVMI1HU3 MR MIPIBHA]2[lB1H63aTM.

Wl all. sl e®nay’ @rAmGlafla) 360, 392 agan1 maud
GRBLM KU MR MAIBA]2[1A1H63M.

@ ogo. all@eavad” @eai®mdlafla) 361, 394 opaml  mmud
GRBLM KU MR MAIBO12[1A1H63aM.

Wl all. a0 wWlaeknod @A®Glafla) 362, 393 apan1 maud
GRBRVMI1HU3 MR MIRIBHA2[lB1H63aTM.

W cmau@m*& a0n18” afl. eRAI®Glafla) 363, 388, 411, 412 agan
MMIB GRARVMIMHUI MVE M1BIB:A12[1B1H30.

@l al. awl. avmlvomd @RAI®GIa{la] 366-00 M3 B3V aVE
MEIBO] 2[101H630M.

GAI. af)o. O. oMIB @RA®Alafla) 368, 409 oMl maud

GRBRVMI1HU3 MR MIPIBHA]2[lB1H63aTM.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
44

O@)oan. ERMIE" 2000TVM ®eEBUW @PAMOlaflsl 372, 384 agan’
MMUG BGRAVMIHHUI MVE M1DIBO12{l1B1H8300.

Wl all. sl mu@dnde @AUGGIafly] 378, 405 agpan1 maud
GRRVLMI1HU3 MR M1PIBHA]2[lo1H63aTM.

Wl 600=]l ago. 6o  @RAMOla{la) 379, 404 agam1 maud
GRBULM KU VR MOIBO]2[1A1H63aM.

12 aHIMIEMIUT DIVIM @RAIMAIaflaf 380-00 MMIA BBV LB
M1EIBA1 2[101H63aM.

Wl sl ez allemisd” ePaA®Glafla) 381, 407 agaml maud
GRRVLMI1HU3 MR MIPIBHA2[lo1H63aTM.

Wl EPMIA EREDO GRAIMAlafla] 382-00 mmUd eGeBV®] auVE
M1RIGO12[10156300.

W) nePMBIod:¢]l @ell ERAMOlafls] 386-00 MMUG 6BRV®] qVLE

M1EIBO] 2[101H63aM0.

Wl BPMAId MVIBO® @BRAIMAIa{la] 389-00 mMIB G_BVW®I aVE



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
45
MEIBO1 2[101H63aM.
@W). @®IBAIYE EIWIG) UMD @RAIMGafla] 390-00 MmMIB ceEL®]
ME M1RIH A1 2[101H63aTM.
¢RRNMI] §21Q(JHIVABB BP0 Qldsq| MLNO03 BIVAILHICHI af)aM
@JUIOOD
@R BZBLNHABOMAIA. .. ........
(@J®1gBellasamala..........
RO §a1Q(JHI0ABB BP0 Qs MiLfload  BIVAIBHIMORIM

@JUgo VR @RV 1d@12[l@1BsaT.

CRRINMI] 621QY(JHI0ABS a@¥PIo Aldhal Mmilefload fIVNIW1BISs3MM.

af)390 Qdsal

Smt. Shanimol Osman: Sir, I move the following amendment.

414. Clause (114)(d) of section 2 proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
State Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 by Clause 8(1) shall be
recast as follows:

“(d) Ladakh and Jammu and Kashmir”

Shri Abdul Hameed P: Sir, I move the following amendmentey:.



416.

420.

428.

430.

421.

427.

423.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
46

In item (a) of the proviso to Section 30(1) proposed to be substituted
in the Kerala State Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 by clause 8(5)
for the word “thirty” the word “fifty” shall be substituted.

In Section 132(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala State
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 by clause 8(9)(i), for the word

“causes” the words “become a cause to any” shall be substituted.

In clause 8(10), the words, figures and symbol “with effect from the
1* day of July, 2017” shall be deleted.

In clause 8(11), for the words, figures and symbol “in sub section
(1), in the proviso” the words, figures and symbol “in the proviso to
subsection(1)” shall be substituted.

Shri C. Mammutty: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In Section 132(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala State
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 by clause 8(9)(i), for the word
“causes” substitute the word “abet”.

In Section 132(1)(c) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala State
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 by clause 8(9)(ii), for the word
“fraudulently” substitute the word “wilfully”.

Shri Anil Akkara: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In Section 132(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala State
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 by clause 8(9)(i), for the words
“retain”, the word “obtain” shall be substituted.

Shri _ Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan: Sir, I move the following




24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
47

amendment.

424. In Section 132(1) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala State
Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 by clause 8(9)(i), for the word
“retain” the word “enjoys” shall be substituted.

Shri K. C. Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendment.
431. In the proviso to Section 172(1) proposed to be substituted in the

Kerala State Goods and Services Tax Act, 2017 by Clause 8(11), for
the words, “five years” the words “four years” shall be substituted.

o). eead: MIa0nIMeals 2@ 6B3LMIHRUE TV E:E1e8MEMs0?

WMHIVY0Jo HWQo O.IoSaqd@f] (6awa. Sl af)o. EMINAV" HafVD):

MA@, ERVMIGHABIM0 MVflGG1esIM1Ll.

o). 169ad: A axIMIERUd ©MYIM BRAIMGala] 414-00 MmMUAD

GRRVWMI] VB MTIB®2{101H630.

W (BTOGT).I@(ZS’ZS a0018” afl. @RAIMO1a{la) 416, 420, 428, 430 agaml
MMIB GRARVMIMHUI MVE M1BIBA12[1B1H30.

Wl aVl. 031 BRAIME)ala] 421, 427 agyam1 maud 6REL®IG:U3 aVE



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
48
MEIBO1 2[101H63aM.
@) @M GPERO GPAMGIa{la] 423-00 ®mMUd G_3LMI aVE
M1 012[1@1H660M0.

@W). ®1@WOIYE EIWIGHHM @RAI®MANafla) 424-00 MMIB GBRL®)]

MR MOIBO]2[1G1H66800.

W od. aVUl. ¢RoMVal” @RAIMOIa{la] 431-00 mMUB GE3L®I aUVE
MEIBO] 2[l01H630M.
af)500 Qlsaf mieload BIVNMIGHIGAI af)aIM @JUIODOD
@RABLIHAEB0MAIA. ... ...
@J®1gBelasamala..........
af)SJ0 Qldsa | enflefload BOUNAMIABNEMHAAM (@JUgo e
@010 12 [101H63aM0.
af)5%0 Qlsal mileflond conmwlalssan.

@Wl. . al. @ROMaO: V6, WA  aHIMIEAOUd  DaYOd

@AU®OIafla] 414-00 ®mmud eeRV®IVIG @ basic error @M’



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
49
2JNB1ENM|®.  MVoMOIMEBBROS alSlHWIAIB8 =00 @AY &HIUY1Ad
DG 0Ud @(E‘?,QV @REl, GREMIMW QMW §SOISO1WIEM . ERMIMIG3 200
@AY $HUR1Iolem QMW §©S01S0T BRWI] OUdNq|FOMEMo. ERMIMIEM’

@PeOdONM Qai” §21QYT1E83aN Y.

WMI0Y0Je SHWQo Qldra Aa] (6awa. Sl. ago. GMIAANV HafNVH) :

M3, GHMB @RYRHIM™ BRAEOIWAIW] AUGBO@DAN AIQAM”.  ANBEMIalMo
9alQ @H0o 2@ MR GREOLMI] §alQYINd cmow’loe@@%;. G (3

NAIIMOAAZ" 2090 AIBAWEMIOUY MRG0 AIQo AUGBODJo.

SN0 Qldhaf

Minister For Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac): Sir, I move

the following official amendment.
432. (1) In section 12 of the Kerala Finance Act, 2019 (5 of 2019) proposed
to  be substituted by sub-clause (1) of Clause 9 of Bill,-

(a) to sub-section (1), the following Explanation shall be inserted,
namely:-

“Explanation.- Arrears for the purpose of this section shall include
the tax remaining unpaid as on the date of option, under clause (a) of



433.

434.

435.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
50

sub-section (1) of section17B of the former Act pursuant to the payment
of compounding fee mentioned therein”;

(b) in sub-section (5) for the words and figures “31st July, 2020”
the words and figures “30"™ November, 2020” shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-section (7) for the words and figures “31st December,
2020” the words and figures “31"™ March, 2021” shall be substituted;

(d) in sub-section (12), for the word “Dealers” the word
“Assessees” shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-clause (2), in clause (b), words “ figures and” shall
be omitted;

Shri P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 12(1)(i) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance
Act, 2019 by Clause 9(1), for the word “fifty” the words “twenty
five” shall be substituted.

Shri M. Vincent: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 12(1)(i) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance
Act, 2019 by Clause 9(1), for the word “fifty” the word “thirty” shall
be substituted.

Shri V. S. Sivakumar: Sir, I move the following amendments.

In section 12(1)(i) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance
Act, 2019 by Clause 9(1), for the word “fifty” the words “thirty five”
shall be substituted.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
51

462. In the proviso to section 12 (7) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Finance Act, 2019 by Clause 9(1) for the word “instalment”
the word “instalments” shall be substituted.

Shri Abdul Hameed. P: Sir, I move the following amendment.

437. In section 12(1)(i) of the Kerala Finance Act, 2019 proposed to be
substituted by Clause 9(1), for the word “fifty” the word “sixty” shall
be substituted.

449. In section 12(2) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance Act,
2019 by clause 9(1) for the words “such assessee shall not be liable
for payment of any collection charges” the words “the revenue
authority shall not receive any of the charges in this regard from the
assessee from the date of settlement” shall be substituted.

Shri Sunny Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendments.

440. In section 12(1)(ii) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance
Act, 2019 by Clause 9(1), for the word “forty” the word “twenty”
shall be substituted.

458. In the proviso to section 12(5) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Finance Act, 2019 by clause 9(1) for the words and figures
“on or before 31* March, 2021”, the words and figures “on or before
30™ September, 2021” shall be substituted.

Shri V. D. Satheesan: Sir, I move the following amendments.

441. In section 12(1)(ii) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance
Act, 2019 by Clause 9(1), for the word “forty” the words “twenty



459.

443,

444,

450.

453.

454,

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
52

five” shall be substituted.

In section 12(7) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance Act,
2019 by clause 9(1) for the words and figures “on or before 31%
December, 2020”,the words and figures “on or before 31™ March,
20217 shall be substituted.

Shri V. T. Balram: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 12(1)(ii) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance

Act, 2019 by Clause 9(1), for the word “ thirty” the words “ fifty
five” shall be substituted.

Shri Parakkal Abdulla: Sir, I move the following amendments.

In section 12(1)(ii) of the Kerala Finance Act, 2019 proposed to be
substituted by clause 9(1) for the word “thirty” the word “sixty” shall
be substituted.

In section 12(3) of the Kerala Finance Act, 2019 proposed to be
substituted by clause 9(1) for the words “for opting for” the word
“on” shall be substituted.

clause 9(1) for the words “such assessee shall not be liable for
payment of any collection charges” the words “the revenue authority
shall not receive any of the charges in this regard from the assessee
from the date of settlement™” shall be substituted.

In section 12(4) of the Kerala Finance Act, 2019 proposed to be
substituted by clause 9(1) for the words “and penalties” the words
“penalties and all other charges” shall be substituted.

In section 12(5) of the Kerala Finance Act, 2019 proposed to be
substituted by clause 9(1) for the word “July” the word “October”



457.

463.

465.

466.

461.

464.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
53

shall be substituted.

In the proviso to section 12(5) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Finance Act, 2019 by clause 9(1) for the word “July” the word
“October” shall be substituted.

In section 12 (9) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance
Act, 2019 by Clause 9 (1) the words and symbol “,under any
circumstances” shall be deleted.

In section 12 (9) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance
Act, 2019 by Clause 9 (1) the following proviso shall be inserted:
“Provided that the total amount paid by any assesse shall not be
greater than the sum of the principal amount, interest, and other
penalities.

The section 12 (13) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala
Finance Act, 2019 by Clause 9(1) shall be deleted.

Smt. Shanimol Osman: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In the proviso to section 12 (7) proposed to be substituted in the
Kerala Finance Act, 2019 by clause 9(1) for the word “thirty” the
word “sixty” shall be substituted.

Shri T. J. Vinod: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 12 (9) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance
Act, 2019 by Clause 9 (1) the following proviso shall be added:

“Provided that if the amount settled under the scheme is found to be
erroneous in subsequent verification of the commissioner, the amount
settled under the scheme will be adjusted subsequently”.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
54

Shri P. K. Basheer: Sir, I move the following amendment.

467  In section 12 (13) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance
Act, 2019 by Clause 9(1) the word “full” shall be substituted with the
word “complete”.

Prof. Abid Hussain Thangal: Sir, I move the following amendment.

469. In section 12 (13) proposed to be substituted in the Kerala Finance
Act, 2019 by Clause 9(1) the word “review” shall be substituted with
the word “examine”.

o). 189ad: NIOMIMBAa]s AAD] GRBVM1E:U3 MVI1E:@1H63M0EM=0?

WMHHIOVY0Jo HWQo m&%@q (@awa. Sl af)o. BMINAV" afVB) :

@, IMW  @RAIMOlafla) 432-00 ®mUd  SWE3LWI:  GRBVM]

@RoNTHolSNMOAIN”  @PEJAMOISBM. Wyl  aill.  aaVv.  wlale:n0a@

@A G flaf 462-00 MMIAB RV MVE:@1HEBMD.

ol.  aVlanad: mMIa0MIMealg WML  HWQo mﬁarg‘d@q
@RAIMOafly] 432-00 MMId 8Med3PWld: eerVIo Wyl ail. ag)aV’
WlaIE:008  ERAUIMO]a(la) 462-2 mMd  6BROLmIQe  aLe

@RoU 101 2[101H630TM.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
55

@1 afl. Sl @V’ @RAU®Alafla] 433-00 maud 6_BY™I aVE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

@ ogo. oN@davad’ @eoI®dlafla) 434-00 MM e_BVL®I  ave
M1EIB0]afl@1Hs30M0.

@1 afl. oMV WlAGN03 BRAIMGlafla] 435-00 MM GV aLE
M1EIB0] 2fl@1H630M.

1. mméua a0018” all. @A®Eafla] 437, 449 agam1 mMUG cREVW1B:U3
MR MRIMH 01 2[1@1H63M0.

@) avam1 ¢ROMVal’ @RAIMAIa s 440, 458 oM MMUG RN B0
VR M1EIM 01 aflolHs30M0.

Wl afl. Wwl. avevom erAIm@lafls] 441, 459 agyam maUd 6REL®IGU3
VR M1EIMH A1 aflalH630M0.

@1 afl. sl miadnde GBRAMGIafla] 443-00 maUd G_EVL™I aVE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

W1, ald0BH®3 @oeniel @p®dafla) 444, 450, 453, 454, 457, 463,

465,466 ag)anT mmid cREBLMIHU TV MEIBE]2{le1H80M.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
56

WG] HIMIEDOUWS 2aYIM @RAIMAIafla] 461-00 maUE 6BV aLE
M0 01 2f101H6300.
Wl sl ez allemisd” @AUA®MOlafla] 464-%0 ®maud c_3L®1 ave
M1EIB0]afl@1Hs30M0.
Wl afl. od. maHld @RAUMCIafla) 467-00 Mm@ celY®] auE
M1EIB0] 2fl@1H630M.
O@Joan. BRMIE" 2006VM MEBUWY ERAIMAIa{ls] 469-00 MMIB GEEVL®I
MR MRIMH 01 2[1@1H63M0.
CRRM] §21QYE@JHI0ABB 30Bal®Io Aldhsal Mmiefloa  BIVAIHHICNHI
o) (@JROOD
@RMBLIA6MMAIA. (.. ...
@Q®gelasamald..........

GRRULMI 021Q(JH008S B300al®lo Aol snflefead

BOAIBHEIMOAMD (@JUQo MV BRoW 101 afl@1es30M.

v

clelflo]! 0 21Q(aJHO0NSSB SMal®Io Qldsa | enfelleoad

LINMIWIB1HABM.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
57

alOm90 QAldzal

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac): Sir I move the

following official amendment.

473.

474.

479.

483.

(a) To sub-clause (1) of clause 10 of the Bill, the following
Explanation

shall be inserted, namely:-

“Explanation.- Arrears for the purpose of this section shall include the
tax remaining unpaid as on the date of option, under clause (a) of sub-
section (1) of section 74 of the former Act pursuant to the payment of
compounding fee mentioned therein”.

(b) in sub-clause (5), for the words letters and figures “31°* July, 2020”
the words letters and figures “30™ November, 2020” shall be
substituted;

(c) in sub-clause (7), for the word “dealer” the word “assessee” and
for the

words letters and figures “31* December, 2020” the words and figures
“31st March, 2021” shall respectively by substituted;

(d) in sub-clause (12), for the word “dealer” the word “assessee” shall
be substituted.

Shri Abdul Hameed P. : Sir, I move the following amendments.

In clause 10(1) the words and symbol “or in any judgement, decree or
order of any court or tribunal or appellate authority” shall be deleted.

In clause 10(1)(i) for the word “fifty” the word “sixty” shall be
substituted.

In clause 10(1)(ii) for the word “forty” the word “fifty” shall be



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
58

substituted.

488. In clause 10(2) the words “which will then be binding on the revenue
authorities” shall be deleted.

493. In clause 10(5), for the word "July" the word "December" shall be
substituted.

502. In the proviso to clause 10(7), for the word "instalment" the word
"installments" shall be substituted.

Shri Anil Akkara: Sir, I move the following amendment.

476. In clause 10(1)(i) for the word “fifty” the word “thirty” shall be
substituted.

Shri_Anwar Sadath: Sir, I move the following amendment.

477. In clause 10(1)(i) for the word “fifty” the words “thirty five” shall be
substituted.

Shri  Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan: Sir, I move the following

amendment.

478. In clause 10(1)(i) for the word “fifty” the word “forty” shall be
substituted.

Shri P.T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

480. In clause 10(1)(ii) for the word “forty” the word “fifteen” shall be
substituted.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
59

Shri K.C. Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendments.

481. In clause 10(1)(ii) for the word “forty” the word “twenty” shall be
substituted.

482. In clause 10(1)(ii) for the word “forty” the words “twenty five” shall
be substituted.

Shri K. M. Shaji: Sir, I move the following amendment.

484. In clause 10(1)(ii) for the words “lump sum” the word “full” shall be
substituted.

Shri Parakkal Abdulla: Sir, I move the following amendments.

490. In clause 10(3) for the words “for opting for” the word “on” shall be
substituted.

491. In clause 10(4) for the words “and penalties” the words “penalties
and all other charges” shall be substituted.

492. In clause 10(5) for the word “July” the word “October” shall be
substituted.

494. In the proviso to clause 10(5), for the word "July" the word "October"
shall be substituted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer: Sir, [ move the following amendment.

497. In clause 10(6), for the word "submission" the word "receipt” shall be
substituted.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
60

Shri T. A. Ahammed Kabeer: Sir, I move the following amendment.

498. In clause 10(7), for the word and figure "December, 2020" the word
and figure "March 2021" shall be substituted.

WM HIB0Jo HWQo Qloeugd@pﬁ (awa. Sl af)o. BMINAV" af)VB>) :

a3, o  @RAIMAlafls]  473-00 MMUE  BVEEPWIH  GRBAOM]
@oW1HA1HPEMHATN” EREIBAMOIHBIN. B ERMIG 2013 all. BRADCI 2]
502-20 Mm@ 6e3L®] ALNBGE1H80M0. 0] EBEBVMIHU3 MVfl;h@lasan1al.

ol V1@ MIa0MIMea]g WMEHIQL0QJe  HWQo moeagd@ﬁ

@RAIMA)afly] 473-00 MU B8ME31WE: GRROLMIWL Y. @ENYEB 200"
afl. @RAI®@lafla] 502-%0 maud eI MVE @RV 1E:@]2flB1esaM.

Wl (msmg(csﬁ a0018” afl. @RAUGGafla) 474, 479, 483, 488, 493 agan’
MMIAB GBI 1HHUI MVE MTAIB®12{1B1H63aTM.

W)l EPMI@ GRPEO0 @RAMAlafls] 476-00 ®mIUd es3L®]  aLE
M1EIB01afl@1Hs30M0.

@l eP@MAd qVIBO  @RAMAlafla] 477-%0 ®md eV aLvE



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
61

M0 01 2f101H6300.

@) @GO OWIGHMW  @PAI®R)afla] 478-20 MMIB GREZO®T aVE
M0 01 2f1@1H6300.

Wl afl. Sl ecmay eRAU®Glafla) 480-00 Mmaud ee3L®]  aLE
M1EIB0]afl01Hs30M.

@ . MU ROTVal’ BRAIMEa{la] 481, 482 agyam1 MMIB GREBV®I1E:U3
VR MRIMH 01 2[1@1H6300.

Wl o af)o. oudEl cGRAMOlafla] 484-00 ®mMUB ce3L®] avE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

W, al0HHm®3 @oeniel @RAImOlafla) 490, 491, 492, 494, agam1 maud
GRBULM KU VR MTRIME1afld1Hs30M0.

GAWI. af)o. Od. MIB GRA®Elafla] 497-00 ®mmUd c_BL®1 ave
M0 01 2f101H6300.

W Sl ag). @ERa0E" HMAB BRAUMGIa{ly 498-00 MMUG 3L aVE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

CRRM] §alQ @JNHIVYBB alOMIo Aldhal M1Lload  RIVAIHHICNH]



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
62

af)IM @JROOD
@R ZBLNA6aMAIA. .. ........
@J®1gBellasamala..........
CRRNMI] §al1Q (@JHIVABS o lOMIo Aldsal MLl BINMIBHIMOAIM
@JUgo VB BRoW BT 2{l1@1Bs30M.
GBI §al1Q) (@JHIABB alOM0 Aldsq | ilelload oAV TIesM.

al®1OMIaNI0 Qldhal

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac): Sir I move

the following official amendment.

504. (a) In sub-clause (2) of clause 11 of the Bill, for the words and figures
“31% July, 2020” the words and figures “30™ November, 2020 shall
be substituted;

(b) In sub-clause (5) of clause 11 of the Bill, for the words and
figures “ 31 December, 2020” the words and figures “ 31t March,
2021”7 shall be substituted.

Shri Abdul Hameed P.: Sir, I move the following amendment.

505. In clause 11 (1), the words “or in any judgement, decree or order of
any court or tribunal or appellate or revisional authority” shall be

deleted.



507.

510.

511.

508.

509.

512.

513.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
63

Shri Parakkal Abdulla : Sir, I move the following amendments.

In clause 11 (1) (i) for the word “ on” the word “ of” shall be
substituted.

In clause 11 (1) (iii) for the word “ on” the word “ of” shall be
substituted.

In clause 11 (1) (iii) for the words “and interest” the words “interest
and all other charges” shall be substituted.

Shri Roji M. John: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In clause 11 (1) (ii) for the word “one” the word “two” shall be
substituted.

Shri V. T. Balram: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In clause 11 (1) (iii) for the word “two” the word “three” shall be
substituted.

Shri T. J. Vinod: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In clause 11 (2) for the words, figures and letters “on or before “31*
July 2020” the words, figures and letters “on or before 30" September
2020 shall be substituted.

Smt. Shanimol Osman: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In clause 11 (2) for the words, figures and letters “on or before 31*
July 2020” the words, figures and letters “on or before 31* October
2020 shall be substituted.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
64

o). 189a@ 1 NIEOMIMea]s AAD] BRBVDIB:03 MVI1BA1HBMMEENEI?

WM HIVY0Jo HWQo moeh%:!@ﬁ (awa. Sl. ag)o. CMINAV Hag)IVH): VA,

ow®o VAT mlaoles @Yoo MIIYeS  &BdalaH® @IO®IQo  &HS1YY1H
@PSIMES8 MIO®IQo 3130eiq 1892088mIem”. 6mMIM @RAIMAIa{la) 504-00
MMIB 8VEEJWIH: GBRVLMI BRoVIHRHO1EHIMORIN” BREIABMOISBIM. 7Y
¢RI 1HU3 MVfld@lesanlel.

ol. 1H9A@: MIaONIMAA]g WMHHIVY0Jo HWQo O_|o93<2;l@n| @RAI®MO1o (1]
504-20 maud 8MEELOWIH: 3L MVE @RV M@ 4{lE1esaM.

@ﬂ.«mm%ua 2013 afl. @AMGlafla) 505-0%0 maud  eesw®]l auve
M1EIB0]afl01HBs30M.

W ald0HHTI @oenJel @AU®Cafly) 507, 510, 511 agan1 maud
GRBULMIHHU3 MB MTQIM0]2[101H630M0.

Wl @00kl ago. 6RO  ERAIMAlafla] 508-00 mMUd  celL®] aVE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

@l afll. sl muminde ERAMGIa{la] 509-00 maud  esdL® ave

M1EIB01afl01Hs30M.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
65

@1 sl ez allemod” GraImGIaflal 512-00 maud  G_BL™I aue
M0 01 2f101H6300.

U@ HIMERWS OB @RAIMGIafla] 513-00 mMUB  ee3LGI aUVE
M1EIB0]afl@1Hs30M0.

clelhlo] 0 21Q(@JHI0ABSB al®1emMIaNI0 Qs | enflefload
BOAIBHIGAI af)IM (@JUYOHDID
@RMBALNHAEBMAIA. .........
@®gelasamald..........
G_BUNMI 0 21Q(aJH00NSS Al 1HMIaMI0 Qo] enflefload
BIWMIBHMOAMM (@JUgo MVB BRoW @1 2[l@18830M.
clelhlo] 0 21Q(@JHI0ABSB al®1emMIaNI0 Qs | enflefload
BOUNMIWIA1HE3M0.

al@6N200 Qldsa |

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac): Sir I move

the following official amendment.

516. In sub-clause (1) of clause 12 of the Bill, in item(a), for the word,



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
66

letters and figures “ 30" April, 2019” the word, letters and figures
“ 30" April 2020” shall be substituted.

516-0%0 mmud 8eEE5WH: RENVGIVIM @PSWYI AWIRIBMIMGOS BRYoOHMAY]
6300l aHad (QIWIO]R &S1YQ1 @RSYIMSS QW] aganial

3132eila[lenoms88™I6eM.

Shri Parakkal Abdulla: Sir, I move the following amendment.

517. In clause 12(1)(a) for the word, figures, letters and symbol “30"
September, 2020” the word, figures, letters and symbol “31* March,
2021” shall be substituted.

Shri A. P. Anil Kumar: Sir, [ move the following amendment.

520. In clause 12(1)(c) for the words “six equal monthly instalments”, the
words “seven equal monthly instalments” shall be substituted.

Shri Anil Akkara: Sir, I move the following amendment.

521. In clause 12(1)(c) for the words “six equal monthly instalments”, the
words “eight equal monthly instalments” shall be substituted.

Shri Anwar Sadath: Sir, I move the following amendment.

522. In clause 12(1)(c) for the words "thirty six equal monthly instalments,
the words "ten equal monthly instalments" shall be substituted.

Shri Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan : Sir, I move the following




24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
67

amendment.

523. In clause 12(1)(d) after the words “under this section”, the words and
figure “within 3 months” shall be added.

Shri K. C. Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendment.

524. In clause 12(1)(d) after the words “under this section”, the words and
figure “within 4 months” shall be added.

Shri P T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

525. In clause 12(1)(d) after the words “under this section”, the words and
figure “within 6 months” shall be added.

o). 189ad: NIOMIMBAa]s @D GRBVM1EU3 MVIB@1H63MEM=0?

WMHI0Y0Je SHWQo Al ]A] (6awa. Sl. ag)o. EMINAV” eIV ): VB,
03HNw=-19 HorIsaN@ a@omesleje MSalSl  af)SABMDIEMI  GREAIH
quadaflesmmlemd 988 &oenawl 2020 m0dsf 31-m° eraVIMIesMOY,
2021 @93af 31 alo M5l H@BM@INss MI3e3wadem” 516-00  mmid
BVCBELUH CGRROMI. BR® @RoW1HA1LHHMHAMN” @R BMC1A3M.

2l. 1H9A@: MIaOAIMAA]g WMHHIVY0Jo HWQo moe;qﬂ@"l @AM Mo (la]

516-00 mMIB BDEBYIWH: BBROLDT VB @RV 1:E]2{IE1BsD.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
68

@1 a0OBH@ @PMIE] EROIMAq (1) 517-00 mmud@  cesuw®1 auve
M0 01 2f101H6300.

W1 af). all. @MIGI&H00E ERAU®GIa(la] 520-00 M3 6ERLM] aLE
M1EIB0]afl@1Hs30M0.

Wl @M GREOHO GBRAUMOIafla] 521-00 maud  ee3LY®] auvE
M1EIB0] 2fl@1H630M.

@) GRMAA3 qVIBEL @RAMAlafla] 522-00 maud  6BEV®I aULE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

©). @®IGBAIEDYA EIWIG UM @RAIMAIafla] 523-00 MMIB  GBEVL®] aVE
M1EIB01afl01Hs30M.

Wl & aUl. 6ROl GRAIMAIa{la] 524-00 mmud B3V aULE
M1EIB0] 2fl@1Hs30M.

@ afl. Sl c®daV @AmAlafla] 525-00 MU 6RO auLE
M0 01 2f101H6300.

CRRM] §alQYE]HIVABB o l@DeNRI0 Aldhal MmILload  BIVAIHHICNH]

af)aM (@ JUIEOTO)



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
69
@RMBLNHA6BMAIA. ...
@®Igelasanald..........
clelflo]! 0 21Q(aJHI0NSSB al@»6n820 Qldha enflefload
BIWNMIBHMOAMM (@JUgo MVB BRoW @1 2fl@18630M.
clelOloO]! 921Q@JH0ABS al@»6n=820 Qldsa | snfelfload

QIUNWMIW1B1HABM.

©). O, M. BRIMVas: VB, 516-00 MMIB 8DERLPWH: GRRVLGIHW

MoNITWla]” 8@ VoUdWo DANWIHNIMEME. MIaONIMAalS D@1 alles
106018 ®  m33a] 31  agamoem’  af)IMO@3  @RaJSlaflBlesan®”
a3l 30 agamoem’ M@ oB®Ie VEIWIVISSI®. agefl@d 30
10BN

2. 1693: @RHHNIQY0 allaNS” RGO §aIQYITI A TWIB:s0.

al®1gMoo Qldsal

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac): Sir, I

move the following amendment.



526.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
70

After clause 13 of the Bill the following clauses shall be inserted,
namely:-

“ 14. Extension of time limit.- Where, any time limit has been
specified in, or prescribed, under the specified Act terminates on
the 31t day of March, 2020 for the completion of compliance of
such action, as completion of any proceeding or passing of any
order or issuance of any notice relating to any assessment,
proceeding to determine, any tax, penalty or other amounts or
such other action, by whatever name called, by any authority,
under the provisions of the specified Act and where completion
or compliance or such action has not been made within such
time, then, the time limit for completion or compliance of such
action shall, notwithstanding anything contained in the specified
Act, stand extended to the 31t day of March, 2021.

Explanation.- For the purpose of this section, specified Act
means the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963, (15 of 1963), the
Kerala Tax on Laxuries Act 1976 (32 of 1976) (former Act), the
Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 ) 15 of 1991), the
Kerala Value Added Tax, 2003 (30 of 2004) (former Act).”

15. Validation.- Notwithstanding anything contained in the
Kerala Building Tax Act, 1975 (7 of 1975) any tax collected or
paid under section 5 at the rate specified in Schedule I of the said

Act, at such higher rates, by virtue of the provisions of the

Kerala Finance Bill, 2020 (Bill No, 257 of XIV Kerala



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
71

Legislative Assembly) in respect of the period with effect from
It day of April, 2020 to the date of publication of this Act, shall,
be deemed to have been validly collected or paid and the tax so

collected shall not be refunded,

Shri Parakkal Abdulla: Sir, I move the following amendment.

527. 1In Clause 13 for the words, figures and symbol 31 December,
20207 the words, figures and symbol “ 31t March, 2021”

shall be substituted.

0l. W1OHA@: NIaOMIMAa g @1 GRBULM1HUJ

V0186300 EM207

WMRHIVJ0Jo HWQo O.Io@arg;l@f] (awa. Sl. af)o. CMINAV Haf)VD):

@, emIM @RAMOla{la] SVEBLWIH: GRRLMIT @R 1;hAlBNMHRAN”

@REIAMOISs3M. 09 68RVM qufld:olesamlol.

ol aVlenad: MIa0M0Meals  WMHIQQJe  HWQo Qloea%;l@1

@U@ {la) 526-2 mmiad 36E3L0U GRBUIM] GV



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/N(;tz for Publication
@010 2[101H88300.
@1 al0HD3 LT @AU®MOIafla] 527-00 maud 6eRL®] aVE
M1 012[1@1H660M0.
GR3NM] ©21Q (@JHIOYSS8 13-00 Almaf milefload sowaoaeemenm
(@JROOD)
@RABZBLNA6BOMAIA. .. ...
@®1gelasamald.........
CRBULM] 219 (@JHIVNBS 13-90 Qidaf nofload BoWadaneMeAM
@JUgo VR @RV 1d@12[l@1BsaT.

GRBNMI §21Y) @J30088 13-00 alda| mileflead sowadwIalesmo.

B80NJ0 AUdsalo all01dH Qo Gal@o

Minister for Finance and Coir (Dr. T. M. Thomas Isaac): Sir, I

move the following official amendment.

6. For sub-clause (2) the following shall be substituted, namely:-
“ (2)Save as otherwise provided in this Act,-
(a) sub-section (10) of section 8 shall be deemed to have come
into force on the 18" day of May, 2020, sub section (1) and sub-



9.

24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
73
section (11) of section 8 shall be deemed to have come into force
on the 30" day of June, 2020 and the remaining provisions of
section 8 shall come into force on such date as the Government
may by notification in the official Gazette, appoint;
(b) the remaining provisions of the Act, shall be deemed to have

come into force on the 1* day of April, 2020.” .

Shri M. C. Kamaruddin: Sir, I move the following amendments.

In the long title the word “ certain” shall be deleted.

Dr. M. K. Muneer: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In the Preamble for the word “ certain” shall be deleted.

Shri V. T. Balram: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In the enacting formula for the word “ BE” the word “ Be”
shall be substituted.

Shri M. Vincent: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In clause 1 (2)(a), for the words “ on such date as the
Government may, by notification in the official Gazette,

appoint” the words “ at once” may be substituted.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
74

Shri Abdul Hameed. P: Sir, I move the following amendment.

17. Clause 1 (2) shall be recast as follows:-
“ (2) Except otherwise specified in this Act,-
All the provisions of this Act shall come into force on the 1% day

of April 2020” .

ol. a100a: NIaOMIMAa g @] C_RULM 103
OO BBMEENE0?

WMHHIVY0Jo HWQo mceag;l@’l (awa. Sl. af)o. CMINAV Aaf)aIVD):

@, emIM @RAMOla{la] BVEBLWIH: GRRNMIT @R 1;hAlBNEMHRAN”
@PEIAMOIHBM. 29 6BRVM1HUd Lf1dh0lesamlel.

ol.  aVlenad: MIa0M0Meals  WMEHIQ0QJe  HhWQo moaa(g;!@@

@RAUMGa{la] 6-00 MU B8DEBLPWIB: GRRVM] VB ERoV1E:A]4{lB1eBM.
Wl ago. M. H2Q31M @RAU®Glafla 1-00 maud ce3L®] auve
MEIBO] 2[101H630M.
GWI. af)o. 0. AMIB BRAU®Glafla] 2-%0 MaUd 6BRY®] aUe

M1 012[1@1H660M0.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/N(;tS for Publication
@1l all. sl. emdnde @RAIMGlafla] 4-00 ®maud G_3LMI aue
M1EIBO] 2[101H63aM.
@ ago. alddoauad’ @eaIMGlafla] 9-00 mMIB eV aULE
MEIBHA] 2[101H633aM.
1. mam@czsz“s 20137 afl. GRAU®GIa{la] 17-00 MMUd Ge_3V®I auve
M1RIBO12[101H6300.
CRBILM] 92l (@JHIVABB 30N Qldsqfo af1016HQo Gal®o milefload
BONDISHEMHAAN (@ JUISOID)
@RM0BLINAEBMMAIA. ... ...
@J®1&Belasamala.........
CRRVMI §2lQ) (@JHIOABS BANIo Qldhoo a0l Qo Gal@o milefload
BIUMIBNEMOAMM (@JUgo MVB BRoW @1 2fl@18830M.

CRBLM] 92l (@JHI0ABB 30MNJ0 Qldsqfo af1016HQo Gal®o milefload

CINMIWIDB1H30M0.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
76

WMHHIOY0Jo HWQo moemd@”l (awa. Sl. af)o. BMINA Daf)TVD):
aud, 2020-9e1 ¢H08 WMI0Y MG aIlATRIBHIMHAIN (@JEAWo EMIMD
@AM @ o {la6m0.

©lelnDIe1le} é(Tlﬂ@)QJO aJEIQITY  TVoQBHEMOJo Qloey%d@@ (Wl

0002 IBAB HSMa |85]1): VB, NI (JEAWHDED o 1aMIEBRD.

ol. ae9d: 2020-0e1 cHO8 WMy MG aldoTIGHEMHAAD
(JCGRW OO
@RAZBLNA6aMAIA. .. . ...
@J®1gBelasamala.........
2020-021 @HO8 WMHQY MG alDTIGNEMHAI  (@JEOWo aVB
@0 1@ 2[1B18830M0. MN@3 10V B18s30M.

(11) 2020-0e1 6308 WML (2-00 mmMIAB) nNN@I

WMHHIOY0Jo HWQo moemd@”l (awa. Sl. af)o. BMINAN Daf)TVD):

A, 2020-o0e1 CHOS WM (2-20 MmmIA) en@3

a1B1NEMM W B AHFANMHNAN (@JECAWo NI BRAUMD 1o (losaM.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
77

DDIO® Q)Y (W) af). O WIBMB): avd, ™M
(@GO allamIEBRAD.

Q6MBJ0 QAldsal

@l ago. . HSH0qQ3lad: avd, amIM  @INYa|0QAM  GRBUM]

@AM [lasan.

45. suemwo 2-@3 "all@aminiMo 621Q8q ]SO0 BRIWeS" ag)am
QAUIABHUIAB CUdaHo ' ANaHOODT' ag)aM QLS GalBH3H.

Wl. Sl. ag). @Ra0MZ" HMIAB: AVAE, AMINT MINPa|OQYIN CRRNM]BU3

@RAIM @ o {lasm0.

49.  auemwo 2-@3 " aN@amoalMo §21Q0a ]SO0 BAIQeS" agf)am
QOBBBHUIH3 BUAHO ' HIQJODIB' )N AUIBS” G2IBHBH:.
62. alemwo 2-@3 “ aV@IMO0WDo T ag)aM QB SF1QIIHBH:.

Wl 0aom8lod:¢l  @pell:  avd, amMIM  MINPa 0N  CRANM]

@AM @ o {la6m0.

52. auemwo 2-@3 "agQojo @RSOM " ag)aM’ QANEBH:U3HE” )Ml



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
78

" RGN BHSIGRI @REINOMaldHo" af)MNT QNOBHUD C2I@HRD:.

D@Joan. @RYMI3" 20000V  @6BBU3:. V@, aMIB  DINP|OWAN

C_RUNMI @RAIM®a {lo6aM0.
53, augmuo 2-@3 " @GO MOI®] £ 21QIN@AIV" af)aM NIBBGHUIHE
aldh0o " @GO MOI®] 21" a)aM AIBBHUY CalBSE .

@l all. gVl w@lald:m03: aqVE@, aMIA MINPal0QAN  GRBLMD]

@RAIM @ o {la6m0.
59.  ausmuo 2-@d "ajolsomlaad myoaiel” afm@Im’ aldo
"TUR0MMI© o JEISEOBIN" af)a’ GalBHED:.

. ail. Odh. MENYIaGlo &AM AVA, MIM MINPa|OQAN CRRVMD]

@RAIM@a {lasa0.
60. alemuo 2-@3 ¢ @REJHI00.  af)aD QNG BE1ABBDH:.

GAI. afo. . AMIAB: aVE, MW  DINP|OWAD  GRENM]

@AM @ {lasa0.

65. alemwo 2-@  “ aLEVMAIV] MAI®] HaIYIN@AVV”  af)a



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
79

QABHUWBES aldh0o * AVAOMAWT MO ©21QIN”  af)aD

QIDABHUD GalBHG3Ds.

2l. 1H9Ha@: MNIaONIMAa S 2AD] GRBNMDI1HU3
a0 @1 HB3M0EN2I7

WMHI0Y0Je HVQo A ]AAD] (@aw9. Sl. af)o. GMINNV Oaf)TVD):

MA@, ERVMIGHABIMMo MVfld:TG1esaM1Ll.

o). aVleed: Wl ago. AVl »aQ31mM eRAU®GIafla] 45-0%0 maud

GRBLM 1 VB M1DIKHO1a{lB1H630M0.

@ Sl ag). @GRa0ME" &HmMI13 GPAMEIa(lal 49, 62 oMl maud
GRBLM 1K U3 MR MBIBA]2[1A1H63aM.

). 2eOMBIo:Y] @Rell @AIMOlafla] 52-00 mMUB esR3V®] aULE
M1RIGO12[101H63M0.

O@Joan. @RMIE" 20000V ®EBUW BRAIMOIa{la] 53-00 MM
GRRVLMI] VB MTIB®2{101H630.

W ail. agaVl wWlAGn3 @AUMGIa{la] 59-%0 MmMB 3L qULE



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
80
MEIBO1 2[101H63aM.
W all. 9. MEY2adlo &6 @PAUMGafla] 60-00 MIUB GERRV™]
ME M1RIH A1 2[101H63aTM.
GAWI. af)o. . AMIB @RAUMGIafla] 65-00 mMIE ee3VL®] auLE
MNEIHA] 2[101H6830M.
@6N=200 Qldsal Mol BONAIGHMHAAN (@JUIHDD
@RMBLIH630MAIA. . .. ...
@®1gelasamald.........
@200  Qldkaf  mileflead BIWAIBHEMOAM  @JyQo VB
@010 2[161H800.

@8N0 Qldsal milefload c0nmIW1dlesm.

80NJo Adsalo all01dH Qo Gal@o

WMHHIOY0Jo HWQo moeaqd@ﬁ (aWI. Sl. ag)o. CMIDAV eV ):

V@, aMIM MINY]OQAN BVEBLIWTH: GBI BRAIMGa{lassa.

29. auemwo 1(2) ®999aj0®0 (@000 209!
"(2) o 2020 ag@fl@d 1-00 ®M®] (@Jomiely@m@3 AUM®IW]



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
81

HBOINQBSNBMIGM .

GAI. af)o. &dh. QANIB: aVE, aMIMW MINL|OWAN  CRBNM1HU3

@AM @ o {la6m0.

[13

. 3132210013 UHC™ @3 CHO8'  af)aM  AHHIMW  aldho
"MoMNIM”  af)aM QNG Gal@HB .
23. aN01aH0I@ ¢ Qamao1olosHI@"  af)dm  AEHIMD  aldho

@YU LMY BTEBHIM3 "' ag)aM AUIES” B2IBH63D:.

Wl. all. o, MENJIasdlo 0. VA, aMIMW  @INP|OQYAM

CRRNMIHHUY @RAIM@a [lasam.
8. 3130210018 UHOMIBE ¢ MABERUEBUWIGS” " af) M ANHHID GUaHo
"Ma" af)am QNG CalBLBH:.
21, afNol®@d ¢ aflngo " af)am QI0ES” SE1QU0SBH:.
27. oolaJayPal® IS ODI03 © ®009al0®o" af)aD AUISHIM ald0o

OMal0o" af)aM QIS CalBH3d:.

@ oll. &, MIaHI@: VG, MM MINYa|OWAN  CRANM]HHUI




24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
82

@RAIMN @ o {lasmo.

13

25. ®®IePald QAIGIOMIT T @I0Paj0Qo’  af) MMM  aldo

113

@Ol af)aTO 209 .

40. auemwo 1(2) ®e¢® aloWo (@JHo00 209!
“(2) oo wadimd  @Ro:»Alesam ®lo®l O3

(@JONIEIyE]@3 AUGBAN®IEM™.

©ol. V. aonsl: V@, aMIM MINPYalOQAN CRRNLM] BRAIM®1a [lasa.

32. auemwo 1(2) ®ae9ajowo @Je000 209 .
“ (2) oo 9sM (@JosnILIyOmIT AUIBIM®IEM”.”

Wl ogo. alldeauadt  avd, MmO @INY|OQAN  GRANM]

@AM @ o [lasa0.

36. auamwo 1(2) ®e9alo®o ()Hhono M0Q:
“(2) oo 2020 avlavomid 31-00 @I (@Joemnielyom1cd

Q@BAN®I.

DJoan. @RYMIE" 20OV  M6EBUI: V@, MIM  MINPa O

GBI BRAIMO1a[lasmn.

41. atemuo 1(2)-@3 “ @Mo®” o) QSHIW GUaHo “ BT



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
83

af)aM Gal@ABH:.

Wl @A o087 ol U@, aMIM @INP|OWAD  GRBNM]

@AM @ o {la6m0.

43. augmwo 1(2)-@d ¢ aimanmoem” af)M QO aldho

(13

QAUM®IVT HB®OAIESMB®IM  af)an QB G2IGHB3H:.

ol. a1ena: NIaOMIMO g QY] el lOIOI LI
M@ HBMMEENE0?

WMHHIOY0Jo HWQo mcﬁa%@ﬁ (aWI. Sl. af)o. CMIDAV" eV ):

@, MM @RAMGIalla] BMVE3WIH: CRRLM  BROW1GO1BNIMHNIM’
@PEIAMOISBM. 29 @BV 1HUd Lf1dholesamlel.

ol.  aVlenad: MIa0MIMeals  WMHIQ0Je  HWQo O_Ioaa(gd@']

@RAUMOa{la) 29-00 MU 8DEELWIG: GRRVM] VB EROV1E:@]4{lB1ABaM.
GAWO. ag)o. O&. AMIG ERAMAlaflal 1, 23 agam1 Mmaud 6eRV®1B:U3
MR MOIBO]2[161H6800.

@ afl. O&. MEYIa0lo G0 @RAIMAafla) 8, 21, 27 agam1 maud



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
84

GRBLM KU MR MBIBO]2[1A1H63aM.

Wl afl. & maHld eGRa®mlaflal 25, 40  agam1 ®aud
GRRVMI1HU3 MR MIPIBHA]2[lB1H63aTM.

@l avl. amsl @RAMGlafla) 32-0%0 moud  G_3L®]  aue
MNEIHA] 2[101H6830M.

@ ago. afl@eavad” @ealmclafla]  36-20 maud R3O aVE
MEIBO] 2[101H63aM.

o@)oan. @RYMIE" 20000VM ®@EBUS EPAMOlafls)  41-00 maud
GRRVWMI] VB MTIB®2{101H630.

@1 @MIG3 200167 afl. EROIOC] ) 43-00 mmIB c_B3VL®I aVE
MNEIHA] 2[101H6830M.

CRRVMI 621Q) (@JHIABS N0 Qldho o af1016HQo Gal@o milefload
BOUNDIANEMHAAN (@ JUINOID)

@RABLINABEMAIA. . ...

@J®1&Belasamala@.........



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
85
CRRILM] §alQ (@JHI0ABB 30N Qldsqfo af1016HQo Gal®o milefload
BOWAIBHEIMOAMD (@JUQo VR BRoW1H 0] 4[lalHs30M.
CRRVMI §2lQ) (@JHIABS N0 Qldhqo a0l Qo Gal@o milefload

CINMIWIB1HABM.

WMNI0Y0Jo HQQo Qldhq QD] (Gawa. Sl. af)o. GMINAV ANV ):

aud, 2020-9a1 c¢H08 WMy (2-20 MMIB) MNGE aIdAYISHENHAAT)
(@JCAWo I3 BRAIMA o {losam.

ODIOD  Qldha |A@] (W) af). O WI@WM): aud, a»Ind

(¥ [EMI0IN () () oJ’](TG)O6BT§(TTO.

@ . AV GRIMVaN? AVA, GMINT GaldUd @IRYAINDIOA]SAN.

2. Vleed@:  DeIeRiemld:  Gglow) @@o  (@JAAE™]a {18903

MLOWSALDOD@TIMIM  MIa0AIMDa]S BROWEBBUIHH OODHNHUB DVWABO]
GQIIZHU3 BORINFTMIYAN@IEM.
(@RoWEEBU HOD:D:U8 DWAO] EGANGHUY EORINRISOM].)

UZ)GT)Tla(SO_IO(SgC)@S @JCOWo oJC)(TO}))OQ)ﬂ.



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
86

2. Weed: 2020-e0e1 6mo8 Wm0y (2-00 maud) MmN

a10MIBHIMHAN (@ JCAWHOD
@RMBLIH630MAIA. . ... ...
@J®1g&Belasamala.........
2020-021 6508 WMHHI0Y (2-00 maud) @3 aldARIGHEMHAAD
@JGA®o VR @ROW 101 a[lE1Bs3M0. NG A ldTVIWVIGIBEMD.

2020-2021 cvomiomla QIBaHH@® MIARQICLIQSSs

DalWMIBLBMOMB:Bo WMANMIEWIW Milglo aldlVeMISs8IM®INSs

(@JCAWo

Q6132 @1 (). aNemoo®] aNRWm): aVaE, eHIaNw=-19-608 &lauem]

M1eIN@HEBAMN  alUROCLIGMITE HAN” Gal@aN @JEDId: TVEI MVEASMo
@SBMM”  Gald»HOMMBB  MVIa0aI0JAL]  M1elneI8s8o). @YHWIM  HAM”
QNEWHIS cgcrog;lo«sm” Qla) DalMIBJAGNM HUY 1IN IOBIY)
al01lWeM1BBAI0Mo DSAAM @R® LoMNIMWIa] WMAIMICWIw mi@3 &Sl

algo 153(2)-0” ®»o@ddnoeld sal’ A@Bom] aldlwem1asaldme D VR



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
87

@1@BRIMHBID )M (@JECAWo MIM BRAIMG]a[lHs30M.

QILAINOWAOJe GIYIBSTYo QAIRMHIVY0Jo mdamd@ﬁ (W) o. ol
ROOIRM): VA, IMIM (JCOWHDOD a aDIEBRAND.

0l. W1OHA@: (@JGO®o MVR BRoWTdA12[1A1H6B3aM.

(111) 2020-ee1 caHo8 wnalMecwaw (3-050 mmIA) mNad

WMHIVY0Jo HWQo O.IoSaqd@f] (6awa. Sl. af)o. EMINAV" HafVD):

@, aMI03 BRAIME 1o {lasam.

ol. W1eea@: nilod @GRAIMGalaflalasan.

WM HIOJNJo HWQo moequ@1 (@awa. Sl. af)o. BMINAV" Haf)MVE;):

a@, 2020-ee1 emo8 wmalmlewiw (3-00 mmIB) i@l al@lwemmyy”
2f)SENEMHAMN (@ JCAWo NI BRAIMT o {lH6aM0.

DIV moemn;!@’] (W1 af). O WIBMB): avd, ™M

(@GO allamIEBRAD.

. aleed: 2020-021 cmH08 wmallmlewow (3-00 mmId) enfmd

oJ®1CD6mm®)U6)096)§<ﬂ®6m0CTD (¥ [EMNVINIO©)



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
88
@RMBLNH6B0MAIA.. .. ...
@®1gelasamald........

(@JGOo VR BRoWTBA12[lA1ABM. MIlGE Al D HHFHAN.

Q6NZo QMo Qldza |HUD

(ee3L®] wel)
@6NZo QMo O_Iceagdoe)(!a neload BOVAISHIMHNAM @ JUROTD
@RMBLNH6B0MAIA.. .. ...
@®Igelasamald........
@eNgo QMo Aldho]dhud  MIENlOad  BIVAHHMODAD  @JUQo VB
@010 2[161H800.
@ENZo Mo Ol dud MIlElead SoWMIWIRIBEMD.
alglo,
(EEEOIOIRT1))
alglé nileload BoMAIEHMAIM @JUIOHE

@RA0BLINAEBMMAIA. ...



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
89
@®1gelasamald.......
alglé mieload BoMMIBeHeMEAMM @JUWo MVE BRoW 1! 01afl@1es3D.

alslsd nilefload cowmI1alasan.

80MJ0 Qldkalo all01dhQo Gal@3o

(ee3L®] wel)
&MI0 Qldhq o af1016HQo Gal@o MLilnad BIVAIGHIMOAN (@JRODD
@RMBLNHA6MAIA. ... ...
@®1gelasamald.......
BMIo  Qldha o af101&HQo Gal@o MIEflOH BIWAILHEMOAIM  (@JUQo
MR @RoU1H:O12[1G1H8800.
63MI0 Qldho o a0l Qo Bal@o niefload BowadWlalasam.

WMHIVY0Jo HWQo O.IoSaqd@f] (6awa. Sl. af)o. EMINAV" HafIVD):

ad, 2020-ee1 cmHo8  wmaAlmIcwIw (3-00 ®maud) o

al0AVIGHMHAAN (@JEAWo T3 mam@(o"lcgoe@m.

DOIOD®  Qldhg AV (W) af). O WIBM): avd, MO



24-08-2020
Uncorrected/Not for Publication
90

(@GO allA3®I6BZMD.

Wl . V). GRIMVaO? AVAE, GNINT GaldUd BIRYAINDIMA|SAN.

UZ)GT)Tla(SO_IO(SgOOS @JCOWo oJC)(TO}))OQ)ﬂ.

ol. Weed: 2020-021 coHo8 womallmewiw (3-20 mmid) @l

A ldVIGHEMODIN (A JEGAWE) DI
av

@RABBLINAEMMAIA. ...

@®1gelasamald......

@JGa®o MVE ERoU 1M1 2{lB1BB3MD. MM o 1dAVIVIB]HBM.



