Uncorrected/Not for Publication
1

MMamIA226mM HI0 Yo

VNI Ha1G] 0184|933 021 JHIAABE DINYa |0 MNIOIEud
alQ1VEMME” af) SENEMHAM (@ JEGAWNQJo BRMANCLISEEBBO

(1) 2018-0e1 @rmMi®201 (¢eBL®1) MN®3

OMI¥lejo af)OOGHM0 moea%l@mgcgmm_ﬂ MVaOHO6MAJo

QIlEMIBAVEMIINNJo  BGRAIMVINo moeygd@ﬁ (UY). &HSdroalssl MYEOQ3M):

aqua@, auenidy’ Halgl 01Gapds” ©a1Q @088 2018-0el @EMI®:00]
(6e3L™I) @3  alBlVIMMUDANSHNMHAMN  @JECAWo 6D
@RAIM@a [lasm0.

00IM0Jo BAIMMIB2R06MAJo Al A@] (W) . »IWEUAION)

aMVA@, MIM (QJECAWHDOD a laMIEBFAD.

U1, HSHoalss] MYEO@3M @ AVAE, MM §al0lW GRBLM IMHEBIGM D

MVBABOMIMG3 GRAIMCa{lEB3aND. NIa0MIMA. ]S @)D TaldH @RoUEEBUINE0
@RHNIVJ0  BROTWIo. BRDHNHIMNS MCaoud  Aseo  aflveaowl

MVoMVIATEHEIMHAMMIE]. 218 2|PWEUdaHO MoMVIBTHN 0.

ol. avleed JaR® enflefln”  aflcIRrMesolaf m(csfsoe;l@)’l%@@

@RoWEBRUIAS MVoMVIBANHINJIN@IGM . BALI. af)(d. RWOIL".



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
2

(6aW2. o). RWOI MIGlLNLN@GBIM@IMIG Al |

GO6A o |SOmIWEL.)

@l  aofl. al. ol aqud, M af)pad allcwilal

CORINQISODGH®IM.  TLoMVNIM  MVABHHIVTOAG OB NVWOODEBO] af
AMEEBUHH ALY @J®IGaUWAje VAMIWIW BGRAGAHUNJo ABAIIaINEIM”
MVABHHIA AABMDIM@I QAR COIHOAMNE". aldHHU BRD (oJdhSla {land0d
algl® @RAITVENLL EME" MaI01W GRRLMIGEBIFES] VMG GHaA1QIW1®3
06ajods”  0a21Q  ®@lalgjaamlolesan  milgflom  dLomIAWls] MV
2182J06QIS8WIG3 B®eBBl1 MIGICHNMN® @R M GRBRUNMIGHOBAG30 ]l
MO@A06M.  BR® Q8OO ONUBAIW] 2lBa] alQYO|CSMNE CRROM1HSBE.
@RD@OHIME” A16WIR]q | BO6UOQISOD] I af)HAF AUIHBHHU3 MTBADAN.

ol. 1993: Yl O, o)V WOMIATMILOM 2JADLINASOM]IW (@JHho00

@Y. GPMIT EREHO, GREEBRY MVMIE, H01g] 0162 |00S” M21Q) (JHI0ABS
2018-021 @rMI®:001 (6e3LMT) MG Hald@®RMIE @ JIWo CNSAN@IMIW]
qudaseely’  aaiemeamm 1 (ag) mmud  6_3OL®  GRAIG®A)a{la)

MoMVIBTBHINJANIEM”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
3

@ .  af)aVU.  WMIETMINMT  2JAIDRINASOMI  (@)5hI0o

(). @M@ @RH0): aud, 2018-ee1 @RMI®:IGT (6e3V®]) mNdd

0a1002MIEJIWo EMFM@TIMIWT MVABHBELIY” H21QeMeamD 1 (ag)) mmud
G_RL®1 @RAIMGa[lHasHWIeM.

oM 21L1® O1IDIVILIBS (JTVoEMIELIY” Galdd:anlel. M mileflod
@JWIMMOWe  EMZPAM™ 2101V EBBNMIHUT  AI@DIEM A lOETINISSS® .
NIaONIMea g m@«gﬂ@@@@s WLV B3OASOMIMBBAIME] (cH
@JWIMDalg  »H00YeEBU3  ayolla[lE8HWIEM. HONW] MITWe.]S
al@a)HOBIOBE MSHBEMIIUI, (@JWIMMIWo M coaleIlsel
O@IYILININVOBBRUE  MaYer |IMND@AIW]  MINWO|FO®IES8 ALl
21@2)HH8o6M” MOYOS MIS51@3 MSAN. BRD®GA 6L @AM
JOISHHODILIENO®  alBOISHUNIYo H@IYIT Maleo |IMNDTOMBR0] 4|83
21@a)®HUd  MOYOS MISIBE MSHBANME.  alddH  (JWOIMNIWo  2lBa)
MSEOMENZGIHWIM  GAILIWIM. 03JoedIMs R1al®o  Maleq]gGalow
nloaiwl 5Go6NI6BBSBo Mloaiwl (m@goeaaa @RYOROMY  2IPEaldW

HGoEMNIEBBBo MIMUAH]HAOWT MafoQUAN WOBIBo B*:Go6NIEBBBAMS, (18’]@6)@



Uncorrected/NoLt1 for Publication
ANWAIBHBIGH1®  MlEAUW]  AllaHWEBBo  DHONOW]  MINWOR] MERSS
Moglejme. MANHO® TVIa02IO AONIMT ABIHAMHBOa]” MVoMVIMTHE3ECMNINUT
M3Jo  GAIGEMI;  GAIGMNS;,  af)BBOM, of® FEOMIGI  AlGdHNEMo;
af) @UO®AIMo SR’ MMSISHEMo; BRD BIMANLINIV] GAITMEAD BGRE®I
MRald 008890V  GAIGEMI  af)NE8  Alel®  2lBa|HUd  MI@DIEM’
MSHABIMD. o lDH CHOSAOMIG3 ABJo OIS HOBMHBIVWAUMBOS QllaH o
MoMIBTHHINT @R)YDBo®EM ®QIOLINODODOT MVa0ald)o
MeIN@BHEBAVMNE. BRDODHINS  ABLODIM  HODHBIW 3:Qo6NIEBBBROS
HMABo ARAIBOS RI0NMo DG 0Ud af)6BBOHMWINMIM®INAZ  aflalo0)o
@) CRBHOZ ®IClaf  IVPAOARLIOMIG  O®IMNZAUEIM  HYIQAM
QI 1WNERIPOBBI@ 2 IRL@TQo TVEMVLOIM TVBHHIB BQINIGHEMOAANIEM
NIaOMIMea g OJcG)H@']CQgUanHG)S@gQQ MABHNIVIGMIS  af)M1Hs”
@RAM Do {lEH0MBB®. O®IG3 Mo oeﬂggcm QAUBROMODIOAZ (BO1BIN0Jo
QINHIS Mosleoad allg:rvmomlmealng] Da 1GWIU1HBAVHAIAMIOT’

aloQMMN®. MICHHAIRHDNS HODHAUNABB aleMo Qoch@)ombd@oe;omoan“

BT MNINB; LIEBOMIRINGIN®. MICHHUAIRHOHBE LI0B0 GOQEMIIPIEM MIIE:H



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
5
LINEOMILINGMMN®. aUIRININGAIYo  MINGIM AUMBAIMo  HOWQEMIIUI
MIEHHaIHABBS  £10Bo AIBRUISs0. Maflos asyOm1oad RIWAIW] QIMBAIMo
MUABBHIOTMVENRIB:CMINUT, 3@ QALY ANRIWHDO® MANUI HEMBNIBGIANDY
GAISIOM  HEMBNISHIWOM.  af)ANIT  BAUOZIOM  HEMBNIBH VLI  alel

ald@5ld:80  EPWIHRHIOOMIM QAUBMN@. 0BJo WII8o AgYlesan  B@

Zelwiem”  af)0MIBZBo.  alddH  HYIOD H®ONOMG[led  MIdAd

adSMM @100 MY @M @OV AN VI 2 IIG
2JS10®1MEUaHNJo Q. AW1. af)a0-MNBIWI@BAND. @P® 1603
HEM O 1GLIY HHHNIMo aMId Galdaamlel. MVoALISMIA IR

BDAMILIINIEM alIRVOMINMG  @JWIMO|S LldHHjo. ABJo  OBHIME
MVOMNIM  TVABSHIBIMENRIGHIM QIR EMSe MVoMLOIMAMINAZ AfldaVM
$HIQYEBRUIHNIM DalCRIWNILEBAN®.  oldSHH  MDALOIDB  aldQIRa ]S
&SomIeBRsIOdMIaMo AIBAN  DHWIEM. @REPO®  aflmdMmO®1®3
MVAUAABAMN  AOELNGINIMWHSCWI  HMIMAV  HI0IM VUG THABAN
QOENSNIMHSCWI alémo OdHMLl, MIWINEM HHIVIW

MOM&Hg@)OQ@:%@S aleMo 6dhIN326IM° MM Qleilw m@omogmaooeam@“.



Uncorrected/NoEt; for Publication
@R ALl AGBRIMENIM” MIEAIW]T &:G0mIEBRU3 DAGHBIWIZME. af)M1ee”
Q§eMlalond@] @EROIWINIIM af)o0d OflS” 2UdeqlesVS88 AfgHE1M alellw
@@lvawl @R aumuaggaoeaom” Qm0®1§m“. @R6ERHM VBB
HGoMNIEBBBOS  AflaH®o  MVoMLOIM  AVABBHIB  al0lEBHWQo MDD  AUGBAM
AU@BRINODOG Qe AIMIVILI88 VoAl MOHBIVW  &HSFomiEBRS1eel
HS1HBOS alOMOm1Mo le $00463BUIAB0 GAIMNE] DalECWIWN(J3RIHNIMNBS
AlFL@1WIEM  @YO0ICHNMB®. MANHS  MIOIHL!  HhalUSo &S00
SHOQIMONINHHWIEM 6T)_ﬂ%lg<ﬂa03 ®QIOISBAN®. DD M@ (@JIWalolw]
£3MHDNIEM”  alomM®. 21 aloay’ apmosse’ 23 aoayleaiyy”
20QOaMIG enfopeml®. meges mMogIed mileeld @ReLIE10d MIVAENI
OMBIAN1IWNG af)amIEM” HI0J0? @D  AflatOIRIW] MNITWEOQ |SBBOE,
MOYOSOHWIW  0f)o.nf)@.af). BB 2lQa]NI0OM AAF2 DAV MINWSA|S
mM331aIvo gMI” MO 3@ VMU @AW afI@a. MWANjo G IN1MN@3
D@JOMV1ZR0IQo BHISHIYOHNIOSED MANHS MIFIM DBBEMIIUF B OOQIT3

MOLITN” HAVYIGI 6.21QBWIEM. BREGE|0U3 DD 6TU1%IR09303C9630 mlaem1o

af)amIem”  @Javem? 21 aiwequanss®” 23 aiweayd S50 aiweayo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
7
@R 1WILo anflalcoRIV”  GHIBa]|C0aUMI@3 QIo1 M1@HBIMDo
mola3ca Pl &:slgan@oe  17-18 ailomilcomoeegssalciem. o
@2 O mieflomiame 8@ (JIVAMIQAINLINMBB®  MANHOD NLIVWIS
DEMIAD al@O®IG3 'Daf af)dm ®LIOBHEZI5E:ST HMS1W] 4[101083E:WoeM”.
BAMIWIMRHIBIHUY IRIOMIGMISONAN Mo alOWMHAANIEM af)M1He”
ryaila {l90HOM0BB . @O CRIY B HHIMo IO Galdsaniel.
MYAOHTIV®OAN @JIVSM]IVILOOMIT  HILICLISAIMID®.  MDODIT
CH00af1onad oy’ af)an AT®1WI@3 230189160 101E8HWINM”. D QAUGBAIMo
@2 Om1od  AlHMVMOMINEAME]  DaleIN]BBMMEMINSIalo  @OAN
N3 OMIM” MODSIVAUMAS  HF06NIOO  TVoANHUIHHNIM83  alelWw
MSalSlh@leel)”  Galdd:am arm%oe@oam“ MAYHAD”  GAMB®. AR OIM’
MHOWIVAUMOS  :SoMIEBRSILISB0IG  af)6BBeMm  21aHB3a10QIaM MANUI
@YELalldneMo.  MIM  alMIVOD  (JIVIWMBIV @D TVOVOD  Sl.
af)aV. QIRM af)HIMI@ A leMIIWOD HAMIQMBIW @M. QAU8HO MVXRININIW]

@I 2fIBIN  EIVMW B@ CLISODITE 033 l0MONIGLIY" Galdd:dhQo

ale@IOVE® HAMIQ@ AVNIMo BY1FNMYSWBOMHAN  BIRYDNAOD 6219 QYo



Uncorrected/No; for Publication

021, MM §.21Qa|ANIOMIVTIWAN  BRAINVEOMIMB3, @RSIF A leNIVWOD
@13V I@BIMEa U3 af)o0d al®Ia” ERYTROD Y REILOR GHIVMIOIBA
OAWIHH@  CHIEBHNOLl  600B201VIGMIANe  of)0ad  all®monilend
WAINE100  QIIBREMINEMNBIW afHM OfldHI00, af)H0d GERIAWSS Ofld000
AMOM  @RYGCOIS al0Wo?!? @REBROM  BRYVWIBHMBNIM” 0&3‘%@:({8 e0M
IR OYENBOWIFENE". af)a3 BR2JOM3 @20 ABYalla” OOMIGNA SOOI
QA1 226N, MAN HAWISNBI GHICBRHSINLINNB) oy 26eM] HY1amMIG3
@ISOV NINWEQIFOB:INE” WIVIBo BRYBEUT AUBTBHWIEM. 6NIIQBUT
@Sa) LD O M6BRMWYBS @@goe;ua omeol@manlel.
@YU I@1HSIT  HaUN@I]  @ROLISITE  @RMY0I®  afl’dwo  alellw
Q1Y@ HAN” 200169 F1aD]BIHBHWIHIMAND@IM” MDIDAZ aBd> EMSo.
I 2)BABHWIGM .

@RENI3IC]  @ENGINIO0SB01gJo  HMTaHOMEBO]ajo  MNINQHBHS
@RHLlo ggcmgomﬂ MNITNWO|SOBHINZABS 21B8a|H&826M” MAOS MSAND).

AMEBBOBCAIRIB8 ABJOMIM MOHBIVWAINO MVoRMUIHNIMT MDD NmMS1@3

Mo o) @ D ogﬁmg’];m‘? aldQIfals AlWalG8Iw aflgMnI6o



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
9
MVaNIWTHHIGMI @213 MO ]§EAI0W B600Y63BBOS
aIoMOM1MEAIMEICWI @Y B:SoMIOMINAI 621010 @RYAIUD A 1MEAIMEIGWI

8@ @al Galdejo m0Q1 alaflglel.

@l.  aofl.  afl. ovxl@m@: @»  miled  qumid  Holgles”

GaloB:0M@IMYMIDNAN MIa0NIMe ]S D@D MVWATVEWITE GaldlWIYeSs
000 alo@dHQEzowl. 200 2l 3oaidlwl &:04(1510eIMIem” @REZa00
@@md(mﬂgﬂ al0OQIM®. @REBOHM BREZa00 BRYAIBAM]a] 01LW UdN|OHIG3
alOfTMEa O 96an0l qRIB  Ga0ISEIGSeS  GOaldlwl 50 algoow]
2)BHHIOWAN” @RGZa00 al@OHH alOeR.  af)aBIMIM” OOanAl’ AV
Ga00SLIBEOS Goaldlw] 50 21900 a@eslo®? Akl @RYWNIO
$IQBHEM3, TVMIMMOICIVWAIB HOaNAl” AYIB Ga0ISLINM GaldWT &Slajielo
@® M@  @OANWIEM.  @RMBROHMWBS  NIIQMHUB MPBHBOSQo
u@@’loe;g@scogo @PMILIEBBBHSW)0 amilod DD INZCIOW]
MUNIaABINDIEINS af)aD) DGZUNIM” OO AVAHHNIB LIGUIASIAIHBANDY,
wwodmnomlad 200 o198 aganss@” 500 a190isel eeanal’ auod

GaNISLIBHUIHR @D M@IGHHM3 ol®lwle|8s MIWanIem”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
10

OHINZQUCDNZO@IN BREEBRYY” @E1(@JOWAEMN=20?

©l. ERMIT BRHDO:  AVA, aJBMAIYe @R VOOIWINM. @ERD®AIW]
MNITNWOQ|SOB06NE” 38160 1018630M @RYInm1aInQMe. Qulelys
@O GRIYHHNOIMV0 Galdd:aMIel 650 @aigoe 700 @GolQo aleMloWSHBM
2101l | 99200® a10019q |SVISHU BRIGMIMMo alellewom @& (500
@al) MNAUCORIV EHIBGa|GOUHMIT HB>HIMNZEAIIW] HHIFHBHWIEN. @R
aldQInls ERSHBOS leMEAZOD GOIW  SIQ 6a1QBQo 29 Qflaaum
(@JAUBOIMEBBUT NSO HWYo 921QAMN. alGHH @R ANSHSB1G3 9NN

QANaeBRE103 3@ VVO1WIW MVOIGIANAIO GHEMOBHFOD).....

Wl &dh.  miden):  aV3, @RGEZa00  OflaH®@o  BRAIMN@a[laf

MoMVIB BB TMSW1@3 B8160m1010630M @RYlam] af)®aMNI@3
al3(@JEWIWo OEN20WI@B. @RADANINMAN’ QULBDAIHHIGAI?
GROOLIBHIT @Y aldo  AVERIGCOAIVIGIMIMMMo  MIBo  alQEMOAAN
@E1(@JOVWAIM af)MNHBBBO) .

ol lend: @RGZa00  al0WIM  DCRUWIHNITM  *HJQjo M1BBU3

af) 1M’ aI0QIN D!



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
11

Wl. all. odl. avR1@ad : avd, eMIMIANS IO HIOAI6N,

MIa0MIMOals 2@ DANOSYME.  f)WIMIEM™ MDA BaDISEIHBOS
3oaddlwl 50 21900l  sy@elo®?  ©IAMNOHIT G
adavlqflesnezomeel; Meialcd 200 2198 eaeiiam@” 50 a1goow
2WBHBMD @RYHO ALVaAOIWIHHNIMW  CAMEIWIHAMMMBB®, BRDIMHOD
ag)Bloo 8@1&6@1@1%6@@%0, @R®  MVoNINW1aJGRl @R6EE” alOID®).

©l. GRMIB3 ERHDO: VB, af)@3.(W.af)al-013 HILIOM S@ GRYIAMI,

Q. Wl af)ab-0a3 HLIOD OO0 ERYIAMI af)a» ATDIWI@3 HoGeMNRG L.
af)@3.AWl.af)a0-008  HLIOOD  @ERYIA®IQo  Q.AWl.af)al-003  HILIOOD
ARYIA®IQo  MYA  @)dhIeenan”  MIROCAW DUeq|eSY8s  allel
A@ENGINIG  al0sMIgME. @)  2lG2]OGRIHN GO Galdd:aMIE].
af)@3.(Wl.af)al’ MS@DEMIIWE MIVN(EJHIOA88 G@RYIA®], Q.. af)an”
MSOMEMINW @RYIA®]. @R B@W MIelaldS’ af)Mlee” Gomlelel. monud
AMAVILINEHHMNZ HI0Y0, DDAV MITWHaIS MYaflo@HIS®T allwl alan.
@IRYOHO®  MYSloGHISM  af)MMDAULJIT  af)ANIEM?  AIRIOOD  afBQ0o

@RAITNVIME) BT QI BENIE. QIR OO M SoBHISNBS”



Uncorrected/Nolt2for Publication
@QMWO@@&OQmoq_HO mm(ocm@oaaagoeaohdo (80930(865(800946)0')66301%0
GBUTAIMBHOBHBO] 9ORIOBH  BROTQYMBIGIN® D@ MIBOIW]2 @M
GUOaHMIGM. @R® MIGOIWIa|GUDaHNJo  OfleNgo  MIIQHUT  DOBHINSS
@MAM]  O®HIFABEMUIUT  AVIRIAN®HRIVe  ERYIAMIVOIVT  @RYBHUY
dHENBOM3 B 1M®3 &@g(uoo_@onﬁ HelDNel.  af)@3.Al.af)a0-003WQo,
Q. Wl af)ab-0MWQo HILIHON0) @ARFID®OHWHBO o)’ QI 2Xclenld
alogomlgens. @@ @D ¢RIVt  MVIGQY@1BAUMEHR1HN6a]g
@REEIE103 MO IMAUBCENAENNRIg af)TD Q1MIVIGIRI@ED MYLOGIOM
HMIM  HY1IW. alel ERYSHBSNOW]  MITNWOa]S  2102|HS10LI00HS,
DSHNOMIT  alOGOMDCalIRLl, 03Jo TYRISAIW] oe{l§m@16)moesao”lgﬂo
MUDHOINIWV] B1SINDIOMEB0]ajo MBI ABJo HIFMNM@IOMBB0ajo  OBJ0
AN@3ABEMNINUE A3 MICRIWMo DENBIBHEMINUB, MBJo KHIFIOD QAUBEMNUIOUT @R
MOVOWENBIBAN  ODIFIMIEN0® Ol HWEBBOSHB01.2]0RIOBHWIEM
MoMIAISBN®. GRM1OMW  ERYVIVBHIMSHIM” MOSZ], LIGHSHEMENIM

@@goe;@oan" MOYAS  MVoMVNIMAD OB OMIONAF  DalCWIWo OIS

DODHBIVISBB®.  @OAUNO  TVoAGHIHHIMBB  BBRNMIHB6M”  TVAHHIA



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
13

OHHIMZAICAMBZOAND” MY alla {l9]d06Ns" MO BRAITVIM o {l6sa0.

©l. @23 HaNBMIMBAV” I VA, TVMIE, H1gl 016 |0dS §alQ

eomoonas 2018-0e1  @EMI®:001 ¢e3O™] Mmad afdNgo @RED TVMIE;’
SH2191QOS alB1NIMMY” EROPHMHAM GERVMI MM BRAIMO1a lasamn.

S0NINOTM  GBEOM] (@JWIMAIYo 030 QIIEBIMEE (@JoWo 21
alemled Mmoo 23 alomileelds’ 2WAEOm] af)MO88MIEN.  GRM1OM
@®laldto  af)@IBEHNME  HOOIOAONAILL  AOQIAN;  alOMIEIN®
QIJQUMVIVAIEM” SHSBAUJAITVIWo. HBB QIJAINVIWo  BHOSOMIM3 AN’
el @@1Tvaw] eMa1SHE:IMEIREBHWeM. @13  BIVAIW] @GRy
QO GRIE( af)SOMIGBAN EREMHIWI00 2O O IYILNE]®HBESWo
aHOa| omIYengle:geso Rlallmoe man”  AFIRSINITEBHWIEM”. HSS”
QILQATVIWOGAIIEISS aldMIRIWN® QILQITVIWEBBHB MVoABH]IBBH: af) MBSO
MSDaldhd RMIWaI®IAaMem] MVBHHIC1NMR @) 0alNIW LldH M6
@R LlHHio YAIMIACMINHIMBIAM alOMICIND@ QAYQINVIWEBSIG BOMNIW
HBF  QIJAITVIVWOOD  OBHUIIBH:  af) B8 TVATalMo MDD WAIMBHAAZ

Mfld0lafI388®. GO BIVMIWIIM” MDD 6e3V®] mileled «as”



Uncorrected/Nolt4for Publication
QILQINVIWH DD QU1 H90D csme;n’ﬂ@W%g@ e’ GRBUM1HUd
@Tam@m@d’lglﬂ%@@@”. @M 1aHenan” ogom%e)(ooqmggg aflavend  06QI
Gal@HBaM AVMAROMIGE M@IBH:AN  WIGH  af)AMIGEMI @R  UIIRHHWIGM”
MYOABaj" 21010 ERSONM GalBGOMIG3 MANIEa U3 MILINITIBBIND. AVIBa]
o)A I0EMMIT  HETHIHAUSBAEM, GROLID1O3 dha| GRS a|SHBEMINUD
@®1@3 M1ao oeﬂgcm HAUSBN0EM. TVIB 2] GalBOD H38s8”™ ONT3HBSIM®]ONZ
aNLIN0W]  LVEIEEDIM™ a0IMHENIHMMILL  aldBHH GRGIMNS8  U0loH
af)MaloQaN®, alell®  oflado  @ERELIHIT GRDENLIBE &)@ 1000V
(oom)mcrgoeﬁ)u% GalBOD &8s 9MBIHH] QTIABEMIDUY HBHISHABAN Y31
@D ARIBaj/ HEMOHAUBBo GBI HBHIFHBEMIOB0 D 1WBROM]LBIMD®
QL@ $HISOMAIEM. GRDOGHIMNE BROIMNBS UTlaH MBOT 621" HBHIFHBH:

af)M@IEM” OENZINHE GRRUNM1WIW] @oe)oansomm%g@@”.

W all. Sl. e®IAMV": AVAE, MIaONIMHA S HAMIA, NIWo Cal@ABANDY,

BR® af® 20Wo Gal@SBMNDMIVILe BRG® HMQGLI; GRGIOHM WAINMOAAG”
eflNOOLINT”  §21QaN®°  VOIWICEMI;  dha]  @RA.2{E2ICCNDNI@ED

GalBHBMMOEE,  GROLIBIGE  HETMIOAUSBRI@ED  G2IGSBIMOSIOQUAM



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
15
aloQM®’ 20Wo GalBBLNem G@JONIadla {lHS8aMNMEE]. @REROHWEAIAIZS
B8 O0MIA @Om  elre)dholaf  HIMIN® 0BIWIGEMI;  MIWo
Gal@HSMN@IM” 8@ WAINOATDOHAN MWAIENIW aIBIOBHU HHIFHEAN
8@ enilefllom afllg@emaf MEBOBEAILI8BOIG TVoMVIGIAEBIND® AUISHO
CRIBHOMINMAN” DI@2LI, TVRYSS »II@ODIB af)MVOAIT®W  HQOID
@RRLLOWVWAIW] BKISHBHWVo .21Qo. @ODOIME  BOWAINW] @Y alddN@Udo

alfladaleNesemo.

Ul. GRIMI HaNB@EMIMNBAV:  AVAB, aMIAT  HMINAUSBo  HSla)

\%

210 ajaimoem. @) &6 16 QISSOD 103 BSGaMI QG6NRI Q19
OMRBIWI@HAM S 1eLIaN” alRIGa 0o @Y WaOlaflS88AIMIEM. @)
G 160IB8B0 HBS1G3 BalB@HBIND AIQHAIW QAlaHAINMAT GHEMBNIA |
AN DOOHNIW  WIGH  HHISHNMHAAN @REBRHWEAINLIBS QIS
alleMIME2EDMIW (@  AVRIoWo  alOauMIG3  @RM®  GAIUdAIENM.
BRDHH NS @Y YOl LICLJHDTHBD: af)AND QAUSHO (@JWIMHQ S,
MOQIAN;  oBO®EIRjo  DOOH]M3 SH@Ino MSO)AN oM {103

af)OORIYHIC 921N alQIGUIWM  MSOMIWIT3 @Ry aHIq| ®@RSs)



Uncorrected/N()lthor Publication
od§cm(6ﬂm<uoe>(00 @R@NW] MINWals oW lamileel 0940(2_;!09303 @) dh
@S 9]0 SHWIEM. BREBOM NIATVEBEBI8o MIMNZMIGIBEB0 DD @RS 2jad3@3.
@P®IHG anLINOW] @Y EoNAD aleMIOWSHBIN 0] aHIq (lOLl WIH®IT
O®Qo  ©.21QICD OMIFILNSH:HBSHN0  WIMUIHNNAISAD. @R B0 O 1G3
Mmoo @RAIDA  GAIalla[ldsH  af)IMNDL:STWIEM’ m1%0©1 NINWES
oJO6T6!Z5ﬂ%§§ 00 4633U3.

MOMOS 2182 WIT A lOIHGODOHIMNE  AVoMVIOLa]  NIaOAIMAlS
@RoWo  UYl. EPMIT @RHDO o JDIHWIT  2M(J®IMIWIWIEM,
@RGCZaOOMIM UY1. Ail. ag)o. MYWIOHMAN A I0QAN DANGMIW BHINIYWAV’
CN®INNEMIS’  MIaOAIMAOJo  GAVaOQIONIOHD  O88  QlYHMIWIEM.
CHOBOMIM MSDaldd RMIWlal®IAMeN]T ERWIGHIOOMIG3 AUMEG|0Ud
QENO®  MINQHOBLI00 &S], Béoﬂd()qdo@a(ﬁ &Sl a)HAMIOBHYBB B3
ORIV  (@Jal0eMo  2l@a|V1M A lOBIODONRHINE" MAllosS MSADATME”.
@RGZa00 al06N® BT &*HI0Jo, N AVYIB  GaDISLIGHUBHS  MIOAB

OEOLIMVAIY’ oeﬂgcm(o)’lnocsmmgﬂw‘lggg 30al@lw] oeao%iammoggmom)".

GHOSBHOM VoMW [ISCOMIBo  GHOBo SO1Mo GRaILIVIGE AlG3UMAEY



Uncorrected/Nolt7for Publication
afle|n1md »¥leom waleMdeaad” afllel MSalSIdhud o) IO TOMADSBAN
CHOBOMIHA3 gOIMo  QIJOITVIVODIM” alelle  @slal’ avocallafl@an.
2f)06MIB:80 GaldrI88 ALY alIgeMEBSINLINAHH NITVOMIG3 JaTVo MILJo
el GHITMIaNOMBAYHUE MSMIMBAN.  EIRIOMINGHODo 2 JOODASS
Ay®ITY  caaleldglmeoals  Alallw allgdnEBaeas  @HIM3an0admy”
MSABEMIIUT, @@OIS] @QYWIOBHNEM BN 1M’ @T@goe)uaoe@” O®MIYI©3
pIGlalBm.  afleiGa]oUd  Qalnloo SOl HIB  BIESNEMIWINIo.,
ROV TOOMICLINO  BaDISLIHUIHS Qo MIBN]low) &1S1VI@aN. GREOMLI0
@O @HBMN” ®™BlalemadW], golTve QILIED HOOMIB DHBAN B3
AR OMAINMEBIW]. BRD@HEHHIMNE” @) BoN@DENSIWIBAM @RYBHBo aflailw
NOBAG]HSOH0INBH DDTVoMINW]] 21@2|/Q1@3 2VWAOWI®  BaNIEM
OHO®. MHODOOWHIB GOITVo GANILIY” MVa0IVWHAIW Bd06MIaNOBMYo go
MSHBEMINUE BRMID alPEHGHBAN 2]BHOo HALLNENYIYHOBE:]1Ljo 03 Y0
G F1ABIN QIO @RAIRHS @R ®STVA1LIO® & 1500883

MUV B JRMSIBN6IMoO. 86)aN0l CTO\(%C)@ GQDO§EJ09>§1QIOG1’1) IO OI0]e}

BHIMIaNOMMYHOBINA) MSANIQPBBD.  @ROMO0  BHINMIaNOABTYHHUI



Uncorrected/Nolt8for Publication
MSHAGBaM oeanal”  aYIA@ Ga0ISR)RhUWBHS  (G0alolwlwIms ns30i”
OBHIFOMIFENBIB0. alBHH BRD BRYHH: HPe|N0HEMAN MILIY” AUTEIUIUY
GaNd@ AVIB Ga0ISAIHUIEHNI @] TRIB BaDISLIHUBEHHI 0o D MO
OHIGOMISIEl af) M Qflla®@o &S] &06emMeMo.  AflEelleeImINIaN  Heanal’
TYOB GaDISLIHUd MI@EGR cgoe)(ogmmtggg. @RAIYAI@o DODOOD1OHLIB3
DB OHIFOO@OM AULIOD (@JalBlo{l2]0E:06NE" BHOSOMIM ERYHH: MBY0
MNP 03O QBBMVHAUOHANLII0 alOQEMIIW..... Q. AW]. af)a0.6AQ
BOMHILIOD  aflel  MSalSldhesSaHomamn mommcs%o? @63B3M
MSalSInWFOMGCA|OUd  MIo mangelocgoes)ma@omom“? Q. W]. af)an.
MBHHIBIG HILIOD  EHOBOMIDI 2 DTQGIW 67 0@ eerITLMBaYHUd
DNHOFOMIFENS’, 67 3 eerITMIV OBHISODOCIM88®o 93 mlwad
aldBrIQHUY (GTO(TO(‘).IB']%@OJ(TTO@Q@O Q. W af)ab:-VBHHI019F
@JEDJHOWIN. GRAUBHS HILIO ABJAMIHM@I0IWT AMVoMVIBBBHQ0
af)aMo®d  a3jem1end  Afl@@al®  G@Joorvdadlaflasamallwo  MI0A@

OOHLITVMIYBHB0 MNINVWAE 2 NALIQH:So WELNAYo HB:IFABHWQo a1QIgeenzan’

MYAe” HemMImd avowWlegoe. 2011 go@d 2016 alwoss &irlwsalod



Uncorrected/Noltgfor Publication
CHOaOm oLl allesuadjeMm1nad 0lMlq NIV MINLEQIS GHEMEBHUI
al016UIW12J0®@3 mase allel mcrg@da)ua J61MIJ & ¥1W)o.
cHO8IMHom  2010-11-a8  allddajm  msomlw  afle3uonsyemlang
@R8egOomIa3  217.41 eloto  0HOIY alleswnsymiem” alge@es1ad
MIQHUINBOLI0 HOLINVMBMY”  0F" §21PHAIIN alOSD  HILIOW, 2015-16
$oereIgom1@,  esegomlcd  201.75 BlGHo  OHOM  alle3uondso
ANAI@BAN.  aHIq|HOBEIC  BRSJaS1OWAT” MIEBUS A lOAT  TVOWOD”
@YOD  HOMO® 15.66 eloHo ©BHOTY Q@3 |MEO@@6M. AN
m1do® afNes3voasyemlead aadamlas 15.66 eleto s milend @:0al”
AMEoud M@0 all@o]m  arPe® adruls). 2010-11 adato 85.61
eloto  OHOMIIGdMIae  2015-16-a3  aamemndd  154.20 eiomo
OHWVIGRIY” aldrUls). DeOMENe  HOSIVIHBM®  AlE3UABLVoWNOI”
M16BBUT HBHHINZAUMIHAIAN A l0QAM aflel MSalS1dhud, CHASODMIMEO @)
MlelY” @JCRINOMIT AIM1HLIMSI®IM. ERMING LIV & eI

@RSHNASS DVSBABANGHBHS DalEGBIWO OJ@@D1%J. CHOBOMICRIQY”  0g”

MISHEBIG3 Mo MOl BSO@ @RSBANG3 HHINZAUGBAN AVAIH QNI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
20
OV MeIYBGEHLI0 BHO8OMIT NE3UARJANM |NVIM3 &:00l” AlIMeAIIM”
alOQEMIIU3 VLNIBMOOMIT MR |®, GHOBo OWVWSBAGBANIOHMY  3@3
GH @AW 201 af)AMBBMIGM. @R @RaldHSOMIGE MIMVE:ST CHOBH) O
OHHISHIMBB  MSalSIVWIM” DSDa ISHRMIWIal®IAMem]T  waledeaad”
QU EI EY(OF DG ]0Ud aIOMIQIND QIyQINOW CRAIRIWIW
HBBUJAUTVIVOTD  BRSHNo  ABHIBHIMIW]  HHHNFAUMISBS 921010
GRBAVMIHW aMMIM BRoUNHB1HBBWIEM.

O™I¥lelo af)OORIYo O_|093Q‘;I@1CB63C30_|6T1§1 MVaOGHO6MAJo

QlemMIBIVEMIDVAOJ0 GBAINVINJo O_Ioeagd@'] (UY). &HSdHoalIssl MYEO@3M) :

M@, MM ERAVMIWOS DERULIGHIEBRUE TVRY” BRYAD cganowcgoow’]gm?
of)MBB® @HANWIM MDAV  MITWe]S  BOIM()®]aldhHBINDD
msmﬂ§§§ 218203 HDOSIWIABAND®. BRDEHHIME” ODMNOMABO ] AUBHO
v af)OMB1ejo  alOWEMOAIM”  GMIMW  BRYWaOlesaMILl.
MUABSHIBIOM  MVoNITWafISEGOMIBo  A3JQIL0aIMo  WAlMA0Z1oad
PIGHIOLL  ABJQIRDBEMo@OAMNVIM”  WAIMHOG MWo.  0330M 1003

9al@BIWo alEnAIW] &0 af) MD@HANVIM” MVAHNIB BRYWaO1LBSAND).



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
21
@R®  alEndQIW] GHOYMDIMCAUNETIQYSS & JI0MIRIMHU o lLIDOOM] @3
MSOMIA] MLIWIHEHEMHANIEM” waleNdenag’ @)D 1BBAN D).
@@ IEAMEIWITM”  'aNgeml’  af)MCaldl@d  Asan  allaleind® 3G
GNIOWOIMBHNOEM  al@lalds]  WalMOnad” TVoceISlg lajamm@.  alelw
GOMIMILIEM” @R GMIIWAIDMIANEM aldlaldS] MAYHS MVoMLNIMADSMIBo
MSHABIN®.  BOM@DlaldH  QAUI@IOIVAILIO®  MERAOS  af)o.af)@3.af).
-009OL0IMBo  BROMO0  BMIIWAID HOM  aldlaldSlHudHs CNPDIo
M@ HIPWIEM MVoMLNIMADSMIBo  HITNVIAMND. BRDEDHINZAI(@0
WLNIBAMNOMIT DD GBRYAH:  BRAINVIMIA{lEHIM  HYIWHAAN MRS
COIMMANIEL  MNIa0AIMIMIV BRMIM3 @RV  B:FoMIEBROS  MIdW]BEaM
@JueBud  maflos  ayallafla).  G@RO®IOSGH  VOGBIWIM.  BROMINGE
QRAPAINWVISBB  HOOIMIEM.  GNIWAUBIBNO6Mo  HHHINBEIIO®  MIWAo
HINEMNB0MMo M@ ERAITVIM]a {990 SVl MIYNS TVoMVNIMHDBD)
|MEBOS  QAYAIMB  ABJo  MYaHlABAN  ERAIHSHONIY  TVIa02ID OO

MoNINWla]” GMNIOW IO SOOI HFlWemMo. allel H:GomIEBSIT3 af)LIo0IGo

GalBaN~  alOGMITIGA Lo BHUIHHIND  &SIHNIOD  AUAIGIWIENM',



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
22
&SomIOm 1ol @oWEBRABLIN0 Galdam’ LOAMAIW Mlelalds’
MVl @1 J0@3Ca 1080 OHD@IM” GRAWIE, GRYVAINO MMITMINMo AGHISHIND
mowlsHsleinas (@JUaeme: BRDEHIME’ alomoQIw]l
GENIOWAIB3BEHOMODILDS  ABJIAVEMT  BHOPIMo OB OMIHM  Da IGBIWO
SHOQIMo  BRYAUWINIW MSalS] MVflGHCIEHIMW  A@ECD  @ERHHIQYOHG3
921900 HYlY. Mo  ag)alOSOWEIINIGMI  af)MBENIY ©2IQaIND,
OO0 HIOEBBSEIM VAMAIW MSalSl TVflhalHndo. MDD WAIMOO0G
QUM 1MVEUDaHO  af) SO EHAVHBOS  af)sPo al@1GUOWla 0@ alellw
QY@ IOMVPME. B HEMEBHUT MVoMITWIN 2J00Mo MOIOS 2 lOWI3
@RYWaOlassanIel.  GAIMENE1M3 @Y  BHEMHBHHUY (suocaom" QIYo.
alGdH  MlYnoYLlo  DODINHN m1cs®ow1%36)oeaoma" HOMO0 (@JUYEBRUIHS”
al@1a0000  &26MIM3  MLIWISH1HLIMBB®IM™ GRG0  MMOS  AIM1®3
D0QHWIW]  MIDWHBHWIAN.  BRDOHIMNE  aldRQAUW]  BROMOO @I
921QEMOAMMIM”  @1WBRIM2flAlHBM@.  Oa0Q” AVIB  BaDISEIHBOS

$H00jo MONOS 21213 AUMHFIR. OanAl AYIB BaOIFHLIANID3

GHOBOMIGE  QAUBOO  2|BAHOO 3a003E)HHCBWSS. @AI6SHWITO



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
23
MLOWIVEMENIB  HWOI0TEL ERAINOS MABHIBHB0 HWOIM  TVIW]BBOAAN
a)M1ee”  GMIMOANIEL  IVMUMAIV  ER8M®Bo  ALNW  63»IBa|C0Y
MUNJa IMEBRS1HEI (m@goe;goem“ HOMOo  OanOl”  AYIB  BaDIS®I
DalGQIN1HBIN@. @ROAOMO0 Ga0ISLIHSIT3 MV AMVDHOlo BBEHNEND)
@R §ANIGa AU I®D6M. Solnvom1eag 00O 1@3 20@el,
nNNIINMIHG $H00ODLNOME]Bf0. aB® HIOJOWILIOMELILJ0 a0l
TYI3  @a0SEN@d @IAAVISBAN  BRBHUWISBH  GROMOO  TVDEOY63BUI
B@BHN1OHHIFOM19LIE 103 TLVMIMNOIY BRYBWOMHIAN BHOBOMIGLIY” QIO
@QUOIBIEL  MYHNIBABo  MYRUIPZNBISHAN  AflaHONE].  EROIM
ODEAIRS8 AlaHVAIV]T  a)FEHNMEDINLIANMINM” af)MIHS 2 l0WINSI®) .
GENIOWAIBIHHEM og,)ocrq%oeaagoe@obzr Qollen al061y, H Y160
OMZAUBAHUONILINIW] o ID]YAI0W]d0  ENIDWAIDGIHNVEM %oq}goe)uﬁ msom1.
solos 630 CQUJOCT(T\)B&U% af)ODKHAV” HTeUeM@ Uyl 3aHloed” aVlowload
CMNY®IONI@,  GBRGZa00  GMAIg MSOVIVIZME.  AISHSNEIM SN M

QlB03MO01HBo  QANSEOHBo MDD KOG A lOBFAVOAUIMDIEM” MAHS”

GENIOW Y M00QJAN D). @1 (@B alO 163 MoOS MoMOIME DI



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
24
TMVoNITW2flISEGEMI8e MEAIW] (@JIAIWdjo, a@®Ime” 16 (@Joaivd eEmIs0
CRRVML.., GBRMIV® TVOMLOIMDMIND:  OHIafld  GBRENIGHIC] B,
MNIDWHNIBHTODIMEW0aHO  al®IMIO”  @JO0INje MDD GG GBRLMI
92l1QlIgms.  DEaJoLMBIVIS88  6e3VLM]  EME 921010  allatWEBeS
@RYAVBAISHIQYBB®IM. @RG  Hald®OA  MYHD @RV 1HO1H6HI03
HFIQAN@®INM. A3J0 AUEZAMDIMSS (@JWaldlw] 21 alayiamlane 23
QQIIEH] DIOICO OFH af) NOBB®I6EM . QENBIN®) cg())o@adom)’l
MNINWIS®IeM.  alelew COIMIT  ODHANNL|HSIVW  AIWoC2IGOD
@RYBHBOS  BRYGOIW) OO VYo K1alemMQo  MIDWIABMDIM™  HHHIFAG3AM
WU HODM OIS0 Gal@ABMDIM’ ODHIFANBD® o) MAI@EA VAIMBHANG”
al0QMMSS. GREIOD DAMQO GHIVYEBOS C@JoONVIa0la [lE8HEl. UTlaH
QM2 @®OOMILINAIMo. HOMINABBo  Bal@ABANDIM™ HBHISABAN V31U
@RYMAVHH  CalBABMDIM”  OHIFHNIM  aldSIel. MM  AIY®JOTVAIEM
DMNBICHNZD.  af)ADOBRHIMNE  NAUMIHAT MEBBOM 8@ GREOMI

OHINZAUATYHAUAN” Gald312]0@3, OV QoA  (JAUBOHIABAN HDIFILINs]

MVoPLISMHBOSWQo O®¥1210815H86SW)0 M1@enIanWMI6NM'”. @@ @3



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
25
BHIMMWAV”  af)BAMO @)ée;nﬂq}g” af)BIMI  AIY@IOaVAILl  af)LIonI@o
800993001  HYlaom 0" QAIBaHNIW] @IS  EMDIN]Z:SIVWIW
af)DOHN AQAD1WHSEAD  §2lLJOM1Q MVANGZAEM. VLNIGMOOHIG3 M@’
@RYAQIVIINIAT, alEMIAIV®HNAN M1LIV]G3 HBB  QAQINVIWo  AISHO
@olcvaw]l  @GREINANAZHOIABMME.  @R®  @RSENNGAIIGIMD® MANOS
MVEMLOIMODD  MVeMNITWa[ISECOMIBo MLIDEL  BRD® TVOQMHIBBIN®
walendenadlend OOMOAIIZ IR @13 alemM1HWSHBaM
O®IYILNBHOB TVoMITW]a] @JUIAME. BRDEAINNL! oBO®ELlo BT
aHq floel 8@ o®IY1LINg] HBS103 MIBa” CalGEMIGS @Y GOUID3 af)@SI
alGOI 0HIq [NBIB:0. @Y coeileel 0§l o0 ]dhGo @IS g)ndGd af)an®"
@RMOWAEM. BROMOo BRMIIWo BFINEBH: o) MIRIYIGE MI@AIM”
OO HM 6N D). rey” @0 1H 0159 dHFIQam
CRRVMIVWINMANIM af)Hd AflUDI0TVo. ERYVD® BRI E1ENHIMOAANIEM’

af)© 3 GG IGH.

o). ae9d: @l MG BREHE, EREE ERAIMGIa{la] 1 (ag) maud

GR_RULMI (@JaV’ @gjcggmocgmao?



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
26

(). @M@ @PHnE MVIGIE8 MEIGIBM@IMIM CREZOMI (JaV”
QESET))

@l ePMIGE ERHHE BRAUMAlafly] 1 (ag) maud 6e3L®1 ave
MOIHO] 2f101H630M.

@) GRM OanBeMIMBIY, @R GRAIMGIafla] 2 (enil) maud

BRI (JmV’ @mc%mwmgo?

U1, GRIMD HaNBMIMNBAV. AVAE, 6MIM JTVU” O.21QaNIE].

o). 1e9d: Ul ¢2R26emM HaNBeMITEBIY” BRAIMAafla) 2 (enil) maud

GRBRLM 1 MVRWYAS BRAAMICWINS alladaleilaflelesao.
qunimes  »mlgl  0leaods’  ea0m  (@doonss  2018-eel
@RMNID001 (ceL®) MND3 A IBlNEMMWBDANFHNIMHAIN (@ JCAWEDD
@RA0BLINAEB0MAIA .. . ...
@@ 1&Belasamalad........
@JGO®o AVER BRoWTdA12[1A1H6B3aM.

@3 A lR1VEAMMW OBHNFHBO.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
27

Qo JD1Q12I88 aIB1NeMM

M6N8%o Qldsal”

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments.

128.  In the marginal heading of section 15A of the principal Act for
the word "liquor" the words "liquor or country liquor" shall be
substituted.

146. In section 15A of the principal Act, for the figures "21" the words
"twenty three" shall be substituted wherever it occurs.

147. In section 15A of the principal Act, for the word  "liquor" the
words "liquor or country liquor" shall be substituted.

o). a1e9d: 130-00 mmIB eer3L®] 129-00 MM ce3dv®eso 132,

133, 134, 135, 136, 137 aganl mmnid cesu®lenud 131-00 ;mmnid
GR3ULMIHR0 138-00 MmMIB 3L 139-00 MUAB creV 8. 141, 142,
143, 144 agom1 momnid ceu®&ud 140-00 mmid ee3u™lése 149-2
mnd  ee3u®  148-00 mmud  GR3LMIEBe  @EIYNIVGIMIGS
@RAIMO]q {leapmz®Iel.

MI20MIMA g 2O BBV IBU3 TV B@1EBaTOEM3I?

OMI¥1ejo af)DOHMYo moes(g;l@’lceacemm’l MVa0BH6MAJo



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
28

AlEMIBIVERI00J E3AIAVINJ Qldhq QD] (). &HSHoalIss] MEO@3M)

MA@, RRLMIGOBIMM MVI1HAlasIMIEl.

ol. eed: @l al. all. wRI@BB epamGlafly 128, 146, 147

ag)am’1 MMIAB RV I1H:U3 MVE MBI 0 12[1G1H60M.
@6N=2J0 Qldsq | MO0l BOAILHNMOAN @JURODD
@RMBLINHB30MAIA. . ..........
@J®1&Belasamald............
@MBJo  Qldqf  milellead BOWAIBANEMHAAM @Ugo  aUE
@010 12 [l01H63aM0.
@6N=2o0 Qldsq | nilellead Bowad1alesm.

gaMoo Qldsal

Shri P. K. Abdu Rabb : Sir, I move the following amendment.

160. In clause 3 (b), for the words "twenty three" substitute the
words "twenty four".

ol. aV1e9A@ : 152-00 mmId ee3w® 151-00 MMIB ce3V®IBB. 154,

155, 156, 157, 158, 159 agaml moud ceeuw®eud 153-00 ;maud



Uncorrected/No2t9for Publication
cee™laso 161, 162, 163, 164, 166 agam1 mmid ceew®1eHud  165-20
MMIB GRRVDIHH DLIJOIAIVDTIMIT  BRAIMT]a {leanmz@Iel.
MI2OMIMA g QD] BBV IAUS TV fB@1ABaTOEM3D?

OMI¥lejo af)DOHMYo moes(g;l@’lceacemm’l MVa0BH6MAJo

QIlEMIBAVEIINNJo BRAITVIN0 Qloeygd@ﬁ (UY). &HSHoalssl TYEO@M) :

@,  mlenlleigs AlyaITU0  al@}dalNem. GRDOGHINZOOHAN  CRARVMI
oSl elasanlel.

ol alo9d: @1 ofl. o@. @ oM GRAIMAIq{la) 160-20 mmid

GR_ALMI VB M1BIB01 2 101H8MD.
QAN Qldsq| MINEflOad BIWAISHEMHAIM (@JUIODD)
@MZLNH63aMAIA. .. . ........
@J®1gBellasamald............
QAN20o Qe enflefload BOUAIBNEMSHAAM (@JUQo aoe
@010 2[1618800.

QN0 Qldsa | mileflond f0wmIalesa.
[y 0



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
30

MIoelIdo Qdaal

Shri V. P. Sajeendran : Sir, I move the following amendments.

173. In section 57 of the principal Act for the word "liquor" the words
"liquor or country liquor" shall respectively be substituted wherever
it occurs.

175. In clause 4 (a) of section 57 of the principal Act after the  words
"any ingredient" the words and symbols ", other than starch or any
form of starch," shall be inserted.

209. In section 57 d(i1), proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by
clause 4(c), for the words "six months" the words "one year" shall be

substituted.

Shri Adoor Prakash : Sir, I move the following amendments.

182. In section 57(aa), proposed to be inserted in the principal Act by
clause 4(b), the word "permits" shall be substituted with the word
"allows".

229. In section 57(d)(i1), proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4(c), after the words "twenty five thousand rupees" the

symbol and words ", subjected to a maximum of one lakh rupees"
shall be added.

Shri C. Mammutty : Sir, I move the following amendment.

192.  In section 57(d)(1), proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4(c), for the words "five years" the words "nine years" shall
be substituted.



214.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
31

Shri P.T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 57(d)(i1), proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4 (c), after the words "six months" the words and symbol ",
subjected to a minimum of three months" shall be inserted.

Shri Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan: Sir, I move the following

amendments.

216.

230.

218.

In section 57(d)(i1), proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4 (c), for the words "shall not be less than twenty five
thousand rupees" substitute the words "may extend to thirty thousand
rupees, subjected to a minimum of twenty five thousand rupees, or
with both".

In section 57(d)(i1), proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4(c), after the words "twenty five thousand rupees" add
the symbol and words ", subjected to a maximum of one lakh twenty
five thousand rupees."

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu: Sir, I move the following amendment.

In section 57(d)(i1), proposed to be substituted in the principal Act
by clause 4 (c), for the words "twenty five thousand" the words
"thirty thousand" shall be substituted.

ol. aleed: 168, 169, 170, 171, 172, agom1l omud ee0w®1e:ud




Uncorrected/Not for Publication
32

(BD(@)000enom®IMIeje 178-00 mmud 6e3w@ 177-20 maud c_3L®1H60
187-00 mmid @3V 186-00 MMIB ceeL®Iase 197, 198, 199, 201 agam?
mnIB 6_RVLMIHUI 200-0 mmId ee3dv®lose 208, 210, 211 agam1 ;mmid
ce3VWMHUW 209-00 mmMIB e 212-00 MMIB @3V 213-00 Mm@
cR3VWMB80 215-00 mmMIB 3L 214-00 MMIB eeBL®IG30 219-00 Mm@
cee®] 218-00 mmud@ eesw™ese 221, 222, 223, 225 agan1l oonid
c_BILM U3 224-9 Mm@ GRBILM1A80 @LI N0 IMILo
@PA®0lq [lesnenza el

MI20MIMA g QD] BBV IAUS TV B@1ABaOEM3D?

OMI¥lejo af)DOHMYo moes(g;l@’lceacemm’l MVa0BH6MAJo

QIlEMIBAVEMIINNJo GRAITVIN0 Qloeygd@ﬁ (UY). &HSHoalssl TYEO@M) :
M@, GRARVMIHHUd Mufldolesanlel.

o). leed: @l afl. afl. uR1@B®M GrAmGlaflay 173, 175, 209

af)aMT MMIAB BRI 1HU3 MR MTAIBA12[1A1H63aM.
W) @A (JIUd” BPAMEa(la) 182, 229 agam1 maud ee3L®1H:u3

MR M1OIBO]2[161H88300.



Uncorrected/NoStSfor Publication
Wl ail. 0os]l  @RAMGlafla) 192-00 maud eesL®1  ave
MNEIHA] 2{101H630M0.
@1 afl. Sl emnaV” @AUMGlaflal 214-00 maud ce3L®1 auve
MOIHO] 2f101H630M.
@) @BAUTYAR EIWIGHHB @RAIMRafls] 216, 230 agan1 maud
GRBRVLMI1HU3 MVE MTRIBHM2[l1B1H63aTM.
@ af)@. af). ONENSBMN” @RAUMANa(la) 218-00 MU EBBL®I qULE
MNEIHHA] 2{101H6330M0.
MoLId0 Qldsq | ilellead BOWAIBHIMOAND (@JUIODD
@RMBLINHB30MAIA. . ..........
@®Zelasamald............
MoLNo  Qldkal  mlefload  BIVAISHIMONAN  @JRo  ALR

@010 2[161H800.

MOLIJ0 O_Ioem(:r mﬂ%’lm@ CINMIWIB1HABM.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
34

@60 Qldsa |

Shri A. P. Anil Kumar: Sir, I move the following amendment.

241. In clause 5(a), the figures “ 23” shall be substituted with  the
figures “ 267 .

ol. aVleed: 235, 236 a1 mnid ce3u®&ud 234-00  manud

ceBOMIAB0 238-00 mMIB 6eBL®1 239-00 MMIB c_3L™IBB0 242-00
mnid ee3w™] 241-00 MMIB ceRL®IBB0 248-00 MMIB eI 247-20
mnId ee®dse  250-00 mmIB ce3w®] 249-00 mMIB cRARLER0
251, 252, 253 agam1l mmid 6e30®Hud 254-00 mmid c_r3um1asio
@eIin00@IMIT BRAIMG]a {I6EHME@ILL.  MIa0NIMOals D], CRAVMI
V@130 EN=I 7

OMI¥lelo af)OORIYo moea(%;l@’loess@mmW MVaNGHOMAOJo

QlemMIBIVEMIDVQJ0  BRAIMVINJo m@%ﬂ@’] (). HSHoalIsss] TYEO@3M):

mad, ee3w®] auileolasaniel

o). 1e93: @, af). all. GRMI@B:008 GRAIGGIA(la] 241-00 maUA@

GRRVLMI] VB MTAIBA12{101HE3D.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
35

@610 Qldsa | MIe190d BIVAILHEMOAAN (JUIODOD,

@R ZBLINABEIMAIA. ...
@®Igelasamald......
@6edo  Qldqaf  milellead  @IVMIGHIMOAAM  (@JUo ae
@010 12 [l01H63aM0.

@m0 Qldsq | niefload BownIw1olasan.

@100 Qldsa |

(ee3v@lwlel)

@100 Adha mﬂ%’]@c@ BINAIBNHEIMOAAN (2UR6)DID)

@R BLINABE3aMAIA. ...
@®gelasamald......
@Y0J0  Qlda]  ilefload  BIWVAILHEMOAIN  (@JUo e
@RoU 10 2[101H630TM.

@0J0 Qldhsa | niefload fovnIw1alasamn.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
36

800 Qldsalo all01dHhQo Gal@3o

Shri P. T. Thomas: Sir, I move the following amendment.

118. In clause 1(2) the words “come into force on 21% day of
December, 2017” shall be substituted with the words “come into
force at once”.

Shri P. K. Abdu Rabb: Sir, I move the following amendment.

123. Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:
“(2) It shall come into force on the date notified in the Official
Gazette”.

Shri C. Mammutty: Sir, I move the following amendment.

124. Clause 1 (2) shall be recast as follows:
“(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 12" day of
February, 2018”.

Shri A. P. Anil Kumar: Sir, I move the following amendment.

126. Clause 1 (2) shall be recast as follows:
“(2) It shall come into force on 1* day of July, 2018”.

ol. aleed: 110-00 mmid ee3w®] 109-00 mmIB e oge 112,

113, 114, 115, 116, 117 agam1 i@ ee3®Idhud 111-00 mmId ey o530

120, 121, 122 agaml cmmid ee3u®I:hud 119-50 mmid ceruw@1saso



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
37
@eIn0O®IMIT GRAIMG]q {lesvmz®Iel. MNIaONIMAals  2QD],
IO ENTGRQM N Pt lo T cloly

O™I¥lelo af)OORIo moearg;l@’loeszcemm’] MVaNGHOMAOJo

QflemOBaLEMINENJe G3AIAVIAJ  Qld:n]A] (UY). &HSdroalssl MYEOQ3M):

VA, XA CRBLMIHHU3 BTo MV ﬁoe)aﬂoe@nm%.

o). 1e9d: ). all. Sl. eIV’ BRAIME)a{la) 118-00 MMUAB GEEL®

MR MRIBO]2[161H86300.

@) ofl. 9&. @RMIOM]" BROIOEI (1) 123-00 mnd ece3u™]l aue
MIOIHO12[10156300.

@l al. omgl @eAa®Olafls] 124-00 maud@ cesv®1  ave
MRIBA] 2[101H6330M0.

W af). afl. @MIABH:003 ERAU®Rafla) 126-00 maud 6e3L®] aqvE
MNEIHA] 2[101H630M.

6MNJo Qldho]o a 101 Qo Bal@o NNENONB BIVAILHEMHAIN (@JUIODID)

@RMBLNH60MAIA. . ...



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
38

@J®gelaesamald......
BMIo  Qldha o aflOleQo Gal@o MIlelHad BIWAIBHAMHDAAN (aJUdo
[Q) [e] m

VR BRoU1BH@1a{101H80M0.
6NJ0 Qldho]o a 101 Qo Bal@o nieflond BowadWlalasam.

OMI¥lelo af)OOR IR0 moeag;l@’loe@cemm’] MVaNGHOMAOJo

QfleMOBaLENINENJe G3AIAVINJ  Qld:n]A] (UY). &HSdoalssl MYEOQ3M):

@, 2018-0e1 6508 @RMI®IG] GBELM MG alDTRIGHIMHAIN (@JCAWo
I3 @BRAIM® 1o {lasam.
alSlahR0m] algl®Hldy  allEGMIGHMVABIVWEHHUN0Je  MIVA0Jo

MVOoMYIATH 0o a10BLIHAZOTH:000)o moemn;!@’] (W) ag). O, MIRIN):

V@, MIM (QJECAWHOD o llaMNIEBZMD.

ol. aylond: avniey’ »olgl 616a0ds" §21Q @jdoonss 2018-eel

BHOS BRENIBHIV] BBV eNilmd A 0AVIBHEMOAAD (JEGAWHDD,
@RMBLIHA630MAIA. . .. ..

@J®1g&Belasamala. ...



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
39

W], ®@AIODA EIWIGHM: VA, GMINT GaldUd @IRYAINDLA|SAN.

(MVBLWIEBBUE I |0Wo(JHIM0 GAIIY B |STIN])

@R BN H63aMAIAR:
L. W1 o, il (mméu% 01030
2. ). afl. @’oméoon1006
3. W . @RYMILLINY
4, U1, @RYZEM] G061
5. W), ag). af)o. @RYOlan”
6. ®@)lan. Od. Q). BRMEMD
7. @I AV, Od:. @RYUD
8. W . NI
9. W), af). O, MIOLIN

10. W) M. 21Q3EURIOND
11. @W. OB, BOAVAD

12. ©). enfl. al. eIyl

13. . af)@IGRI af)ERJa0o



14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23,

24.

25.

26.

27.

28.

209.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication

40

Wlam1 VI®»I BUIal

Wl

W

W

G2RIABXR" af)o. BMIAMY’
_oﬂg@o CUNJald:nId

Ul Od. a0

W1, GRIMND HaNBEMINMY’

Wl

W

afl. gzl

63. @RA. CHSB

. 1. &aHad

. GDHI0YB 610G

. afl. &d. AVl 20 BHIW
. 20D Sl. GV’

. 0. OR. 00H]

. af). Ml 92013

. 0a003” Qa0MV1ad adl.

. MUl ©ds. MM

. af)o. MMaHI3’



30.

31

32.

33.

34.

35.

36.

37.

38.

39.

40.

41.

42.

43.

44,

45.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
41

Wl. Q. BRA. @J3lal’
Wl. af). @J3lal’ 3020
Wl . W], (@JeaVmMAad
Wl aJ@aHd &Hsejnel
U ail. Sl. ag). 0a0’lo
UD). agf)o. IREWIAIILIND
Wl 2. EIGRQ303
WY1, @YA. VICRH

@1 gl. all. PR’
Ul. BRYA. CINIM
@, EINLIBM HSMMo |81
U1. R 2101WIN3
Wl af)aVU. VOB

Wl. V. O, vuUdQ303
W all. @, VoWl

Wl ®ag). nil. AVOYlaH’



Uncorrected/Not for Publication

42
46. W af). a)MB. aHoV1A
47. @ all. @YA. MYMIB3 BHMIA
48. W1 HSHoaladxs] MYEO@@3D
49. W1. af)o. ML
50. @ . Sl. easaVENd M3
51 W . all. ol
52. W, ag)M. ARV 88

@J®1ellasanald:

1. . all. O @06 o’
2. O@Joan. @RYMIE" 2000V @6BBRUD
3. ©Y). @A (@JBr0UD"
4, @1. @GMICI BRONHO
5. W), ag). all. GRMIGI B5:203
6. W, GRMAIZ MVIBOD”
1. @), ©ag). V). MIdLIG)H
8. W. ail. sl. mIc3ndo



10.

11

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

Uncorrected/Not for Publication
43

Wl. a0l MmMaad
Wl O, V). GRIMVaD’
W OD. af)M. af). 611033
Wl. avl. oSl

GAWI. af)o. Odh. MIA

@1 af@. ag). dOENSB30D

). ®IBAIEDYE DIWIGHHD

WYl OOV Halaniomel

U1, 8G0IXN ag)o. BRI
Wl. ail. afl. vR1@Wd
Wl af)ad. aHoy310d

Wy1. ail. awl. avwo1uvoad

Wl. adl. Sl. eIV’

Ul. af)o. 0NA

MaHHHUD aldellasmmald: er@alel

ol. W1enad: @RMGENABaMAUAE -

52



Uncorrected/Not for Publication
44

e gselesamald - 22
MNaYHHU® o loellasmald - @Ry@alel.

@JGA®o VR @RoW 1@ a[lB1esM. MI1M3 A IdAVIW]DBIBs30M.

(i) 2018-06e1 ¢08 ON@AV@ DIPIBOMS Vo @ HH6M
(eedLY®1) nN®3

0QIMY0jo BOIM MB2206MOfo Al QD] (). M. 2IWBEVRINM): TVE,

queniey” ®enlgl 016a]0dg" 921 doonss 2018-0e1 ¢HH08 HMTIAUWE3
@MIBOMS  MVoABHHEM (eerw®1) @3 al@lEIMMY” af)SHNMHAAM
(@JGAWo aMIN3 BRAIM@ o (lasmo.

VA0 GHOEMOJo QNEMIBIVERINON0 GRAITVI0Jo Qo 2D

(DY) HSHoalsxs] MYCO@M): VA, MIM (JEAWHDD o laNIBRFND.




