
asL\r\\ s\ oB-Gj-\s

Fourte.dl X.rNlt Legilhtive Ar*mbly
'BfllNo. 121

I

1j.
i IEE TRAVANCORS{OCHIN EINDU RELIGIOUS

TNSTITUTIONS (AMENDMENT) BILT,' 2018

t.
I
I

{
1-.

@

Kerata Lcgislt$ta Socr€trriet
2qt

I(ERAI-A NIYAMASABIiA PR$ITII{6 PTESA.



Foulteenth K€rala Legbladve Assembly

Bill No. l2r

TIIE TRAVAI{CORT.COCEIN HINDU R.ELIGIOUS
INSTITT]TIONS (AMENDMENT) BILIJ 2018

359/2018.



Fourteenth Kersla Legislttive Assembly

Bi No.l2l

TIIE TRAVANCORE COCHIN HINDU RELIGTOUS INSTITUIIONS
(AMENDI\,'EI.ID BTLL, 2018

A

B]IT

lurther to anend the Traltancorc Cochin Hindu R.ligious Itlstitutions AcL 1950.

Prcatnble. WHERE^S, it is expedient further to amend the Travancore-

Cochin Hindu Religious Insdnrtions Act, 1950 (Act xV of 1950) for the purposes

hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of lhe Rep'rblic of India as follows:

L Short title and conmencement.-(l) This Act may be called the
Travancore-Cochin Hind'r R€ligious Instihrtions (Amendment) Act, 2018.

(2) Sections 2, 3 and 6 shall be deem€d to have come into force on the

l4th day of November, 201? and the rcmaining Fovisions of this Act shall come

2. Amendnent oI section /r.-In the Travancore-Cochin Hindu Religious
Institutions Act, 1950 (Aot XV of 1950) (hereinafter refened to as the principal

Act), in section 10, in sub-section (l), for the words "three years!', the words

"two years" shall be substituted.

3. Substitution of new section for section 12.-For section t2 of the
principal Act, the followiq section shall b€ substituted, nanely:-

"12. Honotutia for President and nenbers.--lhe Presid€nt and m€mbers

of the Board shall b€ entitled to receive per mens€m, such honoraria and sifiing
fees, as may be fixed by the Govemm€nt ftom time to time, by notificatioo
publish€d in the Official Gazette." .

4. Inse ion of new section ?jt.-After section l3Aof the principal Act,
the following section shall be inserted, namely:-

"138. lppointnent of Comnissionet.-The Covernment may, by
rotification in the-Gazette, appoint an officer not below the rank of an
Additional Secretary to Covement and who is a Hindu as the Commissionet." .

359/20t8.



5. Anendment of sectio, 29.- Itr sub-section (2) of section 29 of the

principal Act, th€ words "who shall b€ appoint€d by rhe Board- He shall be a

Hindu." shall be omitted.

6. Anendnent of section 70.-In sub-s€ction (l) of section 70 of th€

principal Act, for the words "three years", the words "two years" shall b€

7. Amendmetu of sectio, 71. For sub-section (2) of s€ction 71 of th€

principal Act, lhe following srb-section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(2) The Presidedt and members of ih€ Board shall be entitl€d to receive

per m€nsem! such honomria and sitting fees, as may be fixed by the Govemment

ftom time io time, by notificatiofl published in the Official Gaz€tt€.".

L Anendmeht of section 7ll.- ln sub-section (l) of section 74A of the

principal Act, for the words "Board shall appoint a Devaswom Comnissionei'!
the words "Govemm€nt may, by notification in th€ Cazett€, appoint an omcer

not below the rank of a Joint Secretary to Govemment and who is a Hindu as

the Commissionef' shall be substitut€d.

9. Repeal and sarins.-(1) The Travancore-Cochin Hindu R€ligious

Institutions (Amendment) Ordinance, 2018 (10 of 2018) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithsra ing such rcpeal, artding done or deemed to have been

done or any action taken or de€med to have been taken under the principal Act
as anended by the ssid Ordinanc€ shall be deemed to have beetr done or taken

utrde. the priocipal Act as amended by this Act.

STATEMENT OT OBJECTS AND REASONS

Section l0 oflhe Tmvarcore-Cochin Hindu Religious lrEritutions Act, 1950

provides for the tefm of ofEce of memb€rs of the Travancore Devaswon Board.

Section 12 of the Act provides for th€ hororaria for President and members of
the Travaocore Devaswom Board and section ?1 of the said Act provides for
the honoraria for the President and memben of the Cochin Devaswom Board.



3

2. As per section l0 of the said Act, the lerm of ofiice of the members of

the Travancore Devaswom Board shall be 6ree years Th€ Government have

decid€d to rcduce the term of office of the m€mbers as two years As per

section 12 of the said Act, the Presid€nt and members of the Travancore

Deva.swom Board shall receive such honoraria as the Board mav decide subject

to a maximum of rupees five thousadd only per mensem ir the case of the

Presirlent and tupecs tkee thousand and five hundred only per mensem in the

cas€ of each of the other two menbets As per sub-sectior (2) of section ?l of

the said Act, the President of ihe Cochin Devaswom Board shall receive an

honorarium of rupe€s five thousan'l per melrserll and each of the other two

members an honorarium of rupe€s tbree thou$nd and five hundr€d per mens€m

ftom out of Devaswom funils

3. The Govemm€nt have also decided to revise ihe honorarium of the

Prcsident and members of ihe Travaocore Devaswom Board and of the Cochin

Devaswom Boaril and also deciale to bring amendment to the said Act to the

effect that the Pr€sideDt and membels of the Travancore and Cochin Devaswom

Board shall b€ entitled lo receive p€r mensem such honordria and sitting fee' as

may be fraed by the Goverment ftom dme to time Accordingly' the Govemm€nt

have decided to make suitablc amendments to the Travancore'Cochin Hitrdu

Religious Institutions Act' 1950'

a. As rhe kgislative Assemblv of the State of Kerala was nor in iession

and the above proposals had to b€ giv€n eff€ct to ifinediately' the Travancore-

Cochin Hindu Religious lnstitutions (Ameldment) OrdinaDce' 2017 was

promulgated by the Govemor of Kerata on the l4th day of November' 201? aod

th€ samc was published as Ordinance No 23 of 2017 in the Kerala Gazette

ExFaordinary No 24?9 dated the l4th dav of November' 2017

5. A Bill to replac€ the said Ordinance bv an Act of the State Legislature

could not be iotroduced in, and passed bv, the Legislative Assembly of th€

Strte of K€rala during its session which commenced on the 22nd day of January'

2018 and ended on the ?th dav of Februarv' 2018'



4

6. As tlrc provbioni of the said Ordinance ar€ to be kepr alive and the
l,egislative Assembly of the State of Kerala was not in session, rhe Tmvancore_
Cochin Hindu Religious lnstitutions (Amendment) Ordinance,2O1S was
promulgated by the Govemor of Kerala on $e t2rh day ofFebrury,2OlS and
the same was published as Ordinance No.lo of 2018 in the Kerata cazetle
Extraordinary No.345 dated l2th February, 2018.

7. Funher rhe covemment have also decided to bring i. certain other
amendments to said Act, in ord€r to provide for rhe quatificarion for the
appointrnent of Devaswom Commissioners of Tmvancor€ Devalwom Bosrd and
Cochin Devaswom Board and to reduce the term of rlle Cochin Devaswom Board

8. The Bill seeks to.eplace Ordinance No. l0 of20l8 by an Act ofihe
State Legislature and also to achieve the above object.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The Bill, if enacted and brought into operation, would not invotve any
additional expenditure ftom the Consolidaled Futrd of th€ Srare.

MEMORANDTIM REGARDINC DELEGATED LEGISLANON

Section 12 proposed to be substiruted in the p'incipal Act by ctause 3 of
the Bill seeks to empower th€ covemm€nr to fix the honoraria and sittins fees
for the President and members of rhe lravancore O",a"*om goa,a Uv
no.ification published in the Official cazete.

2. Section 13B prqposed to be inserted in the principai Act by clause 4 of
the Bill seeks to enpower the covernnent to appoint an officer not below the
rank of an Additional Secretary to Covemment and who is a Hindu as the
CorDmissioner, by norification in the Cazette.

3. Sub-section (2) of section 71 proposed ro be substituted in the principal
Act by claus€ 7 of the Bill seeks to empower the covernment to fix the
honoraria and sitling fees for the President and rnernbers of the Coohin
Devaswom Board by notificadon published in rhe Offrcial cazene.



5

4. Sub-section (l) of section 74A proposed to be substituted in lhe Aot

by clause 8 of the Bill seeks to empower the Government to appoint an omcer

not b€low the rank of a Joint Secretary to Govemment and who is a Hindu as

the Commissioner, by norification in the Gazette.

5. The matters in respect of which the notifications are to be issued are

matters of procedure and are of routine or administraaive itr nature. Further, such

notifications are subject to the scrutiny ofthe L€gislative Assembly Herc€' the

delegation of legislahv€ power is of a normal character'

KADAICAMPALLY SURENDRAN.



6

EXIRACT FROM TIIE TRAVANCORE4OCHIN HINDU RELIGIOUS
TNSTTnONS ACT, l9s0 (ACT XV OF 1950)

12. Honoaria Ior Prcsident a d menbers.-The President and members of
lhe Board shall receive such honoraria as the Board may decide subject to a

rnaximum of Rupees five rhousand only p€r mensem in th€ case oi the President

and Rupees three thousand live hundrcd only per mensem in rhe cas€ of each

of the other two menrbets.

10. Term of the Roard.-(l) Every member of the Board shall be entitted

to hold office for a period of three years from the date of his nominarion or
election as the case may be.

l3A. Appoin nent of Chief Commissioner.,Il tlrc e!.nt of all tlrc members

of the Board ceasing to hold ofiice as such, the coverunenr may, by .otific6tion
in the Gazette, appoirt an officer not below the rank of a S€crerary to
Govemment and who is a Hibdu as tte Chief Commissioner ro exercise such
powers and perform such duties of rhe aoarJ as may be specified in rhe

notif€tion till the n€w memberc assume omce.

29. Roard's control orer the Deraswom Depa4men t. 1t) The Devaswom

Depadnent constitui€d in 1097 shall continue and shall consist of such number
of Hindu omcers and oth€r servants as may be detennined irom time to time by
the Board.

(2) The Devaswom Departm€nt shall, subject ro the supervision,
dt€ction, and control of the Boar4 be under the Devaswom Conmissioner who
shall be appointed by the Board. H€ shall be a Hindu.



'7

'70. Tem of the Board4 ) Every member of tle Board shall be entitled

to hold o{fice for a period of three years fton1 the date of this nominatror or

election, as th€ case may be.

11. President of the Boad and honorafiun for the Presiclent and

nenbers-i.t\ The HinlltLs among the Council of Minist€N shall nominate one of

the members of the Board as its President.

(21 The Presialent of the Board shall receive an honorarium of Rupees

Fi\e thousand only p€r meDsed and each of lhe olher two members an

honorarium ot Rupees Three thousaod and fi\e hundred onlv p€r mensem from

out of Devaswom tunds

14A. Appoinrhent of a Devaswon Co nissioner-(l' The Board shall

appoifi a Devaswom Commissioner for the Administration of the incot?orated

and u$incorporated Devaswoms and Hindu religious institutions under the

Board




