IR

B . BT

REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE
‘ ‘ON
THE TRAVANCORE-COCHIN HINDU RELIGIOUS
INSTITUTIONS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2018
- AND

- THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJ'ECT CONIMITI'EE
w

T

' Kerala Legislature Secretatiat
. 2018

KERALA NIYAMASABHA PRINTING PRESS. .

-




REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE
ON
THE. TRAVANCORE-COCHIN HINDU RELIGIOUS
INSTITUTIONS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2018
AND
' THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE

10422018,




CONTENTS

1. Composition
2. Report
3. Minutes of Dissent

4, Bill as reported by the Subject Committee




SUBJECT COMMITTEE II
LAND REVENUE AND DEVASWOM
! (2016-2018)
Composition

Chairman:

Shri E. Chandrasekharan,

Minister for Revenue and Housing.

Ex-Officio Member:

Shri Kadakampally Surendran,

Minister for Co-operation, Tourism and Devaswom

Members:

Shri P. B. Abdul Razak

Shri AdO(-)r Prakash

Shri €. K. Hareendran

Shri E. P. Jayarajan

Shri Kovoor Kunjumon

Shri K. D. Prasenan

Shri Purushan Kadalundy

$hri K. Rajan

Shri M. Ummer.
Legislature Secretariat:

Shri V. K. Babu Prakash, Secretary

Shri K. Suresh Xumar, Joint Secretary

Shri G. Harish, Deputy Secretary

Shri D. Krishnankutty, Under Secretary.




THE TRAVANCORE-COCHIN HINDU RELIGIOUS
INSTITUTIONS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2018

(Report of the Subject Committee)

Subject Committee II (Land Revenue and Devaswom) to which
“The Travancore-Cochin Hindu Religious Institutions (Amendment) Bill, 2018”
(Bil! No.144) was referred, considered the Bill ¢lause by clause and now submits
its Report with the Bill as reported by the Committee annexed thereto.

2. The Travancore-Cochin Hindu Religious Institutions (Amendment) Bill,
2018 was published as a Gazette Extraordinary dated May 29, 2018. The Bill was
introduced in the Assembly on June 6, 2018 and was referred to the Subject
Committee on the same day.

3. The Committee considered the Bill clause by clause at its meeting held
on June 11, 2018. The Committee recormmends to adopt the Bill without any
modification.

4. The Minutes of dissent is appended.

E. CHANDRASEKHARAN,
Thiruvananthapuram, Chairman,
11th June, 2018, Subject Committee IL




aﬂc@ommmo‘lg

almallciomd 63l GMIBMReINYs, Bdlafiod GaqTe ssuodaulpelgoe
mommaufaam, wavlancfiges  sxmeadioe  mvawisamalngs W00
oo empdaysBenroiem. e’ onigae 3500, 5000 @ugeowl
MmO SO 0IEID.  afMIcd  ojolas aean®] )dots @@ molismmolngs
@pwlisome MUdsMIB  Afegsesde, SBVEBLUE waogled  @nlueleaam
aNmEma Mo ) MlvmIE1ERMBDEIOHMAT” @R’ UXZCITUO DalgflSSR. audsendim”
TOLI0ABE TUIaNAIDNETI  @sTENTIRe ADE DaIw] v HaaanGinta
DAGYHS TSR0, BI@Aaenr @A T0-00 aeqflon 1-00 aldalled umanio
esan@l oo GUIAAeEes @micnaiw] 3 adaiomlc Mmoo PANCTL T L TS Lo
mleioflesresl@mam GG kag nj]m‘lgdaﬂﬁanm'lm" eRMEIWI @R, Do) adala
B3} 8103 nJdomealoaanmim” caenFlwoen’ ap@mocd v dleyidglemas”
aflglq | coaiag|SERDaN.

1. eogd @Jamoud” (8]}

2. ago. pend (eq])

1042/2018.



THE TRAVANCORE-COCHIN HINDU RELIGIOUS INSTITUTIONS
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 20i8

. (As reported by the Subject Committee)
A
BIL
Jurther to amend the Travancore-Cochin Hindu Religious Institutions Act, 1950,

FPreamble —WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Travancore-
Cochin Hindu Religious Institutions Act, 1950 (Act XV of 1950) for the purposes
hereinafier appearing;

Bk it enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the
Travancere-Cochin Hindu Religious Institutions (Amendment) Act, 2018.

(2} Sections 2, 3 and 7 shall be deemed to have come into force on the
14th day of November, 2017 and the remaining provisions of this Act shall come
into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 10.—In the Travancore-Cochin Hindu Religious
Institutions Act, 1950 (Act XV of 1950) (hereinafier referred to as the principal
Act}, in section 10, in sub-section (1), for the words “three years”, the words
“two years” shall be substituted.

3. Substitution af new section for section 12.—For section 12 of the
principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“12. Honoraria for President and members.—The President and
members of the Board shall be entitled to receive per mensem, such honoraria
and sitting fees, as may be fixed by the Governmeni from time to time, by
notification published in the Official Gazette.” .

4. Insertion of new section i3B—After section 13A of the principal Act,
the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“13B. Appointment of Commissioner.-——The Government may, by
notification in the Gazette, appoint an officer not below the rank of an
Additional Secretary to Government and who is a Hindu as the Commissioner.” .

5. Amendment of section 29.— In sub-section (2) of section 29 of the
principal Act, the words “who shall be appointed by the Board. He shall be a
Hindu.” shall be omitted.



-

6. Amendment of section 70.—In sub-section (1) of section 70 of the
principal Act, for the words “three years”, the words “two years” shall be
substituted.

7. Amendment of section 71 —For sub-section (2) of section 71 of the
principal Act, the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely;—

“(2) The President and members of the Board shall be entitled to receive
per mensem, such honoraria and sitting fees, as may be fixed by the Government
from time to time, by notification published in the Official Gazette.”.

8. Amendment of section 74A.— In sub-section (1) of section 74A of the
principal Act, for the words “Board shall appoint a Devaswom Commissioner”,
the words “Government may, by notification in the Gazette, appoint an officer
not below the rank of a Joint Secretary to Government and who is a Hindu as
the Commissioner” shall be substituted.

9. Repeal and saving.—(1) The Travancore-Cochin Hindu Religious
Institutions (Amendment) Ordinance, 2018 (28 of 2018} is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or deemed to have been
done or any action taken or deemed to have been taken under the principal Act
as amended by the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken

under the principal Act as amended by this Act.

Secretariat of the Kerala Legisiature, V. K. Banu Prakasy,
Thiruvananthapuram, Secretary.
11th hme, 2018.





