— —r-

REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE
ON
THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2016
AND .
THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE

©

Kerala Legislature Secretariat
: 2016

KERALA NIYAMASABHA PRINTING PRESS.



REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE
ON
THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2016
AND
THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE

1142/2016.



CONTENTS

Page
1. Composition . v
2. Repont . vii
3. Minutes of dissent - »d

4. Bill as reported by the Subject Committee " 1



SUBJECT COMMITTEE VIIi
{ECONOMIC AFFAIRS)
{2M6-2018)
Comnposition
Chairman:

Dr T. M. Thomas Isaac,
Minister for Finance and Coir.

Ex-officio Members:

Shri T. P. Ramakrishnan,
Minister for Labour and Excise

Shri G. Sudhakaran,
Minister for Public Works and Registration.

Members:

Shni T. A. Ahammed Kabeer, M.LA.
Dx. N. Jayara, »
Shri V. K. C. Mammed Kova, »
Shri D. K. Murali, »
Shri Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan,
Shri Mullakkara Retmakaran, »
Shri V. D. Satheesan, »
Shr K. Suresh Kurup. "

Legislature Secretariat .
Shri V. K. Babu Prakash, Secretary
Shri K. Gopakumaran Pillai, Joint Secretary
Smt. Lima Francis, Deputy Secretary
Smt. Deepa R. Krishnan, Under Secretary.



THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2016
(Report of the Subject Committee)

The Kerala Finance Bill, 2016 (Bill No.16) was referred to Subject Committee
» VIII—Economic Affairs for joint consideration with Subject Committee V—Pubtlic
Works, Transport and Communications and Subject Committee XIV-Home Affairs.
The joint meeting of Subject Committee V, VIII and XIV considered the Bill
clause by clause and now submits this Report with the Bill as reported by the
Subject Committee annexed thereto.

2. The Kerala Finance Bili, 2016 was published as a Gazette Extraordinary
dated Julv 16, 2016. The Bill was introduced in the Assembly on July 18, 2016
and was referred to Subject Committee VIII for joint consideration with Subject -
Committee V., VIII and XIV on October 26, 2016.

3. The Committee considered the Bill clause by clause at the meeting held
on October 27, 2016. The Committee recommends to adopt the Bill with the
following modifications:—

Ciause 1
For Clause 1, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala
Finance Act, 2016.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act,—

(1) Clause (b) of sub-section (8} of section 9 shall be deemed to
have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2005;

(il  Clause (b) of sub-section (2) of section 9 shall be deemed to
have come into force on the st day ot April, 2013;

(i) Sub-clause (i) of clause (a} of sub-section (2} and item (d) of
sub-clause (i1} of clause (a) of sub-section {2) of section 9 shall be deemed to
have come into force on the lst day of April, 2015;



viil
(iv) Clause (a) of section7, section 8, item (a) of sub-clause (i) of
clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 9, item (a) of sub-clause (ii} of clause (a)
of sub-section (2) of section 9, sub-section (4) of section 9, sub-clauses (i), (ii),
(iii) and (v) of clause (a) of sub-section (16) of section 9 shall be deemed to
have come into force on the lst day of April, 2016;

(v} Sub-clause (i) and sub-clause (i1) of clause (b) of section 7, item
(b) and (c) of sub-clause (i) of clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 9,
sub-clause (ii) of clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 9, clause (b) of ,
sub-section (1) of section 9, items (b} and (c) of sub-clause (ii) of clause (a) of
sub-section (2) of section 9, sub-section (3) and sub-sections (5) to (7), clause
(a) of sub-section (8) and sub-section (9} to (15) of section 9, sub-clause (1v),
sub-clauses (vi), (vii), (viii) and (ix) of clause (a) of sub-section (16) of section 9
and clause (b) and sub-clauses (i), (i) (iii),(v),(vi), (vit) and (viii) of clause (c) of
sub-section (16) of section 9 shall be deemed to have come into force on the
18th day of July, 2016;

(vi) The remaining provisions of this Act shall come into forcc at

once.”
Clause 2

1. In sub-clause (b) for the word “inserted” the word “substituted” shall
be substituted;

2. In sub-clause (¢) for the word “inserted” the word “gubstituted”’shall
be substituted.

Clause 3

1. For sub-section (1) of the Kerala Stamp Act, 1959 proposed to be )
inscrted by clause 3 of the Bill, the following sub-section shall be substituted,

namely:—
(1) in section 2,—

(a) for clause (d), the following clause shall be substituted,

namely:—

(d) “Conveyance” includes.—



1X
(i) a conveyance on sale;

i (ii) deed of amalgamation of two or more companies whether
in pursuance of an order of the National Company Law Tribunal or not;

(iii) deed of amalgamation in pursuance of the order under
section 44A of Banking Regulation Act, 1949; and

(iv) every other instrument, by which property, whether
movable or immovable or any interest in any property is transferred inter vivos
and which is not otherwise specifically provided in the Schedule”;

(b} in clause (1) after item (vii) following items shall be inserted,
namely;—

“(viii) an agreement relating to installation of ATM/CDM or
both of them between banks and the land owner or renewal of such an
agreement,

(ix) an agreement relating to installation of Mobile Tower,
between & company and the land owner or renewal of such an agreement”.

2. after clause (d) of the following shall be inserted:

(i) (da) after serial number 22 and the entries against it in columns (2) and
(3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be inserted,
namely:——

“22 A, Conveyance as defined in
item (ii) and (iii) of section 2 (d)
not being a transfer charged or
exempted under no. 55.

1142/2016.

Five rupees for every 100 rupees
or part thereof of the fair value
of the land and the value of
other immovabie properties of
the transferor company, which is
the subject matter of the
conveyance; or the aggregate of
the market value of shares or
other marketable securities, which
is the subject matter of the
conveyance issued or allotted in
exchange or otherwise; or the
amount of consideration paid for .
such amalgamation whichever 1s
higher”. :



X

(ii) for item (f} of sub-clause (3) of clause 3, the following shall be

substituted, namely:—

“Gift.—instrument not being a
settlement or will or transfer,

{a) Where the gift is in favour of
father, mother, grandfather,
grandmother, husband, wife, son,
daughter, brother,
grandchildren of a person and if-—

sister or

() the extent of land involved in
the property transferred by the
instrument is five acres or less

(i) the extent of land involved in
the property transferred by the
instrument is above five acres

(b) in any other case

in serial number 31, for the entries in columns (2) and (3), the following
entries shall be substituted, namely;—

Two rupees for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the fair value
of the property and the value of
the other properties set forth in
the instrument or the value of all
the properties set forth in the
instrument whichever is higher,
subject to a maximum of rupees
1,000.

Two rupees for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the fair value of
the property and the value of the
other properties set forth in the
instrument or the value of all the
forth in the
instrument whichever is higher.

properties set

The same duty as a conveyance
(No.21 or 22 as the case may
be)”;



Xi

(iii) for item (b) of sub-clause (3) of clause 3, the following shall be

substituted, namely:—

in serial number 42, for the entries in columns (2) and (3), the following

entries shall be substituted, namely:—

“Partition—Instrument of (as defined
by section 2 (k):

(a) Where the partition is among all
or some of the members of the family
and if—

() the extent of land involved in
the property divided by the
instrument is five acres or less

(i) the extent of land involved in the
property divided by the
instrument is above five acres.

(b) in any other case

One rupee for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the fair value of
the separated share or shares of
property and the value of other
properties in such separated share
or shares set forth in the
instrument, or of the value of all
the properties of the separated
share or shares as set forth in
the instrument, whichever is
higher, subject to the maximum of
rupees 1,000,

One rupee for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the fair value of
the separated share or shares of
property and the value of other
properties in such separated share
or shares set forth in the
instrument, or of the value of all
the properties of the separated
share or shares as set forth in
the instrument, whichever is

higher.

Six rupees for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the amount of
the value or fair value of the
separated share or shares of the
property whichever is higher”.




xii
(iv) for item (i) of sub-clause (3) of clause 3, the following shall be
substituted, namely:—

in serial number 48, for the entries in columns (2) and (3), the following
entries shall be substituted, namely:—

“Release, that is to say, any
instrument (not being such a
release as is provided in section
24), whereby a person renounces
a claim upon another person or
against any specified property—

(a) When such release operates in
favour of father, mother, grandfather,
grandmother, husband, wife, son,
daughter, brother, sister, grandchildren
or lepal heirs of the deceased
children of a person and if—

() the extent of land involved in  One rupee for every rupees 100
the property in which right  or part thereof of the amount of
relinquished by the instrument  the fair value of other properties
is five acres or less or claims of which the right is

relinquished in proportion to
right relinquished or value of all
the properties or claims of which
the right is relinquished in
proportion to the right
relinquished or consideration for
the release, whichever is higher,
subject to a maximum of Rupees
1,000.

(i) the extent of land involved in ~ One rupee for every rupees 100
the property in which right  or part thereof of the amount of
relinquished by the instrument the fair value of other properties
is above five acres or claims of which the right is

relinquished in proportion to
right relinquished or value of all
the properties or claims of which
the right is relinquished in
proportion to  the  right
relinquished or consideration for
the release, whichever is higher”.



{(b) in any other case

The same duty as a conveyance
{No.21 or 22 as the case may be) for
such amount or value of the property
or claim or fair value of the property
of which the right is relinquished in
proportion to right relinquished or
consideration for the release,
whichever is higher.

(v) for item (j) of sub-clause (3} of clause 3, the following shall be

substituted, namely:—

in serial number 51, clause (&), for the entries in columns (2) and (3), the
following entries shall be substituted, namely:—

“Settlement—

A, instrument of (including a deed of
dower), '

(a) Where the settlement is in favour
of father, mother, grandfather,
grandmother, husband, wife, son,
daughter, brother, sister or
grandchildren of a person and if—

(i) the extent of land involved in
the property settled by the
instrument is five acres or less

(i) the extent of land involved in
the property settled by the
instrument is above five acres

Two rupees for every rupees
100 or part thereof of the
amount of the fair value of
other propertics set forth in
the instruments or the value
of all properties set forth in
such instrument, whichever is
higher, subject to a maximum
of Rupees 1,000,

Two rupees for every rupees
100 or part thereof of the fair
value of the land and the
value of other properties set
forth in the instrument or the
value of all properties set
forth in such instrument,
whichever is higher.



Xiv
(b) in any other case The same duty as Bottomry Bond
(No. 14) for a sum equal to amount
or value of the property settled as

set forth in such instrument or fair
value of land, whichever is higher.”

Clause 4

1. For sub-section (1) of section 76 of the Kerala Court Fees and Suits
Valuation Act, 1959 proposed to be amended by sub-clause (1), the following

sub-scction shall be substituted, namely:—

“Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or any other law for the
time being in force and subject to section 4A of the Act and sub-rule (1) of rule
397 of the Kerala Motor Vehicle Rules,1989 it shali be competent for the
Government to levy an additional court fee by notification in the Gazette, in
respect of original petitions, original applications, appeals or revisions to tribunals,
appellate authorities and original suits in Civil Courts other than in Family Court
at a rate not exceeding one per cent of the amount involved in the dispute and
in other cases at a rate not exceeding one hundred rupees for each original suit,

original petition, original application, appeal or revision.

Explanation:—The term “amount involved in the dispute” as specified in
sub-section (1), where it is capable of valuation, does not include the amount of
valuation for the purpose of court fee, in suits for recovery of possession,
partition and suits of similar nature and where fixed court fec is specified under
this Act.”

2. In sub-clause (2),

(i) in item (a) the words “subject to a minimum of five hundred

rupees”’shail be omitted.

(ii) in item (b) the words “subject to a minimuim of five hundred rupees”
shall be omitted.



XV

Clause 6

1. In the 4th proviso to sub-section (1) of section 3 of the Kerala Motor
Vehicles Taxation Act, 1976 proposed to be inserted by item (a) of
sub-clause (2),—

(2) after the words “ in respect of ”, the word “new” shall be inserted;

(b) to the 4th proviso as so inserted, following note shall be inserted,
namely:—

“NOTE:—This shall be deemed to have come into force on and from
18th day of luly, 2016”,;

(c) in the proviso substituted by sub-clause (b), the word “also” shall
be omitted;

(d) in the proviso inserted by sub-clause (¢),—
(1) after the word “payable” the following shall be inserted, namely:——
“from the date of entry till the end of the quarter”;
(ii) the third proviso and Explanation shall be omitted.

2. in the Table, in section 3A proposed to be inserted by sub-clause (3),
setial number 5 and the entries against it in columns (2), (3) and (4) shall be
omitted.

3. in serial number 7 in the Schedule proposed to be substituted by
sub-item (i) of item (b) of sub-clause (8),—
(a) in item (i),—

(i) in sub-item (e), for the entry “350("" in column (3) against entry in
column (2) the entry “3000" shall be substituted.

(i1) in sub-item (f) substituted by sub-item (i}(b) for the entry “3500”
in column (3) against entry (ii) in column (2) the entry “3000” shall be
substituted.

(b) in item (iv), proposed to be inserted by sub-item (iii), for the entry
“Rs.1,360” in column (3) against entry in column (2) against item (b), the entry
“Rs.1,100” shall be substituted.

4. In serial number 9 proposed to be substituted by sub-clause (c) for the
entry “7000” in column (7) against item (e) the entry “700” shall be substituted.



xvi

Clause 7
. In sub-clause (b) after item (ii) the following shall be inserted, namely:—
“(1ii) .the second proviso to clause (¢) shall be omitted.”
Clause 9

In the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 pfoposcd to be inserted by
clause 9,

(1) in section 25D, proposed to be inserted by sub-clause (6), the following
shall be substituted, namely:—

“(i) for the words and figures “30th June, 2016 the words and figures

“from 1st April, 2016 to 31st March, 2017"”and shall pay the amount within a
period of two years in equal quarterly instalments” shall be substituted.

(2) For sub-section (8), the following shall be substituted, namely.—
(8) in section 42—

(a) in sub-section (1), after the second proviso, the following proviso
shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided also that with respect to units of Kerala State Electricity
Board Ltd. which obtained separate registration as per sub-section (3) of section
20 shall file trial balance for each such units, along with audited statement of
accounts and certificate of the company.”;

(b) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(3) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in this Act, if a
dealer,—

(i) fails to file audited accounts referred to in sub-section (1), or

(ii) fails to file revised annual return rectifying the mistake or
omission, along with the audited statement of accounts and certificate or if the
variance in the audited statement of accounts with the returns is not
satisfactorily explained in the reconciliation statement prescribed, or

(iii) fails to file the annexures, statements, certificates, declarations,
including the statutory declarations to be filed under the Central Sales Tax Act,
1956 which are required to be filed along with the returns to prove the
correctness of the concessional rate of tax, exemptions and exports claimed in
the returns, or ’



Xvii

{(iv) fails to declare any sale, purchase or inter-state stock transfer as
evidenced from the documents prescribed under section 46 available with the
- assessing authority in the sales and purchase lists filed along with the returns,
the assessment of such dealer for the relevant year for the purpose of section 25
shall be treated as pending and the time limit mentioned thereunder shall not be
applicable in such cases.”.

(3) in section 58A proposed to be inserted by sub-clause (13),—
{(a) in sub-section (2) clause (a) shall be omitted;
{b) clauses (b) and (c) shall be relettered as clauses (a) and (b);

(¢) in sub-section (3), for the words “clause (b) of sub-section {2)” the
words “clause (a) of sub-section (2)” shall be substituted.

(4) in the First Schedule, proposed to be inserted by item (a) of
sub-clause (16),—

(a) in serial number 2 proposed to be inserted by sub-item (i) of
sub-clause (a),—

(i) after item (ix), the following item shall be inserted,—

“(x) in serial number 63, in the entry in column (2) after the words,
“used plastic” the words “plastic scrap, waste chips, parings” shall be
inserted.”;

(i) in item (c)—
(a) for sub-item (i) the following sball be substituted, namely:—

(1) after serial number 5A and the entries against it in columns (2) and
(3} the following serial number and entries shall respectively, be inserted,
namely;—

“5B. Atta maida, sooji and rava sold in packages with MRP printed on
such packages”;

(b) for sub-item (ii} the following shall be substituted, namely:—

(ii) after serial number 8, the entry against it in columns (2) and (3), the
following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be inserted, namely:—

“8A. Basmati Rice sold in packages with MRP printed on such
packages”;

1142/2016.



XViil
(c) for sub-item (iv), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

for serial number 30A and the entries against it in columns (2} and (3),
the following serial number and entries shall respectively be inserted, namely:—

“30A. Cooked Food, other than,—

(i) those served to any airline service company of inslitution or
shipping company for serving in aircraftship or steamer or served in aircraft,
ship, steamer and five star hotels; and

(i) burgers, pizzas, tacos, doughnuts, sandwitches, burger-pattys,
pasta and bread fillings sold by restaurants having a brand name or trade mark
registered under the Trade Marks Act, 1999,”;

(d) sub-item (vi) of item (c) of sub-clause (16) of clause 9 shall be
omitted and sub-items (vii) to (ix) coming thereafter shall be renumbered as (vi)
to (viii) respectively;

(e) after sub-item (viii) so renumbered, the following sitell be inserted,
namely,—

*(d) in List A,—

(i) in serial number 118, in item 15 for entries against it in columns (2}
and (3), the following entries shall, respectively, be substituted, namely.—

(L]

“recycled Plastic

New Clause 10
After clause 9, a new clause shall be added as Clause 10, namely:—

“10. Validation—(1) Notwithstanding the lapse of the Kerala Finance Bill,
2016 (Bill No. 396 of Thirteenth Kerala Legislative Assembly) (hereinafter referred
to as the said Bill) and the cesser of force of law of the declared provisions of
said Bill anything done or any action taken, including levy and collection of tax
or duty, during the period from the 1st day of April, 2016 to the 17th day of
July, 2016, by virtue of the declared provisions contained in the said bill, under
the Kerala Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 (11 of 1957) or under the Kerala Stamp
Act, 1959 (17 of 1959) or under the Kerala Court Fees and Suits Valuation Act,
1959 (10 of 1960) or under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of 1976) or
under the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 (15 of 1991) or under the
Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 2004) (hereinafter referred to as the
respective Acts) as they stand amended by the said Bill, shall be deemed to be
and to have always been for all purposes, validly and effectively done or taken
under the provisions of the respective Acts, as if the said amendments had been
in force at all material times.



X1X

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in the respective Acts during
the period from 1st April, 2016 to 17th day of July, 2016 during which the
declared provisions contained in the said Bill was in force, anything done or
any action taken by virtue of the said provisions of the said Bill shall be
deemed to have been validly done or taken under the respective Acts and no
action shall lie against any dealer or authority on the ground of short tevy or
refund of excess tax or duty and tax or duty collected, if any, by a dealer or an
authority, as the case may be, shall be paid over to the Government.

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Kerala Value Added Tax
Act, 2003 (30 of 2004) any tax collected or paid at higher rate by virtue of the
provisions of the Kerala Finance Bili, 2016 (Bill No. 16 of the XIV Kerala
Legislative Assembly) in respect of the period with effect on and from the
18th day of July, 2016 to the date of publication of this Act, shall be deemed to
have been validly done and any tax collected or paid by a dealer or authority at
such higher rates shall be deemed to have been validly collected or paid and the
tax so collected shall be paid over to the Government and shall not be
refunded.”

4. All other changes are either verbal or consequential,

5. The minutes of dissent are appended.

Thiruvananthapuram, Dr. T. M. THOMAS ISAAc,

27th October, 2016. Chairman,
Subject Committee VIII



afllecwormeaclaf |

2016-0e1 canog Wm0 snflgfiad 3(3) algiawien (agar) wamoud 31 (i) 48 (i)
51-e3(ag) amuomlons 300 coI8smElTE AIEoBdWleam hGosTloaBul Gudle|gs
LaYEIMNe, EINAN@o, WNWURIRe ARINERUESS” ainnoiw] 1,000 @aiwooimme”
100 @ug' 3 @a mosslmd  adaiyflye” cugenomleos EN TR T T B
AIAUBE 200 aflemisne misdsammadaas @DGBBG()JW@’ICDQ‘;!OOJDGTD‘T

4-50 eusmuamlOe! edeg8 ceods’ aslmyo A AUOORTVEIQe RING 76-00
Udaflad (1)-%o Datdalldd (ng)) cismuomlop (mm QIMLEWIRje GEINGHgs,
alallad  easmisolaes afgl  eolwinad COHTYMENSWYo  eadds a0l e
25 wommniw! aidavlafl yo” gemiciwem’ mgele GEIMENILNGIME” A 0UN]g
BNOERZe  OIDEOAICIY  TUEDBFGOIT.  CHISIe@ns @D adewmal  aiod
HETRavIcan, mwiesed entianed @eiglews mgmuo;m.-ﬂsm(m@asm mm”
aJMalRlcuawlenemo.

42(2) II-90 ~iglaod amdsleadd 3-eel (iii)-% mmaminag (), (mul),
(en), (o) Qg mgloal Income tax, Wealth tax BhTYBHBOS HHaDCHNISD noloy”
adavlalafm’  euowseg’ TNew@omI@enilele AJOWIO®IE. @ aclmoadms”
migflo} s@guimfielglom mowless. qIWRG @vonomla mEImm @It
afHEIMOM WMoY MALAGE cuTReom” alaleuous] daame.

B8 6206508 AWanm Meo ARGl 3 (3) Amgimeme «yolwmon
¢adam  anele mleoel spomal aglaoled Non-transport  anaomspules”
I5 aiBatiqe BQ ARaOMETEUBHH” 10 adaneow mimaqgjsomle ole) a3g] aggp
WROMEBWGR 15 0ifarnowl mlnReqagomems.,

9-20 ausmuwamlos 2003-e01 caeg gely adare @@ 25 wl Wse] o)
[RERINY  TYOSHPEUTE] andG MG ORI valMeadd ROIEmHNIU
@RYGAINIURAENEISEAN GNIGHNT Do |MEaNUlaRe MWD alblanlosEswlane 2013-14
apeqps asaiogoles mldapulsasns dleo] assmmenal@dalon  eauwas
Dealer-oodea” @ somasmuwomlenssmaslee arlnoge olege eFILIGID@®IT”
BRODAUIGS MWEHITHE FURMINNM” MaANEISEINENIE'

BRTI T HOBEMFBEI amaad o melam ageBenan,

G0, o). RO (8a))



xxii

afcommandiaf Il

2016-001 cong WNGIRY ISl @IOVoR  OCEIRMo  NERUD
COERGEDT.
1959-p2) c:08 GBS 1Yo 0IyH-OIRTVAIDC @y aylob @REIWMIRCT] @R

QBIONBE @D |GEl] smcssrnésn')eﬂang pomeal@elone eUMOm’ $Igy @RydIm” '
SHWyss B eeI’ s)s)smjém)anm@ pomaa@alomgs anaflel O8a0eanIsSorls”
. oad laRemuul  ERQTUIGT  diNgaidHa @alolod  eaNQomlsam’  alendaiwl
10,000 @nig olewoarw] @lgaqg|somio maxnaTang 8w WHAIMAR T
a0dg anlny, @em’ nggaje @@ 500 @rwlod agma@lm” alewoniwl
epeajsm™ Migomlges 5 w@@aime  @rpwl adaslaflaje” Oleaalenrm

anallgl. o mdcaueamos” Ale@IK)Ham,

all. o, dsmmoellaagl  (8q])

EEAW’ Salmiamel (e f)



xxiii

afleommaendslaf 111

2016-pa1 Gaeg WMsoR) mANM” Moeeqn@IM  AllewirMo  MEIBLY
GOSN |GEDT;

l.  @gomuewsmud melejgg BINAIe, S$170), Mo, WHMIURIWe Ay
awonsnges gaofle) 3% el adalalaolemage gaofole, aRlITUESaHm

atimilele  2ME@ImM  AIOIW]l  A)SODS@mm@e MG 1HO)18a00)M  SONEL
mlainfees alomn memals] MeindamIam@ImI ereiet csomle e33!]

midegurcomis’ allewiklaf caaifq|SEman.

2. allpawsaasddses”’ mlenlcd 6 oooms gaalleiwism” paso. @Galyes
mpmaleges 50 w@aIme @5l 23@6s TBWIEERUE DUl ERITRE OaY agam
aunnalpyomlcd  ggates 8 woemarml  adavlafleammlomas’  aflcwoslef

BO6US|STTDAT.

3. @:08:1Emomw Ma® oNeananimlagns sdeyamlc 80% mywicmo”
30% @@l sogainmngsg Mdequusamds” AlewIR]y cony 3@

S). nf). @Ra0@A” &Henfld (83a])
@@ E0WIGaHmM  (8qf)
afl. awl. ruwead (8a])



xxXiv

aNcwormaeadlef IV

2016-02) caH0@ WM, MM @ePn o  ACWIRMe  ERISIRUD
COELSAGRD MO

. aoea apanmeanges mleoloial 10 woame adama asawioo”
ML IB@WIN MUIWMEBRIGeSs alleiudadmallm” @:00emaeaammmImIcd AREAGmIs

aflcImissn.

2. oqum’ S$HJICORHRNS HNWAITY mlam] anaigns @oaltaldspamlang
@rsIauoomamial aIRlaeleaan ulanaeiomlcd soamyavlgh audafiny” ms@Dmm
2dImol euryages Sog goramonleendleedd 10,000 @aewoge anulae
MOBESHMEUBIN TVID alDL@MIOE 0D ERAI® MlB®] oJ3Mari 8F1OIIenEMenm
rdaguee quflaaleniammimint ralamos’ alewoimlaf coELaGEDT.

3. 15 adae aveegps emoem Sadeayids’ ananmenules M Sogy
AEHDGIGE Q. AU @RE.QLmlge pudeqgmn. 10 gl S awlauo
QIANTHEBU AflMaeleauomnag Wi s)mssmésmrua aluwlges agrenocomicialome
adIsTIcaRRes meomled mlalaesmm ad.aDTV ARA.0L ML 807 FRYILIIMDIHIN

@R sayidmlanoe afry® MUDIn INEOE a¥1IGHaMEm e, g
mSa{lenseaameinIm alcwislef coaIn oD,

4. coogon” olqyd Oalg apandoverunim mudalmy’ msgmam apalaiwlae
WHDENIND SBIMFEAIISHIN TVIWIVOM EHIMNTEIG B} 0eeEIM anrveid sanlm’
1,540 @oiwsoi@mma” 2,050 @aioowian” aidavlafla)o oo ruowieemsnIeIw
WADENIDD  CGEIaHHARIW]  mpwleam @ mldejrniomimaind aeolemas’
aflewominf s ST,

ap0d. ettomryIad (a3

"



THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2016
{As reported by the Subject Committee)

[The words underlined/sidelined indicate the modifications suggested by the
Committee. Omissions are indicated by asterisks]

A
BILL

to give effect to certain financial proposals of the Government of Kerala for
the Financial Year 2016-2017.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, it is expedient to give effect to certain financial
proposals of the Government of Kerala for the Financial Year 2016-2017;

Bt it enacted in the Sixty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as
follows:—

1. Short title and commencement—(})This Act may be called the Kerala
Finance Act, 2016.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act,—

(1) Clause {b) of sub-section (8) of section 9 shall be deemed to
have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2005,

(i) Clause (b) of sub-section (2) of section 9 shall be deemed to
have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2013;

(iiy Sub-clause (1) of clause (a) of sub-section (2) and item (d) of
sub-clause (ii) of clause (a) of sub-section(2) of section 9 shall be deemed to
have come into force on the st day of April, 2015;

(iv) Clause (a) of section7, section 8, item (a) of sub-clause (i) of
clause (a) of sub-section {1} of section 9, item (a) of sub-clause (i) of clause (a)
of sub-section (2) of section 9, sub-section (4) of section 9, sub-clauses
(i),(i1),(iii) and (v} of clause (a) of sub-section (16} of section 9 shall be deemed
to have come into force on the 1st day of April, 2016;

(v) Sub-clause (i) and sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of section 7, item
{b) and (c) of sub-clause(i) of clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 9, sub-
clause (ii) of clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 9, clause (b) of sub-section
(1) of section 9, items (b) and (c) of sub-clause (ii} of clause (a) of sub-section (2)
of section 9, sub-section (3) and sub-sections (5) to (7),clause (a) of sub-section (8)

1142/2016.




2

and sub-section (9) to (15) of section 9, sub-clause(iv), sub-clauses (vi), {vii),
(viii) and (ix) of clause (a) of sub-section {16) of section 9 and clause (b) and
sub-clauses (i), (ii),(iii),(v),(vi),(vii) and (viii)of clause (c) of sub-section (16)
of section 9 shall be deemed to have come into force on the 18th day of
July, 2016;

(vi} The remaining provisions of this Act shall come into force at
once.

2. Amendment of Act 11 of 1957 —In the Kerala Surcharge on Taxes Act,
1957 (11 of 1957), in section 3,—

(a) after sub-section (1A), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(1AA) The tax payable under section 6 of the Kerala Value Added
Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 2004), shall, with respect to the sale of water, soda, soft
drinks, fruit juices and other beverages whether aerated or not, intended for
human consumption and sold in containers of plastic but excluding those sold
in such containers of and above 20 litres, be increased by a surcharge at the
rate of five per cent and the same shall be paid over to the Government and
further, the provisions of the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 2004)
excluding those related to input tax credit and special rebate shall apply in
relation to the said surcharge as they apply in relation to the tax payable under
the said Act.”;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the word, brackets, figure and letter
“sub-sections (1) and (1A)"” the word, brackets, figure and letter “‘sub-sections (N,
(1A) and (1AA)” shall be substituted,

{¢) in sub-section (3), for the word, brackets, figure and letter
“sub-sections (1) and (1A)” the word, brackets, figure and letter “sub-sections (1),
(1A) and {1AA)” shall be substituted;

3. Amendment of Act 17 of 1959.—In the Kerala Stamp Act, 1959
(17 of 1959),—

(1) in section 2,—

(a) for clause (d), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:—

(d) “Conveyance” includes,—

(i) a conveyance ou sale;




3

(if) deed of amalgamation of two or more companies whether
in pursuance of an order of the National Company Law Tribunal or not;

(iii) deed of amalgamation in pursuance of the order under
section 44A of Banking Regulation Act, 1949; and

(iv) every other instrument, by which property, whether
movabie or immovable or any interest in any property is transferred inter vivos
and which is not otherwise specifically provided in the Schedule;

(b} in clause (1) after item (vii) foliowing items shail be inserted,
namely:—

{viii) an agreement relating to installation of ATM/CDM or
both of them between banks and the land owner or renewal of such an
agreement;

(ix) an agreement relating to installation of Mobile Tower,
between a company and the land owner or renewal of such an agreement.

(2) after section 28A, a new section 28B shall be inserted, namely:—

_ “28B.Valuation of Flat/Apartment.—Notwithstanding anything
contained in this Act,—

(1) an instrument transferring land including flat/apartment, chargeable
with duty, shall fully and truly set forth the value of the flat/apartment therein.
For this purpose, the party executing the instrument shall furnish a valuation
certificate of the flat/apartment conforming to the criteria approved by the
Central Public Works Department for determining value of flat/apartment, issued
by a competent authority, to be authorised by the Government, by notification in
the Official Gazette, to perform such functions as may be specified by
Government in that behalf;

{ii) the registering officer shall, before registering an instrument
mentioned in clause (i} shall verify that it is accompanied by the valuation
certificate issued by the competent authority and ensure that the value of such
flat/apartment set forth in the instrument is not less than the value assessed by
the competent authority.”;

(3) in the SCHEDULE,—

(a) in serial number 4, in column (3), for the words “Twenty Five
rupees”, the words “Fifty rupees” shall be substituted;

(b) in serial number 5,—

(i) clauses (e) and (f) and the entries against it in column (3),
shall be omitted,




4

(i) clause {g) shall be re-lettered as clause (e);

{c) in serial number 21, in clause (i}, in column (3), for the words
“Six rupees” the words “Eight rupees” shall be substituted;

{d) in serial number 22, in clauses (i) and (iv), in column (3), for the
words “Six rupees” the words “Eight rupees” shall be substituted;

(da} after serial number 22 and the entries against it in columns (2) and (3),
the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be inserted, namely:—

“22 A. Conveyance as defined in
item (ii) and (iii) of section 2 {d)
not being a transfer charged or
exempted under no.55.

Five ropees for every 100 rupees
or part thereof of the fair value
of the land and the value of
other immovable properties of
the transferor company, which is
the subject matter of the
conveyance; or the aggregate of
the market value of shares or
other marketable securities, which
is the subject matter of the
conveyance issued or allotted in
exchange or otherwise; or the
amount of consideration paid for
such amalgamation whichever is
higher”.

(¢) in serial number 23, for the existing entries in columns (2) and (3), the
following entries shall be substituted, namely:—

“Copy or extract, certified to be a true copy or

Fifty rupees

extract by or by order of any public officer
and not chargeable under the law for the time
being in force relating to court fees

Exemptions

Copy of any paper which a public officer is
expressly required by law to make or furnish
for record in any public office or for any public

purpose.”;

i



5

(D in serial number 31, for the entries in columns (2) and (3), the following |

entries shall be substituted, namely:—

Gift—instrument not being a
settlement or will or transfer,

(a) Where the gift is in favour of
father, mother, grandfather,
grandmother, husband, wife, son,
daughter, brother, sister or
grandchiidren of a person and if~--

(i) the extent of land involved in
the property transferred by the
instrument is five acres or less

(i) the extent of land involved in
the property transferred by the
instrument is above five acres

(b) in any other case

Two rupees for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the fair value of
the property and the value of the
other properties set forth in the
instrument or the value of all the
properties set forth in the
instrument whichever is higher,
subject to a maximum of rupees
1,000.

Two rupees for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the fair value of
the property and the value of the
other properties set forth in the
instrument or the value of all
the properties set forth in the
instrument whichever i8

higher.

The same duty as a conveyance
(No.21 or 22 as the case may
be);




6

(g) in serial number 39, in column (3), for the words “Fifty
rupecs”, the words “One hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(h) in serial number 42, for the entries in columns (2) and (3), the
following entries shall be substituted, namely:——

Partition-Instrument of [as defined by
section 2 (K)]:

(a) Where the partition is among all
or some of the members of the family
and if—

(i) the extent of land involved in
the property divided by the
instrument is five acres or less

(ii) the extent of land involved in the
property divided by the
instrument is above five acres.

(b) in any other case

One rupee for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the fair value of
the separated share or shares of
property and the value of other
properties in such separated share
or shares set forth in the
instrument, or of the value of all
the properties of the separated
share or shares as set forth in
the instrument, whichever is
higher, subject to the maximum of
rupees 1,000.

One rupee for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the fair value of
the separated share or shares of
property and the value of other
properties in such separated share
or shares set forth in the
instrument, or of the value of ail
the properties of the separated
share or shares as set forth in
the instrument, whichever is

higher.

Six rupees for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the amount of
the value or fair value of the
separated share or shares of the
property whichever is higher.



7

(i} in serial number 48, for the entries in columns (2) and (3), the

Release, that is to say, any
instrument (not being such a
release as is provided in section
24), whereby a person renounces
a claim upon another person or
against any specified property—

(a) When such release operates in
favour of father, mother, grandfather,
grandmother, husband, wife, son,
daughter, brother, sister, grandchildren
or legal heirs of the deceased
children of a person and if—

() the extent of land involved in
the property in which right
relinquished by the instrument
is five acres or less

(i) the extent of land involved in
the property in which right
relinquished by the instrument
is above five acres

following entries shall be substituted, namely:—

One rupee for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the amount of
the fair value of other properties
or claims of which the right is
relinquished in proportion to
right relinquished or value of all
the properties or claims of which
the right is relinquished in
proportion to the right
relinquished or consideration for
the release, whichever is higher,
subject fo a2 maximum of Rupees
1,000.

One rupee for every rupees 100
or part thereof of the amount of
the fair value of other properties
or claims of which the right is
relinquished in proportion to
right relinquished or value of all
the properties or claims of which
the right is relinquished in
proportion to the right
relinquished or consideration for
the release, whichever is higher.




A

(a)

{b) in any other case

The same duty as a conveyance
(No.21 or 22 as the case may be) for

such amount or value of the property
or claim or fair value of the property
of which the right is relinquished in
proportion to right relinquished or
consideration for the release,
whichever is higher.

(j) in serial number 51, clause (a), for the entries in columns (2) and
(3), the following entries shall be substituted, namely:—

Settlement—

instrument of (including a deed of

dower),

Where the settlement is in favour

of father, mother, grandfather,

grandmother, husband, wife, son,

daughter, brother, sister or

grandchildren of a person and if—

(i) the extent of land involved in
the property settled by the
instrument is five acres or less

(i) the extent of land involved in
the property settled by the
instrument is above five acres

(b) in any other case

Two rupees for every rupees
100 or part thereof of the
amount of the fair value of
other properties set forth in
the instruments or the vatue
of all properties set forth in
such instrument, whichever is
higher, subject to a maximum
of Rupees 1,000.

Two rupees for every rupees
100 or part thereof of the fair
value of the land and the
value of other properties set
forth in the instrument or the
value of all properties set
forth in such instrument,
whichever is higher.

The same duty as Bottomry
Bond (No. 14) for a sum
equal to amount or value of
the property settled as set
forth in such instrument or
fair value of land, whichever
is higher.

"



9

4. Amendment of Act 10 of 1960.—In the Kerala Court Fees and Suits
Valuation Act, 1959 (10 of 1960),—

(1) in sub-section (1) of section 76,—

Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or any other law for the
time being in force and subject to section 4A of the Act and sub-rule (1) of rule
397 of the Kerala Motor Vehicle Rules, 1989 it shall be competent for the
Government to levy an additional court fee by notification in the Gazette, in
respect of original petitions, original applications, appeals or revisions to tribunals,
appellate authorities and original suits in Civil Courts other than in Family Court
at a rate not exceeding one per cent of the amount involved in the dispute and
in other cases at a rate not exceeding one hundred rupees for each original suit,
original petition, original application, appeal or revision.

Explanation:—The term “amount involved in the dispute” as specified in
sub-section (1), where it is capable of valuation, does not include the amount of
valuation for the purpose of court fee, in suits for recovery of possession,
partition and suits of similar nature and where fixed court fee is specified under
this Act.

(2) in the ScuepuLk II, in item (iif) of Article 3,—

(a)} in sub-item (C), for the entry “one per cent of the assessed
income, subject to a maximum of ten thousand rupees” in column (3} against
clause (c) in column (2), the entry “five per cent of the relief sought for, [*¥***]
shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-item (D), for the entry “one per cent of the assessed net
wealth, subject to a maximum of ten thousand rupees” in column (3) against
clause (c) in column (2), the entry “five per cent of the relief sought for, {****]
shall be substituted;

5. Amendment of Act 15 of 1963 —In the Kerala General Sales Tax Act,
1963 (15 of 1963), in section 23B,—

(a) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or in any
judgment, decree or order of any Court, Tribunal, or Appellate Authority, an
assessee who is in arrears of tax or any other amount due under this Act or the
Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (Central Act 74 of 1956) relating to the period ending
on 31st March, 2005, may opt for settling the arrears by availing a complete
reduction of the interest on the tax amount and for the amount of penalty and
,interest thereon:

1142/2016.




10

Provided that nothing in this section shall apply to a public sector
undertaking under the control of Government of India.”;

(b) in sub-section (3), for the words and figures *31st August, 2014”,
the words and figures *28th February, 2017” shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-section (4), for the words and figures “31st December,
2014”, the words and figures “28th February, 2017 shall be substituted;

(d) after sub-section (7), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(8) If a dealer is continuing business even after the
commencement of the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 2004) he shall
get himself registered thereunder before filing option for payment of arrears
under sub-section (1).”.

6. Amendment of Act 19 of 1976.— In the Kerala Motor Vehicles Taxation
Act, 1976 (19 of 1976),—

(1) in section 2, after clause (ab), the following clause shall be
inserted, namely:—

“{ac) ‘Floor area’ of a motor vehicle means the area of the vehicle
obtained by multiplying the overall length with the overall width of the vehicle
and for a double decked bus it shall be twice the floor area.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this clause, ‘Overall length’ of a motor
vehicle is the length of the vehicle measured between parallel planes passing the
exireme projection points of the vehicle exclusive of a starting handle, any
hood when down, any fire—escape fixed to a vehicle, any post office letter box,
any ladder used for loading or unloading from the roof of the vehicle or any tail
or indicator lamp or number plate fixed to a vehicle, any spare wheel or spare
wheel bracket or bumper fixed to a vehicle or any towing hook or other fitment
and ‘Overall width’ of a motor vehicle is the width of a motor vehicle
measured at right angle to the axis of the motor vehicle between perpendicular
planes enclosing the extreme points exclusive of a rear-view mirror or guard rail
or a direction indicator.”;

(2) in section 3,—

(a) in sub-section (1), after the third proviso, the following proviso
shall be inserted, namely:—



11

“Provided also that in respect of new Stage Carriages registered or
assigned a pew registration mark or altered from any category other than Stage
Carniage, there shall be levied a tax based on the floor area of the vehicle at the
rate specified in item (iv) of serial number 7 of the Schedule.”;

NQOTE:—This shall be deemed to have come into force on and from
18th day of July, 2016.;

(b) in sub-section (5), for the existing proviso, the following proviso
shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided {***#] that in the case of vehicle covered with permit under
sub-section (8) of section 88 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (Central Act 59 of
1988), and registered in any State other than the State of Kerala and entering the
State of Kerala and staying therein, the tax payable for such vehicle shall be—

(i) if such stay does not exceed seven days one tenth of the
quarterly tax for one round trip ; and

(ii) if such stay exceeds seven days but does not exceed thirty
days, one third of the quarterly tax for one round trip.

(c) after the proviso, as so substituted, the following provisos shall
be inserted, namely:—

“Provided further that in the case of vehicles covered with permit
under sub-section {9) of section 88 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (Central Act
59 of 1988) and registered in any State other than in the State of Kerala and
entering the State of Kerala and staying therein, the tax shall be payable from

the date of entry till the end of the guarter at the rate specified for such

vehicles in the Schedule.”.

[* #**]

(3) after section 3, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“IA. Levy of Green Tax.—There shall be levied and collected a tax
called ‘Green Tax’ in addition to the tax levied under this Act on the motor
vehicles specified in column (2) of the table below at the rate specified in
column (3) thereof, for the purpose of implementation of various measures t0
control air pollution, namely:—



12

TABLE
Sl Rate of Green .
. Incidence of
No. Class and age of vehicle Tax (in levy
Rupees)
0} @ 3) 4
1 Non Transport Vehicles having 400 for every At the time of
four or more wheels and | five years rem?‘_:’ral .°f
t
completed 15 years from the date registration
of its registration.
2 Light Transport Vehicles having 200 for every At the time of
four or more wheels and have | Y®T renewal of
fitness
completed 10 years from the date certificate
of its registration
3 Medium Transport Vehicles 300 for every At the time of
which have completed 10 years | Y& renewal of
: . . fitness
from the date of its registration. certificate
4 Heavy Transport Vehicles which 400 for every At the time of
have completed 10 years from the year renewal of
. . . fitness
date of its registration. certificate
[****]

Provided that no additional tax, fine or interest shall be levied for any
belated payment of Green Tax:

Provided further that nothing in this section shall apply in case of
remitting tax at the reduced or modified rate allowed by the Government under
section 22 of the Act:

Provided also that the provisions for payment of tax and issue of licence
under sub-section (3) of section 4 shall ‘mutatis mutandis’ apply to Green Tax
to be levied under section 3A.”

m



13

(4) in section 4,—
{a) in sub-section (1),-—

(i) before the first proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—

“Provided that Green Tax levied under section 3A shall be
paid in advance in such manner, as may be prescribed, on completion of 10
years in the case of Transport Vehicles and 15 years in the case of Non
Transport Vehicles, upon a licence for the purpose, for one year or five years,
as the case may be:”; '

~ (i) in the first proviso, after the word “provided”, the word
“further”” shall be inserted;

(iii) in the second proviso, for the word “further”, the word
“also” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (4), after the words and figure “under section
3", the words, figure and letter “and section 3A” shall be inserted;

(c) in sub-section (5), after the words and figure “under section
3” the words, figure and letter “and section 3A” shall be inserted;

(5) in section 5, for sub-section (1) and sub-section (2), the following
sub-sections shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) In the case of a motor vehicle which is not intended to be
used or kept for use during any calendar month of a quarter or two successive
calendar months of a quarter, or the whole of a quarter or a year beginning with
the 1# day of a quarter, as the case may be, the Registered Owner or the person
having possession or control of such vehicle shall give previous intimation in
such form, manner and fee, as may be prescribed, in this behalf, to the Regional
Transport Officer or the Joint Regional Transport Officer concerned under whose
jurisdiction the vehicle is registered or endorsement of tax has been obtained,
that such vehicle will not be used for such period and thereupon, the Registered
Owner or the person having possession or control of the vehicle shall not be
deemed to have used or kept for use of the vehicle for such period, and no tax
shall be payable in respect of such vehicle for such period.



14

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section(1), twice
the amount of tax shall be levied from the Registered Owner or the person
having possession or control of the vehicle if on verification it is found that
the vehicle has been used during any such period of non-use without remitting
tax.”;

(6) in section 6, after sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—
“Provided that no Green Tax paid shall be refunded under this section.”,

(7) in section 28, in clause (d) of sub-section (2), after the words
“claimed” the following words and figure shall be inserted, namely :—

“and the form and fee payable for filing such exemption of tax
under section 5.”;
{8) in the ScHDULE,—

(a) for serial number 3 and 4 and the entries thereunder in
cotumns (1), (2) and (3), the following serial numbers and entries shall,
respectively, be substituted, namely:—

“3 Goods Carriages
i) Goods Carriages other than those fitted with
tipping mechanism
(a) | Motor 300 Kg. in gross{ 150.00
Cycles vehicle
trucks not weight
gxceeding

(b} | Vehicles not

exceeding 1000 Kg. do. 250.00
(c) | Vehicles
excceding | 1000 Kg. 1500 Kg. do. 470.00
(d)| do. 1500 Kg. | but not 2000 kg, do. 610.00
exceeding

(e) | do. 2000 Kg. do. 3000 Kg. do. 780.00




15

§3) do. 3000 Kg. do. 4000 Kg. do. 930.00
(2) do. 4000 Kg. do. 5500 Kg. do. 1340.00
(h} do. 5500 Kg. do. 7000 Kg. do. 1580.00
)] do. 7000 Kg. do. 9000 Kg. do. 1940.00
)] do. 9000 Kg. do. 9500 Kg. do. 2060.00
k) do. 9500 Kg, do. 10500 Kg. do. 2300.00
M do. 10500 Kg. do. 11000 Kg. do. 2550.00
(m) do. 11000 Kg. do. 12000 Kg.i do. 2790.00
(n) do. 12000 Kg. do. 13000 Kg. do. 303000
(9] do. 13000 Kg. do. 14000 Kg do. 3270.00
(p) do. 14000 Kg. do. 15000 Kg do. 3390.00
(qQ do. 15000 Kg. do. 20000 Kg, do. 339000+
Rs.130 for
every 250
Kg. or part
thereof in
excess of
15000 Kg.
()| do. 20000 Kg. do. 5990.00+
Rs.250
for every
250 Kg. or
part thereof
10 CXCCSS
of 20000

Kg.




16

(1) Goods Carriages fitted with tipping mechanism
' (Tipper Goods Carriages)
(a) | Motor 300 Kg. j in gross| 190.00
Cycles vehicle
trucks not weight
| exceeding
(b) | Vehicles not
exceeding 1000 Kg. do. 310.00
(c) | Vehicles 1000 Kg. 1500 Kg. do. 550.00
: exceeding
(d) do. 1500 Kg. | but not 2000 Kg. do. 760.00
exceeding
(&) do. 2000 Kg. do. 3000 Kg. do. 970.00
i do. 3000 Kg. do. 4000 Kg. do. 1160.00
{g) do. 4000 Kg. do. 5500 Kg. do. 1670.00
(h) do. 5500 Kg. do. 7000 Kg. do. 1970.00
0] do. 7000 Kg. do. 9000 Kg. do. 2420.00
) do. 9000 Kg. do. 9500 Kg. do. 2590.00
® do. 9500 Kg. do. 10500 Kg.| do. 2880.00
0] do. 10500 Kg. do. 11000 Kg.{ do. 3190.00
(m) do. 11000 Kg. do. 12000 Kg.| do. 3480.00
(n} do. 12000 Kg. do. 13000 Kg. do. 3790.00
{0) do. 13000 Kg. do. 14000 Kg.| do. 4090.00
({9)] do. 14000 Kg. do. 15000 Kg.!  do. 4240.00

w



17

!Tq) do 15000 Kg. do. 4240.00+
Rs.160 for
every 250
Kg. or part
thereof in
excess of
15000 Kg.
I_—:l Trailers used for carrying goods
{a) | For each 1000 Kg. |in grossi 18¢.00
Trailer not vehicle
exceeding weight
(b) | For each 1000 Kg. | but not in laden
Trailer exceeding 1500 Kg. | weight | 360.00
exceeding
L(c) do. 1500 Kg. do. 2000 Kg. do. 480.00
@] do. 2000Kg | do. 3000Kg | do. | 65000 |
(e) do. 3000 Kg. do. 4000 Kg. do. 870.00
0 do. 4000 Kg. do. 5500 Kg. do. 1100.00
() do. 5500 Kg. do. 7000 Kg. do. 1460.00
(h) do, 7000 Kg. do. 9000 Kg. do. 1700.00
i @ do. 9000 Kg. do. 9500 Kg. do. | 182000
L(,') do. 9500 Kg. | do. 10500 Kg.| do. | 194000
! ® do. 10500 Kg. | do. 12000 Kg.{ do. | 218000
4] do. 12000 Kg. do. 13000 Kg.| do. 2300.00
(m} do. 13000 Kg. do. 14000 Kg. do. 2420.00
(n) do. 14000 Kg. do. 15000 Kg.| do. 2550.00

1142/20t6.




18

(0)

do. 15000 Kg, | do. 20000 Kg.| do. | 255000+
Rs.130 for
every

250 Kg. or
part thereof
in excess of]
15000 Kg.

®

do. 20000 Kg. do. 5150.00+

Rs. 250 for
every

250 Kg. or
part thereof
in excess of]
20000 Kg.”

(b) in serial number 7,—
(D) in item (i)—

(a) for sub-item (¢) and the entries thereunder in columns (1),

(2) and (3), the following sub-item and entries shall, respectively, be
substituted, namely:—

u(c)

Vehicles registered in Kerala and operating Interstate after
obtaining permit under sub-section (9) of section 88 of the
Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (Central Act 59 of 19838)

{) Ordinary Contract Carriage permitted to 2250.00
carry more than 6 passengers—for
every passenger.

(ii) Contract Carriage with push back seats 3000.00
and permitted to carry more than 6
passengers—for every passenger.

{iii) Contract Carriage with sleeper berths 4000.00.”
and permitted to carry more than 6
passengers—for every passenger.




19

(b) for sub-item (f) and the entries thereunder in columns (1), (2)
and (3), the following sub-item and entries shall, respectively, be substituted,
namely:—

“(f) Vehicles registered in Other States and entering Kerala after
obtaining permit under sub-sections (8) and (9) of Section 88 of
the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (Central Act 59 of 1988)

(i) Ordinary Contract Carriage permitted to 2250.00
carry more than 6 passengers—for
every passenger.

(i) Contract Carriages with push back 3000.00
seats and permitted to carry more than
6 passengers—-for every passenger.

(i) Contract Carriages with sleeper berths 4000.00.”
and permitted to carry more than 6
passengers—for every passenger

(i1) in item (iia) for the heading, the following heading shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(ii1) vehicles to ply solely as Stage Carriages based on
passenger capacity’’,

(iif) after item (iii), and the entry against it, the following item and
entries shall, respectively, be inserted in columns (1), (2) and (3), namely.—

“(iv) Vehicles to ply solely as stage carriages—based on floor area

(a) | Ordinary service other than city/| Rs.1,300 per square

town services. metre or part thereof
(b) { Ordinary city/town services. Rs.1.100 per square

metre or part thereof

(c) | Fast passenger and other higher{ Rs.1,400 per square
class services. metre or part thereof. "




20

(c) for serial No. 9 and the entries thereunder in columns
(1), (2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
substituted, namely:—

9. Double-axle trailers drawn by the vehicles in clause (8) above and
articulated vehicles with or without additional or alternative trailers,
for each trailer or articulated vehicle, subject to the proviso of this
schedule—

(2) | not 1000 Kg. in gross| 180.00
exceeding vehicle
weight
(b) | exceeding | 1000 Kg. | but not 1500 Kg. » 260.00
exceeding
(c) » 1500 Kg. " 2000 Kg. , 390
(d) » 2000 Kg. » 3000 Kg. " 510
(e) » 3000 Kg. » 4000 Kg. - 700
& . 4000 Kg. " 5500 Kg. - - 890
(8 » 5500 Kg. » 7000 Kg. - 1090
(b » 7000 Kg. » 9000 Kg. " 1340
(Y » 9000 Kg. - 9500 Kg. " 1460
) ” 9500 Kg. » 10500 Kg. »” 1580
® 10500 Kg. . 12000 Kg.| ., 1700
o " 12000 Kg. » 13000 Kg. . 1820
(m) » 13000 Kg. » 14000 Kg. ” 1940
(n) m 14000 Kg. ,, 15000 Kg. " 2060




21

(0) | Exceeding 15000 Kg. in 2060.00+
gross | Rs.130 for
vehicle | every
weight | 250 Kg. or

part

thereof in
excess of
15000 Kg.

(d) for serial number 12 and the entries thereunder in co]umns-(l),
(2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
substituted, namely:—

“12

Specially designed vehicles such as Mobile
Restaurant, Mobile Canteen, Mobile Theatre,
Mobile Workshop, Mobile Book Stall, Mobile
ATM, Mobile Shop, Mobile Exhibition Van, Mobile
Office Vehicles, Mobile Digitization Unit and Cash Van
for every square meter or part thereof of the floor area

Rs. 300 "

(©)

after serial number 14 and the entries against it in columns (1),
(2) and (3) the following serial number and entries shall be inserted, namely:—

1115

Motor vehicles other than those liable to tax
under the foregoing provisions of this Schedule.—
for every square metre or part thereof of the floor area

Rs. 1507

in Annexure I, for serial number I and the entries thereunder

in columns (1)}, (2) and (3), the following serial numbers and entries

shall, respectively, be substituted, namely:—

“1 Goods Carriages having GVW up to 3000 Kg.

(D) Motor Cycle trucks not exceeding 300 Kg. 3000

(i) | Goods Carriages with GVW not exceeding 1000 Kg. 5000

(i) | Goods Carriages with GVW exceeding 1000 Kg. but not 0400
exceeding 1500 Kg.

(iv) | Goods Camiages with GVW exceeding 1500 Kg. but not 12200
exceeding 2000 Kg.

(v) | Goods Carriages with GVW exceeding 2000 Kg. but not 15600.”.
exceeding 3000 Kg.




22

7. Amendment of Act 32 of 1976.—In the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976
(32 of 1976), in section 4,—

(a) in sub-section (1), after the first proviso, the following proviso shall
be inserted, namely:—

“Provided further that no tax under this Act shall be levied on hostels run
directly by the educational institutions and working woman’s hostels run by
religious or charitable institutions, registered under The Travancore-Cochin
Literary, Scientific and Charitable Societies Registration Act, 1955.”;

(b} in sub-section (2),—

(i) in clause (a), for sub-clause (i} and (ii), the following sub-clauses
shall be substituted, namely:—

“(i) at the rate of six per cent per room for hotels, in respect of
rooms where the gross charges of accommodation for residence and other
amenities and services provided is above rupees four hundred and up to one
thousand rupees per day;

(1i) at the rate of ten per cent for hotels in respect of rooms
where the gross charges of accommodation for residence and other amenities
and services provided is above rupees One thousand per day.”:

(ii) the third proviso shall be omitted;

(iii) the second proviso to clause (c) shall be omitted.

(c) after section 10AA, the following section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“10AB. Liability of Directors of a Private company.—Where any
tax or other amount recoverable under this Act from any proprietor being a
private company, whether existing or wound up or under liquidation, cannot be
recovered for any reason whatsoever, every person who was a director of such
company at any time during the period for which the tax or other amount is due
under this Act shall be jointly and severally liable for the payment of such tax
or other amount unless he proves that the non-recovery cannot be attributed to
any negligence, misfeasance or breach of duty on his part in relation to the
affairs of the company.”.



23
8. Amendment of Act 15 of 1991.—In the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax
Act, 1991 (15 of 1991), in the SCHEDULE,—
(a) in item (3), the words ‘domestic company or’ shall be omitted,
(b) for item (4), the following item shall be substituted, namely:—

“(4) In the case of domestic company oOf foreign company thirty
per cent of the total agricultural income.”,

9. Amendment of Act 30 of 2004 —In the Kerala Value Added Tax Act,
2003 (30 of 2004),—

(1) in section 6,~—
(a) in sub-section (1),—
(i) in clause (a), in the table,—
(a) in serial number (3}, for the entry in column (2), the
following entry shall be substituted, namely:—
“all types of plastic carry bags including non-woven poly
propylene bags.”;
(b) in serial number (3A}, in the entry against it in column (2),
after the words “disposable plates”, the words “tumblers” shall be inserted;
(c) after serial number (7) and the entries against it in columns
(2), (3) and (4), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
inserted, namely:—

«g  Embroidery or zar articles, that is to say,
imi, zari, kasab saima dabka, chumki, gota
sitara, nagsi, kora, glass bead, badia 2%

(1) Embroidery without visible ground 5810.10.00
(2) Other embroidery of cotton 581091.00
(3) Embroidery of man-made fibres

(a) Embroidered badges, motifs and
the like 581092.00

(b) Other embroidered articles 5810.92.00
(4) Embroidery of other textile materials  5810.99.00

(5) Zari articles i



10.
11.

24

Handloom cloth, Handloom bed sheet
and Pillow cover

Silk fabrics and sarees made of natural silk

Textiles fabric
(1) Wool

@

)
@

(a)

b

{©)

Woven fabrics of carded wool or
of carded fine animal hair

Woven fabrics of combed wool or
of combed fine animal hair

Woven fabrics of coarse animal
hair or of horse hair

Cotton

(@)

(®)

©

(@

{e)

Woven fabrics of cotton containing

85% or more by weight of cotton
weighing not more than 200 gm./m?

Woven fabrics of cotton containing
85% or more by weight of cotton
weighing more than 200 gm./m?

Woven fabrics of cotton containing

less than 85% by weight of cotton,

mixed mainly or solely with man-made
fibres, weighing not more than
200 gm./m?

Woven fabrics of cotton containing
less than 85% by weight of cotion,
mixed mainly or solely with man-made
fibres, weighing more than

200 gm./m?

Other woven fabrics of cotton

Woven fabrics of Flax

Woven fabrics of jute or of other textlle
base fibres

ek

5111

5112

5113

5208

5209

521¢

5211
5212
5309

5310

2%
2%
2%



1142/2016.

&)

6

O

@

25

Woven fabrics of other vegetable textile
fibres; woven fabrics of paper yam

Man-made filaments

(a) Woven fabrics of synthetic filament
yamn, including woven fabrics obtained
from materials of HSN heading 5404

(b) Woven fabrics of artificial filament
yarn, including woven fabrics obtained
from materials of HSN heading 5405

Man-made Staple Fibres

(a)} Woven fabrics of synthetic staple
fibres, containing 85% or more by
weight of synthetic staple fibres

{b) Woven fabrics of synthetic staple
fibres, containing less than £5% by
weight of such fibres, mixed mainly
or solely with cotton, of a weight
not exceeding 170 m*

(c) Woven fabrics of synthetic staple
fibres, containing less than 85% by
weight of such fibres, mixed mainly
or solely with cotton, of a weight
exceeding 170 m?

{d) Other woven fabrics of synthetic
staple fibres

() Woven fabrics of artificial staple
fibres

Special Woven fabrics; Tufted textile
fabrics; Lace, Tapestries, Trimmings;
Embroidery

(a) Woven pile fabrics and chennile

fabrics other than HSN heading nos.

5802 or 5806

5311

5512

5513

5514

5515

5516

5801



©

(b)

©

()

(e)

®

(®

26

Terry toweling and similar woven
terry fabrics other than narrow fabrics
of HSN heading nos. 5806; tufted
textile fabrics other than HSN heading
no. 5703

Gauze other than narrow fabrics
of HSN heading no. 5806

Tullies and other net fabrics not
including woven, knitted or crocheted
fabrics, lace in the piece, in strips or
in motifs, other than fabrics of HSN
heading nos. 6002 to 6006

Hand woven tapestries of the type
gobelins, flanders, aubusson, beauvals
and the like and needle worked
tapestries (for example petit point,
cross stitch), whether or not made-up

Narrow woven fabrics other than
goods HSN heading no. 5807; narrow
fabrics consisting warp without weft
assembled by means of an adhesive
{bolducs)

Woven fabrics of metal thread and
woven fabrics of metalized yarn of
HSN heading no. 5605 of a kind
used in apparel as furnishing fabrics
of a similar purpose, not elsewhere
specified or included

Textiles fabrics coated with gum or
amylaceous substances, of a kind used
for the outer covers of the books or the

like; Tracing cloth; Prepared painting
canvas; Buckram and similar stiffened
textile fabrics of a kind used for hat
foundations

5802

5803

5804

5805

5806

5809

5901



-

27

(10) Tyre cord fabric of high tenacity yam
or other polymers, polyesters or viscose
rayon

(11) Textile wall coverings

(12) Rubberised textile fabrics, other than
tyre cord fabrics of high tenacity yarn
or nylon or other pelyamides polyesters
Or viscose rayon

{13) Textile fabrics, otherwise impregnated,
coated or covered; painted canvas being
theatrical scenery, studio back-cloths or
the like

(14) Kaitted or chrocheted fabrics

(a) Pile fabrics, including ‘long pile’
fabrics and terry fabrics, knitted or
chrocheted

(b} Knitted or chrocheted fabrics of a
width not exceeding 30 cm., containing
by weight 5% or more of elasto meric
yarn of rubber thread, other than
those of HSN heading no. 6001

{c)} Knitted or chrocheted fabrics of a
width not exceeding 30 cm., other
than those of HSN heading nos.
6001 or 6002

{d) Knitted or chrocheted fabrics of a
width exceeding 30 cm., containing by
weight 5% or more of elasto meric
yarn of rubber thread, other than
those of HSN heading no. 6001

(e) Wrap knit fabrics (including those
made on gallon knitting machines},
other than those of HSN heading
nos. 6001 to 6004

(fy Other knitted or chrocheted fabrics

3502
5905

5906

5907



28

(i} after the sixteenth proviso, the following provisos shall be
inserted, namely: -~

“Provided further that cooked food manufactured by the prisoners
and sold by the Kerala Prison and Correctional Services Department shall be
exempted from tax with effect from 1st day of April, 2011:

Provided further that in respect of cinematographic films, turnover
relating to sale of ‘Copyright’ under clause (a) and transfer of right to use under
clause (c) shall be exempted:

Provided also that the rate of tax on the sale of disposable plates
and cups made of styrofoam for the financial years 2013-14 and 2014-15 shall be
at five per cent.”;

(b) in sub-section (7), in clause (b), the following explanation shall
be inserted, namely—

“Explanation.—Building materials referred to in this clause shall include
basic building materials and other goods essentially required to make the
building effectively functional and capabie of being used by the umit, depending
on the activity carried out by the said unit.”;

(2) in section §,—
{a) in clause (a),—

(i) for sub-clause (i), the following sub-clause shall be
substituted, namely:—

“any works contractor who imports any goods into the State from
other States or Country for incorporation in the works contracts and or who is
registered under the provisions of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (Central Act
74 of 1956), may at his option, instead of paying tax in accordance with the
provisions of section 6, pay tax at the rate of seven per cent of the whole
contract amount for all works contracts undertaken by him except works
contracts of interior decoration and furnishing contracts, electrical, refrigeration
or air conditioning contracts or contracts relating to supply and installation of
plant, machinery, rolling shutters, cranes, hoists, elevators or lifts, escalators,
generators, generating sets, transformers, weighing machines, air conditioners
and air coolers, deep freezers, laying of all kinds of tiles other than brick tiles,
slabs and stones including marble:

s



29

Provided that the compounded tax payable under this
sub-clause by such works contractor in respect of works contract awarded by
Government of Kerala, Kerala Water Authority or Local Authorities shall be five

per cent of the whole contract amount.”;
(ii) in sub-clause (ii),—

(a) for the second proviso, the following proviso shall be

substituted, namely:-—

“Provided further that a contractor who intends to pay tax at
compounded rate in accordance with this clause in respect of all works awarded
by Government of Kerala, Kerala Water Authority or Local Authorities
undertaken by him durihg an year, may, instead of filing separate application for
compounding for such individual works, file a singie option for payment of tax
under this clause for such works before 30th day of April of the year to which
the option relates, subject to eligibility:”;

(b) in the third proviso, the following words shall be added at
the end, namely.—
“and with respect to works contract awarded by Government of
Kerala, Kerala Water Authority or Local Authorities up to 31st March, 2016.”;
(¢) after the third proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—
“Provided also that subject to eligibility, a work once compounded

under this clause, shall remain compounded till the completion of such work.”;

(d) in Explanation 3, for the word “this sub-clause”,
the words and figure “sub-clause (i)” shall be substituted;
(b) in clause (f), in sub-section (v), for the words “‘under sub-clause; (ii)”,

the words “under sub-clause (iv)” shall be substituted,



30

(3) in section 9, the existing proviso shall be numbered as sub-section (1)
and after the sub-section as so numbered, the following sub-section shall be

inserted, namely:—

“(2) The burden of proving the denial of any transaction or the
correctness in the rcturns, applications, payments, declarations, delivery notes
and other records fumished by the dealer under this Act, through the website or
portal of the Commercial Taxes Department, by using the user identification name

" and password allotted to him by the assessing authority or the Commissioner,
shall be on such dcaler.”;

{4) in scction 11, in the proviso to sub-section (5), the words, letters
and figures,

“for the period up to 30th September, 20107, shall be omitted;

(5) in section 20A, in sub-section (2), for the words “the
Commissioner”, the words “the District Deputy Commissioner” shall be
substituted;

(6) after Section 25C, the following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“25D. Special provision for bakery dealers to settle
arrears.—Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, a dealer in bakery
products, sweets, confectionary and other food products sold under brand name
registered under the Trade Marks Act, 1999, who had not remitted the tax as per
the prescribed rate, for the period up to the financial year 2013-14, and have
opted for remitting the differential amount of tax up to from 1st April, 2016 to
31st March, 2017 and shal e within_a
quarterly instalments and those who opt for payment of tax under this Scheme
shall be exempted from payment of interest and penalty due thereon subject to

such conditions and restrictions, as may be prescribed.

25E. Special provision for assessment and payment of tax for
presumptive dealers.-—(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or
rules made thereunder or in any judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal
or appellate or revisional authority or any assessment orders or penalty orders
issued under this Act, the dealers who have opted to pay tax under




31

sub-section (5) of section 6 and with regard to whom unaccounted purchases
have been detected by the assessing authority for the period up to 31st March,
2016, may opt to settle their cases by paying tax at the scheduled rates on
such unaccounted purchases with an addition of 5% gross profit and on
payment of such tax, all penalties and interest including penalty under sub-
section (7) of section 22. shall stand waived and it shall be subject to the
following conditions, namely:—

{a} Any dealer who opt for this scheme shall obtain Tax payers
Identification Number (TIN) under this Act with effect from 1st April, 2016;

(b) All pending cases in any Forum shall be withdrawn and
evidence to that effect shall be produced before the assessing authority;

{c) Such option and settlement shall cover all the financial years,
in which unaccounted purchases have been detected; and

{d) such further condition, if any, as may be specified:

Provided that dealers who have opted to pay tax under
sub-section (5) of section 6 and with regard to whom unaccounted purchases
have not been detected by the assessing authority for the period up to 31st
March, 2016, may also voluntarily declare their unaccounted purchases. and opt
for the scheme mentioned in sub-section (1), and on doing so, no further action
under this Act shall be initiated against such dealers with regard to the same.

(2) For settling the cases under sub-section (1), the assesee shall
file option before the assessing authority within three months from the date of

declaring the scheme :

Provided that in cases where no notice or orders has been issued
by the assessing authority, regarding the unaccounted purchases detected by
such authority mentioned in sub-section (1), the assessing authority shall
intimate the dealer regarding the cases pending against him, to enable him to file

option under the scheme.
(3} On receipt of the option, the assessing authority shall

intimate by order, the details of the evidence before him and the amount of tax to
be paid, calculated in accordance with sub-section (n.



32
. (4) Thirty per cent of the amount shall be paid within fourteen
days from the receipt of the order under sub-section (2) and the balance in
twelve equal monthly instalments or in lump sum at his option, and the last date

for fulfilment of payment under this section shall be the date of payment of the
twelfth instalment,

(5) Without prejudice to the provisions of this section or notice
made thereunder, the Commissioner may issue such instructions to the assessing
authorities and the dealers for the effective implementation of the scheme.

(6) No further action under any of the provisions of this Act
shall be invoked by the assessing authority with regard to the unaccounted
purchases settled by the dealer under this section or other irregularities in
accounts, which resulted from such unaccounted purchases, and no appeal or
revision shall lic against the amount so settled under this section.”;

(7) in section 40, after the second proviso, the following proviso shall
be inserted, namely:—

Provided also that every dealer whose total turnover for the
previous year had exceeded rupees five crores shall get the bilt or invoice or
cash memorandum in respect of every sale, uploaded on a real time basis
through the portal of the dealer in the Kerala Value Added Tax Information
System in the manner and subject to such restrictions and conditions as may be
prescribed;

(8) in section 42,—

(a) in sub-section (1), after the second proviso, the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely.—

Provided also that with respect to units of Kerala State Electricity
Board Ltd. which obtained separate registration as per sub-section (3) of section
20 shall file triai balance for each such units, along with audited statement of
accounts and certificate of the company.;

(b) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:—

(3) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in this
Act, if a dealer,

(i) fails to file audited accounts referred to in sub-section (1), or

£



L3

33

(i} fails to file revised annual retumn rectifying the mistake or
omission, along with the audited statement of accounts and certificate or if the
variance in the audited statement of accounts with the returns is not

satisfactorily explained in the reconciliation staternent prescribed, or

(ii1) fails to file the annexures, statements, certificates,
declarations, including the statutory declarations to be filed under the Central
Sales Tax Act, 1956 which are required to be filed along with the returns to
prove the correctness of the concessional rate of tax, exemptions and exports

claimed in the returns, or

(iv) fails to declare any sale, purchase or interstate stock
transfer as evidenced from the documents prescribed under section 46 available
with the assessing authority in the sales and purchase lists filed along with the
returns, the assessment of such dealer for the relevant year for the purpose of
section 25 shall be treated as pending and the time limit mentioned thereunder

shall not be applicable in such cases.

(9) in section 46, in sub-section (3), after clause (e), the following clause

shall be inserted, namely:—

“(f) when goods are transported out of the State through coastal
cargo, air or railways, such dealer or person or his agents by whatever name
called, shall furnish a declaration to such authority in such manner as may be

prescribed.”;

(10) in section 47, in sub-section (11), after the words, figure and symbol

“sub-section (9) shall be” the words “confiscated and” shall be inserted;

(11) in section 48, in sub-section (1), for the words “one hundred

rupees”, the words “two hundred and fifty rupees” shall be substituted;

{12) in section 55, in sub-section (4), after the existing proviso, the

following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

114272016,




34

“Provided further that where the appellant remits 20% of the
disputed amount of tax along with collected tax, if any, further proceedings
against recovery shall stand stayed till disposal of the appeal.”;

{(13) after section 58, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“58A4. Powers of revision of the Commissioner suo-mofu on the
orders passed by Deputy Commissioner (Appeals) under section 55 of the
Act.—(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (4} of section 3, the
Commissioner or any Joint Commissioner authorized by him in this behalf, may
suo-motu call for and examine any order passed by Deputy Commissioner
{Appeals) or Assistant Commissioner (Appeals) under section 55, along with
records thereof, which in his opinion is prejudicial to the interest of revenue and
may make such enquiry or cause such enquiry to be made and subject to the
provisions of this Act may pass such orders as he deems fit.

(2) The Commissioner or Joint Commissioner shall not pass any
order under sub-section (1), if,—

[F#¥¥]

(a) the order has been made on subject matter of an
appeal before the Appellate Tribunal or of a revision
before the High Court; or

(b) more than one year have expired from the year in
which the order referred to therein has been passed.

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2), the
Commissioner may pass an order under sub-section (1) on any point which has

not been decided in an appeal or revision referred to in clause (a) of

sub-section (2), before the expiry of a period of one year from the date of the
order in such appeal or revision,

{4) No order under this section adversely affecting a person shall

be passed unless that person has been given a reasonable opportunity of being
heard.”;



35

(14} in section 62, in sub-section (1), for the word and figure
“section 58", the words, figure, letter and symbol “section 58, section 58A"
shall be substituted.”;

(15) in section 88, in item (é), the following shall be added, namely:—

“by sending it through the portal of the registered dealer in the
Kerala Value Added Tax Information System (KVATIS) along with an alert
through short message service (SMS) in the phone number declared by the
dealer with the department.”;

(16) in the ScHEDULES,—
(@) in the First Schedule,—

(i) in serial number 2, after sub-item (9), the following items shall
be inserted, namely.—

“(10)  Braille Printer .

(11)  Assistive devices for visually
challenged persons like white cane
and electronic cane. Fhkwn.

(ii) in serial number 9A —
(a) in the entry against it in column (2), the following
words shall be added at the end, namely:-—
“with or without MS-rod and MS-flat™,
(b) the following Note shall be inserted, namely.—

“Note: This entry shall be deemed to have come into
force on and from the 1st day of April, 2005.”;

(iii) after serial number 11A and the entries against it in columns
(2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
inserted namely.—

*“11B. Cleaning liquids for removing pesticides residue from
vegetables manufactured by units using the technology
developed by Kerala Agricultural University or other
recognized institution.”;



36

(iv) serial number 12B and the entries against it in columns (2)
and (3} shall be omitted;

(v) for serial number 16 and the entries against it in columns
(2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall respectively, be
substituted, namely:—

“16. Earthern pots made from earth clay including
flowerpots, receptacles, statues and carthern oven, ¥***

(vi) in serial number 18A,—

(a) in the heading, the following words shall be inserted at
the end, namely:—

“other than those specifically mentioned in the Third
Schedule™;

(b) the entries in column (3) against sub-item(l) shall be
omitted;

(vii) after serial number 31 and the entries against it in columns
(2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
inserted, namely.—

“31A. Municipal Plastic Waste. kR
{(viii) in serial number 42A,—

(a) in the heading in column (2}, the following words
shall be added at the end, namely:—

“other than those specifically mentioned in Third Schedule.”;
(b) the entry in column (3) of sub-item (1), shall be omitted.

(ix) serial number 42B in column (1) and the entries against it
in columns (2) and (3) shall be omitted; '

(x) in serial number 63, in the entry in column (2) after the words,
“used plastic” the words “plastic scrap, waste chips, parings” shall be inserted;

(b) in the Second Schedule,—

(i) serial number 2D and the entries against it in columns (2)
and (3) shall be omitted;

[



37

(ii) serial numbers 7A, 8, 9 and 10 and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3) shall be omitted;

(c) in the Third Schedule,—

(i) after serial number 5A and the entries against it in
cohmns (2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be

inserted, namely:—

5B. Atta, maida, sooji and rava sold in packages with MRP

printed on such packages

(ii) after serial number 8, the entry against it in columns (2)
and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be inserted,

namely:-—

8A. Basmati Rice sold in packages with MRP printed on

such packages.

(i) after serial number 24 and the entries against it in columns
(2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be

inserted, namely:—
“24A Coconut Qil Xk 7

(iv) for serial number 30A and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be

inserted, namely:—
30A. Cooked Food, other than,

(i) those served to any airline service company or
institution or shipping company for serving in aircraftship or steamer or served in

aircraft, ship, steamer and five star hotels and *EEE

(ii) burgers, pizzaé, tacos, doughnuts, sandwiches,
burger-pattys, pasta, bread-fillings sold by restaurants having a brand name or
trade mark registered under the Trade Marks Act, 1999; hEk




38

(v} in serial number 33, in the heading in column (2}, the
following words shall be added at the end, namely:—

“other than those specifically mentioned in the table in
clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 6.”;

[****]

(vi) serial number 86B and the entries against it in columns
{2) and (3} shall be omitted;

(vil) After serial number 109A, and the entries against it in
columns (2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
inserted, namely:—

“109B Rice bran oil FEEE

(viii) after serial number 141A and the entries against in
columns (2) and (3), the following serial numbers and entries shall, respectively,
be inserted, namely:—

“141B. Washing soap bars and cakes
manufactured using coconut oil KRk X

“141C. Waste and scrap of primary cells,
primary batteries and electric
accumulators; spent primary cells,
spent primary batteries and
spent electric accumulators;
electrical parts of machinery
or apparatus. 8548.";.

(d) in List A,—

(i) in serial number 118, in item 15 for entries against it in
columns (2) and (3) the following entries shall, respectively, be substituted,
namely:—

recycled plastic. hkk

“10. Validation—(1) Notwithstanding the lapse of the Kerala Finance Bill,
2016 (Bill No. 396 of Thirteenth Kerala Legislative Assembly) (hereinafter referred
to as the said Bill) and the cesser of force of law of the declared provisions of
said Bill anything done or any action taken, including levy and collection of tax



39

or duty, during the period from the 1st day of April, 2016 to the 17th day of |
July, 2016, by virtue of the declared provisions contained in the said bill, under
the Kerala Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 (11 of 1957) or under the Kerala Stamp
Act, 1959 (17 of 1959) or under the Kerala Court Fees and Suits Valuation Act,
1959 (10 of 1960) or under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of 1976) or
under the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax Act, 1991 (15 of 1991) or under the
Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 2004) (hereinafier referred to as the
respective Acts) as they stand amended by the said Bill, shall be deemed to be
and to have always been for all purposes, validly and effectively done or taken
under the provisions of the respective Acts, as if the said amendments had been
in force at all material times.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in the respective Acts during the
period from Ist April, 2016 to 17th day of July, 2016 during which the declared
provisions contained in the said Bill was in force, anything done or any action
taken by virtue of the said provisions of the said Bill shall be deemed to have
been validly done or taken under the respective Acts and no action shall lie
against any dealer or authority on the ground of short levy or refund of excess
tax or duty and tax or duty collected, if any, by a dealer or an authority, as the
case may be, shall be paid over to the Government.

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Kerala Value Added Tax Act,
2003 (30 of 2004) any tax collected or paid at higher rate by virtue
of the provisions of the Kerala Finance Bill, 2016 (Bill No. 16 of the
XIV Kerala Legislative Assembly) in respect of the period with effect on
and from the 18th day of July, 2016 to the date of publication of this Act,
shall be deemed to have been validly done and any tax collected or paid by a
dealer or authority at such higher rates shall be deemed to have been
validly collected or paid and the tax so collected shall be paid over to the
Government and shall not be refunded.”

Secretariat of the Kerala Legislature, V. K. BABU PRAKASH,
Thiruvananthapuram, Secretary.
27th October, 2016.



