- REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE
- ON
THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2017
AND

THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMTITEE

©
Kerala Legislature Secretariat
2017

KERALA NIYAMASABHA PRINTING PRESS.



REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE
ON
THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2017
AND
THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE

725/2017.



AW

CONTENTS

Composition
Report
Minutes of dissent

Bill as reported by the Subject Committee

Page

vii

xi



SUBJECT COMMITTEE VIlII
(ECONOMIC AFFAIRS)
{2016-2018)
Composition
Chairman:

DR. T. M. Thomas Isaac,
Minister for Finance and Coir.

Ex-officio Members:
Shri T. P. Ramakrishnan,
Minister for Labour and Excise

Shri. G. Sudhakaran,
Minister for Public Works and Registration.

Members:
Shri T, A. Ahammed Kabeer, M.L.A,
DR. N. Jayaraj, »
Shri V. K. C. Mammed Koya, "

~Shri D K. Murali, . w
Shri Thiruvanchoor Radhakrishnan, "
Shri Mullakkara Retnakaran, "
Shri V. D. Satheesan, - »
Shri K. Suresh Kurup, 2

Legislature Secretariat:

Shri V. K. Babu Prakash, Secretary
Shri K. Gopakumaran Pillai, Joint Secretary
Smt. Lima Francis, Deputy Secretary

Smt. Deepa R. Krishnan, Under Secretary.



THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2017
(Report of the Subject Committee)

The Kerala Finance Bill, 2017 (Bill No. 48) was referred to Subject
Committee VIII Economic Affairs. The meeting of Subject Committee VI
considered the Bill clause by clause and now submits this Report with the Bill as
reported by the Subject Committee annexed thereto.

2. The Kerala Finance Bill, 2017 was published as a Gazette Extraordinary
dated March 13, 2017. The Bill was introduced in the Assembly on March 15,
2017 and was referred to Subject Committee VIII on May 22, 2017,

3. The Committee considered the Bill clause by clause at the meeting held on
May 22, 2017. The Committee recommends to adopt the Bill with the following
modifications.

Clause 1

(1) Short title and commencement—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala
Finance Act, 2017.

(2) Save as otherwise provided it shall be deemed to have come into force on
the 1st day of April, 2017.

Clause 2

(1) In clause (ea) of section 2 of the Kerala Stamp Act, 1958
(17 of 1959} proposed to be inserted by item (b} of sub-clause (2) the words, “for
this purpose” shall be omitted;

(2) In sub-clause (7), for the words, brackets and letters “a new clause (aa)”
the words “the following clause” shall be substituted.

Clause 3

In sub-section (9) of section 23B of the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963
(15 of 1963) proposed to be jnserted by clause 3, for the word “applicant” the word
“dealer” shall be substituted.



viii
Clause 6
1. For clause (6) the following clause shall be substituted, namely.—

{1) in section 6,—

(a) in sub-section (1) after the nineteenth proviso, the following

provisos shall be inserted, namely:—

«provided also that the sale of packing materials by a registered dealer to an
exporter for the purpose of use in the packing of exported goods shall be exempted
from the tax for the period up to 31st March, 2016, subject to the condition that the
sale has been supported by 'H' Forms issued under the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956
(Central Act 74 of 1956, by such exporting dealer and tax, if any, paid
shall not be refunded:

Provided also that the rate of tax on works coniract of supply and installation
of solar energy devices, equipments and plants shall be one per cent from 1st April,

2013 and tax, if any, paid at higher rate shali not be refunded:

Provided also that the goods specified in item (1) of serial number 134 of |
List A of the Third Schedule shall be exempted from tax for the period from
20th December, 2014 to 31st March, 2015:

Provided also that the rate tax of Mobile Phone Charger sold along with
Mobile Phone in a sealed pack shall be at the rate applicable to the goods specified
in the Third Schedule from 1st April, 2005:

Provided further that the rate of tax on 'bakery shortening’ included under the
Chapter 15 to the Schedule to the Customs Tariff Act 1975 (Central Act 51 of
1975) with the HSN code 1517.90, shall be at the rate applicable
to the goods in the Third Schedule, up to 22nd February 2017.



ix

Notwithstanding anything contained in the aforementioned proviso tax, if any
paid, shall not be refunded.

(b) in sub-section(2), to clause(a) the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:— .

Provided that notwithstanding anything contained in clause(f) of section 8, a
dealer paying compounded tax for the goods mentioned in that clause, shall not be
lable to pay tax under this sub-section on such goods with effect from Ist April
2013.”

4. All other changes are either verbal or consequential.

5. The minutes of dissent are appended.

DR. T. M. THOMAS ISAAC,
Thiruvananthapuram, Chairman,

22nd May, 2017. Subject Committee VIII.

72572017,



allewommaadiaf I

2017-001 cang Wm0, migfloR qumiiras @mlgl oleapdsicmds
@INE alOWIND IR aNewosile| GRS ISTPAT,

1

s0-cppom” MlosmIauT af B 0N W00 anfgfiensm’
DHMIFOITSBs®. aualam Moosnuawlaf e alda) Slalganim” gmymaan
7-4-2017-000 =@, {(nM}) maud 23201791 (v and.e.
maud 182/2017)  anyw) AR 2SR aJooqsaf afloleaa@om®
UV PY f2lgmMEkwgmy’ 0P Mosuaus 21Z3BBA o J0O G0 ajm”
mlearveem allvmroammiol ) FTDOHINELL

W@ DaQes aefivge, nNegmawe ajdapaca avlanes) S OGED
PH0ea mlad  &slgle: Manosm  awvent 2011 aodsf 31 awe
Skl auesaden nagasm” ealdnllafigana’ sa” 2015 aee ageieje
Ad3neflnflaems.

Sl af). @RA0IBAE" BB (8a])
®IWBOKRRNE ROWIGaHENAd (84

afl.awl. quolvoad (82D



3

(b) in sub-section (4), for the words and figures “28th February,
2017”, the words and figures “31st December, 20177 shall be substituted;

(c) after sub-section (8), the following sub-section shall be inserted
namely.—

“(9) If the dealer had filed optidn in 2016-17 but failed to remit the
entire amount as per this section, the amount paid under the earlier option shall
be treated as amount paid under the new option.”,

4. Amendment of Act 32 of 1976 —In the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act,
1976 (32 of 1976),for section 10B, the following section shall be substituted,
namely.—

“10B. Reduction of arrears in certain cases.—(1) Notwithstanding,
anything contained in this Act or rules made thereunder or in any judgment,
decree or order of any court, tribunal or appellate authority, an assessee who is
in arrears of tax or any other amount due under this Act relating to the period up
to and including 31st March 201 1, may opt for settling the arrears on payment
of the principal amount of tax in arrears and thirty per cent of penalty amount,
by availing a complete reduction of the interest on the tax amount and interest
on the penalty amount.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Kerala Revenue
Recovery Act, 1968, (15 of 1968) reduction of arrears under sub-section (1) shall
be applicable to those cases in which revenue recovery proceedings have been
initiated and the assessing authorities shall have the power to collect such
amounts on settlement under sub-section (1) and where the amount is settled
under sub-section (1), the assessing authorities shall withdraw the revenue
recovery proceedings against such assessees which will then be binding on the
revenue authorities and such assessees shall not be liable for payment of any
collection charges.

(3) The assessee shall withdraw all the cases pending before any
appellate or revisional authority, tribunal or courts for opting for settling the
arrears under this section.

(4) All arrears including tax and penalties pertaining to a year shali
be settled together under this section.

(5) An assessee who intends to opt for payment of arrears under
sub-section (1) shall submit an application to the assessing authority on or
before 30th June, 2017.

725/2017.



4

(6) The arrears for the purpose of settlement under this section shall
be calculated as on the date of submission of application.

(7) On receipt of an application under sub-section (5), the assessing
authority shall determine the amount of tax and other amounts due from the
assessee under sub-section (1) and shall intimate the same to the assessee, and
thereupon the assessee shall remit the amount in equal monthly instalments on
or before 31st December, 2017:

Provided that an assessee who opts to settle his arrears under
sub-section (1} has remitted any amount relating to the arrears for obtaining a
stay voluntarily or by way of an order or decree or judgment passed by any
court or tribunal or appellate authority and if the case is pending before such
authority, the amount so paid shall be treated as that paid under this option.

(8) There shall not be any refund subsequently for the amount
settied under this scheme, under any circumstances.

5. Amendment of Act 15 of 1991.—In the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax
Act, 1991 (15 of 1991) for section 37C, the Yollowing section shall be substituted,
namely:—

«“37C. Reduction of arrears in certain cases—(1) Notwithstanding
anything contained in this Act or rules made thereunder or in any judgment,
decree or order of any court, tribunal or appellate authority, an assessee who is
in arrears of tax or any other amount due under this Act relating to the period up
to and including 31st March 2011, may opt for settling the arrears on payment
of the principal amount of tax in arrears and thirty per cent of the penalty
amount by availing a complete reduction of the interest on the tax amount and
on the penalty amount;

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Kerala Revenue
Recovery Act, 1968 (15 of 1968), reduction of arrears under sub-section (1) shall
be applicable to those cases in which revenue recovery proceedings have been
initiated and the assessing authorities shall have the power to collect such
amounts on settlement under sub-section (1) and where the amount is settled
under sub-section (1), the assessing authorities shall withdraw the revenue
recovery proceedings against such assessees which will then be binding on the
revenue authorities and such assessees shall not be liable for payment of any
collection charges.

(3) The assessee shall withdraw all the cases pending before any
appellate or revisional authority, tribunal or courts for opting under this section.

(4) All arrears including tax and penaities pertaining to a year shall
be settled together under this section.



5

(5) An assessee who intends to opt for payment of arrears under
sub-section (1) shall submit an application to the assessing authority on or
before 30th June, 2017,

(6) The arrears for the purpose of settlement under this section shall
be calculated as on the date of submission of the application.

(7) On receipt of an application under sub-section (5), the assessing
authority shall determine the amount of tax and other amounts due from the
assessce under sub-section (1) and shall intimate the same to the assessee, and
thereupon the assessee shall remit the amount in equal monthly instalments on
or before 31st December, 2017:

Provided that an assessee who opts to settle his arrears under
sub-section (1) has remitted any amount relating to the arrears for obtaining a
stay voluntarily or by way of an order or dectee or judgment passed by any
court or tribunal or appellate authority and if the case is pending before such
authority, the amount so paid shall be treated as that paid under this option.

(8) There shall not be any refund subsequently for the amount settled
under this scheme, under any circumstances.”, :

6. Amendment of Act 30 of 2004.—1In the Kerala Value Added Tax Act,
2003 (30 of 2004),—

(1) in section 6—

(a) in sub-section (1), after the nineteenth proviso, the following
provisos shall be inserted, namel —

“Provided also that the sale of packing materials by a registered dealer to
an exporter for the purpose of use in the packing of exported goods shall be
exempted from the tax for the period up to 31st March, 2016, subject to the
condition that the sale has been supported by ‘H* Forms issued under the
Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 {Central Act 74 of 1956), by such exporting dealer
and tax, if any, paid shall not be refunded: .

Provided also that the rate of tax on works contract of supply and
installation of solar energy devices, equipments and plants shall be one per cent
from 1st April, 2013 and tax, if any, paid at higher rate shall not be refunded:

Provided also that the goods specified in item (1) of serial number 134 of
List A of the Third Schedule shall be exempted from tax for the period from 20th
December, 2014 to 31st March 2015:

Provided also that the rate of tax of Mobile Phone Charger sold along with
Mobile Phone in a sealed pack shall be at the rate applicable to the goods
specified in the Third Schedule from 1st April 2005:




6

Provided further that the rate of tax on ‘bakery shortening’ included under
the Chapter 15 to the Schedule to the Customs Tariff Act 1975 (Central Act 51 of
1975) with the HSN code 1517.90, shall be at the rate applicable to the goods in
the Third Schedule, up to 22nd February 2017.

Notwithstanding anything contained in the aforementioned proviso tax if
any paid, shall not be refunded.

(b) in sub-section(2), to clause(a) the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely—

Provided that notwithstanding anything contained in clause(f) of section 8,
a dealer paying compounded tax for the goods mentioned in that clause, shall
not be liable to pay tax under this sub-section on such goods with effect from
Ist April 2013.”

(2) in section 24, in sub-section (1).

( in clause (c), for the words “three years” the words
“four years” shall be*substituted;

(i) for the fourth proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:—

“Provided also that the period for rejection of return and
completion of assessments including those subjected to extension under section
25B which expires on 31st March, 2017, shall be extended up to 31st March, 2018.7;

(3) in section 25, in sub-section (1}.—

() for the words “five years”, the words “six years” shall be
substituted;

(i) for the third proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:—

“Provided also that the period for proceeding to determine
any assessment including those subjected to extension under section 25B which
expires on 31st March, 2017, shail be extended up to 31st March, 2018.7;

(4) for section 25E, the following section shall be substituted,
namely—

25E. Special provision for assessment and payment of tax for presumptive
dealers.—(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or rules made
thereunder or in any judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or appellate
or revisional authority or any assessment orders or penalty orders issued under



.

this Act, the dealers who have opted to pay tax under sub-section (5) of section
6 and with regard to whom unaccounted purchases have been detected by the
assessing authority for the period up to 31st March, 2016, may opt to settie
their cases by paying tax at,—

(i) half per cent on the turnover of taxable goods, if the total
turnover determined is, within the total turnover limit
specified under sub-section (5) of section 6;

(i) one per cent on the turnover of taxable goods, for the total
turnover determined in excess of the total turnover limit
specified under sub-section (5) of section 6 and up to
rupees one crore, in addition to the tax due under clause (i)
above;

(i) two per cent on the turnover of taxable goods, for the total
turnover determined above rupees one crore, in addition to
the tax due under clauses (i) and (ii) above,

and on payment of such tax, all penalties and interest
including penalty under sub-section (7) of section 22, shall
stand waived.

Explanation—Notwithstanding anything contained in clause (li) of section
2 of the Act, for the purpose of this section, ‘total turnover determined’ shall be
the total turnover obtained by adding unaccounted purchases detected or
declared with five per cent gross profit to the total turnover declared as per the
returns filed.

(2) For settling the cases under sub-section (1), the dealer shall file
option before the assessing authority on or before 30th June, 2017, along with
the evidence regarding withdrawal of cases, if any, pending before any court,
tribunal or appellate or revisional authority.

(3) Such option and settlement shall cover all the financial years in
which unaccounted purchases have been detected.

(4) The assessing authority shall intimate the dealer, the amount to be
paid under sub-section (1), within fifteen days from the date of receipt of the
option.

(5) Thirty per cent of the amount due under this scheme shall be paid

within fifteen days from the date of receipt of the intimation under sub-section
{4) and the balance amount shall be paid on or before 31st December, 2017 in

equal instalments.



8

{(6) Without prejudice to the provisions of this section, the
Commissioner may issue such instructions to the assessing authorities and the
dealers for the effective implementation of the scheme.

{7) Any dealer who opts for this scheme shall obtain Tax payers
Identification Number (TIN) under this Act with effect from 1st April, 2016.

(8) No further action under any of the provisions of this Act shall be
initiated by the assessing authority with regard to the unaccounted purchases
settled by the dealer under this section or other irregularities in accounts which
resulted from such unaccounted purchases, and no appeal or revision shall lie
against the amount so settled under this section.

(9) Dealers who have opted to pay tax under sub-section (5) of section
6 and with regard to whom unaccounted purchases have not been detected by
the assessing authority for the period up to 31st March, 2016, may also
voluntarily declare such unaccounted purchases, and opt for the scheme
mentioned in sub-section (1), and on doing so, no further action under this Act
shall be initiated against such dealers with regard to the same.

(10) Dealers who opted to settle their cases under this section in 2016-17,
but had failed to make payments may also opt to settle their cases under this
section, and the amounts, if any, paid earlier shall be adjusted towards the
amount to be paid under this section, provided that no refunds shall be allowed.

(11) There shall not be any refund subsequently for the amount settled
under this Scheme, under any circumstance”.;

(5) after section 25E, the following section shall be inserted, namely.—

“25F. Special provisions for assessment and payment of tax for certain
work contractors.—Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or rules
made thereunder or in any judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or
appellate authority, works contractors who have opted for and paid compounded
tax under clause (a) of section 8 of the Act for the years up to 2014-15 in
respect of works relating to installation of kitchen cabinet, aluminium fabrication
and air conditioning plants in which the transfer of materials is in the form of
goods and if all the purchases for executing such contracts are from within the
State, may pay an additional tax of two per cent on the whole contract amount,
and on payment of such tax, no further proceedings under this Act, including
any assessment or penalties shall lie against such contractors.”;



9

(6) after section 31, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“31A. Reduction of arrears in certain cases. —(1) Notwithstanding
anything contained in this Act or rules made thereunder or in any judgment,
decree or order of any court, tribunal or appellate authority, any assessee who
Is in arrears of tax or any other amount due under this Act or under the Central
Sales Tax Act, 1956 (Central Act 74 of 1956) relating to the period up to and
including 31st March, 2011, may opt for settling the arrears on payment of the
principal amount of the tax in arrears and thirty per cent of the penalty amount
by availing a complete reduction of the interest on the tax amount and on the
penalty amount,

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Kerala Revenue
Recovery Act, 1968, (15 of 1968) reduction of arrears under sub-section (1)
shall be applicable to those cases in which revenue recovery proceedings have
been initiated and the assessing authorities shall have the power to collect such
amounts on settlement under sub-section (1) and where the amount is settled
under sub-section (1) the assessing authorities shall withdraw the revenue
recovery proceedings against such assessees which will then be binding on the
revenue authorities and such assessees shall not be liable for payment of any
collection charges.

(3) The assessee shall withdraw all the cases pending before any
appellate or revisional authority, tribunal or courts for opting under this section.

(4) All arrears including tax and penalties pertaining to a year shall be
settled together under this section. )

(5) An assessee who intends to opt for payment of arrears under sub-
section (1} shall submit an application to the assessing authority on or before
30th June, 2017.

(6) The arrears for the purﬁose of settlement under this section shall
be calculated as on the date of submission of application.

(7) On receipt of an application under sub-section (5), the assessing
authority shall determine the amount of tax and other amounts due from the
dealer under sub-section (1) and shall intimate the same to the dealer, and
thereupon the dealer shall remit the amount in equal monthly instalments on or
before 31st December, 2017:

Provided that an assessee who opts to settle his arrears under sub-section
(1) has remitted any amount relating to the arrears for obtaining a stay
voluntarily or by way of an order or decree or judgment passed by any court or



10

tribunal or appellate authority and, if the case is pending before such authority,
the amount so paid shall be treated as that paid under this option.

(8) There shall not be any refund subsequently for the amount settled
under this scheme, under any circumstances.”;

(7) in section 55, in sub-section (I),—

() for the words, brackets and figures “other than those under
section 16, section 19, sub-sections (8) and (9) of section
44, section 49, section 67, section 68, section 69 and
section 70" the words, brackets and figures “other than
those under sub-section (3), sub-section (8) or sub-section
(9) of section 16 and sub-section (8) of section 19" shall be
substituted;

(i) in the first proviso, for the figures and words “48, 70A and
72", the figures and words “48, 49, 67, 69, 70, T0A and 72"
shall be substituted;

(8Y in section 57, in sub-section (1), after the first proviso, the'
following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

~ w«provided further that where an order of the assessing authority which
has become appealable under section 55 with effect from 1st April, 2017 by
virtue of the Kerala Finance Bill, 2017, is pending as revision under this section,
such revision shall stand transferred to the Deputy Commissioner {Appeals) or
Assistant Commissioner (Appeals) as the case may be, and such authority shall
consider the same as if it is an appeal filed before it.”";

(9) in section 60, in sub-section (1), after the second proviso, the
following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“provided also that where an order of the assessing authority which
has become appealable under section 55 with effect from st April, 2017 by
virtue of the Kerala Finance Bill, 2017, and on which the Deputy Commissioner
had passed orders under section 57 and revision against such orders are
pending under section 59, such revision shall stand transferred to the appellate
tribunal and the tribunal shall consider the same as if it is an appeal filed
before it.”;



aNewommanclaf 11

2JUDSAIOWM Hooemanglst 2017-081 emag wmaoy ilglemas’ amoad

afleoom) sam.

1

AW HOTNONIR  @-gE Joajctictic  Gayidles”  aosmeseind
ARG Meaflwame aifl agrsaam elal Meacm]ol alysmat

auomunamam” GST ammmemes VAT mlweoe 0gide. o JoilQ 8@
M@ae ABEINPIIM  alp® osowmlest  &HSi@le:  ealegom’
DVSIBIMOHCEIE00@T  @RaMIGITY” AUl O®:IMNg WM. af)anIad
oD o aeoearm dleol  moarm aydepeleag  duoeminu gje
M) adepaileama”  quosiawlaje QU NE®LOE  Moliesengan
BS1gds OO aIQINE TuosWlaje a oo €1 KTUD D03
a@Iagamiclesaiam. Do aog” Mlem] A0yaalsl AUPClEE
VAN SDICT Daldh®]on),

ang” moaanlcd @em olaal midapoonime  @Idqjoesmmolae
@A) (UoMINULs] AAITLUNGGe 21568680 DOE] @D UMW af)Rfde
@O  OIWATUEYSHS IBICRHLMW B ANCWDAEN. fimimd  aog’
M@V DI ORIMBAUGBAN Alda] GRMIVT] 2] o)l ayoiren
@®ive  MudH0IBIT” ameayunle: wavy” allbamiaineadl  ®laml
mdapaaie qairﬁm%smm:m sanamlad  aldqrsaamaimoa] asism,
ajamelaud, mMSaISigtio, Mldal midgpo oHaNial anoavg’ soed”
AONDIE mecdlonmmlme ajdomledlesmaine 1ol AysmaIes]
OEN0MS 8W  Aleb@®]  @@SSEle00md e Palan.  afanocd
MAH03  (@aNeolanmm oyl ol moarueEesSewy TulRe:S
SonlFlResew)  ~glammg” amanlgr o afesmvlspgial
eaigeryglal aid saudamgeama@lm” @elyaay, @D Adnf ameflod
aflam” avlaissasme.

GOWD. M. RWOILE (saf)



THE KERALA FINANCE BILL, 2017
(As reported by the Subject Committee)

[The words underlined/sidelined indicate the modifications suggested by the
Committee. Omissions are indicated by asterisks]

A

BILL

to give effect to certain financial proposals of the Government of Kerala for the
Financial Year 2017-2018.

Preamble.—WHuErkas, it is expedient to give effect to certain financial
proposals of the Government of Kerala for the Financial Year 2017-2018;

BE it enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:—

1. Short title and Commencement—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala
Finance Act, 2017.

(2) Save as otherwise provided it shall be deemed to have come jnto -
force on the 1st day of April, 2017. .

2. Amendment of Act 17 of 1959.—In the Kerala Stamp Act, 1959
(17 of 1959)—

(1) in section 2,

(a) in clause (e), for the words “an adhesive or impressed stamp”,
the words and symbols “an adhesive, impressed or e-starnp”
shall be substituted;

(b) after clause (e), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“{ea) ‘‘e-stamp” means an electronically generated impression issued
by the Government of Kerala [*****] to denote the payment of
stamp duty;”;

(c) after clause (p), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(pa) “Registering Officer” means the officer appointed under section
6 of the Registration Act, 1908 (Central Act XVI of 1908);”;

{(d) in clause (qq),—

(i) for the words “mark, seal or endorsement”, the words and
symbols “mark, seal, endorsement, impression or e-stamping” shall be
substituted;



2

(i) for the words “adhesive or impressed stamp” the words and
symbols “adhesive, impressed or e-stamp” shall be substituted,

(2) in section 10, in clause (b) of sub-section (2), after the words
“impressed stamps”, the words and symbol “or e-stamps” shall be inserted.

(3) after section 10A, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“10B. Appointment of Central Record Keeping Agency.—The
Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint
the Department of Treasuries as Central Record Keeping
Agency which shall have such duties and functions as may be
prescribed, regarding issue of e-stamps.

(4) after section 12, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—
“12A. Defacement of e-stamp—(1) Any e-stamp in an instrument
shall be defaced through online computer verification system by
the Registering Officer or any other officer authorized by the

Government, in such manner as may be prescribed, so that the
same cannot be used again.

(2) Any instrument bearing an e-stamp which has not been
defaced, so far as such stamp is concerned be deemed to
be unstamped.”;

(5) in section 13,—

(a) in the marginal heading, after the words “impressed stamps”,
the words and symbol “or e-stamps” shall be inserted;

(b) in the existing provision, after the words “impressed stamp”,
the words and symbol “or e-stamp” shall be inserted;

(6) in section 47, after the words “impressed stamps” the words and
symbol “or e-stamps” shall be inserted;

(7) after clause (a) of sub-section (2) of section 69, the following clause
shall be inserted, namely:—
“(aa) the manner of payment of stamp duty and refund thereof by
e-payment’”.
3. Amendment of Act 15 of 1963.—In the Kerala General Sales Tax Act,
1963 (15 of 1963), in section 23B,—

(a) in sub-section (3), for the words and figures “28th February,
2017”, the words and figures “31st December, 2017” shall be substituted;



11

(10) after section 96, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“96A. Framing Special schemes for speedy disposal of assessment and
reassessment.—For the speedy disposal of assessments and re-assessments, the
Government may by notification in the Official Gazette, frame special scheme
outlining the structure, functions, procedure and the manner to initiate and
complete assessments under this Act under a fast-track mode.”.

Secretariat of the Kerala Legislature, , V. K. BABU PrakasH,
Thiruvananthapuram, Secretary.
22nd May, 2017.



