Uncorrected/Not for Publication 1

mlaml@amoem #0900

al. Walleed:  aud, 2013-6a CHOS WMBI0Y 6nileo 2013-6el

CHO8 WMy (2-00 mMIA) enflajo Al@lNEMM WO EOS) HHEM A

(alGO@o BRAIOGa{lEeoIM@o6.

(1) 2013-60£I CHOS WM 6nilEd

WM OO o mleaalno _aIMMIBemoemAal)o QU)o ja(o]

(WO._odn.afio. @6m]):  MUA, 2013-621 CHOS WMBIES enilajo 2013-62l

CHOZ WMHO0Y (2-00 mmB) eila)jo  AlBlVEMMUOBOS)HOHEMEAM
(~IG2o 6O GRAIMCa{lee)yam).
S{aHl®)o AYNMOOHUMA)0 @RSIW)o EAVAUMOIW)o QAldha}AlD]

(W0 O all. BRANMAB): MVA, IS (AIGRWHDED allMmo6BBEIM).

2l. MWalleed: 2013-6081 GHO8 WM& MG AlBlNEMMWOEHS)Es

MO (AICAWEDID)
@RM) ) RIHMAIA.................
(@) RlH)MAA...................

(a1G2@o MR BRoW1E:01aflElee)M), MG AlGlNEMMWOEHS)HENM).

Ud)a] @Cla)88 al@lnemnm

2-00 Qldh)al]

(eesn@lwial)

2l. all8e@: 2-0%0 Qlda] enileflod EOVAILHIEROOHWD

LalUOM 6O



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 2
@MY D)L MMAUA.................

(@) 2 MAUA........coneeceee.
2-00  Qud)a] enilafled  EIVAIHHEMOAM  (altdMo VB
@0 18>0la))

2-00 QUdb)a] enileflomd coVaIWIElee)M).

3-00 Qldh)a]

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, |

move the following official amendment:

In clause (i) of sub-section (2) of section 4 of the Kerala Money
Lenders’ Act, 1958 (35 of 1958), proposed to be substituted by sub-
clause (1), for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the words “six thousand

rupees” shall be substituted.
60018  @RAUIMACla{la 68DEEJ VS  CRERVGI  @RoU1H:CleeMeAM)
@R A@0O1H6)M).

@l Malleed:  Man)adMmeqls aml cramclafla) B8DERLWe:

GRBNM @RoU1d:®1H6) ).
CRRVON 621T® (alHO02)88 3-00 QUd)a] enileflod cowaILeM
QN (alUOMODTD
@RM) ) RIHMAIA.................

(@) RlH)MAIA...................



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 3

CRRVON 621T® (alHO02)88 3-00 QAUd)a] enileflod con@IBeM
QN (altdMo MR @RoUld:@)a])

GRRUN® P[] (00088 3-%0 QUdb)a] enilaflead
2oDOWIB1H6)M).

4-%0 Qld)a]

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, |

move the following official amendments:
(1) for sub-clause (3), the following sub-clause shall be
substituted, namely:-
“(3) in section 29,-
(@) insub-section (1), the following words shall be
added at the end, namely”-
“or on the fair value of each such separate part
and value of all other properties therein including
building, if any, whichever is higher,”;
(b) in sub-section (2), the following words shall be
added at the end, namely”-
“or on the fair value of each such separate part
and value of all other properties therein including

building, if any, whichever is higher,”



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 4
(c) insub-section (3), the following words shall be
added at the end, namely:-
“or on the fair value of the property and value of
all other properties therein including building, if
any, whichever is higher.”.”;
(2) for sub-clause (6), the following sub-clause shall be

substituted, namely:-

“(6) in section 39, in clause (b) of sub-section (1), for the words
“five rupees”, occurring in both places, the words “ten rupees” shall be
substituted.”;

(4) in the Schedule to the Kerala Stamp Act, 1959 (17 of 1959),
proposed to be amended by sub-clause (7),-

(1) after item (b), the following item shall be inserted,
namely:-
“(ba) in serial number 17, for the entry in column (3), the
following entry shall be substituted, namely:-
“One rupee for every rupees
1000 or part thereof, of the value

of the share, scrip or stock, as the
case may be.”;



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 5

(i1) in serial number 21, proposed to be substituted by item (c) of

sub-clause (7), after item (iii), the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:-

“Provided that if the conveyance relates to any transfer of
undivided share of any land and refers to any agreement relating to
the construction of any building or part of building, including flat
or apartment or room etc., the value of such building or such part
of the building shall also be included in such consideration, and the
stamp duty if any paid in respect of such agreement shall be

deducted from the stamp duty payable for the conveyance.”;

(ii1) in serial number 22, proposed to be substituted by item (d)
of sub-clause (7), after item (vi), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:-

“Provided that if the conveyance relates to any transfer of
undivided share of any land and refers to any agreement relating to the
construction of any building or part of building, including flat or
apartment or room etc., the value of such building or such part of the

building shall also be included in such consideration, and the stamp duty



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 6
if any paid in respect of such agreement shall be deducted from the

stamp duty payable for the conveyance.”;

“(ga) in serial number 44, in clause (f), for the entries
against it in columns (2) and (3), the following entries shall,
respectively, be substituted, namely:-

“(f) When authorising a person The same duty as a

other than his father, mother,
husband,

daughter, brother or sister to

wife, son,
sell any immovable property
or giving authority or power
to a promoter or a developer,
by whatsoever name called,
to make constructions or
develop, sell or transfer (in
any manner whatsoever) any
immovable property situated

in Kerala

@RE AGI1HB6)M).

conveyance (No.21 or 22, as
the case may be) for the fair
value of land or for the amount
of the

whichever is higher or the

consideration,

estimated cost as certified by a
Chartered of

or

Engineer
proposed  construction
development or such property,

as the case may be.”

60 @RAIMGlafla) BDERLOWG CEERNTIHUE @RoUIB:GClee6MeAN)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 7

2l Malleed:  Man)adMeaqls ol cGrAOMGlafla B8DERLWIe:

CRBUNMN U3 @RoU1H:0186)aM).
CRBVM 02lT® (alHIOMBS 4-00 QUd)a] enileflend cOVAILHEM
OQM (AlUOME DT
@RM) ) RNHMAIA.................
(@] ) RN MAUA............nc.c...
CRRVDN 621T® (alHO02SS 4-00 QU)o enilaflond con@IBeEM
QN (altdMo MR @RoUld:@)af)
CRBVM]  0alT®  (alSHI0MBS  4-00  Qldla] enilaflead oW
20WIBle6) ).

5-00 Qldh)a]

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, |

move the following official amendment:

For section 69A of the Kerala Court Fees and Suits Valuation Act,
1959 (10 of 1960), proposed to be inserted by sub-clause (2), the
following section shall be substituted, namely:-

“69A. Refund of court fee in case where the dispute is settled
under section 89 of the Code of Civil Procedure.- Where a suit, appeal
or other proceeding before any court is settled by recourse to section 89
of the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (Central Act 5 of 1908), the whole

court fee paid on the plaint/Memorandum of Appeal or other



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 8
proceedings, except in interlocutory matters, shall be ordered by the
court to be refunded to the parties concerned by whom the court fee was
paid.”.

6001  @RAUIOMACla{lay 68DEELOUE:  CREVGI  @RoW1HClEeMeAN)

@Re AO1e6)M).

gl all8ed: Ia0)@0Meals aml  @ealedlaflay 80eEE 006
CRBUV® @RoU1H:@1H6)M).
CRBVM] 02lT® (alHIOMBS 5-00 QUd)a] enileflend coWAILHEM
QMM (AlUOME DD
@RM) ) RHMAIA.................

(@) 2 MAUA........cooeecee.
CRRVON 621T® (alHO02B8 5-00 QU)o enilaflond conadseeM
QN (altdMo MR @RoUld:@af)
HeIOl0] P[] (00088 5-00 AUdya]  endleflend

2oROWIB1H6)M).

6-00 Qldh)a]
(eesn@lwial)

2l. Malleed: 6-00 AUd)a] Milallod EONAILHIERIOWM (alUEMEDTD)

@MY )N MMAUA.................

(@) RH)MAUA........coveeeee

6-00 QUdh)a] nileflond fOVAIBHEMEAM (altdMo MVE @ROW 1G]



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 9

6-00 QUh)a] enilefload coaIW@lee)M).

7-00 Qidh)a]

(eesv@wlg))

2l. Walleed: 7-00 Ald)a] Mmilallend cINAIEHIECRAIHWN (AlUETMEOET

@RM) ) RIHMAIA.................

(@) RlH)MAIA...................

7-00 Qidh)a] nileflomd BOVAIBHEMORMM (alUdMo VG @RoU1B:G]al)

7-00 Q)] endleflond conaoW1Blee)M).

8-00 Qidh)a]

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, |

move the following official amendment:

For sub-clause (3) by which it is proposed to amend section 6 of
the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of 1976), the following sub-
clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(3) In section 6,-

(a) in sub-section (4), for the existing provisos, the following
provisos shall be substituted, namely:-

“Provided that all assessments relating to the years upto and
including the year 2007-08, pending as on 31% March, 2013, shall be

completed on or before 31% March, 2014:



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 10
Provided further that in cases where any investigation or inquiry is
pending under this Act or where any assessment cannot be completed
within the period specified under this section, the Deputy Commissioner
may, for good and sufficient reasons, extend the period of completion of
the assessment including escaped assessment under sub-section (5)
beyond the period specified in this section.”;
(b) in sub-section (5), for the words and symbol “hotel/house

boat”, the word “proprietor” shall be substituted.
600 @oal®Clajla)l 80eE0We: AL  @RoWIB:ClBeEMeAM)
@RE AGO1H6)M).

2l Wall#ed:  MIa0)a0Meals aml  @ealodlafla) 80850016

GRBNM @RoU1d:®1H6) ).
CR_BUW® WO} (alH00M) S 8-00 QUdb)a] endlefload
ROUNAIBHEMHAM (AlUDME DY)
@RM) ) RIHMMAUA.................

(@) RlH)MAUA..........cncee.
CRBVM 62lT® (alHI0MBS 8-00 QUd)a] enileflond cOVAILHEM
QMM (AltdMo MR @RoU1d:>G1a])
Hello] PO} (00088 8-00 AUdya]  endleflend
2oNROWIB1H6)M).

9-%0 Qld)a]




Uncorrected/Not for Publication 11

(eeru@lg))

2l. Walleed: 9-0%0 Q)] ilaflond BOVAILHIERIOWN (AILEMOTED

@RM) ) RIHMAIA.................

(@) RlH0)MAIA...................

9-00 QUdb)a] enileflod EOVAIHHEMOAM (altBMo MUE @RoW1dhElal)
9-00 QUdb)a] enileflomd coVaIWIElee)M).

10-90_Qldh)a]

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, |

move the following official amendments:

In section 8 of the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of

2004), proposed to be amended by sub-clause (2), before the item (a),

the following item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(A) in clause (b), for the letter and word “M-Sand”, the words

“Manufactured sand” shall be substituted:;”:

(2) in section 18B of the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of

2004), proposed to be inserted by sub-clause (4) of clause 10,-

(i) in the first proviso,-
(@) initem (c), the word “and” shall be omitted;
(b) after item (c), as amended, the following items shall be

inserted, namely:-



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 12
“(ca) other dealers referred to in sub-section (1) of
section 6; (cb) companies; and”;
(i) for the second proviso, the following provisos shall be
substituted, namely:-
“Provided further that hospitals run by charitable institutions
which avail exemption under the Income Tax Act, 1961 (Central Act 43
of 1961) and purchasing medicines from compounded dealer after
paying tax under clause (e) of section 8 shall be exempted from tax on
their sale of such medicines and on the sale of laboratory store items and
consumables to their patients:
Provided also that, with regard to such hospitals which were liable
to take registration under this Act, but had not taken registration till 31
March, 2013 shall get itself registered on or before 30" June, 2013 to
avail the concessions as per the forgoing proviso for the period from 1

April, 2005 to 31% March, 2013.”;

(3) after sub-clause (7), the following sub-clause shall be inserted,
namely:-
“(7A) in section 48, in sub-section (1), the following sentence shall

be added at the end, namely:-



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 13
“A fee of one hundred rupees shall be payable to

Government on each transit pass so issued.”.”;

(4) in sub-clause (8), in item (c), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-
item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(inA) in serial number 93, in item (1), after sub-item (b) and the
entries against it in columns (2) and (3), the following sub-item and
entries shall, respectively, be inserted, namely:-

“(c) Edible soya chunks manufactured falakalalalt

from soya bean oil cake/meal

60018 @PAOGafla) 8VEEJ0WH CEERNMIHUE @ooU1H:CleeMeAN)
@R A®O1H6)M).

2l Maleed:  Man)adMmeqls ol cerAOMGlafla BDERLWe:

CRBUNMNH U3 @BRoU1H:01He)aM).
CRRVO  2lT®  (al®H00M88  10-00 Qe  enilallead
BONAOBHEMORON (VMO
@RM) ) RIlHMAIA.................
(@) RlH)MAIA...................

GRAND 6alV® (al®HOOMB8 10-00 m:ﬁagglj enflefload coMAOBeEM

QN (altdMo MR @RoUld:@)af)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 14

CeBNO®]  6210®  (alHoOMB8  10-00 Qo]  enfleflead

oM WE1H86)M).

11-00 Qidh)a]

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Shri. K. M. Mani): Sir,
I move the following official amendments:

For clause 11, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

11. Levy and collection of cess on wedding celebrations.- (1) There
shall be levied and collected a cess to be called Mangalya Nidhi Cess on
every wedding and its connected celebrations conducted in hotels having
the classification of three star and above or in auditoriums with a seating
capacity of above five hundred including that of dining halls, at the rates

specified in the Table below, namely:-

TABLE
(i) | Hotels of three star and above Rs.10,000/-
(if) | Air conditioned auditorium situated in Rs.10,000/-
Municipality area




Uncorrected/Not for Publication 15

(iif) | Air conditioned auditorium situated in Panchayat | Rs. 7,500/-
area

(iv) | Other auditoriums situated in the area of Rs. 5,000/-
Municipality

(v) | Other auditoriums situated in Panchayat area Rs. 3,000/-

(2) The cess shall be collected from the person from whom the
charges or rent for such celebrations are received by the proprietor of
such hotel or auditorium, as the case may be, and shall be remitted to
Government Treasury in the Head of Account of Mangalya Nidhi on or
before the 15" day of every month.

(3) The proprietor of such hotel or auditorium shall file a statement
in such form as may be prescribed and submit the same along with the
proof of remittance of Mangalya Nidhi Cess to the assessing authority
under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of 1976) having
jurisdiction over the area, on or before the 15" day of every month. He
shall also keep a register containing the details of remittance of
Mangalya Nidhi Cess in such manner as may be prescribed.

(4) The statement referred to in sub-section (3) may be filed and
the amount of cess may also be paid electronically by the proprietor
through the website of the Commercial Taxes Department, Government

of Kerala.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 16

(5) The proprietor of the establishment entrusted with the
collection of the cess shall apply for obtaining a unique identification
number to the assessing authority under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act,
1976 (32 of 1976) having jurisdiction over the area where such
establishment is situated, in such manner as may be prescribed and the
assessing authority shall allot the same to the establishment.

(6) Where any proprietor of a hotel or an auditorium as stated in
sub-section (1) permits any person to conduct a wedding celebration
without the payment of cess under this section, such proprietor shall be
liable to pay such amount of cess as if he had conducted the wedding
celebration and such amount shall be recovered from him as if it is an
arrear due from him under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of
1976).

(7) The Government may, after due appropriation made by the
Legislature by law in this behalf, utilize such sums of money for the
purposes specified in the Mangalya Nidhi Scheme framed by the
Government.

Explanation.- For the purpose of this section,-



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 17
a. the word “proprietor” shall include the person who for the
time being is in-charge of management of such hotels or
auditoriums, as the case may be;
b. the word “auditorium” shall include hall and
kalyanamandapam also;
c. the word “prescribed” means prescribed by rules made by the
Government in this behalf.
(8) The provisions regarding the assessment and recovery of tax in
the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 shall mutatis mutandis apply to
the assessment and recovery of cess under this section.

All other changes are verbal or consequential.
600 @RAIOMGlafla) BVERLOWG CEEBVTI®HUE @RoUIB:GClBn6Mea)
@REAO1B6)M).

al.  Wall#ed: MIa0)a0Meals aml  @ealodlafla) 80eEE500 6

CRBNM B3 @RoU)1dh®1H6)M).
CEENON 62lT® (alH0MSS 11-00 Qld)a] enilaflead conadseem
QN (alUOMODT®
@RM) ) RNHMMAA.................

(@) RlH)MAUA..........cecoe.
GRRVM] 0alU® (alHO028S 11-00 QUd)a] iaflond EcONAILHEM

QN (altdMo MUE @RoU1d>0)a])



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 18
GRANM!  0alP®  (ald000)8S 11-00 Qo]  enilaflead
CoNMOWE1H6) M.

600 Qld)ajjo allOl&:®)o Gal®)o

Minister for Finance, Law and Housing (Sri. K. M. Mani): Sir, |

move the following official amendments:
For clause 1, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Kerala Finance Act, 2013.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, clauses (ba) and (ga) of
sub-section (7) of section 4, sub-section (7A), sub-clause (iiiA) of clause
(c) of sub-section (8) of section 10 and section 11 shall come into force
at once and the remaining provisions of this Act shall be deemed to have

come into force on the 1% day of April, 2013.”.
60 @RAIOMGlafla) BVERLOWG CEEBVTI®HUE @RoWIB:GClBs6MeAN)
@RE A@01B6)M).

@l Malleed:  Man)adMmeqls aml craOclafla) B8DERLWe:

CRBNM B3 @RoU)1dE1H6)M).
GRRNO B2lW® (alHI0RY8S BMMNJo Qdlafio  afl0lé:@)o Gald)o
enilaled oOWaILeMeAM (AlUMODD
@RM) )N MMAUA.................

(@) 2l MAUA........coneeeeee



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 19

CRRNO B2lW® (alHI0DBS B0MNMIo Qdlafio  all0léH@)o Gald)o
nilalod OMAILHIMOAMM (altdMo MUE @00 ld:®lal)

GRBVM] 6210® (AHIOMSS BMMNIo Qldlaflo  afldléd®)o Gald)o

enflaflend comacwleles)m.
0

WM OO Q)0 mleaalo _caIMMIBamoemal)o QUdh)afya(o)]
(WO  &d. afo. @o6ml): M@, 2013-681 GHO8 WMEO0Y 6niled

aloqUOBHIMOAM (alGR®o GRAIG®]a{lee)m).
@R MO0 all=leindau)o QU)o ao)]

((00]. @E)AINA@ EIWIG: AHEMAB): MG, ETMINT (AIGRAWHDD all(m6BBIOM).

al. 0alleed: 6nIa0)@OMeals WMo Mwaale cAUMMIBao

eMaljo QU)o AT GRAUI®Ga]la] 2013-621 GHO8 WM M@  ldoqYo
HOMORAM (IGAWE DI

@RM) ) RIlHMMAA................

(@) R1HMAUA.........ccvveeee.

(alea@o Ve @00 1E:d]flelee)mm). nilad aloqyowleles)am.

(2) 2013-621 GHO8 WM&HIOY (2-90 MaUA) enil@d

2l. MWalleed: 2013-6.1 GHO8 WM& (2-00 MMUA) nil@d ald@lnem

MOOBHS)BHEMERAM (AICAWE DT
@RM) ) RNHMAIA.................
(@) RlH)MAIA...................

(a1G2@o MR @R 1E:@1aflElee)aM), MIES AIGlNEMMWOEHS)ENN).



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 20

U)o @01 )88 allemnm

2-00 Qldh)a]

(eern@wilal)

2l. Malleed: 2-00 AUd)a] Milallod EONAILHIERIOWM (alUdME DT

@MY )N MMAUA.................
(@) REH)MAUA........coneeeee

2-00 QUd)a] enilefload BOVAIBHEMOAMM (alUdMo M. @RoU1B:G]al)

2-00 Qid)a] endleflond cona0WIBlee) M),

8Nl Qidlaflo all0lé@)o Gal®)o

WM )0 mleaalo _aIMMIBEI6MA)0 Qldh) oy
(WO ed. ago. @oeml): M@, MM g SVERLOUE:  CRVOI
@G a{leeyam;.

enfleflloal  1-00  EUEMWEDIM)  al®Oo  @IOPA OO 66O

GalBBHOMR®IEM, @RMIWD):-

“1l. an©)®9Ga|0)0 (al0®oBANo.~ (1) DD @RGJGIM 2013-68 CHOS

WMBHIOY (2-00 MMUB) @YY aflM Gal@ al0Wo.

(2) @® 2013 agall@d 1-00 @I (AlNIREMITE  AUM@OW]

B0} OO |EGSEMIRMIE. .
60  @oalmclalal 80EE0WE: AL  @RoIB:ClenEMeAM)

@RE A®I1e6)M).



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 21

2l Malleed:  Man)adMeaqls ol cGrAOMGlafla B8DERLWIe:

CRBUV® BRoU1B:O1H6)M).
GRBVM] 62I0® (AlHIOMBS 6MIo Qld)allo afloléd®)o Gald)o
nilafload BOWAILHMEOAM (AlUOMOEID)
@RM) )L MMAUA.................
(@) RH)MAUA.........c.cncoe.
CRBVM] 62I0® (AlHIOMBS 6o Ad)allo alldléd®)o Gald)o
nilaflond BOWAILEOMOAM (altdMo MUE @R 1H:Ga))
CRBVM] 62I0® (AlHIOMBS Mo Ad)allo alldléd®)o Gald)o
enfleflond comaowlaleeyam,.

A)(MJo QUM

WM OO Yo mleaalo caummIdamoemal)o Qldh) oyl

(0. B, aglo. @o6M): VA, 2013-6R1 BHOB WMEOOY (2-00 MMUA) 6nil@d

alOYOHOEMEAM (alG2Wo @RAIOGa{lee)m).
@B MMON)0 afl==leimauyo U)oy

(W2 @E)UENB EOWIEaHeMAB): VA, AMIND (AIGAWHD® allMmO6EBE)M).

al. MWalleed: Ma0)@OMeals WMo Ao Mlan)oe UMM
emaljo Aldh)aja((D] @PAIMGlaflay 2013-621 GHOS WMEO0Y (2-00 MMUA)
NIl@d  AldOLOMORAM (AICRWEHTTD)
@RM) ) RIlHNMAA................
(@) R1EIMAUAB.....c.cveceeeeeneee

(alGa@o VR @00 1E:d]2flelee)mm). nilad aldoqyowlelee)am.



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 22

WMo

2013-14 QLONUEDM] B AUBHUOHO® NI RQJICLIW H6) 88

DalWMILYBONMB®B)OS al@ajW)o GAIIOSS)a])o

WMHOO QYo mlonaalo _caImMMIBaoemAal)o QU)o a(o)]

(D). &.afo. @06mM]): VA, MVoMuNIM MIWAMVE ag)dm |-00 MOUB WMo

B AMMMW)ASW)o  MVoMIAIM  EREM@MAIAUMIAB, AMMIA0B, @RYILAIM

963600Momod agam ll-00 moud wmoeidmOMW)EsI0 MIGIM oW
Mdqgaoemo agam lll-00 mmud wmoeidmumw)esw)o #oBaxl@m00@
Moo alldlaim Meolio agam V-0o mmud wmoeid@mamw)
OSW)o MBaj@emB8o o=lmiesaumyo agmn VIl-0o mmud wmoesdaom
WesW)o A9a0m M@ agan 1 X-00 mmud wmoeydmamw)esw)o
(Sau0l®8lo  @RHODVENE)HSBo of) X-00 MM WMIBYROOMW)HSW)o
21alogoeMaljo  alLIQUG®)o  af)aM Xl-00 mmid wmosyd@OM®IOSW)0
eatoerlny agam Xll-00 mmid wmoeidmomwyeswio equarmolw)oe @osy
slo)o 2Q) cEEMaIoR0® MVdQflavyes)o agmm XIV-0o mmuid wmoeydmn
MW)OSW)o ©alo®)a0ad® aglm XV-00 maud wmocid@OM®IOSW)o
OalBauM)o aleiud@lo agm XVI-00 mmid wmosydmamw)esw)o

aNBL ey BV BaNemIBe, ®eal, MomIdooo agam XVIl-0o mmid



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 23

WMIRBMOMWIOSWIo  HOAUBLMANIWOONA0  BAld®IRMIGOIW A0

agym XVI-00 mmid wmoeydanmwiesw)o wo)aneial®osmano ¢o)al
&oemalo agam XX-00 mMMUB WMILLBONMWIOSW)o BAIM MIREAEMo

agym XXl-00 mmud wmogidmomw)eswio mwoalléaumo ageamn XXII

-00 MMUB@ WMIRARGLMW)HSW)o AUIBDMININIMOEMA0 (alal®EMAl)o ag)am

XXI-00 maud wmoeidmomw)eswio emoFleno emoslanglesuanio

(aaomleouanno  agan  XXIV-0o mnud  wmoeidanmw)esw)o
alS1HR0®1/algledW/a0)  allemoes my)Maléd  AllRONEEBUd  agmial

0605 oo oM XXV-0o maud wmoeid@mnmm)asmio (aldyo)
coUocomaIM8s 3)0l®ouom@la) agm XXV I-0o mmud wmosydaom
Wes@)o MadHoeMo ag)mm XXVIl-00 moud wmosydmamw)esw)o
aleial® aomuawile adladwd agam XXVIHI-00 mmud wmoeidon
MW)eswio dyaHl agan XXIX-00 mmud wmoeydmamw)osw)o @& o
aggam XXX-00 mmud wWmocyBOOM®IOSW)o AYNIVOOEHHUEMO  af)(m
XXXl-00  mud  wmosydmommiesw)o  &Hloallé&aumoe  agam
XXXI-00  oud  wmoeid@omm)es®io  AGTLLEUTWMo  ag)a

XXXIHT-20 mmud wmoeydmomwyesw)o aimo agom XXXIV-00 maud



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 24

WMORBMOMW)OSWI0 alerUo@ED ag)am XXXV -00 mmud wmoeydmam
wesW)o (Woaalleaumo agmm XXXVI-0o mmid wmoeidanmw)asw)o
aymoeaBud agam XXXVIl-co mmid wmogydmamw)esw)o =eicm
aimo agyam XXXVII1-00 mmuid wmoeidmumw)osmio 660GH® aleb@)
&3 agan XXXIX-00 maud wmoeydmamm)osw)o @10@)6U68B03 ag)m
XL-20 mmud wmoeid@umesw)o K@an@o agam XLI-00 mamid wmo
cy@@OMW)esw)o aflemosauemdco agm XLIl-00 maud wmoeydmam

)OS0 MaiSalGlanooalo @RI eedacgeEssyo agm XLI-oo
MMIB WMIBYBMOMW)OSW)o TVIAAOY MIOGHO@IAN0 EHHUAANC o)
XLVI-00 mmud wmocidmnmw)esw)o Galdled 2013-14  qUOMIGTD)®

AUGHOOD  DalMIBYBONMB®HOS  MVoMNIMWla] EIYIOANZIEE  (alTI@)®
WOMORLBMAMEUBHS) BMOO® LAY (R0 &M flBlemN @BV 8683
DallMIR BMOMBUE @RMAIGIEHMORMM (~IGA®o MO MNITWeA]S A

20386 eAleNE] @RAUI®Ga{leeyam;.

SI.No | Demand Title of Demands Amount
No. (Rs.in
tho
usands)
1 I State Legislature 1




Uncorrected/Not for Publication

2 ] Heads of States, Ministers and Head Quarters staff 8604

3 Il Administration of Justice 21,483
4 \Y Agricultural Income Tax & Sales Tax 2

5 VIl Stamps and Registration 1

6 IX Taxes on Vehicles 2

7 X Treasury and Accounts 1

8 Xl District Administration & Miscellaneous 403004
9 Xl Police 23361
10 XV Stationery and Printing and Other Administrative Services | 10003
11 XV Public Works 277852
12 XVI Pension and Miscellaneous 97601
13 XVII Education, Sports, Art and Culture 442657
14 XVIII Medical and Public Health 2525
15 XX Water Supply and Sanitation 3

16 XXI Housing 3

17 XXII Urban Development 707508
18 XXIHI Information and Publicity 2

19 XXIV Labour, Labour Welfare and Welfare of Non-residents 18854
20 XXV Welfare of SCs/STs/OBCs & Minorities 10

21 XXVI Relief on account of Natural Calamities 1930698
22 XXVII Co-operation 5

23 XXVII | Miscellaneous Economic Services 131452
24 XXIX Agriculture 43632
25 XXX Food 450003
26 XXXI Animal Husbandry 155005

25



Uncorrected/Not for Publication

26

27 XXX Dairy 13501
28 XXXII | Fisheries 307335
29 XXXIV | Forest 60001
30 XXXV Panchayat 7

31 XXXVI | Rural Development 9138

32 XXXVII | Industries 28984
33 XXXVIII | Irrigation 250020
34 XXXIX | Power 1500000
35 XL Ports 59330
36 XLI Transport 250207
37 XLI Tourism 4566

38 XLII Compensation and Assignments 1373481
39 XLVI Social Security and Welfare 31509

S aHl®)o AYNMOOHHUEMA)0 @B SIW)o BILHMOIW)o AU )aATo]

(0. 8. all. BRIAOMM): MVAE, (AICRWHED MIM alltmo6EBIaM).

gl.  malleed:  momunom  mleame  agan -0 moud

WMORLBOMW)ASWIo MVoMUAIM COMOEMAIIMOIAG, AHIA0AG, @RYMUAIM

03 0nmamad ogymm ll-00 maud wmosydmomw)esw)o MIGIMLHOW
MBaoemo agiam ll-00 mmid wmorydmomw)esw)o #odaHls060@
Moo allelam Mleolio agan V-oo mmud wmoeydmamw)

OsW)o M)(Bof@6aB8)o o=lMiesamyo agmn VIl-00 moud wmoesdmom



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 27

WesW)o A9a0m M@ agan 1 X-00 maud wmoeydmamw)esw)o
(Sa0l®8lo @RHODVENE)HSBo of) X-00 MM WMIBYROOMW)HSW)o
£1ajogoeMAljo  alLIAUG®)o  af)aM Xl-00 mmud wmosyd@OM®IOSW)0
eatoerlny agam Xll-00 mmid wmoeidmomwyeswyo equarmolw)e @osy
slo)o 2Q) REEMaIER0® MUdQflavyes)o agmm XIV-0o mmud wmoeydmn
MOSW)o Oal®)a0a0™ ag)m XV-00 mmud wmosydmOmW)esw)o
OalBadM)o aleiusd@lo agim XVI-00 mmid wmosydmomw)esw)o

aNBLoe oMo BV BANEMIBGo, ®eal, MomIdooo agam XVIl-0o mmid

WMIRBMOMWIHSWIo  HOAUBLMANIWOONA0  HAldI®IRMICOIW QN0

agym XVI-00 mmid wmoeydanmwiesw)o wo)aneial®osmano ¢o)al
&oemano agam XX-00 mMMUB WMILLBOOMWIOSW)o BAIM MIRAAEMo

agym XXl-00 mmud wmogidmomw)eswio mwoalléaumo agemn XXII

-00 MMUB WMIRARGMW)HSW)o AUIBDMININIMOEMA0 (alal®EMAl)o ag)am

XXI-020 moud wmoeidmomw)eswio emosleno emoslanglesuanio

(aaomleouanno  agan  XXIV-0o maud  wmoeidanmw)esw)o
alS1HR0®1/algledW/20)  allemoes my)Maléd  AllRONEEBUd  ag)mial

0es eodao o XXV-00 maud wmoeid@omomm)esmio (aldio)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 23

ceuocomeim8s 6)0l@ouolmEma) agiam XXVI-0o mmid wmosydmam
WesW)o Man@oeMo ag)m XXVIl-00 mmid wmorydanmw)esw)o
aleiaus momiamle amudlruyeud agom XXVI-0o mmid wmoeydmo
M)esWio dyaHl agam XXIX-00 mmud wmoeydmamw)osw)o @& o
aggm XXX-00 mmud wmocid@ommIes®)o AYWIVOOEHHUEMo  af)m
XXXl-00  oud  wmocyd@ommiesw)o  &Hloallé&aumoe  agam
XXXI-00  oud wmogid@omm)esmio  AGTLLENITWMo  ag)a
XXX -90 maud wmoeidmomeswio aimo agiom XXXIV-00 ;maud
WMIRBMOMW)OSWI0 alerUo@ED ag)am XXXV -00 mmud wmoeydmam
wes@)o (Woaalleaumo agan XXXV I-0o maud wmoeydmamw)esw)o
ayamoeasud agan XXXV II-0o mmid wmoeidmamwiesw)o =eaicmv
aimo agyam XXXVII1-00 mmuid wmoeidmnmw)osmio 660BH® aleb)
&3 agn XXXIX-00 mmud wmoeydmamm)osw)o @10@)6U68B03 ag)m
XL-20 mmud wmoeid@ummesw)o K@an@o agam XLI-00 mamid wmo
g @@OMW)es®)o aflemosmusmnco agam XLIl-00 mmud wmogyd@am

WOSV)o MatiSalTlanooal)o @ISO e6dacgaBgle agmn XLII-oo

MMIB WMIRBAMOMWIHSWIo MVIMA0S MOGHIO@IA0 BHUAO 0 agf)m



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 29
XLVI-00 mmud wmogidmnumw)esw)o Galdled 2013-14  qUOMIGTD)®

AUGHOOD  DalMIBYBAONMB®:OS  MVoNIMWla] EIYIOANZIEE  (aITI@)®
WOMORLBMAMEUBHS) BMOO® LAY (R0 &M IflBlemN @BV 8683
DalMIBLBGOME U3 @PMIAUGIBHEMORMM  (AICAWEH DT
@MY )N MMAUA........covecee.
(@) RlH)MAUA..........cec..
DalWMIRIB@OMH 1B aldqOWIBleeM). (1008 @MUl ]ldlee)am).

Maml@emoem o0 o (M)sda))

2013-621 GHO8 Wwmailmlewowm (3-20 maud) eniled

al. MWalleed:  Wwm&ooya)e Maalo AUMMIBMOEMAo QUd)al)

(e 2013-6al eHo8 WMmAlmIEWIw (3-050 MMUA) Milcd GRAIMGA]l
S9N @6,
WMHOO QYo mleaalo _caImmIldmmoemal)o QU)o a(o)]

(LWol. &d.af)o. mo6eM1): LA, 2013-621 CHOs8 WMAIMIeWIw (3-00 MMIA)

endled 608 @RAI®Gla{leeyamn;.

al. Walleed: eniled @ealmdlaflaflclesymm).
WM OO0 mleaalo _aIMMIBEI6MA)o U)oy

(W2l &d.af)o. @06eM1): LA, 2013-621 CHO8 WMAMIeWow (3-90 MMUA)

nil@d aIBlNEMMWEEOSIHHOMOAN (AlGAWO MO @RAUMGa{lee)yam).
SyaHl@)o AFOMOOHUMONo @RSIW)o EIYHMOIW)o Qldb)a]}aTD]

(W0 O all. BRANMAB): VA, IS (AIGRWHDED allMmo6BBIM).




Uncorrected/Not for Publication 30

ol. MWalleed: 2013-021 eHO8 wWmallmlewow (3-90 MoUA) eniled

Al@lWEMM WO BOS)HOEMEORAM (AIGAWE DT
@RM) ) RIHMAIA.................
(@) Rl MAIA...................
(alGAWoO e @0 1d0lajloleen)ymy, enil@d

al@lNEMMW O HOS)EH)M).

QUd)a] @16la)88 alBlnemnm

2 90 3 9o QIB)a])BuB

(eesn@lwial)

2. Walle6d: 2-90 3-90 AUd)ajd0d mnilelond ONRISHICAIOWN
(UOM O
@RM) ) RIHMMAIA.................
(@) ellee)mMAald...............
2-90 3-90 Qa0 mile)lond OVAISHEMOAM (altdMo TLE
@Rl @12]l0106) M)

2-90 3-20 Ald)ai&0d milaflond conaswIcles)am).

alglé

(eerv@lg))

2l. Walleed: aigle emnilajlend oNAIEHIEAIHWAN (AlUTMEOET

@RM) ) ANHMMAIA..................



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 31

(@) 2l MAA.................
alglés enflefload BOUNDOBHEMERA (alU0Mo e
@Rl ©12{l0106) M)

algle endleflomd conaowlelee)am.

1-20 aum)afio all0l&®)0 Gal®)o

(eesn@lwial)

2l. alleed: 1-00 ald)afio allOlé:®@)o Galo)o Mmilaflomd cOVAIE60

GROOQMM (AlUOME BT
@RM) ) RNH6MAIA..................

(@) R MAUA........coceeee

1-%0_Qld)a])o all0l&HW)0 Gal®)o enilafload conadseMea

laltdMo Ve @Ro1&: ] flelee)mm)

1-%0 Qid)afjo allol®:@)o Gald)o enilaflend covadWIdleeym).

WMHOO QYo mlaalo _aImmIdmmoemal)o QU)o 2]

(W2, . ag)o. @aeM1): @, 2013-e21 eHO8 Wmailmlewow (3-090 MMUA)

NIl@d al0qYOBOHMOAMN (alERo MIM BRAIG®G]alee)om).
S aHl®)o AYNMOOHHUEMA0 @S0 BIVHMOIW)o AU )a}ATo]

(). O, all. BROMMB): MUA, (AIGRWHE® MM all0mO6B3)M).

2. Malleed: 2013-ea1 csHos8 wmallmlewow (3-090 mmud) enilod

oJO(EUUOcBG)GTT)G)(TT) (G 6)(OT0)



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 32

(@) RNHIMAUB: ...

(la®@o ME @RoWIe:@lafloles)mm). miled aloquowlcles)m).

2)6Uy 2 (M W)OS (alGA®o

e @MU &2IcEMm® E6 allol@IMmM® qosrIWla]

o6y (V0] 9™ 2106nE1): TVA, ERYAUUDIMNOIW WMEOOY enilaulm

MUYHUB VR al)BOTIWILEHIW MVIAN2IO OGS RO 18-00 @IV AUO®

Mllafloyam  qLEd UEESMo AMEB:0NE @AMIMlafledemeamm)o
e ERMIEIOEILICEMWE alldlWemenmM)M8s (aIGRWo MIB GRAUM
©lajleeymm;.

SyaHl@)o AFOMOHUMANo @R SIW)o EIYHMOIW)o Qldb)a]}aTD]

(D). . all. B@IAOMM): MV, (AICRWHED MM allamo6BERIaM).

2l. MWalleed: (aIeao VR @RolB:®Ea]ldlee)mm).

@GP OAICRIdIHBHMo

2l. MWalleed: al@l@)Mio GHO8 MWANVERW)HS BMBal®do MUEZASM

@06Mm e @AIMVIMIEe)m®. =)o 10-0) @roocle Mucmsmo w)e6e!
18 aee msomomosn) ©@10)20Maflo)M®.  a)MOT3  @RNV)ELEORIW)

MoRAIBBRSBIE3 M) @RAINMIMIEe)HWIeM. mmUeo 12 Elucuaseny



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 33
e memglay®. oo Glanueesglane a)@emaoWio MVED MSalSleud
MSM) af)M} alo@omoallg).

(alWOMAIW)o WMOBIARMOM 21B2|HUdHH)CAUMEIWSS 0D TVECEASM

O®I@ 5 WMIRIBMNMEUB MR 2lBa] 621Q0M HFOMBB). GUAH]

#0)m 40 wmoeiBANMB:UB 2IBa] H)SOO® AlOTOHH)BHWIEMENOWW).
wmalflmlewon enflajo WMoy mila)lo MR aldqYoBsl. 4 enilendud
MUENIRGS HERIGHS CPWWHH}HW)o HalW®).

10 @RSl (aIcaWaRWBeN8s @RAI®OeMIMA®]  @mogImy

al®lnemla).

630 meu(@aflamals @210336838)0 6258 MEU(@ 2NlaMASOED @al0B)

saR8)o @PM)AUGafloymm). RIS 34 @aldBi6ERUBSS AR AUOSOIGED

20)alS] M3,

10 (woeveweMee@d cmoglmuisglenes allallw  (alWBmesBRud  auveE

wes (worbWlcdeaqls)oml. 45 queninlaum)es)o eI @eAIM@lafla)).

alee Glainuessglano (VVERLEUMIBOHR)G:S)o MVENIAlUMBHS)o GRAIOGA]
#9IM HFWIG0)M@NENOS BB W (IUdMEBBU MERWIGE @PAIGGa{la]
OWAEMOAMEIOM MVOIO DSENISE8 EMSIMESS GROITVEAET) MEMOS M
(TIVNWH U8 MatiSHalS) OO

21S68B38)0SW)o  HIPULHHEBRBBIOSWI0  @RSITLAIMOEIGE Ao
(BED]E6)M  621G1OM  MaHalHUOO®  TVEWHHHOMo  Alj0TTm)o

GaldBjo ©alQIAN OOV ICRIWDEN)UO® TVoRIBAHO  af)@MMM® LMW



Uncorrected/Not for Publication 34
Al@JOBIMN O TVEMBUOAET) MTIH)MO@AN af)ajonld)o @RYERIalee6M
e0M) 621WA B01E6OTE3E6)S] @PELAMAIlE6)m).

(MoQUIBEER8IOSW)0 2182 Hh810SW)o  GUAIWIGH:ME MIWATVLE
MoARIGAUEBRBIHSW)0 @RMV)EUGHORIW MoRAIBRE)OSW)o BAUGIWIB)M®)
(B1QICRHRIW  LMOIWal®OMIM  af)(@EOMIBo  B)aHUEMAINEMAT  RO6M
aldHQ0 (al@aléHalo al)eeeeNzm)6ns.

WMIRIBAOUMS:BOWIR0  MAMIBEREMAIWIRN0  af)Jd BINDD)
MIMMB8  @ROMEEBEYAS  @REIAIDWEBBUE  MVIB)allajoGd  Ad(@6n
@ROWAI00 BRAMAA)BENAINHWIBR).  BMEBBRRBYOS OllH000 l)B6m
20W)o (aldSlaflesesz eI MlYAMEWITE @@IME8s8 MVMBEEA)0
MLAAL0 af)RIOAIRYe GalBM) (U AUSICHHMZM)ENE. DHOOOJ0  ag)elonlo)o
800896MeRMN BO1LOTIH)S] @REA@AlE)mM).

af)2joBEe)0 0oMIOM @RHUDOTVEUB EMOIM).

BoBWA......808WA.......... e @M EIRIGETWES allolw)am).

(eBUWIW”IMo @RELlalla)))

(e 2013 ®)eeal @0TVo 9-90 @IV 9ajVE)GUdaHo 12.13-M

@RMNR® BRIV B allClermm).)

kR R T T o



