| sn.enfl. XIlI- cros mwacue/I1X-12
al®1@) Moo GHO8 Mwamue
BMUO®O0 MUEERBMo
M@AMVEO MSalSle:Ud - Muo(Naho
(210GBLOTMOBRUY BFled:)

2013 =)e6el1 9, 62100

(8.30 2)@@3 9.30 AUO® G2ldGBLOOO MVAWO)

mare ooadleal 8.30-m NIa0}RIMB|S Mallesnd

(00, =] HBOVIEHWHME @RLISUOW]TE MYWAMIED ANISIT CWOWO

Gal@m).

@RSIMMO (AIGAXOo

@)AUEKMAVRISMI (IR S BB OO MSON @RY(HHA6Mo

al.  Walleed:  cmogdod  ©@gla] allauwEwled  ayeuyaao)

0Z]1QUW HOEMOAMMINUUD 16O HH06NE $01680S163083] NN EY
(UBODEHOO Gl ©LlajdWBe) &0 LINHL! EI@] HIV(HEZO1IWQ
2032 MSOMI® WLOOAafad.0af). (UBOMEBAL)EME0  Galoallm
emwio  Relallosl@)o  LIOOM2ldd®R)o MSOBIQ@OME™SAaN
(0o gl all. EGR, af)o.af)@B.af). DUBOAOSWIBS (AAUBRCDHALS ~IC1H6)
alQ)®HW®)o  §2l0® VoMol  98NNWIFHIBS®OIW]  Al0WESYAM

muol@ilGudatto 80 M 6)(0T0) MVRIMSalSldhud MA@ ] 2182



©2IQEMOAMOUWD el TVl aUl. GlAUdd®EM, all. (U0looad: M6 s,
Ml O, MO6M), af). af). @RMVITY, af). 6d. WUIMBM g @RoLIEBRUY
0108 50 @PM)MVEla] ¢MOsIMY M@3& IS 6ens.

@R TOO)o adl=leindau)o U)oy

(W2, @)l d@ EIWIB aHemad): (L0l E2ROMU 6@QWIE3, agf)o.af)@d.af).

EZ]UWHOEMOAMINUUD Oa]S  08.07.2013-M 2oJWHe) 12 26MICWIES

25)VI@o  RoWeHUMIGMIM HE3MBOANE CILAUMICRITES (AIHSMAIOW
OO®  @RETMCOI[o WOV  CHIMBNMY  (alUBODHO0  AMIEe]
Gan03eillm qualalo MUOGIGHHMUW)EUBM2] GaldallM) @SW)HW)MRIW]. oM
MUAo  GMVIBIB  aldM@  @Sla)CHMIAW]  UTWER]S  R)WTay@d
@REMIaHEMo MSOMEMEAM)0 MEUSATTIW)o @)LV  AUH}a))ADIW)0
EZ]IUWHOMOAMMY0  BRHUWDIOA]S (alHSMo MSEDIW O U@ 1603
OU36a|OS  @PO}AICMIBO  af).6a)).000aflal. (AJUBEH®:E0  Galoellm)
@RAR.@RA. slomilmaua’lalo Qlaj @se)eQEIR)o GRAUA  Gatoallmilem
@gglaodl amieeg Ganogellm  Malaln)Eowloym W)ETE  EHOeIBUNMY
(IO ®>O)20W]  agiMSl. DD MVoRAICIG3 af).0ag).060l.af)al.
MUOMIAOM (AIMIIAWAT B atiemM(aloEIM)o 60} WG] 2U8ealeS ag @O
af)-0ag).060l.af)al. (AlUBOMEB:CEN)0 ©NE WY GBHIMNM) (AR
HOHO)0  aldlesedlgins. aldlesegud  allallw  @rudya @ le:E]ed
aflgloru@ilensm. (ale® MoRAUCMIOM EalCled WO  EHIBUNIV
(QUBCMEHEOWI0  af).0af).000lafal  (AlQUGODGHEOW)o  (Al®)B:8066)]

25)Vlo @ty eHaU eEIqud e ld@lg)ms. 0@ 1.30 aemlewIes



(ol gl Qil. E06R!aY, af)o. af)®D. af). WOS CMHOIEICTICE AYEMIECOIBo
WLoOALAGal.00f). (AUBEDHE  ald8@E®IMIM)o  OIV(HE501WGleg
eam@  eudloaiom]  emsesdlogimsslcades  @8SBOWOID
(oRE&®W)0 BaldallM)20W] DMRIW MIRIAIGINHDEOBMSB) 2oJa
aflosl@)o SIA@ 100 (NBMA)GS)0 Dalc@Ila] @RS alldlajiails)
HW)o 621PT®). DD MVoRAUOTIEE aldlE8O@®IW] aloddeqals aflatiem),
2om1B, MLEMIaH )M  (AIUBEDE®@  @OIAUMMal}®o  LMOWG3
@YUOYAI@IVIEE  afl®lory @Sl @RGAODITE  caloallmileond =elallos)
UOOMEIN) EHS)aldS MVoRAIlaflg)ens. D MoRAIECIEE & E13on3eand
Gal0eflny @EUAUMIEE EHMU 0=IqYE e2lW® @REMIaHEMo MSMNYAIOIAM).
wol. gl all 0068, af)o.af)@8.ah).We6 aldles @IV Al
BIElHe) HBWI, @RGCEaN0 af)ilosewsslr)o ailélon comsl®ow] aiflaloo
2IElHe)HEWI 2SIl MBI  aldM@  @SlajR0W]  UITWea]S

24-06-2013 )@@  MLoMNIMEWION  alcigomesglalo  aflaflw
MoRISM & U IO (0] (\0) @R (HH A (AIIROMEBRS] T3 52-630830
MREEIB8EN)0 79 Galoellnl  9630MWMNAREN)0  alBIGEHTIE)BHW)0
@R(BHAOMI@  5,25,000 ©)al@)OS MOUDMaUSA)ENBON)HDI0 BalD@G)6NTs.
@R(HA6ERS)20QI] MIMWOQlS 28 Galo® G@ROYY ©alWTS)6N:.

(w0l il Blaoeem: @@l (1)O)@ORO®  (MVoRAIEBBSIEM)

GHOSOIG M) MSMIOBIMNEIBIENMMD. MWAMVEO AMWIEGTIMI®EMN
Mo &HEMALOOTD @RAIMOWO6M). meaaued 0010 1W1ed

OO RMEBBUBHE) (alGQIUDMoO M@3Hymley, a)0.af)@3.a[).000)6)S



Gal$Uem@d  quoadlom  @R&®E®  Hglalsymlal  emog  Mloamue
sndeflzadmilond mooa:uem ARIETRIQEIM H06Mo AIBOAIBHEMO.
@)QURM  MVoPAISMO  (AlUBCMERBMEMOD  E'ldO0(BHAemMadeM  Galoallmd

MSE®M@. (@] 100 asmles eruB»esoledimammiled  (remad

Dalcoilaj®)o Oalo)USlDRlS 60} ealemd)Slow ®ajlaj®)o @MV
oM  @)anaileom  mela@leyes aeElQlsla) e&02/008  (Voalaj®)o
@ E6BRQ0 (@1 GaHWIBAOAOEM). LI H6) SNIGIRE) ENTol )
af).0ag).060l.af)al. MuoMuadm (el eaWleeed CHICBZ
@U@ WIEd  allasleruailalnen). aldleals  ©altNdH)SHe8W)o0
OOH(S1®  (aIUROM&HCOW)o  2ABGE1EHM MO0 Al0)FVAEEO T OO
Msalsl qufleE1ee)M@IM)ald:0o @R@IM  &)SIM@3Ee)Mm  qVAlalmMao6em
MBH608 MHAEO)MT).  HO)MINASSIVIOL! af)o.af)B.0). VI e
630a01M0  @eSla)) @HGO® (Moo GRERIMDO AU aJATTIW)OS  (VORD
OGN SIQOIIVEA IS MSals) aqulledlaflal. MoMAIME D)
0ald®)0aH(STR)LIf0  oOHHla)OEHEME)0  EHIMBWNAYIO  aldOMIO 0o
SHOOM)M)E&Hlajjo DYEUIAOD] V@ LTVIW® allrlBEm] 00=]Qla]  G@REMI
adeMmo  GMAEISeMo.  W.eeALaf)al.eaf).—af).0af).0e.af)al.  (AlQUGTDE:60
catoellmd 2d3laj® MuosniTWla] rUANAI® @REMIaHEMo MSMMEMo. ag)o.
0()@8.09).@)6S 639a01m0 MWTlajlaj@l) MaHSaldhoooo MEBHHIM)0 @GNS

@ROQY ©219)M)o MSalS] Mufledkeeemo.



(V0. GHOSIGWE] 6nU0RIH aieMd: (lEajoBS@ aldoM@S MUoE(alaH6eMo

PN al®laloslwyes aul.awl. NUaDYAOMOS Malles0)6s
@RM)AGCWIS)H)S] CGAUDAJOTTD) AW B6)aMN).
@R TONI)0 afl=leimauyo Q) aja(o)]

(W) @)@  ©0WId aHeMd): MOAMVEH®  MoMITWla)8s

en3elRm@ay  0leajods  a0)adMeqls  Malleeeo  @rdleilajlg)ens.
af)-0ag).060.af)al.  (AIAURTMGHOV®Io M (al®IMWsHo8Wlo adGElaj®)o
ag)o. af)@. af). 000)0S 62a01MU  ERY@A]@AIW  MoRMUIEBRSIGS
@REMIaHeMo MSOM] MSals]  qLI1&E1Ee)M@oEM.  G@REMIaUEM  VoCal
Oolem ©@10)a0MERE8MMVE1aJo6Mm 6000 CHMUIR)0 (alO®he8 Mluniw]
SOIMO@.  00aH(STVEAICIORIW  @YBEOIAIEMEBBEBIOS @RAUOClafl]ld]
SN @RSIVMMO (aIGAo MVRIMSAISIG;:UE MIBEMIU] 2102 ©216Q)MNE
@Qluoyalay.

wol. gl all. 00e=R«: el (@ MSaN  AVACOEVHH)Gla]

@RE)MO  AUdlapawl)es allwaleemo  6@JIRLOEEMILMEAIEM).
@M)G0980 (W.eeAl.af)ad.eaf). (IUBOMEA@ @RUdOM MUGIWOIES Ml
(&Sm0 emuBegolwdln)  aymiloaiomlwealodamem  ((DEMW)o
2010108 1W)o DalcWInla] ®SWOM caallm) (ala)). M@ Galoallmd
DEBLOMMUACOIS  (AlGHOalM@NBIL6)aN  Caloellmvlom  a0gemeaa)
@RAUUDYOSC|OUB  af)o.af)©@B.af). @YOHEMMOIONTMEGHIMNB@OM  allel
Galorlln)@®o@ af)om 2laflg)d@)o aHBS aellafid100m (voalee)dw)o
0al0®).  af)o.af)@B.af).  @IBHO)GaloL)o  MVodMHUeMo  eElaeymmlal.

catoelimileal (&lMen®es 9aleouilaf)edoems qVACHM® GMOISId



(Loalee)ME@ AIWEL MIMWeR]S Gl PEBLONMNBEHBOTOO MSalS]
S @lee6mo.

@)y ((Wol. 28 2106nE]l): VLO8OA Qfla¥®@o  MUoeNINWa]

a0 &HYleom FlaaUEBEBSIT8 AlOTM 00 468BS1TICHMN DO IMTIH6)
HQM.  HI00] 9SAHSYOS  (AUTMANAOW]  NUITWOQ]S ©NE  (aldOUUD 0

(0. WlWEME MOWA ageam QUM  &HMEIO)M). 9-7-2012-@3 OO
uosnIWla]j mlealdMo M@3HOMo  26-11-2012-@G3 0QIMY) QUdb)afid

(w)o meamml)o aillgla] GHOMMan0MAVIGd  aleES)EnIMIAI6M
AUMMIgI8S@). H100] DSAHE)OS (alWdMo MoeIMUWlaf NAUMBEANT ©6ME)(AlD
Qoo G061Man03m) 18 f) ) 5)HW)0 oQImy) QIO
QUd)afiElE3mIan)o OOO) BB DO H6) B W) 0 B2l ens.
(0O lWEM3 MmoWA ag)eam QIO B6ENMEEa0U3 MUEI®O moWaA
SH1OSWIMNEBOW]0) MO @YBEOJaleMo  dOIWAL  2)elyA(B]IWeS
80a01U1E8 MN0ailaflg)88 emie: 1000 HeRIAIEM. @RMIM HOGHHIUloU)
el (afl-(aflanomBay  emoglay 69al  @RAMIESUMIEE agloMalgl BaM)o
alow)mlegm 2o(@ag] (Lol MIWA ageaM AIIM)EIEMYIM @M@ M)

@M af)o. 6. W). HOTVD EalYHW)o MSaldS GHIMU HalW® 40 LldHo

0)alW)OS 6aldd) HBHISIEN)HW)0 O2lW@)OUMIEM alOEG]1H6)NO).

(WOIWEM MOIWMEIOS AUBSTTE af)P)@] @®QI0IBE] CHISOIWIT 6)0S) BT
al00®WT8 26 AW)ES H0050 aloeEmISlel. @R@ICS @)eUya(Di] ag)om
aflomls  agi9)@eajdomyenisdlane 60y DmMIaui@d  Galdeho ealvdglal.

CGHIS®] @O GRG&GMVAIS 2l ®Ig)6eNs. @) D(D@)o  BRYERITOO



AUd)aja((w)o @@ @R 3o weloeemmm (@ ]ald¥  (alal®6Mo
QUMI@)®0 AlE)ELAEM. O &)FOEUIGIIMBS AT ITVEWEM.

al.  alleed: @RSIVINO  (aICR® 2102JYB6ISWIGE  BIVO8IA

Qle@)20W] MIMWOA]S (ATlalHH DalEM@OIQ] B0} HOB MVall®o 6©)
aul.aw] ruadailay). @e@loMmEe)0laj MR (VoaVIG1Es)o.
WM IO )0 mleaalo _aIMMIBEI6MA)o U)oy

(WO &db. afo. @o6em]): (@]laldd Oal@M@OQ]  alO6II @00 \683U3

@PSIMOIM Eadl®Ro6em.  @)6UAMWIA0Q] MSOMIQ &)S1Ee0$ 210 E6)
GUOaH@O6M STo BMVOBIAB SIS af)(Mm WIEM QUOYBHIUWEHM@IMO6)
(@ laldto (V0AlEO)ME@). G@RO E®QOEM. 2)AIA(BIOW (VOlWEM MOWA
SO6MYM® 09-07-2012-2106M.  @P@IM) M(Bal 25-06—2012-C3C®HEOON
2)0.6.®) OOTV(MB O21QY)BHW)o 40 BldHo O)al OBHSIAUVE9)BHWI0 HalV ).
o® Useled  emoglnuled alo@)m SO M06M. (TN Tg(o] [Dl)
HOEMM@IM) )M @O af)ejd MSaldS)HSlo MSAN). 26UV HE
OOR0W] B0) WSalos)alal.

(al@®laled  em@oal (1. all. agay. @Ra@®IMMBM): @RSIWIMO

(0G0 ANlaH@EDIN) 2)6UAMTIW)0 BRHEBYIDO U)o jA(TTIW)0 MOTBL1W
20)alSldH U8 RIERIBHEM06M.  MELUIAHIIOS BEMWRIGMIGS MIam) aIam
GHOMBNIT EM@IQT B0) OalNMBB)SIO® @aNM Byuoy@dem  sl.ail-wflad
HH6N20). OO CHOSOMIM  @RAIDIMAIEM. GMI8IA8  @Zlajy20w]
NITWea]S  e6em5lafleemm  eaigloqs)ome)&aoem  (Vlwem  Mmowad

QEIQOIWIIENepplo) MRWEHSHOMo  al)0@®)o MM alal@emo



MSEB6H66MEICle)N  2)OA(TOSO@O0  Ealdellry  eHeqys)oisial.
catoellmilom  9ale@otila] 00aH(STR (@R IV®:68  @RSlaad@]
CHISIHE)S OASla] 20af)Qla] OHHUOASIODT) HO)OO)G). 2)6UIA(V]
©0Z1Ua] 2R)WlaH @ @REMIaHEMo GMAISINE @QIOIBHEMo.

(26U (o 01U HOEMOAMMINID 0a]S (@ ald:300(NEBRUT
BANSH0  MIaN)AIMeals  Mallee0)es  waVIMEI@d  cimmymlam
(30D Jo Aflglef MVEIMSAISIHUE @STIOS)O016E6MNEN} M @MIED
NIa0}RIMB|S Malleed £000laloqlSlewleal @rS)Om OMOWICLIWH6)
&HSaM).)

(VORVEHUEMIBHEY

(1) »uBad MS)BHEGd cRoell HalW®mAUE)MAdSs Bldcalsoel alldslor

(0oL, af)(1d. ag). omailee)a: NWBal MOS)HS1Gd

aleM1eWS)H86) M UGH6 2 il 1EMoMaN0Wo M @) M@ IMONUUD § AW
Mo lWOMM)ENROBE6Mo.
(20)alS] GRUDaOOD)la)).)
(emoglmd  m@dsslloym @RoWo amuiglailelo@leym@moos
©EN302OED (VORLHHUEM]EHT @PAIOGaflee6qaisal.)

(@l SHUNINOBOODEDSBM  ©dafleal  10.57-0) TVE @M
MRQECOWHS  MRODIUQDBOHW)o  11.56-M  MIa0)RIMeR]g MUalles

016S @REDJEHHUOWIGS al)NOIO0E]IE)HWI0 OalDM).)



0)8lol)

NUa0)AIMO|S ATIW)OS alEIAGU0 AUNT@)@IalOAEQI0M

@R)B0IaleMo

2l.  alleed: OMeal @RSIVINI0 (AW 2182)0 GUSWIE]

@R Mmoo AllZlaimm)o AU )alAT] 60) HSEIDIU  CAUDA0MM)(al)
OBHIENE  MSOWWalooadUdo AUTI@@alEReQIM) (al@laléHo 6aloleng
(RLWIBBeqS)EmIloymm). 2010 AWlmvoeni@ 14-0%0 ®l@IWleal my)
DADYM  af)BMV(IQY  al@0lol  20886dlolt)  anlafoled  aIMm  60)
AlOMUIOBIM @ROMOE® MELIAOH] MO B0) TVEMBUDHDBINE)O12jo6)
] (alo@DIG  alE2@UD]a]o). (MO®  all@O®1ed  S’lo
GMO8I0IOM B0l )88 ailuoemalio @RAICIOS M) aldMilo agMA]
@0eMEOR OMVAZB WWOHS0)OS BO) CRIELUMOTIM)o ®IOY agMAe]

2oeM=Eead OMMBA (CO BRIV OISO  2010-6&!  agMd]

HSHEMMBBUAHNT @RAIOBMW VoM Wla] aldMi)o MT3EIQIOIMM). @R
Al JOB12106m @M IGINEIW ) @RIOBMW CRMISHOS
@REINME]a))OEH06MRI88 @RAMEOG M)6LIA((HIWIOS TVEMBYIo AIMIS)S8SO).
@PAIIAW ERMIBHSITS STo GILOBIB ©UBOASIM®IW] Hoemyamlg).  Slo
eMOgo0lomEN0lafigs allaloemale @@IOM  aloMuja)o  all@OE3
OAEMead alomyomlm) 2)&Elenel Aamig8s® APWMEHICITd Slo
GMO8IB  &B0) mmm&@c@ @RoMIH @  oBRMBMVIWIHEMM  TVoUdWo

20]a{leedm oW eWISS®IW]E)S] 2103 Alleiwlo)Em)m).



10

(6n1a0)@0Mea]s MUallee0)es 0)Elowiled GROIAIG]  CO6UAIS)ET]

(al@]aldi00(NEBRU MNlaNSBo Ua}OH06NE10) M BB Malleod

quenIala¥M) B3 0F ©210O®IW] @ROIWIEe)HW)o GRRMRWIORI G@RS)OT

MSalSeSICRIVES &SE)GHW)o HalD®).)

dleajods muadalemo

(1)

(2)

(3)

2012-2013-681  WMIRLBMAM:SB)OS  alGlEUoOWMm  (uoeMWla

©6N200@  0leajodsleal  wo)aldduodElecmanss qUNIRGHS &g
Xl —o08 @Gryeud eseeed 01cajods muadalleveals).

avmirss  saldl  Xll-ead  @oevajow)am  dleajodgyeud

M2Ba{lee6a]s).

1. 2013 20@2] 31 AWOOWISS GRM)&Lild: Glea ods

2. 2012-2013-6R1 WMIRLAMNMGHSB)OS  al@lGUdOWM (Mo UWla
©6N200® 016ajod31eal (0)aldBBHSICENSS GRYH:UM CSHHEND
0lea]ods.

alenfles)  @RHOVMNSM  HIGIWES  DO)AICHOWIMIB 2O OD

2)o O]} AUOOW)SBS G1Eaod5)& 08 MR {lE66aS).

$HIGO}0aIGBUE MAI®] 018ajod5leal 10)ald@UVG:U8 CERUOI

£2lQ)IN@) oMW a]

eyl (0. 9omad  al0enz]): “aued MSalSlE®Ud  MVYNERIW]

MSODNOEHIENBYBAlOHIM  HFIWIT® M0N0 M06M  MIIMI@dL6)M).

OO IMBo®meOan 2013 =6 17, 18, 19, 20, 24, =eeal 8 oM



1

oloolsgloal mlaUINMIHU alBa) H)S0O® ald(YICSHME] AUIClGHW)o
2)6n0 25 QYOG 2166l 7 Ueo ruEd rueIA8Mo
MR U CHHMEIURHD)0 H2IW®). OMN)o @RE® MIRIAldS EMMMI6EM
(a@lalétto  MUAB0)oflolee)M@. MIATLVEY (LEMSMo  MVINAAIW]
MSOM BN BAlIBHIMN@IM (@ aldHddd]  CMMIBHS)R0QS]  21@a
MSEB]OWEs1R)0 MVANIWHEALIIO® M1alaldsoem @G MUS&:Cla)d. olel
(alWOMOa|s  WMHony  enilmilmm®8le  BOAWIMMAVIM)  alé:02)88

7 enflad8)o alBleM1ee)M@IM)@GIMM  AlWET1RI06M 0G0 0alCRUdE:

mal@w)es 13-00®) 0lGa odg]ed (0)al0B VD 021 ®0)MM®.
BOEMARISMIAl0AIW @ROUUDY WM enflaulmn ) B3 e
al) @18 Gleeeenzm)6ns. mewlod mlanilenss  mualmlaileudato

MUEO MSalSld U3 MNAIW] MSEWIOGOETE EaldHH)MN@IM MVANIW L.

@@IMOG3  H06OY0aIGRUH (UAlIW)es 13-00®  Oleajodgleal  uE
@Ro1d:0lay (0)aldBUOBHUE CRBVMI B2IW@ 2013-6081 GHO8 WMEI0)
enilgjjo  2013-621 GHO8 WM (2-00 MmmuA) enfleo  qLENIRSHS

Sldles  ERUEHO®  DINOOHAN  alBlNEMMWOBHS)HHEMOAN)0

@RHHI0 O 1MW CHOS maMVEW)6s MSalSl&Haalo
#0018 anemal)o MuosniaWla] algeemslear 75, 153 A(D) aigenud
@@ HH0/H20W MVIIBINE HalQemenm)o 2106l 16, 17 ®1d]egod
OLOO(HA0  al@lnemlesomleym  2013-14 el MIWRJICRIYH)SS

DalMIRB@MOM®SB)0  @R@IOM  MLoUMWIENM  2013-621  GHOS



12
wmadlmlewon (3-90 mmud) enflelo HAMI@EM
Al@lNEMMWOBHS)HNM@IM)o @YUM MSalsS] TUlBGE1BE1Ee M@ 1N}
oD M. ®10)a0MmBeYMmM)” Al (aIGA®o @RAIMGlee)am).

@R)ERLMMOA)0 adl=leindau)o Q) afjao]

(W2 @EYAUIEANB EOWIEaHEMMB): (AIGRWOE allM06BBIIMN).

(alGRA@o (MUER @RoU1d>Gla).

MamIBea06mM &0 o

©969a]j0@)aN nilan&8 MVMIRES Ho2g1H0 EPWWHHEMEAM

(aIGO®o

(1) 2013-621 CHOS WMEIO 6nilad

(2) 2013-621 GHO8 WML (2-90 MMUA) nil@d

WM Q)0 meaalo _aMMIBEMIEMA)o U)oy

(W), &d. ag)o. mo6emM): 2013-681 GHOS WM Nil@d 2013-681 CHOS

WMy (2-00 MmauB) 6mil@d agMIU  AIBlNEMMWOBHS)HEHEM ORI
(G20 @RAIOOa{lee)0m).
S aHl®)o AYNMOOHHUEMA0 @B SIW)o BILHMOIW)o AU )aAT]

(0. B.all. BGRIAOMM): (AICRWHED llTmo6BRIaM).

(IGO0 VR @R 1B® ).

enilg)) B3 alBlEMMWeE6S)O1).



13

(1) 2013-621 CHOS WM\ enilod

2)0M90 Qldb)a]

WM IO )0 mleaalo _aIMMIBEI6MA)o Q) ajao]

(WOl . ago.  @06m]): ©®069ajoW)aN  BVEBROWIE  CEARNO

@O a{leeyam;.

In clause (i) of sub-section (2) of section 4 of the Kerala Money
Lenders’ Act, 1958 (35 of 1958), proposed to be substituted by
sub-clause (1), for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the words “six

thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

2((®] @RAI®Glafla) 8DEBJ0WE: GRROMI MVE @ROW1E:®]ay).

CRBVM] 0alT® (AlHIOMBS 3-00 Qldla] enilafleomd VAW
@01 ® ).

MoLI%0 QUdh)a]

WM OO Yo mleaalo _aImmdmmoemal)o QU )ajao]

(WOl 0. ago.  m06ml): @609 0@  8DeE3LVle:  CERU®I

@RAU®Ga{leeyam;.

(1) In section 28 of the Kerala Stamp Act, 1959 (17 of 1959), proposed
to be amended by item (a) of sub-clause (2), for the words “fair value of

the property”, the words “fair value of the land” shall be substituted,;



14

(2) for sub-clause(3), the following sub-clause shall be substituted,

namely:-

“(3) in section 29,-

(a)

(b)

(©)

in sub-section (1), the following words shall be added at the
end, namely”-

“or on the fair value of each such separate part and
value of all other properties therein including building, if any,
whichever is higher,”;
in sub-section (2), the following words shall be added at the
end, namely-

“or on the fair value of such separate part and value of
all other properties therein including building, if any,
whichever is higher,”;
in sub-section (3), the following words shall be added at the
end, namely”-

“or on the fair value of the property and value of all
other properties therein including building, if any, whichever

is higher,”;

(3) for sub-clause(6), the following sub-clause shall be substituted,

namely:-



15

“(6) in section 39, in clause (b) of sub-section (1), for the words
“five rupees”, occurring in both places, the words “ten rupees” shall be
substituted.”;

(4) in the Schedule to the Kerala Stamp Act, 1959 (17 of 1959),
proposed to be amended by sub-clause (7),-

(i) after item (b), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(ba) in serial umber 17, for the entry in column (3), the
following entry shall be substituted, namely:-

“One rupee for every rupees
1000 or part thereof, of the value

of the share, scrip or stock, as the
case may be.”;

(i1) in serial number 21, proposed to be substituted by item (c) of
sub-clause (7), after item (iii), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:-

“Provided that if the conveyance relates to any transfer of
undivided share of any land and refers to any agreement relating to
the construction of any building or part of building, including flat
or apartment or room etc., the value of such building or such part

of the building shall also be included in such consideration, and the



16

stamp duty if any paid in respect of such agreement shall be
deducted from the stamp duty payable for the conveyance.”;

(ii1) in serial number 22, proposed to be substituted by item (d)
of sub-clause (7), after item (vi), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:-

“Provided that if the conveyance relates to any transfer of
undivided share of any land and refers to any agreement relating to
the construction of any building or part of building, including flat
or apartment or room etc., the value of such building or such part
of the building shall also be included in such consideration, and the
stamp duty if any paid in respect of such agreement shall be
deducted from the stamp duty payable for the conveyance.”;

(iv) after item (g), the following item shall be inserted,
namely:-

“(ga) in serial number 44, in clause (f), for the entries against
it in columns (2) and (3), the following entries shall, respectively,

be substituted, namely:-

“(f) | When authorising a person| The same duty as a
other than his father, mother, | conveyance (No.21 or 22, as

wife, husband, son, | the case may be) for the fair




17

daughter, brother or sister to | value of land or for the amount
sell any immovable property | of the consideration,
or giving authority or power | whichever is higher or the
to a promoter or a developer, | estimated cost as certified by a
by whatsoever name called, | Chartered Engineer of
to make constructions or |proposed  construction  or
develop, sell or transfer (in | development or such property,
any manner whatsoever) any | as the case may be.”.

immovable property situated

in Kerala

2] @RAI®Glafla) 8DEBJ0WE: GRROMI MVE @ROW1E:®]ay).

CRBVM] 0alT® (AlHIOMBS 4-00 Qldla] enilafled conaoW

@01 ® ).
@RE™UJ0_Qldb)a]
WM OO Yo mleaalo _ammdmmoemal)o Q) ajao]

(WOl 0. ago.  m06ml): @609 0@  8DeERLVlE:  CERU®I

@R a{leeyam;.

For section 69A of the Kerala Court Fees and Suits Valuation Act,
1959 (10 of 1960), proposed to be inserted by sub-clause (2), the
following section shall be substituted, namely”-

“69A. Refund of court fee in case where the dispute is settled

under section 89 of the Code of Civil Procedure.- Where a suit, appeal



18

or other proceeding before any court is settled by recourse to section 89
of the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (Central Act 5 of 1908), the whole
court fee paid on the plaint/Memorandum of Appeal or other
proceedings, except in interlocutory matters, shall be ordered by the
court to be refunded to the parties concerned by whom the court fee was
paid.”.

2@ @RAI®Glafla) 8DEEJ0WE: GRROMI MVE @ROW1E:®]ay).

CERVM] 0alT® (AlHIOMBS 5-00 Qldla] eilaflemd conaoW

@0 e 0la)).
af)§90 Qldh)a]
WMHOO QYo mleaalo _aImmldmmoemalyo QU)o ao)]

(WOl 0. ago.  m06ml): @09 0@  8De3LVlE:  CERU®I

@R {leeyam;.

For sub-clause (3) by which it is proposed to amend section 6 of
the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of 1976), the following
sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(3) in section 6,-

(a) in sub-section (4), for the existing provisos, the following

provisos shall be substituted, namely:-



19

“Provided that all assessments relating to the years upto and
including the year 2007-08, pending as on 31% March, 2013, shall be
completed on or before 31" March, 2014:

Provided further that in cases where any investigation or inquiry is
pending under this Act or where any assessment cannot be completed
within the period specified under this section, the Deputy Commissioner
may, for good and sufficient reasons, extend the period of completion of
the assessment including escaped assessment under sub-section (5)
beyond the period specified in this section.”;

(b) in sub-section (5), for the words and symbol “hotel/house

boat”, the word “proprietor” shall be substituted.

2] @RAUOCla{la) 80e3LUlE: GRRV®I ME @RV 1B 0a)).

CRRVON 621T® (alHO02)S8 8-00 Qd)a] 6nilallend conAOWI
@018 0la).

al®™m9%0 Qldh)a]

WM 0 )0 mlwaalo _aIMMIBEI6MA)o QU )aja(o]

(WOl . ago.  @06em]): @069ajoW)aN  BVEBROWE  CEARNO®

@A a{leeyam;.



20

In section 8 of the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of
2004), proposed to be amended by sub-clause (2), before the item (a),
the following item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(A) in clause (b), for the letter and word “M-Sand”, the words
“Manufactured sand” shall be substituted;”;

(2) in section 18B of the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of
2004), proposed to be inserted by sub-clause (4) of clause 10,-
(i) in the first proviso,-
(@) initem (c), the word “and” shall be omitted;
(b) after item (c), as amended, the following items shall be
inserted, namely:-
“(ca) other dealers referred to in sub-section (1) of
section 6;
(cb) companies; and”;

(i) for the second proviso, the following provisos shall be
substituted, namely:-

“Provided further that hospitals run by charitable institutions which
avail exemption under the Income Tax Act, 1961 (Central Act 43 of
1961) and purchasing medicines from compounded dealer after paying

tax under clause (e) of section 8 shall be exempted from tax on their sale



21

of such medicines and on the sale of laboratory store items and
consumables to their patients:

Provided also that, with regard to such hospitals which were liable
to take registration under this Act, but had not taken registration till 31%
March, 2013 shall get itself registered on or before 30" June, 2013 to
avail the concessions as per the forgoing proviso for the period from 1%

April, 2005 to 31% March, 2013.”;

(3) after sub-clause (7), the following sub-clause shall be inserted,
namely:-

“(7A) in section 48, in sub-section (1), the following sentence shall
be added at the end, namely:-

“A fee of one hundred rupees shall be payable to Government on
each transit pass so issued.”.”;
(4) in sub-clause (8), in item (c), after sub-item (iii), the following
sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(it1A) in serial number 93, in item (1), after sub-item (b) and the
entries against it in columns (2) and (3), the following sub-item and
entries shall, respectively, be inserted, namely:-

“(c) Edible soya chunks manufactured FhdIKT



22

from soya bean oil cake/meal
(@] @PAI®Glafla) 8DEB WG RO MVE @ROW1G:®]ay).

CRRVMN 0alP® (alHO0MSS 10-00 Qd)a] enilejlomd conaow]

@018 0la).
al@1OMIMo0_Qldb)a]
WM Q)0 mloaalo _aIMMIBEI6MA)o U)oy
(0. &, afo. m6em]): @OOPa|OWM  BDERJONH GRRVOM] A
@RA®Glafleeymm;.

For clause 11, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

11. Levy and collection of cess on wedding celebrations.- (1) There
shall be levied and collected a cess to be called Mangalya Nidhi Cess on
every wedding and its connected celebration conducted in hotels having
the classification of three star and above or in auditoriums with a seating
capacity of above five hundred including that of dining halls, at the rates

specified in the Table below, namely:-

TABLE

(i) | Hotels of three star and above Rs.10,000/-

(it) | Air conditioned auditorium situated in Municipality area | Rs.10,000/-

(ii1) | Air conditioned auditorium situated in Panchayat area Rs. 7,500/-

(iv) | Other auditoriums situated in the area of Municipality Rs. 5,000/-




23

(v) | Other auditoriums situated in Panchayat area Rs. 3,000/-

(2) The cess shall be collected from the person from whom the
charges or rent for such celebrations are received by the proprietor of
such hotel or auditorium, as the case may be, and shall be remitted to
Government Treasury in the Head of Account of Mangalya Nidhi on or
before the 15" day of every month.

(3) The proprietor of such hotel or auditorium shall file a statement
in such form as may be prescribed and submit the same along with the
proof of remittance of Mangalya Nidhi Cess to the assessing authority
under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of 1976) having
jurisdiction over the area, on or before the 15" day of every month. He
shall also keep a register containing the details of remittance of
Mangalya Nidhi Cess in such manner as may be prescribed.

(4) The statement referred to in sub-section (3) may be filed and the
amount of cess may also be paid electronically by the proprietor through
the website of the Commercial Taxes Department, Government of
Kerala.

(5) The proprietor of the establishment entrusted with the collection

of the cess shall apply for obtaining a unique identification number to



24

the assessing authority under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32
of 1976) having jurisdiction over the area where such establishment is
situated, in such manner as may be prescribed and the assessing
authority shall allot the same to the establishment.

(6) Where any proprietor of a hotel or an auditorium as stated in
sub-section (1) permits any person to conduct a wedding celebration
without the payment of cess under this section, such proprietor shall be
liable to pay such amount of cess as if he had conducted the wedding
celebration and such amount shall be recovered from him as if it is an
arrear due from him under the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 (32 of
1976).

(7) The Government may, after due appropriation made by the
Legislature by law in this behalf, utilise such sums of money for the
purposes specified in the Mangalya Nidhi Scheme framed by the
Government.

Explanation.- For the purpose of this section,-
a. the word “proprietor” shall include the person who for the
time being is in-charge of management of such hotels or

auditoriums, as the case may be;



25

b. the word “auditorium” shall include hall and
kalyanamandapam also;
c. the word “prescribed” means prescribed by rules made by the
Government in this behalf.
(8) The provisions regarding the assessment and recovery of tax in
the Kerala Tax on Luxuries Act, 1976 shall mutatis mutandis apply to
the assessment and recovery of cess under this section.

All other changes are verbal or consequential.
2] @RAOClafla) 806310UlE: GRRV®I ME @RoW 1B Oa)).

CRRVON 6alT® (alH0MSS 11-00 Qld)a] endlajlod oW

@01 @1a)).
80MN20_Qld)afio allOlHW)o Gal®)o
WM OO Yo mleaalo _camMMI@aoemal)o Qldh)afya(o]

(WOl o, ago.  m06eml): @609 0@  8DeERLVle:  CERUO

@RA®Glafleeymm;.

For clause 1, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Kerala Finance Act, 2013.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, clauses (ba) and (ga) of

sub-section (7) of section 4, sub-section (7A), sub-clause (iiiA) of clause



26

(c) of sub-section (8) of section 10 and section 11 shall come into force
at once and the remaining provisions of this Act shall be deemed to have

come into force on the 1* day of April, 2013”.

2] @RAI®Glafla) 8DEBJ0WE: @GRV MVE @ROW1E:®]ay).

CRRVD] 6alU® (alHI0)88 1-00 Qldlafio allCl&H®)o  Gald)o
enfleflond conaW] @Row1H:01a)).

WMHOO Qo mleaalo _aImmldmmoemalyo QU)o ao]

(WO._od. ofo. @06M]): 2013-621 EHOS WMBHO0, NIlEd AldqVIBHEMORN

(lG2®o @RAIOOa]lee)am).
SaHl@)o AFOMOOHUMONo @R SIW)o EIYAHMOIW)o Qldb)a]}aTo]

(). O, all. BRAOMM): (AIGRAWEDE® allamo6B3)M).

2013-621 GHO8 WMy M3  AlBlNEMMWOBHS)HHEMEAAN
(AIGQ@o (MR @RoU 1@ ]a]).
enfl@d Ve aldqOB6].

(2) 2013-621 GHO8 WM (2-00 MMUAB) enil@d

N80 Qldhlallo B8N0 QAldhlafio all0l®H®)o Gal®)o

©@6N200  Qldh)ajio BMIo QAldlaflo allol®:®io  Gald)o enflajleond
oo MVE @R 1d®1a)).
WMHOO QYo mlaalo _ammldmmoemalyo QU)o Ao)]

(0. Od. aflo. @mo6eml):  2013-081 BHO8 WM (2-00 MMUA) 6enilad

aloqUIBHIMOAM (G0 @RAIMGaflenym).



27

SyaHl@)o AJOMOOHUMAo @R SIW)o EIYHMOIW)o Qldb)a]}aTD]

(). O.all. BGRIAOMAB): (AICRWODTD allmI68BYM).

2013-621 CHO8 WM (2-00 MMIA) 6nil@d aldqIBOHEMOERM

(AlCQWo (GO MVE @RoU1d®1a]).
enfl@d Ve aldqOS6].

WM OO0

2013-14 QLIMUO 1B AURHE YD) emm‘)’ag]cselmggg

DalWMICIAMOHOS MoNIMUWIHH)M alB@ajW)o GAOSS)af)o

2013-14 MLOMUOTD s QUG U6 YD) nIwRg1celfn)Ss

DallMIR B@OM U3 @M)UB1eeEM e (AlGO®o IS
AUdh)aja(m20dee)calenEl WMol Mlwane cAMMId2AdeMAl)o

U} )AD]  @PAUOGIalE0)&H®)o @R allMDIBBEOAS)HW)0 62lW@).
momuoom  mlwame agan l-00 moud wmoeid@umw)esw)o
(MoMNOM BOEMOAIAUMOIAG, AMWIAIB, @PTUAIM DEGBLOMMUAMOIB af)(Mm

[1-00 mmud wmoeidmoum)eswio MIGIMo® MIBQjeosmo agam 111-00

MMUG  WMIRIAGNMWIHSWI0  &HIBaHlHIBIW M@)o  AilEdalm

Mo @llo oM V-00 Mm@ wmoeid@mamw)esw)o 2)(Ba|(@68B8)0
oZlmiesaumio agyam  Vll-00 mmud@ wmoeidmnmwiesw)o  aioaom
M @HB  agan [ X-00 maud wmoeid@umw)esw)o  (Saudl®:8)o

@RHODVENR)HB)o af)m X—-00o MMUB WMIRLBOMWOSW)o =lalogoemalyo



28
alelus®io agam Xl-00 mmud wmoeidomiesw)o Galoeflms agmm
Xll-00 moud wmoei@mumw)esw)o eQUaHMOI®)o @RSI®o AQ) BOEM
alo2o@  qudQlruysglo agyam XIV-0o mmud wmosydmomwiesw)o
020020 o) XV-00 Mm@ WMIBIBGNMW)HSW)o HallBaUM)o
aleius®io agm XVI-00 moud wmoeidmomw)eswio aflayoeyomo

SH0Ballemoso, e,  momI®ono  agm  XVIl-00  moud

WMORIBAMNMWASW)o  HOAUBLMVANIWAN0  HAlI@RMEOIWNIAY0  af)m

XV -o00 maud WMOBLROLOMW)HSW)0 wyeLReIal®EEMA)o
w)all®oemallo  agan XX-00 mMUE WMIRIBOOMWIESW)o @AM
mdemoemo agym XXl-00 maud wmoridmammieswio MwoANGTUMo
agan  XXll-oo mmud wmoeidmomwieswio  aRdEmOAN®OEMA)0
(alatosmano agam XXI-00 maud wmoeydmomwieswio emoslelo

oooslenglesunnlo  (alomilesuanlo  agm  XXIV-00  mmud

WMIRIBMOMWOSWIo AalSlehROM/algld: AW 2Q) allemods /M fyMald

aNeoweEswd agmlalo)es eeao agim XXV-oo mmud wmoeyd@mam
WOSW)o (aldl@lesuoco m)eImss B1Bl®mouIMEDIM agan XXV |-

mmud  WmoeyBMAM®IEsW)o  Ma0HoeMo  agimm  XXVIl-00 mmid



29

WMIRLAMIMW)OSWIo  alfld  TVOAUEIE: VARSIV ag)dm

XXVll-00 mmud wmosydmommiesw)o @iaidl agan XXIX-00 maud
WMIERBMOMW)OSW)0 BHH|o ag)(m XXX-20 Mm@
WMIRLRAOM®OSIo  ByMMUoddHemo  agim  XXXl-00  mmud
wmoeidmamw)eswio  eHloallemumo agan XXXIl-00 moud wmo
_y@@OMW)Os®)o a@ryenTwmo agam XXXI1-00 mmud wmogyd@am
wesw)o amo agm  XXXIV-oo mmid@ wmociderumw)esw)o
oo agan  XXXV-0o  omud  wmoeidmamm)esw)o
woaallesaumo  agan  XXXVI-00  moud  wmoridonmw)esw)o
ayamoweasud  aggem  XXXVIl-00 mmid  wmosydmomwiesw)o
2eieqvalmo agiam XXXVII-00 mmid wmoeydmamwoswio e6aic))®
aeD@N&WB agiom XXXIX-00 mmid wmoeidmomw)oswio @)00)6168303
agam XL-00 maud wmoeydmomwieswio w@In@o agom XLI-o0

maud wmoeidmamwiesw)o aflemosauemooo agam XLIl-00 maud

WMOBYRAMW)OSW)o MaHSAIBAN000N0 GRAIGIND HOHAIYEBBEBY0 ag)(m

XLIT-00 mmud@  wmogidmnumm)eswio  auomady auo&Ule@IAlo

eouano agm XLVI-00 mmud wmoeidmomw)eswio caiclad 201314



30

MLOMIOD | AUBHUODTD DalWMIBIBMAMMB:ES MosniTUWla] crugeanglad
(V@@  WMIRLBMNOMBHUBLO)EMO®  OLAJ(@Ro  &06Mlafl@lesnyan
MBHOUENBB  DalWMIBLBAOMEUE  @M)AUCIEHMODON  (AlGA®o MVUE
Al0IEe) B0 (VO BRMAIGIHNHW)0 H2IV®).
Mam1BE6M 00 0 (@)SB2)

2013-621 G608 wmailmlewown (3-050 maUA) miled

WM Q)0 mleaalo _aMMIBEMIEMA)o U)oy

(WO 8d. ago. moeml):  2013-021 GHOS8 WMAIMIeWIw (3-00 MMUA)

enfl@d @RAIGla{lee)om).

al. MWalleed: mniled @ealddlaflaflclesyan).

WM Q)0 mleaalo _caMMIBEIEMA)o QU)o )y

(WO 8d. ago. moem]):  2013-021 GHOS8 WMAIMIEWIw (3-00 MMUA)

nil@d aIBlNEMMWOBHSIHOMOAM (AIGAWo GRAUIMG]a{lee)m).
emoslelo alimowlalomual)o Q) aja(o]

(0. oHlenl) genuenil G2R06N3):  (AIGAWOOTD allM®o6813)(M).

(AlGa@o (MR @RoU 1@ ]a)).
@3 AlBlNEMMWOHHS) ).

@6N3)o @)MM)o QAld)afldhS)o alglé:®)o BMNIo QAldlallo

all0l&:@)o Bald)o

©6N3)o @)MMYo Qdh)afid8lo algléd®)o &M Qldlajio allole®)o

@al®)o enileflomd conadw] e @oou)ld:dlay).



31

WM Q)0 mleaalo _caMMIBEMIEMA)o U)oyl

(). 8. afo. @o6mM1): 2013-621 GHOB WMEIOY (3-00 MMUA) 6nilcd

aloqUOBHIMOAM (alEa®o GRAIM®lallee)m).
emosleno alimowlalomual)o U)oy

(007, oHlens) @enuenil GE206N3): (AIGRAWOOTD allMmo6813)(M).

2013-621 GHO8 WMy (3-00 mMMUA) NIlE3 AldTVISHEMORN

(AlGa@o (MR @RoU 1@ ]a)).

enfl@d VR aldqOB6].
26U (W) OS (AIGA®o

e @RMII® HILIGEMH al®lWIM@) VoMW a]

e (Wl 9 2106nEl): @RQUUOIRNOW  UWMEHIO

VIS8 VB a)BODIWIEHIW  TVOaN2IOJEMIED 2166l  18-00

@] aloo Mlmelafloymm qued  quemgmo ®M @eAITVOMIaflaj MUE
@rmluil® BHORIGOT V) H6) alldl@emeammm8s (aIGQ@o
@O a{leeyamy.

2. NWalleed: (aIeao VR @Ro»1d:®1ay).

Xlll-00  eoHo8 mamew)os 80Bal®oo  MVEASMHOHIGD

MURIMSalSl®He8H:)0laflo MR aldlemly] flaMWeEBes MVosnITWlaj)o
NIa0)2OMeals Malleed quosHlai® afllaloemo  M@3S). allmens
Glaluessud  que  quemglajioaldlelo alj@eNAOW]  MVED MSalSl: (3
MSMOAM) alo@OMOilegim)o WMIBYBGOMI 2lBafdhUBHH)CLMNEIW)SS

D MUEMSMOMIGE @REI WMIBIAMAME:U3 Q@AM  2I@a) 621Q)(3



32

HFODOGM)0 MIGBa]® WMILIAMOMBE)o  WMmallmlewow enileo WM
500y enilao alBa H)S0O® VB  aldQVIBOIHW)o  MILl enila)Hud
MUENIRGS HeR1PlHs CROYWENHW)0 HalWO@IW)o Al @RSV
(AICOWEBRU3ENBS @RAIMOMIMA®] @MIFINY  alGlNeM]a®o®)o Nian)
@0Meals Malleed @eolwla)).  @RoEEBRS)eS NSO OM)YSBM)
2lee BlaumuesBgle)o (LORLEHEMIBORNGS)o  MUENIAlAHUM)®:8)o @R
afleeomd  seleowilal.  21368BS8)ESW)0  HIFAULHOEBBB)ESWIo  @RSITOIM
OO]@d  @0(@o  (alUBOTEO}M  BaIGlOM  Ta¥alBH®MOW  MVEWHH
@RGH:OM0 all0OM)o G2ldBjo €2IQNAN @OOMIAN88 MIRlaldS)d03 RmMowl
@O0 M@3H)M  MUGMUdOo ) ®OW1C186)60a0M  af)ajonio)o
@RERI0a{lHeMeOAM) MIaN}AIMOF Malleed® @RE]I0WeA|S). MVoNIIE68R
8)GSW)0 2lBHB)BSW)0 CUGlWIGHENE MWATVR MVoCRIBaHBRS)
GSW)0 @RTV)ELUGONIW) (MoRAIEBBRE)ESW)o BAUGIWIG)M® (& 1WICRE:
2MIWal® EWIM  af) @COMIBo  B)aHUEMAIOEMAT)  ROEM /(@ ald:HIow
68308 aflovleoemem)ens.  2RMeEBRE81eS All®ovo alj@gNAoW)o  (aldSla]
c66 WO  MYAMEWITE GR@IMS8 TVMBABERANe MAVAC afald
QAO)o Gal@MN qUYAHUSICHOME@OMEMMBS OO0 BOHOTBNS] ag)2loql
coW)o 63982ila{lee)M®IW] @REGaN0 AlOETTM). MIaN)AIMealg Malleed
2)2/08al@H6)0 0oMOM @RYUDOMIGUE BMABM).

(e 92JPeEecUDato 12.13-M @RI MIMILINAIMEOINS @M

@@ £0LICEWES alldletm))



	H¼Xmw kt½f\\w
	ASn-b-´-c- {]-tabw
	\(1\)  KÄ^v \\mSp-I-fnÂ tPmen sNbvXp
	2013þse tIcf [\\-Imcy _nÂ
	\\memw hIp¸v
	A©mw hIp¸v
	F«mw hIp¸v
	]¯mw hIp¸v
	]Xn-s\\m¶mw hIp¸v
	Hotels of three star and above


	H¶mw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw


