
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

\nb-a-\nÀ½m-W-Imcyw 

 

k_vPIvSv I½nän dnt¸mÀ«v sNbvX {]Im-c-ap-ff 2012-þse tIcf 

kwØm\ tkh\mh-Imi _nÂ 

apJy-a{´n ({io. D½³ Nm−n): kÀ, k_vPIvSv I½nän dnt¸mÀ«v 

sNbvX {]Im-c-ap-ff  2012-þse tIcf kwØm\ tkh-\m-h-Imi _nÂ 

]cn-K-W-\-bvs¡-Sp-¡-W-sa¶ {]tabw Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p--¶-p. 

Irjnbpw arK-kw-c-£-Whpw A¨-Snbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw hIp-¸p-

a{´n ({io. sI.- ]n. taml-\³): kÀ, Rm³ {]ta-bs¯ ]n´m-§p-¶p. 

an. kv]o¡À: _lp-am-\-s¸« No^v an\n-ÌÀ A§v {]kw-Kn-¡p-

¶pt−m? 

{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, {]kw-Kn-¡p-¶n-Ã.  

 (hn-tbm-P-\-¡p-dn¸v Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡-s¸«n-Ã) 

{io. hn.- Un. kXo-i³: kÀ, k_vPIvSv I½nän dnt¸mÀ«v sNbvX-

{]-Im-c-apÅ 2012-þse tIcf kwØm\ tkh-\m-h-Imi _nÂ hopw 

AtX k_vPIvSv I½n-än-bpsS ]cn-K-W-\bv¡v Ab-bv¡-W-sa¶ 

t`ZKXn AhXcn-¸n-¡p-¶p. 

an.- kv]o-¡À: {io.-hn.-Un. kXo-i³, A§-bpsS 2(-_n) \¼À 

t`ZKXn {]Êv sN¿p-¶pt−m?  

{io. hn.-Un. kXo-i³: {]kv sN¿p-¶n-Ã. 

an. kv]o¡À: {io. hn.-Un. kXo-i³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 2(-_n) \¼À 

t`ZKXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbm-Sp-IqSn ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

k_vPIvSv Ia-anän dnt¸mÀ«v sNbvX {]Im-c-ap-ff 2012-þse 

tkh\m-h-Imi _nÂ ]cn-K-W-\-bvs¡-Sp-¡-W-sa¶ {]ta-bs¯ 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p¶hÀ.................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p¶hÀ................... 

{]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-̈ n-cn-¡p¶p. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

2

_nÂ ]cn-K-W-\-bvs¡-Sp-¡p-¶p. 

hIp-¸p-Xn-cn-¨pÅ ]cn-K-W\

2þmw hIp¸v 

 Shri. K. N. A. Khader: Sir, I move the following amendment. 
 

125. In clause 2(b) for the words “is eligible for” the word 

“require”  shall be substituted. 

 Shri. Palode Ravi:  Sir, I move the following amendments. 

126. Clause 2(b) shall be recast as follows:- 

             “applicant for service” “means a person who is an applicant 

for    services notified under section 3.”  

130 In clause 2(f), for the words “eligible person” the words 

“applicant for service” shall be substitute. 

 Shri. Benny Behanan: Sir, I move the following amendments.  

127.   In clause 2(c) delete the word “first”. 

128.   After clause 2(d), add the following: 

              “ (da)  Notifications means a notification in the gazette”. 

138.   Clause 2(h) shall be recast as follows :- 

      “2(h) “state level Appellate  Authority” means the authority  

notified as such under section 3A.” 

 Shri. P. Ubaidulla : Sir, I move the following amendment. 
 

139. In clause 2(i) the words “or ninety days which ever is earlier” 

Shall be added at the end.  



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

3

 Shri. K. Sivadasan Nair : Sir, I move the following amendment. 

 

141.    After clause 2(i), add the following sub clause namely:- 

“(j) “Aggrieved person” means any person aggrieved by the order 

of the designated Officer or the first appellate authority.” 
{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn-IÄ kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

 an. kv]o¡À: {io. sI. F³. F. JmZÀ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 125-þmw 

\¼À t`Z-KXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨p. 

{io. ]mtemSv chn Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 126, 130 -þF¶o \¼À 

t`ZKXnIÄ k -̀bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-̈ p. 

 {io. s_¶n s_l-\m³ Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 127, 128, 138-þF¶o \¼À 

t`Z-KXnIÄ k -̀bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-̈ p. 

 {io. ]n. Dss_-Zp-ff Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 139-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-aXn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-̈ p. 

 {io. sI. inh-Zm-k³ \mbÀ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 141-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn 

k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨p. 

 2þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

2þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

3þmw hIp¸v 

Shri. Palode Ravi : - Sir, I move the following amendment. 

 

142.    In clause 3 for the words beginning with “save as” and 

ending with “statutory body” substitute the words “save as 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

4

otherwise provided in any other law for the time being in 

force, every Department of the Government including 

Secretariat Service, every head of Department, every Local 

Self Government Institutions and every statutory body”. 

158. In clause 3, the words “six months” shall be substituted 

by  the words “three months”.   
 

 168.  In  clause 3, insert the words “not below the rank of a 

Government  Secretary” in between the words “Second appellate 

authority” and  “and the stipulated time limit”  

 Shri. M. Ummer: Sir, I move the following amendments. 

148. In clause 3 delete the words “every Local Self Government 

Institution”. 
  

156. In clause 3, for the words “Six Months” substitute the 

words “Two Months”.   

 Shri. K. Shivadasan Nair:  Sir, I move the following 

amendment. 

152.  In clause 3, after the words “Local Self Government 

 Institutions”, the following words shall be inserted 

“Heads of  Public Undertakings”. 

 Shri. V. D. Satheesan: Sir, I move the following amendment. 
 

164.   In clause 3, for the words “six months” substitute  the 

words “five months”. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

5

Shri Benny Behanan: Sir, I move the following amendment. 

166. In clause 3, the words “first” and “second appellant  

 authority”  shall be deleted. 

 Shri. N.A. Nellikkunnu: Sir, I move the following 

amendment. 

171. After Clause 3, the following proviso shall be added 

namely; 

“Provided that in order to maintain uniformity,  Local Self 

Government Institutions and State Public Undertakings shall Publish 

such notification only after obtaining consent of Government in 

Local Self Government Department and Bureau of Public Enterprises 

respectively.” 
  {io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn-IÄ kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

 an.- kv]o-¡À: {io. ]mtem-Sv chn  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 142, 158, 168 F¶o 

\¼À t`Z-KXnIÄ k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. sI. inh-Zm-k³ \mbÀ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 152þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn 

k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. Fw. D½À Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 148, 156 F¶o  \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. s_¶n s_l-\m³ Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨  166þmw  \¼À t`Z-

KXnIÄ k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. hn.-Un. kXo-i³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 164þmw, \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. F³. F. s\Ãn-¡p¶v Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 171-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn 

k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

6

 3þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

3þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p 

aq¶mw hIp-¸n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v 

 Shri. Benny Behanan: Sir, I move the following ammendment. 

176.   After clause 3, a new clause shall be inserted  as follows  

“3A:- Constitution of State Level Appellate Authority :- 

Government may by notification constitute a State Level 

Appellate Authority within six months of the commencement 

of this Act  to entertain the  grievances of the appellants.” 
{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn- kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

   {io. s_¶n s_l-\m³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 176-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn 

k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p.  

3þmw hIp¸n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-

sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

3þmw hIp¸n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p 

4þmw hIp¸v 

 Shri. M. V. Sreyams Kumar: -Sir, I move the following  

 amendment. 
  

180 In clause 4, the words “specified for each service” shall 

be added at the end. 

 Shri. T. N. Prathapan: - Sir, I move the following mendment. 
  



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

7

181. After clause 4, the following proviso shall be added 

namely; “provided that eligible person shall submit true and 

correct information to obtain the services notified under 

Section 3”.   
 {io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn- kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 
 an. kv]o¡À : {io. Fw. hn. t{ibmwkv IpamÀ  Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 

180þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-bpsS A\p-aXn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. Sn. F³. {]Xm-]³ Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 181þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k -̀

bpsS A\p-aXn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 4þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

      A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

4þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p 

\memw hIp-¸n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp-¸v 

 Shri.Ramesh Chennithala: -Sir, I move the following 

amendment. 
  

182 After clause 4, add the following Clauses 4A and 4B 

namely;  

  “4A A notice board/information hoarding in the prescribed 

format, depicting the services being provided by the 

institution/office and its accessing modalities, shall be displayed 

with in the office premise so as to make the applicant be known 

about such services and also about the personnel whom they have 

to approach for accessing/availing such services     



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

8

 4B Government is empowered to make/put in place suitable 

institutional or structural arrangements or changes as may be deemed 

fit under this act including designation of nodal officers and 

formulation of procedural formalities to facilitate the access of 

qualitative and timely service”.  
{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn-  kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

 an. kv]o¡À: CXv _nÃnsâ `mK-aÃ AXp-sImv AtUm]väv sNt¿-

−Xn-Ã.  

 {io. ctaiv sN¶n-¯e  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 182-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 4þmw hIp¸n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-

sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

4þmw hIp¸n\v tij-ap-f-f -]p-Xnb hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p 

5þmw hIp¸v 

Shri. M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendments. 
 

183. In clause 5(1), after the words “The designated officer” the 

words “or a person subordinate to him authorised to receive the 

application” shall be inserted.  

 193. In clause 5(2), the words “in prescribed form” shall 

be inserted before the words “to receive such application.” 

Shri Palode Ravi :  Sir, I move the following amendments. 
 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

9

 185. In clause 5(1),  the words “eligible person” shall be 

substituted by the words “applicant for services”. 

 Shri. Roshy Augustine : Sir, I move the following 

amendment. 

187.  In clause 5(1), after the words “intimate” the words “in the 

same day” shall be inserted. 

189. In clause 5(1), in between the  words “applicant”  and 

“forthwith”, the words “in writing”  shall be inserted. 

Shri. Ramesh Chennithala : Sir, I move the following 

amendments. 

 

192. In clause 5(1), after the last sentence, the following 

sentences may be added,  “If any service has been 

denied/rejected by the officer, causes and reasons for such 

rejection/denial must be clearly stated and intimate to the 

applicant.  If it has found that the service has been rejected 

or denied with out any substantial valid reason or 

justification fine may be imposed to the erring 

officer/officers in such a manner and way as may be 

prescribed under this act.” 

196. Recast clause 5(2) as follows: 

“(2) An application received, including the online 

application, under subsection (1) shall be duly 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

10

acknowledged by the designated officer or by the officer 

authorised by him to receive such application.” 

 Shri. M. A. Vaheed : Sir, I move the following amendment. 

198.   In clause 5(3), for the word “start” substitute the word 

“begin”. 
 {io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn-IÄ kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

an. kv]o¡À: {io. Fw. D½À Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 183, 193 F¶o \¼À 

t`Z-KXnIÄ k -̀bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p.  

{io. ]mtemSv chn Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 185þmw \¼À t`Z-KXnIÄ k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p.  

{io. tdmjn AK-Ìn³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 187, 189 F¶o \¼À 

t`ZKXnIÄ k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. ctaiv sN¶n-¯e  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 192-, 196 F¶o \¼À 

t`ZKXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. Fw.F. hmloZv   Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 198-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

5þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

5þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

A©mw hIp-∏n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp-∏v-  

an. kv]o¡À: CXv _nÃnsâ `mK-aÃ. AXp-sImv AtUm]väv 

sNt¿--Xn-Ã. 

6þmw hIp¸v 

 Shri. Benny Behanan : - Sir, I move the following amendments. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

11

207.       In clause 6 for the words, “first appellate authority” the 

 words “appellate authority” may be substituted wherever 

 occur. 
-  

208.       In clause 6 for the words, “second appellate authority” the 

 words “state level appellate authority” shall be substituted 

 wherever occurs. 
  

Shri. K. Sivadasan Nair:  Sir, I move the following amendments. 
 

213. In the proviso to clause   6(1) for the words   “after the 

expiry  

           of the period of thirty days” substitute the words  

 “forthwith”. 

237. In clause 6 (8), for the words, “second appellate authority 

and such applications shall be disposed of in the same 

manner in which a second appeal is to be disposed of 

under this Act”, substitute the words, “first appellate 

authority and such an application shall be disposed of for 

complying the earlier order and proceed in to the penal 

provision and disciplinary action ”.  

 
 

   222. In clause 6 (3) after the words “time limit” the words 

“after giving an opportunity to the designated officer 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

12

under Section 3 to file his explanation whatsoever for 

denying the service if any” shall be added at the end.    

        225.     In clause 6 (4) for the words “sixty days” the words 

“thirty days” shall be substituted.     

 Shri. Roshy Augustine: Sir, I move the following amendment. 
 

214. In the   proviso to  clause 6(1)  for the  words   “thirty         

 days”  substitute the words “fifteen days”. 

 Shri. P. C. Vishnunadh: - Sir, I move the following 

amendments. 
 

216. In clause 6 (2), for the words “provide” substitute the 

word, “render”.  

236. In sub-clause  (8) of clause 6, after the words “such non-

compliance may” the words, “within such period or may 

be prescribed” shall be inserted. 

229. In clause 6(5), delete the word “he may”. 

 Shri. M. Ummer: Sir, I move the following amendments. 

218. In clause 6 (2), for the words “a specified period” the 

words, “Thirty days” shall be substituted. 

          231. In clause 6(5) for the words “a specified period” 

substitute    the words “fifteen days”. 

 Shri. C. Moyinkutty: sir, I move the following amendment. 
. - 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

13

221. In clause 6 (3) after the word “limit” the words “or one 

 month, whichever is earlier” shall be added at the end.    

 Shri.P.B. Abdul Razak: -Sir, I move the following amendment. 
  

 223. In clause 6 (4) for the word “aggrieved” the words “not  

   satisfied” shall be substituted. 

 Shri. T. N. Prathapan: -Sir I move the following amendment. 
  

224. In clause 6 (4) for the word “sixty” the words “forty five ” 

 shall be substituted. 
 

              Shri. Abdurahiman Randathani: Sir, I move the following   

                amendment. 

235. In clause 6 (7) after the word, “limit” the words “or one 

month whichever is earlier” shall be added at the end. 
  

Shri. Sunny Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendment. 
 

228. In the proviso to clause 6(4), for the word “that” substitute 

the word “the”. 
{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn-IÄ kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

 an. kv]o¡À: {io. s_¶n s_l-\m³  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 207, 208 

F¶o \¼À t`Z-KXnIÄ k -̀bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS 

]n³hen¨ncn¡p¶p. 

 {io. sI. inh-Zm-k³ \mbÀ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨  213, 222, 225, 237 

F¶o \¼À t`Z-KXnIÄ k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-

¡p¶p. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

14

 {io. tdmjn AK-Ìn³  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 214-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. ]n.-kn. hnjvWp-\mYv  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 216-, 236, 229 F¶o 

\¼À t`Z-KXnIÄ k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. Fw. D½À Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 218, 231, F¶o \¼À t`Z-KXnIÄ 

k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. tambn³Ip«n  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 221-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-bpsS 

A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. ]n.-_n. A_vZpÄ dkmIv  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 223-þmw \¼À 

t`ZKXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. Sn. F³. {]Xm-]³  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 224-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. A_vZp-d-ln-am³ c-¯mWn  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 235-þmw \¼À 

t`ZKXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. k®n tUmk^v  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 228-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

  6þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

6þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

7þmw hIp¸v 

(t`-Z-KXn Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡-s¸-«n-Ã) 

 7þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

7þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

15

 
Ggmw hIp-¸n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v-  

 

an. kv]o¡À:  CXv _nÃnsâ `mK-aÃ. AXp-sIm−v AtUm]väv 

sNt¿-−Xn-Ã. 

8˛mw hIp¸v 

 Shri. Oommen Chandy: Sir, I move the following oral  

amendment. 

245. In sub-clause (2) of clause 8 for the word “penalty” the word 

“fine”  shall be substituted  

¢mkv 8þse s]\Âän F¶ hm¡n\v ]Icw ss^³ F¶ hm¡v 

tNÀ¡-Ww. ImcWw, B ¢mÊn-Â Xs¶ Hcn-S¯v ss^³ F¶p-]-

tbmKn-¡p-¶p− -v. AXp-sIm−v cm-as¯ Øe¯pw ss^³ F¶ 

hm¡v tNÀ¡p-¶-Xm-Wv Ipd-̈ p-IqSn sa -̈s -̧«-Xv. AXp-sIm−v B 

t`ZKXn AwKo-I-cn-¡-W-sa¶v A`yÀ°n-¡p-I-bm-Wv. 

 Shri. K. Sivadasan Nair : -Sir, I move the following 

amendments. 

247. In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words “the second appellate 

authority” substitute the words “first appellant authority”. 

256. In clause 8(1)(b) for the words, “second appellate 

authority”, substitute the words, “first appellate authority”. 

 Shri. Benny Behanan: -  Sir, I move the following amendments. 
  



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

16

248. In clause 8, for the words “second appellate authority” 

wherever it occures, the words “state level appellate 

authority right” shall be substituted.   
 

249. In clause 8, for the words “first appellate authority” the 

words “appellate authority” shall be substituted wherever it 

occurs.  

287. In clause 8(3)  insert the words “including for making 

relevant entries in the Service Book of erring officials” 

between the words” disciplinary action and “against him”. 

 Shri.T. N. Prathapan: - Sir, I move the following amendments. 
  

252. In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words “five hundred,” the words 

 “one  thousand” shall be substituted.   

257. In clause 8(1)(b) for the words, “two hundred and fifty” 

the  

        words “one hundred” shall be substituted. 

  277. In clause 8 (2), for the words “five hundred” the words, 

“one    thousand” shall be substituted.  

 284. The proviso to clause 8(2) shall be deleted. 
  

        Shri. Hibi Eden : Sir, I move the following amendment. 

259. In clause 8(1)(b) for the words “two hundred and fifty    

 rupees”, substitute the words “two hundred and eighty 

five  rupees”. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

17

  Shri. P. C. Vishnunath : Sir, I move the following amendment 

261  In clause 8(1)(b) for the words “two hundred and fifty  

   rupees”, substitute the words “four hundred rupees”. 

 Shri. M. P. Vincent: Sir, I move the following amendment 
 

264. In clause 8(1)(b), for the words “two hundred and 

fifty rupees” substitute the words “six hundred rupees”. 

Shri. P. A. Madhavan : Sir, I move the following amendments. 

 

271. In clause 8(2)for the words “five hundred rupees” substitute 

the words “six hundred rupees”. 

         Shri. Ludy Luiz : Sir, I move the following amendment 

 

273. In clause 8(2), for the words “five hundred rupees” substitute 

the words “seven hundred rupees”. 

 

 Shri. A. T. George : Sir, I move the following amendment. 
 

274. In clause 8(2), for the words “five hundred rupees”  

substitute the  words “ eight hundred rupees”. 

Shri. Shafi Parambil:  Sir, I move the following amendment. 

280.  In clause 8 (2), for the words “five hundred rupees” substitute 

the words, “one thousand and two hundred rupees”. 

 Shri M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendments. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

18

286. In clause 8(3), the words “and in case of a bahitual and 

willful defaulter” shall be inserted between the words 

“under this Act” and “recommend disciplinary action”. 

   Shri T. A. Ahammed Kabeer : Sir, I move the following 

amendment. 

288. After clause 8(3) the following sub section shall be added 

namely : 

“(4) In the circumstances of these penalties imposed on a 

designated officer or first appeal authority, an adverse entry 

shall be made in the respective service record”. 
{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn-IÄ kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

{io. sI. inh-Zm-k³ \mbÀ Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 247, 256, F¶o \¼À 

t`Z-KXnIÄ k -̀bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

  {io. s_¶n s_l-\m³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 248, 249, 287 F¶o \¼À 

t`Z-KXnIÄ k -̀bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p.  

{io. Sn. F³. {]Xm-]³ Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 252, 257, 277, 284 F¶o 

\¼À t`Z-KXnIÄ k -̀bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. ssl_n CuU³  Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 259-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. ]n.-kn. hnjvWp-\mYv  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 261þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn 

k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. Fw.-]n. hn³skâv  Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 264-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. ]n.-F. am[-h³  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 271-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

19

{io. eqUn eqbnkv  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 273-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. F.-än. tPmÀPv  Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 274-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-bpsS 

A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. jm^n ]d-¼nÂ  Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 280-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k -̀

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. Fw. D½À  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 286-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k -̀bpsS 

A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. Sn.-F. Al-½Zv I_oÀ  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 288-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn 

k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

_lp-am-\-s¸« apJy-a-{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZym-KnI t`Z-KXnsb 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................. 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

apJy-a-{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZym-KnI t`Z-KXn k` AwKo-I-cn-̈ n-

cn-¡p¶p. 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-ap-ff 8þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-

sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-ap-ff 8þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-

¡p¶p. 

F«mw hIp-¸n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp-¸p-IÄ 

 

        Shri Ramesh Chennithala :  Sir, I move the following 

amendment. 

289. After clause 8, add the following clause namely: - 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

20

8A Compensation for right holders; 

“If any damage or loss has been sustained to the livelihood 

perspectives of the right holder/applicant subsequent to the 

denial/rejection of service with out any substantial valid reasons, 

the loss/damages caused to him thereby on account of such 

denial/rejection of service, the applicant may be paid such 

compensation or relief as may deeme fit.” 

 Shri. M. Ummer: Sir, I move the following amendments. 
 

292.After clause 8,  the following clause shall be inserted  

namely:- 

“8 A. The provision of this Act shall be deemed to 

the part of service conditions of the designated officer 

including  such officer of all Public Authorities.” 

293. After clause 8,  the following clause shall be inserted 

namely:- 

“8 A Right of appeal by the Public Servant-Any Public Servant 

aggrieved by the order passed by the Second appellate authority in 

accordance  with section 8 of the Act shall be entitled to file an 

appeal to the Head of Department/a commission constituted  under 

this Act, against such order with in a period not exceeding thirty days 

of the receipt of the impugned order.  The order of the Head of 

Department Commission shall be final and binding.” 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

21

294. After clause 8,  the following clause shall be inserted 

namely:- 

“8 A Constitution of the Commission- For the purpose of this 

Act, the Government shall constitute a commission to be called the 

Kerala  Right to Service Commission. 

Provided that till such time  the commission is not constituted 

by the State government, it may, by notification, nominate an officer 

of the State Government not below the rank of a Secretary to 

government, to perform the functions and exercise the powers of the 

commission under this Act.” 

 Shri. T. N. Prathapan: Sir, I move the following amendment. 
 

295. After Clause 8, add the following Clause and renumber  

      accordingly. 

“9 Application for revision-  Any officer affected by an order of 

the second appellate authority in respect of imposing penalty 

application to the officer, nominated by the State Government with in 

a period of 30 days from the date of order.” 
{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn-IÄ kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 
an. kv]o¡À: _nÃnsâ `mK-aÃ. AXp-sImv AtUm]väv 

sNt¿−XnÃ. 

{io. ctaiv sN¶n-¯e  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 289þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k -̀

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

22

{io. Fw. D½À Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 292, 293, 294 F¶o \¼À 

t`ZKXnIÄ k -̀bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. Sn. F³. {]Xm-]³  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 295-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

8þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

8þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

9þmw hIp¸v 

 Shri. K. Muraleedharan : Sir, I move the following amendment. 
 

297. In clause 9, for the words “which is in good for the done”, 

substitute the words “done in good faith”. 
{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn-  kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

an. kv]o¡À: {io. sI. apc-fo-[-c³  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 297-þmw \¼À 

t`Z-KXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 9þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

9þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

H³]Xmw hIp-¸n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp v̧ 

 Shri. T. N. Prathapan : Sir, I move the following amendments. 

       298. After clause 9 add the following clause and remember   

         accordingly 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

23

“10 Display of Services-  The Services and the stipulated time 

limit shall be displayed in every department concerned for 

information of the public”. 

         Shri. N.Samsudheen : Sir, I move the following amendment. 
 

299.After clause 9  add the following clause and remember   

     accordingly, 

“10 Evaluation of performance using advanced technology:- 

Performance of designated officers and appellate authorities shall 

be evaluated with the help of advanced technology and best 

performances in each District of the State shall be awarded in the 

manner prescribed”. 
{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn-IÄ kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

an. kv]o¡À: {io. Sn.-F³. {]Xm-]³  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 298-þmw \¼À 

t`Z-KXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p.  

{io. F³. jwkpZo³  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 299-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

_nÃnsâ `mK-a-Ãm-¯-Xp-sIm−v AtUm]väv sN¿p-¶n-Ã. 

9þmw hIp¸n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ 

{]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

9þmw hIp¸n\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p 

      

 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

24

10þmw hIp¸v 

(t`-Z-KXn Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡-s¸-«n-Ã) 

an. kv]o¡À: 10þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ 

{]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

10þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

11þmw hIp¸v 

 Shri. V.M. Ummer Master: Sir, I move the following 

amendment. 

304. In clause 11 (1) after the word “Gazette” the following words 

shall be inserted: “with in six months from the date of its 

passing” 
{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn- kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 
an. kv]o¡À: {io. hn.- Fw. D½À amÌÀ  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 304-þmw 

\¼À t`Z-KXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p.  

11þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

11þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

12þmw hIp¸v 

(t`-Z-KXn Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡-s¸-«n-Ã) 

12þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯  

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................ 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.................... 

12þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

25

1þmw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

  Shri.T. N. Prathapan :  Sir, I move the following 

amendments 

109.  In the title, the word ‘STATE’ shall be deleted. 

110. In the title after the word ‘TO’ the word 

‘PUBLIC’ shall be inserted. 

 117. In clause 1 (1), for the words “Kerala State Right to 

Service Act, 2012” the words “Kerala Right to public Service Act, 

2012” shall be substituted.   

 Shri. C.P. Mohammed : Sir, I move the following amendment. 

113. In the long title for the words, “the delivery of ’ substitute the 

word    ‘guaranteeing’ 

 Shri.P. K. Basheer : - Sir, I move the following amendment.  
  

119. In clause 1 (2) after the words “in to force” the words and 

figures “on the 1st of January 2013” shall be inserted.   

 Shri.M.P. Abdussamad Samadani: Sir, I move the following 

amendment.   

120. In clause 1 (2) after the words “in to force” the words “on 

the expiry of one hundred and eighty days of its passing” 

shall be added.     

  Shri.Therambil Ramakrishnan: - Sir, I move the following 

amendment.   

  



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

26

121. In clause 1 (2) insert the word “Government” between the 

words “The” and “Gazette”. 
{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, t`Z-K-Xn-IÄ kzoI-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

 an. kv]o-¡À: {io. Sn. F³ {]Xm-]³  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 109, 110, 117 

F¶o \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. kn.]n. apl-½Zv  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 113-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. ]n.-sI. _joÀ  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 119-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-

bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. Fw.-]n. A_vZp-k-aZv ka-Zm\n  Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 120-þmw \¼À 

t`ZKXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 {io. tXd-¼nÂ cma-Ir-jvW³  Ah-X-cn-̧ n¨ 192-þmw \¼À 

t`ZKXn k -̀bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

 1þmw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw _nÃnsâ `mK-am¡-W-sa¶ 

{]iv\s¯ 

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ............... 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

1þmw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw _nÃnsâ `mK-ambn-cn-¡p-¶p.  

aq¶mw hmb-\ 

{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, 2012þse tIcf kwØm\ tkh-\m-

hImi _nÂ ]mÊm-¡-W-sa¶ {]tabw Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p-¶p.  

Irjnbpw arK-kw-c-£-Whpw A¨-Snbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw hIp-¸p-

a{´n ({io. sI.-]n. taml-\³):  kÀ, Rm³  {]ta-bs¯ ]n´m-§p-¶p. 

{io. D½³ Nm−n: kÀ, Rm³ ZoÀL-ambn {]kw-Kn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

\½psS kwØm-\s¯ kw_-Ôn-̈ n-S-t¯mfw Gähpw {][m-\-s¸« 

\nb-a-am-Wv. P\-§Ä¡v In«p¶ Gähpw henb Ah-Im-i-am-Wv. Cu 

_nÂ FÃm-h-cp-sSbpw kl-I-c-W-t¯m-Sp-IqSn ]mÊm-¡-W-sa-¶mWv 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

27

B{K-ln-̈ Xv. F¶m-epw {]Xn-]£ AwK-§Ä Ah-cpsS {]Xn-tj[w 

{]I-Sn-¸n-¡p-t¼mgpw  Ah-cpsS ]tcm-£-amb ]n´pW Cu _nÃn-\pv 

F¶v ImWp-¶-XnÂ  hf-sc-b-[nIw kt´m-j-ap-v. Cu _nÂ C\n \S-¸n-

em-¡pI F¶-XmWv Ne-©v. Gähpw thK-¯nÂ \S-¸n-em-¡m³, P\-

§Ä¡v AXnsâ {]tbm-P\w ]qÀ®-ambpw e`n-¡p-hm³ th \S-]Sn-

IÄ Cu Kh¬saâv kzoI-cn¡pw  A¡m-cy-̄ nÂ Kh¬saâv 

{]XnRvPm_²-am-sW-¶-dn-bn-¡p-¶p. CXv ]mÊm-¡n-̄ -c-W-sa¶v 

A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p.  

an. kv]o¡À: hfsc {][m-\-s¸« Hcp _nÂ ]mkm-¡pI hgn 

tIcf \nb-a-k` Ncn-{X-¯n-te¡v IS-¡p-I-bm-Wv. 2012þse tIcf 

kwØm\ tkh\ Ah-Imi _nÂ ]mÊm-¡-W-sa¶ {]ta-bs¯   

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ............... 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ................... 

{]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

_nÂ ]mÊm-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

(2)  2012þse tIma¬shÂ¯v {SÌv, tImgn-t¡mSv (kwcw`w 

hnebvs¡Sp-¡epw ssIamäw sN¿epw) _nÂ 

 
 

hy-h-km-bhpw hnh-c-km-t¦-Xn-Ihpw hIp-¸p-a{´n ({io. ]n. sI. 

Ipªm-en-¡p«n): kÀ, k_vPIvSv I½nän dnt¸mÀ«v sNbvX {]Im-c-

apff 2012þse tIma¬shÂ¯v {SÌv, tImgn-t¡mSv (kwcw`w 

hnebvs¡-Sp-¡epw ssIamäw sN¿epw) _nÂ ]cn-K-W-\-bvs¡-Sp-¡-W-

sa¶ {]tabw Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p¶p. 

Irjnbpw arK-kw-c-£-Whpw A¨-Snbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw hIp-¸p-

a{´n ({io. sI. ]n. taml-\³):  kÀ, Rm³ {]ta-bs¯ 

]n³Xm§p¶p. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

28

an. kv]o¡À : _lp-am-\-s¸« an\n-ÌÀ Fs´-¦nepw 

kwkmcn¡p-¶pt−m?       

hy-h-km-bhpw hnh-c-km-t¦-Xn-Ihpw hIp-¸p-a{´n ({io. ]n. sI. 

Ipªm-en-¡p«n) :  kÀ, Ct¸mÄ kwkm-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

an. kv]o¡À : hntbm-P-\-¡p-dn¸v \ÂInb {io. Ff-acw Icow,    

{io. hn. iin, {io. kn. IrjvW³, {io. kmPp t]mÄ, {io. C. sI. 

hnPb³, {io. hn. Fkv. kp\nÂ Ip-amÀ F¶n-hÀ koän-en-Ãm¯-Xn-

\mÂ t`Z-KXn Ah-X-cn-¸n-¨n-Ã.  t`Z-K-Xn-IÄ k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbmSp 

IqSn ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

{io. sI. apc-fo-[-c³ : kÀ, k_vPIvSv I½nän dnt¸mÀ«v sNbvX 

{]Im-c-ap-ff 2012þse tIma¬shÂ¯v {SÌv, tImgn-t¡mSv (kwcw`w 

hnebvs¡-Sp-¡epw ssIamäw sN¿epw) _nÂ ho−pw AtX 

k_vPIvSv I½nän-bpsS ]cn-K-W-\bv¡v Ab-bv¡-W-sa¶ t`Z-KXn 

Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p-¶p. 

an. kv]o¡À : {io. sI. apc-fo-[-c³, A§-bpsS 2(_n) \¼À 

t`ZKXn {]Êv sN¿p-¶pt−m? 

{io. sI. apc-fo-[-c³ : kÀ, {]Êv sN¿p-¶n-Ã.  

an. kv]o¡À : {io. apc-fo-[-c³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 2(_n) \¼À 

t`ZKXn k`-bpsS A\p-a-Xn-tbm-Sp-IqSn ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p.  

k_vPIvSv I½nän dnt¸mÀ«v sNbvX-{]-Im-c-apÅ 2012þse 

tIma¬shÂ¯v {SÌv, tImgn-t¡mSv (kwcw`w hne-bvs¡-Sp-¡epw 

ssIamäw sN¿epw) _nÂ ]cn-K-W-\bv¡v FSp¡W-sa¶ 

{]tabs¯.... 

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.... 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ...... 

 {]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p.   



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

29

_nÂ ]cn-K-W-\-bvs¡-Sp-¡p-¶p. 

hIp-¸p-Xn-cn-¨pÅ ]cn-K-W\ 

2þmw hIp¸v 

(tZ`KXn Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡s¸«nÃ.) 

: 2þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯.... 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

         2þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

3 apXÂ 9 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ 

: tZZ-K-Xn-bn-Ã. 

3 apXÂ 9 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ 

{]iv\s¯.... 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

3 apXÂ 9 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 
 

10þmw hIp¸v 

hy-h-km-bhpw hnh-c-km-t¦-Xn-Ihpw hIp-¸p-a{´n ({io. ]n. sI. 

Ipªm-en-¡p-«n) : kÀ, In clause 10(2), the words “of  payment” shall 

be deleted  F¶ HutZ-ym-KnI t`Z-KXn Rm³ Ah-X-cn-̧ n-¡p-¶p. 

an. kv]o¡À : _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXn k` AwKo-I-cn-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p.   

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 10þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-

W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯.... 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

30

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 10þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-

¡p¶p. 

11 apXÂ 15 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ 

an. kv]o¡À : t`Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã. 

11 apXÂ 15 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ 

{]iv\s¯.... 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

11 apXÂ 15 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

16þmw hIp¸v 

hy-h-km-bhpw hnh-c-km-t¦-Xn-Ihpw hIp-¸p-a{´n ({io. ]n. sI. 

Ipªm-en-¡p-«n): kÀ, In clause 16, for the words  “Subsidiary 

corporation, and”, the words “subsidiary corporation or other agency 

of the Government, and” shall be substituted. F¶ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXn Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p-¶p. 

an. kv]o¡À : _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ HutZ-ym-KnI 

t`ZKXn k` AwKo-I-cn-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p.   

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 16þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-

W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯.... 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

t`Z-KXn sNbvX {]Im-c-apÅ 16þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-

¡p¶p. 

17þmw hIp¸v 

(tZ -̀KXnIÄ Ah-X-cn-̧ n-¡s¸«nÃ) 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

31

an. kv]o¡À : 17þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ 

{]iv\s¯. 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

17þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

18 apXÂ 28 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ 

an. kv]o¡À : t`Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã. 

18 apXÂ 28 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ 

{]iv\s¯.... 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

18 apXÂ 28 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

29þmw hIp¸v 

Shri Thomas Unniyadam:   Sir, I move the following 

amdnement. 

100. In clause 29(c) for the words “with imprisonment for a 

term which may extend to two years” the words “for three 

years” shall be substituted. 

{io. ]n. sI. Ipªm-en-¡p-«n: kÀ, t`Z-KXn kzo-I-cn-¡p-¶n-Ã. 

{io. tXmakv D®n-bm-S³ Ah-X-cn-¸n¨ 100-þmw \¼À t`Z-KXn k`-bpsS 

A\p-aXn-tbmsS ]n³h-en-¨n-cn-¡p-¶p. 

29þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯. 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

29þmw hIp¸v _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

32

 

30 apXÂ 35 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ 

an. kv]o¡À : t`Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã. 

30 apXÂ 35 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ 

{]iv\s¯.... 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

30 apXÂ 35 hsc-bpÅ hIp¸pIÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

1 Dw 2 Dw ]«nI 

an. kv]o¡À : t`Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã. 

1 Dw 2 Dw ]«nIIÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ {]iv\s¯.... 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

1 Dw 2 Dw ]«nIIÄ _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

3 -þmw ]«nI 

(tZ`KXn Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡s¸-«nÃ.) 

an. kv]o¡À : 3 -þmw ]«nI _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡-W-sa¶ 

{]iv\s¯.... 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

3 -þmw ]«nI _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

1þmw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw 

 an. kv]o¡À : t`Z-K-Xn-bn-Ã. 

1þmw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw _nÃnsâ `mK-am-¡W-sa¶ 

{]iv\s¯..... 

A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ ...... 



 
Uncorrected / Not for Publication 

33

{]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ....... 

1þmw hIp¸pw ]oTn-Ibpw t]cpw _nÃnsâ `mK-am-bn-cn-¡p-¶p. 

aq¶mw hmb\ 

hy-h-km-bhpw hnh-c-km-t¦-Xn-Ihpw hIp-¸pa{´n ({io. ]n. sI. 

Ipªm-en-¡p«n) : kÀ, 2012þse tIma¬shÂ¯v {SÌv, tImgn-t¡mSv 

(kwcw`w hne-bvs¡-Sp-¡epw ssIamäw sN¿epw) _nÂ ]mÊm-¡-W-

sa¶ {]tabw Rm³ Ah-X-cn-¸n-¡p¶p. 

Irjnbpw arK-kw-c-£-Whpw A¨-Snbpw tÌj-\-dnbpw hIp-¸p-

a{´n   ({io. sI. ]n. taml-\³) : kÀ, Rm³ {]ta-bs¯ 

]n´m§p¶p. 

an. kv]o¡À : _lp-am-\-s¸« a{´n kwkm-cn-¡p-¶pt−m? 

{io. ]n. sI. Ipªm-en-¡p-«n: kÀ, Hcp hm¡p am{Xta ]d-bp-

¶pÅq. t{SUv bqWn-b-\p-I-sfÃmw ZoÀL-Ime {]t£m`w \S¯n 

{]Xn]£w IqSn A\p-Iq-en¨v kt´m-j-t¯msS ]mÊm-t¡ Hcp 

_nÃns\ A\p-Iq-en-¡m³ Ah-k-c-an-ÃmsX t]mbn.  AXnÂ hnj-a-

ap− -v.  GXm-bmepw Cu _nÂ ss^\-embn ]mÊm-¡n-̄ -c-W-sa¶v 

A`yÀ°n-¡p-¶p. 

an. kv]o¡À : 2012þse tIma¬shÂ¯v {SÌv, tImgn-t¡mSv 

(kwcw`w hne-bvs¡-Sp-¡epw ssIamäw sN¿epw) _nÂ ]mÊm-¡-W-

sa¶ {]tabs¯... 

 A\p-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ.... 

 {]Xn-Iq-en-¡p-¶-hÀ...... 

 {]tabw k` AwKo-I-cn-̈ n-cn-¡p-¶p.   

_nÂ ]mÊm-bn-cn-¡p-¶p.                              ([-\-hn-\n-tbm-K-_nÂ)  

 


	A©mw hIp-¸n\\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp-¸v-
	Ggmw hIp-¸n\\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v-
	an. kv]o¡À:  CXv _nÃnsâ `mK-aÃ. AXp-sIm­v AtUm]väv sNt¿-­Xn-
	F«mw hIp-¸n\\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp-¸p-�
	H³]Xmw hIp-¸n\\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v

