Uncorrected / Not for Publication

MIaMBMO6M 00 o

mUeNIRGHS Ha21g] 016alodS 6alD® (al&HI0N)SS 2012-6021 CHOS

MOMXNOM GVAIMOIUGOUD 6nilEd

26U ol (0o, Pe!ad 2106nEl): VA, ueNIRGS GHAlGl Gleajods

0210 (AlSHO0MBS 2012-6R1 GHOS VoMM GIVAIMOIUEIUD eNilEd
a@lNEMM WO HOS}HHEMHAM (alGAWOo DO GRAUIMG]a{lee)ym).
SH{aHl®)o ALNMOOHUMA)0 @RSIW)o CTYAUMOID)o QUdb)al)

(@] (V0. Od. ail. BRAOMAB): MVA, HMINT (AIGRAWEDD ll0MO6BE)M).

2l. Wall8ed: MIa0)@omenls allad alMIQUA @6ESE (alMow)ee)

(M) @6N=E0?

(12, a3 2l196nEl: VB, (alMouileeymmiay.

(alcworm#)0la] @RAUOClafleeeqislal)

woll. afl. awl. welwoad: U, queniRe:S ®»elgl 0leajods ©alY®

(BH00m88  2012-60R1 GHOS MUoMUOIM BIVAIMOIUEIUD niled alljo
@OC® (UMNIRGHS  HAIGIWIOS  alBlVEMMWBE  CROWBHEMHA
6RO GRAUI®C]a{leeyam).

2l. Walleed: wolal.al. cvolwad, @reBies 2(eni) maud

elhlo] (_OJ% QQJQQ(TT)QGGT@O?

(w7l ail.all. V@TKOB: (IS Balg)avIel.

2. Walleed: ol afl.awl. cvelvond @RAU®Ga{la] 2(endl) mauad
CRBUV®| MIRW)AS @PMIAMIGWISIHH)S] allmBalailajleles)amn).

meniRss  Haaldl  01aods 021T®  (al®H002)88  2012-6
GLAUMOUB 000 B3 AIBINEMMWOEHS)HHEMEHAM (AIGAQEHD®D

@RM) ) RNH6)MAIA..................

(@) RlH)MAIA...................

(alGA@o (MVE @018 ®2flelee)m).



2
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

enil@d alBlNEMMWOEHS)HEH)aN).

for

Udn)a) @0l )88 al@lemm

2-00 QUdh)a]

Shri. K. N. A. Khader: Sir, I move the following amendment.

125. In clause 2(b) for the words “is eligible for”” the word

“require” shall be substituted.

Shri. Palode Ravi: Sir, I move the following amendments.

126.Clause 2(b) shall be recast as follows:-

“applicant for service” “means a person who is an applicant
services notified under section 3.”
130 In clause 2(f), for the words “eligible person” the words
“applicant for service” shall be substitute.
Shri. Benny Behanan: Sir, I move the following amendments.
127. In clause 2(c) delete the word “first”.
128. After clause 2(d), add the following:

“(da) Notifications means a notification in the gazette”.

138. Clause 2(h) shall be recast as follows :-
“2(h) “state level Appellate Authority” means the authority
notified as such under section 3A.”

Shri. P. Ubaidulla : Sir, I move the following amendment.

139.1n clause 2(i) the words “or ninety days which ever is earlier”
Shall be added at the end.



3
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

Shri. K. Sivadasan Nair : Sir, I move the following amendment.

141. After clause 2(i), add the following sub clause namely:-
“(J) “Aggrieved person” means any person aggrieved by the order

of the designated Officer or the first appellate authority.”

(12, 3 al0enEl: VB, BRARV@IBHWE MflB:olee)amlal.

al. MWalleed: (10l 6. af)B. af). 6I0BG @PAUOGlaflay 125-00

MMIB BRRVM] MERW)HS GRM)AMIEWINS allmBalaila)).

(L0,  aloees ol eeal®dlafla 126, 130 -agM1  MMUAG
CRBUMIHUd MIBW)HS @RMIAMICWINS allndcuailay).

(00, ®enIOM] HENUIAOMOM ERAI®Gla{lay 127, 128, 138-agMT MMUA
CRBUNMIHUE MIBWYHS @RMAMICWINS allndalailay).

(0. afl. 9e6MmIZI88 @RAUMGla{lay 139-00 MMUA GEREVOM] qLE
W)6S @PMAMICWINS allndalrilay).

(00, 6. 1BlUBOMNVM MOIWA @PAI®®Glafla) 141-00 MMUIA CERV®)
(MRW)AS @PMAMIGWINS allmBaiaila)).

2-00 Qld)a] enileflond BONAIBHEMORAMM (AIUdME DT

@RM) ) RlHMMAIA................

(@) RlH)MAIA....................
2-00 Qld)a] enileflend conaoWIBlee) M),

3-00 Qudb)aj

Shri. Palode Ravi : Sir, I move the following amendment.

142. In clause 3 for the words beginning with “save as” and

ending with “statutory body” substitute the words “save as



4
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

otherwise provided in any other law for the time being in
force, every Department of the Government including
Secretariat Service, every head of Department, every Local
Self Government Institutions and every statutory body”.
158.  In clause 3, the words “six months” shall be substituted
by the words “three months”.

168. In clause 3, insert the words “not below the rank of a

Government  Secretary” in between the words “Second appellate

authority” and *“and the stipulated time limit”

Shri. M. Ummer: Sir, I move the following amendments.

148.1n clause 3 delete the words “every Local Self Government
Institution”.
156. In clause 3, for the words “Six Months” substitute the
words “Two Months”.

Shri. K. Shivadasan Nair: Sir, I move the following

amendment.
152. In clause 3, after the words “Local Self Government
Institutions”, the following words shall be inserted
“Heads of Public Undertakings”.

Shri. V. D. Satheesan: Sir, | move the following amendment.

164. In clause 3, for the words “six months” substitute the

words “five months”.



5
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

Shri Benny Behanan: Sir, | move the following amendment.

166. In clause 3, the words “first” and “second appellant
authority” shall be deleted.
Shri. N.A. Nellikkunnu: Sir, I move the following

amendment.

171.After Clause 3, the following proviso shall be added

namely;

“Provided that in order to maintain uniformity, Local Self
Government Institutions and State Public Undertakings shall Publish
such notification only after obtaining consent of Government in
Local Self Government Department and Bureau of Public Enterprises

respectively.”

(12, 3 2l06enEl: VB, BRARV@IBHWE MflB:olee)amlal.

@l. Walleed: (10l al0eelds oall GrAUIMG]a{lay 142, 158, 168 ag)an’]
MMIB BRRNMIHUE MVRW)AHS @PMAMIGWINS allmBalailajleles)am).

(00, O, TlAROAVAZ MIWA @RAIMGafla] 152-00 MMIB EERV®)
MRW)AS @PMAMIGWIeS allmalailajleleen)mm).

(00, ag)o. 9@ @RAUIO®Glafla] 148, 156 oM MMIAB GERO®I (VLE
W)6S @PMAGIECWIRS allndalailajldlesnymm).

(00 e@enIam]  OMNIAOMOMD BRAUIOGlallaj  166-00  MMIA GEAR
OONHUE MERWYIHS @RMAGICWINS allidalrilajlelean)yamy.

(00, al.awl. olvom GRAUIGGlalla) 164-00, MMUA GRBO®I MVLE
W)6S @PMAGIEWIAS allmdalailajldlenymm).

(W0 ag)@. ag). emelee)m @eal®clafla) 171-00 MMIG GERVOI]

MRW)AS @PMAMIGWIeS allmalailajleles)mm.



6
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

3-00 Qld)a] nilefleond  oNAOBHEMORAMM (AIUdME DT
@RM) ) RlHMMAIA................
(@) RlH)MAIA....................

3-00 Qld)a] enileilend conaowI@lee)m)

2)aN%0 Qdh)afl) EGLAUMBS a)GIW QAld)a]

Shri. Benny Behanan: Sir, I move the following ammendment.

176. After clause 3, a new clause shall be inserted as follows
“3A:- Constitution of State Level Appellate Authority :-
Government may by notification constitute a State Level
Appellate Authority within six months of the commencement

of this Act to entertain the grievances of the appellants.”

(12, a3 al06enEl: VB, @RV MVIle:CleeymMla).

(007, eI ©ENIAOMOIND @RAIMClafla) 176-00 MMUB GERV®]
MRW)AS @PMAMIGWIeS allmalailajleles)mm.
3-00 AUBY]IN) CULOAUMBS O Qd)a] enileflod coMROBHEM
QM (AlUOMEDTD)
@RM) ) RlHMMAIA................
(@) RlH)MAIA....................
3-00 QABYafl0) CLOHUL8S a@1W Qld)a] milaflend cowaIwclesn)an)

4-90 QUdh)a

Shri. M. V. Sreyams Kumar: Sir, I move the following

amendment.

180 In clause 4, the words “specified for each service” shall
be added at the end.

Shri. T. N. Prathapan: Sir, | move the following mendment.




7
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

181. After clause 4, the following proviso shall be added

namely; “provided that eligible person shall submit true and
correct information to obtain the services notified under

Section 3”.

(12, a3 al06enEl: VB, @RV MVIle:CleeymMla).

@l. MWalleed : (10l ago. Ail. GO &)A0B  E@PAUMGIa{lal

180-00 MMIB GRRVM] MERW)OS @GRM)AGICWIAS alladalailajlclecnymm).
(00, Sl ag)M. (Al®0alMB @RAIOGafla] 181-00 MMIB GERV®] MVLE
W)6S @PMABICWIAS allndalailajldlenymm).
4-90 Qld)a] enilefleond  oNAOBHEMORAMM (~lUdME DT
@RM) ) R1HMMAIA................
(@) RlH)MAIA....................
4-90 Qld)a] enileflend conaoWI@lee)ym)

MoRI00 Ald)afl EUHRBS )@V ald)a]

Shri.Ramesh Chennithala: Sir, I move the following

amendment.

182 After clause 4, add the following Clauses 4A and 4B
namely;

“4A A notice board/information hoarding in the prescribed
format, depicting the services being provided by the
institution/office and its accessing modalities, shall be displayed
with in the office premise so as to make the applicant be known
about such services and also about the personnel whom they have

to approach for accessing/availing such services



8
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

4B Government is empowered to make/put in place suitable
institutional or structural arrangements or changes as may be deemed
fit under this act including designation of nodal officers and
formulation of procedural formalities to facilitate the access of

qualitative and timely service”.

(12, a3 al06enEl: VB, RV aUVIle:dlemmlal.

2l. Walleed: @ enileflond oMLl GRMOBH]T GREWIAIY 62lCQ

enz@le).

(L0. ECAUD HalMIE®al @PAIGGIala) 182-00 MMUG ARV MUE
W)6S @PMAGIECWIAS allmdalailajldlesnymm).

4-00 QAUBYfl) CUOAUMBS O Qldk)a] enileflod conAOBHEM
QMM (AlUOME DD

@RM) ) RIlHMAIA................

(@) RlH)MAIA....................
4-90 QlBH)afl0) CLOHBS @I Ald)a] milallend coVaIWclesn)an)

5—-00 Qldh)a]

Shri. M. Ummer : Sir, | move the following amendments.

183. In clause 5(1), after the words “The designated officer” the
words “or a person subordinate to him authorised to receive the
application” shall be inserted.

193. In clause 5(2), the words “in prescribed form” shall
be inserted before the words “to receive such application.”

Shri Palode Ravi : Sir, I move the following amendments.




9
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

185. In clause 5(1), the words “eligible person’ shall be
substituted by the words “applicant for services”.

Shri. Roshy Augustine : Sir, I move the following

amendment.

187. In clause 5(1), after the words “intimate” the words “in the
same day” shall be inserted.

189.  In clause 5(1), in between the words “applicant” and

“forthwith”, the words “in writing” shall be «wleeaiyceo.

Shri. Ramesh Chennithala : Sir, | move the following

amendments.

192. In clause 5(1), after the last sentence, the following
sentences may be added, “If any service has been
denied/rejected by the officer, causes and reasons for such
rejection/denial must be clearly stated and intimate to the
applicant. If it has found that the service has been rejected
or denied with out any substantial valid reason or
justification fine may be 1imposed to the erring
officer/officers in such a manner and way as may be
prescribed under this act.”

196. Recast clause 5(2) as follows:
“(2) An application received, including the online

application, under subsection (1) shall be duly



10
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

acknowledged by the designated officer or by the officer
authorised by him to receive such application.”

Shri. M. A. Vaheed : Sir, I move the following amendment.

198. In clause 5(3), for the word “start” substitute the word
“begin”.

(12, 3 2l06enEl: VB, BRARVMIBHUE MflBolee)amlal.

@l. Malleed: (1ol ago. D@ @PAIOGlafla] 183, 193 ag)aMT MMUG

CRBUMIHUE MIEWYHS @IMAMICWINS allidalrilajleleanyamy.

(L0 at0eeos oall @rAUI®Glafla) 185-00 MMUAB GEEVGIHUB MVE
W)6S @PMAGIECWIAS allmdalailajldlesnymm).

(0o, @00l @O GRAUI®Glafla] 187, 189 agMT MOUAB
CRBUMIHUE MIBW)HS @RMIAMICWINS allidalrilajleleanyamy.

(L0, ©eawd ealmmlomal  GRAIM®Gla{lay 192, 196 g MMUAG
CRBUV®| MIRW)AS @PMAMIGWINS allmBalailajlelea)amn).

(L0 ag)o.af). A10a0’1E3  @RAUIOGla{lay 198-00 MMUB GEEVIGI MVE
W)6S @PM)AGIEWIAS allmdalailajldlesnymm).

5-00 QUdh)a] enileload BOVAIBHEMOAMM (~IUdME DT

@RM) ) RlHMMAIA................

(@) RlH)MAIA....................

5-00 Qo] enileflend conaowWIBlee)mm).

@60 QAU)aflD CUOaHASS al)@® Qldh)a]

2l. Walleed: o eileflond covaal @ROO®]  @oEWIAIY

ealeQolal.

6-00 Qldh)a]

Shri. Benny Behanan : Sir, I move the following amendments.




11
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

207.  Inclause 6 for the words, “first appellate authority” the

words “appellate authority” may be substituted wherever

OCcur.

208.  In clause 6 for the words, “second appellate authority” the
words “state level appellate authority” shall be substituted

wherever occurs.

Shri. K. Sivadasan Nair: Sir, | move the following amendments.

213. In the proviso to clause 6(1) for the words “after the
expiry
of the period of thirty days” substitute the words
“forthwith”.

237. In clause 6 (8), for the words, “second appellate authority
and such applications shall be disposed of in the same
manner in which a second appeal is to be disposed of
under this Act”, substitute the words, “first appellate

authority and such an application shall be disposed of for
complying the earlier order and proceed in to the penal

provision and disciplinary action ”.

222. In clause 6 (3) after the words “time limit” the words

“after giving an opportunity to the designated officer



12
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

under Section 3 to file his explanation whatsoever for
denying the service if any” shall be added at the end.
225. In clause 6 (4) for the words “sixty days” the words
“thirty days” shall be substituted.

Shri. Roshy Augustine: Sir, I move the following amendment.

214. In the proviso to clause 6(1) for the words “thirty
days” substitute the words “fifteen days”.

Shri. P. C. Vishnunadh: Sir, I move the following

amendments.

216. In clause 6 (2), for the words “provide” substitute the
word, “render”.

236. In sub-clause (8) of clause 6, after the words “such non-
compliance may” the words, “within such period or may
be prescribed” shall be inserted.

229. In clause 6(5), delete the word “he may”.

Shri. M. Ummer: Sir, | move the following amendments.

218. In clause 6 (2), for the words “a specified period” the

words, “Thirty days” shall be substituted.

231. In clause 6(5) for the words “a specified period”
substitute the words “fifteen days”.

Shri. C. Moyinkutty: sir, I move the following amendment.




13
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

221. In clause 6 (3) after the word “limit” the words “or one

month, whichever is earlier” shall be added at the end.

Shri.P.B. Abdul Razak: Sir, I move the following amendment.

223. In clause 6 (4) for the word “aggrieved” the words “not
satisfied” shall be substituted.

Shri. T. N. Prathapan: Sir I move the following amendment.

224. In clause 6 (4) for the word “sixty” the words “forty five ”
shall be substituted.

Shri. Abdurahiman Randathani: Sir, I move the following

amendment.
235. In clause 6 (7) after the word, “limit” the words “or one

month whichever is earlier” shall be added at the end.

Shri. Sunny Joseph: Sir, I move the following amendment.

228. In the proviso to clause 6(4), for the word “that” substitute

the word “the”.

(12, 3 2l0enEl: VB, BRAV@IBUE MUflB0lee)amlal.

al. Walleed: (1ol eIl EMIaOMIM  @RAUMG]aflay 207, 208
ag)am’ muA CRBUN® B Ud MERW)6S @RMAGICWIOS
aflmdaieilajlelesnymm).

(00, O, LBIAURONVB MOWAB @RAIMGlaflay 213, 222, 225, 237
ag) T MMIB GRANMIHU3 TVRW)HS BRMIAMICWINS allMBalailaflol

£6)MN).



14
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

(02, 00Ul @RMAVIM  @oAI®®Glalla] 214-00 MMIAB GRBVM] MUE
W)6S @PM)AGIEWIRS alladalailajldlesnymm).

(007, afl.avl. afladem)mold  @eAIOGafla] 216, 236, 229 ag)aM’]
MMIB BRRNMIHUE MVRW)IAS @PMIAMIGWINS allmBalailajleles)am).

(00, ag)o. 222@ ERAIGGa{la] 218, 231, ag)aMT MMIB CERV®IHUI
MRW)AS @PMAMIGWIeS allm@alailajleles)mm).

(00, G2OWIM&H)S] @RAUIG®lafla] 221-00 MMIB CERL®] MEBW)AS
@RMA®ICWINS allmdalailajlolea)am).

(007, afl.enil. @eENIBYUWE OMLOE: @PAIOGlafla] 223-00 MMUG
CRBUV®| MURW)AS @PMIAMIGWINS allmalailajlele)amn).

(00, Sl. af)MB. (Al®IalB @PAUDMGaflay 224-00 MMIA CEBLI®I MLE
W)6S @PMAGIECWIAS allmdalailajldlesnymm).

(0. @ENIBY0aN1AM EEMoeM] @PAU®MGIafla) 235-00 MIUA
CRBUV® MIRW)AS @PMIAMIGWINS allmaliailajlole)amn).

(0ol el eIl @RAI®EG]ailay 228-00 MMUAB CEBV®I MLE
W)6S @PMAGIECWINS allmdalailajldlesnymm).

6-00 Qld)a] enileflond ONAOBHEMORAMM (AIUEME DT

@RM) ) RIlHMMAIA................

(@) RlH)MAIA....................
6-00 QUd)a] enileflond conaoWIBlee) M),

7-00 QUdb)al

(eern® @RAI®Cla{leeeaqlslal)
7-00 Qid)a] enileflond  ONAOBHEMORAMM (~IUEME DT
@RM) ) RlHMAIA................
(@) RlH)MAIA....................

7-00 Qidh)a] endlefload con@oWIBlee) M),



15
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

a}®00 Qld)alll CUOAHUMBS o)@NW Qldb)af

2l. Walleed: o milaflod vl GR@)OGME @REWIAT

90¢

ealeQenE®le).

8-00 QUdb)a]

Shri. Oommen Chandy: Sir, | move the following oral

amendment.
245. In sub-clause (2) of clause 8 for the word “penalty” the word
“fine” shall be substituted

ROV 8-621 HaIM@J] af)M AUISEIM aldhOo ©6a0B )M IOHe
Gal@BHEMo. BHO0EMo, @R HIMIG @O BCISED ©6a08 agaM)al
CONIEO)MYNE. @RM)OEINE  OIAODE TLORITIM)0 HOANNd  af)Mm
QUOHO  GalB@BOYM@IEM  @)0af)d)S] 6220alSO). @RM)OEHIENS @)
GRRUN®] @Ro11B:C1BHEMORAT) @RELAMI]E6)B:QI6M.

Shri. K. Sivadasan Nair : Sir, I move the following

amendments.
247. In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words “the second appellate
authority” substitute the words “first appellant authority”.
256. In clause 8(1)(b) for the words, “second appellate
authority”, substitute the words, “first appellate authority”.

Shri. Benny Behanan: Sir, I move the following amendments.



16
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

248. In clause 8, for the words “second appellate authority”
wherever it occures, the words “state level appellate
authority right” shall be substituted.

249.In clause 8, for the words “first appellate authority” the
words “appellate authority” shall be substituted wherever it

OCCuUrs.

287.1n clause 8(3) insert the words “including for making
relevant entries in the Service Book of erring officials”
between the words” disciplinary action and “against him”.

Shri.T. N. Prathapan: Sir, I move the following amendments.

252. In clause 8 (1) (a) for the words “five hundred,” the words
“one thousand” shall be substituted.
257. In clause 8(1)(b) for the words, “two hundred and fifty”
the
words “one hundred” shall be substituted.
277. In clause 8 (2), for the words “five hundred” the words,
thousand” shall be substituted.
284. The proviso to clause 8(2) shall be deleted.

Shri. Hibi Eden : Sir, | move the following amendment.

259.  Inclause 8(1)(b) for the words “two hundred and fifty

rupees”, substitute the words “two hundred and eighty

five rupees”.



17
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

Shri. P. C. Vishnunath : Sir, I move the following amendment
261 In clause 8(1)(b) for the words “two hundred and fifty
rupees”, substitute the words “four hundred rupees”.

Shri. M. P. Vincent: Sir, | move the following amendment

264.  In clause 8(1)(b), for the words “two hundred and
fifty rupees” substitute the words “six hundred rupees”.

Shri. P. A. Madhavan : Sir, | move the following amendments.

271.In clause 8(2)for the words “five hundred rupees” substitute
the words “six hundred rupees”.

Shri. Ludy Luiz : Sir, I move the following amendment

273. In clause 8(2), for the words “five hundred rupees” substitute

the words “seven hundred rupees”.

Shri. A. T. George : Sir, | move the following amendment.

274. In clause 8(2), for the words “five hundred rupees”
substitute the  words “ eight hundred rupees”.

Shri. Shafi Parambil: Sir, I move the following amendment.

280. In clause 8 (2), for the words “five hundred rupees” substitute
the words, “one thousand and two hundred rupees”.

Shri M. Ummer : Sir, I move the following amendments.




18
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

286.1n clause 8(3), the words “and in case of a bahitual and
willful defaulter” shall be inserted between the words
“under this Act” and “recommend disciplinary action”.

Shri T. A. Ahammed Kabeer : Sir, I move the following

amendment.
288. After clause 8(3) the following sub section shall be added
namely :
“(4) In the circumstances of these penalties imposed on a
designated officer or first appeal authority, an adverse entry

shall be made in the respective service record”.

(12, 3 2l06enEl: VB, BRARV@IBHWE MflB:olee)amlal.

(00, O, UTlAIBOTVAZ MOIWA @RAIMGlafla] 247, 256, ag)aMT MMUA
CRBUMIHUE MIEWYHS @RMAMICWINS allidrilajleleanyamy.

(00, ©eNIM] OENUAOMOM BRAUIGGalla] 248, 249, 287 ag)OM’ MMUA
CRBUMIHUE MIBWYHS @RMAMICWINS allidarilajlelseanyamy.

(00, Sl af)MB. (@0l @RAUOGafla 252, 257, 277, 284 ag)m’]
MMIB BRRNMIHUE MVRWIAS @PMIAMIGWINS allmBalailajlolea)amn).

(00, ©8a0mil WOAWM  ERAI®Gla{lay 259-00 MMUIB CEARV® MVLE
W)6S @PMAGIEWIAS allndalailajl@lesnymm).

(0. afl.avl. ailefemymold  @RAIMEGla{lay 261-00 MMUAB GEEV®)]
MRW)AS @PMAMIGWIeS allmalailajleles)mm.

(o). ag)o.afl. allm@eauad @rAUIOGlafla) 264-00 MAUB GEBOM (MVE
W)6S @PMAGIECWIRS allmdalailajldlesnymm).

(00, allag. @owWaI®  @PAI®Glafla) 271-00 MMUR CERVL®] TVE

W)6S @PMAGIEWIAS allmdalailajldlesnymm).



19
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

(w0l enall en@loy  @eAI®Glafla) 273-00 MMUB GRAVE@I @MUE
W)6S @PMAGIEWIAS allmdalailajldlesnymm).

(0. ag).gl. c=0deE @PAUOClafla) 274-00 MMUA GERRVIOI MEW)ES
@RMA®ICWINS allmdalailajlolea)am).

(00, auadl alomiled  @RAU®Gla{la] 280-00 MMIAB GEBL®I MLE
W)6S @PMAGIEWIRS allmdalailajldlesnymm).

(0. ago. 2@ @PAUOMGlaflay 286-00 MMUB GBI TVEW)OS
@RMA®ICWINS allmdalailajlolean)am).

(107, Sl.ag). @RanME &M@ GRAIMEG]a{lay 288-00 MMUB GEEV®)]
MRW)AS @PMAMIGWIeS allmalailajleles)mm).

MIa0}QOMER]S 2)6UIATD] @RAUIDGla{la) B8VERLOVE CERVGIOW

@RM) ) RIHMMAIA.................

(@) RlHMAIA....................

21613201 @AIMGlafla 8DERJ0VE: GERVM] MVE @BV 1H 0]l
©1H6) ).

GRBVM §alT® (alHI0MBS 8-%0 Qld)a] enileflomd covaIseem
QMM (AlUOME DD

@RM) ) RIlHMMAIA................

(@) RlHMAIA....................

CRBNM 21O (alHO02)S88 8-00 Qud)a] milallend onaoWIa]

HOYM).
af)500 QUdh)afl0) GUOAHUSS a)@1W Qldh)al)dh 3
Shri Ramesh Chennithala : Sir, I move the following
amendment.

289. After clause 8, add the following clause namely: -



20
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

8A Compensation for right holders;
“If any damage or loss has been sustained to the livelihood
perspectives of the right holder/applicant subsequent to the
denial/rejection of service with out any substantial valid reasons,
the loss/damages caused to him thereby on account of such
denial/rejection of service, the applicant may be paid such

compensation or relief as may deeme fit.”

Shri. M. Ummer: Sir, | move the following amendments.

292.After clause 8, the following clause shall be inserted
namely:-

“8 A. The provision of this Act shall be deemed to
the part of service conditions of the designated officer
including such officer of all Public Authorities.”

293.After clause 8, the following clause shall be inserted

namely:-

“8 A Right of appeal by the Public Servant-Any Public Servant
aggrieved by the order passed by the Second appellate authority in
accordance with section 8 of the Act shall be entitled to file an
appeal to the Head of Department/a commission constituted under
this Act, against such order with in a period not exceeding thirty days
of the receipt of the impugned order. The order of the Head of

Department Commission shall be final and binding.”



21
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

294 . After clause 8, the following clause shall be inserted

namely:-

“8 A Constitution of the Commission- For the purpose of this
Act, the Government shall constitute a commission to be called the
Kerala Right to Service Commission.

Provided that till such time the commission is not constituted
by the State government, it may, by notification, nominate an officer
of the State Government not below the rank of a Secretary to
government, to perform the functions and exercise the powers of the
commission under this Act.”

Shri. T. N. Prathapan: Sir, I move the following amendment.

295. After Clause 8, add the following Clause and renumber
accordingly.
“9 Application for revision- Any officer affected by an order of
the second appellate authority in respect of imposing penalty
application to the officer, nominated by the State Government with in

a period of 30 days from the date of order.”

(12, a3 2106nE]l: VB, BRRVGIBHUE MUflBolee)amlal.

al.  aVafleed: eilaflodd  covael  @@eHI  @RGWIAI]

ealegenzmlel.
(0. EEAUD H2IMIEDEl @RAIMGlafla) 289-00 MAUAB EGEBVM MVE

W)6S @PM)AGIECWINS alladalailajlclesnymm).



22
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

(0. ago. 9203 @PAUOGlafla) 292, 293, 294 M MOUR

CRBUMIHUE MIBW)HS @RMIAMICWINS allidarilajleleanyam).
(00, Sl ag)M. (Al®9ald @RAUIO®lafla] 295-00 MMIB GERV®] (VLE
W)6S @PMAGIEWIRS allmdalailajldlesnymm).
8-00 Qld)a] enileflond BONAOBHEMOAMM (AIUdME DT
@RM) ) RIlHMMAIA................
(@) RlH)MAIA....................

8-00 QUd)a] endleflond conaoWIBlee) M),

9-00 Qidb)a]

Shri. K. Muraleedharan : Sir, I move the following amendment.

297.  Inclause 9, for the words “which is in good for the done”,

substitute the words “done in good faith”.

(0. ©oM 2106MEl: LA, BRAUN®)] (mﬂcﬁs(o'lcﬁs)ym'l%.

al. MWalleed: (ol o, 2)es8Twomd  @eAMGlafla) 297-00 MG

CRBUV® MVRW)AHS @PMAMIGWINS ailm@aiailajlele)mn).
9-00 Qdh)a] enilafload coV@LHEMEAM LD MNEDTD
@RM) ) RlHMAIA................

(@) RH)MAUA...........cecoee.

9-00 o_loe:),cﬂ’ enfleflond onaowl@lee)m,.

B08al®I0 Qidh)afl0) CGUOHMBS @I Qldk)a]

Shri. T. N. Prathapan : Sir, | move the following amendments.

298. After clause 9 add the following clause and remember

accordingly



23
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

“10 Display of Services- The Services and the stipulated time
limit shall be displayed in every department concerned for
information of the public”.

Shri. N.Samsudheen : Sir, I move the following amendment.

299.After clause 9 add the following clause and remember
accordingly,

“10 Evaluation of performance using advanced technology:-

Performance of designated officers and appellate authorities shall
be evaluated with the help of advanced technology and best
performances in each District of the State shall be awarded in the

manner prescribed”.

(0. ©oMB 2106ME]: VA, BRBUNMG (D (ruﬂoe:«ﬂce@gmﬂ%.

al. Walleed: (1o, Sl.ag@. (aAl®alm@ GRAIMGafla) 298-00 MMIAG

CRBUV® MVRW)AS @PMAMIGWINS ailm@aiailajlelea)amn).

(00, ag)MB. ato)BIMB  @RAUMGlaflay 299-00 MMIB @ERV®] MLE
W)6S @PMAGICWINS aflmBalailajloles)mm).

nilaflod BOVALIED®)OGIMNE @REWIAI] algalay.
9-00 Qld)aflM CUUMBS @ Qld)a] enilajled oVadseEMeAM
LD N OB

@RM) ) RlHMAA................

(@) RlH)MAUA...........ec.e..

9-00 QUdh)afl) CUOUMSS @I Old)a] enilajlend conaoWIBlee)am)



24
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

10-90 QUdb)al

(eeB1@] @rAUIOGla]leo6qls1al)

2l Malleed:  10-0o0 Qo] nilafleoad  cOVAILeHEMEAN

(UEM O
@RM) ) RlHMAIA................
(@) RlH)MAIA....................

10-00 QU)o enileflond con@oWIBlee) M),

11-00 QUdh)a]

Shri. V.M. Ummer Master: Sir, I move the following

amendment.
304.1n clause 11 (1) after the word “Gazette” the following words
shall be inserted: “with In six months from the date of its

passing”

(12, 3 al0enEl: VB, RV MVIle:dleeymMlg).

2l. Walleed: (0. all. ago. 2@ 20qUA  @PAUOGlaflay 304-00

MMUIG BRAVMI MERW)OS @PM)AMICWINS allidalailajldlesnymm).
11-00 QUdb)a] nilafled OMAILEHMOAM (AlUOMODTD

@MY )AL MAA................

(@) RNH)MMAUA........coneeeeee.
11-00 QUdb)a] nilalend conaswicles)amn,.

12-90 Qidh)a]

(ees0®@] @rAIOCla{leeeqlslal)
12-00 Q)] milajlemd coVaIBeHEMeERM (AlUEMODD
@RM) )AL MAIA................
(@) 2N MAUA.........cooceceeee.

12-00 Q)] enilejlomd conaoWIBlee)mM).



25
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

1-90 QUdh)aio allole:®)o Gald)o

Shri.T. N. Prathapan : Sir, | move the following

amendments
109. _In the title, the word ‘STATE’ shall be deleted.
110. In the title after the word ‘TO’ the word

‘PUBLIC’ shall be inserted.
117.  In clause 1 (1), for the words “Kerala State Right to
Service Act, 2012” the words “Kerala Right to public Service Act,
2012 shall be substituted.

Shri. C.P. Mohammed : Sir, I move the following amendment.

113. In the long title for the words, “the delivery of ’ substitute the
word ‘guaranteeing’

Shri.P. K. Basheer : Sir, I move the following amendment.

119. In clause 1 (2) after the words “in to force” the words and
figures “on the 1% of January 2013” shall be inserted.

Shri.M.P. Abdussamad Samadani: Sir, | move the following

amendment.
120. In clause 1 (2) after the words “in to force” the words “on
the expiry of one hundred and eighty days of its passing”
shall be added.

Shri.Therambil Ramakrishnan: Sir, | move the following

amendment.



26
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

121.  Inclause 1 (2) insert the word “Government” between the

words “The” and “Gazette”.

(12, 3 2l06enEl: VB, BRARVMIBHUE MflB:olee)amlal.

@l. Walleed: (Ko Sl ag)MB (@I  GRAUMG]a{lay 109, 110, 117

ag) T MMUB BRG] MVRW)HS @PMAMICWINS allmdalrilajleles)ym).

(L0 Mlail. @aomE  @RAUOGla{la] 113-00 MMUG GEEVG MVE
W)6S @PMAGIECWIAS allmdalailajldlesnymm).

(0. allod. 1B  @PAI®Clafla) 119-00 MMIB GERO@I TVLE
W)6S @PMAGIEWIAS allmdalailajldlesnymm).

(107 ago.adl. @RIGyTLAG aMVARIM]  @PAIGGlafla) 120-00 MMUAE
CRBUV®| MRW)AS @PMAMIGWINS allmBaiailajlolea)amn).

(0. G@OMIIT3  EIMB atiemn(d @RAU®®Claflay 192-00 MMUA
CRBUV® MIRW)AS @PMAMIGWINS allmalailajlele)am).

=00 Qldlajlo aflO0l&HWio Gald)e 6nilaflend e ovAdBHEMORM
(UEM OO

@RM) )Rl MAIA...............

(@) RlH)MAIA...................

1-00 Qldh)ajjo aflole®)o Galdyo milaflond comadwlales)amn;.

@)0Mo0 QOWM

(W0, ©oM  al0enEl: VA, 2012-621 GHOS TLOMUAIM  GILAIMO

U000 NI AlOTYIBOHMOAMN (alGRo MIM BRA®Glaflee)m).
SH{aHl®)o ALNMOOH:UMA)0 @RSIW)o ETYAUMOID)o QUdb)al)

(] (10 Od.ail. BRIOMAB): MVA, FMINB (AICAWHDE® AllM®I6B8RIaM).

(12, 2008 al06nEl VA, eI 1Bl (alouileeyamlal.

MA)EOS  TVOMUAIMEE®  MVoNIMWIafISEEIBo  aBQaljo  (AIWIMea]]
Ml@aaoe). BMEEBUBHS &SI agQljo ALl @RAIBOUAEM. D

NG  ag)2loAI0}OSW)0  MANHOMEDDIS)E)S]  aldqYISHEMORANIEN)



27
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

@R(Nalaf®. af)MoLno (al@laldH G@ROMIEEBRUZ @RAIO)OS (al®IGaHWo
(l®S1aflee)EmIoP)o  @RAIOYES AlGEIGHUAOW afltm)em @ enilejlm]
af)M HEMM @G  AUSHOWWIdho MVEMMIaUA). 0D nilad el msa]l
RIDHOYH af)MM@OEN) alfle@i. aBQaljo CAUNEDITE MSaflelnssdd, =m
6BBU3H6 @RMIOM (AICWORMo al)BePadW)o LIElB)AU0M8 GOl MSals]
HUB oD vaemeand auleclene  @REHICIOIGE  !AlINdeATd
(@160 2206n1RLA0OEMMAIWIHHYM). D@  aldqYIHETDHOEMOAM)
@RE AGI1H6)M).

@l. Malleed: QAUSOO (AJWIMea|S 60) 6NTd aldMVIEe)d Y

CHO8 MWAMIE alBl(@ODICRIGS GHSEN)HWOIEM. 2012-60L1 GHOS
MUOMUAIM BIVAIM BRAIEOUD NITE AlOTYILHEMEOAM (~ICAWEDD
@RM) )Rl MAIA...............
(@) RlH)MAIA...................
(alGO@o MVE @RoU1d:®12fl6le6)m).

endl@d aloquowicleanyamn;.

(2) 2012-6e1 G£AMEOAUGIOD (SQY, CHIFIEH6IS (MVo®oRo

QeI HnS)H0e)o A0 Aaleno) eniled

alyalmowaljo aflalomuocedlealeo Ad)apal®] (Wl all. e6.

) 6moelleegl): U, quenines &gl 0leajods 621P® (aldh00
g8 2012-e2  GHOREMOAUGIOD  (SQY, CHIFIEH60S  (MVodoRo
alleiess)eeano ©eHaIQo ealgel)o) il alGlNEMMWOBHS)HO6M
QMM (alGa®o 6MIM GRAI®®Glalee)m).

S )0 ALNMOOH:HUMA)0 @R2SIW)o CAYAUMOID)o QUdb)al)

ol (V). ed. all  Gmda0mMm): MA, 6MINB  (AIGRWE DT

aflB®o68E)M).



28
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

2l MWalleed :  a0)@0Meqls  almiqud  agermsslelo
(MoLOB1HH) MY BENZ0?

QlyaInuoaloe afllemocs@le:0lo Ald)aia(®] (W0l ofl. e6.

H)6000el80)51) : VB, DEaOUd TVoMLOGlEs)MMAl.

@l. Malleed : alcwirme)dla] MTHIW (0. ag8ado 0o,

(0o, adl. vowdl, (WOl UL &yatiemmd, (00l MVOR) GalduB, (VD). . e®:.
allze, ol all. agal. V@I H)R08 agamlaud migleflalom ol
M@ C_AVM®I @RAIMGIa]laflal. 6RO MEWINS BRM)AMICWIS)

S| aflmdaleilajleles)mm.

(W0 0. MESTWOM : VA, TVENIRGHS Helgl 61ealodS ©aIT®
(1500288 2012-621 CHIREMBOAUGIOD (SAY, CHIFIEH6S (Mo®oRo
allegesssyseeo  ©OH@IQo  eal@eno) micd  aflnslo  G@REO
MeNIRGS  HAIJlWes  alClweMMWEs GPRWHOMOAIN  CRRNO)]
MO @RAI®Ga{leeyam).

2. MWalleed : (1. ed. ME8TWEND, GREERW)eS 2(6nil) MU

GREV® (o) ©alQ)M)E6ME0?

(0. 6. MESTWOM : MG, (T ealgyarlal.

al. Ualleed : (0. eglwom @PA®Glafla) 2(enil) MmMUG

CRBUV® MRW)AS @PMIAMIGWISIE)S] ailmaiailajleles)amn).

qeniRss  Hoilgl  0leaods eldoalso00)88  2012-66
GHOREMBOUTIOD  (STY, CHIFIEHHS (Modoco Aflaiess)seealo
©6H2000  Balgeno) MG alBlEMMWEE  af)S}HOEMEA
(AIGQQEODD....

@RM) ) Lilee)mMaAId....

(@) eilleeamald......

(AlGa@o (MR @RoU)1d:@1ajlBlee)m).



29
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

i@ alBlNEMMWOEHS)HEN)aN).

U)o} @10la )88 alelnemm

2-00 Qudh)aj

(eBe1®@] @paI®Cla]lesaqlslal.)

: 200 QUdb)a] Niaflod ONAILOMOAMN (AlUTMOOD....
@RM) ) RlHaMAAd ......

(@) elleenamald.......

2-00 QUd)a] enilejlomd conaWIBlee)mm).

3 2)®@3 9 UEOWIBS Aldh)al)dHud
: 6BRLOIWIE).
3 )@@ 9 AUPOWB8 Adajeud milallem cINAdLeeMmeAm
(O MODTD). ..
@RM) ) RleenmmMald ......

(al@ ) elleenymmald.......

3 2)@@3 9 AUWOOW88 AU )ajd13 milallem conadwlclesm).

10-90 Qidb)a]

alyalmowalo aflalomocedlealo AUd)ajal®] (Wl all. e6.

SH1eomoeilee)g)) : avd, In clause 10(2), the words “of payment” shall

be deleted ogom smesyIMe: ceBVEI MM @RAIGEA{leeyaM).

@l. 0alleed : MUa0)AIMEa|s AT @RAUIOGla{la] 68DEEL0U 6

GRBNMI MUE @RoU1d:d12flElee)mm).

CRBVM ©alT® (al®002)88 10-00 Q)] milallend cOVAILs
eMORAN (lUdMODV....
@RM) ) leeamMAd ......

(@) alleenamald.......



30
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

GRRNM 6210® (00288 10-00 ald)a] enilaflond conaowlel
£69)0M).

11 2)@®3 15 AIeeW)8S8 Qld)al)&ud

2. NVallBeed : cs@em@'lmﬂ%.

11 2y@@d 15 aloow)88 AUd)aje:ud milallend comadensmea
LD MNOD@D....

@RM) ) RleenaMAad ......

(@) ailleenamald.......

11 0)@®@3 15 AleoW)88 Qld)afid>0d mnilaflomd conadwlmlee)mm).

16-%0 Qldh)a]

QlyaIuoalo AflleMIeE@ 00 AUd)ajal(®] (WOl ofl. ed.

semmoelsosl): aud, In clause 16, for the words “Subsidiary

corporation, and”, the words “subsidiary corporation or other agency

of the Government, and” shall be substituted. agon evesjos;
eRRV®] 63 @RAIMGalenym).

al. MWalleed : MIa0)@omeals AW GRAIOGla{la B8DEE5UIe:

CRBUV® MVE @RoW1d:0lajlelee)yam).

CRRVON 6alT® (alH00M88 16-00 ald)a] enilajled conaoss
eMORAN (AlUdMED....

@RM) )l aMAd ......

(@) elleeamald.......

CRENMN £alP® (al®00M88 16-00 ald)a] nilaflond covadwa)
H)N).

17-90 Qid)a]

(eBeV®IHUB GRAUIGGla{les6qlslal)



31
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

2l Waflleed : 17-00 b)) enilejlod cOVAILEEHEMEA
(lUOMEBTO).

@RM) ) RlHeaMAId ......

(@) alleenymmald.......

17-%0 aud)a] nilaflend covawicles)mm.

18 2)@@3 28 AOOW)B8 AUd)al)hud

2. Nalleed : cs@em@'lmﬂ%.

18 2y@@d 28 AlooW)88 AUd)ajd0d milallend comadensmenm
(UM DTD). ..

@RM) ) LleenamMad ......

(@) elleenamald.......

18 )@@ 28 o088 AUd)ajd>3 milallend conadwlclesm).

29-%0 Qid)a]

ShriThomas Unniyadam: Sir, | move the following

amdnement.
100. In clause 29(c) for the words “with imprisonment for a
term which may extend to two years” the words “for three

years” shall be substituted.

(12 afl. 8. HyeEmoLlen)sl: mad, eeeV®] qulle:clesmmlal.

(V0. @MU PEPIWISMB BRAIOGlafla) 100-00 MMUA CEEVGI TVEW)OS
@RMAMICWINS ailmalailajlolea)am).
29-%0 Qud)a] milajlemd cOVAIEHEMERMM (alUdMOTID.
@RM) ) RleenmmMald ......

(al@ ) elleenymmald.......

29-%0 Qud)a] milajled covawcles)mm;.



32
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

30 )@@ 35 AUOOW)BS AUdh)al)dhud

al. Malleed : ca@,em(a)’l@’l%.

30 2)@@3 35 AUEOW)BS Qldbla]j&ud mileflond cINAdLeEMeAM
(lUOMODTD....
@RM) &) AleenmmMald ......

(@) elleenymmald.......

30 2)@@3 35 OOWIBB AUB)ajeud milajlond conaWIBleeyaM).

1 ©0 2 90 alglé
ol. NVallBeed : IOl \I/=TX

190 2 90 algl®a18 enflaflem cowaosesmennm (AlUOMODD....
@RM) ) RlHenaMAAd ......

(@) alleenamald.......

1 90 2 90 algl®:&0d milajlond comaIWIBlee)aM).

3-90 alglé
(eBe1®] @oaI®dla]leseaqlslal.)
2l @alleed : 3-0%0 aiSle  enilafleond  EOWAILeHMeAN
(O MODD. ..
@RM) ) lHeaMAId ......
(@) elleenymmald.......

3-00 algl® enilajlond conadWImlee)mm).

1-90 ald)alio all0l&:W)o Gal®)o

2. NValleed : cs@em@'lmﬂ%.

1-050 aim)ajlo aflol®®)o @ald)o 6nilajleom EoVAILHEMEAM



33
Uncorrected / Not for Publication

(al@ ) elleenymmald.......

1-90 ald)afio allole®)o Gald)o Mmileflond comnaowloles)am.

2)0MJo QM

aljaimowaljo aflalomuocedleale Ald)apal®] (Wl all. e6.

) 60moeilee)sl) : aud, 2012-ea! ¢HREMEAUTIOD (ST, CHIFICHHIS

(Moooco ANRITEHOS)H6RI0 HOBHAIQ0 Haleo) NIlTd AldqYIHHEM
QMM (alGa®o MM GRAI®®lalee)om).

S aHl®)o ALNMOOHUMA)0 @R SIW)o CAYAUMOID)o Qdb)al)

(o] (WO 8. all. G@Oa0OMM) : qUAB, 6MIM (AICAWEDTD
aflomoesRyam).

al. Malleod : MIa0)RIMOQ]s BT TVOMVIB]HHYIM)EENZ0?

(W0 _adl. &d. @)emorile)sl: UG, B8O) QAOEH) AIMGCA alOW)

M88). s ©MIOM&He8e00  BIRCRIMRHIRI  (AIGHHIBO  MSOTD]
(al@lalddo  B)S]  @M)d)ella] TVEIMIUEEDIOS aldYICHS  60)
endlaflom @M)H)elee008 @RAIMEAIIO® Gl  @P@ITd Allaua
@eNs.  a@OWIRo OV NIlGd  HOANMAINW]  ADTVILSICDOEMEAD
@REGOMAOlee)am).

al. aUalleed : 2012-601 EHOREMOIGIOD (SAY, CHIFICH60S

(Momoco ANRITEHOS)H6RI0 HOBHAIQ0 Haleo) NIlTd AldqYIHHEM
QM (AIGRWHE...

@RM) ) Lilee)MAId....

(@) eilleenyamald......

(AlGa@o (MR @RoU1d:@1ajlBlea)m).

endl@d aloqVoclenyam;. (wmailmleowmeniled)



	A©mw hIp-¸n\\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp-¸v-
	Ggmw hIp-¸n\\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v-
	an. kv]o¡À:  CXv _nÃnsâ `mK-aÃ. AXp-sIm­v AtUm]väv sNt¿-­Xn-
	F«mw hIp-¸n\\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp-¸p-�
	H³]Xmw hIp-¸n\\v tij-ap-ff ]pXnb hIp¸v

