1

I on.onil. XIII-coHos8 mowaacue/XII-13

al®1gaNdo CHOE8 MIVAIVE
al@»6N2do MLEINSMo
MIOAMVEI MSalS1dhud -aVo(@ao
(@2106BL00OM0EBUS BY10G,)

2014 canlavoeni@® 17, enjwad

moacve edaileel 8.30-m" mia0nomeals aaquég’] M1ood Wyl ag)m.

MO BRERL AU T MTVWATVRIAOISIT CGWIWo Bal@N.
(8.30 @3 9.30 oo @21963100MO TVAWO)
@RaOGEUDJ alMo

®»1@Q 1961 @GR A6Mo

ol oWaligl aWl69E: o 0@HIMOOMIDLl  Oalat0loc1o) 16-12-2014-@3
920  ®1QJaE]l @r@aeMmomcd 130-cildo &:S1ohud DUWINA NS BREMEo
GalBd6” 210UM Mayeqls. AMAUIAMNVISHIO® MGBH1® MDD BlHAMOW TVE
@Ralela 1asam.

(aICOMEGOISSS @RYBOMYal®HAIW] TVRICWIEBUS @RI |TVAW.  af)EIMY’



mlan” ammMo m@mm%.)
@R ST 0(@JCAWo

28y MGEIWM MWDo

ol 6)cwoJé§1 M16038: @Safls 418 MQeuWes” milwQo acaIMo alejm
MSOMIMBB  HOLITVMAV” M@IHMI, ANIWOILHSINL!l HOQALHCAW  BY1QUIHHDI
@ses] el @1 @alfdally] O GIBROMEBBBOS aNLINIW]  TVMYBM
D3 MIGEIWMHRAN N®Wo @RSIAGT 2] MoMNIMAD ABIDaICWIWo AIYdaldn0W]
AI@RV1o (18630100088 MSalSldudgelo @@mo@I%g@@oqﬂ al0Wealgam
muaI®afleudato MLoNIAWaj OAMHOD® AVRIMSAISIHUY MIQOMIAIA] 2I@a)
§21Q6MAAANINUNNA]S” TVAQYWYT af). @JBlald20ad, all. o)V, MG HMIAG,
M. Od. MM, af). O, VURIBM af)aM MI20MIMealg @RoWEBUW Qud S50

@PAIVEL" 6MISTIV” M@ 10 gene”.

MOVINIMLMOje DORRINYe  a)PNGMYo Al QD] (). . nioeny):

2BJMNOOMIT  @RSINVNIMAIENIW]T  WIHIT  MOQ0Je  QAUBOMIMW  AVAHHIA
oe3wlasanlel. MO ®IBAIMOASHNIDTI@BAN MIWAE-9HM 2 0CRIQHOS

MoMITWa] @I@BRIMOASABAM@®IMIEM” Q.AWl.af)al. GCWIWo A@HITVEHW



3

2JDMEIN|SON]VISBB® . QIBEU2JQIGBD 2D3L00VBMm1Yelo CH O
MVYOOMIMENBILAD  (@JDJIPLIDMo  HMINDRISOMIM  arlojo &SIV MBYo

SH0QIM DIBOOIM 2| o JD]I® @IBROMEBS]EHS A3)MVEMIT M0Qo AUBO]

QY00 ldhn0W] m350 BLHNIND BGaldaM af)am @RYBOIAlMo
@RS1IMOIMDOIR6M .
Uyl af). @JB3lald:m0a@: 2015002ISN0W] MVoMLNIM DI

233Q18MRSBORIN”  (@JeI}dnlla|OdIenes” MSe sl  ABjMWo  GAIISIMo
GHOPYo @H@Hoaﬂoel GOMICHNIVYWVo GAIME] MSILBSIV®IM. M1WNA 1000V
M1eINI@EHITD ABJMVAM” NVABEHIBIEMFHAN” DD TN Ho@OHAN BHISOY U3
AUBMRIANHHYIED.  CRHISHIWIG MM DSA2|WIWT MING  DSAHUBHS
@RAELINIW QAN UWBB6N80B:6MIIgo NOIWIW  MSHAISTE  MSODMIOD)
MINABDSOAHOB  MVa0IW]HBAN VA la IMAI6MN” MBHHIB VIO 1HBBANDY .
MVPaO0OE® D33019MNIHHIM88 9630nel 418 MIQMU3 0JS1VMIEHSVQSBOY.

NYaflo BHISHIQESDUBNQHSYSS AladroMesBUd MM Waledenadlonad asyM®o
@R(JICWINTHAIHMINDIM  Od®S1QI106M. 5010, O®IFIB  CaRILIRS®3
HDALINMBIGHAN (@JDLILIMo MVoNITWaf al0oMo MSTAMIN@WIAN A3 MWDo

COIIIEN T OF DBJO®IHG  AVEEG]  GHOYMDIOMEB0]sjo  milaicoeRaVy”



4

amg”ag((gce;@WeJ@smg@Q 23O GoauMlow’  aVlaye/@odal’  aulaye
B30 |IODMD@IOMEB0]ajo  @YAUWVYHNERIE M@IMIV] Mlea MIG2RIMo
MSQDMDOMEB0ajo  BRYGELI.alleneMo. N3y LIBY®  B&0af
2L15002IS00W1 TUMYABE) 2By MIGEIWMo af)AN B0Ya]ISIM A ECOVENZHIEM”.

MM AflaHWo MANOHOD® MVERI MSalSlhud MBI 2184 &alQ)eMo.

DONININDLMAJe DORRIAJe afOORTo Al AD] (W) . niden)):

@elyoall® 03y MOO®IG 0Qo  AUGBOMOIMW  WAINMBOAAT  DDOIHO
@@B2oMfIgel.  aVIGaoy ®IMNIELOQSS BIWVAIWT @1 ARIA/Gandd aRIAd
GaNISLIHUIA  HALITVMAY aJDABAN  TV@Y3IWo MIBOMLNGEH].  HFleom
0AIMOAIHAZ HOLIOD 152 nioQdud @ravaIdla] LNIMO 8D lelpulolnleny
soo@alno 60 af)eMOMIM” MI@D0M” HOLINVABIY mmme’l%ﬂgggm‘i 6nM
NAIMOHAAY MIQBBOS  (@JAUBADM  TVAWO  HOPHQo  MIIB  HOLITVABY
@RMAISTIABMIMMSB3  BRWIHI00  aldRIIWADHUWIHN M@ HHQo  QINIGAW
0aldalg” 21082 50000 @e1wossl aIBella{lo8H@e  HOEAINS  AIYOOAD
n3jomlong @egal’ 15 eNgoow »EBER®HQo ABYo ANERIMGIMNSS (@JIWaIGIW]
21 clomO©  BOPHQo A3 OBIOM@IN0  QAIY0aIhnoR]  GMIWAIG) H6M

(@JQIB@DMEBBUY MSOD HWYo AW~ @RAW1H:H03 OAVAZQBHUIH 303



5

65S10IeIWldo  @al TVa0IWo MBB:®HQo  H2IQIgME.  GENIIWAID &M
@AUCOMMEBBROS BIWAIWVT 28y AN |MWOS EMIMIM  &HOA AUGBOMIMo
@D@AUYT 23) DalGBIWo WEMIMIW] GHOPIMo TVIWafIgMs. BB MVOH]HY
hlnblw] nilalgozay’ G528 |B0aHU] a @1 63®§“6)e|ggce)uﬁ
@MAIBIEBHWIOLIAN” @1TBRIM]ofIgens. NINQMHUT @RS )o@ OY
aDRINIQYENBIB:IM  H@IYIB3  MaYo  MVoMITWaf O®IFILINE]  TVoCLISMEU3
MleaIBMEEBUE  VAdq{laflgemne. AMOWOIY MO  CALWILH]WEAJIUd
MILHSeel n3y0ile|mos 60% QIBRLM YNV B BB HWIG.
O3WERINM HNlaHM 0160351003 @RSINOIMEMIT MD MVAHHIAB (@JeIydalla)
NBJNOOMIT  M3Qo  AIBOIWISIAL MNIOQDHBNOWT  NINWERIS GBSOV
Msomla{l@d arly omzowlgiel. MO W10Ll a@Q0lo @JARIMNIVW QlBs1RI6eM”
Jay® GHMY QANE1IEBMM®. MIB GaNISEISAHOB TUIWIM]af TVBHHIVOM
@RSIN01HHIMBB  (UPHAIEM (@D laldHo MSOMIDANIMENIVABIND@ . @RSITVOIM
MM 2390 AUGBOMIO® ABY LIBYD® 0] HBINIFEAIIBHIMIEM” MVBHHIAB
WRABAN®. MMV OflaH®o aTUVRI MSalSldhud MIBOMIALL] alBa] ©2IGQYMS
@RQlusolel.

Qeya@) (). 9@ 2106n2]): @.AULagal. VAINBOAT HHHIENFAIAN




6

23§MOOHIG3 GRSINLNIMAIEAIY WIHDI@ MIQ0Qje  AUBOMIN DE3UBlBsaMIL].
0pI1S0°LISMW] 3y M1GOIWMo MSa o8N »1@rIMO®IGIMIaN”
afleMIgEaIdZIEL.  MIAUGORIV"  BHIBA|EOAHHY 63’D§U6)EI(%093(I3 alo’
QB aHO 10088313 ad@eNMoQo SDLIOMIH630. enM coaleiwleel
O®IY1LINS]HUIHBMNROW  HDIYIBZ MaHo HEMSHINLISOD GRAIAHS OO IWIW
MVORGHUIMO DO |AUBADAN@IM.  DOGYelo AEMIBAVEANIIQ PO DONENZSIW
®MIO12JS1Qo  AVABHHIB  WHEAIMIW] I6MOHWIEM . mlwad, a0
a108eIQHHUBHe” MILINleigs  gmi” HOLITVMIT” @SOEMEAIHVWIND MVosNINW] af
@GRl @IBRIMOASASM®IM.  A3YAllaleIGIMIMMe  AVYaOHDD)
QMU HBIMD@ MU | NI GENIOWAID HHQ6M (@JOIB@DM6BBUY
MSO@DINE®INSIa o D3IMICGEIWMAJo  ABJAId2RMAje  AVAMIW]a(la)’
aDLI@JBR0W MSalSldg8now] aVAHHIB AGIMIZEAIIGB:IN@®IEM. DD QflaHWo
MVRIMSaIS1H U3 MIBOMIALa) 21@2] alGQENE @RYAIVDJAIEL.

(@RSIVAM0(JEAWINUDOMOMIM” GRADAD] Gﬂ(‘éoﬂduﬂgﬂ)

(waldennd” Mleln10sS1a8 @@EaHW af VAT Ofl. ag)aV: @0.9OM3M3,
avl. 31106003, DO gl. CMIAAV, af). Odh. VUWIWBM af)aMT (@D ]aldHd: U]

CNDIBHUB (@JTYIAUM MSOMIWEURaHo BRAIOAUMOS aldB3] ERoWEBBEBINSIq jo



7

MEWIGMIMN”  aJOOWEN®:HYo  GRE|JTVAVONIMERaHo @@

@QJ@)@.)
UL AH M H B3
(1) eR®™IeIaY @RoMN&” VA &khaI0wIel
Wl all. enil. @RMIUE OaVID:. @06l ©0REBBNIW] G030

aJRIA@MIAUBAN  QI§0aI00-TVIMVIA]H: MINWEBBo AY" TVIMUCD]H-O®IFI3
@DAITVEEBBo  BRYUMIL:  NWBal" EIRYEBBUB OB |IABMMDI@  EHOS1VAE
MDH1Q TVoRIAUMB:Bo alBlNEMlaf  TLOMLOIMOD BT BRAMIOIaY GO
VAQHLINWIRI  AUNIACHNMEBD BRDANIGAISHIDRIEM, @O
MVBQJHLINUDIRI WILNIBMOIAOWIB MoMNIMOMIHA  aflallw  caeILIRHU3Hs”
@R CGMSM0HH Qo AlE3uwd Al od™mNOlHud aflaflw csoeaoggoeaus al01esaM@1mMOW]
eailes af) NG 2 |BANDAIS] MLoMLNIM @I 1M MOLIT3 Q@AM
CAYIDTVNEIHHEQo Ha1Qo. QNAIBODM aldlB8IaHI oWOD® MILINIM@IHBAM

O®IYIB3 MVIW DM HSID ald:@IWeIWldh0jo  @ROMIT BlaHWI,INWIG]LB6H20M

¢3WIY  AlDeMIM  HolaHOP SHOMBOMLIHUE BT GRADIVIaY
M1eInnoom 1888 @RoMid MVABQBHLIDUDILIYHS @1RYQUUD § SHDWIE

Dlel I IS Ol IR 21y’ MV2J0d oG] M13BG3U0633UI



8

MSa{lenesmM®IMIVT  MIeWIWla al00LNS] 00003 &5l HeN1aHOHA (@ JWIM
M1BB300J0 @ROMIE; MVABQGEINUIIL! (FBalldhOlHHMORM®IVWI@a. aflaflw
coaleldglenl  @oomil  8aHQMIWT  MINWealS  aloMo  MSODAM
@YWIOBNEIMSBHIM”  uNdaIMeEB8o  Afl3J0AMO:SAME.  @RYCNISDEIOH 3
M1eIM@EBaN  0aH1®  TVIa02l0}EBRSIG3  AISGMMAGAN  @ROMI  BIaHWOS
@JOWIM @D IMMAY@AIW]T  AVoLNIMH@®  ABLIAMO]BHU3H” AN
M1einnenss afld|ocyoavajo HMIYIGE MVMUIBMAOJo JaR® MVAQBe10000e1 Y]
MLOWIRIGZAAIN@ QAUTR@WIEN.  AIRJOBIM” AIGHLIB:00iWo MVMNIM DD
B8  GRAMIVIY  @ROMIE: MVAQYHLIUIL!  TLNdallasM@IM” MSals]
MU H@1H8H6Mo.

fl3§08500V  Qldka D] (). all. Bd. @EMIB 0M)): CHOSOMIBI B3T3

@RoMId’ MVABQIB-LI0U00E] NI 1HEHEMHDANBBD®” QIBaHEBRBIVYBS3
@RYAIUM06M . RAVIN’ 0ICR@B V208 He0191QOSWo alderNS] HmI1GIYOSV
W1laldB30Wes  @RSITLNIMOMIGE  MVouNIM  aVAHMIAB  06.05.2008-@3
0J00a]g0lls] 200"  (@JHI0o  CHESOMIGI  @ROMIIG: AVABQIHHLINUIAI
Bat15H01EHNMEMIWIFNE. HO8OMIGE RIMI-0® GB36HMEMY @ROMIT BIaHI

alOlMIBOBOSWo  OMIPIB  EMGMABOSQo  af)eIRo  QAUGEU12JQIRNESWI6M.



9

@RONI  BoaHWQo MVoVIVNJe MTIHIW  MVoRIAIMBUB  CHOBSOMIG3 MIoaIW]
MVIPa0Td:  MOQEBBUIBH  BHIVEMMIWIFMNE.  EHOSOWIOLl 2M®  AflBL0EL0MV
HVEMAVIG3 @ROMIE: AVAQHLINUIRI  MUNIAHBAN® VoI Wla] alOoMo
MSOM] 016aJ033" TVABa{laflgms. @ROMIE: TVAQYBEI0000El MNIa lesIM@IMm
MNQalENIW IWBAIMo  HODHOBNICBBNMEM IO ACMMISIVWIV]  EHOBOM1SLI
@ROMIlD: CHICBERHOBVYo IR O HODo aJOOABB @M &,
MVBQYMHLIDUWILIHOBQo  MoNINWlal WMHIQY Aldsqa(load MIBE3UD (@) 000
GUORIM1 2] AAIEEBUY al0]ajGUdato MBNIVJo MABHHNIB AlF1GUIW]BBAMNMIE.

(2) @rgqelos1vleel alglsaidy wwlgwaeemo

@Wl. 9. all. olBYAIANV! aldelends’ Klolvloel @rSaloS] caalelo1od

@1RYGCQIW § BAHUADOT 1MW @JBD MLoOIWIMEBBUI a6 |g0m1WIg0
W1Y»HNEEMo  QAIRRUIABHWIAM. @R)YEIAIIVT DDBMHSINL! Galdatd:Ia0IVAEONI
al@la001AB3M@TIMIW]  @RYDoE]a) oe)(éem”lgl &8  alBL®]  oJdannow
MSIBNHIGMI  YPHELRELI0  LIBIAIAHICMI  Haf).af).0AAL.  alFL®], alEMICING)
HaHl  @l®l @s@Eleal MSe{lenandiemd  qmvowlaflsiel. algléaldy)
CHUAOD IMOW] M1a010l) Yalg)cy oMo oalelalglassaniel.

@RRIAUIM]H86S @RYEOIVJMEI®] HR2|OAIFEDIN@IMIW] BRYOoElaf M é@s“]osm%



10

0la0onielegan@ o©aVadoled ®Iaaulendnd Al @1Es8MMAIdes aflges1o3
GaldaHtBHHIa0I00 af) M 1ABIN@ M0 WACBIEIMIBHUIHH @RV, GaNISld: @YV’
DS HHUY QSHNo &HSIO® M@IB:IN 100 BOaUM HSHGLJHSWo
@RoUNMNIISHB1RJESWV0 GaldaHdh ReINS3 BAHUEMEIBUY allmeamo
9211000 BRoNMBANSIGHEINEI B:S1B3:U3HH” TVAHBHIB BMAIZ” BaldnHB:000000
Q196831 M@IGHM®IMVo  BRYUII  (@JAUBONDHBBBo  HHSNIM  H(@JICNISBRIBHB0
an1TO3W” 830a01TVAMIBBBo  alM:alQlWIeIMo  HHISABAN® 1Mo  GRUTW
OMIFIL)0a] alBL®]  (@J®00o  OMIFILNSIHWBHN RISIHNIMBS (ol
M@BBMDIMWo  MSalsl  aVflHG1HH6Mo. HBBOIQo HEAIT  HaHIWo
®SQMDIM” af)POGIV" Aldhallom  @JAUBOMMo  ZSSMD@  NVIM1Da |SOD H Qo
@@e’lmow’lceag@s @RS1IVINO  @1RYNIUD |63BUY m10c3mc(gcm(6)’lm0@1 OO@BUHIVM
M2 I®H8OS  aleMo  AMIGWIVTEHOM  GRMA®]  MTHBHQo  H.2lQeMo.
@3 joslwleel @RRIANMIGUENIW] VAW @GRYEIWY aldlGaldate MVAEGYY
MSOM6EMo.

alSlHABREHUA0Jo  QAIRMBHI0J0jo  HIKMIQINYdHBo  JWUDILIHBo

moebg:l@’l (20001 all. o@. Roelayl): @gajs] GoaIRIInel MAIRI®

WIYHHBOS QMo TVABHHIBTIOMG  UBRLWYITINASDTOEMAVSBIN”  (JED Y



11

o IBL U3 MSa (1e106s] QOIE TRV ETHE Cal0aH:HIa0008630011000
GEIMJAITNOYo 8@  al0lWlAUOO  al@ladd0o  HIMMM@IM™  IVIWIafigems.
WIYYAEEMEBU  o@eN0W]  B8F10NSSMM@IMIX]  aflolw e lRL®1H03
MSq{leNes] AUGBN. GBH@-TVoMLNIM TVASHIWBHUS (@Jalfdallaflg8s Je® i
alfb@1®:8o MIeIeI88 0g" algldhAIdW CHUN alL®]db8o TVAWMINWIMA0W]
NS leRSBM@IM”  MSalSldhed  aLfldaalaflgans.  oflollw  Qldsq @@ 100@.
2MOQJOIMIWIHGBo  MINWOQ]s  2EBLPOIVNMCWo  AldBH:GOM  GRAIGEIIGM
cInomIanel  MIABGRUIRUI dVABHI@  WDEAINIW]  alBlVaMIBBANDIGI'.
MVABHHIA@ (@Jerlyoalla) o IBL®1HO8L100 a8 oallaf 300 AHHUANIW]
MSa [leEsamemMaaN” Qo%!m@@m)«mmo@l 830ajotlo MVMNIHBHOHO BMIDI
6830001V MONEBHQo  alRLO U] c006m1QA@ @gjcggcm(aﬂmocoﬂ
2M O TMIWIH856330M 168" @3alo M@ H Qo 9.21Qflgens.
aIS1H R0V ISl 0IBNHNI@BOS GHUNOD 1MW M1H9101a) aléeMo
@RMAIBSBMN®IM WMV  Aldsa{lodmlae  MIYE@HEMo NI 1OLIAMD

TMoMITWI 4 2QHITVEICVWINOHI@ G 1BRIMOAFOTIZMNE.

amoeni'ml e ad

(1) ™o @emQsul




12

@®laldt ML (Ul Ofl. oV @RLIDOMAM): MVeMOIMOD M

oogmﬂc(gceaua M2 NBBSM@IM” MIWRANGE @Jeydails] 15 S @Gal QBRG]

9alel0l’  ©aIQM@IM88 @IWBAIMo 2 JM:al@lGUIWIBHEMo.  MIWERQIGI

@Jauydails] @dH O@INMIWT AMIEWIGTIEBMM@IM” MSalST AV ABC1HH6Mo.
HaHIQo JUIVoOBHUMOJo @RS BANAHUMOTWYo moea%d@)’l (W1 .

all. 6m0a0MM): &0BaHId: TVABQYB:EI0000el Al {19.JSOm AVICEM1H: a3y

@JCWIRMAO®]  QIeM1RLOSTNNINODIT  MI0 2@ aldB]la {lHs8MM@IMIW]
ol 221el6glod Mo ngﬂggoeaaa N2 NEBM@IM” 15 €895 @Bat miWRI@I
@Joiyoailsjpaimleje @d eiglafle). alaNls’ Palwmeydmome:glees 130 eiauo
@] $HIBaH]d MVBQYBLI0000L1QY” BRMAIFBBHV MVBQYBHLINUDILIYSS &> 191®3
Mo crgam’l((gceaua @Y0oR1HHIN @GRAADT MDB:HQo MIBRIVDIN0, HAISBIMTHNO,
®Iss30WeM1  af)aNIafsERaE1od M0 D@ ald3Mo  @RYOoE1HB3HHWo QQJ%W%mg”.
MIFNEHO  ANBIVM  BHIBE0aHNMY  H1¥1ejo MO o008 (@JAUBODIHBMD
PRl MVAEHIG anme” M@ 1WISIE].

(2) @pEL Al alIGHNR 0 EREDYIald NUIB0 (@G alldlsn @

W Odh. IWGHoHUM: @RRELYIAID: alICHANER MSA|IABANDo @RELYIAID:

NNE: (BalldhOlasan@ogelo  all.agau.avl. gl exoell  H00m101e83aMm



13

96BLIWNIAMONIRHOB MNIDWIHBAD (@JURIEBBUIHN alTla0d®o &HI6MEMo.

afl3yoyoav moeug;l@’l (). all. O&. @RI 0MmI): af)wal” cnale1]os

MleAIW]  QIBaHEBR8001  vomI8n1ePe®  620ell  §aIQYIGBAN  G@RELJIA IG:GH60
@M MaHoLlo o JOPDEIOW @RELJIaIGh@HE0 MoRE:HMo MMM IMIW]
1.10.2012-0e1 aude9od 20mOQ (@000  @RELYIAlD: aldGHHE MSalodn].
2014-15 @.9ag).aW). @000 @MY MIFEINWo  MSODIWERPUWD  HF1HBOS
S00jgelo @Md  MalPals  G@RELIIAIHOO  Dalle0W]  aJmdallmyaules
M@ 1MEAIMEIWIEM” MVAHHIA ngg’lcmo af) @’ ag@cmo (@JG® ydho
@ELSIAlD: MO (Ballhdlendad @IBROMOAGOD®.  TVASHIB TYBHS3
adMBAMIAVILfIS88  §(@JISHW  @RELYAIGZO0  all@aieflsl  miIdes1es
DU3OSOMEMINU TVAHHIA mé)goe)glaﬁ B910JeN2I:HAAMIEM (@JOY1HHIHBIND) .
HSIHBOS  H00PLlo MVABHHIA (ngda)@«ss @RRELYIAIHGB  BPWIHRHYBS
Mvoa0aloyoml@d  1:30/1:35 af)a» @R IDOODIGE  GRMI®  APSHS1©3
M1eIMmIBOmIMo @R(EJHhI00 M1RINIBEMIM HFIWIAMAIND @RELYIAlD: MNI0H;1M3
DU gOm]  aJMABANMIaVIEH0M0MeM” @1@BAIMaflolesand. aflaw
Z1elHS1BMIM”  016aods" 0a1Q  a9lajegleniw” mlelnleel  afl.agau.avl

eflayl@dmlane MIeam wlalddwd  LIE1a]0IdHS” TYald méom @M1 Qaylaf



14

M@AMo M@BM@IM” HaIODABIBIIIV WA U0lalddUd MVAABq{laflgms'.
@RRELYIAID: A l0CHNSR @@ MAMEBUBE @SMo  MYaylassanlel.
mlelnle)ss @RELYIAIHBNS Mo@MUEMo 204 |UBADINGHIMNIW]
@1R)@. af)o.af)MV.af)., af)aV~ )V af). aleb®lsglenlQ)”  me )eeIm
aJNAamn1es301003 @1@20M]2f1g6ns" al0GHHXR’ Q1Yo M0y
@BolHoMOMIENSQo  HAMBOMIYW o) @AW" GRELLIAIGHO  AVAHNIA
aggce@kge%‘“ aJnaaflm §avlesainad elamadmlaflslel.

(3)angyrdonadaass capIgdatlq|HHdd

Wl all. 9eemigas: aldjodmbla.rdasss  allalw (B(TBOQ@OSMH&;@

M@BBEMOIMIWT  afl3jogyoav  Alda(ln” H1FIGE @JEDIH  TVoallWIMo
@QY0oR1HB3aM @ 1000 @RCAINMHUDHUD g0~ (NIag Y’ G0 HIVA Q9]
V1HO1E83M@ 100 MSa ISl AV 1a6Mo.

afl3}085000 Qld:n]a@1 (U1 afl. Od:. @RI 0aM)): 0VAB HAVLHBALS]

D@ all.ag)al.a]l. @®elo AHOWS3 A3 0AMOIHUdAN BRI AIY1WwIeM’
6MPI8BaHlo 3 LI MIABINDY. Dalo@alB 08 AV  Qldsa(lad  GH@3
MVABHHIO1@MIMNOBSB @dgp@@o&m%@)uﬁ eD-SIMAVA ACRIMWIEMN M@IH1UGBAND .

29" 6MYIBBoHln U3 HalN@OMNBLIBLAV Aldsqf WDOHQDS H1F1G BT ICD b



15

TuoallwamamleeIg” 209D $HI0Jo  WMH:I0Y Qe |20 &SGR0l of
@ 1@BRIM]HBIM@ 6.

(4) olomow” B2an1AV” OGS MIBamaIemo

@Wl. all. 9d. O@WBINVM: Ll Klolwloel oldMlow” 8an1ay” O;sls
M1B2R6Mo BRYMoEIABIN 1M MSalsl V1B 186Mo.

neya@] (@l 9m@ 20eEl): adoele Zelwleel oldMlow” Blanlay”

ODHGISMGeMOA0  nITWeqlg” 15-12-2014-@8  oNglsjeaidom  cwow
@IBROME@JHIV0  OSNBA  MSalSldhud oJdoml@aes]l 2015  =maiel
DOMLEOMISES]T MIB2MI6M (JAUBODMEBBUY BRYDoE1ABANDIEM .

(5) om001e196m21 af) M. af) af-OL1 DDIN® BB

Wl  &d.  BaVAd: ODHWILNMEl  MWOOMINL!  af)d.af)af.-©3

@RARAINAISIN  NDDINDEBTBH a101a0018s30M@ 1M oﬂ.w%.mﬂ.,
Soafild;, af)@.af)af @RE®IOIG] af)MIAIOW oBeHHdallaflaf 8@ HB0D al@lalds]
@YARY@EMo §21QaN@IMINAUIWVIAIW MSalST AV 1B:a1enemo.

Ny n@1 (Wl 200@ 210mEl): OHHIWILNmME]l MNOOTINEL! MIaUEMTI

H9a0GAIYHNS HTBAINJo AIIEM IR MNIA IMEBBUY (TUD’](ZS)’IOQJQJCT])@’](T)O(Z% GOIW’

AN@EZM@IM” TUOLlo aBOQIHNIM NYELIRS"  BMEIFAMMES. MSajodd:S1eel



16

BRMWIHD® Hal0iSo BFIQHH] Hald@DRMEBBUIHH MVEBIHNIMBB MV DHO o
BB SOM] DEaEB8 Sdalbld: GMIIBS alGlaOB1ENIM  UYHATEBIM®IEM',
G301V  al®Y  H1PSBAUVODIMo  ISIETMIQAIVVODH Mo AVAIAHEAIW]
MM EBIM  HOMIQ OV GOIWIHMBQWo @GR OIWIHMBWYo M1B2mIeMo
2B THDB1HBAN MSalSldhud IO |SODANGIIEM.

(6) @RI MSAIHIBH9” MVAMVaNIWo

W, all. U»1EING)HM: RWIG3 Al21006M MSOYGHI00W] KHY1QYN AWMIS’

Zeloloel  ERYRIANINIGHUWBES MIVWAMa0IWo  LIBIAISSMN@® Mo 22000
PIS1HBOM CHMYHS1T3 200 o M@HIMN@ AN INIW MSalS] AV fd:G1onemMo.

Qe @) (¢ 9@ »10m)): aIMIS’ Klelvloel oMy RWejegleNW]

41 @rlanml ®Sq)dHI01m  BHHIU MSOMIDBNINZCaIIGHIM  HEIWIOCHAIOO
Ma0dW1HSMHIMIVT €508 LAV@ Aflavay” ERE®ICIFIYNS qVVRM
MO0V  HINEBHWB A9l ERYLWIHLICIHHT RVILIHUE MVBABUDI 4]
@RYAININIW  MIYWAMVA0IWo  LIBYAIHNIN  (UYHA]HBATMNS, aflalo@em
®SOJHI0IWT MEa|dUd ERYWBo@HMN RWILIHSI0 HYl@aMlel. MWaaIologH
eIlHnIMd  @BRAOOMWSBBNIA  @BROOH1Ej0 RWIE|HSI03  &Y1QYBWIHNME; 13

@RAIAHH MIYWAMVaNIWo  HHISOM aJODADHHIMNZAUBIMDINBB  MSalS1HHUd



17

VN HHO1HEOM@®I6M .

(7) 21ma@ capaloomload mldomoemo

@Wl.  afo. afl.  GUYWIM &M@ alemis Zlelwlod  =1mal@3

ONOGINI01W @3 cRWloomlend M1@an26m (@JOIBODMEBRUD
aJMOIVoE1ASBM® 188 MSalsl AV d&01H86Mo.
aIMojo  al@luOI®IQo W@INDMOJo  EMOIASTYo MM mcaargd@ﬂ

(W) ®I@BAEPIE  EIWIGHHM): 2IMalB  HAECINIOIV@  CARWIVON]HA]

M1B2N6M (@ )OI B> U3 2B T HA1HBAN@ MU0 YD MSalSldud
MUl O1BBINDIM”. EHOB GaldLfla” a0DIVToW)” SHeMBANSHUM EHIBq |GOaHH]
028 @RAITVIMIa flasam@land 0wmd] 41,73,114 @Ga1es 96anm@s oo
GIYIBSTV” BHDEMAVIEIM” M@IBIVIgne. &M al@ eqYWIo TVMBAW1a] S]
M132206M(JAUBTMHMEBBBOS 2 JEGRIND] CTUO6T)_ICTU)1_3J0 MHONIHO MSON1VISS:
JYo»1HSem@3 MSMISBS  (HACHNFHOBAB01 o  BREMIaHa]" aflKdBRIW
016 0dg” VABa{lH90M8  HMeMBAVI@E OB Wlow)'  HAGIWonEmIOM
GIYIBSTV’ BHMNMBIVI@ 2JaMEIRQ SO TVGNE.

(8) ®:01s1®:WB MBHAMHNlS MocAlo

@Wl. 20®) Sl. e®mIAMV @IWAIL] MIEVWIRGHAMLLICT]SAI HEIaf00
[



18

aleIOWOMIOR]  B:O1NSIHUE  DGHAANNAS  TVoRAAMABO1af  @RGMIaH6eMo
NSO HQHINIBOHDD OO MSalS] MVfhOlHneMo.

W1 . WBIAIBAVA MIWVWA: @BRYOMB MICWIRAMLELIOM DL QIB8Bod:80

OIVA3" GAETNY" BIBOMEAIER" 2lB2flO0d BH010dST OHBOD MVoRAIDDDEBO] 2]’
@REMIaH1 2] HQENINO0 HOMNMNRODMND@TMNBS MSalSl MVfHE1En6Mo.

@RBLMENJo AflERIRIBIYo Al QD] (W) EEWD” alaNOmAI): @;"]goqu@

Galoeflay” @YU alolwlwleel HSNIEHEB0, o @6, HBlafo0
agyamlaiiseaBglonl  #:0100S1RHUBABEMHOVENEW  BR(EHABBUINHMIHO  JaN’
CHMYHU  OIAYE  BalQgene: sl mowonasglad 87000 @alwes
MOUDM YNV IV TF06M” ale0® 100 |S1S88®. 2Ll |8s] Galoerlav’
SOMONNHQOS MO IO @3 MSOM QUG @REM UM O 1603
@PSINOIMODI@3 DI@AIL] aMILlVHNMBo BIVE@OMIMMo  AI@]1 OOMIBH ]G3
QUMM EMZCaIHO CH3T1HhAla] @REMInHMo MSAMIQURIHWIAN. ISs1Y6HS
M0 lale)E3UERSIAIB8  &HSHhsIelo MIB:dHEIElo §alGSIUW alMidsleo
MuNda flaflg8s M1 HHU6M &Y 000hSeel 300\ 6B3U3 Galopflany”
a101GUIWIHBMME®INSIajo MDD TLORIOME:ST U@ MVAVOD VG HEaM

WI@BNIWOS  QlAIEBBUE  GUIAIBIABIM®IMOIW] OMIHMIM  BaNIGND



19

SQIBEH@1H0af HOMVMIA  HIVENHAF  TVaOIVWEOMINS  aldleuowm
MSOMIAURTHQAGN.  QAUSBoHBODBB  HG10ST  DHAOMHDAIW]T  NINWH S
@IBAIL]  Galoeflny’ GIRaUMIBE GHIU” 0Z=1aNd ©al1Q)" @@Ll Galoeflay”
SDABOIVRQOS CNQ)® IO @3 @RGMIaH6Mo MSAMAIBTHWIEM. sl
CHAMVEMIaHEMEEBUY  DDADRI®OSEDIM@IMIV]  aflo’d@  @fl10F 6T)_Ié(BOC),
adlacle”  alldwud, Galoeflny” GaNIBSIWIANA, GO PIOW’
a)aM1QfIROWEBEOS  GILAIMo (JEVWIRMOAFADAND®IEM. ailoilw
@JGBUEBREIT3 MSHBAN  MOMOo  @R(EHANEBBUY @SN IMIW]T  EI@)1HH0el
al@SOgloU)” NAMAISHINBB MBEZUD MBI 1WIgME"

(9) %03 ALAUMVIV MVaDBHOEM MVooQIBREOS TVIMUGN &
@J®lavawl

GAWI. Sl af)o. G@MIAAV HadMVd:. LoMLNIMHODAD HWA  AIYAITVIW

MVaO0®EEM  TLOCLIBBEAS  MVIMUOM]H:  @@ITVTW]  al@lad@1EB8aM®IM0
MNINEEHIMOS GWIWo Aflgla] Rall MSalSInHud MIBOHIAURYM@IAAINIUDJNIW

MSalsl V1O 1aneMo.

0QIMY0Jo  HOQo moea%d@ﬁ (). @PRSAB (@JHIUD):HVAB cnaleivleel

OMILILINS 08 MVoO&HUIBBAM @Y (Do N coaleIvlisel (@JyQeBBUd



20

al01la001HBM®INA8B8 MSalsl AV 1863mM06NE". ANYWHWSOD  HWA
MVaOGHOEM MVoCLIERUY OUBa|ASQYBB MoMoRHMHA@ Rall GlaHem] eMAIgM®IW]
@WWRLYIMPIS® IO BRSITVOIMO ]G3 @JAIB@M  PRIWLMo  AVAHHNIA
QABo{la)N@WH1OWERIEJo HWB  AVaOHOEM  TVoCLIEBBRBAS AR E:S1YFld:
@JRMIVIQTHBBAM  AVIa0210OMIGE AN OIVGIT3  O2IYM@IMIV]T  HWA
HSOWONAV  alRL@] MSEPABAD  300J0  al@lNEM2jAIRlG:WIeM.  aemlRy-
@O NIDELED:UB, TVAOHOEM QAW MVNAIMEBBUY, MVAHNIA O_I(ﬂaqdcﬁa(fa,
MVAHHIB@ NN IMEBBUY  af)aMIallsE@BEIEd Mo HWA CaRIRIYIGE TYSHHUD
MoMoR63BUY @IRYWMoETHBAUIMIWT AN ANERIWY alQd1S HWQDIA|IBHA, HWA
AUYAIMIQOMTINIVT  (Balldhdla] MVNEHW HalQdIS DTaloBdHH  MVLIEBRUD,
HOAE  caalLIVIOLl  HIVQHU, MVaOGHOEM  TVoCLIEBUE af)IMT  CRILINHOS
DU GOMIQo  BMOAOA®  M@HTIYIWBAN  HSOWPAV DHQS  aldlw]
Q1BeUlq{lajo &SOUDNAV alRL@] MSe{lENGHIMBS TVAWRINWIT 6)(@JoGa TV
MABBIBIHG VA aIBIWEMMWILINEM. DD AVEI MVEMABMo HY1NMMEUdAHO
ADY M@H1VIFBI  MNIBESHBOS 6WIWo  Oflgl2[62IB0M DENHIOJo 210

@mgm@oesm“.

(10) U8 @ELYIAIBHDMOIV Od. Bd. @MIHIOG Ao



21

Wl. M. oH. MRV  2elgloe Hglvleel gMIQYE «0WAE HIVHHIZO]
MPU3 BRELJIAIGHMID . Odh. GRMTaH HNOE ERYOLVAOMY §2IQ TVLORAUOTIN
MoMINWaf” BREMIaHEMo MSOMT  GHQBNIOO  HOMBOMT  YO1HHIABAN @100

&SoNIA 1M AVIMITTTE: TVaNIWo M@ 1Mo MSalsS]l VGO 1H06Mo.

@RYEYLAMNQ0Jo allXleImayo mceu;d@gw (W). EEAOWD" AalIMICEI): Delo]0o
Zleloleel gMIQE 0@ HAVSHAZOT APU3 @RRLIIAIGMIW Od:. . @RMToH’
000 DEIMYY DLV GEINWERM AdMo QAN G 4)B1SMNMDAM0WVT MIMWeQ]S”
GLINAWE 10eMRA 2001301003 HR¥IQYHS @RSITLOIMODI@3 DLIMIY Galoeflay”
GOMRAUMIG B@ CHAV" ERITRAE 6 2l1Qlgemns. @mo%@oégmmii SHEOmIEMQ
@RYOMILIBE A010I06M” AOMSIVEMHAIM” HAISINNV@IHG @RSINLOIMEM1©3
HOQISHHANIWY BREM JaHMADIMIWV] GBIV HIEI0 H6(@oEIsROM aF@3ala).
2E6MOa]s  @RMTaHING  HGFoMNISHIWOSWo  Mad@JAUBOMRHOMBWo  HRY]
CARINAISOMT  @REMIaHeMo  MSO1W®1@3 crg@’lec;maooo) aflel  @JREBx6S

4

Galol®3 @M laH1OHM MAQlav1@3 mlam all@l2jolls@leiss
DEMIANHAOD LM BRYOTVAODY  O2alQPOMAN” AMMYILNG:HQo  SIWISHUD

MDWH1Q H2YIWHS BRSITVOINON]I@ CHTVEM IaHla] MIaONIMEA]S BHIS®]



22

QNI H 016 ]0ads QTGN EY ) pllukze Q) @REM JaH6Mo
MSOM QIO H QA6

(11) eao@am” AWOMIQOT ABOIYHAE GSAW” G Ig”

Wl _of. Ql. 6RIART  6a().S1.00().-HS1G  al0lofl2JIBAN  HaOGIOD
momMIQol  MAWOIYHAB GSW 6HOBI  all.af)iavl. @GRV 1GHGIENIOHD
m)omlcrw"l%JO c0e(l MW HVYBS Jay® GG’ BHOBODM1G3
MIRAOMLINBNIMBSB MI1BNo B3Y1AUIBBIN® 1Mo MSalST AVHO1H0H6Mo.

OMIFIejo HOMaleMy0jo O_Icﬁag’;l@q (W) oaHleny ceninil c=oM): B3T3

QAUBAHOOD BHILIIM  af)@.aVL.aMN.Ql. QYOS ERoUIHIVABB OGO AVIMIQO]
MWOMVRAB  GHOY.  GBRYCOIVY Adallom 1Yo  0me" QlBaH  CHOY
MSEDMM@IMIMS ENIVAQ HaOBO® MWBOAYHE cWW-IT @aleolceiw” a3
QAUBaH GHIY al0f0alNOBIMB8 MLl ldsdem” Wlaod500ad" MUI1e:014[IS88®.
S8@ QBHOHOD GHIY al0lafloERmm  &Sldudas G20ell  AVIRLIOW]LIOE
MVIa02IRJOBILINEN” JIRD®  EHOY MIBOMENGHIN  @1GBRIM]2/lA1e8ING.
MAIBHH TVABHHIB GOAILIVIGE HMIYITE LIS1HBAN Va0l AMBIB:0Nald:Ho

DHNIOVY0 0 JM3alB@1GUIWIHNINJAMD®IEM.

(12) @@’ H01m1 6®91e18180 emalgan myev1agH ud



23

Wl af)o. adoV: aloeleeds’ ZHlelwloel %HeiEHnIS MD@BMYBHS

QLI GH(BBR10Al OMIY1L1063165:Ud emMaEISaMm NnJeU1ng Ul

al@1a0RNHBMIM” MSals] AV le:o1as6Mmo.

O®OYIejo  OOMaeMi0jo  Qldhq AV (W1 o¥len] cenienil  c=o6eM):
aloelsnds’ Hlelwleel &HefEHnIS. DMMDE  QIJAINVIV  BH O3R!
O®0¢1eNG®H03  @PMEBANSSIM  MYRUIRgHUE MBHHIG VVONINIOVWSOD IS
@Y®  @JEBUHOD 44 @M@ QAW MO IMEEBRS]®I
@JAUBODMOaT®N0® 13 VNI IMEBRHBIYIHHQBB0IWN @I A 101GUIWM
NSO HQo 26 auNonIMEBUWEHN” GIYIa| NG  MTIB:HWQo 0.21Q.
al@1eUOWMIGABWILje ©0R1ONaD  H2IXH®AN  016q[0dS M @3N
amumBsomiejc ANAWIGWIWYo BaNIBSIWIaRo @RATGRIDW” 92190 BRAIQHS
G0l BRWjMOMOAMo MaUBHIHBHWQo  H21QIZMS.  MHHIYo  QISHO
WOOAUCAMIZEST  HAE  OOMOAUIBHUBOBHIDNOHO  MIT)HIalRNIW  MSals]
DO BNIBSBAN@IEM”,

(13) 8GN IS” DEHNIFOTMVo BGH@BAIBANMI®” AVoMIAW] af”

Wl. QBHHL!I Ha0dB:  QAUBHHL! MIGWIRGAMWEITNINL]  MVoRRHUID

QIM(EJERUINIY MBAYBHHISIOM MEENIFOIMVo  EMHMBAIABIM@ Mo HHQUTIW”



24

OeLla0’ MaNIA] ald@H8” @RYHH1 Alld:lalésanm@Ime MSalsl TVd:@1dnemo.
QIMojo  al@lOID]IQo O@INDNOJo  EMOIASTYo MM m&H@W

(). @I@AIYB EIWIGHUM): MEHHI SO1Mo aleL®] ERYEE1BBM MBS

MSalSldhyd MU HR1HSM@IMOW] NINWLO|S Qo fln” MIBE3U00
MDBIND@EMN.  MB@YCHNIS  (@J6BUWo QMR HBHS VLIRS BRHYAUIAV
QIJOINOYA JOODHBB 2MAIITV BHMBOM]LINVDTIMIM HHAUGW’ HeLIa0” TVanIO]
ald@89" MNdallasMmM@IM” aflel aldl2l®sgameeslejo MIaUEM®@ OO’
OOLlan’ QD1CHO@§®0%O©1 @G allaf Gal0au1gl010W 0Qals]
B 15HWINMES]G3 DHNHIOJ0 VAUMBOAMG MSa{lLIEBM@IWIBIBs0.

(14) ®001@e®m0@BUWBAR0 101D ILIGHAOB0 @YD LI\ 638 KD

Wl 9l @. &@alla: BHIMNoWELlo  @RYMVNIMAIW] sNoIw0)] Fie

Q

MUAQYHEINWIE!  ARYOoEISBM@IMo  H0Wd:  apsHgloal  ail31odmOlE:U3es”

EIS1HB0N  ERYMBLINEEUWE 2MOM  MYBHEoel 300l  afl310dmO1e:0dd60

3O HHIRLYIaIRHBB30 LISIASIM@ Mo @RYAIND NI MSalS] MVldha@lenemo.
QIMOjo  al@lOIDIQo V@INDMNOJo  EMOIASTYo MM mcea@;l@j

(). ®IBAIBE  EIWIGHIHUM): W HOoWO® @RSIIVNIMTVV O Y633U3

ONo)Do]|SOMIQo  Al3®L aldludleiMo M@HIQo  Aldha] HIWIHh @I0EBROHS



25

QNBAOOMSHRBD: af)aN OGZUIRIM HIW]dh TVAQIGHELIDUIEI af)aN @YUV IM’
allaMlgi88®.  TVAQIHLIUIRIYHS  @RYTVNIMo  MLoMIMWIa]  KHIJO]C3
@1@aomadlgiel.  aldkha]  @HSMo  HIKAUYAN  RMOMI «ggceagoel
HIWHI06BBUIAE) adallafla] GRYWERIJ0  MTBEMOIMNB8 MSalS]
QBB Aldq ] TUfld@aflgens.

(15) eooaw” somaeanoads” eavanl Mm@

Ul. @PMAIB  AVIBOI: CH@B GOOW ©0MBeMVIAS" @Madl miod

MNYARIHEMIIUY MoLNIM GMIGBSIA QI0aOM ODIN® coalel
en@lesME1@BaN  @@IVTW]  al@la0olesam®]me MM milellom®1e0w
ald@(d3000 CH@OO @ROTWIASBMN@IMIV] GHO8 MWATVRWIM (JECAWo
OHINZAUBMM@ 1Mo MSalsS]l MVB:@1H06Mo.

aIMojo  al@lOI®IQo W@INDMOJo  EMOIASTYo MM mcaargd@ﬂ

(). ©@I@BOIYE  EIWIHYM):  GOIW SIWBEIYOABS  GaVaf] gm0
MNITWRalS  TVoNIM QVGEDRI DIy @E1(JOWAIY® §OTV6BBUI GH((3
TMAHNIAIOM WAlaflaflgans. Mm@ @omIelye®I@d AUMMI@ D cAaILIYI3
MVoMNIMEBBUIHS M1LINLI88 BRWIHI00 MalDa|SHWo  OOQALHAow)” aggoe)ua,

O . o)V @BRYA.S1.aVl. DU ]|OSVYBS QIaOMOSNHUB af) Ml



26

GBIUDHORNIW] MIIWIHBHQo  GRIGSIAB AIPaOM MIGH®]  allBlas3IM®1M08s
@OWIBH000 GH@M@ TVAHHIBICRIY” MBH]INIB:®HQo §21QOAMDIMIT®  OD
nilgllemos” cwozdlendm TVIWIGHIE]  af)aM AflAIe EHMBOOD GROTWI4fIgms".
nNelomM®100V] @JEAWo aldIISBMMD TMVoNIMWIa] @IBRAIMo af)FEBNNZD®)
0G0 0aIGBUd TVAT@TWIEM.,

(16) aNcIaNCEUAHIQYBBAUMOHS AYOSH D0 aldINM

Wl ERA. HAVG@ININIZ"  AVoMVLNIMHED ANE1IANEUAHIVYBSB BRYBHBOS

MOGH QIBRUIa (I98M@IMe Hald@aVorIEBSE1Ajo NN INEBE1Rjo @RYQIUd AW
MVDHHOY63BU aFBDa SN Mo MSalS] AV fldalanemo.

aleRIVID  MVOPaOIMINIQo Qg QD] (BGAWI. afo. &Od. 0MIA):

mlelllgiss mleae®oel  QIYAITUOGRHBMAVE1s]  AlC1NECUAHIY8I0IBLHIW]
BGSO0 CAUNIBLD]HUWB  AVABHHIB  MSa[lenanaale:iem..  nlladwlowy”
QU@  ee3v®]  aA@E®]  mia0MeInBlEmEBS1TE  MHAIBHHININ AW
TMUDHAYEEBUS  aBBOITDM@IMo  @RAI  BRAIGENDG:Mo 621N IMAIW]
MeMOIM DML QO [H1) 2JD@EINA SN MBS MSals]
T1@1af1g6Ns" 9ald@ILOLIEBBRSB0 MUNJA IMEBBSB0 aflde1000

MUDaHBAISBANDIM” ERHIV” BIAWIY” MSODMM@IMo  MIVOIVWAE @J1 @RI



27

OHMNZISEBBBOS HEMOBHFABM@ Mo M I1WBAIMofIgeNE. &SIO®  E]EPMLIOH 3
@RHIV" BaNI@ BRYUY af)M  AlaHYOODERO o] GNIIWAITILNVEM  RINYHUI
MocalSlalasam@ 1o &HeINeIWEBS1 3 ClIMEUAHIYBBOIMOS  OI1036) 2 1@
HSHMMODAN  DOOMILIB8 @AY @SO@)“elggce)ua MuNa flassan@ 1o
HeMA RgIOW TLVMAEN GRGRIV" 1 Z18IWIVT (eI NEBIM@IMo MSalS]
1@ f1g6ns"

(17) ®™egdw coem MNIaIM@BS1NLI BROoY6EBUIBN” MalddaHmd

Wl. afl. agf). DOWAIR: ®E3UD BEM AUOIAIMEBRSIGE ®BRoWEIBBIWI

@mmmm&g’lg QM aleMIIWOD @BRoWEBRUIBE allBaHAd BRAAIBASBAN® 1SS
MSalsl V& 1asemo.

alERIOVID NIZPaOIMIBQo Qb 2OV (GAWI. af)o. OH. ONMIB): CHOSB

MVOPa0y  MOHHINTAHOZ  AVIPaOy  AROHHI  alRLD]HEI3  alNASYAN

a1V HS1eel Qa0 2M @D 1NIWI&HU3AE” oA DU IOV’

o IRV 1Y@ O] afl& 1o MVa00Wo MDD 100 @1®el
160 QO HS1H LI MUWOAVEI G IBa|COHMHSIOHLI0 neo)
2M @O TMIWIHHUB O ® 1012010 @3 HIBARBUB @ MAIB1ABIMN @ 1000

DOMOAIOWIgME. ®MGGRU BOAM MUNIAIMEBSIG3 HOMIMHD® @RI Ql@aHo



28

oJdomlienlo@e 60 Iy oJEOMIWIV®o MO HaldBaHmo
EIE1BHITMHDRNIW M 2MEJDINIUWIBHUBHH” MEZUD BOEM MUNIAIMEBBBOS MM®
anNME1@3 MIAMMo  Da NWIHE8INS allBaHM  BRMAIBISBMIMN88 MI1BE3Ud0
MVBEHIBINAZ aldlemmwlenem:.

(18) emM90 al§Wo HOAUNABBAUBHH” GaldBBAUO A" £IE 20 H6 @3

Wl &I IMId:” EJIVEMBaHM: HHIafl, HONWATYAB MILHBHSIT3 HMIo

alS®o  OHGAUNABS  *HFoNIBBRUIAH  BaldABAIOAL amga&ogmm«ﬂmgg
@RS1IWANO MSalSl AV 1Han6Mo.

0QIMY0Jo HVQo Qo @] (). @RSAB (J»HIUD): VABQNIANY” Mo algWo

HONHAUNABBAUABHH  (B2] oJ(bﬂgdceﬂgnn@ﬂm@@ @RCaldH  TVAAa [leanme
MOWa ITIWIE836Wate  eIgla]  S00-21Wldoe  @REaIGHUMHWW ool Mo
ONGI03O0a"  BoanlyHglenw] @138 006003 @AICUNAH]2[IS8B®IW0
VWA IG1W] 1@ 1M O3 JIR® @G IHHUDUD MleavIcHnmz
MV0a02IVIABB®IWo  £I0AF"  GMIABAW”™  OIVGSOl 016 0ds”  ©alQ®1ead
@RS1ITLNOMEMI@3 TvaWaldlwl 31-12-2015 awe 318cefa{lal M@E:M@IMnss
A2emIalMo  aJ0sa]gallaflgems’ JaR® QN2 INOIM” QB HH0el

emielyalenom®Imoas 01-12-2001-avo0  afl@emoaime mleloN@daian  28-11-



29

2014-a00 mspss  @»oeiwgol@  @emaldly] AVAQfIaY” Mo aISWEEBUY
MIWHA1ABMD TS @BRS1IWANO MSalST AV HEIHBIN®IEM.

(19) HalmIWo DMBISHANAUAHN” WMAVANIWo

@l.  avepl  @RIMal: GH@  WaleMendlead  MIBR3UEJHI00
@JOHD®ICHHIBOJo  AUMIAWWERINOoYRlo HaHlMIWo  TVoRANHBIMMAIRHBSS
WMHAMVaO0IWo HAISIBEO.2JHH0ENE” TVETLOIM NAIIMOAAT 2 JOOD 0861 DOMOAI
M2 IR1CUIWIBBaN@ 1Mo MILIAN@ &aHIMIWo BMAISAMAIRHS @RAURHBAM
WMAVa0IWo QIBRU1a (188aN@IMYB8 MSalSl V1Holanemo.

0QIMY0Jo &HOQo Qo |21 (W @RSA (@JH0UD):

af) V. AW @RYAB. ag)an’/af) M. ). @RYAR. af)al. mOmaleleel 7-2o0  alembld: (@000
ORI IL16838313 GH(B MVABHHIA MaUBaH1H3aM MOMBEMDEBBSBOS
@RS1ITLNIMOEMIT3 MI@EGA GO @@ 1Hoem MW AMICWITIHNIG) af)aToo
@R ()00 MURIW]ENNAIS DHHWHNIUY BRWIdho GAIMEIAUGAM DH MVoAVNIM
MVABHAHNIB NlaO1EHANNZMINEMANABS QIJOINVNQENES.  AIMBEMLADIM” ANGBRLAIW
o)V WL.@RYA.afa0-@8  MIMMo  WMAVa0IWo  ERMAIZISBM® S0
BMYSHUM0  EH@MB WMAMVaN0IWo GSQYIN@IMV0  HOEEMMIB:0.  BIGAI Aldn]o

OODMTAN06M  (@JAIBOMMEEBUIENIWT  AIDBatld:  MIWRPI® @JEDIDH Ddb



30

AUSQIBODMHAAN” WIMLOaRE MeM=eAg" Macmleje MlayBaHlaflgamns'.
&S0O®, HBHHBHD” MaYal@la0d00 MTHMMD@IMIW] aflg MIBaHIOMBIV” @S6ER]
Aol alrRL1HU Hatl Qldha {1003 H1913 MSq (lL1ER1aIGMD.

(20) 219821 @JWo ald1a0®) sl HBaUDHBHN" algWo MEI B @3

@l. aHdalfl aloM@3: aldelends =Helwloel &19encaniol, aln=0¢]

alIOVODHBIOL!  HBHUH@BOS  0l2|@21 @JUgo  alTla01EBM®IMo OQIMY
DEBHOWTVOMHS CNP@IOMIT DIMND@IW]IHI0 NVATDHW 2JADEINISOD] al5W
ADOIMOMINL! ([ HACHNFHUD  HONBADIN Mo BPRA20IVAUBLH al3Wo

M@BMDIABSB MSa ISl MV fld01H06Mo.

0QIMY0Jo H@Qo moeag:l@’l (). @RSAB (@JHIUD): @.SLSl. GMIMIAIG:
MLOLIORIM”  @RAIIUAIBHIMNW 900388 93] GREaIOUNHWB 2O
GOIMBOS  @RRIAUICIMNIM  MBS1HNBEOMOAUBSILJo  GADI]OMD  HAH]HHUD
DIF:Neller e} Qlajlsam amuoelo, AHMIM] emalg’ NSO ISSBDo
@RYWINMIHH V@MW @A, e100d” 6)6)LS6T)_I%6TT)(63 alg®o OHIFEMIgSs Bal, AIMo
QB lond Oe:»0lwnss @2l ofanlal 861001 mNeslQss 2313.55 agoeed
oaj@al 24-01-2011-0" eoeigmd @rWwlatem@d @a0aV1GiBI8 aBOHQSHBHQ0

Gand0o 16 JeLI®:014)" a3eagse® G2l allmoemo 6219} QAMBIW]. 2f)aMI@3



31

OOMOOMIG  0l2fEal aBOHQSO® oJ@hdm(zsfsoe;m@Mm@m:)@go BCOBANHONDI
SO0 HOHAUNELIQYSS  HaH1HBHIBHH GAMa|S] BA] Al®1aNTIBEMOHRAT0
&M a] MIEAW] §OGHAUNGHNIB MIa). ONaOCHNISHIWIB CHA aNW@I
921Q)dHQMB0WT.  GHO80 (Bal@layoem MVWN(EJBHI00 alERIAUW] BEAHHAE (Bl
DO@ED al®]g)N@HIM HEIQYHQBB. &S00, AMEA], algV@Eal, als)Eal
o)Al AlyHmMA0W] @R8I @150q |SOMTWI@ MI@ECA alPd®] al@la0d1HHI3
anow"loes;cemgg%s. alg®@ Al®EIMOIGE QAN  (GHACHNSHUI  MVoNITWIaj’
l@1GUIWM MS@DIND MBS MSalS] MV IHE1ABAN@IEM.

(21) 2503 McVIRG AMWEICDIOL! alILIEEEOS MI1daAIeMo

Wl M. all. ROEIRM: ASAYA MICVWIRG: AMLLIONIDG Ha ldDAAINDD’

Aol oBOQIOMIBS NEMENIWIBHSAI, GROGEEBIS P, &S1eNSal, AIG3IE]

@sER1W aloelERgns M1BEnM (YD U3 BRSIVIHERIWT BRYoETeReMo.

9210200000 Qldhq |A@] (W) all. &t MENIa0lo HOM): AFANYA
M1eWIRS 2MLLIOMIDL!I AMSHIVIBHSA™ alOLIOMINM @REEJIa] GOIWIM
quoelo  eIRYMIGHINAMN” gmImvlajoellgl @rolwlsjmlomoamsdan” 475 elso
@BalQes  af)1en]” @®QRI0ISHT  BOMIMAMIQe  TVICH®]H  GRAAG Qo

M@HM@IN” MSalsl AVfd:012JI01SHWIM.  GROGEBIS P o lorIO1ead



32

MWHAUNICNHMB o) @QoCAWo  oJAOMIWISH] QBN  afauleag”
®MQI0IBHT  MIBMIMo  BRYOoE1ABMD IS8  MSalS]  AVfBGA1ABIMN@IOM.

8lo0sal’  aloelomlHnd  MABHAUTGIENH®D o3 WISBHQe 450  eleHo

@BalQOS  BOMIMAM]  M@HEHWQo  OalQIgems. @2l elsymIsmMm  QoQ”
MIB2N6Mo  BRYDoR1HBAN@IE . Q3081  aldeIoM1Nad  DABOAUAYIEUNaHTD
0JBOM1WIHHT  AWIHHAVMB  DQYINIHH QBB af)J1EnQ” ®QI0IBH]

BEAMIMAMT MMDIB:0M HIQL0 alBlNMIHBIN@IM.

(22) cmao acmueiomloel aldelEsgns m1daademo

Wl. o,  wlamdasgl:  eH@MIeaomlend  qumigemeienl  elag

@RDHINIaUB  MSalSIhud @ICIMO|SO®M]  GMao  AgMLRIOM]DRl  SMIBY
alDEIEB8aSWo MG (@JAUBODMEBBUWE  BRYOoE1BBIMBIMIAUUD A0V
@RS1WANO® MSalsl AV&hG1HH6Mo.

ald@AOINOD) moea%d@’l (). afl. Od. MENJIa0lo B:6M): BB

Mloacm1end aueniQud ®@OWlo © 21O IMILIEM’ GMmo
MEWIRBAMLEIOD]OL! alILIBBEOS MG  (@JAUBAMMEBUILHOWT 21008

@R VaHMB MSalS1Hhud @RYOoE1HNIMND HFIVWIO®. BT MOTVAM Mo QUd



33

®@NWlo @m%mmacmoem” (@O SHHHBAN D). HClao-»I@alLlo  gOIWleel
nWatoeioIm” 700 eleto @GalQosWo al88EM&GHSA aleiomIm” 850 eismo
@GolQOSQo  ®eISIgale  alelemIm” 500 eltto  (GalQOSWo  BAMINAM]
M@B1WIg6ns. @21 £IBYMIG:AN QO aldLIEBRE6OS MG (@ JAUIGOHMEBBUI
@RoclasmMmmIem. 65 OILAZ" MLOLlo ERYAININIW ASAUMAYBHUB aldLIOM1OOZ
af)V1EAQ" ®QYI0ISHTQUBAT. DERIgMHSAl,  H1900MYEB, @IWAIGlo MHSWIAB
alDRIEB8eS HMHAUNYIENAHUM @JYOMIHU3 MSMOAUGTBHWIM.  alMADO aldelo
M1320eMAMIM” BOEMINA®T M@IH1VS1e).

(23) ce®maceN 00mig]Iav’, »Ielsl 122100 TVAIANA aldelo
a)M1aIQYeHS M1B2N06M (o)A@ M 681 1D

@Wl. =AYV o®Qulmd:  @p®aoell  eemiajonileonde  &oels]

@W10EHH2100)  ALVAIANO o DRIOMIHMWQo  MIBANEM (@ JAIBCMHMEBBUY
o}
@1RYOoE1HBMMD MO NIV BRSIVWANO MSalS] MVI1BG1aneMo.

ald@AOINOD) moea%]@’l (). al. OH. MENJIa0lo &HOOM): @IQ1a)

MLIMIEM ] MINRLYD AUGBAN BRENIAIN OENIa oIV MIBMANBBN@ M GO
@Y EJIWRIY’ dAaLlaHAG EHIBRICOAUOM 2 JA®LINQISODHQo 25

EldHo Gal 0211068 GRS 016 035" OQIOIIBHQo alQIgens. 42 oS



34

BalQeS BOMINAG]T M@HIW LISl U1U0eH02100) MVRAIADO o DRI 1003
@RODLINOAAT  alM:(BHATHOIEHIMW D 1BAIM]HBH Qo O®IMIWT  aqVAEQJ
MSOYM@IMo ARG EEIHW VN0 lEsmM@MAW] 1.94 eldHo
@B3alQeSs af)AFIEAGIM” @R 1HI00 MTIHHWo @gjq(gﬂgma”. @REOLINBOHAT
@91 MIBINDNal oD@ Wlall.GRYAE. ®QYI0IENIWEUWaHo alDEH]1W
BOAMIMADM] M@ (@JYO®T @BRYRoE1SBINIG.

(24) agpoml-@r®:adel MoajaIelalo®m@as M3 6m @) aldom m sl

@l . al.  esaqyl:  e3wlweld® 47-a@  agnoml-eosndel]

MIRJaIdlo o QeS MIB2MIeMOJAIWT  MITWR.]S HOI01LJWINAIS @RV
@JYON]HUB 2RO 1HO1ABM@TMINUU AW MSalST AV flB:aldneMo.

DaldDAQINOD O_lcesqd@f] (W) all. &, MENJIa0lo HEOD): MIaHUEMDI

992060l GREMINIF] Boan” MABAWY W.all.@RYA. @®QRINIHH] QIBaHBBUIBBEUdAHO
@ILOIBMOYRNIS:AN  ANOMT-GRELNLI  MILJQITIa IS avdaflav’
COIWHHUIHHIW] rLENNIM MVBH9IA 63.66 G505 (B lQeS
af)qylensnggomigems. MLOMUON ]S MYRUIRSOHME" BEEMIMAGT M @3B
HYleomlslol.

(25) 210Q1899S™-QISHHICHIAT GOIAWIHAR aJM@BELIOEMO




35

Wl MM  af)o. aldelenEl:  &HdMod8o MICWIRGHAGMWEICHEI

210QIHHIS-QAUSHNIGRUA] QSIOLI HMod:Bo-2105H=Bo  BOIWINAF  aJMTBRLIVEM

(@JAUBOMMEBBUY @RYDoE1ABIMDIMININ NI AV IO MSalSl AV 1HolaneMo.

9210200020 Qo AD] (W all. &, MENJ0a0lo GHEOM): SHANod:So-
2l0g§®:80  GOOAWINM o JM@RLICIMOMIMVo  6nil.ag)o. & enfl. avl
21N @100 185 eloHo @GolWes BEMIMA®] MTH1OWE;IL HSMBA
SH0191 W0lalod0d 921Q GRWIH: MIESHIT aleM] aBOQFHNIMB  HBIQBHI0N
@QI0IHICONOMOmsAan”  15-12-2011-@3 c218am esened  @onilgl 35%
@MWl MeEe  @RMASIABSHQ0 HOHMVG HOHRIQHWo H2IQIgME.  Oealaf
OOLIN U oggmm)’leJO Q19538 @RE®IOIGT HOOHAVICOAHM Ddh MMHMND® Lo
g0LIR 1 csoJoq;goe)u% oc(gm)(oﬂemmaocw GILIMIAMVo  HIM6Mo  aleM1dUd
VOO0 aBADTBA1H0008  MOWISHITHDIMIGI  B0eNaIW]  313elq flo)
M3 1geNe" 31-01-2015-cogmi”  atem] oo 1d:@1E8aN@IMINIUD §00Q
MSals] AUHR1HEB8aNIEM.

0164]94@38” ava@alémo

(D cenee@ anme” @ronmamEmy” &m1glQes HGBalomlcws” @l

DGBaION]HWINUD AUHOQBS 01608503 TVAGR {1606 ]S



36

(2) 01913201 algld:aIdy) GHHNo VoMW AVAIGIQHS al@IMIO”
A al®1OoMS AUOHOQSS 01628503 TVAGBA{lH06a]S.
2ISEBEOS GBBNMIHEOS ald1WeMM

(1) 2014-0e1 31 c®08 avdanav’ (condaw” Gradd »aa3”)
215688 W ARB8 CRBULM1

Wl ago. 9@ : 2014 acHMId 1-00 @lGlwIeel =).a.(afl) mmMIAd

429/2014/a01a8 (agyaV’@rad.e. maud 614/2014) peaum ajosalsails 2014-sel
3l eHog  audallay’ (codw” @eaadHnag)  aIgEBUdes” MATLEI
OIVBE301vgleel 6)cwoJi§§"l OMVBS0], ¢R0VIG HIVBGSO], @RALTaHEM T3
OV SO0, AU @3 OISO ag)am 008 18|83 DEBLININVOO
@imlenglal’ - Alepdgeandleal  qVAIM  HAVGS0IR0BHH DeIynIW]
a101eM1BHMHANMBS )0  cRELM]  BRAIMAlq {lEBMD.  TVOAVOIM
aIZMIQNM” WIH®I@ MVIMIOM]H  MIDWIDQo  AUBANIHLIM@TIMI MM
RV BRoUHHAB1HNEMHANM” @PRE Y AMOTHBD.

(avdawdl afl. al. 1w, emIaM] BMNIaOMING, MU, BlAIGEM ag)am?
NIQOMIMQ]S BROWEEBUY CRBNMINW BRMVEE 5)OEIENE" MMV 4).)

WMHOY0Jo MIWANj —AMMIBAMIEMAOJo mceargd@j (1. ad. af)o.

m06m1):  NIEONIMeIS AVIBHQOS oJdem @RUWIHIOOMIM  &1I@  QIGaD



37

MIYAMVRI HMVEGESOIVY” RI0UMBNIOO  BHOB almiled:’ MBI ERYR1H3
alE1WIVI@  2UdOa|SOMIWISIENOD@IMILle  BOAMCLISNWQOS 187-00 aidaf
@000 MOAMEY  OIVGES0IV]”  Z1AUMENIO0  @JE®Id  AlleowmIw]
HEMINIBHVIBSBIM@IMIEJo DD alg0 GBEOM]  H2UQPIND@IM” AVEYHS
@R @RIV sAO.

W  ago. 23 @RAIMOla(la] GRAROLMT MLVEWHS GRIAMICWINS
oﬁo%meﬂgd.

(2) 2014-0e1 381 508 ale@II@Om” mINaablow” (HOYLINOECAVaUD
8dan” @M @) ® OO O AV'A"” &M IYHHUM) 21S@BRRS8S BBV MI.

Wl ogo. 9omd: 2014 @rway” 21-00 oloclwleel 2.a. (af)o.af)aV)

manid 150/2014/ag)@B.ag)arv . e2l.all. (agav ed.e. maud 519/2014) npeeum
aoealgafls] 2014-0e1 81 ¢®08 alemuom mladwlew)” (HOYELIHHOGIVAHD
3000 @RS @YDOOOTVW” HEMBAYHHUG) 2IS68BUWBBS° I(5), 9(6), I(7) agaml
MMIB GRELMIHUY BRAIMG1a{las3am.

aleRDOODo  MOZaOIMIDIQo Qb a1 algo 9(5)-mss eI
@01 A 2J®1EMINSIalo algo I(6)-ao I(7)-0a88 cRRVLMIB:UE ©969a 0D

O I OIOL @gj@@@o@;oma” (n.)ﬂoe)((ﬂ%.



38

9(5). In Rule 9(5) for the word “ Two, the word “ Three” shall be
substituted.

9(6). In Rule 9(6), for the words “ a member of the committee
nominated by him” , the words “ the Director of Panchayats” shall be
substituted.

9(7). “ In the case of equal number of votes, the person who presides
over the meeting shall have a second or casting vote.”

D@1 AVflh@ls] CRROVMIYo CRRNVMICWISBZSIW BVEBLIWH: CRRLMIWYo
Ve @RoW 1@,

MamI3aIMHI0Y o

(1) avea” 02191 016421985"° Pa1QEi®o0a88 2014-0a1 o 08

200100So GaUIBW” mINE1603 alATEMMGo BRMANALISEBBo

(@58 2184))

GRBUNMIHH U3 MVERWHS BRADAM® 1GWINS ojlcramengd.
quenier” Hagl 0Eajods” 921Qe)o0gss 2014-0e1 coH08 200)106So
G6NIDAAW” NI@3 alR1WEMMW HABNFANEMHAAN (@ JEGAWo VR (GTOocn“]ce;(o”lgd.

NI @3 A IBlNaNMY HHEHFOD.



39

@6N300 Qldza |

119, 123, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 131, 134, 135, 136, 138, 140, 141, 142,
143, 144, 145, 146, 148, 149, 150, 152, 153, 154, 155, 159 agam1 maud
683VM1HU3 BRAIG®q (1.

DADT ®INPIOQAD GBBNM]HU3 AV flh@la).

129. In clause 2(e), for the words “ arms break water” , substitute the
words “ arms of break water” .

146. In Clause 2(u) delete the words “ excluding roads” .

AT MV 1B015] BEBBNMIB®:U3 TVE BRoW1B:@]).

gg GRBUNM1IHH U M1RIHO1H63HEWI MLEWYHS @AM ICWINS
allBQIeles::EWwI 921Q.

¢RBULM] 2IQ@E]NHIVABSB 0MJ0 Aldsq | MILN1OA3 BIVAIHHIMOAND (@JUo
aTE @oW 1 @la).

¢eBULM] §21QEJHIVABSB VN0 Aldsal milefload fowaow.

A0 Qldza |

DADT MIHPIOQAD BVEBLW]SH GERBNG BRAIMAola).

638. Inverted commas in clause 3(1), shall be omitted.



40

162, 163, 164, 169, 171, 173, 175, 179, 180, 181, 183, 185, 186, 187, 188,
192, 193, 195, 196, 197 aganT mmid 6e3L™HHUd @RAI®E1o{1a).

DAY ®INPROQAD GBBNM]HU3 AV flh@la).

179. In clause 3(4), After item (d), insert the following item and
reletter remaining items accordingly:

“ (e) Minister for Fisheries.. Ex-officio Member” .

187. In clause 3(4) insert a new sub-clause after sub-clause (m) and the
remaining shall be relettered:

“ (n) One representative from Indian Customs Department to be
nominated by the Central Government” .

192. In clause 3(4) after item (0):-

The following item shall be inserted and the remaining item shall be
relettered:

“ (p) Chief Engineer in charge of Harbour Engineering wing of the
State” .

D@1 ERAIMAIa{la) 8DE3JW]E: BRIV MUKl CBRLMI®:Eo VB

mom%e)(o’l%J.



41

29 GRBRULM 1 Ud M1OIBO1H63HEWI VERWAS @RAVAOD@CWINS
a1ad01e$833HEWI RETLOR

¢eBLM] §21QEJHI0ABB PaMI0 Qldsq| MILlOad BIVAILHEMOAAN (@JUgo
e (GTOO(DGICB)(Z{]%.

CRBLMI] 62IQYE]HI0ABS PJANo Aldsq| milellond cowadwl.

MOEIdo Qldsaf

199, 201, 202, 205, 206 agam1 mmid e 103 @RAI®E1o{l).

GRBNM1HUY MIOIHO1H63HCWI MVRWAS @RV ICWINS
a1 H633:6WI 021Q.

M0 Qg MIIENHF BINMIGHIMHRIM (@JUo TVE @oW 1 @].).

Me1do Aldsal milellead sowaowl.

@R6MI00 Qldsal

208, 209, 210, 212, 218, 220, 221 agam maud celw®1a:ud
@AM G {1a).

@890 6BEVMT AQD] AVflE:@1a):
218. Clause 5(3) shall be recast as follows:

“ (3) Number of members necessary to constitute a quorum at a



42

meeting be one-third” .

D@1 MV 1B3014] GEBBOMT TVE @R 1B:@]2).

09" CRAVMIHUT MBWHS ERIOG1GWINS oﬁaﬁmeﬂ%.

CRBLM] ©21QYE@JHIABB @0 Qldsal MO  BIVAILHEMOAIN
@UQo VB @aom%ea(o’lad.

GRBULWM] §.21QE@]HIVABS @RI Qldal milefloag owWaow.

@1RY0%0 Aldsaf

(eRBLMHW @RAIMOaleoeq]gIel)
@090 Qldsq| MO BIVAILHEMOAMM @JUQo TVE BROV1B:014).

@00 Qldhal milefload sowaowl.

a0 Qldhraf

@069 JOQAN ANGHIGI GB3NM] DO BRAIM@To[la).
232. In Clause 7, for the word “ proceeding” substitute the word
“ proceedings” .

231-00 M@ ¢e3L®] GRAI®G]qfla).

D@1 BRAIMA1a{l2] ANEHIM GBRNM] MVE @0 1khE1).

231-00 mMIB c_R3L®] Ve (Tﬂ(bC)cBa((ﬂ.f}J.



43

¢RBWM] §21QE@JHIVAYBR aB¥Io Qdsq| MilLflead BIVAILHIMOOAN @JUo
aTE @RoW 1 @la).

¢eBUM] §21QEJHIVAB a0 Qldha| milefloa) owaowl.

af)S%0 Qldsa |

237, 239 agaml mmid ¢eB0®1Hud @RAI®@lafls).

@690 GBENMT AQD] AVfB:@12):
237. In Clause 8, after the word “ Act” insert the word “ as” .

D@1 MV 1B3014] GEBBODT TVE @R 1B:@]2).

239-20 mmud eV Ve MO0 3.

¢RBM] §21QJHIVAYBR af)30 Qldsal MILlO0d BIVMILHEMOAIN (@JUo
Ve @RoW 1 @1a).

GREUVWM] §21QEJHIVABS af)S%0 Aldsq | ileflond Bonmowl.

BMal®i0 Qldzal

@69 JOQAN AGHIGI GB3VM] DO @RAIM@To(la].
242. In Clause 9(2):
1. After the words “ as soon as possible” insert the words “ but not later

than fifteen days of the meeting” .



44

2. After the words “ transmit to the Government” insert the words “ and
to all members of the Board” .

240-20 muB cEBL®] GRAIME1R{la).

D@1 BRAIMAa{l2] ANEHIM GBBNM] MVE @0 1khE1).

240-00 mMIB GREVM MVERWYHS BRMADNICWINS afldaieils).

cRBULM] §2lQ@)HOAB8 BMBal®Io Aldsal ileflead BIWMIHHIMOHA
(@Jygo VB @011,

¢eEUM] §21QE]HIVABS BMal®Io Qldsal milefload owmowl.

alOmio Qldza |

@090 BDEBLNIH: ¢83VM] DO BRAIMAIo{la).
639. In Clause 10(2)(1), the word “ fixed” shall be omitted.

@069 JOQAN ANGHIGI GB3NM] DO BRAIM@To[la).
249. In Clause 10(1) for the words and figure “ Companies Act, 1954”
substitute the words and figure “ Companies Act, 1956”7 .

255-90 mmMIB 6EBOL® BAIMANa{la).

D@1 @RAIMGIa{la] B8DE30WIH CRARNVMIMo ANHHNIB GRBLMIYL dVE

mom%e)(o’l%J.



45

255-%0 mMIAB GREAL®I MVRWAS BRAADIGWINS aflmalefla).

¢eBM] 921QEJHIVABB alOMIo  Aldsaf mIlLloag BIWAIHHIMOR
(@Jugo VB BP0 1@,

CRBMI] 621QYE@]HI0ABB alOMIo Aldsal mileflaad sowaowl.

al®1HMIaMIo QAldhal

259-20 mmM1d ¢V @PAI®Gqla).
GRRLMI] MVERWHS BRIV ICWINS oﬁoﬁmen%.
al®1OMIMIo Qldzq | MIENOAF BINDILHEMHRM (@JUQo TVE @BoW1B:@]2).
al®1OMIMI0 Aldsa | milefload owadwl.

al@6NElo Qldsa |’

267, 269, 271, 272, 273, 274, 275, 276 agan1l mmid 6e30® 1603
@RQIN G {1a).

GRBUNM 1hUd MNOIBO1H63HEWI MVRWYHS @RA0AOD1CWINS
a3 H6336WI RETLOR

al@®eNsdo Qldsq | MIEHME BOVMIGHEMHAAD (@Jugo MVE BP0 1),

al@®eN=oo Qldsq | nileload 2owmowl.

al®1aMio QAldsa |




46

277, 279, 280, 282 ag)anT mmIB 631 U3 @RAI®G]qfla).
GRANMIGH U3 MVRWYAS BRAAMICWINS ojlaﬁmengd.

al®1aMIo Qldsq| MIE1Oa3 BIVAILHEMOAM @JUQo VB BROW1B:014).
al®1gaMio Qldsq | nilefload conawl.

al®1MOLINo Qldsa |

DAY MIHPIOQAD BVEBLD]DH GRBNG BRAIMAola).

640. In clause 14(2) after the words "and appoint" the words "on
deputation or otherwise" shall be inserted.

285, 288, 289, 290, 293, 294, 299, 301, 302, 303, 304, 305, 307, 308,
310, 311, 312, 313, 314, 316, 317, 318, 321, 322, 323, 324, 326 agam1 manid
683UVM1HU3 BRAIGAq (1.

DD @I |OQAD QASHIB BEBBNDG1HU3 BRAIMA{1a).

284. In clause 14, substitute the words “ Controller of Finance and
Accounts” for the words, “ Controller, Finance and Accounts” in the
marginal heading.

295. In clause 14(2), insert the words “ in writing” after the word

“ Government” .



47

®069a|0QN GBENM1H:U3 AQDH] MVfle:1a).

285. In clause 14(1), insert the words “ in writing” after the word
“ Government” in the first line.

290. In clause 14(1), substitute the words “ Controller of Finance and
Accounts” for the words, “ Controller, Finance and Accounts” .

303. In the proviso to clause 14(2), insert the word “ for” , after the
words “ who is not” .

316. Delete clause 14(6).

D@1 BRAIMAa{l2jDo AVflhAl2 @RV GEBBVMIB:U3 TVE @oW1H:@].).

09" CRAVMIBHUE MBYHS ERMAGIEWINS oﬁqﬁmeﬂgﬂ.

R3] alQ (@JHIABS al®IMILIdo Aldsal MmILload BIVAISHEMOAAN
@UQo VB mOm"]oe)(o"l%J.

cRBWM] ©21Q) (@JHIVAYBS o IMIMOILI0 Qldal milefload cowaow.

al®IMEeId0 Qldsa |

327, 330, 331, 333, 334, 337 agan1 mmd e300l GRAIMG]a{1a).
GRBNMIHH U3 MVERWANS BRADAM® 1GWINS oﬁcﬁmeng{l.

al®IMaRII0 Qldsa | MIEflHag BOVAILHEMEAM (@JUo AVE BRoUY1H:01).



48

al®1MemIdo ldsa | mnilefload cowarwl.

al®1MI0%0 Qldha |

338, 341, 342, 343, 345, 346, 347, 348, 349, 351, 352, 353, 355, 356,
359, 360 agan1 mmiB 6eEWI&:Ud @RAI®Gqla).

DAY MIHPIOQAD ANHHIM3 EGBBNG] BRAIM@To{la).

350. In clause 16(f), after the words “ Board is terminated” the words
“ or until his tenure remuneration or terms and conditions of service are
duly altered by the Board by regulation” shall be added at the end.

@09 JOQMM GEBENMIB:U3 AEY] AV,

338. In clause 16(a) for the word “ port” substitute the word
“ ports” .

342. In clause 16(c), for the word “ port” substitute the word
“ ports” .

343. In clause 16(d), for the word “ port” substitute the word
“ ports” .

345. In clause 16(e), for the word “ port” substitute the word “ ports” .

D@1 BRAIMAo{l2jDo AVflHhAl2|ONIW BEBBNMIH:U3 TVE @oW1H:@].).



49

09" CRRVMIKHUT MBWHS ERMADMIGWINS oJ’](TﬁO_Ieﬂ_v}J.

¢eBLM] §21Q @JHIVABS o I®IMINI0 Aldsq| MIEOHd BIVAIHHIMORAM
(@Jugo VB BP0 1@,

¢RI alQ (@JHIABB al®IMINIo Aldsq | mileload fowmaIwl.

al®1GMPIo Qldhal

361, 364, 365,366,367,368,369,370 agan1 mmid ce30®1&ud @RAI®Cq1a).
@00¥a|0QMN 6BV AT MVfE:@]1).

365. In Clause 17 after the words " The Board is duly terminated"
the words "or until his tenure, remuneration or terms and
conditions of service are duly altered by the Board by
regulation” shall be added.

D@1 TV 1B:015] BEBBNMT TVE BROW1B:@]2).

@1 EHISIGWAl MILIGHHB @RAI®Mdlafla] 368, @l AV, vodom

@OI®0la{la] 370 a1 mMIB e3V@IBUW 39 dM®IOE 52 GOISHEBIOS TV

m’l(oooe;m%.

\%

) GRRUNMIHUY M10IHHO1HB63HEWI MVEWYHS @R ICWINS

alladaieilasaecwo @QJ@Q.



50

¢eBLM] §4al1Q @JHABB al®IEMPIo Aldsqa| MIEOad BIWAIHHIMOA
(@Jygo VB @0 1h@la).
¢eBOM] §21Q) (@JHIVAYBS o IMIEMPIo Aldsq | milefload owmwl.

al®1eMg20 Aldsa |’

372, 373, 374, 375 aganl mmid ce30®1dhud @U@ {l2).
W, afl.od O@BRITVAS BRAIMGIa{laf 373 -00 MmMIB 3L 41 HOMOO

56 @gHE8IS MVE MO0

%

il GRBNM 1hUd M1IHO1H63HEWI VRS @RIV 1CWINS
alladale#s3@cwo 021Q.
al®1OMZo0 At MIL1Oad BINAIBHEMOAM @JUo MVE BRI 1B:@1a).
[QY) [e] m

al®1omMS20 Aldsal milelload sowaowl.

lD@MIMNI®I0 Qldsa |

376, 377 aganl mmid a3V IH0d @RAI®Gqfla).
®00¥a|0QaD BBV AT MVfE:@11).
376. In clause 19, for the word “ varied” , substitute the words
“ altered by the Board” .
D@1 TV 1B:015] BEBBNDT TVE BRoW1B:@]2).

377-20 mmIB cR_R3L®] aVE (Tﬂ(bC)cBa((ﬂ.f}J.



51

GRBLMI QEIY) (@JMHO0O83 alOIMI®0 Qldsa enflefload
BOWRISBHEMOAMM (@JUBo VB BN 1B014).
CRBUILM] §21Q) (@JHIVAYBS A IHOMIMIMI0 Qldsa| Mmilellond fonmowl.

D@0 Adsa |

378-00 mmud ¢e3L®] GRAI®G]q{la).
683LW®] AVE MI0IHEl).

DB I®00 Qlda | MIL10a3 BINAIBHEMOAM (@JUo MVE BRI 1E:@1).
H@Bal®Io Adsq | Mileflond 2onmawl.

D@30 IO 1)®IANIo Aldsa |

380, 381 agyam1 mmIB ceBV®B:08 ERAI®G]qfla).

683WMIHU3 AVE MI0IHEA1a).

O Ba IOM1HWIMI0 Qldsa | MO8 BONAISNEMHAIM @JUQo VB
@001 @1a).

OB IO OO0 Qldsa | mileflond 2onmowl.

D@ O 106N200 Aldsa |

DADT MIHPOQAD BDEBLWD: BRBNG U3 @AIM@Io(la).

641. In clause 22(b), after the word “ lease” the words “ or



52

license” shall be inserted.
642. In clause 22(c), after the word “ leasing” the words “ or
licensing” shall be inserted.
382, 383, 385, 386, 389, 391, 393, 394, 396, 397, 398, 399, 400
af)aM1 EBBNDG1HU3 ERAIMGo{1a).
@069 JoQAN 6BE3OMT AQD] MVfB:@12).
385. In clause 22(b), the words “ acquisition of sale” shall be
substituted with the words “ acquisition or sale” .
RIOINETQII L EYREEEDOIF S RUMEAG EY RECEOIOIERUVERE SIOIEIG EYE
@ af).0d. neIBd @RAMAlaflal 391-00 muAB ce3LV™] 43 sm™len 56
GQIIgHEBINS VB m’l(oooea(o’lad.
29" 6BRUMIHUW  MOIGHCEIABHEWI  TVEQYHS  BRMADICWINS
a B H833cWI 02IQ.
R3O  9aQ  (@JH0A8S  DGBalOWMIOMNI0  QAdsaf  mileflead
BOWRIBHEMOAMM (@JUBo VB BRONTB014).
CRRMI] ©2lQ (@JHIYBB Mo IOMIVMI0 Alda | ilefload conaIWl.

D@ IO 1Mo Aldsa |




53

402, 403, 405, 406 agam1 mmid L 1HU3 @RAI® AN {la).
DADT ®IHPROQAD GBBONMT AV1B>014).

406. In clause 23 (2), add the following item at the end;

“ (p) container handling facilities;”
AT MV 1B:014] BN TVE BRoW1B:@]2).
29" 6BRUMIHUW  MOIGHCIEBHEWI VRS  GERMAGICWINS
a1 H6336WI 021Q.
clelhlo]! 02l  (@H0AB8 OB lOWHIPYANI0  Aldkal  nilefload
BIWAIHNEMOAAN (@JUQo VR @aomﬂce;(ﬂ%J.
D BalOM1PaN0 Qldal milefload cowmow.

DM IO IMOLI0 Qldsa |

407, 408, 409, 410, 411, 412, 413 ool onid c_3VMIHU3
@ROIM G {1a).

GRBULM 1%H U M1RIBOH633HCWO VEWHS @R 1CWINS
alad01elH833EWI RETLOR

MO@BalOMIMOLN0  QAldsaf melom  BIVWMIGHMOAIN  @JyPo  AVR

mom%e)(o’l%J.



54

O Ba IO 1ML Qldsa | milefload sowaowl.

DB IO W0 Qldsa |

416, 417, 418, 419 agom1 mnid ce3O® 103 @RAI®Gqfla).
GRANMIMHUT  MIOIDHOABHEWI  AVRBWYHS  BRADAM IGWINS
a3 H633:6WI 921Q.
DB IOW]WeId0 Aldsaf ENHnd BOVAIGHIMEOAI Jyo 41-am@len 59
BQIIZHEBIOS MVE BP0 1h@1a).
OB lOM1WeI00 Qldal mileload cowaowl.

D@30 IO 1IN0 Qldza |

420, 421, 422 agom1 omid ce0®1aud @RAU® @l {l2).
GRBNMIMHUT  MIOIDHOIABHEWI AVRWYHS BRIV IGWINS
alada1eH83HcWwI 02lQ.
MHBalON]IWI0%0  Qldal  milelload  BIWAIHHIMOAAD  @JRo  AVE
@000 1M1,
DB IOM1WI00 Qldal milelload fowmowl.

DB IOM1GWPIo Aldsa |

424, 425, 426 agan1 mmid 6e30® 1603 @AI®G]qfla).



55

GRRUWMIKGUT  MIDIGOIABHEWI AVRBWYHNS BRIV ICWINS
aflBQILNH8:HEWI  §.21Q.
MHBalOMIGWYIo  Aldhaf miefload  RIVAIGHEMOAIM  @JWRo VB
@001 @1a).
@B IO IGWPIo Qldsq | nilefload conmowl.

D@ lOM1HWS0 Aldsal

427, 428, 430, 431 agan1 mmid ce30®1Hud @A fl).

DADT ®IHPROQAD GBBONMT AV1B>014).

428. In clause 28, for the words “ five thousand rupees” substitute
the words “ ten thousand rupees” .

D@1 TV 1B015] BEBBNMT TVE BROW1B:@]2).

W )V vodem GRAIMAlafla) 431-00 mmMId cerw®] 4l-em@len 59
BQIIZHEBINS MVE MI1IBT]).

ile} GRBNM 1hUY M10IHO1B63HEWI VRS @RAVN@1CWINS

alladaieleseco @m%.

CRRLM] 02l  (@H0AB8  DBaIOMIOWZo0  Adsaf  mileflend

BOWNAIBHEAMHAM (@JUQo LB @aow%e;m%.
m



56

MHBaIOM1OWS0 Qldsq | mileflond conmdwl.

D@30 IHOMIMIMI0 Qldsal

432-90 maud e3310®] GRAIMAN{la).

6830™] AVE MIIHA1a).

MHBalO@MIMI®0  Qdsa] MNLfload  RIWAIHHIMONAM  @JyQo VR
@001 @1a).

@B IOOMIMI®0 Qldsa | milellond cowadwl.

Da|®do Qldsal

433, 434, 435 agyam) mmid e33O Ud @RAI®Eo{l).

GRBULM 1 Ud MOIB O H63HEWI MVRWHS @RAVN@ 1GWINS
alladalel#s3a:ewo 021Q.

Q@90 Qldsq] IE1Oa3 BIVAILHEMOAMM @JUBo TVE BROW1B:014).
Qal®0 Qldsq | nilefload @owmawl.

Do |0 1H®IMI0 Aldsa |




57

436, 437, 438, 439 ag)anT mmIB G333 @RAI®a{l).

GRBVM 1hUY M1RIGHO1H63HEWI VRWAS @RV 1GWINS
alladaieasa:ewo 921Q.

Do ]|OMIHWIMIo  Qldsal mielload  BIVWAIBHIMHAMM  @JRo VA
[QY) [0} m
@000 1@,
QOO0 Qldal milelload cowaowl.

Qo O 106MB0 Qldsa |

440-20 mmAd BBV GRAIMG]a 1.

683WM] AVE MIIHA1,).

Qo lomlemsdo Qldq] MIEHA3 BINMIGHEMSAM @JWRo TVE @R Td:@12).
Qa]om10mz00 Aldsqa | milefload sowadwl.

Qo O 1aNIo Qldsa |

(ee3L™WIE))
Qo |O®1AMI0 Qldsa | MIE(lHM3 BOVAILHEMEAID (@JUo MVE BP0 1@ 1).
Qo |O®1gaMio Qldsq | nilefload f0nmdwl.

Qo | IMILId0 Qldsa |

442, 443, 444, 445, 446, 447 agan) mmid 33033 @RAI® @l {l2).



58

GRRUWMIKGUT  MIDIGOIABHEWI AVRBWYHNS BRIV ICWINS
aflBQILNH8:HEWI  §.21Q.
Qo |O®IMIEN0 Qldq | MIIENO3 BINMILHIMHRIM @JUo TVE @RoW1B:@].).
Qo |OmIMILdo Aldal milefload sowadwl.

Qo |0 110 Qldsa |

449, 450, 451, 452, 453, 454, 455, 456, 457, 459 agyam1 maud
HeeIOIELRE QI LY EYS

GRBULM 1%H U M1RIBOH633HEWI VEWHS @RI 1CWINS
alad01e$833cWI RETLOR

Qo |OD1WeDI00 Qldsq | MIE1O3 BIVAILHEMOAM @JUWQo TVB BROV1B:O14).

Do |Om1emIdo Qldsq | nilefload f0nadwl.

Qo |0 1WI000 Aldsa |

460, 461, 464, 465 agan1 mmMIB GR3LHHUI @RAI®G]qla).
GRBNVM1HUY M1IGHO1B63HEWI QNS @RV 1CWINS
alladalel#s3a:ewo 9.21Q.

Qo |O®1WIN0 Al IO BIVAILHEMOAM @JUBo TVB BROV1d:014).



59

Qa]Om1@I00 Qldal milelload cowaow.

Qo |JOM1GWPIo Qldsal

466, 468 agam1 MMIAB EBEOG1HU3 ERAI®O T {la).
GRANMIMHUT  MIOIDHOABHEWI  AVRBWYHS  BRADAM IGWINS
aflBaIelo8He 0219,
Qo |OM1EWLI0 Qlda] MIIENHR BOVMILHMORAD (@JyBo TVE @RoU)1e:1).
Qalom1ePio Qldal milefload cowaowl.

Qo |10 Qldza |

469-00 mMIB €33 ERAI®Gafla).

683LWM] AVE MIIHA11).

Qo |O®1HWSZ0 Al MIEloag BOVAIBHEMOAM @JUBo VB BRONTB:014).
Dalom1oWg0 Qldsal milefload conmowl.

Do |HOMIMU®Io Adza |

470-20 mmMIB eBBOL® @AMl {la).
GRAVMI1 MVERYHS @RAVADTICWINS oﬁaﬁmengd.
Na|@@IMI®0  Aldsaf miefload  BIVMAIBHEMOAIM  @JRo  AVE

mom%e)(o’l%J.



60

Do |O@MIMIMIo Aldsa| milellond sowmowl.
QY 0

MI@3a |0 Qldsal

471, 472 agam mmId eEEOG1HU8 ERAI®0Ta{la).

BRI U M1RIHHB1H63HEWI MLEWYHS @R 1CWINS

alfladaieleseHcwo @QJ%.

MA@ |®I0 Qldhq | nElHd BOVAILHAMHRIM (@JyZo TVE @0 1dh@1).
MI@a @0 Qldsaf milelload fowmowl.
QY 0

MIM@3a |HOMIANIo Aldhsa |’

473, 474, 475, 476 ag)anT mmiB c3310® U3 @RAI®G]qfla).
CRRLMIHU  qVEWHS  ARMAMICWINS  allBaleldn®aq|SHEWI
MR ]GHEWI 6219

MIMa |O@MIMMI0  Qldsaf milefload  BIVAISHIMOAAN  (@JUQo  AVE

(BTDOUﬂcG)(O’]_H.

MM |H@MIAMI0 Qldhal milefloa cowaowl.

MI@3a |JOM1QMBI0 QAldsa |’

477-00 mM1B @33 ERAI®G]qfla).

GR_ALMI Ve m%ooce;(o’]gd.



61

MO o080 Qldsal mielload  [IWAIANIMHAMM  @JRo VB
0L 0 m
@001 @1a).
M@ O 10200 Qldsa | mieload cowmowl.
[QY) 0

MI@3a |O®17aNI0 Qldhal

479-00 B €23V ERAI®G1q{la).

DADT MIHPIOQAD ANVHHIM3 GBBNG] BRAIM@To[la).

480. In the proviso to clause 43 for the word “ remit” substitute the
word “ refund” .

DA BRAIMAa{l2] ANEHIM GBRNM] MVE @YY 1khE1a).

479-00 mMIB _BO® M8 MG ).

CR3LM] 94l  (@HI0ABB  MITIo|OWIPANIo  Aldsal  enilefload
BIAIHNEMOAAN (@JUQo VR «momﬂce;(zﬂgd.

MO@a |O]YaNI0 Qldsq | mileflond conmdwl.

MIB3a |OIMILIIo QAldhal

481-00 mMIB €3EV®I ERAI®G]q{la).

GRANMI MVERWAS @RV 1IGWINS ojlcramennd.



62

MIWo |OIMILe  Qldsaf milelload  BIVWAIAHIMHAMM  (@JUQo
QY (o) m
@001 @1a).
M@ @ IMILIN0 Qldsa | mileflond owmowl.
[QY) 0

M3 | T1WeDI0 Aldsa |

(ee3L™ BRAI®Ra{le06aS1El)
MM | IWemIdo  Qldsa] miefload  BIVAIHHEMOHAIM  (@JUQo
@001 @1a).
MI@a |O1WemI00 Qldhal milefload cowaowl.

MI@3a O 1IN0 Qldsal

(ee3L®NWIE))
MIB3|OMIWIN%0 Qe mielload  BIVAILHMOAAN  (@JUo
@0 1h@1a).
MNI@a |ON 1IN0 Qldsa | mileflond conmowl.

MO@3a JO1GWPIo Qldsal

485-20 mMIAB EBBOL® @AM {la).
GRANMI MVERYANS @RV 1IGWINS ojlnﬁmeng{l.

MIB|OMIGWYIo  Qldsqaf ileflom  RIVAISHIMOAMM  (@JUdo



63

@001 @1a).
MI@a |ON16PIo Qldal mileflo fowaowl.

M@ |HOMZI0 Qldsa |

486, 487, 489, 492, 493 agam1 mmid e 1HU3 @AI®Gqfla).
DADT MIHPOQAD GB3VM] BERNMIGWINS TV [1h1a).
492. In clause 48(3), after the words “ sent by post” insert the words
“ and by e-mail wherever possible” .
DAY ®IHPIOQAD GBBND] MVfB:@1).
493. In clause 48(3) substitute the word “ bonafide” for the word
“ bona fide” .
AT MV 1B015] BEBBOMIB®:U3 TVE BRoW1B:@]).
g’ GRBNM 1HhUY M1RIGHOHB63HEWI MVRWAS @R 1CWINS
allBQIees::EWwI 9.21Q.
C_BRUNM] 6 21Q(JHI0NSS MI@a |HOMZI0 Qldsa | enflefload

BIUNAMIBHNEMBHAAM (@JURo VE @aomﬂce;(ﬂ%J.
m

¢RBWM] §.21QEJHIVABB NI |O@MFI0 Oldsa | milefload sowmow.



64

MIB3|H@MIMUDI0 Qldsal

494, 495, 496, 501 agom1 mmid B3O @RAI®G]q fla).

DAY MIOLAOQAD GB3OMT GBROMIGWINS TVfl:@1a).

495. In clause 49(1):
(1) after the words “ sent by post” insert the words “ or by e-mail as the
case may be”
(2) and after the words “ notice cannot be so served upon him” insert the
words “ in the address collected at the time of landing of goods™ .

D@1 AV 1015] BEBRNMT TVE BROW1H:@]2).

29" GRRVMIHUWB  MEIHOIIBHEVWI  AVEWYHS  GRAAMICWINS

al103QIeE8:HEWI RETLOR

CRRLM] 92lQJHOPBB  MITI|O@MIMI®I0  Aldsaf  nilefload
BOWRIBHEMOAMM (@JUBo VB BRONTB:014).

¢RBMI] §21QYEJHI0ABB MIMQ|HOMIMIMI0 Qldsal ilefload conmowl.

@RMI®J0 QAldsaf

(ee3L@el)



65

@0MIMI0 Qo | MIIENHZ BOVRILHIMHRAM (@JUZo TVE @0 1dh@1).
[y 0 m
@RMIMI0 Qldsa | milefload sowaowl.

@MU OIIMI0 OJcGaq‘_r

502, 503, 504, 505 agam1 mmid e33O 1dHud @RAI®Gqfla).

DADT ®IHPROQAD EBBOM U3 AV flh@la).

503. In clause 51(2), insert the word “ working” after the word
“ five” .

504. In clause 51(2), add the following proviso, namely:-
“ provided that 10 days' notice shall be given to the party before the sale” .

AT MV 13012] BEBBNMIBHU3 VB BRoW1B:@]4).

09 GRAUNMIH U3 MVERWYHS BRAAMICWINS oﬁqﬁmeﬂ%.

eclelflo 921Q()H008: @RMIHOMIANIo Qs | enilelleoad
BOWRIBHEMOAMM (@JUBo VB BRONTB:014).

CRBLMI] §21QYEJHI0ABB ERMUHD@MINMI0 Aldsa| milelloand cowaowl.

@RMIOMI06N200 Qldsal

506-20 Mm@ ¢33V GRAIMG]Q ).



66

QD] ®I99a 0N GBBVMIT V@),

506. In clause 52(i), after the word "board", insert the word "of".

D@1 AV 1B015] GEBBOMT TVE @R 1B:@12).

CR3LM] 92l  (@H0AB8  GRMIOMICMRI0  Qldaf  enilefload
BOURIBHEMOAM (@JUBo VB BRONTB:014).

¢RBULWM] §21Q) (@JHIVAYBS ERMIOMIMEI0 Qldal milefloag cowaow.

@MU QM0 Al |

507, 509, 510 agam1 mmd E33L®&0d GRAIME]a{1a).

GRBNM 1Hh U M1RIBGHO1H633HEWO MVRWAS @RV 1GWINS
ailadaleiles3a:ewo 0aIQ.

@OMIO®MIYIMIo  Qldsaf  Mmilelload  BIVMILHMOAAN  (@JUQo VB
[QY) 0 m
@001 @1a).
@RMIOMIYAMI0 Qldsq | nileflond oMW

@RMIGMIMILId0 Aldsa |

511, 512 agyam1 mmid 330 ey @AI®G]q fla).
GRRULM1HU3 MVLRWYHS BRAAM IGWINS oJ’]O@O_Ien%J.

@RMIOMIMILIo  Qldsaf mileflload  BIWAMISHMOAIM  @JUo VR



67

(BTDOUﬂcG)(O’]_H.

@RMIOmIMLId0 Qldal milefload cowmowl.

@RM IR0 Aldsa |

513, 515, 517 agyam1 mmiIB c_AV®1H:Ud @RAI® o {l).

GRBULM 1HUd M1IHO1H63HEWI QNEWOHIS @RAVN@1GWINS

alfladaieilas eI @QJ%.

@RMWalOMIWeR00  Aldha| mMefload  BIVAIBGHEMOAIM  @JPRo  AVE
@000 1M1,

@R IO ]1WemI00 Qldal milefload cowaowl.

@R IO IWIN0 Qldsal

518-00 MA@ €e3V®] @RAIMG]q{la.
DADT ®IHP0QAD BBNM] MVfld:@]2).

518. In clause 56, for the words “an effectual” substitute the words “a
valid”.

D@1 AV 1B015] BEBBOMT TVE BROW1B:@]).
Jclelflo 0 21Q(@JHI0NBS @R IO 1WIN0 Qo enfeleoad

BORISHEMHOAMN (@JUQo VR (ewao(n%e)tzﬂ%J.

¢eBULM] §21QEJHIVABB @RI IOMIWINI0 Aldsq | ileflond BOVmIWI.



68

@R IO G PIo Qldzal

(eeB3L® wel)
@RMalOMICWIo  Qlda| mofload  RIVAIGHMOAM  @JUgo  ALR
@000 1@,

@M IOD16WPIo Qldsq | milelload cowmowl.

@R IOM1HWS0 Aldsa |

(6eBL® wel)
@RMalODMOWSI0  Aldksal Milefload  RIVMIGHIMOAIM @)oo LR
@0 1h@1a).

@RMa IO 1OWS0 Aldsa| milelload sowaowl.

BRMIM1HWIMBa Do Aldsa |

¢_3L®] BRAIMG]a {leoqalslel.
@R IOM]OWIMBalI®Io  Qldsa| MILlOM BIVAILHIMORMD  (@JUWQo VR
@000 1@,

@R IOM]HWIMBal®Io  Aldsa| milefload owadwl.

@RQaI®Io QAldsa |’

(e_B3L® ME))
@0Qal®o Al MIENHG BONAIBHEMORAM (@Jugo MVE @oW)1dh@1a).

@RQaI®0 Qldsq | nilefload 28onmawl.



69

@RQIOM]HWIANIo Qldhal

520-%0 mm1d ee3V®] GRAI®Gq{la).

GRAVMI1 MLERYHS @RIVADICWINS oﬁaﬁmengd.

@RQAIOMHWIMMI0  Aldsaf  Mmellond  BIVAISHIMOAAN  (@JUo
@000 1M1,

@RQAIOM1HWIMI0 Qldsq | nileflond B@owmawl.

@RQa IO 106M200 Aldsa |

(e6e3L® wel)
@RQaIOMI0N20  Aldsaf  miefload  BIWAILHMOAAN  (@JUdo
@001 @1a).

@RQaIO]06M200 Qldhal milefload cowaowl.

@RQa IO 1AM Aldsa |

521, 522 agyam1 mmIB ¢ 1H:038 @U@l {la).

GRBUNMIHH U3 MVERWHNS BRADAM® 1GWINS ojlcr’émengd.

@RQaIOMIYaMI0 Al  mefload  BIWAMILHEMONAM  (@JUQo
@001 @),

@RQaIOMIPYaMI0 Qldsa | mileflond f0nmawl.



70

@RQa IO IMILI0 Qldsa |

523-0%0 mmMI3 ee3V®] GRAI®G]q{la).

GRANMI MVERYANS @RV 1IGWINS oJ’]oﬁmel’]gJJ.

@RQalIOMIMOLo  Aldsaf  Mellond  BIWAISHIMOAMM  (@JUQo
@001 @1a).

@RQaIO 1MoL Qldal mileload owaowl.

@RQIOM W0 Aldsa |’

(ee3L® wel)
@RQalOMIWemdo Qe  milefload  BIWAIHHEMOHAIM  (@JUQo
(GTOOUﬂ(ﬁ)(O']_f}J.

@RQa IO 1WemId0 Qldsq | mileflond conadwil.

@RQIOMIWIN0 Qldza |

524, 526 agyam1 MMIAB ¢V 1HU3 @U@ fla).

GRANMIH U3 MVRWYAS BRMAMIGWINS ojlcrﬁmeﬂgd.

@RQaIOMIWI0%0  Qldsal el  BIVAISHEMOAIM  (@JUo
(GTOOUﬂ(ﬁ)(O']_f}J.

@RQa IO WI0%0 Qldsq | mileflond conmdwl.

@RQa IO G PI0 Qldsa |




71

528, 530 agam1 MMIB ¢V 1H:03 ERAUM@a{la).

GRBNMIHH U3 MVRWAS BRADAM® 1GWINS oﬁaamel’IgJJ.

@RQAIOMICVYIo  Qldsaf milefload  BIVAIBHEMOAIM  @JRo  AVE
@000 1M1,

@RQaIOM]GWYIo Qldsq] ileflond cowmW].

@RQa IO 1OHWS20 Qldhal

531, 532, 534, 535, 536 ag)am1 mmiIB c_RAL®1d>ud @U@ {l2).

GRBNMIHHU3T MVRWANS @RV 1IGWINS oﬁaamel’IgJJ.

@RQAIOM]OWSI0  Qldkal mMefload  RIVMIGHMAMM  @JRo  AVE
@001 @1a).

@RQaIOM OG0 Aldsq | Mileflond BowmW].

@RQa IO 1HWIMa I®Io Adsa |

537, 539, 540, 541 agyam1 mMIB RV I1H U3 @Gl {l2).

GRRULM1HhU3 MVLRWAS BRMAM ICWINS oJ’]('lﬁO.len_r}J.

@RQ IO IOHWIMal®Io  Qldsaf efload BIVAILHEMOAI  @Jydo LR
@0 1h@1a).

@RQa IO 1OHWIMBal®Io Alda | nilefload fonawl.

af)§al®o Qldsaf




72
(6eB3L® wel)
af)§al®do Qldsq | nE10a3 BIVAILHEMOAM @JUQo TVE BROVIB:014).

af)gal®do Qldal mileload cowaowl.

) o 1OM10H@IAMIo QAldhal

(e_B3L® Me))
af)§alOWIHWIIMI0  Qldsq| miefloag  RIVMIGHMOAM  @JfRo  AVE
@001 @),

) §a IO 1HWIMI0 Aldsa | milefload sowadwl.

2f)§alOMIME20 Qldsal

D@1 ®IOHYa|0QAM CBRULMI] GRBUVLMIGCWINS QANAHNIT  CRRUMIWIW]
@RI G {1a).

542. In the marginal heading clause 72 substitute the word “of
amounts” for the words “of moneys”.

543, 544, 545, 547, 548, 549, 550, 552, 554 agam1 mmid eV 1a:ud
@RI G {1a).
DAY ®INPRIOQAD EB3OMIHUY AUf1h@1a).

547. In clause 72(1)(e) substitute the word “authorised” for the word
“authorized”.

550. In clause 72(2)(a) the words substitute the words “Treasury



73

Savings Bank” for the words “Treasury Saving Bank”.
552. In clause 72(2)(a) delete the words “or in any corporation”.

D@1 BRAUGGa{la] AGHIGE GBIV MVfld:Glay 6B3LTIHBo LB
@001 @),

29" 6BRUMIHUW  MOIGHCEIABHEWI  TVEQYHS  GBRMAMICWINS

alladaieilasecwo @QJ@Q.

(&)

eclelflo 0 21Q(JHO0NBSB af) Qoo 10620 Qldsal enflelload

BIAIHNEMSAN (@JUQo VR mOm"lceam%J.

¢RI §2IQYE]HI0ABY af)galOMI0M20 Aldsa | milellend cowaowl.

2)§alOM1gaIMNI0 Qldsa |

(e_B3UL® ME])
af)alO®IMio  Qldal  milefload  RIWAIHHIMORAAD  @yQo VB
@000 1@,

af) §a 1Mo ldsq | milefload sowadwl.

af)§alom1mMILIdo Qldsal

555-00 MMIB 63V GRAI®G]q{la).
GRAVMI1 MVERYHS @RIV ICWINS oﬁaﬁmengJJ.
af)§alOIMILDo  Qldal  milefload  RIVMIGHMOAM  @JyQo VR

@aom“]oea«ﬂ%.

af)galOm1MILIdo Aldsal milefload owadwl.



74

2) $o 10N 1WEDI0 Aldsa |

556-00 mmM1d eV GRAI®Gq{la).
GRAVMI1 MVERYHS @RAVADICWINS oﬁaﬁmengd.
af)alO1emde  Qldal  Milefload  BIVAISHIMOAIM  @JyQo  AVE

@’oomﬂoe;(ohd.

) §a IO 1WemId0 Qldsq | milefload owmwl.

2f) 1O 1WINI0 QAldhal

557-00 MMIAB €e3V®] BRAIMG]q{la).
DAY ®IHPIOQAD GBBND] MVfB:@1).

557. In clause 76(2) for the words “per cent” substitute the word
“percent”.

D@1 MV 1B014] RN TVE BRoW1B:@]).

GRRULMI 921Q(JH00BS af)§a lom1WIN0 Qldsa | enfleflead

BOWNAIBHEAMHAMM (@JUQo VB @aow%e;m%.
m

¢RBUWM] §21QEJHIVABS af) Lol WINI0 Aldsa | milefload cowawl.

2f) 1O 1CWPIo Aldhzal

559, 560 agam1 M3 EeBV®H:08 ERAI®G]qfla).

DADT ®IHPIOQAD GEBND] MVfB:@]).



75

560. In clause 77(2) for the words “per cent” substitute the word
“percent”.

D@1 MV 1B3014] GEBBOMT TVE BRoW1B:@]).
09" CRRVMT MVBWOS BRI 1GWINS oflcrameﬂad.
GR_BULMI 6 .21Q(JHO0QBSB af)Qalom1cWYIo Qldsa | enfleflead

BIWMIANEMEAAM (aJUo VR «momﬂce;(zﬂgd.
m

¢eBUM] §.21QEJHIVABS af)§alOVIEWPIo Aldsq | milefload owadwl.

af)§alom10WS00 QAdsal

(ee3L® wel)
af)§alOIOWs0  Aldsaf Mefload  BIVAMIBHEMOAIM  @JRo  AVE
@001 @1a).

af) §alO1OWSF20 Aldsa | milefload sowadwl.

2f) 10N 1HWIMal®Io Qldsa |

¢ 1HU3 ERAIMAq [leoeq]slel.
af) §alODHWIMa ™o Qldsaf mIelloa BIVWAIGHIMOOAN  @JyQo VR

(GTDOUﬂOG)((ﬂ%.

) §a IO HWIMa I®Io Aldsa | milefload owaowl.

2f)eN3al®0 Qldsa |

564-00 mmM13 eV GRAIGG{la).



76

GR_A3ULMI VE m%ooce)(o’]gd.

af)eMbal®o  Qldq | MIIENO3 BINAILHIMHRIM (@JUo TVE @oW1H:@].).

af)eNBal®do Qldsq | mileflond conaowl.

2f)NBa IO 1) IOMI0 Qldsal

565-20 mmMIB eV mm@mg%.
QD] ®I99a 0N GBBVMIT V@),

565. In clause 81, for the word “authorized” substitute the word
“authorised”.

D@1 TV 1B:015] BEBBNDT TVE BROW1B:@]).
e 92IQEJHIVABB  af)MValOMOWIMM0  Aldsq|  nflefload

BOWNAIBHEMHAMM (@JUQo VB (maou)"lce;m%.
m

¢RBULWM] §21QEJHIVABS af)MBaIOVHWIMMI0 Aldsa | milefload sowadwl.

af)Ma IO 10MB0 Aldsa |’

567, 569, 570, 571, 574, 575, 577, 578, 579, 580, 581, 582, 583 agom
MMIB GEBEBNG1HU3 BRAIMATo{la).
DAY @IOLOQAD GB3NMT MVfB:@1a).

567. In clause 82(1) for the words “the Chairman” substitute the words

“the Chief Executive Officer”.



77

D@1 TV 1B:015] BEBBNDT TVE BRoW1B:@]).
09" GRAVMIBKHUE MBYHS ERMAGIEWINS oﬁcﬁmen%.
eclelflo 921Q(JH00BS af)6eMda IO 106200 Qe nilellead

BOWNAIBHEMHAMM (aJUQo VB @’Oo(fﬂtﬂa((ﬂgd.
m

¢RBMI] £2IQYE]HI0ABY af)iMBalOM]0MN2o0 Aldsal milofload owadwl.

af)eMa IOM1PaNI0 Qldsa |’

(e6e3L® wel)
af)MBalOIgaMio  Qldkaf mileflload  BIWVAISHIMOAM  @JQo VB
@000 1M1,

af)eNBa OGN0 Qldsal milefloag cowaowl.

)M I IMOLI00 Qldsal

R3] ERAIMTIa{leoealslel.
af)MBalOBIMILDo  Qldsa| m1eloa  BIVAIBHEMOAIM  @JUdo  aVE

momﬂoe;aﬂgd.

af)eNBa IO IMILIN0 Aldsa| milelload owmwl.

2f)Ma IO 1WeRIdo QAldsa |

(e6e3L® wel)



78

af)MBalOD1WemIde  Aldsa| mMNEfload  BIVAISHIMOAAN  (@JUQo VR
@001 @),

af)fNBa 1O 1WeRId0 Qldsa | milefload sowadwl.

)Mo 1O WIN0 QAldhsal

586, 588 agam1 mMIB EBOL®1HUY BEAIMAIa{la).

GRBUNMIHH U3 MVERWHS BRADAM 1GWINS ojlcramengd.

af)MBalOD1WI00 Qs mIIelom  BIVMILHMOAIN  @JyQo  AVE
@001 @1a).

af)eNBa IO 1WI0%0 Qldsaf milefload cowaowl.

2f)eNda IO 16 PIo Qldsa |

589-00 MmMIB 2BV ERAI®G1q{la).
DAY ®IHPIOQAD GBBND] MVfB:@1).

589. In clause 87(2), for the words “State Legislature” substitute the
words “Legislative Assembly”.

D@1 MV 1B014] RN TVE BRoW1B:@]).
GRRULMI 921Q(JH00BS af)6eNda IO 16WPIo Qdsq  milefload

BORISHEMHAMN (@JUQo VR @aow%e;m%.

¢RBMI] 62l1QYE]HI0ABY af)iMBalOM]CWPIo Aldkal milefload sonwadwl.

af)Ma MO WSI0 QAldza |




79

590, 592, 593 agyam1 mmiIB GRAV®1H>Ud @Ol {l2).

GRBNMIHH U3 MVRWAS BRADAM® 1GWINS oﬁaamel’IgJJ.

af)aMa IO 10HWS0 QAdaf ilefload  BIWAISHIMOHAM  @JUQo LR
@000 1M1,

af)fNBa OO0 Qldsaf milefloag cowaowl.

2f)M3a 1M 10 WIMa Mo Aldsa |

(e_B3L® Mme))
af)MBaIOD1OWIMa ™o Qldal MO BIVAIGHMOAIM  (@JUdo VR
@001 @1a).

af)iNBa 1D 1OWIMaI®Io Qldal milefload cowaow.

OMIGNROAJ0 Qldhal

594, 595, 596 agam1 mmid c_E3L®IHHU3 @RAI®@Nqfla).

GRANMIH U3 MLRWYAS BRAAMIGWINS ojlcrﬁmeﬂgd.

O@®INO0%0 Ao MILNO BONRILHEMSAM (@JYBo TVE BRI @1).
H@®IGN0%0 Qldho] Milefload 0NadW.

s)@osmq”l B0MJo Qdsal’

597, 598 ag)an1 mmid eV 1&hU3 @RAI®@Nq fla).

GRRULM1HU3 MVLRWYHS BRMAM IGWINS oJ’]O@O_Ien%J.



80

O®MIMAl  @MMlo Aol mielload  ‘IMAIGHAMOHAIN  (@JUQo VB
o1y O QY 0 m
@001 @1a).

O®IMA] BaNJ0 Qldrq] Mmilefload oWl

6)@06;391 Q6M3J0 Qldsal’
599, 600, 601, 602, 604, 606, 607 agaVT MMUAB ECRBODIHUI
@RQIN G {1a).
683OMIHU3 TVB  MI0IHEla).
6)@0%91 @200 Qldsq| ileflead  BIWAISHIMOAAN  @JRo  dVB
@001 @),
O@®IMA] N300 Qldhq | mileflond coOwaWl.

s)@ocamgmcm" QA ® @3 s)@oswq”lm)am" QAU AUBaldhUd

(a3 lel)
O®EMAIPAN”  AM@  O@®INFIWeDI” QIO OldhaldhUd  milefload
BOWRISBHEMOAMM (@JUBo VB BRON1B014).
©®NGIRIN” A®@ H@IFRATWEI" QIO Ol 03 Mileloagd GOV,

O@OG&Q’I@OOOO QAldhal’

610-00 mMIB L] @PAI®Gqfla).



81

610-0 ®mmId ce3O@WOLl GHITY (1) oJdM@OWo GV (ii)
@INPa|0QAM CRARNMIMHEBINSWo AV ﬂoe;czﬂgd.

610. In clause 96,

13

(i) for the words “ five thousand rupees” , the words “ ten
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
(i) for the words “ five hundred rupees” , the words “ one
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
CRBL®] 92l  (JH0QS: @@0%91@0000 Qe  enflefload
BOWMIBHEMOAMM (@JUBo VB BRONTB014).

¢RI alQ (@JHI0)BS 0@0%91@0000 Qldsa | nilellond cowadwl.

o@oswg”lem)mo Aldsal

612-00 mMA ¢EBL® ERAIGG]q ).

012-00 MMIB GEBROLG] MO0 CEEBODIHEBIOS TVNH:014):

612. In clause 97, for the words “ five hundred rupees” , substitute
the words “ one thousand rupees” .

CRRLM] 92l  (@JHONBS 6)@066@@9’](3@@:)0 Qs milelload

BIWAIHNEMOAAN (@JURo VR mOm"lceam%J.



82

cRBLM] §21Q) (@JHI0ASS @@0%91@@900 Qldsq | nileflond conmowl.

O®I6RQ1 afg%0 Qldhql

614, 615, 616 agam1 MMIAB RO IHUB @OI®G]afla).

GRBUNM1IHH U M10IHHO1H63HEWI MLEWYHNS @R ICWINS
afladaielH633cWI 9.21Q.
@@oqmg%ﬂ af)S%0  Qldsq Mo  BIWAIHHIMOAID  (@JUQo LR
@001 @),
6)@0%91 af)§%0 Qldsa| mnilefload cowadwl.

RIORD 1 ]edl B al®9o QAdsal

619, 620 agam1 MMIB RV 1B:U8 ERAI®Gq{la).
GRAULMIHUT  MINIGHOIHBHEWI TVRWYHS  BRAADICWINS
alBaIeNes®:cWI  0.21Q.
O™l B8Mal®Io  Aldqf Milelload  BIVMIGHIMODAD  (@JWPo  dVE
@000 1M1,
O®IMA1 3MBal®o Qld:qf mileloagd @anaIW].

Q090 Ald:al

(a3 lel)



83

Q020 Aldsa| MIEOH BIVAIHHEMHAMM (@JUgo MVE BP0 1k 1a).
Y020 Qldsq | ileflond B@owmawl.

MQ1HWIANI0 Qldhsal

621-00 MmMIB 6EEOL® AN {la).

621-00 ™A BV AEDT MA@ 4:

621. In clause 101, for the words “ one thousand rupees” substitute
the words “ two thousand rupees” .

el 9alQ) (@JDHO008 Q1OWIIMI0 Qdsq  enflefload
BOWMIBHEMOAMM (@JUBo VB BRONTB014).

CRBLMI] ©2lQ (@JHIABS MYQ1HWIMI0 Aldsa | ileflead fnaIW.

Q10MBI0 Aldsal

(eesv@lel)
MQ10aMs20 Ald:q | MIENH03 BOVAIBHEMOAIM (@JUgo MVE @R 1),

MQlomzdo Qldsqa | milefload sowadwl.

™Q1gando QAldkal

622-00 mMIB €83 ERAI®G]qfla).

622-20 M3 6RO @] VN1 5):



84

622. In clause 103(1), for the words “ orco-operative society,”
substitute the words and symbol “ or co-operative society,” .

¢eBLM] 219 @HAB8 YFIPYIMIo Aldsq| Mol BIWAILHIMONAM
(@Jugo VB BP0 1h@la).

¢RI 2lQ (@JHI0ABS 1Q1PaMI0 Aldsal mileflead sowadwl.

@QIMILI‘o QAldsal’

623, 625, 626, 627, 628 agam1 mMIB RV IHUB @AI®G]q fla).

DAY ®IHPOQAD EBBOM] AVfld:@1a):

628. In clause 104(4)(f) delete the words “ the Government or, as the
case may be, the” .

29" GBRUMIHU  MOIGHOIEBHEWI  TVRYHS  GERMAGICWINS

a1ad01e863&HEWI 02lQ.

¢eBLM] 021 @JH00A88 QYFIMIL0 Aldsa | MLl BIWAIHHIMOHAM
(@Jygo VB @011,

¢RRLM] §21Q) @JHI0088 Q1ML Aldal milefloa owaowl.

MQIWenIlo Qldsal’

@090 GBEVMT AQY] ANEHIGE ¢E3VMIWIWVT BRAIMAIR{la):



85

629. In clause 105, the following sub-clause shall be added, namely:-

“ (6) The recommendations of the Local Advisory Committee may be
placed before the next Board meeting” .

D@1 BRAIMAa{l2] ANEHIM GBBNM] MVE @0 1khE1).

R3] ©alQ (@JHI0Q88 1QIWaNId0 Aldsa| mIelload BIWVAILHEMOAN
@UQo VB mOm"]oe)(o"l%J.

¢eELWM] ©21Q) (@JHI0Q88 FIWeId0 Qldal milefload cowaow.

@ Q1wI0°, ®Qlcwy” O.Icﬁa(%cea(la
(ee3w@lel)
MQ1WI0, MPIWY” ag)aM] O_loeagdceaga nelond RIVMIGHMOAM (@JUo
Ve @RoW 1 @1a).
MQ1WI0, MFICWY” af)am] (llo@agdoea(ﬁ enfeleoad conmowl.

Q16 WS%0 Qdsal’

630, 631 agam1 MMIB EEERV®IH:U38 ERAI®Gafla).
GRAVMIMH U3 MVRWAS BRAAMICWINS oﬁaﬁmengd.
MQQ10WSI0 Qldq] B3 BINMISLHIMHRIM @JWRo TVE BRoW1B:@]2).

MQ1OWS20 Qldsq | nilefload fonmwl.



86

Q1O WIMIMI0o Aldsal’

632, 633, 634, 635, 636 agyaM1 MMIB EEEV®HU8 ERAI®G]afla).
DAY ®IHPROQAD EBBOD] AVfld:@1a):
635. In clause 109(s), for the word “ authorized” substitute the word
“ authorised” .
29" 6BRUMIHUW  MOIGHCEIABHEWI  TVBYHS  GBRMAMICWINS
a B H833cWI 02IQ.
eeBL®]  9alQ  (@NHOAB8  MFIOVIMI®I  Aldsaf  ileflead

BOWNAIBHEMHAMM (@JUQo VB (maou)"lce;m%.
m

¢RI 2lQ (@JHI0ABS 1PQ1HWOIMIMIo Qldsq | ilefload fonmIW.

Qoo A @ @ Qlal@®Iment” AU moea%!oeaua
(eesv@lel)
110 poxd 115 awo Qdha 03 NGOG BONMIGHTNHAM @JURo aVE
@000 1M1,
110 gomd 115 aoo Qg |03 MEfload cownow.

@QNa|®1MI0%0 Qldhal’

637-00 mMIA L] @RAI®Gala).



87

GRRULM ] MVRWAS GRIVAMICWINS oflaameﬂgd.

MYl |®IMO0%e Qldqe|  milellond  BIWAIHHIMORAM  (@JUo
@000 1@,

Qo |®IMI0%0 Aldsal milelload sowaowl.

®Qa|®IeM®Io Aldsal’

(eezw@lel.)
MQla|®lem®io  Aldkal milefload  BIVAIBHEMOAIM  (@JUQo
@001 @1a).
MQQla|®1eMPI0 Qldsq | nileflond B0nmawl.

B0MIo Qldalo al101H o Gal@o

107, 108, 109, 110, 112, 114, 116, 117, 118 agam mmnId@ GO

@RQIN G {1a).

GRBUNM 1hUd MNOIBO1H63HEWI MVRWYHS @RA0AOD1CWINS

alladaieilasecwo @QJ@Q.

B3MNIo Qldhq]o af1015Qo Gal@o MIEN1OM3 BIVAIGHIMOOAN (@JUQo VR

momﬂoe;aﬂgd.

63NI0 Oldsq o al10l®Qo Bal@o nilefload fonmwl.



88

DONININLMAje DORRIAJe afOORTMo Al ]AD] (W) O, nIdemy):

2014-021 6®H0g 200106So  GMIBW" MG  AldAYISHEMHAAD (@ JEAWo

@RAIM@a [lasmo.

OMR2R mcea%d@’l (). BRYOLISM Na0M3): (JECAVWHOD o 10BIEBRAM.

U G»IS16 @] UL I D! @ORQ6BIBUI U1RHO0 Y GR6ILIY)

AN@BEBM@IMEIMS1Woem” MO Mleae Waflos ERAIMAIR {1H06q]S1S88® .
3OQldald  (@JIILINMEBIMBISBMDo  2TAUNSOIWBOS  @YAOZLIYEBBUI
MVoAHHIBDOQSIOD@NIW MV  Milefload  ERADANCMEWIS GWI1HHI0D
HPlOILL  BRDOBIMES” OMEBBUT DIIBHDS MSTDHAN.

Wl. aVl. 310103000 @0aa1ERUd £NTVIMN” MGG HFIQYIN OO 1LI8s

a@ ilenen” oaflos @ealmdlaflafildlesmmo. 1908-ae1  ecam@masnom
@RS1IVNIMNIHH ] OB:HIMNZAUMISSS [29]p0) enflelleel Gal000QHHU3
2101200199 a]SeMo. AN (JWIMAIW DOAAIGBHS BRMYAN0 @Y lD® HOAIW
MN2a0 210 | O 1GLIY B AN 1 HBANDo RN BNIWBOS @RAIMHIVIEBBUY
MVoAHHIEDOQSIODD@NIW MV NI A ldAVIBSBINAIB3 VMRV (@JD1BaHWo
GOAUQSOAN. QSHDT MSODATN.

@l . edk. MM DORAIBBEHS dYOBHUY” BlaHeMIQYWAEODA




89

®OO®1e|gs M milellom of)D1BAWOBIMNE" AIGHDS MSADAN.

Wl af). Od.  UIMBM:  GoAldald:  (@JMIICLIODEEBBMBIABAN 303

ilgoem” maflos  BRAIGGa{la2/IS88™. 210N BNITWOS  @RUHIVV6813UD
VoAU HDNQ SO OV NILNOM af)D]BODOHHIMNE" AUOHHDVT” MSADAT.
(V30w cHoslcwl NILIGHoHB, V). 310003, MV Od:. MID, af).
. NWIBMB of)aM1 @D ]aldH HAHH END@ISHUT (@JTYIAIM MSOMIWEUdaHo
@RAINAIMBOS 10351 BROWEBBEBINSIajo MVRWIGE MM A JOTWGAIIW.)

@l. afl. awl. w®10ad: MVeudM  AlGBIVMOMIM” MIBMIVSH ol

Ua01HH0MW  HYIQAN 8@ M1WANEM 1. CHIM@  aHla flowy”’
Ao [lasamme]ejes alVEIR/ 508 JATHANGIMBS  AVIRL YO HHUD
OO IAIQIMN@IM.  HIRIaO0MNa|S MTWABBHS M@0 @RSITVNIMAIBNIN®)
&IGLI 2 1RO DOQ6BBS0 MY(aS1oBBHISOIYHSVYo eOJBMIaHEM @3
@RYAMNBSAHM  GHIBFHBOSWo  MYJWIM  AflWldh8o DU HNINGHBI6NE"
M@ RV AUBOMeMo.  atila {loMIWT MITWeq|S MAFB MIHEM®I
SHMOQAUHMIDLI MNINLMGHUBHH” AUNDERLAIW KHIOLEEBUE M1VWAGTHLJMBIRID
aldSIgl.  @RD@eOME” MANBWERL@. MNIA1OOSe Af)RealBgdh8o 2U3NAlS B3

HMIGl Bell®0la] MWDo @RAIGWG" ©21QdQo  BHIARM@ aHlaflow)” 6@



90

o080 aHlal 6(@JIRBHIW] HB0MZAUTTIHQo & alQeMo.

W1, ®MIANT HEMNIaOMID: B3@ VA aloMo MSOM] MIB1HNSO (@ JBBUIDD

o)Ll @RYOHMYE, Yo Q@O@OOQQ‘%O@:O%U MY Moo  aldlayalanemo.
S0MBEMYIBESAHM QoA BHIANM@  atla{lolOA  @PMAD  AVIRL D HUI
(@JBYITRMOQFOMIMDS:AN  DOOMIT  M0G1ONSo  EMIIBAWINAR  (JAUBGmMo
QBAMIZHBIENZGaIddheMo. @ogalEgloel  21AMSHIWBOS  (@JUREBBUIHS

al@1a0d0o HHI6MeMo.

DONININDLMOJ  DORRINJe aPNGRIYo At |AAD] (YD1 O, enIomy):
2010-@8 avdeseely” 921Q0q]g milelad ¢e3u®] AIGOMIWISIEl. GHITRG3
aHla flofl®ad  VIRLIOGHUW  (JEVWIRMHQFOMINBEAIMEIWIM”  MOC1OeSo
GMNIAW” (@ l1012{1S88®. oo Mmilod  @ERAUMGIalla|GaloudOmeam
@REeeIgenam Mel]cd nelendd Galddsoy” ag)an &muMIQmol 800 6081
@Bales eflav’ afleonag” aHm%ooﬁ MOWlafIgNs”.  HE8OMNM3 @IRYOoE1a)
CHINN@  atlaflo’ olRL®IQo ReINIBWo  OBDINZEAIIBAN 2I0HBHUIHN”
(@Jar1ydalls] qumMiculawlQo EH@AVBHHIB DI BHWISHTVIgME. 2 1AUMSHIAHS”
E18].2J0 3 0MEIR1HBAM GILAIMEAUMM AIAITVNG:U3 DSBAMO LIBIAIBAN@IE.

MAOMIT3  HILINMMAYDAIW  A0Qo  QAUBOMING  AVBHHIG  AVLANELAJEM.



91

RLIND@IN Do G(@JoOMIa0la {l800a00 ®1CEUD coalelvleel

DOV §OOMIFILNSE] 58130 |HSVSIAUBOS O®I¥IeInIVEo  AIBRUa[lendao
oM MM Mc  @RAMOla{laf’ aldTOHHIG MO 014 Slally
@RoeBRUARe MMl GOEUORISODM.  MIT  aldAVIBSHIOMOEMOAIM’
@B AMO1H530M0.

2014-0e1 508 200100So  GMIDBW MG aldAVISHENHAM (@ JEOWo
ave (GTOOU)O]CG)(O']_'}J; N3 VB o ldaVIB].
(aJOOEAIW O ]aldHIoWERUY TVRWITE MG1OE: a0IR00W].)
(2) aven)dy” %191 0169]9485" 9aQElHI0a8s 2014-0e1 cH08

HSHBo AR MNIaIMEBBo (EE8BV®T)MINM aldlnem®
DDHOGHNMOAID (@JCGAWOJo BRM AN EOLISEEBH0

O®OYIElo HOMaIMINjo Q] (@) oxlen) Genienil GER06M): VNG,
SH1gl 016 0@ 6 21Q(JHI0NSSB 20l4-021  c»08  HSHSo
Q106M122MN0a IMEEBGo (6EEVMT) MA@ alGlWIMMWBHNGHNIMOAID (JEAWo
@RAIM @ o [lasmo.

BaHY0le  MIIAN@BAVONGIMN  DalBRISAYHMVoOH:HMOJo  EL1BIRAH0

moeh%l@’l (. @MYL’ cRBNMT) : (JCAVWHDOD o laNIEBRFND.

Wl adl. O . PD@EIANVAT: alewoRlal CARINA|SODMD.




92

OMIF1LINSICAHHAOM 1M EAIME] OHINZNUMMIB1H63aM enflelossman”
@RAIHINIRSEMIOo  BRAIMHNS @UQEBBU8  aldla0a1es3M@IMm” MVABHHIO
WIODI@  MSalSIQo  AVfld@lassaniel. alOMIOIV®  QAIJOITNVIW  GARIA
@B 2|l M1EBRHWITM . ACNIMINLM  casleidloel do®IYILING]BU3oe”
M@BH1VISB8  AWBIMEBBU  MSe{leNEHI@d  MSalsl  AUfle:GlesaMIE].
af)@3. AWl.af)al’ NVBHNITIHG HILITD  HBHINZAUMM  SIBAWINWIYHUB alei®o
a 10OV @QOOIHIOMDYLlo  LIAHHHANMSH M H®IFILINS]HUBHS
@YMZELIYo MalHa AN NLAIDI0NEUaHAIMISB®. AUdS] ©LINIEd 10BHHGlow)
G013 (@JQIBOD1H63aM O®91e1081586S Mo RGHEM O M EAIME]
MlAMIGM6Me MSTHOAAN  QAIDWBIMo  aloellaflglel. UM IW]
GENUIBRBHBOS AUGBRIMo SaHO1W]ELIES 2IFIOMIHMG aLLINIW] GNIIGWRBBOS
@JAIBOMo @ds1So  A01MMIBBBHWIM.  Hd®IW1eNs] AL M1elaldSHUd
MUMlSHO1ABBAM  CH@  AVBHNIBIHM® OO @1 H01H89203 ®Q)I0IHIND
O®91e1081H386S @013 IU6B13UI 2101510218660 SN auaTalmadem”
MVoMLOIM  MVAEHIB AVflB:AIBBM®.  BHYDAIMElHOMIYILINS]H8es alminc
caIRa’  MIBMOEBIM@AOW]  MINWORIPSFOD  @T@BAOIMo  AfBDEmIaIMo

921QIO®  @EROOAINVOT  Ho1glee” afly  MSalsl  aJM:aldleudWlesnemo.



93

O®IY1LNS]HBOS MM |0)6BBUT  TVoOBRH]IBHIMBB MSalSl H@IVIGE  Aldsaf
V1@ 1Hn6eMo. oMLl  CAUNIBLDTHUY  GHIOYHHUANIABIMN@ Mo
af)@3.Wl.af)an. AVABHHIB OHINZAIAM mﬂ%oe;u‘o’ MYANIHHIMo TVIQ MSalS]
MU H@180H6Mo.

@l af)o. a0oV: ANlGWIR]e] BOIOQIFODIN. HMIFIM MVABBSAOW]

MNITWe]g MSalSldhud  MUSHO1HNIMININDINI®  MoAlWIMo  MVoMNIMEIR
300y AHHUANIW] @oidomlasanlel af)anN@®I6M” QIO Olo. ailoilw
CUMIWIHSICRIQY” GRSV EHNME 1WAINIOHAT afla0l®o  MVAMINWI®RIW]
@RSYMMIM” MSalsl  TVfl&@1aneMo. CAUAMIW]  GMNIIBWRBHBOS  aleMo
SaHO 113 MM (1HsaM MOOMIGIMIaM” AVABHHIA@ afladman6emo.
@RV LIST® coaleIvlael Od®091e1081H:0d GMEIgaM aJoH6Mo
@RAINVIMTa (1860000 crg%mosﬂewg%e;uﬁm“ @JEGD MVo@HEMoO
o330 ]|SOMIM0 DMHMMANWODILIBE VOHMAIYW MVoWIMo @RYAINAHGIBEMo.
9ag).S1. cneILINIM3 GRIE( §2QMAMEOS H@IYIT MYOAKHIO@INJ CHHNNJo
D0 |dHN6Mo. OIS HBOS  BAUMBINEBBUT  TVoAGHIHHIM  TVABHIAB
QAMHOQSHNMo.  HaldD@DEAAILI) MINE:GHUd TVMSHAO1ABAN ML REL

MOl INEDIM” @RQ@IAUGB@M6Mo.  @RYUIAIBHHARNIMHS AIBRUIa(la] GaI®Mo



94

MVOMITWIGRNIWT M@0 AW ad@IYIG caalelidgloel alMlne GQIMo
a]®@#91 MURWTHHIMVABB MVoQNWIMAMBIGEMo.  @RoWANIIS]T 1M BNIMWS
aoIuadlal’  &S1Rld  OBHISOD®1BHHIMo  B6MEO0IWo  2IBRU1q {18600
MSalsl  aUfHA1e0H6Mo. 2J0g0®0¥1eng]  caramiwlges  Rlgo@el
§21Q@RI0300IW] 90D EJAUCOD®:O0  MIVAHHIMo  2JagOMIYILNG]
90l HIELI02N®MNIV] alBladd]H9HIMo CHUIMIWIHSICRIPBB MVAHHIAQ
Afla01®o  WIOOMVAWo  BRSYIMo  MSalSl TVfGGIENeMo. AllB1OELAV QDY)
®1012jSPIM HY1WIO® MYEIRSIM O@IFILNSIHBOS  (@JUREBBUIHS  al@la000
26MIA0  HYIWeMo. a®IFIeINaG] all@3EL avalalmo cmﬂoe;ca’l%n%@g 20)00)
enflefloel aly0INNGE8IS” ¢WIL1HHIM8 HYlwlel.

W af). OH. VUIAM: AlCWIR]a| CONINAISOMAN. QYMHILIEBRSIGIMIAN”

QAUY®IARAW] TVATY GaalLlGSloel HMIFIeNS]B:8o  TUNIaIMYSAKSIGIMIAN”
@RAI®RIW  ajaHEMo  BMAIZHEHIMNETGTHBHWIEN OO  aJoHIMO M’
DOWIGMAIRI@  (BAIBINNJo  QYIHBIOMAD@IEN”  QAUATY@. O®IF1 @3-
QIIAUTVIW] - TVIYPaOld:  GRILIBEIE3  AUMISB8 o JOMMB  al0layOOEBBOS
aDLINIW] BOME:SEMBBUY BRUIAMOIWT MIQHWIEM. oMI¥1n3 coaleIvleel

aJoHeMo @®SQMM® 1083 aDRI(@J300W DSE SO MSO®ID



95

HYIQOMINAUWONIT HDIFIBZ Qldsa] MVDRMIGHEMo.  aJOIQW AVINUDDT Hh-
a1 (MN2a021063331@3 BO6MESE3BUY @RAIBGNS HSO
M1BQa01EBAND]IMaldh0o DOMOABI®IEBUG TVIHIVY SHOMHHUBH @RSIVWO
QAP AT INODON®]O0 MBI (JAUBOM]BNIM  HFIQYIM  ®EOM]L|S:
QoIOG8 68O el 9UdeEnIgs1aflsiel.  d®IYILINE] MVYOBOMIS
M@ 2 leIBOMIO® ER3LMI Mmilefloel AlJRINN:HEBIS  CWILZTHNIM B llel.

@Wl. ABHHLI Ha00B: AVNIRHHS Hog]l 018a oS §21QJHI0A8S

20l4-001  CHO8  HSHGo  AVEMIRITVOaIMEBGo  (¢eBL®T)  MAG3
9al0@RMICJ0Wo  EMFAMMD@IMIWT  AVABBRERIY"  HaIQEMHAIN  BGBROD]
@ROIM T [lasm0. H@IYILNS1508  GRIE( §21QaD MUNIIMEBE6HS Aleilqaor

@RSINNIMESODT gaM” afl8dVAIW] @1GlafIgans. GBRMI®” HMIFILING]H®S1@3

SOOI (saoeﬂ@_ruc%(mmmgg NI IM6B138313 Ga0OqN@  AVDBHOY0
B3R |SOMEMHAIM  AIJAITVO  @YUDINIaOAIE . OMIYIGE Qo@D

af)MBEa0IYHMAF aflow)” WEM1OQSTDIM® IO BIWAIW] IRl ldEQeNd
aJ@#91 MUDVIEENMNZD®” ERD JANICAISHIDREM. af)MBEa0IYHAAZ" allowilom
WM SOMIWI  M@C I MIWAEBUWE  LlorLlonI®B]HHIMo

@@osﬂelo@da)g@s @ROQIGHIUEBRUT  TVoRGHIBHIMo  MVIWIES. VOMIBo  6NIIY;



96

@DV AUYTVISBSM®  VIOIBAMD  LdMIBo  OD®IFILNSTHBOS  OOBHWIG3
af) O 1C | BAN@IM”  AVAOIWHHORI%0. MIWALIALIMO  HONBAMIWI@ o llY
OVSIHHIMSBB  ERWIH000  GRINIG  DMONNHBMIBHS MBI IMo  all9
@RSYIAMAIBHS A1IBaH]H HOLITVMBIV aJD BT MBIHID AL M0 MSalS]
MUf1»HO1HHEMo.  BHAYHU  OHAVENF ROV 0221eaRs” AMBaldnd  Aflaldoem
®21QOa|SAND HILIMIAMVo DNBILNAISHAINDIMIB H®IFILINGICHNI GSA”
QMM  EIOAIAOIEHNI AVICAWWI aNIREIW] @EBBBHS BIWo AUIE1HHIM
H YO H6 alwooy @3 LS16T)J%6TT)(BQIO @RE™®I0191eW) OMBIBN6Mo.
OMI¥1LI0831HH08 oﬁ(o’lg{lmﬂ%cm@WQm@%m @Rq eIy’ @REMININIYS SOOI
HGUMRIWT MS{IENGSHIMIAUNINIW  MSalSIYEMBIG6Mo.  2j0g OMIYILNGS]
UMW @eNIAWIHG =1eld®el 6210600MAI00W] ©aH1W @JDIMIW]Hes
MOATSBSM@IM” BRG; B3VM] ©216QYMEINIGo. 2JAgO@ILILNS] GHHUAMIW]
eMIOAWIERIY” @RoUdRIWo  ERSPICIDHI06Mo  BIRYMDZELIYEBUD  HBHIFHNID
aLIW BN auoloaileuato MeIn1G3esaM@ 1MIG3 DlORNYISTRI LI
cnmmﬁ@n%o Ala0l®o  HO®IMOW]  @RSYMDIM”  AVoOWIMAYMBIG:EMo.
@TVocLISI®  cRaILIYloel  H®IYIRINS]H8UTH]OSQYSBAUBHS TVIMICN I

MVa0IWo M@IHHINY MVBHHNIB @QYINIB:6Mo.



97

Wl af)o. aI@Ad: AV &Gl 016a]0dS" e2IQaelmoonss 2014-eel

BHOB HSHBo QUM TN IMEBBGoO (6eRL®I) mN@3 aflengo GRE® Uy’
SH0191QOS al0lWeMMY”  ERVPEMOAMD R3O  BRAIMAIq{lasa.
mlelnfle)ss B (@3- MoMOIM OMIYI®3 MnERU3 aDPl(e)3m0w]
MSo[leNnssamlgl. 30600 el HHIFOWOBIMNS Ql§0aI100TuNIaIMeEBSE1oel qyl
DI [T ] FeNIa] ajoHeMo 219 Qo M1YN6 IEALIOOD oﬂ(o"lgdm"lsmﬁ
MSOM 169N 1Q1HB3H QMM @moggm)@”. GAUNMIWIWI@3
@RoWAIBHMMN @M EAIME] OMIYIRISNHUd QUG EYal EeoTe 6 HISHHIN]
@QIOIBITHANOM®]OQ GLINIB Wla|dd5en03" MSHalSeMo. H@IYIG P
GSW QIMIVM®BHS  (@JAUGADMo  GH0AUVDHBINBIEM H@IYILI08] B0
@lavawl  emEIgM®. MVOVMIaY  aleldHHq]SIOm®o  @PSITUNIM
MUDHOYEBFOS 300Jo 3HIVEMo QY10 TV IMEBSI@3 GRoefl Halgan  ayl
O®0¢1eNglB:03 MM aflallw ERYEEIWNJ(JUREBBUT BMAIFEOB:IMEIATBERE:WIEM.
O®IYILNSBHOB  aJaHeMo 2l QMBS LIBAMBIBBHQIEM  QI§0aI001HHU3
921QIN®.  ERYEOM HMIFILNG] GHHUAMIW] MVWA MSEIBHIM ULIl2JGa U3
GR@ION®IO0  EHIS®IOW  aqudlalla] 6IY @3] @Y MlYae @OaN

@RSINO1ABINDTNBS  (EYARIEM~ MSHABIN@. MWLM GRIMIG  BHITIWAV



98

M1Be3wly] alMlne el MSqjossmm@lmealinsl man” ESW QeNIWADHU3
(@JCBHIBo MSOMNOB9IMENBBBH@em. 1974-@3 ollmaoe @el Muniw1eneaq]s
¢5H080m1@8 700 @Gl aleMHWSHBIM @YUINIAGHADICOS BIMEON1Wo B3
QAUGHNOWT  &HSIPWIHWIM. DEJIUB  EHIMSI  @RSINOIMOEM]©I
O®o91eNg3H08 MIVAIEBHQo GRAUMOS @RYMLINERUE  MIGAUWIBBHWo
9alQ)” MIaO0MIaH GHOMHHUWE  AISBMOAIA1HWIEM.  H@IFIT  MVANMBIHE3
ME®INSIalo  BRD®  MSe{leNHNIM88  al0lEYAEBBIM™  TVAHHIV1H1]
BIN@DM1AMVENZIBHNSD) .

OMIFIejo  HOMajaMY0jo mceaq:l@j (. o¥len] Genimil  c=R06eM):

MO1HNIMBB  BRAUGHIVOOM IMEAIME] @R)YROMUILIG:SILjlo  @DIMILHSHS1e]o
62202l 921 H®IFILIS]HU VAL §.2IQYMOEN’ 1961-@3 ameloN@d alan
ME2ODIM™ CEROD]  HBHIMZAUIMINM  HIIMAIVD. MY VAN ADSAIN’
afeld  @eMlLosdHElejlo MSOMIVW  al0lerIWMQHS  BRSINLOIMOEM]©3
HOMBOMIM  HYIOI®  O®IPIEE  MIGAUWEEBBo  BR@IM™  HOOEMAIW
MRAONIOL!  Gald0IQY®HBREM. 021010 HSHO8Wo ALY HSHOBWVo
B@GalOL] HIMIM HF1IQHWLl. MWAEBRUY af)LINIBHR0 MIDWEGHAINMEL)0

OMIFIENSIHBOS  af)eIPAMAVAe] SGO@  TUDHOLEBUT  BGQUMOAANIEM’



99

MNENG3 MayBaHSBMN@. 21010 HSHUY (Ra]IVT (YU DENBIGHEMHATVO
el HSHUWEN 62600aNIMo  (@aH DNBIHEMHAMVo  BREMINSIajo QllwWw
HSHEIT  OOAY  Qo, GSOVRIG JDEN®  AVDHRLEE8e  S0-08 @GO3
O®91e108]H866N28:113 ¥eloleaVon MUV OY0Jo GAIIMERAT0
MayBaH12fl0l683M0.  O®IFIM  MIVAEBBBOS  LloPLIMo  MEIO@IBBIND® (0o
Mo  @EPAGODIBHAISBIMM®IMWo  ESW  — QEMIVMBHBHS — VHMAIW
DSHAISLIHUT  DENBICHHNZDENE. OIVVI@IV”  ©OEJIVEBQlaiNIeB®SHNo
AMWHoel  celnid  Wlaodgenaad”  almflat’  921Qls88  B0AAWIMABIYHUD
MRS aldlUyA]SEB3aM@®I6aM. 0udg1eerInImd 20889 low”
O®IY1LNG]HBOS  TVoOBHMOYROWT  MITW]S  AflaHWEBBUWE  al01BUIWa)
MSalsl UMMM,  HYDAUMEIOOMIFILNS]H8es almlne eIy’
MV@YBIWo MSq{leNesan afla@o AlMlRe GAIRIY @ROHALINVOT @MIdBA1H0]
al@lemmY” aflsemealo@an MIVadIGq(load  @PRElEJIWo  LIBYAIWILISAD
@O W 8MISIONaN §21QIN@IM” MSalS] MVfB:G1HBIN@IM”. BaHIq [NV
201N HHI®BHS olmlmo GQIRAV’ arueni@01g1Qes O PR BTG IOD]S
@RSINNIMOHITI 2 JDEHT MIERUDABMD@IM” DTBRIM2|DEMINSIajo @R

QIG@aHo 0101w D F161010) alnloo CAIRMYHOBLI00 A J@ O]



100

MU SBANTMIW] nlep) Ilel GAIRMY @REOHAWINVOI GenIdBAWIHM
2JADLINAISODDHQo  MHIRIMINTVo  BF10IH6]1  EMISTaLIGHNUM  MOLHIND
GERIMNIG HONTAHEMEOGIOM 2JdMEINAISOD®HWVe  OalQlgans. ales =Xelsglejo
Zeld  ceinid  B39a01TVAAIHOEWINM™  HadWELIDW  AlGCHNY 6AITINaNWA
¢NINABAWIDNM 6210BM0MIOIWT MR L[lAlE8IM®. ©aldg1glen@d eflcawglom
§210MA0MIVT MWAHHIMONH; 1T MTVAGREV™] @RYAIVD MM @QYUD
QAURHOAMIBGBOS  GOAIGMOYMIV] MNITNWHRIG HI0J0 WMBHIQY Al [PV
@RGLallaf” ®IBAIMIEBM®IM”.  aBQOJAWIdo ajaHeMo MSANIGBAN  MYlow”
CORIVI@  HOQ AUANIW]T  DSaldSOMMo  @RAIMAS  GAIMo A JDHH]
M0 E900 MR GAIRIV” TV@YBIWo MSaq[lelNEnde MM Waledenaglm”
MOOW]a). ®af).Sl.coaleivleel 210N ENINO ajoH6Mo .21QaN®’
@RAINIM I [laSM@IOMq gl waleeMad” VDAY  BRYELIJAIHBINDAIEM.
mlelnfle)ss 9seHI8] QoJ(SQDOUﬂ%J@cﬁ:OGngu af)MBGa0dYenag”  allowilongd
€al1000Q) al@la0@1EsM@IMIW] @aIEE” H(EJISHHM MUIANo MSa{lLIEBIM@IEM.,
Galonad” B0a0" GAIRI" GRYGIM RVMIT AUGOM] GIGBAMIMaloo Klelwleel
Mm¥low), ©af).Sl., DMIHNSHUI, RAILIO], Al3J0E10AV MUNIAIMEIBUY DS6EBR1W

ONVRHQNHSIT  ¢0el] 921QANAIBOS  VOMIBo 91 e}:s NI [ M@3BAN@ 0o



101

@R®IOAR BHIa{l BRO® AW.af)©d.63. MIBHS” BRMIBAIMo LIBJAISBM MBS
B8  GIVIANHAWVA HHTESINMAOW]  EaIBMM” SAWAIDLIal 6aIQ" eOealel]”
GJIRRIW] MSq {1£1069008 @IGBAIM] 2{1G1BE3HWIEM.

BRI U M1RIHHB1H63HEWI MLEWYHS @R 1CWINS
afladaielH633cWI 921Q.

aquenes” Holgl 016aods” 041 @oonss 2014-0e1 e»08 HSHgo
Q106M122MN0a IMEEBGo (6EEVMT) MA@ alGlWIMMWBINGHNIMOAID (@JEAWo
aTE @RoW 1 @la).

NIN@3 A IBlNANMY HHNFOD).

@6N300 Qldhal

113, 115, 120, 121, 123, 124, 125, 127, 129, 130, 132, 137, 138, 139, 141,
143, 144, 145 agan1 omid ce30®1&hud @U@ {l2).

GRBUNM 1hUd MNOIBO1H63HEWI MVRWYHS @RA0AOD1CWINS
aflBAILNHRHEWI 62IQ.

@aNBJ0 Qldzq | MIIENO3 BINMISLHIMHRIM (@JUWRo TVE BRoW1B:@]).

@6N2J0o Qldsal milellead sowmowl.

QaMIo QAldsa |




102

148, 151, 152, 154, 155, 156, 157, 159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164, 165,
166, 169, 170, 171 agam1 maud e33O 1HU3 @AI®G]afla).

DADT ®IHPOQAN QNIBHIV3 EGEBBNDGH:U3 @AIM@Tqla).

146. In section 5D of Chapter 1B proposed to be inserted in the

13

principal Act by clause 3, for the words “ employer in” substitute the

13 2

words “ employer of” , and for the word “ his” substitute the word

“ the”

1477. In section 5D of Chapter 1B proposed to be inserted in the
principal Act by clause 3, for the words “ in a” substitute the words “ of a
medium or'.

DA BRAIMAa{l2] ANEHIM GEBRNM1HUY MVE BP0 180 1).

ilel GRBRULM 1 Ud MIRIBHO1HE3HBWI aVEWHS @RIV 1CWINS
a B H833cWI 0aIQ.

cRBULM] 2l @JHIVAYBS AN Aldsa| MIEfOHF BINAIBNEMHAIM (@JUo
Ve @RoW 1@,

QaMIo Aldhal mileflead sowaowl.

MOLIdo Aldsa |




103

172, 173, 174, 176, 178, 180, 181, 183, 184, 185 agyam1 maud ¢eB0@® 1603
@RI G {1a).

GRBNMIHUY MIOIHO1H63HCWI QWD @AY ICWINS
aflBaIeld8H6WI 0aIQ.

M0 Qg MIIENH BINDIGHIMHRIM (@JUo TVE @oW 1 @].).

Moelo Qldal mileload owaow.

@REIo Aldzal

186, 189, 192, 193, 196, 198, 199, 201, 203, 204, 205, 207, 208, 210,
212, 213 agam1 mmiB 6e30®1H038 @RaI®G]qfla).

BRI U M1RIHHB1H63HEWI MLEWYHS @R 1CWINS
aflBaIelH8H6WI §aIQ.

@06mId0 Qldsq | MIIENHAZ BOVMILHEMORAM (@JURo TVE @0 1B:01).

@60 Qldsq | mileflond conmowl.

@RY0J0 Qldha |

214, 215, 216, 218, 219, 220 agam1 mmid ce30@ 1503 @RAI®Gafla).
DAY ®IHPIOQAD BBND] MVfB:@12).

214. In section 34(2) of the Principal Act proposed to be amended by



104

clause 6(1) for the word * sanitation” the words “ hygiene and
sanitation” shall be substituted.

D@1 MV 1B:014] GEBBOMT TVE BRoW1B:@]).

gg GRBUNM1IHH U3 M1RIBHO1H63HEWI MLEWYHNS @AM ICWINS
afladaielH633cWI 921Q.

¢RBULWM] §21Q@]HIVABS @RYOo Qldal MILNOA3 BINAILHEMHAIM (@JUQo
aTE @oW 1 @la).

¢REULM] §21QE]HIVABR @RYOIoAIBGa ] milefloa) om0,

o390 Qldsal

222-%0 mmid mmd ¢e31®] GRAIMG]a{la).

683W™M1 M%),

a3$90 Qlda | MIE10a3 BONMILHEMORM (@JUgo TVE BRI 1E:@1a).
a@3$90 Qldal milelload cowaowl.

B0M0 Qldhzalo afl01dhQo Gal@o

110-00 mm18 Mm@ B8O GRAIMEa 1.
683W™M1 M%),

BMIo ldhq]o allol®» Qo Gal@o NIEfloag BIWAISHMHOAN (@JUgo VR



105

(BTDOUﬂcG)(O’]_H.
630N00 Qldiq o af1015Qo Bal@o milefload owaow.

O®OYIelo  HOMaMI0je Qs QD] (W, axleny cenienil czoend): 2014-

OEl BHOB MHSHBo QIEMIR TN IMEBBGBo (eerL®1) Mm@ A l0VIBHEMHAIM
(@JCDWo BRAIMO]q (losaM.

@B Mo aflz=leldmye Ak Ayl (WY). ocnUw ealMlomAl):

(QJGLWHOD a lamIEBZAM.

20l4-001 EH08 HSHGo  QVEMIRITVN0a MBS0 (683V®])  MNG3
alOARIBHEMHRAM (@JEAWo TVE @01k,

NG VB Oaf)HdHEIPIM aldTVISH].

Ve HNAGEANQ0 6.45-m" aNd1610N).

ARk



