| @.enN. Xlll-eo0g mMoaave/XII-1
aI®1gaMI0 GHOB MTWAVE

o IQ®)6N2I0 MLEIASMo

MIWAAVEI MSalSIdhUd -TVo(@)a0o

(621068120 0ERUE B¥1Od)

2014 aavosnid 1, ooy

al®1xaMIo BHO8 MVATVBYHS al@®emzdo queoamMo 2014 awlavosmnid
0o 1-050 @™IO® @1engog eoallael 8.30-m" miaOmIMealg OWalyg] Oleod

@1 af)M. VSMHF BRELIGHO V]G MTVWATVEI 0SB ERYOoE] ).

(8.30 am@3 9.30 100 2126300 TVAWO)

2l0G@AJalaldo

af)o. Qil. @101, all. afl. Afl. YAV, af)o. Hd. FlAUIMHOM, af). 21003V
a)MAUBHS MT1OLI6Mo

QAMBO@1 ag)o. Qil. @I2LINING, CHO8 MWANTVERICWEBBBIVI@AN alfl. afl. afl.

AV, af)o. O, BlANHOM, QM CRING:TVEIWo af). 20UV 2f) NGBS

MIQ26Mo MoMIMWlaf” NIaONIMa ]S aapoJég’l M1HH@ 0aNOMAV” NSOV H QYo



2

A ICOMEOISBS @RYBOMY2ldhAIW] MVEIWEEBRU3 BRL|INAWo ag)sgczm%aﬂm)” OMMo

@19 2101 H633H QYo 921Q.
DalWRRIMIMOS aldIM@

MAQUY1 VL. all. 2a003, af)M. aHoMY31M, WYl RAILId (aJdhdUdo
of)OM1  @RoWEBAS al®IPaINIo  CHO8 MIVWATVERYNS ol@HeN2do  AVEINSM
HILIDOD 6 21QGAIMIBEAS aldmelleelr” mMImIBe3uo 921Q.

@ S1IMO@EJCAWo

MNIIB CGHIPCHN MV

2l. ®AWallgl VIHNAB: WM 0Jo MWANJo BAINMIBMNIEMOJo mces(g;l@ﬁ

Wl Od. afo. MIGM], ALOAVOIMODAD @RSaflg MINQYHUI DOBBANDAIW]
MNINWOAIS B  GHNHIST  (@al MIOQSATVAGIGE MIAM”  GHI®  QINEEIHWM
NINQSAMUD MVoLlo (MW adlend eaIgloq|semelend @RSITLNIMEMI®E 3@
2OMVURIWG0 @MV ERIMNE ©21Q)" GREMIHIHHIA TVANELAIBHIAD TVBHHIAQ
melaldslomo®S3aN’ ngoqm%@@@ocnﬂ al0@&a oM auolo1aileuato

MooMIaA W] s’ AN MVEIMSAa IS U3 IO [eTEY 21Q2a)

0.21QEMOAMMININ OIS MVABOUYT EHISIGWA] MIOLIG KM, M. 2I3EURION,



3

DO al. GOV, af). OH. WVUIBM af)aMT MI2ONIMO]S @RoWEEBUI Qud 50
@PAIVEL2]" 6MIFTIU” M@ 10 gene.

@REY™eaj  aflzleldaye  Qldg Ayl (WY). ocnw ealMlomel):

MNIQDHBOS MIGOIWMo allBalelesmmM@1mealms] Wm0} moe;g;l@%es)” B33
G»IS] (©LY BHOY M @3B 1HQ@aN Wl g CIenl@uDlen)
9QIE10a|SOMEloMOMSAAN”  @REMIaHMo  MSOMEMOHAMMINULealg 01-11-

2014-a" nig0moMeals I laddUEM®INl aN1eIBay” WORHGHH MTIH;1W
HOMIHG ERSITVOIMEMIBE Galdefly” Myelmslend em®IomIcd mlelnlle|ss

MIYAQILQITVNGWBHB0 MY(S1oBHIS®IQHS 293P MBEZUV6BRUBHEB0
@RMMY@AIW]  AVMIO  @REMIaHIMo  MSOMIQURTHWIaM. @REM JaU6M
aJEOIND] HHa0BHNISM] alB1EUIW] {1886

). @HIS16Al mielgaymd: 2014-@3 eeeirvdav”’ oJj@aoom 418

NINQHUWB @O0HHIMW @1 Wl . af)o. @M1 O @HIS1 @Gal GHHIY

620619J00IMMo B@W  GHIS]  Bal  OOBHMIOINWANO  MIVBH] DBV

o332z af)Mog8s Uyl milg 0cau1ag HaISleqasemas 2014 malmid



4

200 1-00 @I afen 3wy ol MORLIMEBBBo 016 03] ©.21QBQ
»waemeaa” aflad” aflaf 69050 MOIO1HGIEB®HQ0 OaIQIgME.  @RSaflg
NIOQBHUY @O0 20 €20ST @al  MUBa0OG14[IgHMEMDe  WMAOD],

a)POGHIV @], 2ARAAD], S8@  ECHIMVGYAY M  af)NIAUBHBNEId0
Aa0l®o MBIV IgeMNEMMASS MIDB OSHMVNMHS CWIVOMIGE  MSAM

DD |SOM@  BS1H 000D aldh@O®]  M@EAT  2I0M@  MoG@JaHeMo
921QlIgaNs. 8@ 2OMVAIWIFo MDAVoNINWa] EBHMU" EFIINA@ ©.21QOMBEAIIEJo

MBHHI@ ®QI0WIgIel. gan” ceigEBglenel 8@ CHISl Bal 2A@DIQYSS
aloenwleisss  aflslelo B8V6300d AVIWIejodlsf  ONHRI0IHWAM
@Y BHHUAINIGM ©AMAUMIBIHE30M @Y. aléMo 06)HNIN1WMIW]
al0®WO|SIMAIBOS HAIOOMNIOS GaNdM  alorlW1oel HNIOEMICE SAI0TH03
al@lWIYI@  AMMISEMBIOWAN  &H00J0  aldleUdWleneMo.  MIIB  BaOISM
OSAMHEBIS DAY GBI G210B815JHQIM @RYCHHlo AflaflWw MW IMEBBUY O16qJ0BS”
921Qflgo MSalSIHWFHHIM  AVBHHIB  OQYINIZHMIEL  MIENINWMBHUBHS”
AlewMW]  MIQBHUWED  OOLITVMIV MDHIOAMN”  HIMlal  af)OOGAV

O.Io@x;d@'] 2B {la] HL0MINMY” MISIM” AAYITVE BRAVDD®]T MTIHIGTBAND®”



5

MINQSNH S Qinnlclelo [Tl DMONEOMNG]’ anenEleelQ)” D dh
QAIBRU1a {1850MIeemMan” MuotdWlcanmel]olasa. JIY® &> Jonilng” emoglend
alNIsV” AVRWYHS CBU()Q‘;!O(UTG)U QIQYEMo.  BHIY® BRYEOIAIMAINIW]T  MITWeQ S’
aflag” Ofla {100 ©0IE1OQISODEIHUE  TVoITWaf  HRIYIHWSHHIT TVABHHIAQ
@QU0IHEMo.  MEIGRIM]D  MOWINEBUS  016aJod3" ©2IQAD  BH006EBU3
Oo®s101001 VNGO 1EHIHAMN BHIS®] ANWIYHS @RSITVNIMEDY I3 JAR®
01608308 om0V VBl  GHMY ERIINAE ©21Q" @REMIaHeMo
MSOMIMW AVBHNI@ @ QYINIBHITIMND af)ADEBHINBIHEMAMo D AVoMNINW ] ajf’
@onaldh  @REMIsHEMo MSOMIM  @RMAISIANINJAN  aloMdQIW] aqvawoe 15
31aI0rvmeeMaN116 £ 45 3lainue O MVOQIMHIUdo M @31V
af)IDOHINBIHEMMV0  AUSBMAISHEMo. NIIB OSA EREIVINVIEWAHM (@@ TMIW]
NI BIW) HHENZHQIAM @YEOIaleMO 103 QU Selol[aVa
0 JOOORHIMZAUBM@IM”  avl.avl.sl.all.  30LEBUW8  old1eUIWIENea|SeMo.
Wl il 0cawlode Wl allavl. ¢208221003WQ0 GaNIM3 MVoRIaHEMO
alRlGIWABIM® 1Mo BRYGOIAITMAM W] 2|AUBOS  HAIY] U3 afNawlecwo
0189IBW" 921" EHISHIWIBE a0IROISBIM @0 ANER1LIBIT” BQYIOIGHIODH®”

o@)@@@aom@ommcm” QAUNBONIBBANEDBIINSIalo Gd»hIY mcs(oomesmq;ocw’]



6

MNINWA[SAUMOS  MINE: BRADVMZHU o lB1CLIWIEBMHWo  MalQeMo.  6NIOA

@RYIA®ICHHMIT AADT U ODH.af)o.MITMIDBOD OO GBI ELZIANA@ 6.21QPID3

20100) LAHHIA Meloal®1as30. MLBHHNIOHM QAU HHIMIEM”
SHLPNNMI1WOals S8@ @OV  ModBHHISBMMOIM DI 1Qo
@RYE L AMOAQH 1o VIR MaldhHa ld®o HI6M1HBaN D). 201p0) BHAV’
OS99 3003 QA AD]1QUBNHSYBBAIB (@ JD]LB8S1LI0B:0. snalles
OWAMAIANIB1H630M @UQEEBU8  alTlEUIWISBEMINUE  @JIODZaHYD O]
HQHNOOMINMAN” HDS1W]B9ealSo0. 01SWA@ §21QIAd ENZIAIMVo M@)o

MBHIYBE  B@W  af)V.all.o®IM” MV  eHMI1O03 @REM JaHEM 4| ADE
aB@o{l2fleles8aM@.  21MESS1ORIEN0 DDAVoNITWaf” AUIBCME:U3 AIaMIgo

Eneplen MSals] Maom»1H03 36-2 Qldsa | @RMIV@] ]’

@REM JaHEM OO A0 2] BRYCHHA lo mmﬂgo afleleindav” @Rad” @Yadl & 0a farad

6IYGO0 WOOHAE DODION®IO0  @J®]H01aflS)el @RYlo®]1  MIEEIWM
meaoleer 7 (13) (1) (D) Qdhq 000 8@ 0o 01INAd 621" 15

BlaIrvEM18S1@3  CHISMIWIT  af)a.Haf).@RYA. TVABA[lASMD@IM” MSalS]
V3O 1886Mo. @Y GBI IeMANCWWOIW @RYBHOS MVa0IW1HBaNOIM”

'@)12N2 1IN0l af)B 100N af)MEAIGIB3 M MISIHENINZCAIIB:MN@INBS B3



7

BUIEDYANEM” MBHHIB MVflBA1LBINM@. MDA ERYIAGIEHIV” MSaNIgemsan”
O®S1W1as3am a8 aul.awl. amMI0d @uoqdom” QIYIMN@®IEM. @D
MNIaONIMOals M1EHA@  al@lcUodWla], ooglallead  @ERSINNIMODIG3
MIeOMIMO]g WMy  Oldq P@IH®  MM@HAN  AEYITNVEWI@  Mlamo
A JOOMIBNIGMo. ool @RYIa®m] CHMGHESIG3 7Rl MM  BOMOMIM’
CMQDIo HHISHBAM ARIINADTWIEN” U], Odh.af)o.MITMTHW TVoRHHUIABAND.
M  BOMO RMEBURBHN  aBOO0  BadO0Jo  FANaOQAIWV]BBBHWIEM.
MLoMNIAD B D] D]OHD alouimW1  @RYIA®m]  @RYGOIaleMo
DM ofIG1HBIN  AVIA0LIOYOMIGE  BRAIM™ MIV)HHIal0NIHWIT  MSals]
M f1&H01HH0MWo MM AflatH®o  AVRIMSaISIHUd MBI 2182 62100000
MUBHHNIB MVANELAIB:6Mo.

2. d@Walisl W1H93: (@D ]aldH DaleM®INNOHM HOBHNWABE M. AW

TUBYOS GOV 0TI SDCa U3 QIYIM aldSIEl.  @REEBOM MVEWHS GO0 JOCI)
QIYEMOAMMHMNEE1D3 62103 BR® al01eUdW]2|EUdaHo NI@EGA TVOWILS.

@RERIM™A0j  ofleleiBayo  Qldg Ayl (W). ocaw’ ealanlomel):

JaR® Afla®@o MVoITW]af” (@D ]aISHHEN@IAM1HM alEI®] &151W BRI

' &199” 901010016 99aUMB MSalS1dhud TUMdAafIgME. & iles” HaIGlatlEdnaum”



8

45 oo aleMeRM” BRYEBYANO AU D] o I0IMOAUM” O aldto Mafles

DM W 1H63HQN2IW]. HP1OD  af)@.AWl.af)al’. TVBHHIBIHG  BHOLICD
aNZleiday” wod,d  3-9-2008-@@  ajosq]goi sy MAHBLI01HNZ
@RS1ITMLNIMOMILINEM” MO MHNIVL0  alOTIHO). @RS1ITMLNIM ORI

@YEIaleMEEBUd SNV @®@laldto MAOS B@ aldHA0 TYaHISHIMIEM”
@WAHBM®. O 1@3 8@ @JOLNA]d  @REMIaUEMo  MSDAD HHWANDIEM’
QVGEDRIGDIeG) 2|l oM QflaHOIG3 MYaflo  @HISO®]
M1BG3UEBBUIBH MAYAIWIFI6M’ GHOS MVBBNHIo ailZlelndayo

@JOIBOD1HBAN D). M1YAQIJOINOH®  MVABHHIB  @RSIA0TSsHWIAl. N

cgoe;quomﬂ NINWRAS aflan” allaf, Mlwn m@%‘!@W agamlaeoessieo® 30

Gal®OS ONIC HOBSHE3HH Qo CH 1903 GeJomyaV’ SOOI [WhEE
96006HHISMIVI@ Dadolo 016083 MVABA[lE8HQo  HalQIgMms.  @EPIMIA
016aods"  2-00 ®IO®] CHISHIWIG VOB 1AM MDD EHMIG3
@YOHVAVWE1ejo OMHIBHIM  afl=]eiBervd  WalMeAcadd Eyalsesanlel. o™y

921QOIBOS Gal®l@d MSalsl MVI1GHO1ABGHHWAMNIGM wmaﬁ@c@” amualalMo.

v

af)aMIO@3 G IAMIOIOIIS aJH00 Yol af DIle) 62120



9

@RalH 13O0 |GOMIM  MVAHHIB BRYWaOlassanlel. a=]leIBIy” WOHQeS
eMaAlge8 MIQ1HUIMODILNEN” GREMIaHEMo MSABM®. MDD GHMIG3 B@
allwomejnss MI@IMCaHWAMRIV 51O 2@2el, MYNa IOV
V@ §AVMLOJRIWIEMN” @BREMIaHEMo MSABMMD.  BREMIoHEMo o 3O 1WIHH]
D0a0CHNISOIWIT DSHN®HAM 01Ca 03" MVABA{lEBAN@IEM. MDD AflaH o
MURIMSaIS1H U3 MBI 21@2] HalEQRNE @RIV AL

WMHO0Y0jo MIWANj BAMMIBANIEMOJo m&%@’] (W od. afo.

moem1): enofles DM W1HNNIS BRYBOIAIIMEEBAS NI MIGAUWIHBHHWIE .

OMOMo  af)OMW  aldB51VIMO|SAUTWo BRYEVIGe  aliMo  GaldE1HBHEWO

ADERHEWI  aallglel 26.03.2014-@8  mi0d  eerIvmMaVy’ o JOAsam

MIBE3UEEBUE  QAIMEa 03 @Y MIVAo  alOlafloelan”  aloed® a3

20101 900IaN MYal® QIRISHQEBIW]L. ABJMWHOM VoIl Qflar@o

D@1VEWIGE  AIM G2 ]0Ud a0 HONTaHM 01@(50«"5%0 MYS1loGdIsm]

aflwle Foreign Liquor ggleel afler alyairundud 036 21Qe 0388 aflwlwoe

AUM@®IMI@ M  Allai@o MIOAAUGe] alBlEUIWIHHNSHVIN” 2@DITVE



10

@N@B2IMeO0gH3HQMz0w].  28.03.2014-@3 mlon aldq{1903@o  ag)eMRWo

@E1e)0Wo  GAIAGOD]  afHORAV" A i’ NV  @1Q19)MTIB:BHQo
02.04.2014-0e1 @106 GWIVORIOM alBlnemMY” aflengo QIGTGHQ0 £.21Q.

Melneas8 312 miQeu3es” HMANEIMSa] GenlaHmMo oeaomﬂmc(go MU a)
MININWMHUBHD  ANCWOAIW] MIIG HHLITVMBAY” M@IBHIND O 1BAIMIH3H Qo

aBH200) HMNIaHMB 016203519 BRSINNIMOMIM@  af)H OOV BHonlaHeMA
al01GUOWIajEW0aHo  MIDAH] 418 IQBEHS 5003013 T IGBAOMOAFENIOAAN”

MUV EBHQo ©aIY.  affdh00) HNIaHM 0103310 @PSITLNIMANIGI

SHIMIMNY” a1B1EUIWM MSOAMIG IBWANDHOHIMNB6M” HHLITVABAV” 0 JDBSIM@IM”
@RMA®]  M@IHIDN@BIND®). @RANOHOD @ IMAIMo  A@YIMVERWHS &SIV
®1@2IMAIWIT@AN.

(@RSIVMO (@JEAVWIAIGETMEDIM” ERMAG] MGaHUa).)

(walmonad”  mMelnisia  @@eauwls)’ Q).  afl.  agaV

m%@ommnﬁ, avl. 310106000, DO gl. IRV, G@IAMV" aldenEl, agaM]



11

@@ NaldHUDH U] BNDIHHUB  @JTYIAUM MSOBHIWEWaHo  BRAIOABSS  alddg]

@RoEEBEBINSIa o MVBWITIMIAN” o JOODGaING:HQo  BRL|INAWANINDEUdaH

@101 2R Qo am%.)

U RL AH M A9 B3

(1) amansgos anNelsoQajo 3VABeIBY0J0

U1, OMIMM] HENIAOMIM: (JEMYSH MIa02l06EBSEIT3 BOAUUNY ATBMVHBHS

algld@’ o088  AGBMMGEeS Al MOEHIEsM@IME8  MIaUEM @3
QDO@(TU%Q@Q(G&TUU 06@)ow” @REMININIYHS @RWIBHI0e 2014 oavaifomid
22-oe1 20m0018J0S GH@MB TVABE9HIAR aldlNlMea]|gOm]. 8Danwaller M@3H6em
mesoieel 19, 3a  agaml Qg |HBMAVAL2OeM” QWY 08 JMlou)
@e®00191 108 snmo 22101080 DBINNHBOSQo 09" BRAINDY ABIMVHBHSWo
aflel Me@an alcwaIs@@. 19-00 Aldka| 030&:MME®INS AGALPEM
QWO @JOITVAWIQMBIR:HWo  RIAMWBAGRHUI  AGBANUINAOSWBB  BRAIVDY
BS80S aflel 100001 AIdRL1SSE:Qo 92lQlo.  BDaHW aflel a1dzvmaild
MM GEIU®HO8 OBHSBIN®IMo  EILRIOOM  JLAUM  ATBMMVHBOSWQo  Aflel

MYE@HIMAUIBWOVAISBAN® Mo MIaHEM @I aoocamm)ég%es)mcm“ 00 @JaVlowy’



12

@RE®IOIQIWHS  @RAIHINEBUY  aOMBNOQ SODIBTIABMN® 1Mo GOIMSIQYS:
@IBROMOAGHNIM CHMB VWAINIHAZIE3  MVANBGZe HAILJODAMNEDINSIajo BT

MVABQ AU GIMo ANSlaf MANIVYo 21Ba] &alQeMo.

ey 0@ (). 900 2106nEl): EREOIWY GIVAIM AOWHDD 6)2ILI0)BUd

QAIARVIASBM@ 1ML 2MOldHs DGBANDHS0 HIMIVAE allHlONVYS: DGBAMDHSB0

MUORM YNV HHHIFHNIMW MVoMNIM AINHANE” @ IBAIM 2| af)OTVMBa | @3
HEOWIFINY @O H191RI88 WUV 9]V HMIEGSIWY  BICWA

QIF1IWIEM” MIaHEM @I oﬂocﬁaUég%es)«SScm” 96@JMlow)” BREMINIG ABMOBHBHS
allel M@sMo  MSe{lLNEsIM®. A@BMHEes aflel Ve im0l  AIdeEU -y
MVYA02IQYEM]LIEM” TMVoMLNIMo  BRYAUUIYAA|SMMIVAL]" 2013-@3 348 emo

DBMBHRBHH  afllel MA@DeMo  afdoalgemIV®. ®mlmajoen 108 &1aiad

QAU AMANRHUWAN BB |SOMIW allel MW@HeMo alldaIelosan@IM” CH(@3

NAIMOHAY 2OMONNSIALBHWIEM. MENIQY0 MIa0MIMOa]S (JWIMNDIADIQYSS

WWRLYN B3NSOI TVWE YT alleinle@)emo aflMoleloslogian”  90q]

O@H1Y1gens.  aflel Mo@em Mo DSBMDIM” 6HM  VAIMIHAZIG3



13

NAMAIW VMABZo  HalLJEDIM®IM. a@INIHa3 allel ME@eM SOOI
M1eIm3@DM@IMo  €algad” MIVAQNIW] MITWe|S Hoal@aV0] HELITVABIY’
MWlo  MIBODHLNABMDIOM®DOOQo M@H1®  MIGAIBMOMICM@  ERMZ:AI

®1@BRIMo M2 16L 18,103 (@JWOIMD@H WIS’ aflengo DHNIQ Y0

oMW 1B88aM@®IEM.

(2) 9®991@ 90a | o IBLWNOLI (aJUEBRUD

W afo. 2l@BM: 2a0IERIWITW] CBUWIW WIAleM OMIFITE DOl

Moo @orlem  caalelle)ss  @PANBEL  O®IYIENEl®:8oS  B0600
&:SoMNIOMIMo 3@ ALIMIAMIH  QABaHo 2JBBBIVO®° MO SlaIavens;lelo
O®0¥1Ejo H®IFIM ©21QAN BIGOI AUYEM B0 B06EI FlAUTVHDD BRWIIMEOH M

DOl Moen1@d @eilo JIY® el ailmoel” ooy Ima:0lo
OBHIFANEMOAAN” QAJAUITVO  ©2IQIENE.  af)IMO@ MR AIYOITVOVMAVE] o
alBL®] MSaPEBIMMIT MoNIM WAINEA]” aflg AUGBODIW]TIBEB3 I

O=1A 621Q B0600 O®IYILNS]A630 14 slaimvomlngo 6®IFIT3 N@IHIMD

oe;@’lmoﬂa%eeﬂm @@ow’len%o GO IM” @RAQIAHE



14
@BaOMQMBIV]A1EBIN®IEM. EIINA 21YISSBOIGI@ QAUBHO 04 GallHH
DMO@MI6M” MVABHNIAB YO~ BlaITo H@IFIBE M@HTVD. MIWAGHITI QlyaITVN
921Q101830MWDCa 100l OMILILNG]H WO  dlMlno &ell MDBHEWI GAUDM

&HS1WGIHY” aleflto MDSHHEWI alRb®] afME” oJ@NAW] §alLI0IFlBRE:EWI

(V]

9.21QaMIE). G (3 nAleMONZ aleL®] a0 1O 13 Fs¥ele]

(V]

QUGN 11D 1H63H I . &elQes @RV IO @3 &0

AUBODDBIEs3MDYLlo H@®IYI FIMEBBEI03 B5:00] AUBHWo BHIMISIRBNA@

EIOBQNBISBHQo  HalQo. alBL®] MSOMafled MIan” avoauoomeom 102
CENIOIBHOSB 83910106910 101H8M D 1O M@ 1600 alrLb®]

1012 1MH |SODMD@IMIYBS  YABBHS  alPIRWHSAVIM® Mo MSals]

U NHH1H0H6Mo.

@2AHIVMAfo  ERYIRYDEMOJo  MVIMVITTRH0Jo  EMIBHHWV0 moeag;l@pﬁ

(W) od. . eRMal):  0®I1e)0a] alzb@] 50 emIe @ M@@IW]

o101 1O |SEDM@IME8 aldOHAag M1BC3UWe MDAINE elclaflslol. N

BB CHM alFLDTWIVD@IMIB HILINMDILIEBRSIT3 MIMBIMLOMIGE QUGN



15

20QEEBUIBHMMVALL]  MO@GA  TVoLOIM  YAIeBEAGIM”  (@JOIBO]H9I3
MOW]OBHQYBS. cmHogomlael 152 empassglonio  (@Jadommo
3O AHUANIW] MSHBAVENE". CH@ MOBNNEI88 Zeil MVouNIMEYIM’
M@BHIM  GH@Bo  NIDWITVONINEMAN  3HI0Yo @PAUND BROTWIafIgME.  6H@
0aMEadled o Ol  AMBIMLAMIVETa]  62R0ell MTSHIMDIT &0l
MVoBAMNEBMAMBAN  &HI0Jo  TVOTLOIM VAR aflngo  CHBAAD 1OV
@O aflgene.  @pgeosiwlcs 100 slamveom  eRoelwosm’ m@Samoy.
@O J0AD  ALOMVOIM  VAIMPAGIHAG  aleMo  BalelaiFlgodome” 100
BlaInveom  6®IFIEd MBBIN®INS88 20MOA" 2 J0ee]F0l5)d¢le0D.
DG N CH@B MWAOHIMG MIQo AUBOMIWIGE BI60I HMIFIegaso 200
3lalve ¢2Roefl MTIHIB TVIW]EB0.  MLIGHIMIH: afMs” M0EMEHANG” U100
(.af)o.afab’ap> )9l 30600 O®MIYILNSHBNB8 el GREHVMNEIBI
HNHIFBRBHWIEM” DB JOUY DaIYMD. GHMBADI@MIMoo LISIBEHIMBS B3:S1yFld:
LIG12J0@ QSAN0 ZSIOD af)Lld ®IFILING]HUWHB0 &ell ERAImOS GBRANDME"
QIS & HISHNID MLIWHs30. enalles oMW (@JUQEBROSBLI00
al01BUIWI1HABIN@IEM . CHMB 1AIMONF1NM oMW MIBE3UEBBVIVO] af’

cR0elwlad eMAISIFNEBIM (@JWIMVo BaMIceMam Wloel A 1NIGBNIVYSS



16

CRINOMI@ 21B2] HalQo. BT HIVEMAUWIEJe Q.alfl.af). VAOHNAIF @Y1

ag)o.2.ag)M. @RYA. 2. af)aV". alRL®] AWWEI ég” QEWEIWI[ET]

aveni'm1 auad

(1) @WIB2100@3 MVoaNWImo

Gl af)@. aHoy31Md:  @PZ5a]IS] MG EBRYE1IAUIMVT TVYOEBBHS
@RYEOINY-MVIGPa0)  @JREEBU  alBla0BEBMDIMB8  MVABHNIB  alRL®]HUI
MSa lenssam@Im” 8@ AVl ad: (WIM8a10M@) MVoallwdMo aGdeaq]gememo.

0e1y0@®] (W) 9o 2106nE]): @RFA|IS] CMINGHITE AUBHOVWdo EHED

921eJOm1WIgo  GaldRIQYHUD HIEMAN.  BRFa[IS]  ©af).gl.All.afl.-@" D
MIMIOD]S  AlBado 80 @Sl @l GRMAIG]Y. VAR BHBHSWYo
WIYYHNBHSVo ARYEVIW Y TVOAGHUIMNTN]HAF BIVRIW] 2MMT RMOBHI A lRL]
@)oo 550  WeMERIMIHUWBHS” MIMo @YWV  @al WMAVOIWo
M@BH10UBAN.  BHISOMO HOSMIBE HAVaHLOLNG] Ea0daY1gelead @JaIdemMo
DN 2|Na|SODMD@ Mo YYRLRLIGHIN  al0la0ClABMNIMVYBB  MSalS1HhUd
M13012{1S6N8"  BaldEIQYHUY  al@la0@lSBIMDIMIV] BQajdtlo MVNIGHBHO0
GMOAW®3 B30anTV0IWo eOLLINGNIoRl  MIHIMTE aldBHS” OB HOLIaD’

NIBAWHM HAYAH@ B3a01TVOIQe MTWATL[IFMNE.  MABOHS GILAIMo VVBTVWIW



17

Q1D @ 2 JeEINAHSMD@IMIB3 MDD (@JUIEBBUIHS aIBla0IORENBIB:0.

(2) aflolw AVBHNIAB Aldsq |HBPS @JAUBTMo aBGHhIafla lan®d

W] O.a)aV. avellal: @y31aaUl:H80Ww oglda;g@smgo 531 HBOSWYo

@RYBOIW §(@JUY6BBUD a1@1a001H603 aflaw MVABHHIA Qo HOS

B CHIallalasaN@IMINIU NI MSalsS] TV leolanemo.

@] (Uy). ©m 210enE]):  AVOMLOIMOT® @RYE1AMV] W80
&HgldhBo  QYeLMo  BPMBANSBIM Galdat»a00083001  aldla0olasaM@ M’
B Bea O IW @)é6m191 Sla@B  alL@®IYIG QM GaldIYHUB TVBHHIA
al01a0E1SB3aN@IEM. @AMV HUAOD 1MW M1H910l1,) anens”
WLOOMVAVOD  (AJEWIRM(@J320W]  AllMICWIVTHBAN@IM’ TVAHHIB@ MSalsS]
M1 HA1ABAN @6 @RYE1AMICHUNNNIW]T MIMLe]S  allaflw mﬁodoeaua
AUl MVBHNIB MSa{lLNABIN alBLDHUW aFGHhiallalasam@Im” mIMLe]S
DD 120@BOOVT @RYELIdallaf JEDYd TVIRMBISBIN®IEM .

(3) eowImcal @RAEIWR" @RGCE@JIa]” coowInad mIBdamoemo

Wl. ndl. awl. 3oVl 210216851 HOWIBICA @PRMEA Yl @GRGE@JIa)

coowlond  MIBEMEMODIM”  @JEDYd  @RMMAM] NM@BM@IM  MSals]



18

U NHH1H06Mo.

WM 0Jo MVWAQJo BAIMMIBANIEMAJo m&H@W (WY). adh. af)o.

206m1): 2102168351 HOWI@BEAI @PMEAE EIAUER” @REEJI ] ¢0oWIHad MBamoemo
@YQoR1HSMM®IM” @Al  aBOQGHNT  MSalSlHhUd o JBOD1HG1HHIM0ME
0108216003 aldMIBH1Y  oJ®IW L1005 GRGIMVIaHM BRYGHIM” ERAIYDRAIW
alS6BBU3  MVOMVLNIM  MVAHHIB  alomalgallaflglel oJ®l®  mloaomlead
@RSINNIMODTLIM” GOIAWIMEAIMNE MUNRI0  BHQFELNMEBD). af). o)V,
&1l O flati@o alAlVM]s] MIBWAIMOAFABAMM YO ERYAUWYNIW MSalS]
MU HB1SBIMN @6

(4) osalo eamoaleldmo aJEIQIAR Qldrql’ aBOQGHO @D

@W). G®OMII®3  EING)AHUN: 2101(@@JOWIMASS @ﬁ(& MOSaflo

GHoAfleldho af)@WQWo  GAIWo @Iy QAdsal aBOQIOD  TVoABHHUIBBIN@IM”
MSalsl Mufldholanemo.
@I2AHIVMAfe  BRYAY@EMOJo  TVIMVIBTHOJo  BMIBHHWVo moeaH@W

(). O, V). EROMVaN): @(@«ﬂ@&l MOS0 BHIO(EId0 QAUSHOWWIdho

2101@ (@JOWIMIAB8®IeM. MM awloe  MIelnll@d =ep ey’

HAUWBAOVMNToW)” EHIBa|EOHT @oJ(B@om’lnd@ce;om’](o%e@oe;@om‘i @RYCOIUN



19

moe;cgd@”lmga)sqgo MNINWO]S DCBLONNNMHASQYo  BWIWo Qﬂghdgg"l [29]e0)
GHoalleldo VoAU NYIRGHAIHBAN@TMINIUD §AIW MSals]
VS O1SBAN®I6M'.

(5) cal2eIa’ GAYaHMGHB1@ a11512J151016680N QAIIaO M BB UY

Wl. ail. ofl. qu=@3a0: MVOMOIMBOE®  GaldeflIy” IYaHMGHG1ejo

al@lovoeislelo aiflaflw cgoe)aqlgce;@elomﬂ al1S12f1S10168aM  AaOMEBBo
@®IOLl  TLOWMEBBBo MWWl GaldHIO®  VIOOMVAWo  GRIRlo @l
MAHNQIGRIY”  DM@ZSM@IMIV] DOV  MIMWeals MlwnsEglejo

a1g63381ejo @RYNAINDIMNIW CRARNMT AUBDDMMD M’ MSalST AV fd:aldneMo.

@RBELMEnje aflzleldmyo  Aldq A0 (1. ocawd” Malamlomel):  ololw

csceacrnpgcea@mﬁ allS192JSEBAM  ANaOMEBBUY  BHM @18aodsaM@alnn  aflaflw
Galoeflay” caaH@ BRI ]HSIT NYSHHUIBIMDODHIMNE" Ha IIDRMEBBUBHS”
QISOCWHO NJRU1IQZNBIB:Mo6NS. NIaONIMOa S 0a0CHNISOIQYNS
M1de30Om1OHa  @RSINVOIMOMI@  GaleflaY”  GIYaHM  aldlrvoesglejo
COOAW@Ix1ejo  TYSHHIABAN  QIaOMEBBUT  HILIMIAMe  &SIOH®  AWIEIYIA
9 21QEMOAIM” af)Llo mceagdoe;uaoes?.o MVABABLIG MDIHB:Qo MITWHA ]S Qlcﬁaqdo%(fa

@@IMOAUUIMIW  MSalSldud MUIBHA1OBHQo  OalQIgans. aflaf’ HAVEGSO]



20

21ABMIMIWe ailaflw Qldhq ] GRWINNBUE BRoWEBBBAIVYSS Ho0lg] EWIWo
¢al@aN” D@10  aleEIV®]  AflelYI@BODAME.  QlaOMEEBUE  AWIEIAY”
921QMN@MIMNS  HILIMIAMVo  BFIAUISBM@IM”  MINWee|s MIVAEBSE13
CRBIM] HBHIMNZAUBAN HIQJo TVABHIBINMZ al@lemmE]eoeam:.

(6) avMI'eHIS®MIB9” qNLlo @ad QIR H6 @3

@l ol 31a1HM:  HB@BMINA8S] ®IEJHH” VM CRHIS®]  OhSlSo

MM SSBM@DIM” Odh.af).adl. @@oaoeéocofl MINWRAS  DalCINIBMINOW]
H1SHBM (T\lDQI(Z)TZ)ﬂG)(T?@) 302]80U0 @RMAURTABMDDIM” MSals] TVI1H01H06Mo.

201020l Qldin A (W1 ol om  G2RAVAD): I [WIOR

ABDEIVOMIN  MUORI  @RYAINIASIH@MOABS  AUdB0UEEBRUT  TVaOI®o
@GAIAHH MBI Bl AlgM@B:IM@IM” MSaIS] TV1GE1SBIN@IM.

(7) o309 aflallafla] MVoBAl0

Wl. M. O, ANRWB: MIBIJoo MIGWIRMAMLLIOM ORI 30Q0320B39

Doladt’ alwlwo apsloel mMmLNl:H® aflWlafla] TVoBAL GG OAYAHULO3
@@yom%ea‘ég@oaoes)om” @REMIaH]a [1680M®1M00 - BHQ0NSHO8  MIWACM1OH]

OMI@3 HBHIMNZAUGBAN@ AU INIW MSalS] MVF1HG1HNeMo.

@R Mo  aflz=leldmye  Qldn]a@] (W) ocnw ealMlomel):



21

MBI JOAOD QIBWo GaldLflY” EOANAHM aldlWlw1eel ald0snsal’ 30Q@3a030
oWla’  alwWlwo crg@%)el MOLIO m@qp}gg@ nel:How  aflwWlafls)
MVoBAIOMIM  GHIV”  =1MNAE 6219} Qo crgcfa @mIol aasloomlsel
@REMMAUIMN]HBIW  ENZEAINO BROMY” 2l 012003163 AUPSHWo  H.2IQIgeMs.
JaR® CHAV DGR 00@o  EYITRIM™ OOBHRI0IWIgME.  &QaNs1H%e8
MO2EDIMAMI@  HBGHINFAUBM@IMIAUNIA®  MIVA  MSalSld8ndw]
WAIMBOANBO” QEANIFBAIIBAN@IEM.

(8) alom VOO aJM: (@01 HO1LHEI

W1 Od. af)M. af). AIIBG: TMVoMVNIMHDOD aDWB HAVEHMBOI «g%ﬂ;@@el

cmuaongl@om) aloM VWO o JN:(HATHBIABAN@TMINIUD Y AW MSals]

M 15:01H06Mo.

afl3o8 000 Qld|a@ (W) ofl. o mayéoay“): el &g
021038000  WWlalddWOS  @RSINNIMOmILeM” MIelnflei8s  @RELIVM
MaWEBS1G3  %00JAIRIO® @Yo (laTVEBE1ed 10go  AUBOM1WISSI® .
@YODITVOVOE®IT M0Q0 AUBODIVMIEIHS TVBHHIAIM” WIH@IWANW BRWd:
MNINBLIDWo  OENBIHOM o ldSleLlan  alyITLeY”  allcwnIW] WMWY

MO VAW  @1BHEBIY AO® AISS1WIY AeOWEs  FlalnueEBS1©3



22

0101 5)00NZ83 Do lo® o300V Qldiq load M1BG3wo0
@00 1HAl2lOINE”  AVBHNIB  2EMOA  aJoeqlg0llaflgens. JIR®
OOMO0)a)»000  @dafleoel 9.30 @  esalseamoe  4.45  QI®0eIMS:
Q®IQIGE  HOTV VAo  (@AT®H1afIgeNs" JIR® MaeLISM 13
a OIS UdB1sW1e|ss DSEAUBHBo ® 2 |BHUEM HSEAISW)o
@Ra Q)00 1MIHEMIMNBB 300 UBRLWIMANAIS®INAZ BRSINLNIMEMIT MHHI Yo
AN al01CWIWIERGHQo  MSEAIsHUd 10 21MIQ0Wo D alBHHUM MSCOISB
@Bl a3 aeogaeo 40 almlgowe  eaisslwog 95 almIgowo
AN (@D 13H019)0d06ME"  TVAHHIB  2TMEON0SHWIgeNs" JaY® BIOWIcleln
@J»000 oafloel 9 meml Mm@ ©eal:eIMee 4.45 AIPEWIEM” GIaY" MVOWo
(21D 0121018880 OY . JIR® QIIWIESIIO O [lenlen) alRI®1H68I000
LIS 2{IS1LI0E M0N0 OMIB3 MHMTOWIT MIQo AUGBODEGHWINIME1B a0WA
OMVAHMBO] @ELYVM MV IEjo @ELYIA D OIGWEZE [T
&00QJNZIB:HAN @M I3 JaY® MY GO TOLIE B0Q0 AUBEOMNEHIE].

(9) 21m noN@d eaRAHHAd MeN220 2215 MIBEMIMAMIM” BOEMIMAM]

GAWI. af)M. VOEIL: ©aldMBB:aMo AN V10T GAaUOHI @NRIo LIS

M132206M @D IMINIUD YN B6MIMAMI M@BEIMD 108383 MSalsl



23

U NHH1H06Mo.

aldDNQINDD) O_Io93gd@’] (W1. all. od. MENIaolo  HEO):

§aloaBa:mMo alMT aVloN@ GARAHOAE ENRI0cLlg MBI (@JAIBADMOHIM”
493 e1dsto @GaI@OS BOIMIMO®MIQo MVIGEG]HIMOMIQo  MGIBTWIGME”
OSeME@  MSalSlhUd o8O 1hals).  @RYBJe eISly] HSME@ MUlouilud esmsad
@R 1MIDI 0lesenz@ @m%@mseﬂep arengo aMlo1Ud OSMBA
LIFlEBHWINMMRIV®. OB 59  w®IMo  ERWIGHMIOHNEM” 105
9219101680 OSN3 Lol [WHE @RoN1GHI0OM M’ WLNITVAWo
M3 les8M®I®  26BLMVOGOS  BIVWADMIMe  aflg  dvosallaflgemns.

DBNI0J0  al0lewdWla]  &HQENIBAGO®ID0  MSalsl  AVfHHO1SBMN®IeM”.

@REMINSIa o aSeN2A@ SHo1G1QYOS @0 1000 e1clasam@1aoo
OHSISM1B32NI6Mo ©SOd @) 0oR1As3aM® 10008363 MSalS1dhyud
DO DHOHNIBBANIEM .

(10) e®950 1881 Ha10910NIHOD BRYGOIWY (@ JUREBBUD

@l 2.  WIHOM: C™MISe 851 9aldFlnalom  ©2I100TBEMIS

OIMARINDYLlo  DENBOBHAN  @RYGOIWJ(@JUYBBUY  DSQAN® Mo BRAINSHE

BRMWIHD® QM@ HSOM MSQYMN® 1Mo 2e10flcal Aldsqe {19603 GRWINOWIeISs



24

@JIY® auoelo ModHlaf"  GOIAY GH@AIBH] Alld:MUlq {lesaM@IMININIRIW
MSalS1dhud aUfldhalanemo.

z2ei0flgal  Qldig Q)] (W)  all. o=m.  GRIMaL): GC®IF|8s]

Dalovinalcom )’ 2Q muelsngl@ed Mo 21010 EMIS’  OH:INZAIAN”
DMNABMDYLIRBB  DLNMIHOMe @SQIN@IM WHMANIW  MSalSldhud
M ASHO1EBMM@IM”  MITWHA]S  (DINIIROVOD  HAVEFO1NIBHRB0 OQIMY
moe;cgdcgeéowmcaoe@o Z1eld af)edIcImM3nndo” afellmIWAdasse aellmle:oem
MRE@M G &AM MIBEZU00 MMBH1WIFME”. ERANSHO GRMUWIR®
DM@ HSOM ASQWMMDIM” R1LPDHBHA @JEDJ& TV @oﬁoe;m%meaom”
OOMOAIWIZME. LOLI0  BHEQYQOOD  TVoNIMWa) OQIMY @RWI13H0013:@89S”
aadeq] MsOm]1 BRI mmammﬂad" @JaY® auoelo MVoRGHIABIN@TMO

QUYMW MSalSlhud MVf1hA1ABMMIEM.

GRQUQ OB BHSEIdAYHUI

0030M0I0q S0 HANIVO@D  MMo  GRAAVA1LI8R  BHSLINTYEUY

EDUOQ|OTD O,



25

algo 300 @RMMVE15I88 @JaRIAUM

aldHla M1 MTE@eMajo M1AIDMAOJo

MoMNIMOD® 01608 ©21Qealg  aldHle|M] MY@emOm 1o

M1ALEEMOmIMe MVABHHI@ MVIB:014IS88 MSalSlehud MoNINWlal” &aHlQo

YUAVoOBHUMOJo @R 2JS1QYo BANHMOTW0 O_lcﬁaq‘;l@f] @201 MSO].

M1OAMIBANIN HI0\ o

_VMld” %2191 0169935 021REIHICYSS @INY|0QWAD
67)]1%6303 11NN M VO SN GHN MO A (@JEAWAQJo BRMINA°LIFEBB B0

(1) 2014-0e1 av3qi&e10woel Mwamsud (gamoe eedw®1) Mm@

afl3§o850MV  Qld D] (1. ofl. 0. @I 0am): Tuemiey’ @00g]

01GaPds" ©21Q)B00088 2014-0e1 aLAdQ®:EIel MlaEsuwd  (gamoo
6_RLMI) MNB3 AlRlNEMMWHBHFHNMHRM (@JEOAWo @RAUDT]a (lasam.

QAONVIMINLMAOJe  @OARI0J0  af)DOKHIMYo moe;%l@ﬁ (W) .

eNINEN)): (@AW DM a aIEBRMD.

afl3508400V moeagd@’l (). all. 6. @Ml 0Mm)): GHOsSOMIEAI



26

MVBQYHLIUWILIRHUBHN H1F1RI88 DN MILININE0 o JRIBGIHAM A lGI dMAIMo

B ICBR HUINBNEs )0 V1o RMMINIBIUd0 M @IHEMEAOAM . 221.avl.

M13e30OM1HAZ ERSINOIMOWIT  MHDAVoNINW]af aloMo MSADAN@IMIW]
0f)d. @RYA. MmOWAal GACMIM LATMIHW DMDAIBLIELIAV  BHVMITVIGI
MNEWIN]HE3HHQEN2IW1. JIR® ML 1®M1QHS W01aldBUD (@JHI0o D BRELYYM

ABato @3 Q.M. QOSWo  QeMIEAULIFIWOHSVo  AIMBEMLEBBUIHS
aflcwnow] @BRBaO® eMslw BN ICBRH U @RHNIBA 1
MVIWoBOEMIAUMRIWo M@HMDIMEAUME]  TVBQYBHEIOUOILIHBOS @@oegoe@mp

MINLeals Mlamsgleje 8@ 210008 ©UAIGODIM®IMEAIMEIWIEM” MM
M@ OBHNFAUMIIBB®.  ERHHIBATB TVIWoRAEMINUBIN0 MBIB:IMD M 10

20mB3eMLeEBRUd Q..U DladalosdhQo  Afl3LO8LIV  Qldq @D
9210300MIV 8@ aflzuw Malmlo® MIlEN3 AYNINO 6.21Qd:Qo TVIWoBOEM
CHICBBHUWBBH BRI TVAQYMHLIVILIHBHS @RS 1Mo @0%51@0
MVABQYHLIUWIRINHU  aJodalgallasan  aflaflw MleaEswdase  Alcwadwl

DO@CD  (@JQIBO]BHID @)@1®goeamgggmmm mlmianwm  M1eImIGOD) & Qo



27

921QIgMs.  MVIWOoBAEM GBHICBZBHUIHH @BOANIBATH: HI0YEBBUISE MI@RIEM

MVIWoRMEMo M@HIND af)aM@IMIT AVABQHLIU0IL) MVBHHI@ MWNEERS1®3

mlan” 6aIols’ (@JAIBOM1EHIM DD MWAo ERMAMT M@S:aNIE].

@ af). @J31al &m03: I move that- “This House resolves to disapprove

the University Laws (Third Amendment) Ordinance,2014 (Ordinance No. 18

of 2014)”. a1 AIMo EHICBRHUBHS” BRONIBATH: MV IWoROEMINGIYDO

M@HMOAMD® @.21.aVl.Qes MIAG3UWo  MI(@:AI6M. BN ICBRHUIDD
MVIWOoRAEMINIMIW0 MM TWIRJMBIHINJAN  3OAINIald (@)@ JICLID®EIBRUI

MoNIAWla| VAW al0Mo  MSOMIOD B06506mal af)an @BRYUIWo

MSq {leNEsM®” GRYUIIVIALL  2IM® AflBJIRLOAV BoWOAMAB0]af" al0lB9Id

MeWINTEN]S HMTaUMHUWE  aflel MININLMGHEBIFESIWIM” BROHIG

6306506mMall af)aM ERYUIWo BRAUMTa{l2{ISB8®. RO EIEZEMANV” A I3l
MBH1VISBS  @HICBRHUWB  alei@o QA alEdRWAIVIGIOGS  Afl3}830TV
QOWHAD QIJAINVIWAID) SHO1H3aN ocsmga"e)agoeae)g @19 |SODHOVWAN®IEM”

MY I3l M@B:MDILJOS MVBHNIB LIHHUYAISIN@. aVlelenIay” MlvIw]ends,



28

al1Ud QEOQOILYR aDeleJel dalMo ®S6eR1W @RUWI1H 20631303
ocsma”s)agoe;@oe@” MDD MHD AVoANWIMo BHICBBRHBNS (JAUGTMHMHDOD
MMV  MIWISBMN@IM™  aJOsn aflzyoc0aV  CORILIYSS @ dhBa]Q
$H006MAOIAd:o.  QNlBLIRLOAV  QoUOHDID @RMEILIHIMIY  (@JAIM D HUB
@RAINVIMTa [lesam@1aoo ®0019" @RSITLOIMODI@  BI@o MIVWAMEBBUI
MS@DM® Mo TVBHHI@  DQYINIHHEMo.  BHIFIBHNIS MVAQHLIDUILIY DAL
ol odml:ud  B1322IMI8IWT MSOWMIAUGAN VA0 @RAITVIM o {lasam@Im”

@RS1IVANO MSals]l TV do1e06Mo.

Uy. afl. 1laIB:ES] : MIEIBO6M (JECAWHB o lADIEBRAN. CHOSOD1OEI

2M® afl3}B40aV Moo ANANEEEREAS GRAILIWIVT MI01W]R]EB®:WIEM. MM

Q0@ MILINI@AEBIN  ERYIADIQe OHHFHIOYTVOM Qo  MOIMISBMN G 1MVSS

MSalsl M1 01H96Mo. MVBQYHLIDUDILIRHUIABS” VW0 ROMIWIHI00

M@SBMDIEIOS 2aN®  AflI30RJ0MV GAILIOW & a|ASa|OBNIBN]T MIQIMIEM’

MVABHNIB  LISHUIATISAND. oWAMM mMelnnonss @rAsTY” & qvmay”
CHICBRMHOBWo  af)eIMTWOoW)” CMHICBRMHHBWo MVIWoROAM  @RWI1HIM0

GMSId G@JoN0a0lo{lesanam MVAHHIA  MYOMIM”  &hSEHANGRLAIW]



29

enflefload alolwlwladmlan’ ag)e@mMIolow” CHICBRHOSB

B9101050 110 1HBH M. MUBQIMHLINUIIL!I  HHQIATV  2ldMBAVLIGNIBOS

CYIN Qo MIVAMATMIQo MVoMINWlaf” AIABANNINEEBBEIM  AVoMNIM I

MoRIMAWITTHBIM D $0ella9g” Qenleaglglolcd «Jo»l® ooy’

210MaveId MAIMIVG1ADEUaHO @JaR®  UNJaIMo aflainaesgledmianoe

s¥leommlanigiel.  afldjosyoacu coalelw1od OMM® MIRININO0 o JeI3EIHAN

CHOSOMIM  HIOLEEBUE  WILNIBMNOYEMNIIWEOMINS  al0la|GUdato  NI@ER

@RHNIBAH  TVIWoROM6Mo  BRMAISTHNIN. oIVMQY; MIBWIEHH]" @SBRIV

2MIWlal®y TMollIMEEBUd aBARISODHQo  BRONIBATE" HDamdaJ1allod

@RW 2 ld-0fI310dmA]l @D INW]HO8 2UBNQSODHWQo  HalQeMo.  BIHIW

Da|®@ WU @PE1WIR  AIY]l eIFICHNME  BRABAODMA]S aliMo  GH@3
MBBHIBTIGIMIAM” QIEBRIHWFHNIM 2 I00RW|SAIB Q..M. M@S:MM (YIAF
PISlanIMIWT 6306506mal @RMAIGIHBRMD )M AIB1AEBAN® al@laOdAV MM .

aflz1o8L00V CORILIOW BRAIGOF]SBMM milefloal AJOINNGOS  of)D1@HB3D.

CHOB  MVABQMHRINUILI G@)o AN al0BAVRIHO NIMBAWICHNY" BRINOMIE®I



30

@RWIEHHEB3HWo BRYGAEBHWQo §a1Q MoRAAHIM” DOMENIIEHBIVWAINO

@ROMY" §21QQ0Mo B@JO OOAIM 2I0MBAVLIBHS  MVoAMHEMo MB3HIMo MSalS]
MU H@1H0H6Mo. TMUOMLOIM@M” BRS)ndSIVW ald® Mil.afal. oSWIMlow”

CHIGBRHU MIeIMIBEMINT @RYQININIW MSalSIQYAMNBIHEMo.  Bh(@3 o0y~

MLICHM]H AADILIWo BHO8 QM1GAFIGIHN” NEAIaHEMEEBBUIGHIW] @RAVNIR 4

AN GMHISl @Bal aldPISH D G1HBHWIEM. MIYAMOR0W]  NINWeA S
ocsmg”ongoe;gg@s @1RYQIUD oS @R 1HHA1HNMHAAM o1]Yell¢gMa
DU |SOM O LNINZBS OOMOQI” DO 1W1BHBMDYELlo af) @’
CHICBR HS10el @RRL {0 Idh-BRMEL o ld: M1IAMEIBUY
@RS1N01 4 1G1HBHWIEM. AN afl3508400V Q0O AflaldH0n0W

DOQEBBBMNBIHHIM  ald}0alM®  a0BVHAQ]  HolaH®@  Oleajodslee
W0laldBUHUE MSa0H9Ia MSalSl MUfldElEeMo. @I@BAUMaj0o =].afl. 0O
GIYIASTY” AVSIOLI DalMBB:SlHBOS GaOITYANG @RSITLOIM AV DH0468BUT
o330SV H Qo BaOIAN® QAPAWM MSEDAN G101A01HU3OHBH®IO0 MSals]
V1 O18633HQo GAlsMo.

GWI. &dh. Sl. =eflod: alciRla| COAINAISOMN.  BICZIaMAIY”




31

CHICBRHUI  BIRYVoRIABANDIMIGM”  GHO8  AVAQGHLINUILI MWD I®3
GBI HHIMNZAUMIATILBAND. CHOSAMIOLI AN CaILIGSG3MIAMIW] Ham”
MABHNIB  BHICBBRHUT  HMOAOMFOD  MVIWoROEMIAUMIN  GdhICBLR D UB
@YOoRlEBHWo  EIMILIBE  Gald0IWHUWE  AMIVIILNGH]I@®IMEWaHe  AQ”
CHICBBHSBICRIY”  Qlfdalla(lassH@miem”  oaleesloidmm@.  .el.avl.
#1aldBUD (@JHI0o 630BSIEMAMV CHICBRHNS HhOENBOMIWMIG3 AN MVABHNIO
BHICBBHBo al®IOMIMN” af) QAW GHICBBHBo DUBN|FAMN.  CHOBSOM13
VABHIA BN ICBRHS1®3 OAV@3an’ anlmoadalowy” @@)0%0@3@
@RYoRlABMEMIFZS]T  2aM@  Afl3J0B10AV QoO® BRMIGOIW §HOAIW
@MDY DSHNoBHOTABAN  BRAINVOWYMRIGH:HQo  AfIB10BJ0AV  DoWHTD
(@JoE3UT1E:-M0RBIWE: MIDLIM®Io DEIODMIGHWO §alQo. 606506MAY”
al130/166900] B0lalo MVABIWEBRUY MSEAN BHIGCBR MBI

QEMISAMISIE! af)IMDOBINZ@OAN AflB10ELIV GRARIAIYIGE aldefla)Gald@am

aVIQBIW1H, auael®oalTun M enfl@3 MNYORAIHMMNEDISE:S]
LIV DV IB:HWIEM . WloWw” QemMIGAIFIN:0d WENaHo  DENBIWEQUd
afl3{o.yoav M1elanoo DW@BHAANIEM’ 1060 IBINOH@Es1L)o

M1elnNOO®MHAajgelo Al AflBJORPMVEMINNG  HhaalS  BH(O36BR80W]



32

MOQHWINEMAN  AfldaBUMo  GaldBjo  GHISIYHS  BIV@DMINVME0W].
al®1OMIaMIo  ale@IQIONVO  alBL®]1 &HIelom @.2l.avl o Joom10H91Ww
003QeoaIWIfal MIBEZUEBEMMVGEIa] MIRIOO® 84 AVAQYBHLINUILIH:UIHE”
SR a@dam 441 eHIEBRHUW  MI@@6M°  TVIWoROSM  @RAIMHIU0
cemsW@’Ig@g@". Q. 221.avl. al@lalo0o  OHIMNZAUMEMINUE  AIMIOAAT
o) VAW’ BHICBRHSI3 Melnlees 25 goad 30 aleo aldato GIVOIM
alQlalOAB8  @RELIIAIGAHO  AVICHD]H  CRIVIDHUY  BMSIMHAIM
MalBaHQ]@MIAN” SY1010EH6Mo. MIYOS HS1HUBES” MISIBOMHAN 10166003
@RAINVENNIBHBS:  af)aD  LISHHICOMISESIWIAN”  TVPUDHX  BHIGBZHUI
@RYQoClajo®&rlejlo AN  YIMMILINNE.  PVWAOMIMW  HYlavmislel.
@PRSINOIM  MVDBHOYEBRSILINOD af)e NIVl EHICBRHSIM  aloMOmIMm”
Gal@ONEUWaHo  aBOD:1RJo BHIVMAINDIMT MSPOlaf BHIY MIQOWIGaIIBAM
B30I IHUWIEN BHIY anTaV” QEAIMo HHHIFEHNME @RAINO M1RIMN1TIABA.
HOD@OMMWIWVIDNAH530  HAV@aD aOlMIABAVIow GROWRNT ()OI 1H6HID
Galdd:M  TVIWoBOEM  GHIGBBHBOSWo  TAI®].  VWAIIMBOAAY BIE5eMATY”
CHICBRNHF1M3 BRYO0oL1HBAN a1 W czoe;o;%ceaua aB® Q1MW WIA1H8H0MD®”

MooenITWlaf  enflefll@d  alyaicun ealgislel. af) @’ walendenag’



33

CHICBRHBI03 HAVGIa0 aOIMIBAVIow” csceaog%oeaua @RYQoR1HBANEMINS Q6N
@®OOMILI88  @PRELYIAIM-QANBLAMAl  AVoCLIERUE  DMBIN|HQo  GHIMIaVIeel
TLAOWIMIMNATBHO  DBGBHQo  O2lYo. B26306MAMY° GNHICBEHUJ
QBN EISE:S] BHOSOM 16)LI VAHHIA B ICBR NHSF1eo OAV@3an
anlmomavlowy” cgoeao;%ceaua @seEBmMEloIm@o. Qemlealglgle  @.22l.avlQoe
@RoW1Hh0ls] AIDIVIGE MI@ECD BICZIANAMNY CHICBRHS1M Al303MO1H%Hes
@JCQIW]o [1OBHEWI anlV” QIIEERGHEWI &mcg&mggg@mm” a 0B 180
@RANeOS  @RYDoRlHBaM o JIW (80930(&%0936)@(“):'(31 D  miellad  WIH®I®
ayem®Qalel. @.221.aVl. 20MEMLEBU3 MUV JEa |00l MDD CHICBZIHBHS
MVIPa0y JDIMNICLD® BRBHNIMSBB WIH@IGAMNW AIMBIMLAje MM  enileflad
QEAMIZAILfISIE].  806306MaaV” alBall AIElE8IM  C3IC3BHS1M  BO1SOo
o)V vl ag)av’. sV &.enfl.avl./&.gn. anl. QOO @O |3aM @RYOHOWo
@RRELJIAIH00W]  MIWA4[ISIOLIMSB®” S@  CaldEIQYWIEM.  IE506MAMY’
al3ailanow] MUV 1606a]S1S8S8 13 BHICBR, NS 1®3 @RELYIAIGHO
MO H3EMIDUI 40 LORIMENE; Lo VI BIWHN0W] afleamodso
MN@3BBMAURHHIW] MoOIM6Mo 02188  MSalsl MV 1HH6Mo.

B2G306MAMY° GHICBRMHUWIAH  TVIWoBOEMIWIMHIV0  HHISOMIGE  BRD



34

GHOBOMIOL!  MVBQYBHLIUILIBHBHS MIOTIELIQY” MWHso. af) @’
CHICBRMHB1Orl  MIECMRANIMWOSWo  (fIWBAV]a |@RI@BOHSWQo  Afl.aV]l. QeSQo
all.al.av]l.Qeso GMQDIOMIB MSHBAM  (@JAUBIMEBBUY  BIBZIEMAMY’
6308 BPWIHIA1H:80S M@0 BMYD@ICMIGE  MSHBAOHAUMN® @’lcea%Jo
@RAINIMSHOAEM.  BIE36MATV"  6HIE8BHSoel  Al3)odaleges iYWl
m@g%moeoggo nIGEON eﬂq}(ggo 45 Aacvomlngslad  afldyodmOle:udes”
RIBYMI%HHAM’ al0QEMINU3  TVBQYHEINILIGSIT  HOYELIB  EBHILHUIHH
alolasan  afldiodmNldéud  @RAIMOS  VAESIaNleNGINIW]  QIBaHEBREBIBo
SHIOMITIEHHMEIAUGBAN @RAITVO BYIVSBM@ NSBB8 B RV MM ileflod
OMIMZNU0Mo.  CHOSOMIG3  BIGSIEMAMY  CHICBBRHUY  QAUBANCDISES]
1308400V M1RININ0 MGH@WAN@ Mo MILINo:1S AflE3Ud MVABQYMHLINUDILIM:UIBE
@RYWlal®YA0a (H60I0MBS  @RAITVOAENZIHEGH QNI QQJ(%)(T’D@U. walemeaag”
@M QWL BIC56MANY CHICBRHSIT MIWAlHNNA|SAN  @RELYIA Ib:-
@RMELYIAlD: MTWAMo, CAVAMEAUDM AUYAUITVOGHU af)NTAUHWHBOTa] AVMo
aloelasmMm@ImILjo  aJO1W @oe;og%oe;cfa af) @’ BHIPHBIGEMNI OMV@3an’
anlmoamavlowy” BBHOPMHBOGEMO  0f)NS 300 OMI@3  BRAIY AN QYSITMIL)o

M NI ailadaIelansemenamn’ GRGEAIGH]BBHWIEM .



35

Wl gl all. 06RH:  alcwiRla| GOAINAISODAN.  CHOSOWIAI

af) QWA GHICBRHS1G3  @RENJag) AW’ G&O%&)%@GT@SBQEJO 0l
CHICBRNHSI0 B@ @R6NY af) QWAL GCB)O%(SOJOEJf]%. HGa0Ud 6306g06emal
al3afl M@HIMB 1BAIN 1AM 13 630682 HHS1@3 E9NBEMo AIMIOHANG”
CHICBRMHBIHECMIIUY MING OV BHICBRDHSBIEJo BRI WA’ csceao;gceaua
@RYoRlABMHWVo  MAIN|I88 o) QWA  GHICBRGHUI  BRENJaG)W WAL’
CHICBBRHBIW]  MQHWYo  H2IQPAN  BRAIGHSSHONW  QIJAITVOWIEM™ DD
nele|ss®.  ER@eHIME” MM MG alladnelendad MBHHIB MQYINIBH6eMo.
WeMMILININOo adcU]lalenoadealens] HINZAUBAN M al@lay00o0
OMM®AIIBLOBLOM  PONAM  LISHIMISBAN DIy’ HSHAUGBRLAIEM .
aflzfodmO] @JEAIKdMo, GHIY, al0ldH DSEBIW &HI06ERUE MDAIND & alQ®
MVABQBHLIDUDILIGBINEME; 13 D O@MOAUIEIIOM @3 MIAM” @RAINW B3910I0H8]
MM GRILNHU3 QPAIM BHICBR,HUIAN ag;(o&ghdaoeao%oe@oe;@om” 219N
cm@cyoeaalocfooeloe)gos @RAI®EIV0  HBHIMNBIGM MHOMOOMILIBS ST MSals]
MUNHO1BHIMD TVAHHI@  MQINIGMMODE1M3  aflel  CHICBRHOS  NI@)o
MID@RIENIO®  MIeIfL|88  CHICBBHOB BT RAY0IHHT 091 O@IM’

al0a0d@o  &HIeMIM  UHATHHEMHAAMIEM  MDAVoNITWIa] alom  0lGalods



36

Ralla AN af)DTWA” BHICBR HUIHH 306306MAT allall &Sl M@IH1WIGI
CHOPQYOS  ORHIWIWIBHB0  MONOSWENSIB:003 Gald&:MM®.  af) QWA
CHICBZRH U HIVB3a0” af1MIBAV]oW) EHICBRHBOW] 009 lG0. BRAHIWA ]
WaMMILININEe PVWABADIMN@IMEAUMETWITM” MM MG HBHIMZUBANH@ANIEM’
WAMeadloag @RAIGIAINEHAS:IEje aBO@®B:IRjlo  BROWIH® AN
QflB18L0IV  VEAIAHEM,  JOITY-TVIEEMId: TN IMEBSEIG MIM88 WM
GOV DMEWI @ROLIB]IT BRANOS aldlalla] ERDEAIAIGIZEMNIMEAI B0MVo®HAM
nealeMmlow)” &HMedavlellond  ©21AEn008 MVOIMEOME” QUGN @T@goeauaoes)”
calemeamm’ M Mefled MlaUBatlaflSIEl.  GRX@OGIMNZMOAN o JBMAIQo
206MRHAMFIH Do IOMIMo  @ITIq |OJODIMAMAVGl] @) CHICBR"
Caldd:00aN  HOOYOMIG3  WIHDIGAIW ruovo@AylLl. wealemlow
Hvedavlelleje  @RENIWAH  HVeMaVlelejo DUINAHSQYBB  AVIWOROEM
BHICBBHBOS BAM  MolWINMENI@  Afl3JodmO]l  (EI@IMIWSe  UBlaldodud
oalQlsloclmas®” oM milefleel m%m@@)oam". OMM® Qfl310RJIAV Aldsa (1003
ey MBM@OEMI@  allNILNVIGBIN ) PAWA" EHICBBHOB TVIWoROEM
CHICBT HBOS alS1&01@ @I@BH1HOYOM 3§01V Aldio]a0D]

()

A2 |®IWQ0o Al  HMESI8@ MIYAM CYIV O HS1G3 830



37

QAU@BODAMN@ 1M’ ocsma”ao%oe;ua MVA30 O2ILJODIMDAIYBSB o (@I HUB
MoMITWa] AVBHHIB Qflvd31d06Mo  M@3HH6Mo. MIWoRAMIAUMNINABS
NAIIMOAMY CHICBRHSIT  BRYDVoE1HB0M o D1V BHIYHBOS a1V’ AVAHNIAB
MU HBM@IWTRTHBEAI )N’ AUYHMAIHNMo.  BRONIBATD: HVeNdTV1elod
GMIM  @RENIWATUIMINA  DUWINSEDN®  AflBLOBLIAV i a|AUSHNIND
MVa0W1HBAN@TMIEM”. QekelntYeYepa I (WS DEIY®Qo  DOJAUTBOMIM
Y10 D Mil@d o 1a3ALNBHIB DQINIBH6Mo.

W 6D. 21((BGURINAI: afllcwozla | GOARINA|SON.

MVIWoBOMIW]MHIBB  CHICBRHBOS  alSlHWIM &GO af) @’
CHICBR MO8 DUINSOMIO®ITE MlM@ean  AlBJOBL0AV  &ha]QISHNIBHS

@ILJQY MVoOMHUIMAMINEAIMEIWINM” DD MIG3 HHIMZAUMIBIBBAND® af)aN’

QBRI MUY W afl3§o840av (MUNJa IMN63BUY @1RYMoE12|CMINS
MoMNIMHE® A3V  CRIRIWIAIMEIW  QYRINDHB2|QYOS @RYANo
BV 1a8M@ 1Mo M@ HIOEMAIBs0. TUIWoBAEM  BMHICBEHBOS

HIIODNT  MVBQYBHLIUILIBHBHS @OWIHH000 alRlAI®AEM. BHICBLZHUILN
MVIWoRAMIWIHRHIV0  RISISBMMDIM” 2l QAIGUOHOD (@ JAUBAM  aldlalWo

DIMBIMLAIBBAND”  MVoMLOIMHE® Q318 1O0TVEARNILINY  aJOBBI5S1H60.



38

2MIWaI®GMNIdWAOJo DM IOCAIRHUD aflamQ)o 00MOH@ QYo
WAMD SN @LIOMICRINH  DWOIM  AVIWoRAN  GHhICSEHUING
HPleOmISIEl af) MM WILNIBMNYJo.  BHABOM M MVIWoROEM BHICBEBHUD
@RYQoE1HHIMBB M1HHo @R ldh10je BRMANVOOMILIABBMIHWIM3 NAINIHAT
@@1EMIMMo 2 JOBHHIFEaIIBHIM  @QINIBEMo. ald0jalrLb®], avlelmniav,
BBHIYMYDHBOS  °LISM  af)DT  AaHWVEBBSIOLIEo®HIN  QUYEMAOW  UIO6M
DENBIHEMo.  TVIWoRO6M BGHIGCBRHSIB3 alo1osan al3L08MO1HU3HN” GHIY Y
maslanleng”  GAVWOMI@  LIBINISROAMMSE  @I1@BAIMo  0lBJAMCHH6S
V1Yo RMM GHICBRHSICLIN @) HBaH1 L3N @ 1V EAIMEIYSBS® 6N .
CHIYIU” VBSlaN1HHg" GANMOMIT LIBYNISHIMNBS G1WBAIMo  CHOBOMISLI
o)L MVABQYBHLINUDILINUBBRB0 MNIOWHNISNEMo.  AflBJIBLIMV & 2|QISHNICVISBS
®I@3q|OJ0DHHINE” MX@AIEM” VAIMBHAAZ” MV IWoBMIWIHRHIAABH GHICBEHUY
@RYoE1HHIMEZUTTIABIM®. BR@IMIGE MDD ileflom WHMAIVT af)@1BHEM.

@l ofl. aVl. oflaHENMMILA? VM BRG] 018a]I3S" ©21Q) (@JHIVASBS

2014-0e1 MVABQHLIDUILID MN63BUI (gamoo GRBULMI) enN@d
9alo@RMIC@JOWo  EMFAN@IMIVT  MVABABERIY"  ©2IQYMOAAN  GRBOMI

@AM @ a [lasao. Dalo@0allz s 0aVEamILjo  MVIGHHOIWILJo QN1 @3



39

MI@HBIN  TVAVLOIMAIOIMELTLjo SAN®  Afl31OELAV  YWeMMILINIEO1H (]
300 ON1@3 GHO8Bo  QAUBHO  allaN]elnem. OOAIMY 2ldABAVLIANITNS
Mlwamom1ejo QMIeN20W1@AMN M1e1nno BHOBOM 1L
M3 L1000l Wdesel. 19 auoaunimeBglen®l 420 auIwoecoaMINI;HIUNSS

CHICBRMHUY  (JAUAROH1HBOTME". a0WA g EHDAHUOM cmoesmcrw’]nd@@

Q.2).avl.-Qes 11-00@" o 1003 I, 402a31ejo E5H0mOA] S late ) 1964-66-
ol 01@ajodglejo  LIWOBEEM  GHICBBHBOS  ARYAUUD SHMOWSEEB0]2f
al0Q6MNS". HEBB  CHICBBHUBHD SOOI AVIIDAD Y CODIFLE:S]
aflB§B10V PoWTDENEIG:IM MIQ6BRUY DUBOBNINZDHHIMNE Aldha]| O1DIWILIS:
@REHIWA]H  MOHMMIGAUHMO  af)dhal@lOAMFIYo  MSOMIMSBS  TVII®QAD Yo
RIBYMIABIMNM@IMIEM” AVIWoROMINUGHIY0 MMTB:AMND.  TVABQHLIIVIRIYHS

nlalllwhle Il @RUW1H00633U3 @RE®alS] MmN HHINBI6M”

BHICBZR,HUIHN MVIWoROMIWIEHI00 M@3BANO) . M1MINWM HUBHE3

AN@EL2VT  EJAUCODTAEBAN  CHICBBHBOS  BRHNIBATS:  @RYEgoeMal  0F

921QMN@IM”  AVIWoBBIMIWIB00 @RoU1B:00 HIIIGlHs” @WIB:0006MS". 45

slalnvoIMdo m@ngW@@%oe)ua all®oemoe e algemenan” milellad aljoirun



40
0 21Q1T1EBM®" (@JUouMIMI6M. CHICBRHBI03  0lavABaf ©@RYAF
OALAILIaTONN MSOMIMBE  AVIOOMJo  DENBIMHEMo.  TVEMVNIMHDD
HDMONENNFOD  BHICBRHUBHH  AVIWoROIMINUHIWD0 MDB:MDMIL)HS AllEBUD
MVABQIHLIDUILIGESIS H1SallSlanomas @I»IYIed 920Mm@® MIeINNnE)ss
afl3}08000 MoMNIMHO® AfBLAMONHUBHS”  RIBIAIGMMDIMe  BRDAIY]
aflolw coalelsgled al3rLe TYaHlesMM@IMo  AIF1HWIEBASo.

W9 @RYA. MIGRH": qVMIE; GG 016033 921Q) Jo0gss 2014-eel

amudqeelnudel Maesud (gamde ee3V™]) mled arflngo G@RE® oeNdy’
SH191QOS al0leMMEYP” ERVPEMOHAMD  6E3V®]  GRAIMAIq{lasa0.
afl31oBL0V HHIB8 MSADAN@IMNSE MOBNAIWVT  MVIWoBOEM CHICILHOS
oc(gcm(dﬂmgg DalDWIWIWITM™  aVABHHIB M MIGE HBHINZAUINIATBBAND) .
MU  OflBoBLOAV  LNIAIMEBA8 MIVWANTHHINT MVAHHI@  WIODIT3
MSalslQo nfl&Halasamiealan”  a0@oel, DO Q0 ocgma”@ogoe;@@

(V]

M0V 1HHIN@ HaM @O @3 enflefleel o1} Yol leg¥als XV B0
921Q101883HQAOM.  BRANIAWATH  HVOMML1oadQo  GMIBW"  B0al’

awlavleode  MO@eMo  MEMXHAMI®  MdHlq 100891 V101E8N®”

al3fosyoav  MILINNOOO® OGN  mIdwWlseso. CHIGBZR HUIHS



41

MVIWoBOEMIAUMRIWO  MTHIOMFOD @ IGBRIMONIEINS  MVBQYBHLINUILINHBHS
@PW1HI00  MVABSla01ENY” MDB:HHVAND®” AI@AIBN] 2J@BHN W] TT1HBHHWIEM.
BHIYHU  aJDAMIDB:OMo  OIYINDIEOS MVIWoBOM  CHhICBR HUIHN
Q@201 QUG EYalEebolo) DoAY §21Q) 06RO aljainn enfelod
2U3eINIBB o [l0leB3M@” All3JoAMN0H68 GBRIHUGHONIW]  MIDWIdHs30.
0l 351303 SO 1HOQYSBS @R (B D683UY @SQOM@TMINIUD AW
aljoInOSHUB M mileld  9U3eHHISSHNICH®” @RAIMOS  alOM
MLIO®QD) §S O DBOOAIW] anIWloHRo. MBBHITIHZEWI
QeMICAILIFIQOSEWI H1F1LILINO® TVIWoBOM  CHICBERHS]©3 al01a830M
DaleMBHS1HWOH AVIOQ@RIW] aloMo  MSADANIEMI @E1(Jow
MPO@IOMIECMI 988  @RAIGIWo  MIGAUWILNNAIZAMN  TVIa02I0}0

3910108830M@ 1MW S0 191608 (@BallaGlanemeamm” milefled alyalaun
®2l1Q)6Mo. (3(6)0(&%@308 O 1@BOIM BN @RWI»I00 v eilellgles

MVIWoBAMBHICBEHHUIHH M @3B3HWIEM . @MWAlUIIVEEBS0
@OMI210068BB0  HIAAUGHHOMOJo MDD EIRJOMIHAZ AflBL0ELOMVERRIFIWIG

MSa 1210663 HQIMIGI OHIGBMM B3 TVAHHIA 00RO



42

@RWI1HI0OM L8862 003 2lel | ISz} MNVIWoRAMM CHICBR HSB1EOS

0(30)%6)0%09)03&6)” GHHYHUS @IWAIMTHHIB BRWIBH000 M@B;1WIG @M
Mosl®vad  ACO®O@IODIM”  AlleI®mAMRIH80. ERGIMIG3 MO0

MUOa IMEBBBOS HSANAQIAQI M@ 1an6Mo. afl3§08400V GO ILIN

D 2]QISOIBBHNAHHIMB  UYDo MSABEMIUWB (Do lHHODIM” EPD® GhenEloelamn”

MS1an0ad SHYlolel. Q308 10VEAAIRIHW @ HABH3aM,
TVIWoBOEMEBICBE HBOS o0c1Q"  BRZIN0L20:06Ns" ocgm@g?@ogoe)uaoes)”

®I@a]|0yA88 TVoAWIMAMRIGHIN EBHA1H30M M Mmileflom af)@1BHs30TM.

afl3oeyoav moe;%;l@’l (). all. . @EMIOM)): CHICBRHOS

@RYESIEMATY” @RYHNEMHAMMIEM @.22]l.avl. U01ald@uo QMO 180
@RHHIAWN]H  @YESIeMAT  MI@AIEM. MO@IHIND  TVBHHIA O I@BRIM 2O
@@ 1MW af) COW™ 060 CYIN WOV MU HBH Qo
SMM®AIIBLOB1OMV Qlda(loLIQoe DMM® AQIBJIRLIIV GHDeMaV]elnado BRI®”
MVBQYBHLNUNILIBHBOSWo (@D INIW]BHUB 2UBDqls 8@ DAMBOIVSHUM HA191OW
MO EB3EHQ)o 0.21Q. MVABQHLINWIRIRHSINRIYo  2an®  Afl3{oE8yoav

Qo lorIQo DEBLOVNNMHS  GAVAIMo  LIBLMIHH] JIR® il



43

CHICBRHUI  TVMBAUDABH QYo @RANIWA]D  af)RLIBAV” MVoMITW] 4
@RE30eMATIN0WT  101alBUD 92l  CHICBZIHBOS I CIIRIVENET G
anavlelglavy;, oﬂooes)mg”loeage)s ag)%emcm", q)\%amﬁcm” 6 lBBaNIB@AMITY’
o)Al MVoNIMWIa] al@lEUIWMPEUIaHo  TVIWoRAEM  al3afl M@ Qo
0.21Q. MG BREGHWIGQaHMI@  af) YW £IG12{IS88, IO AUBHONIG
GHSO@  @JAUBODMABE o I®IPAN”  CHICBRHOBSWMN  OHAVLIE)  6alQD.
a)e1MNIOToW” EHIECBRHOB MILI08 DU |SOMIVINLIOIMIEW  @RYEHHa lo
@®laddo oMW EBHQMNBIW]. af)eUIMIWOToW)” BHICBRHUINH NI@RIW]
8@ mled ABAN  AVI0AIOJEMILEM” MDD  BHINV enfelod
A 1020 UI1HENI I@BANY . @RAHHIWN]H BRYBSIEMAT HPHISABINDHHHINE @Y
CHICBBHUB  aJ@PROWo  Qemlealglgl  MqREmI@dmIae  Afl§EaldE:0naM
M@ @D laldto OANWa] @RYEDIAIEMo BRSITVOIMOAO TR CHY
MSOMIMo WIHHAMV 621QIMABS ERWIBH0006M” M MIlEfle)es TVIWoReM
CHICBBHUBBH HHIFOMIGBB®.  TVABHIB CHICBZHUBBBo  ag) W10
DHIFABAN  @BRYNOL:L1|633U3 MVIWOoRAM  GhHhIGBRHUIHBo  MBIAHANDIEM .

.21Vl eena” eeelld @MVl eaveum2 (f) 12 (b) enelead

alGlWIVI@  QAIWBIN  af)LIIEHICBRHUWBEB0 oIl MTHIOAMM”  @.22.aVl.



44

Moy BaH16 9 81eJ0 HSO®  MNINWMNM B UI mgdaoe)omom)” al®lgan”
CHICBBHOB OTVEIY  621Q1388O). @RSOOMIT  °LISo  QIBEMIIUD
MVIWoRMMAlIZAB’ @RGalSHH HMla]  CWINIOWHS @RSITLOIMMTYG3
@RAINVQo  aldlemlasso. al@®eN2%0 alb@IWIG QALY anNMEIMIW]
1245.75 @981 @o1@os ©@)Eapm@d muadaqflafigams”.  o2am® ol ogoav

QWO® Aflal0l®000® 2Q6BBUY  MYaHlESM@IMIVT B  altb®]dSo

MO [W) $H00Y68BR0  BRAUNYOIGBEMIWB (D laldHo GRMIOM  HENPSal
af)®1BHBM®”  LEIVEL. MINIAWMHUWBHD Qll@BELAIW] @REHIAWN] B

@QE36eMAl &1 EHICBRHU  (JAUGON]SBAMHAUM” GENIIELINA|SIT @Y

@PW1HI00  alladalelendmd  qudseniolme  Qemlealglglaso @RWI1HH 000
OHISHBAM SO3 GTUW%IBQS'](Q)OG‘IT)'I@V. afeld  Qemleaglgleglele 360

MVAQo@HIM BRAWTaHM, aldlay, 01TVUEY" WIHWAE &a1Q@3, WY O3HIFHN03

ag)amlal MSOMINSSB MVoQINWIMEBRUY DMRBIHN 16BN INSTO1H63HWIGIMN .
MVoMVNIME) DI oM@ aflzos 40V MUNJa IMEBBBHS 00 SHHANIW

MSOM]a [IEANET  TVoLOIM  WAIGMAB  AMHOQYFABMDIOM  H®QIW]

oe;oeanma«m%.



45

M1IBHOM (JEAWo VB MI0IHE1a).

GRBULM 1 Ud MOIBOH53HEWI QU ODIS @AM 16WISEES]
alaBa1eas::cWo 921Q.

MUNIRB:S" %Gl 016a]dg" §21Qe)50988 2014-0e1 avdqle:e100el
MaEsud (gando 6e3LMI1) MM  aldlWIMMUHENFHNNMHAIN (@JEOAWo VB
@001 @1).

@3 BN MW HHAHFOD).

06N3%0 Qldhza |

DAY @I |0QAD BDEBLOUNTH: GEBBRNMIHUS BRAIMGo{la).

1063. In clause 2, Which proposed to amend the Kerala University
Act, 1974,-

In section 69(B) (ii) proposed to be inserted by clause 2(c) after the

word “preserving” the words “and ensuring” shall be inserted;

1064. In section 69E(2) (f) proposed to be inserted by clause 2(c)
after the words “One member from among the teachers of the

college” the words “not below the rank of an Associate Professor”



46

shall be inserted;

1065. In section 69E(2) (f) proposed to be inserted by clause 2(c),

the words “with the approval of the Director of Collegiate
Education” shall be added at the end;

1066. In section 69E(4) proposed to be inserted by clause 2(c), for

the words “a year” the word “six months” shall be substituted;

1067. In the proviso to section 69G(3) proposed to be inserted by
clause 2(c), after the word “four” the word “academic” shall be

inserted;
1068. In section 69G(5) proposed to be inserted by clause 2(c), for

the words “one such meeting” the words “two such meetings” shall

be substituted;

1069. In section 691(4) (a) proposed to be inserted by clause 2(c)
before the words “one nominee of the Manager” the words

“Manager or” shall be inserted;

1070. In section 69L(i), proposed to be inserted by clause 2(c), for
the words “to approve and submit to the University” the words “to

submit to the University the proposal for” shall be inserted;



47

1071. In section 69M(2) proposed to be inserted by clause 2(c), for the

word “foms” the word “forms” shall be inserted;

1072. In the proviso to section 69N(1) proposed to be inserted by clause
2(c), the words “in the State” shall be deleted;

1073. In section 69P(2) proposed to be inserted by clause 2(c), after the
words “Board of Studies of the University” the words “for approval”

shall be inserted;

1074. In section 69P(5), proposed to be inserted by clause 2(c), after the
words “Governing Council of the College” the words “through the

Principal of that College” shall be inserted.

114, 115, 116, 120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 126, 127, 129, 130, 131, 134, 135,
136, 137, 141, 142, 143, 144, 146, 148, 149, 152, 154, 156, 157, 158, 159,
160, 161, 162, 165, 166, 167, 169, 170, 176, 177, 179, 180, 182, 183, 185,
186, 188, 189, 190, 191, 192, 193, 194, 196, 197, 198, 199, 200, 201, 202,
203, 204, 205, 206, 207, 208, 210, 211, 212, 213, 215, 219, 220, 221, 222,
230, 232, 233, 234, 235, 236, 237, 244, 247, 251, 252, 253, 255, 256, 257,

258, 259, 260, 261, 262, 263, 264, 265, 266, 267, 268, 269, 270, 271, 273,



48

275, 276, 277, 278, 279, 280, 281, 282, 283, 284, 285, 286, 287, 288, 289,
290, 291, 292, 293, 300, 304, 305, 307, 309, 310, 311, 312, 313, 314, 315,
316, 317, 318, 319, 320, 321, 323, 324, 325, 329, 330, 331, 332, 334, 336,
337, 338, 339, 340, 341, 342, 343, 344, 345, 346, 347, 348, 349, 350, 351,
353, 355, 356, 358, 359, 360, 363, 366, 367, 368, 370, 371, 372, 373, 374,
376, 377, 379, 380, 381, 382, 386, 387, 389, 390, 392, 393, 395, 397, 398,

399, 400, 402, 404, 406, 407, 409, 411, 413, 414, 416, 417, 418, 419, 420,

421, 422, 423, 424, 425, 428, 430, 431, 432, 433, 434, 435, 436, 438 agyam’

MMIB BN 1HU3 BRAIMAo{1a).

®IOVOQMM  BBENMIB:U3 AEY] V1),

343. In Section 69] proposed to be inserted in the Kerala University
Act, 1974 by clause 2(c), insert the word “ academic” after the

(13

word two’ wherever it occurs.

398. In the first proviso in section 690(1),proposed to be inserted in the
Kerala University Act,1974 by clause2(c), for the words

“ prescribed by the University” , the words “ prescribed by the



49

statutes” shall be substituted.
424. In the second proviso to section 69P(10),proposed to be inserted
in the Kerala University Act, 1974 by clause 2(c) for the word
“ the” shall be inserted after the word “ lower” .
@09 0QAN BDEBYIN]H: GE3NM1 AEDT BRAIMA{l2).
245. In section 69E(3) proposed to be inserted in the Kerala University
Act, 1974 by Clause 2(c) for the words “ whichever is
later” substitute the words “ whichever is earlier”
D@1 BRAIMAa{l2j@o AVflHhAl2 @MW GEBBNGIH:UE MVE @oW1d:@]1).
W, MU &:Qaf @AU®Ga(la] 377-0%0 mqud ee3L® 48-am@len 62
GQIIgHEBINS VB m’l(oooea(o’lad.
@) GNISICVA] MIoLIGHHMD GRAIMGIalla] 194, 433 agaml mmud
ee3LMH0 47-0m®1o0 63 cnIgHE8OS TVE MG ).
@1 sl.ail. eRaH GRAIMEafla) 360-00 Mmaud cerw®] 47-am™1oo 63
GQIIGHEBINS VB m%oooe;m%.
¢RRUM] 21QEJHIVABS OM=J0 Aldsa| MILNOMF BIVAIBHEIMORND (@JUo

aoe mom%e)(o’l%J.



50

GRBLWM] §121Q) (@JHIVAYBR VN0 Qldsa | milLfloag owWaowW.

RAMI0 Qldha |

@09 JOQAN GBENMIB:U3 AAY] BRAI® G {l).

In clause 3, which proposes to amend the Calicut University Act, 1975,-

1075. In section 68C(ii) proposed to be inserted by clause 3(c) after the word

“preserving” the words “and ensuring” shall be inserted;

1076. In section 68F(2)(f) proposed to be inserted by clause 3(c) after the
words “One member from among the teachers of the college”  the
words “not below the rank of an Associate Professor” shall be
inserted;
1077. In section 68F(2)(f) proposed to be inserted by clause 3(c), the words
“with the approval of the Director of Collegiate Education” shall be
added at the end;

1078. In section 68F(4) proposed to be inserted by clause 3(c), for the

words “a year” the word “six months” shall be substituted;

1079. In the proviso to section 68H(3) proposed to be inserted by clause

3(c), after the word “four” the word “academic” shall be inserted;



51

1080. In section 68H(5) proposed to be inserted by clause 3(c), for the
words “one such meeting” the words “two such meetings” shall

be substituted;

1081. In section 68J(4)(a) proposed to be inserted by clause 3(c), before
the words “one nominee of the Manager” the words “Manager or”
shall be inserted;
1082. 1In section 68M(i) proposed to be inserted by clause 3(c), for the
words “to approve and submit to the University” the words “to

submit to the University the proposal for” shall be inserted;

1083. In the proviso to section 680(1) proposed to be inserted by clause
3(c), the words “in the State” shall be deleted;

1084. In section 68Q(2) proposed to be inserted by clause 3(c), after the
words “Board of Studies of the University” the words “for

approval” shall be inserted;

1085. In section 68Q(5), proposed to be inserted by clause 3(c), after

the words “ Governing Council of the College” the words

(13

through the Principal of that College” shall be inserted;

439, 440,441, 446, 447, 451, 453, 454, 459, 460, 461, 462, 463,

465, 466, 467, 468, 469, 470, 471, 472, 474, 477,485, 475, 476, 479,



52

480, 486, 487, 488, 490, 491, 493, 495, 498, 499, 500, 501, 502, 503,
504, 505, 506, 509, 515, 516, 517, 520, 524, 525, 526, 528, 529, 530,
531, 535, 536, 537, 538, 540, 541, 543, 544, 545, 546, 547, 548, 549,
551, 552, 554, 555, 556, 557, 559, 560, 562, 563, 564, 569,570, 572,
573, 574, 576, 577, 578, 579, 580, 581, 582, 585, 586, 587, 588, 589, 590,
591, 593, 594, 595, 596, 598, 599, 601, 602, 603, 605, 609, 610, 611, 612,
613, 614, 615, 617, 618, 620, 622, 624, 627, 628, 629, 630, 631, 632,
633, 635, 636, 637 639, 640, 642, 646, 647, 648, 652, 653, 654, 656, 657,
658, 659, 660, 661, 662, 663, 666, 667, 668, 669, 670 agyaN1 RV 1HUI
@ROIM G {19).
@090 GBENMIB:03 A@Y] AV 1@,
447. 1In section 2(4B) proposed to be inserted in the Calicut University
Act, 1975 by clause 3(a)(iii), for the word “ by-elaws” , the word
“ bye-laws” shall be substituted.
535. In section 68 F (3) proposed to be inserted in the Calicut University
Act, 1975 by Clause 3 (c) for the words "whichever is later"

substitute the words "whichever is earlier".



53

601. In section 68K, proposed to be inserted in the Calicut University
Act, 1975 by clause 3(c), for the words "two years" occurring in both

the places, the words "two academic years" shall be substituted.

636. In the first proviso to section 68P(1) proposed to be inserted in the
Calicut University Act, 1975 by clause 3 (c), for the words "prescribed
by the University", the words " prescribed by the statutes" shall be
substituted.

658. In the second proviso to section 68Q(10) proposed to be inserted in the
Calicut University Act, 1975 by clause 3(c) after the words “ that

lower”  insert the word “ the”

D@1 BRAIMAa{l2j@o AVflHhAl2 @RIV GEBBNGIH:UE MVE @oW1d:@]1).

CRRUILM] alQ @JHI0ABR Mo Aldsa| MINEOHF BINAIBNEMHAIM (@JUJo

aoe amom%e)(o’lad.

CRBILMI] 21Q (@JHI0ABB PJANIo Aldsq| milellead cowmow.

MOELIdo QAldsa |

@069 OQAN BDEBLN1H: GB3VMIHRHUY DO BRAIMAola).

In clause 4, which proposes to amend the Mahatma Gandhi University



54

Act, 1985,-

1086. In section 104(i1)proposed to be inserted by clause 4(c), after the
word “ preserving” the words “ and ensuring” shall be inserted;

1087. In section 107(2)(f) proposed to be inserted by clause 4(c), after
the words “ One member from among the teachers of the college” the
words “ not below the rank of an Associate Professor” shall be inserted;

1088. In section 107(2)(f) proposed to be inserted by clause 4(c), the
words “ with the approval of the Director of Collegiate Education” shall be
added at the end;

1089. In section 107(4) proposed to be inserted by clause 4(c), for the
words “ a year” the words “ six months” shall be substituted;

1090. In the proviso to section 109 (3) proposed to be inserted by
clause 4(c), after the word “ four” the word “ academic” shall be inserted;

1091. In section 109(5) proposed to be inserted by clause 4(c), for the
words “ one such meeting” the words “ two such meetings” shall be
substituted;

1092. In section 111 (4) (a) proposed to be inserted by clause 4(c),



55

before the words “ one nominee of the Manager” the words “ Manager
or’ shall be inserted;
1093. In section 114(1) proposed to be inserted by clause 4(c), for the

13

words “ to approve and submit to the University” the words “ to submit to
the University the proposal for” shall be inserted.

1094. In the proviso to section 116(1) proposed to be inserted by clause
4(c), the words “ in the State” shall be deleted;

10935. In section 118(2) proposed to be inserted by clause 4(c), after the
words “ Board of Studies of the University” the words “ for approval”
shall be inserted;

1096. In section 118(5), proposed to be inserted by clause 4(c), after the
words “ Governing Council of the College” the words “ through the
Principal of that College” shall be inserted.

671, 672, 674, 676, 678, 679, 680, 682, 688, 690, 695, 696, 698,
699, 701, 702, 710, 713, 716, 717, 721, 722, 723, 725, 726, 729, 731, 744,

751, 755, 756, 759, 766, 771, 772, 775, 771, 783, 784, 786, 793, 799, 801,

802, 806, 809, 810, 812, 814, 816, 821, 822, 823, 825, 830, 831, 832, 833,



56

835, 838, 841, 847, 850, 851, 852, 853, 854, 855, 856, 857, 858, 860, 861,
862, 863, 864, 865, 867, 869, 870, 873 agan1 mMmMIB GRELNIHHUI
@ROIM G {1a).

DADT MIHPRIOQAD AVHHIM3 GBRND] BRAIM@o(la).

754. In Section 107(3) proposed to be inserted in the Mahatma Gandhi
University Act, 1985 by clause 4(c) for the words “ whichever is later”
substitute the words “ whichever is earlier” .

@090 GBENMIBU3 A@Y] AV,

802. In Section 112 proposed to be inserted in the Mahatma Gandhi
University Act, 1985, by clause 4(c), for the words “ two years” occuring
in both the places the words “ two academic years” shall be substituted.

841. In the first proviso to Section 117(1), proposed to be inserted in the
Mahatma Gandhi University Act, 1985 by clause 4(c) for the words
“ prescribed by the University” , the words “ prescribed by the students”

<

shall be substituted. agyon@” “ prescribed by the students” agOP@IValMHO0
“ prescribed by statutes” a)am ¢e3L®IEWINS VN ).

862. In the second proviso to Section 118(10), proposed to be inserted



57

in the Mahatma Gandhi University Act, 1985 by clause 4(c), after the word
“ lower” insert the word “ the”

@1 @ERAIMOIa{ly) 8DE3JWH  EBEOLDMId:Bo QUGN EGBBRVMIWQ0
Td@1af GERND B0 MVE BP0 1hA1).

CRBLM] §alQ (@JHIYBB MILIo Aldsa| iefloa BIVAILHEMOAAN
@UQo VB @TOOUﬂoS:»(Zﬂ.f}J.

GRBUWM] ©21Q) @JHIVAYBS MILIo Aldal milefloag owaow.

@R6MIJo Qldsal’

IOV |OQAN BVEBIN]H GBRNMIBUT A BRAIMA {la).

In clause 5, which proposes to amend the Kannur University Act,
1996,-

1097. In section 74B(ii)proposed to be inserted by clause 5(c), after the

(13

word “ preserving” the words “ and ensuring” shall be inserted;
1098. In section 74E(2)(f)proposed to be inserted by clause 5(c), after
the words “ One member from among the teachers of the college” the

words “ not below the rank of an Associate Professor” shall be inserted;

1099. In section 74E(2)(f) proposed to be inserted by clause 5(c), the



58

words “ with the approval of the Director of Collegiate Education” shall be
added at the end;

1100. In section 74E(4) proposed to be inserted by clause 5(c), for the
words “ a year” the words “ six months” shall be substituted;

1101. In proviso to section 74G(3) proposed to be inserted by clause
5(c), after the word “ four” the word “ academic” shall be inserted;

1102. In section 74G(5) proposed to be inserted by clause 5(c), for the
words “ one such meeting” the words “ two such meetings” shall be
substituted;

1103. In section 74I(4)(a) proposed to be inserted by clause 5(c),
before the words “ one nominee of the Manager” the words “ Manager
or’ shall be inserted;

1104. In section 74L(i), proposed to be inserted by clause 5(c), for the

113

words “ to approve and submit to the University” the words “ to submit to
the University the proposal for” shall be inserted;

1105. In the proviso to section 74N(1)proposed to be inserted by clause

5(c), the words “ in the State” shall be deleted;



59

1106. In section 74P(2) proposed to be inserted by clause 5(c), after the
words “ Board of Studies of the University” the words “ for
approval” shall be inserted;

1107. In section 74P(5), proposed to be inserted by clause 5(c), after
the words “ Governing Council of the College” the words “ through the

Principal of that College” shall be inserted.

876, 878, 879, 881, 882, 883, 884, 885, 887, 888, 890, 891, 892, 893,
894, 895, 896, 897, 898, 899, 900, 901, 903, 904, 906, 907, 908, 909, 910,
911, 912, 913, 914, 915, 919, 922, 925, 926, 927, 928, 929, 930, 931, 933,
935, 936, 938, 941, 942, 943, 944, 945, 947, 949, 950, 951, 952, 953, 955,
956, 957, 958, 959, 960, 961, 962, 963, 964, 965, 966, 967, 968, 969, 970,
972, 973, 978, 979, 980, 981, 982, 984, 985, 986, 987, 988, 989, 990, 991,
993, 995, 996, 1000, 1001, 1002, 1003, 1004, 1006, 1007, 1008, 1009, 1010,
1012, 1013, 1015, 1017, 1019, 1020, 1021, 1024, 1027, 1029, 1033, 1036,
1037, 1039, 1040, 1043, 1044, 1045, 1046, 1047, 1048, 1049, 1050, 1052,

1053, 1055 1057, 1058 agyan1 mmid ce3w@1dhud @AI®Eo{la).



60

IOV |OQAN ASHIBS GBBOMIHU3 DO @AIM@To{la).

946. In Section 74E(3) proposed to be inserted in the Kannur
University Act, 1996 by clause 5(c), the words “ whichever is

later” substitute the words “ whichever is earlier”

992. In Section 74J proposed to be inserted in the Kannur University
Act, 1996 by clause 5(c), for the words “ two years” occurring
in both the places the words “ two academic years” shall be

substituted.

1028. In the first proviso to Section 740(1) proposed to be inserted in
the Kannur University Act, 1996 by clause 5(c), for the words
“ prescribed by the University” the words “ prescribed by the

statutes” shall be substituted.

99 |0QAN  6B3VMT 2@ MVfd:@14).

1048. In the second proviso to Section 74P(10) proposed to be inserted
in the Kannur University Act, 1996 by clause 5(c), after the word
“ lower” insert the word “ the”

W af). O MLIW BRAMAlafly] 972-00 mMud ce3V®] 42-o6m®160
62 cI0gHE8HS MVE M00E:G]a).

@] BRAU®GCla{la] 8DEELPWIG: GBEOMIMd:Bo ADGENIM  GBRODG]M:So



61

AT MV13014] EGEBBVGIWo TVE BRoW1B:@]).

e 9alQ @JHOOABB @REMId0 Aldsal MILNOM BINAIBHEMOAIM
(@Jugo VB @011,

CRBVMI] ©21Q) (@JHIABS @RI Aldsal milellaad sowaowl.

@RY0Jo Adsal

®IOVOQAN BVEBYIN]H GE3NMI DD BRAIMA1ofl2).

1108. In sub-clause (1) of clause 6, for the figures, word and brackets
“ (4 of 2014)” the figures, word and brackets “ (18 of 2014)”
shall be substituted.

1061, 1062 agam1 mmid a3 1508 GRAIMG]q 1.

D@1 BRAIGA {l2] 8DEBLW]E: GEBBNMT TVE @BRoW1B:@]).

CRBVMI] §2l1Q (@JHIYBS BRYOJo Aldsal MIEOAd BIVAISNEMOAAN (@JUgo

ave (BTOOU)(’](B)(O']_'}J.

CRBULM] 9a1Q) (@JHI0ABB @Yo Aldsq| Milefload cowmowl.

B80MJIo Qldalo all01&H o Gal@o

110, 111, 112 113 aganT mmid 6e3L™1&:ud @U@ {l).

(0] o o (0] ) ) o)
630MJ0 Ol aNold Gal®3 mﬂ%%) INNIHHEMBAAM ave

mom"]ceam%i.



62

630M00 Qldhq o al1016:Qo Gal@o milefload cowaowl.

afl30BL00V  Qldhq|A@] (). afl. o®.  @miom)): 2014-ec
uBQ)&e10000e1d MYaeEBUd (Mo GBRLMI) midd A l0AVIGHEMOAMM (@JEAWo
@RAI®Ola (18630.

O®YIEjo  OOMaleMnlo Al ] (W) oHleny cenuenfl  @=06M):

(QJGOWHDED a (la»I6EBRAM.

@), HISIGWA] MILIGHHM: BREHIAATH: MVIWoRAIMONIHM Gald]1®3

QMR HN06Mo  LIGHIAISAN OB MG MTYANIHBANG MVoAMVNIME) DD
2IM®ANBLOBLIV GAAILIVIT DWBW®ONIW (JDJILNMEBBBENBIGB0.  BHIGBXR"
nwealMlow)”  HDaMAVILIM”  TVBQPWIHHIEBBo  HOHHAIQIM  AlWwoN1eISs
CRBULM NS ns ROO-0® MVoPLISMHBOS MY@MOM .88
MUIRHIQYCHICBR, HUIHN RSO @RWI1d»000 eI18lasaMmo) nle)
@RI SHHQM6M. D  mileflon®oo Hgom  alladuoMo  GRELYIA IM:-
Al odmal  avgeo@®1od Mo Q@@mﬂgmg”. M Mo  @RAIVE]a
NVIWoROMINIGINASBS BN ICBR MBI G MVBQYHLIDUDILIRHUIABS”

WIHI@IW @'O(Df]cGaO(OOJQJGTBOtﬁwG)(Dﬂ%. V1Yo E061M (80830(8@%063%6)8 aloM



63

GeNIOABWIm3 MUIHOOY  GHIG82  MIEMRABMIBLH @I |0IABBAUNO
®210BM0MIAHIMD VOWIBB0.  WealeMlow” dhmemdavlelael 13 @rowsrsIed 12
CGal@o GHIE8E 0eMZHMFINMR @@ IMIWIBHBIOMIM@IMITE  AVIHI0Y
DOCMRABRIBHH af)MD O1BRAIMOOASHNINY ATVIWIAHBAN @RAITVO  QIAGal@3o.
OV MVA(@JBHI00 NAIMOAAZ EHICBZHUIH30 TVIUYW CHIY MSOMIHAIM
OID10NCUHAMBIG:H Qo ald0INa|SoId8B0 afleaMose  allednOem1@3
0 ]301dH630 Dl :31HUdds0 aflzyo’ Yoo MNCaUW] B9 SaM
@ROINOWENBIGH Qo HalQo. MDD N alMISBMD]IONDIOO  NVSMHAIW
@J®1GaHWo @J»Slo{laad0ms”  mesRUd @SOS MVRIMSa IS1HUd
NUa0laHO1H63 M.

(@O ald:HI0WE@BRU3 BANSEHo nNeload ald@af »101808aMEUdaHe TVERD

MSalS1du8 MinOlaldl ) A OO CaI10W].)

afl330850M0 Qld @] (1. ofl. O@. @aayéoay“): 1964-0e1 65000001
S0 lat@  01eaodslejo 1986-0a1 6301 afldyoeyoav MOOmIE SAN®
Q308100 AVNJAIMEBBUIAS  TVIWoRMEM al3all MTHeMHAMM MIBC3UdNME.
smanydleel 21 amvoruoomegl@d 84 audqdelnwdelsRdaen &19leiss 441

GMHICBRHUIHAH TVIWoBAM al3all mlelallejms. nfefload  avlclglom



64

a0M1HHIOD ®OOMI@ VM, GHolglailele VRVl (@@ Tald:HIow6ERUY
HHINZAUIM GBENM1HUT VMO BRoW @1 afIgemE"
2014-021  auBqi@enviel  MaEBW  (gaMle  6e3V®I)  mdd
alOAROIBHEMHRAM (@JEAWo TVE @YY 1h@1a).
N3 VB aldTMIBH].

@ 01W1al

¢8RN MIHBo MOIGHAM (@JEAVWEBBo MWHMDIMSB AVAWo

2. ewaltgl aYleed: 03-12-2014-m" ave  alelwemlesmm  GH08

aorvyoflom” mi@d, 2014-0e1 eH080 &HSdHgo  QPEMIRY  TVNJAIMEBSGO
(ee3w®ml) i@  agamlal qumid,y”  SHo1gl MINeE:  GRVREMHAM
JenomImss  ¢e3u®Ihud  02-12-2014  9sj@cewato  3.00  aemlaeo
M @3BHIQJAND 6.

(2) 2014-0e1 G208 ale@OIVOM™” 09R" (0M220 GRBLMI) Mm@

aleQODo  MVIPa0 M1 Qo O_lcﬂaqd@q (BGAI. af)o. Od. 0MIA):

aquenidy” Homilgl 016a0ds" §21Ql30088 2014-6e1 ¢H08 2l1emI0VOm’ 02"
(@en=00 c_BO®I) enil@d al@1NaM MW D BHSHNHMHA (@JGO®o

@RAI®Ola (18630.



65

WM HO0Y0jo MIWANJo BAIMMIBAMNEMAQJo N&H@’] (W) Od. af)o.

m06mM1): @JCOWHOD o aMIEBRMD.

©Wl. 8. W1AIRIAVA MIVWAB: AV, HXIGT 016 [03S §.21Q) (J000SS

2014-021 6308 almom” 002" (0M2de CRRVMI1) MG §ald@RMIE(@JIWo
CNGAN@®IMOWT  qVABABERIY"  §alQeMOAIN  GRRV®I]  GRAIMAq {l&esm.
M1CWIRHAMLLIISTIVNIMN O @3 GENIOBS” A 16I0 QO HOS
aJM:MocelSla (loganam MIBE3We @REJICVWINTHNEM. @Al QN8HBHUd
HAWNMBMABAIV” MSOD] (@)Ul {lESIMDIM” 2 lRIVODHUWBIBBB (@ JOCWIU D
NYRUIRNSHUBAEN 2 lB1a000RMBIGHEMo.  aleRIVODHSIOL! alenils” SO(()chaUﬁo%)u
DHIGAPLD GOQIM aleMo @RSYAN Mlelaleoel MOl®Ies” m3Qo AIBOMEMo.
Al OV HSBIOL! af)Lld AUBEBHUBERB0 aleMo §alLIYISsM@TM” (NIAMVBWOS
@AM GQIEMHRAM Mlenianuwm ARV O HBOS (@JAIBDD MDD

GRIaUHONIW] NIOWIHABHOM @ 1MID@I @R 103 maQo QIMO6Mo.

20elm {M1BIMIB2RMEMIM”  aleRDVODHUB  @JINA  aIBlWeMM  M@IH:EMo.
@JANM1HUBHH BAIISAIRHIUe MDIB:MD Mo @RYUDI ABCHNYIMo @RoWAINIIS]

210N HHIBH630 aleIOVO HD@OHENMG (T3 AONVRIHHNIMW  @RAITVOO



66

M@BEM1MNABE D IBAIMo (@JUdoMVMIWAIEM.

). cvggl 6220MVal: aquenidy” Ho1g1 016ajods” aIQaelmoonss 2014-

DLl CHO8 alIWO 2 (EMBlo 6REV®I) MM afliNgo @RE® VMG’

SH0191QOS alBIVEMMY” EROPEMHAMN EERNLM] ERAIMA]o I8,  EMIOH

alaRII VO HBHS QYo @2 IMOVOD AUIBRHBHSWYo @R 13O

aJMABMIBMOOMIejn2001ges @Touooa@ﬂ@@oeaua al@lan@1an6Mo.

aleUOVTDHBOS alRL@T M0 MSalSl@n6EBRUB BRYWMB:QUD B>@1B63E: Q)0

LIE)HO1EBH Qo 2l MSalS] (@JUoTuMIVMdeM:.

aleRIOVIDo  AVIPaOIMIDIQo Al |a@] (EWI. ofo. k.  AMIA):
GO0 eIV O HBOS @R 1RO aJMAMIBROOM1ejmn200lges

mmoo&gﬂ@@c&uﬁ al@la0@1ABAN@IDH:AN  OOOMILIB8  GRRUMIWIM’
@oe;omgmcm’lgggcof. 2MMVoa1ISINNINODLNWGTds0 @P@13Em] M1BmM®o
msgM®.  Mlelnflegg 152 @miods” almeom@:86s ER@1GOm1VIGE 20go

DMRIGHWYLL.  (DIDAVRHU MIL” A &SOMONAMMBB®IM” MVABHHIV1H AP



67

MWo. OMoHI@ (DIDNVBHUY,  (DIDCH@BEBBUY af)aM]I @M’

@IRMVEHSBICRIPY” HZGMTI BRYBHOB HHHINFAUOIMo AUB:TVM (JAUODMEBBSE3

(DINAVEBUIHS” @OWIMLo  MT@HIMMIEM”  DCFUBTABAND . TAG-om

SY100E8HYoe  alflIVODHBOS  altb®]  MIBQJe0eM  MSalSl@n6EBRUd

L1085 01 HBHQ)o @gjc%’lgma". enflelleel OJcea(HOGJQf]@a @uaa)oe@oggs’lgj]%g@
CRBLMHOBa ] MI(@M@I6M” 610003 MoVIA 2| enil@3
aIG@INEMN MW HANFHANMHAAN” @RE AGO1H530M0.

GRBRUILMIHUT VRS BRIV 1IGWINS oﬂcﬁmeﬂgj.

aquenidy” Holgl 016¢a|0ds" §21Qe)30088 2014-6e1 ¢H08 1m0V’
00" (08oo GRBVMI) MG aldlWEMNMWHENSHNMHAAN  (@JCAWo aVE
@001 @1).

NIN@3 A IBlNENMY OHNFOD).

©6N300 Qldhal

(@I aldHI0U6BRUD MRWI®3 wlalbloflciplofioblen GRBNM 13U
@ROIMGalafle).)

@8 alOoQMM BDEBLN1H: 683VLM] DO BRAIMA1R{l2).



68

271, mNefload 2-00 QUMD (@000 GRBVLM]  §.a1QIMEZUTTHBAD  (JWIM
@008 (1-00 ) Al (2-00 ) Dalid:q I@3,-

(ag) JaY® Do Il (103, 5162 |BHABAIOMD OBRUI1HBaM
" 0NNBERWAfISSS  (@JEBUEBBES®O” )M ANSBHUIGH Gt © 1999-
OEl GHOB QUMWY aB®HRILIH  HIWOMBAV" BMNIOGRG®:So AJAUTVOIW MWO
@esu afllé:aumae  @rdy (2000-0e1 5) (@000 QIO  (JE3UNIW]
@Je1y0a B9 lg (@JGBUOEBEHSW0" o)’ QBB HSBo @ODEBBS0
G21BGHNNZIGM.

(enil) JIR® Oaldldsa{load  mlenfleigs  glal  MIMITWMYBUDAHO
®IOYQ|OQAN dhlal MININLM GalGEENNZDIM” BRIV -
"agan”  mo@oel,  1999-681  GHO8 QAL aR®ROLIE:  HIWONBAY”
GMINBRD:So QIITVIW MW @JEBUD Al&:IVMAle @R (@G0 QIJAITVIW
@JeBOWT  (@alydallendals  @Je3wmeglad o apgleel  XIX-o
@ELYIVONIOEI AYITVNGUWBBH QlYIa 1MW B1HBIN@E™.

DA BRAIMA]{l2] 8DE3LW]E: GEBBVLM] TVE @oW1B:@]).

@aN=J0 Qldq] MIENOA3 BINMILHIMHRIM (@JUo TVE BRoW1B:@]).

CRBUIMI] 2lQ (@JHIVABB M0 Qldsa | ilefload f0nadwl.



69

QaMIo Aldsa |

QM0 Qldsq | MIE1OA3 BOVAISHEMOAMM @JUgo VB BRoN1B:014).
BOMIo Qldsa | milefload fonmawl.

MOELIdo Aldsaf

119, 121, 122, 124, 126 agam1 mmid GO I1&Hu3 @RAU® Q1 {l2).
MIEN0 Oldsq | MIIENHAF BOVAILHEMOAAM (@JURo TVE @0 1B:01).
Moeldo Qldal milefload cowaow.

@REMI00 Qldsal

CBBIM1BHU3 @ERAIMT]a (1aflel.
@060 Qldq | MIENH3 BINAIGHMHRIM (@JUo TVE @RoU1H:@]).

@6eRId0 Qldsal milefload sowaowl.

@RY0Jo QAldsaf

140-20 mm18 ce3L®] GRAIMA{la).

@890 6BEVMT AQD] MVflB:@]2).

140. a1emwo 6 (@J»000 @JWIM @RYGRI@ Galdanoaveguwlasan 30 (1)-2
Q1o aflwd1d®:06mo 2-@ " @RyudAIdBHAdMI@e" af)aM AIBBH:UIBBEUaHo

" MIHHO®I B JOH DI af)aNT AUIABHUY BalBH3D.



70

D@1 Ml BEBBLMI AVE BRI E:@1a).
@000 Qldsq| MIE1O3 BINAILHEMOAM (@JUQo VB BROV1B:014).
GRBULM] §21Q) (JHIVABR @Yo Aldsa| Mmilellond fonmol.

300 Qldsal

146, 147, 150 agam1 mmiId O3 @RAI®G]qfla).
o390 Qldha | MIE10a3 BOVMILHEMORIM (@JUo TVE BRI 1H:@1a).

a0 Qldsa | mﬂ%%)o@ QoM.

af)S%0 Qldsa |’

153, 154, 155, 158, 159, 160, 165, 167, 168 agam1 mmid GO
@ROIM G {19).

@069 JOQMM GBEVMIBHU3 A@Y] AV fldh@la).

165. aimuo 8 (@000 @JWOIM GBRGIGE E2IABHIMEZUIIBHBAD  Qlda]
154(3)-@3, “ ago®m®slejo alemMend” ag)am ANESGHUBOS” aldh0o " aleMEMd' agf)an
QA G2lBHBD:.

167. alemwo 8 (@000 @JWOIM @YBGHIGE E2I@HHIMEZUTHBAD  Qldha]
154(3)-@3, “ 2684000 @enawl" o)1 QNEBHUBES” aldho "BDEBLIN]H

@021001W1" ag)aNT AOBHUY GalBHBDH.



71

AT MV13012] GEBBOM U3 VR @oW1d:@]).
af)3%0 Qld:q | MIENH3 BONAIBHEMHRIM (@JUo TVE @oW1d:@]a).
¢REUM] §21Q) @JHIVABS af)S%0 Qs milefload owmoWl.

BSMIMIo Qldsal

@069 OQMM B3DEBLWVIH: 683VM] DO BRAIMGIo{la).

270. enfigfload 9-00 oML (@000 GEBOLM] HaIYAIOMB DEFUTIHBM
@wom @rleeal 219 ol adaefloa (I-)oo 901 aldefl@d "1020 ave.iwad
an1G1@" ag)an BRAHE Mo AUIBBHUWBBRB0 ald0o 100 V1038 a1901@d" agam
@RBNNJo AUIBBHBo GalBCHNMNBGIEM.

173, 176, 177, 179, 180, 183, 184, 186, 192, 194, 196, 197, 198, 199,
203, 205, 207, 208, 209, 211, 212, 215, 216, 219 (ag) 224, 225,226, 230,
236, 238, 243, 246, 248, 250 agam1 mmIB L@ 13 @AI®G]q fla).

@IV |OQMM GBENMI®HUE AQY] AVfld:@la).

186. auemwo 9 (@200 (JWOM BRYHRITE G2IRBHIMEZUINBSBID Aldaf 219 afl(1)-
©3 ”0_6%081:6308" af)aD  QIEH 1M ldh0o ”a(%()(%c&;go iaoMel OBS1SEERGo" ag)anl
QHBHUY CalBHBDs.

197. euemuo 9 (@000 (@JWIM @RYHIM G2IBHHIMEZWIHBAN Aldsaf 219 afl.(1)-



72

@ , ° @RAGNS"'a)aN  ANAHIW  aldhOo | BRAIQYSS' agamn QDB
G21BGHNNZIGM.

243. a1emuo 9 @000 JWIM @RYEGR]G G2IBHHIMEZUTHBID Qldsa] 219 WenY.
(D (ag))-0133 "@IO®I@m MUNIINEA) @RYESI" AN IMaldho ' aFOITC
MUOJAIMEGRO QAUYBDIEWI" )N’ GalBH63d:.

250.  auemwo 9 (@00 @JWIM GBRYRIG E2IBHHIMEZUTHBID Qlda| 219

v n

cw%.(l) (U)-01@8 "al0¢ oloayld:” " af)M@IM0ald®:00 " 9alCWINIBM NI
oo " ag)an’ G2IBHB3D:.

AT MV 1B015] BEBBNMIB®:U3 TVE @oU1B:@].).

SMI®I0 Aldq MIENH3 BONAIGHMHRIM (@JUo TVE @oW1HE:@].2).

¢RBLMI] 2lQ (@JHIABB BMIMI0 Aldsal milelload cowaowl.

alOmo Qldsaf

al@®do Qlda| mILload BOVMILHEMORIM @Juo MVE BRI 1E:@1a).
[y 0 m
alomo Qldsq | nileflond @owmdwl.

al®1OMIaMIo QAldhal

262, 265 agam ce30®1H03 @aI®Glafla).

@069 JOQMM 6BEVMT AQD] MVfB:@]).



73

262. atemwo 11(1) (nN)-01@ "@RowmMaIsl"afan  QIEHIMValdh0o
" @&eMAIS]" af) N QB GalBHB .

D@1 MV 1B:014] GEBBNDT TVE @MW 1B:@]2).

al®1OHMIMIo Qldhq | MIIENOHAF BINDILHEMHRAM (@JUo TVE @oW1B:@].).

¢RBLMI] 2lQ (@JHIABB al®1OMINMIo Aldsa| milelload cowaowl.

al@en8do Qldsa |

DAY DI |0QAD BVEBLPUNTH: GRBNMI ERAIG®R{la).

268.  auemwo 12(1)-@3 "6"agam @REH@DIM” aldhoo "15"agam @Hno
ColQHGdh.

DAY BRAIMA]{l2] 8VEBLW]E: GEBBVLM] TVE @MU 1B:@]).

al@®eNsdo  Qldsa | MIE[HA3 BOVMILHEMEAMD (JUgo MVE BPRoUY 1@ 1).

GRBUWM] ©21Q) @JHIVAYBS o IQDENZ0 Aldsq | Mileflond BonaW.

&MIo Qldhq o alflol&H Qo Gal@Bo
110-00 mm@ ¢e30®1 @RAI®Ga{la).
B3Moo  Qldhq]o af1015Qo Gal@o U103 BIVAIGHIMOOAN (@JUJo VR
@001 @1).

63N00 Oldhq o al101&Qo Gal@o milefload conmwl.



74

A lERIOVADo NGO MIDIQ Al ]AOD)] (Gawa. ag)o. . NIAR) : 2014-

ALl CHOS alemIVWO 022" (0melo GRBVWMI) d3 A l0AVIBHEMHAIMM (@JEOWo
@RAIMN@a [lasmo.
SHaHIQo  JWAVoOBHEMOJo  BR2JSIYo  BAVAHMOIWYo moearg;l@’l (.

O.all. GNIaOMM) : (JECAWHDE® o 103IIEBRAD.

2014-021 c®H08  ale@DOO® 002" (0=do  ce3L®])  mdd
alOTRIBHEMHRIM (@JEAWo MVE @R 1h@la).
av
N3 VB aldTMOHH].

VR H.AIG:EMMOo 8.37-m aNdleo).

stk sk sk sk sk sk skok



75



	I ഇ.ബി. XIII-കേരള നിയമസഭ/XII-1

